

Date of Tender Opening: April 01, 2025									
File Number: Guyana Energy Agency (117/2025/02) - Transportation, Installation & Commissioning for Solar Photovoltaic (PV) Systems for the GEA in Four Lots									
Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid Amount & Currency	Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	TOSL Engineering Limited (T&T) L1	\$ 7,521,438.40	\$ 747,813	Republic Bank (T&T)	N/A	N/A	✓	2	2
1	TOSL Engineering Limited (T&T) L2	\$ 4,167,061.89							
1	TOSL Engineering Limited (T&T) L3	\$ 21,298,540.40							
1	TOSL Engineering Limited (T&T) L4	\$ 4,403,600.29							
2	R&P Engineering & General Construction L1	\$ 8,000,000	\$ 1,100,000	Assuria	✓	Rec	✓		2
2	R&P Engineering & General Construction L2	\$ 3,000,000							
2	R&P Engineering & General Construction L3	\$ 33,000,000							
2	R&P Engineering & General Construction L4	\$ 5,000,000							
3	Green Energy Electrical Services L1	\$ 4,394,700	\$ 1,200,000	Premier	✓	✓	✓	2	2
3	Green Energy Electrical Services L2	\$ 2,074,800							
3	Green Energy Electrical Services L3	\$ 32,985,900							
3	Green Energy Electrical Services L4	\$ 4,446,000							
4	Aronco Services Inc L1	\$ 7,171,562.05	\$ 143,431	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
4	Aronco Services Inc L2	\$ 4,600,625.00	\$ 92,013						
4	Aronco Services Inc L3	\$ 20,296,875.00	\$ 405,938						
4	Aronco Services Inc L4	\$ 3,924,062.05	\$ 78,481						

Date of Tender Opening: April 01, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Home Affairs (91/2025/51) - Rehabilitation of Mora Point Police Station

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid Amount & Currency	Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	AE&N General Contracting	\$ 28,647,591	\$ 700,000	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
2	Rishal's Construction & Maintenance Service	\$ 27,597,591	\$ 700,000	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
3	JEF Construction & Catering Service	\$ 21,704,351	\$ 460,000	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
4	DS Construction Service & Supplies	\$ 20,534,168	\$ 420,000	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
5	R&P Engineering & General Construction	\$ 21,471,240	\$ 429,425	Assuria	✓	X	✓		2
6	Andrect Engineering & Construction	Form of Tender Page Signed But Not Completed	\$ 1,500,000	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
7	Super Advanced Construction & Procurement Services	\$ 28,995,876	\$ 579,917	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
8	Wazir Khan & Son Construction	\$ 51,403,853	\$ 1,028,077	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		1
9	Mohamed Rafee Yusoof Construction	\$ 46,851,788	\$ 920,000	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
10	Sheldon Contracting Firm	\$ 18,908,820	\$ 378,176	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
11	Surajpaul Balkaran & Son's Construction	\$ 36,987,248	\$ 750,000	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
12	Civil EC Engineering Solutions	\$ 15,101,783	\$ 330,000	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		1
13	Crown Road & Drainage Contractors	\$ 36,713,303	\$ 800,000	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
14	Forever Construction	\$ 19,712,280	\$ 337,440	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
	Engineer's Estimate	\$ 23,795,699							

Date of Tender Opening: April 01, 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (111/2025/21) - Supply and delivery of Seamless Stainless Tube for Rose Hall Estate

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid Amount & Currency	Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	Alliance Investments	\$ 17,013,713	\$ 340,274	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
2	TPLB Inc (USA)	\$ 21,427,000	\$ 428,540	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
3	Impeccable Construction & General Supplies Inc	\$ 16,560,000	\$ 331,200	Scotia Bank (Cheque)	✓	✓	✓		1
4	Zeeco Group of Services Inc	\$ 6,418,683.60	\$ 4,600,000	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2

Date of Tender Opening: April 01, 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (112/2025/21) - Supply and Delivery of Planetary Crystallizer Gearbox with Motor and Stater for Rose Hall Estate

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid Amount & Currency	Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	Impeccable Construction & General Supplies Inc	\$ 10,250,000	\$ 205,000	Scotia Bank (Cheque)	✓	✓	✓		1
2	Cremms Limited (UK)	No Form of Tender Page Seen	\$ 105,000	Assuria	✓	✓	X		2
3	Webster's Engineering & Consultancy	\$ 6,000,000	\$ 120,000	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		1

Date of Tender Opening: April 01, 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (113/2025/21) - Supply, Install, Test and Commission a Rotary Sugar Dryer and Auxiliaries and Existing one at Blairmont Estate

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid Amount & Currency	Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	Impeccable Construction & General Supplies Inc	\$ 90,000,000	\$ 1,800,000	Scotia Bank (Cheque)	✓	✓	✓		1
2	Saisidha Sugar Equipments & Engineering Company Private Limited (India)	Form of Tender Page Not Completed But Signed	\$ 2,104,500	Assuria	N/A	N/A	✓		2

Date of Tender Opening: April 01, 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (114/2025/21) - Supply and Delivery of 4WD/AWD Fire Truck for Albion Estate

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid Amount & Currency	Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	Digital Design, Construction, Logistics & Supplies	\$ 4,420,240	\$ 631,463	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		1
2	Impeccable Construction & General Supplies Inc	\$ 19,950,000	\$ 399,000	Scotia Bank (Cheque)	✓	✓	✓		1

Date of Tender Opening: April 01, 2025									
File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (188/2025/21) - Supply & Delivery of High Density Polyethylene Corrugated Drainage Tubes/Pipes for Industry Lots 1-2									
Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid Amount & Currency	Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	Impeccable Construction & General Supplies Inc L1	\$ 5,000,000	\$ 4,320,000	Scotia Bank (Cheque)	✓	✓	✓		1
1	Impeccable Construction & General Supplies Inc L2	\$ 166,000,000	(L1-2)						
2	Zeeco Group of Services L1	\$ 150,924,300	\$ 26,000,000	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
2	Zeeco Group of Services L2	\$ 498,294,973	(L1-2)						
3	General Marine Company L1	\$ 92,564,150	\$ 2,000,000	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
3	General Marine Company L2	\$ 359,556,544	\$ 7,360,000						
4	Arrowhead Construction Inc L1	\$ 57,750,342	\$ 1,600,000	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
4	Arrowhead Construction Inc L2	\$ 201,754,385	\$ 4,600,000						
5	TPLB Inc L1 (USA)	\$ 56,950,000	\$ 1,139,000	Assuria	N/A	N/A	✓		2
6	Toolsie Persaud Limited L1	\$ 65,000,965	\$ 8,500,000	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		1
6	Toolsie Persaud Limited L2	\$ 285,731,339	(L1-2)						
7	Alliance Investments L1	\$ 47,600,000	\$ 1,620,000	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
7	Alliance Investments L2	\$ 130,157,500	(L1-2)						
8	Gafsons Industries Limited L1	\$ 11,000,533	\$ 9,228,700	Republic	✓	✓	✓		2
8	Gafsons Industries Limited L2	\$ 45,124,422	(L1-2)						

Date of Tender Opening: April 01, 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (189/2025/21) - Supply & Delivery of First Grade Crusher Run (5000MT) for Industry

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid Amount & Currency	Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	Alliance Investments	\$ 81,000,000	\$ 1,620,000	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
2	Impeccable Construction & General Supplies Inc	\$ 74,800,000	\$ 1,490,000	Scotia Bank (Cheque)	✓	✓	✓		1
3	Toolsie Persaud Quarries Inc	\$ 61,500,000	\$ 1,500,000	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2

Date of Tender Opening: April 01, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Health (87/2025/47) - Supply and Delivery of Anti-Retroviral (ARV's)

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid Amount & Currency	Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	New GPC Inc	\$ 427,888,572	\$ 9,000,000	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2

Date of Tender Opening: April 01, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Health (88/2025/47) - Supply and Delivery of Reagents and Consumables

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid Amount & Currency	Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	Western Scientific Company Limited	US \$499,182.23	\$ 5,040,000	Premier	N/A	N/A	✓		2
2	Meditron Inc	\$ 165,071,503	\$ 3,201,430	Diamond	✓	✓	✓		2
3	New GPC Inc	\$ 198,191,412	\$ 4,000,000	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
4	Millenium Supplies & Distribution Inc	\$ 112,390,425	\$ 2,700,000	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
5	Caribbean Medical Supplies Inc	\$ 473,029,340	\$ 9,460,587	Nafico	✓	✓	✓		2
6	ABD Medicare Investment Inc	\$ 331,294,566	\$ 8,493,613	Nafico	✓	✓	✓		2

Date of Tender Opening: April 01, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Health (89/2025/47) - Supply and Delivery of Printed Promotional Materials & Medical Records Phase 2

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid Amount & Currency	Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	Image Makers Guyana L1	\$ 29,050,000	\$ 4,290,050	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
1	Image Makers Guyana L2	\$ 9,595,000	(L1-12)						
1	Image Makers Guyana L3	\$ 20,850,000							
1	Image Makers Guyana L4	\$ 58,465,000							
1	Image Makers Guyana L5	\$ 52,500							
1	Image Makers Guyana L6	\$ 1,230,000							
1	Image Makers Guyana L7	\$ 49,575,000							
1	Image Makers Guyana L8	\$ 350,000							
1	Image Makers Guyana L9	\$ 2,475,000							
1	Image Makers Guyana L10	\$ 22,500,000							
1	Image Makers Guyana L11	\$ 9,330,000							
1	Image Makers Guyana L12	\$ 11,000,000							
2	A1 Print & Supplies L1	\$ 27,850,000	\$ 557,000	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
2	A1 Print & Supplies L2	\$ 8,380,500	\$ 167,610						
2	A1 Print & Supplies L3	\$ 33,350,000	\$ 667,000						
2	A1 Print & Supplies L4	\$ 30,140,000	\$ 602,800						
2	A1 Print & Supplies L5	\$ 29,000	\$ 580,000						
2	A1 Print & Supplies L6	\$ 1,400,000	\$ 28,000						
2	A1 Print & Supplies L7	\$ 70,065,000	\$ 1,401,300						
2	A1 Print & Supplies L8	\$ 500,000	\$ 10,000						
2	A1 Print & Supplies L9	\$ 3,000,000	\$ 60,000						
2	A1 Print & Supplies L10	\$ 15,250,000	\$ 305,000						

2	A1 Print & Supplies L11	\$ 18,875,000	\$ 377,500						
2	A1 Print & Supplies L12	\$ 800,000	\$ 16,000						
3	Kreative Printing & Office Supplies L1	\$ 47,462,500	\$ 3,148,858	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
3	Kreative Printing & Office Supplies L2	\$ 11,109,900							
3	Kreative Printing & Office Supplies L3	\$ 27,470,000							
3	Kreative Printing & Office Supplies L4	\$ 45,578,000							
3	Kreative Printing & Office Supplies L5	\$ 558,500							
3	Kreative Printing & Office Supplies L6	\$ 15,144,000							
3	Kreative Printing & Office Supplies L9	\$ 2,400,000							
3	Kreative Printing & Office Supplies L10	\$ 6,750,000							
3	Kreative Printing & Office Supplies L12	\$ 970,000							
4	JK Printing L6	\$ 752,400	\$ 262,428	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
4	JK Printing L8	\$ 684,000							
4	JK Printing L9	\$ 2,736,000							
4	JK Printing L10	\$ 8,949,000							
5	SAV Investments L3	\$ 15,600,000	\$ 756,000	Nafico	✓	✓	✓		1
5	SAV Investments L8	\$ 15,608,200							
5	SAV Investments L10	\$ 5,900,000							
5	SAV Investments L12	\$ 1,000,000							
6	Jentech Office Supplies & Solution L3	\$ 15,751,500	\$ 457,030	Nafico	✓	✓	✓		2
6	Jentech Office Supplies & Solution L10	\$ 6,100,000							
6	Jentech Office Supplies & Solution L12	\$ 1,000,000							
7	M&C Trading L3	\$ 15,751,500	\$ 1,293,928	Nafico	✓	✓	✓		2

7	M&C Trading L7	\$ 44,295,000							
7	M&C Trading L10	\$ 6,145,444							

Date of Tender Opening: April 01, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Health (90/2025/47) - Supply and Delivery of Wheelchairs

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid Amount & Currency	Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	Caribbean Medical Supplies Inc	\$ 35,000,000	\$ 700,000	Nafico	✓	✓	✓		2
2	Southwind Health & Defence	\$ 67,400,000	\$ 1,348,003	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
3	Optique Vision Care	\$ 39,372,000	\$ 900,000	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
4	Meditron Inc	\$ 18,500,000	\$ 370,000	Diamond	✓	✓	✓		2
5	ABD Medicare Investment Inc	\$ 20,000,000	\$ 400,000	Nafico	✓	✓	✓		2
6	SKM Pharmaceuticals	\$ 39,000,000	\$ 780,000	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
7	Darshan General Enterprise	\$ 29,000,000	\$ 580,000	Nafico	✓	✓	✓		2
8	Gentech Office Supplies & Solutions	\$ 49,500,000	\$ 990,000	Nafico	✓	✓	✓		2
9	New GPC Inc	\$ 25,729,000	\$ 520,000	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
10	Ragnauth General Enterprise	\$ 40,000,000	\$ 800,000	Nafico	✓	✓	✓		2
11	Acado Guyana Inc	\$ 29,995,000	\$ 600,000	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
12	Reliance Services	\$ 25,500,000	\$ 510,000	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
13	Satro's Pharmacy & General Construction Services	\$ 38,900,000	\$ 780,000	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
14	Buildnet	\$ 33,680,960	\$ 680,000	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
15	Millenium Supplies & Distribution Inc	\$ 9,500,000	\$ 200,000	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
16	Western Scientific Company Limited	US \$103,950	\$ 1,470,000	Premier	N/A	N/A	✓		2
	Western Scientific Company Limited (Alt Bid)	US \$161,260							

Date of Tender Opening: April 01, 2025

File Number: Guyana Defence Force (56/2025/53) - Rehabilitation to Senior Officers Accommodation

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid Amount & Currency	Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	BM Property Investments Inc	\$ 86,075,340	\$ 172,106	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
2	JAF Enterprise	\$ 61,334,950	\$ 1,226,699	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
3	Ash Civil Engineering Works	\$ 63,196,300	\$ 1,400,000	Nafico	✓	✓	✓	1	2
4	Joshua Balkaran Construction	\$ 69,632,940	\$ 1,500,000	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
5	Vas Global	\$ 68,485,000	\$ 1,500,000	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
6	SBC Construction Supplies and Transportation	\$ 77,905,380	\$ 1,588,108	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
7	Westbrook Caribbean Incorporated	\$ 72,540,570	\$ 480,000	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
8	Digital Design Construction Logistic & Supplies	\$ 64,498,565	\$ 1,289,971	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
9	Diversity Investments Inc	\$ 75,313,600	\$ 1,506,272	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
10	RS & Associates	\$ 74,937,450	\$ 1,498,749	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
11	Naven's Construction	\$ 83,622,600	\$ 1,672,452	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		1
12	Valiant Industrial Service	\$ 74,680,600	\$ 1,473,612	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
13	M&D Investments	\$ 66,056,650	\$ 1,426,623	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
	Engineer's Estimate	\$ 71,331,150							

Date of Tender Opening: April 01, 2025

File Number: Guyana Defence Force (57/2025/53) - Rehabilitation to Piggery Pen Agri Corps Garden of Eden

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid Amount & Currency	Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	Naven's Construction	\$ 16,128,000	\$ 322,560	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
2	Joshua Balkaran Construction	\$ 12,352,550	\$ 300,000	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
3	RS & Associates	\$ 16,345,750	\$ 326,915	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
4	Metal & Fabrication Ink	\$ 16,115,500	\$ 340,000	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
5	Jaf Enterprise	\$ 17,097,000	\$ 341,940	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
6	BM Property Investments Inc	\$ 21,600,800	\$ 432,016	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
7	Andrew's Enterprise	\$ 17,999,450	\$ 359,989	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
8	Digital Design Construction Logistics & Supplies	\$ 16,344,430	\$ 326,889	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
9	Westbrook Caribbean Incorporated	\$ 23,550,900	\$ 1,560,000	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
10	Art Supplies and General Construction	\$ 15,070,000	\$ 973,480	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		1
11	Vas Global	\$ 16,905,500	\$ 400,000	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
	Engineer's Estimate	\$ 18,477,500							

Date of Tender Opening: April 01, 2025

File Number: Guyana Defence Force (58/2025/53) - Rehabilitation of Ground Floor AQ Branch

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid Amount & Currency	Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	Westbrook Caribbean Incorporated	\$ 13,985,280	BSD Page Completed & Signed		✓	✓	✓		2
2	Supergraphics	\$ 18,491,150	BSD Page Completed & Signed		✓	✓	✓		1
3	Joshua Balkaran Construction	\$ 13,853,630	BSD Page Completed & Signed,		✓	✓	✓		2
			\$ 120,000	Premier					
4	Rs Associarted and design Supervision Services	\$ 12,086,800	BSD Page Completed & Signed,		✓	✓	✓		1
5	digital design construction logistic and supply	\$ 13,328,260	BSD Page Completed & Signed,		✓	✓	✓		2
6	Divastity investment inc	\$ 13,368,540	BSD Page Completed & Signed,		✓	✓	✓		1
7	Memorex enterprises	\$ 17,051,390	BSD Page Completed & Signed,		✓	✓	✓		2
8	VM Property investment inc	\$ 24,782,180	BSD Page Completed & Signed,		✓	✓	✓		1
9	Naven Construction	\$ 15,607,300	312146	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		1
10	Jaf Enterprise	\$ 14,136,700	\$ 282,734		✓	✓	✓		
11	INNOVATIVE Development solution guyana	\$ 14,514,100	BSD Page Completed & Signed,		✓	✓	✓		1
12	art supply and general Const	\$ 15,290,000	BSD Page Completed & Signed,		✓	✓	✓		1
13	Vas Gobal	\$ 14,068,600	BSD Page Completed & Signed,		✓	✓	✓		1
14	jane ann robinson contracting	\$ 14,779,900	BSD Page Completed & Signed,		✓	✓	✓	1	1
	EE	\$ 14,772,450							

Date of Tender Opening: April 01, 2025

File Number: Guyana Defence Force (60/2025/53) - Rehabilitation and Extension of CDS Secretariat

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid Amount & Currency	Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	naven construction	\$ 12,471,000	\$ 249,420	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		1
2	jaff enterprise	\$ 10,043,950	\$ 279,000	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
3	Supergrahic	\$ 15,564,500	BSD Page Completed & Signed,		✓	✓	✓		1
4	art supplies and general suppl	\$ 10,143,600	BSD Page Completed & Signed,		✓	✓	0		1
5	INNOVATIVE Development solution guyana	\$ 11,077,900	BSD Page Completed & Signed,		✓	✓	✓		1
6	jane ann robinson contracting	\$ 13,852,450	BSD Page Completed & Signed,		✓	✓	✓	1	1
7	Vas Global	\$ 11,227,950	BSD Page Completed & Signed,		✓	✓	✓		1
8	Surupaul balkaran & sons construction	\$ 10,742,300	\$ 220,000	perimer	✓	✓	✓		2
9	west Brook caribbean inc	\$ 13,075,590	BSD Page Completed & Signed,		✓	✓	✓		2
10	rs Accoicatied	\$ 9,565,830	BSD Page Completed & Signed,		✓	✓	✓		1
11	f&s Investments	\$ 10,891,320	BSD Page Completed & Signed,		✓	✓	✓		1
12	desverity investment inc	\$ 10,827,950	BSD Page Completed & Signed,		✓	✓	✓		1
13	Memrox Enterprise	\$ 11,416,160	BSD Page Completed & Signed,		✓	✓	✓		2
14	VM Property investment inc	\$ 13,794,060	\$ 275,881		✓	✓	✓		2
	EE	\$ 12,693,750							

Date of Tender Opening: April 01, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Culture, Youth & Sports (72/2025/44) - Design and Build Proposals for International Football Field at Athletic Track Linden Region 10

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid Amount & Currency	Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	Superior Group Inc (Technical and Financial Submitted)		\$ 892,464	Premier	✓	✓	✓	1	1

Date of Tender Opening: April 01, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Culture, Youth & Sports (73/2025/44) - Design Review and Construction of Fire Detection and Alarm System- Berbice Stadium Palmyra

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid Amount & Currency	Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	MEP Engineering Services Inc	\$ 108,091,500	\$ 2,161,830	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
2	AM Concept Inc	\$ 127,528,500	\$ 2,900,000	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
3	M.BN Group of Companies Inc	\$ 157,466,100	\$ 2,900,000	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2

Date of Tender Opening: April 01, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Culture, Youth & Sports (74/2025/44) - Design, Review and Construction of HVAC System Berbice Stadium

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid Amount & Currency	Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	Am Concept Inc	\$ 117,705,000	\$ 2,747,680	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
2	IAQ Solutions (Guyana) Inc	\$ 121,051,486	\$ 2,740,000	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2

Date of Tender Opening: April 01, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Culture, Youth & Sports (75/2025/44) - Design and Build Proposals for International Football Field at Athletic Track New Amsterdam Region 6

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid Amount & Currency	Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	Superior Group Inc (Technical and Financial Submitted)		\$ 892,464	Premier	✓	✓	✓		1
2	M.E.P Engineering Services Inc (Technical and Financial Submitted)				✓	✓	✓		1

Date of Tender Opening: April 01, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Culture, Youth & Sports (76/2025/44) - Procurement of One 400KVA Generator for the Athletic Track Bayroc

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid Amount & Currency	Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	Cummings Electrical Co. Ltd	\$ 14,340,000	\$ 300,000	Nafico	✓	✓	✓		2
2	Alliance Investments	\$ 18,800,000	\$ 394,510	Nafico	✓	✓	✓		2
3	Karligo Inc.	\$ 19,725,045			✓	✓	✓		1
4	Farm Supplies Limited	\$ 9,214,000	\$ 184,280	Assuria	✓	✓	✓	1	2
5	Standby Power Engineering Company (SPECOM)	\$ 15,020,000	\$ 500,000	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
6	Tels Engineering Services	\$ 10,975,000	Bid Securing Declaration Page Completed & Signed		✓	✓	✓		2
7	IBIS Construction Equipment Sales & Rentals Inc.	\$ 11,936,396	\$ 478,000	Diamond	✓	✓	✓		2
8	D's Farm	\$ 25,275,000	\$ 505,500	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		
9	Rans Contracting & Supplies	\$ 11,500,000	Bid Securing Declaration Page Not Completed & Signed		✓	✓	✓		0
10	Double Day Enterprise	\$ 27,360,000	\$ 540,000	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
11	PBS Technologies (Guyana) Inc.	\$ 20,003,459	Bid Securing Declaration Page Completed & Signed		✓	✓	✓		2
12	Machinery Corporation of Guyana Limited	\$ 33,130,742	Bid Securing Declaration Page Not Completed & Signed		✓	✓	✓		1
13	Jumbo Jet Auto Sales	\$ 13,200,000	Bid Securing Declaration Page Completed & Signed		X	X	✓		2
14	Orin's Supreme Enterprise	\$ 24,950,000	Bid Securing Declaration Page Completed & Signed		✓	✓	✓		2
15	Energy Empire	\$ 24,000,000	Bid Securing Declaration Page Completed & Signed		✓	✓	✓		2

Date of Tender Opening: April 01, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Culture, Youth & Sports (77/2025/44) - Procurement of One 400KVA Generator for the Tower Lights at the Berbice Stadium

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid Amount & Currency	Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	PBS Technologies (Guyana) Inc.	\$ 20,003,459	Bid Securing Declaration Page Completed & Signed		✓	✓	✓		2
2	Double Day Enterprise	\$ 27,360,000	\$ 540,000	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
3	Rans Contracting & Supplies	\$ 11,500,000	Bid Securing Declaration not completed and signed		✓	✓	✓		2
4	Energy Empire	\$ 20,000,000	Bid Securing Declaration Page Completed & Signed		✓	✓	✓		2
5	Jumbo Jet Auto Sales	\$ 13,200,000	Bid Securing Declaration Page Completed & Signed		✓	✓	✓		2
6	Machinery Corporation of Guyana Limited	\$ 33,130,742	Bid Securing Declaration Page Completed & Signed		✓	✓	✓		1
7	Alliance Investments	\$ 18,800,000	Bid Securing Declaration Page Completed & Signed		✓	✓	✓		2
8	Cummings Electrical Company	\$ 14,340,000	\$ 300,000	Nafico	✓	✓	✓		2
9	General Equipment Guyana Limited	\$ 15,315,100	Bid Securing Declaration Page Completed & Signed		✓	✓	✓		2
10	Karligo Inc.	\$ 19,725,045	Bid Securing Declaration Page Completed & Signed		✓	✓	✓		1
11	Orin's Supreme Enterprise	\$ 27,350,000	Bid Securing Declaration Page Completed & Signed		✓	✓	✓		2

12	Farm Supplies Limited	\$ 9,214,000	Bid Securing Declaration not completed and signed		✓	✓	✓	1	2
13	Standby Power Engineering Company	\$ 15,020,000	\$ 500,000	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
14	IBIS Construction Equipment Sales & Rentals Inc.	\$ 11,936,396	\$ 478,000	Nafico	✓	✓	✓		2
15	D's Farm	\$ 25,075,000	\$ 505,500	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
16	Tels Engineering Services	\$ 10,990,000			✓	✓	✓		2
17	JR Engineering Solutions	\$ 12,882,000	Bid Securing Declaration Page Completed & Signed		✓	✓	✓		2

Date of Tender Opening: April 01, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Culture, Youth & Sports (78/2025/44) - Construction of Parking Lot & Drains National Racquet Centre

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid Amount & Currency	Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	Ziona's Enterprise	\$ 64,399,335	\$ 1,425,392	Caricom	Rec	✓	✓		1
2	R. Kissoon Contracting Service	\$ 84,226,128	\$ 1,700,000	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
3	Nk Engineering Services	\$ 65,002,213	\$ 1,440,000	Nafico	✓	✓	✓		2
4	L.S Contracting Services	\$ 60,023,712	\$ 1,425,392	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
5	Probuild Construction Service	\$ 65,245,835	\$ 1,425,392	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
6	Sovereignty Investments Construction Services (SICS Builders)	\$ 56,320,404	\$ 1,420,000	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
7	J.R Civil Works	\$ 66,776,430	\$ 1,290,112	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		1
8	Triple A General Contracting Services	\$ 68,888,862	\$ 1,377,777	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
9	M&D Investments	\$ 72,233,490	\$ 1,516,903	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
10	Orin's Supreme Enterprise	\$ 64,312,615	No Bid Security Seen		✓	✓	✓		2
11	S. Prakash Construction	\$ 58,282,397	\$ 1,165,647	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		1
12	Hana's Construction Cleaning Service and Supplies	\$ 59,415,805	No Bid Security Seen		✓	✓	✓		2
13	Souther Construction Services	\$ 65,157,645	\$ 1,303,153	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
14	FN Electrical & General Contracting	\$ 71,065,991	\$ 1,421,320	Premier	✓	✓	✓		1
15	Charles Engineering Establishment	\$ 69,288,030	\$ 1,424,000	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
16	Gryphon Engineering Inc.	\$ 17,024,805	\$ 342,000	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
17	Amos and Junior Engineering Inc.	\$ 68,313,683	\$ 1,355,774	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
18	Mohamed Rafi Yusooof Construction	\$ 70,518,032	\$ 1,425,392	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
19	Aronco Services Inc.	\$ 66,801,480	\$ 1,336,030	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
20	Sac and Sac Vision Construction	\$ 24,060,781	No Bid Security Seen		✓	✓	✓		2
21	STS Investments	\$ 71,227,716	\$ 1,424,554	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2

22	ART Supplies & General Construction	\$ 60,229,984	\$ 1,260,889	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		1
23	The Dependable Construcion & General Services	\$ 70,813,313	\$ 1,416,267	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
24	GD's Construction & Supplies	\$ 66,812,004	\$ 1,425,392	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
25	AJM Enterprise	\$ 69,243,615	\$ 1,425,392	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
26	Energy Empire	\$ 64,945,955	\$ 1,425,392	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
27	J Hussain's Constructio & Supplies	\$ 60,495,729	\$ 1,209,915	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
28	S. Sugrim Enterprise	\$ 60,111,639	\$ 1,420,000	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
29	J&A Lumber yard & Contracting Services	\$ 62,721,802	\$ 1,254,436	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		
30	Ramu Construction Contractor for all wooden & Concrete Structure	\$ 21,862,330	No Bid Security Seen		X	X	✓		1
31	K&S Civil Engineering Contracting Services Inc.	\$ 79,955,005	\$ 1,425,392	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
32	Quality Deliverer	\$ 70,297,951	\$ 1,425,392	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
33	JJ Construction & General Electrical	\$ 71,192,142	\$ 1,423,843	Nafico	✓	✓	✓		2
34	Supreme Builders Services	\$ 63,917,952	\$ 1,278,359	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
35	FMC Construction Service	\$ 67,917,728	\$ 1,425,392	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
36	R&M Mining Investments Project Inc.	\$ 69,140,127	\$ 1,425,392	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
37	Am Concept Inc.	\$ 51,341,745	-	-	✓	✓	✓		-
38	Novar Industries	\$ 21,841,680	\$ 1,418,785	Nafico	✓	✓	✓		2
39	R&P Engineering & General Construction	\$ 20,777,537	\$ 1,425,392	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
40	Alvin Chowramootoo Construction Services	\$ 61,098,177	\$ 1,600,000	Caricom	✓	✓	✓	1	2
41	Multitech engineering Services Inc.	\$ 64,720,835	\$ 1,425,392	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
42	B.M Property Investments Inc.	\$ 21,946,680	\$ 438,933	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
43	Dm Engineering	\$ 68,994,345	\$ 1,425,392	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
44	Dynamics Construction and Real Estate Inc.	\$ 67,604,145	\$ 1,424,000	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
45	IMS Construction and Logistics Services	\$ 65,870,648	\$ 170,000	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
46	Centaur Investments Inc.	\$ 66,214,092	\$ 1,324,282	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2

47	E.D Enterprise	\$ 71,621,445	\$ 1,432,429	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
48	M.B.N Group of Companies Inc.	\$ 69,341,286	\$ 1,425,392	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
49	AL Precise Contracting Enterprise	\$ 66,329,634	\$ 1,425,392	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
50	NJ Investment	\$ 64,062,705	\$ 1,281,254	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
51	JD Investments Inc.	\$ 60,458,213	\$ 1,209,164	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
52	4 A Engineering Enterprise	\$ 69,812,495	\$ 1,425,392	Premier	✓	✓	✓		1
53	Prosperity Investment Inc.	\$ 67,446,435	\$ 1,425,392	Nafico	✓	✓	✓		2
54	Dimitri Construction Services & Supplies	\$ 70,635,800	\$ 1,412,716	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
55	Phoenix Engineering Enterprise	\$ 69,338,325	\$ 1,425,392	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
56	D. Chowkai & Sons Construction	\$ 58,971,129	\$ 376,890	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		1
57	Seenarine's Construction and Landscaping Services	\$ 70,442,967	\$ 1,425,392	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
	Engineer's Estimate	\$ 71,269,595.46							

Date of Tender Opening: April 01, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Culture, Youth & Sports (79/2025/44) - Concerting Works around Building at National Racquet Centre, Woolford Avenue

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid Amount & Currency	Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	Multitech Engineering Services Inc	\$ 20,976,459	\$ 442,848	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
2	R&P Engineering & General Construction	\$ 15,858,379	\$ 442,848	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
3	STS Investments	\$ 22,041,600	\$ 440,832	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
4	Novar Industries	\$ 70,939,260	\$ 436,834	Nafico	✓	✓	✓		2
5	LS Contracting Services	\$ 15,390,910	\$ 442,848	Nafico	✓	✓	✓		2
6	Hana's Construction Cleaning Service & Supplies	\$ 18,840,045	\$ 376,800	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
7	S Prakash Construction	\$ 19,874,421	\$ 397,488	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
8	J Hussain's Construction & Supplies	\$ 19,060,545	\$ 381,211	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
9	AL Precise Contracting Enterprise	\$ 20,784,645	\$ 442,848	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
10	Centaur Investment Inc	\$ 21,472,815	\$ 429,456	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
11	E.I Vision Build	\$ 21,513,187	\$ 442,848	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
12	FMC Construction & Service	\$ 21,213,938	No Bid Security Seen		X	X	✓		2
13	M&D Investments	\$ 20,469,200	\$ 429,853	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
14	Building Tech Construction	\$ 18,249,430	\$ 368,472	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
15	SAC & SAC Vision Construction	\$ 13,532,820	No Bid Security Seen		✓	✓	✓		2
16	SDA Construction & General Services	\$ 18,996,096	\$ 379,922	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
17	D Chowkai & Sons Construction	\$ 18,844,497	\$ 1,179,423	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
18	Seenarine's Construction & Landscaping Services	\$ 21,746,907	\$ 442,847	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
19	Probuild Construction Service	\$ 21,133,959	\$ 442,848	Premier	✓	x	✓		2
20	Prophecy Enterprise	\$ 19,245,287	\$ 442,848	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
21	SB Plumbing Welding & General Construction	\$ 20,310,769	No Bid Security Seen		✓	✓	✓		2
22	S Sugrim Enterprise	\$ 19,159,917	\$ 440,000	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2

23	BM Property Investments Inc	\$ 71,044,260	\$ 1,420,885	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
24	J&A Lumberyard & Contracting Services	\$ 18,925,357	\$ 378,507	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
25	Ziona's Enterprise	\$ 19,946,010	\$ 442,847	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		1
26	Saam General Contracting	\$ 21,164,325	\$ 500,000	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
27	MBN Group of Companies Inc	\$ 21,276,108	\$ 442,848	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		0
28	Gilpin Enterprise	\$ 17,904,327	\$ 358,800	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
29	AM Concepts Inc	\$ 15,601,635	\$ 442,847	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
30	Soverignty Investment Construction Services (SICS Builders	\$ 17,010,294	\$ 442,848	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
31	Dimitri Construction Services & Supplies	\$ 36,340,342	\$ 726,807	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
32	Metal & Fabrication Ink	\$ 18,836,055	\$ 440,000	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
33	IMS Construction & Logistics Services	\$ 18,943,155	\$ 900,000	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
34	NJ Investment	\$ 21,078,698	\$ 421,574	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
35	JJ Construction & General Electrical	\$ 22,094,142	\$ 441,833	Nafico	✓	✓	✓		2
36	A Alli Construction	\$ 19,531,092	\$ 390,622	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
37	Ramu Construction	\$ 69,030,655	No Bid Security Seen		✓	✓	✓		2
38	FN Electrical & General Contracting	\$ 21,663,915	\$ 433,278	Premier	✓	✓	✓		1
39	Z&J Enterprise Inc	\$ 21,649,373	\$ 442,848	Premier	X	X	✓		0
40	Amigos Investments	\$ 21,513,240	\$ 430,265	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
41	ART Supplies & General Construction	\$ 22,350,982	\$ 446,820	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		1
42	SM Investment & Logistic Services	\$ 20,290,410	\$ 405,808	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		1
43	DM Engineering	\$ 21,680,400	\$ 442,848	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
					✓	✓	✓		2
	Engineer's Estimate	\$ 22,142,379							

Date of Tender Opening: April 01, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Culture, Youth & Sports (80/2025/44) - Construction of Concrete Slab Mc Kenzie Sports Club

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid Amount & Currency	Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	Kapil Investment	\$ 36,805,440	\$ 799,268	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
2	S&S Contracting Service	\$ 37,907,625	\$ 758,135	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
3	NJ Investment	\$ 39,435,735	\$ 788,716	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
4	Forever Construction	\$ 38,250,765	\$ 767,955	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
5	Pipang Construction & Engineering Inc	\$ 40,047,630	\$ 800,953	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
6	M&D Investments	\$ 44,907,400	\$ 943,055	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
7	SDA Construction & General Services	\$ 40,932,885	\$ 818,658	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
8	A Alli Construction	\$ 41,229,720	\$ 824,594	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
9	Jaf Enterprise	\$ 41,461,770	\$ 871,735	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
10	MC Realty & Construction	\$ 42,575,332	\$ 851,506	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
11	SBC Construction Supplies & Transportation	\$ 39,286,330	\$ 781,735	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
12	Z&J Enterprise Inc	\$ 43,193,115	\$ 871,735	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
13	Metal & Fabrication Ink	\$ 38,506,839	\$ 800,000	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
14	Energy Empire	\$ 37,362,202	No Bid Security Seen		✓	✓	✓		2
15	S&R Smokez Enterprise	\$ 39,881,352	\$ 797,627	Assuria	✓	Rec	✓		1
16	KBS Engineering & Transportation Services	\$ 40,816,808	\$ 816,336	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
17	AM Concepts Incorporated	\$ 31,762,290	\$ 871,736	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
18	Novar Industries	\$ 40,787,250	\$ 815,745	Nafico	✓	✓	✓		2
19	R&M Mining Investments Project Inc	\$ 43,136,415	\$ 871,736	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
20	Southern Construction Services	\$ 40,237,700	\$ 804,754	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
21	Eco Build Development	\$ 40,721,772	\$ 1,582,891	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
22	J. Hussain's Construction & Supplies	\$ 39,825,135	\$ 796,502	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
23	Gryphon Engineering Inc	\$ 41,681,115	\$ 840,000	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2

24	Legalize Trucking & Contracting Service	\$ 38,687,250	\$ 871,736	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
25	I. Khan Contracting Service	\$ 40,180,875	\$ 803,618	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
26	Prosperity Investment Inc	\$ 40,032,730	\$ 1,425,392	Nafico	✓	✓	✓		2
27	One Million Design & Construction	\$ 39,001,200	\$ 871,735	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		1
28	IMS Construction & Logistics Services	\$ 39,237,450	\$ 1,200,000	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
29	AL Precise Contracting Enterprise	\$ 41,671,770	\$ 871,735	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
30	Gilpin Enterprise	\$ 30,055,547	\$ 611,110	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
31	BM Property Investments Inc	\$ 43,510,425	\$ 870,208	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
32	Hana's Construction Cleaning Service & Supplies	\$ 39,667,635	\$ 793,353	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
33	Sovereignty Investments Construction Services (SICS Builders)	\$ 34,348,293	\$ 860,000	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
34	FS Construction	\$ 35,247,450	\$ 704,949	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
35	N&A Construction	\$ 40,957,770			✓	✓	✓		2
	Engineer's Estimate	\$ 43,586,760							

Date of Tender Opening: April 01, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Culture, Youth & Sports (81/2025/44) - Construction of Boundary Fence at Mahdia

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid Amount & Currency	Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	NK Enterprise Inc	\$ 41,073,049.50	\$ 501,214	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
2	Hard Runnings Investments Inc	\$ 40,936,549.50	\$ 501,214	Caricom	X	✓	✓		2
3	V&K Construction Services	\$ 24,983,564	\$ 499,671	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
4	Troy Dainty Construction	\$ 24,242,510	\$ 500,000	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
5	I Khan Contracting Service	\$ 21,693,092	\$ 433,862	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
6	R&M Mining Investment Project	\$ 24,609,585	\$ 501,214	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
7	Mohamed Rafi Yusoof Construction	\$ 23,830,569	\$ 501,213	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
8	Black's & Son Construction	\$ 27,153,808	\$ 501,214	Nafico	✓	✓	✓		2
9	Prosperity Investment Inc	\$ 23,114,679	\$ 501,214	Nafico	✓	✓	✓		2
10	PR Enterprise	\$ 22,868,365	No Bid Security Seen		✓	✓	✓		0
11	E. I Vision Build	\$ 21,864,103	\$ 501,214	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
12	Ziona's Enterprise	\$ 23,835,914	\$ 501,213	Caricom	Rec	✓	✓		1
13	Metal & Fabrication Ink	\$ 22,955,310	\$ 480,000	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
14	AM Concepts	\$ 24,519,768	\$ 501,214	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
15	Alvin Chowramootoo Construction Services	\$ 27,407,278	\$ 300,000	Caricom	✓	✓	✓	1	2
16	Z&J Enterprise Inc	\$ 24,877,844	No Bid Security Seen		X	X	✓		2
17	Zim's Construction	\$ 22,481,745	\$ 802,437	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
	Engineer's Estimate	\$ 25,060,692							

Date of Tender Opening: April 01, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Culture, Youth & Sports (82/2025/44) - Construction of Parking Lot at Mahdia

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid Amount & Currency	Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	E.I Vision Build	\$ 32,974,200	\$ 676,672	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
2	V&K Construction Services	\$ 32,445,550	\$ 668,911	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
3	NK Enterprise Inc	\$ 46,730,250	\$ 676,662	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
4	AM Concepts Inc	\$ 26,169,150	\$ 676,662	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
5	N&A Construction	\$ 30,951,900	\$ 619,038	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
6	Hard Runnings Investments Inc	\$ 45,833,970	\$ 676,662	Caricom	X	✓	✓		2
7	R&M Mining Investments Project Inc	\$ 33,598,110	\$ 676,662	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
8	Pacific Service Systems	\$ 32,101,125	\$ 642,022	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		1
9	Triple A Establishment	\$ 28,684,740	\$ 573,695	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
10	SBC Construction Supplies & Transportation	\$ 31,118,850	\$ 676,662	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
11	I Khan Contracting Service	\$ 29,947,050	\$ 598,941	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		1
12	Black's & Son Construction	\$ 33,453,735	\$ 676,662	Nafico	✓	✓	✓		2
13	PR Enterprise	\$ 27,878,550	No Bid Security Seen		✓	✓	✓		0
14	Z&J Enterprise Inc	\$ 33,698,280	\$ 676,702	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
15	JR Civil Works	\$ 29,836,590	\$ 596,732	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
16	Triple A General Contracting Services	\$ 31,089,135	\$ 621,783	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
17	Troy Dainty Construction	\$ 31,857,000	\$ 640,000	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		1
18	Metal & Fabrication Ink	\$ 28,943,460	\$ 600,000	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
19	Mohamed Rafi Yusooof Construction	\$ 32,872,380	\$ 676,662	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
20	Alvin Chowramootoo Construction Service	\$ 33,688,200	\$ 800,000	Caricom	✓	✓	✓	1	2
	Engineer's Estimate	\$ 33,833,100							

Date of Tender Opening: April 01, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Culture, Youth & Sports (83/2025/44) - Construction of RC Slab at Synthetic Track New Amsterdam

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid Amount & Currency	Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	Latchman Construction & Landscaping	\$ 64,394,902	\$ 1,287,898	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
2	Yhadram & Sons Construction Est	\$ 69,935,976	\$ 2,767,863	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
3	AM Concepts Inc	\$ 54,784,180	\$ 1,583,395	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
4	Sheldon Contracting Firm	\$ 64,179,390	\$ 1,283,588	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
5	Dimitri Construction Services & Supplies	\$ 79,047,474	\$ 1,580,950	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
6	Rishal's Construction & Maintenance Service	\$ 65,100,376	\$ 1,583,395	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
7	The Dependable Construction & General Services	\$ 78,964,798	\$ 1,579,296	Caricom	✓	x	✓		2
8	The Superior Group Inc	\$ 78,780,250	\$ 1,575,605	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
9	Alvin Chowramootoo Construction Services	\$ 79,079,660	\$ 1,800,000	Caricom	✓	✓	✓	1	2
10	Ramu Construction	\$ 70,076,766	No Bid Security		✓	✓	✓		2
11	EJ&N General Construction & Maintenance	\$ 68,400,915	\$ 1,368,315	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
12	Charles Engineering Est	\$ 77,321,895	\$ 1,582,000	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
13	JR Engineering Solution	\$ 69,164,887	\$ 1,420,000	Caricom	✓	✓	✓	1	2
14	Professional Engineering & Construction Service	\$ 74,637,145	\$ 1,492,743	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
15	R&M Mining Investments Project Inc	\$ 78,178,223	\$ 802,438	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
16	Gem Concrete & Construction Company	\$ 78,992,210	\$ 1,615,073	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
17	Pipang Construction & Engineering Inc	\$ 75,080,060	\$ 1,380,558	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
18	K Mahabir Construction Firm	\$ 69,825,360	\$ 1,369,507	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
19	ILYAS' Legacy Farms	\$ 70,375,976	\$ 1,583,395	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
20	Ziona's Enterprise	\$ 71,374,105	\$ 1,583,394	Caricom	Rec	✓	✓		1
21	RZB Construction & General Supplies	\$ 71,102,522	\$ 1,502,110	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		1

22	Singh & Son Construction	\$ 79,030,193	\$ 1,580,603	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
23	Jaf Enterprise	\$ 75,118,230	\$ 1,583,195	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
24	Kascon Engineering Service	\$ 77,075,845	\$ 1,583,395	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
25	Memorex Enterprise	\$ 70,272,537	\$ 1,406,000	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
26	K&S Civil Engineering Contracting Services Inc	\$ 79,120,855	\$ 1,583,395	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
27	Joshie Construction & Transportation Establishment Three	\$ 73,692,905	\$ 1,524,229	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
28	Rockey & Son Construction	\$ 69,274,645	\$ 1,583,395	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
29	A Alli Construction	\$ 74,921,858	\$ 1,498,437	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
30	RDSM Enterprise	\$ 61,672,050	\$ 1,583,395	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
31	Black's & Son Construction	\$ 62,954,115	\$ 1,583,395	Nafico	✓	✓	✓		2
32	Automotive Paint Station & General Supplies	\$ 78,474,121	\$ 1,583,395	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
33	AJM Enterprise	\$ 79,095,698	\$ 1,583,395	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
34	Urban Road Builders	\$ 73,585,508	\$ 1,471,709	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
35	ProConstruct Solutions	\$ 73,583,300	\$ 1,471,666	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
36	MC Realty & Construction	\$ 78,920,848	\$ 1,720,189	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
37	Sovereignty Investments Construction Services (SICS Builders)	\$ 66,152,460	\$ 1,580,000	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
38	Hana's Construction Cleaning Service & Supplies	\$ 73,337,385	\$ 1,466,748	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
39	N&A General Construction Maintenance Supplies & Janitorial Service	\$ 74,104,910	\$ 1,373,518	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
40	Alpha Construction Services	\$ 59,403,624	\$ 1,583,395	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
41	S Prakash Construction	\$ 69,877,720	\$ 1,610,890	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		1
42	Prosperity Investment Inc	\$ 68,361,982	\$ 1,583,395	Nafico	✓	✓	✓		2
43	Feroz Construction Services	\$ 67,954,150	\$ 1,583,395	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
44	GD's Construction & Supplies	\$ 74,247,228	\$ 1,484,945	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
45	AE&N General Contracting	\$ 66,939,565	No Bid Security		✓	✓	✓		2

46	MBN Group of Companies Inc	Form of Tender Signed but not Completed	\$ 1,583,395	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
47	R&R Auto Rental	\$ 64,942,823	\$ 1,583,395	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
	Engineer's Estimate	\$ 79,169,731.67							

Date of Tender Opening: April 01, 2025									
File Number: Ministry of Culture, Youth & Sports (84/2025/44) - Construction of Concrete Drains & Concrete Works at the Back of the Cliff Anderson Sports Hall									
Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid Amount & Currency	Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	Hana's Construction, Cleaning Services & Supplies	\$ 12,901,465	\$ 258,029	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
2	J. Nimnauth Trucking Services	\$ 11,230,000	Bid Security & Declaration Completed & Signed		✓	✓	✓		0
3	SAC & SAC Vision Construction	\$ 8,036,280	Bid Security & Declaration Completed & Signed		✓	✓	✓		2
4	J. Hoosain's Construction & Supplies	\$ 13,049,515	Bid Security & Declaration Not Completed & Signed		✓	✓	✓		2
5	SB Plumbing, Welding & General Construction	\$ 10,555,621	Bid Security & Declaration Completed & Signed		✓	✓	✓		1
6	ART Supplies & General Construction	\$ 13,960,916	Bid Security & Declaration Completed & Signed		✓	✓	✓		2
7	Real Time Logistics & Transportation Service	\$ 14,056,475	Bid Security & Declaration Completed & Signed		✓	✓	✓		2
8	Metal & Fabrication Ink	\$ 9,969,257	Bid Security & Declaration Completed & Signed		✓	✓	✓		2
9	Pipang Construction & Engineering Inc	\$ 11,271,766	Bid Security & Declaration Completed & Signed		✓	✓	✓		2
10	Amos & Junior Engineering Inc	\$ 11,129,483	Bid Security & Declaration Completed & Signed		✓	✓	✓		2
11	Dundas Construction Inc	\$ 24,802,307	\$ 496,000	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2

12	JJ Construction & General Electrical	\$ 11,692,181	Bid Security & Declaration Completed & Signed	✓	✓	✓		2
13	R&P Engineering & General Construction	\$ 9,711,151	Bid Security & Declaration Completed & Signed	✓	✓	✓		2
14	J&A Lumberyard & Contracting Services	\$ 9,923,917	Bid Security & Declaration Completed & Signed	✓	✓	✓		2
15	Novar Industries	\$ 11,553,222	Bid Security & Declaration Completed & Signed	✓	✓	✓		2
16	LS Contracting Services	\$ 7,774,234	Bid Security & Declaration Completed & Signed	✓	✓	✓		2
17	Melissa & Joasain Construction, Cleaning & Supplies	Form of Tender Page Not Completed But Signed	Bid Security & Declaration Completed & Signed	✓	✓	✓		2
18	SDA Construction & General Services	\$ 9,585,403	Bid Security & Declaration Completed & Signed	✓	✓	✓		2
19	Ramu Construction	\$ 11,517,900	Bid Security & Declaration Not Completed & Signed	✓	✓	✓		2
20	Forever Construction	\$ 10,770,343	Bid Security & Declaration Completed & Signed	✓	✓	✓		2
21	MBN Group of Companies Inc	\$ 30,347,814	Bid Security & Declaration Not Completed & Signed	✓	✓	✓		2
22	Ziona's Enterprise	Form of Tender Page Not Completed But Signed	Bid Security & Declaration Completed & Signed	X	Ltr	✓		1
23	Gryphon Engineering Inc	\$ 13,063,691	Bid Security & Declaration Completed & Signed	✓	✓	✓		2
24	EI Vision Build	\$ 12,287,572	Bid Security & Declaration Completed & Signed	✓	✓	✓		2

25	Summit Solutions	\$ 11,040,593	Bid Security & Declaration Completed & Signed	✓	✓	✓		1
26	Soverignty Investments Construction Services (SICS Builders)	\$ 9,461,308.05	Bid Security & Declaration Completed & Signed	✓	✓	✓		2
27	Z&J Enterprise Inc	\$ 11,640,079	Bid Security & Declaration Completed & Signed	✓	✓	✓		2
28	Softco Buisness Solutions	\$ 10,829,017	Bid Security & Declaration Completed & Signed	✓	✓	✓		2
29	D. Chowkai & Sons Construction	\$ 12,484,720	Bid Security & Declaration Completed & Signed	✓	✓	✓		2
30	IMS Construction & Logistics Services	\$ 10,704,761	Bid Security & Declaration Completed & Signed	✓	✓	✓		2
	Engineer's Estimate	\$ 11,710,253.52						

Date of Tender Opening: April 01, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Culture, Youth & Sports (85/2025/44) - Construction of RC Slab at Bayroc Track & Field Centre

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid Amount & Currency	Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	R&M Mining Investment Project Inc	\$ 85,050,861	\$ 1,723,294	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
2	Orin's Supreme Enterprise	\$ 78,961,338	\$ 1,723,294	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
3	NK Engineering Services	\$ 81,069,156	\$ 1,780,000	Nafico	✓	✓	✓		2
4	Dimitri Construction Services & Supplies	\$ 85,857,975	\$ 1,717,160	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
5	AM Concepts Inc	\$ 54,478,890	\$ 1,723,294	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
6	Pipang Construction & Engineering Inc	\$ 80,383,343	\$ 1,606,077	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
7	ED Enterprise	\$ 86,164,134	\$ 1,723,283	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
8	N&A Construction	\$ 82,877,130	\$ 1,657,543	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
9	JAF Enterprise	\$ 84,147,063	\$ 1,723,294	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
10	The Dependable Construction & General Services	\$ 86,137,884	\$ 1,723,758	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
11	Alvin Chowramootoo Construction Service	\$ 75,538,670	\$ 1,800,000	Caricom	✓	✓	✓	1	2
12	Novar Industries	\$ 85,510,740	\$ 1,710,215	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
13	Soverignty Investments Construction Services (SICS Builders)	\$ 69,941,760	\$ 1,720,000	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
14	MC Realty & Construction	\$ 86,009,482	\$ 1,578,416	Caricom	✓	✓	✓	1	2
15	M&D Investments	\$ 77,091,600	\$ 1,723,293	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
16	One Million Design & Construction	\$ 76,971,489	\$ 1,723,294	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		1
17	Ziona's Enterprise	\$ 81,718,403	\$ 1,723,289	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		1
18	Joshi Construction & Transportation Establishment Tree	\$ 77,011,175	\$ 1,675,428	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
19	Charles Engineering Establishment	\$ 84,401,310	\$ 1,722,000	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		1
20	Eco Build Development	\$ 71,144,590	\$ 814,435	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2

21	Alph Construction Services	\$ 77,994,158	\$ 1,723,294	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
22	Pro Construct Solutions	\$ 79,734,774	\$ 1,594,695	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
23	A. Alli Construction	\$ 81,764,886	\$ 1,635,298	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
24	Pacific Service System	\$ 76,171,200	\$ 1,523,424	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		1
25	Amos & Junior Engineering Inc	\$ 79,096,343	\$ 1,581,926	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
26	NJ Investment	\$ 79,512,143	\$ 1,590,242	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
27	Z&J Enterprise Inc	\$ 85,706,618	\$ 1,725,294	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
28	Prosperity Investment Inc	\$ 79,456,093	\$ 1,723,293	Nafico	✓	✓	✓		2
29	S. Prakash Construction	\$ 80,544,502	\$ 1,397,554	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
30	Black's & Son Construction	\$ 74,156,817	\$ 1,723,294	Nafico	✓	✓	✓		2
31	Feroz Construction Services	\$ 79,237,252	\$ 1,723,294	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
32	SBC Construction, Supplies & Transportation	\$ 77,552,076	\$ 1,723,294	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
33	ART Supplies & General Construction	\$ 79,934,117	\$ 1,598,683	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
34	STS Investments	\$ 81,979,769	\$ 1,639,595	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
35	AE&N General Contracting	\$ 82,907,527	\$ 1,723,294	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
36	BM Property Investments Inc	\$ 84,930,740	\$ 1,718,614	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
37	FS Construction	\$ 76,857,081	\$ 1,537,142	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
	Engineer's Estimate	\$ 86,164,680							

Date of Tender Opening: April 01, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Culture, Youth & Sports (86/2025/44) - Construction of Boundary Fence and Parking lot at Mabaruma

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid Amount & Currency	Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	R&M Mining Invesments Project Inc	\$ 49,254,602	\$ 994,835	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
2	Mohamed Rafi Yusooof Construction	\$ 48,703,982	\$ 994,836	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
3	AM Concepts Inc	\$ 38,376,975	No Bid Security Seen		✓	✓	✓		2
4	AR Engineering & General Services	\$ 84,773,957	\$ 1,840,000	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
5	AVP Investments	\$ 49,490,740	\$ 989,814	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
6	Troy Dainty Construction	\$ 46,281,113	\$ 940,000	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		1
7	Black's & Son Construction	\$ 45,188,777	\$ 994,837	Nafico	✓	✓	✓		2
8	K&K Boat Building, Construction & General Supplies	\$ 44,767,660	\$ 895,353	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
9	The Dependable Construction & General Services	\$ 48,950,527	\$ 979,011	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
10	Ziona's Enterprise	\$ 45,501,183	\$ 994,837	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		1
11	Singh & Son Construction	\$ 49,576,454	\$ 991,529	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
12	Legalize Trucking & Contracting Service	\$ 44,576,458	\$ 994,837	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
13	Supreme Contracting & Supplies	\$ 46,202,384	\$ 924,048	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
14	Forever Construction	\$ 44,520,756	\$ 994,837	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
15	SBC Construction, Supplies & Transportation	\$ 44,394,019	\$ 994,837	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
16	Z&J Enterprise Inc	\$ 49,604,625	No Bid Security Seen		✓	✓	✓		2
17	JR Civil Works	\$ 45,930,113	\$ 918,602	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
18	Triple A Establishment	\$ 45,275,307	\$ 905,506	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
19	Prosperity Investment Inc	\$ 46,524,628	\$ 994,837	Nafico	✓	✓	✓		2
20	FS Construction	\$ 40,812,198	\$ 816,244	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2

	Engineer's Estimate	\$ 49,741,845							

Date of Tender Opening: April 01, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Culture, Youth & Sports (87/2025/44) - Construction of Boundary Fence and Parking Lot at Lethem

Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid Amount & Currency	Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	RP Engineering & General Construction	\$ 37,744,319	\$ 802,438	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
2	Z&J Enterprise Inc	\$ 39,927,444	\$ 802,438	Premier	Ltr	Ltr	✓		2
3	Pipang Construction & Engineering Inc	\$ 37,042,188	\$ 740,844	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
4	Troy Dainty Construction	\$ 36,361,910	\$ 760,000	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		1
5	3D Construction	\$ 35,636,013	\$ 712,701	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
6	Black's & Son Consturciton	\$ 41,148,555	\$ 802,438	Nafico	✓	✓	✓		2
7	Ican Contracting Service	\$ 36,590,589	\$ 731,812	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
8	S&S Contracting Service	\$ 35,958,575	\$ 719,172	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		1
9	J&A Lumberyard & Contracting Services	\$ 38,021,256	\$ 760,425	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
10	R. Kisson Contracting Service	\$ 55,921,681	\$ 1,120,000	Premier	✓	✓	✓		1
11	R&M Mining Investments Project Inc	\$ 39,412,217	\$ 1,583,395	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
12	Triple A General Contracting Services	\$ 37,744,056	\$ 754,881	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
13	Forever Construction	\$ 36,267,865	\$ 725,357	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
14	Legalize Trucking & Contracting Service	\$ 35,534,428	\$ 802,428	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
15	Mohamed Rafi Yusooof Construction	\$ 39,209,987	\$ 802,437	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
16	AM Concepts Inc	\$ 36,475,215	\$ 802,438	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
17	Reaz Akbar General Construction Services	\$ 39,883,072	\$ 803,000	Nafico	✓	✓	✓		2
18	Singh's Construction, Welding & Fabrication	\$ 39,610,263	\$ 792,206	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
19	NK Engineering Services	\$ 39,103,969	\$ 820,000	Nafico	✓	✓	✓		2
20	JR Civil Works	\$ 3,216,362	\$ 744,327	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
21	Triple A Establishment	\$ 36,987,384	\$ 739,748	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		1
22	Soverignty Investments Construction Services (SICS Builders)	\$ 41,806,763.25	\$ 802,438	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2

23	Prosperity Investments Inc	\$ 36,690,328	\$ 802,438	Nafico	✓	✓	✓		2
24	Gormain D'aguiar Construction	\$ 37,935,513	\$ 758,721	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
25	Zim's Construction	\$ 33,523,259	\$ 501,213	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
26	V&K Construction Services	\$ 40,020,897	\$ 800,418	Premier	✓	✓	✓		1
27	Vishal Trucking Master Company	\$ 36,134,308	\$ 720,000	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
28	N&A Construction	\$ 38,787,808	\$ 775,756	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
29	AVP Investments	\$ 40,282,342	\$ 805,646	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
30	Ziona's Enterprise	\$ 35,010,633	\$ 802,437	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		1
31	SBC Construction, Supplies & Transportation	\$ 35,994,206	\$ 802,438	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
32	Ash Civil Engineering	\$ 25,973,461	\$ 802,438	Nafico	✓	✓	✓		2
33	Alvin Chowramootoo Construction Services	\$ 44,747,136	\$ 1,000,000	Caricom	✓	✓	✓	1	2
34	Forde's Construction	\$ 35,100,912	\$ 700,000	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
35	Singh & Son Construction	\$ 39,985,040	\$ 799,700	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
36	FS Construction	\$ 31,507,392	\$ 630,148	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
	Engineer's Estimate	\$ 40,121,892							

Date of Tender Opening: April 01, 2025									
File Number: Ministry of Culture, Youth & Sports (88/2025/44) - Construction of Septic Tanks- Waste Water Treatment System Berbice Stadium									
Bidder No.	Name of Bidder	Bid Amount & Currency	Bid Security Amount & Currency	Bid Security Agency	GRA	NIS	Form of Tender signed	Hard Copy	Flash drive
1	Wazim & Sons Infrastructure Inc	\$ 151,541,061	\$ 3,240,000	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
2	EJ&N General Construction & Maintenance	\$ 158,762,730	\$ 3,175,255	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
3	Phoenix Engineering Enterprise	\$ 151,672,605	\$ 3,240,000	Premier	✓	✓	✓		1
4	Kascon Engineering Service	\$ 155,561,700	\$ 3,240,000	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
5	Rockey & Son Construction	\$ 125,878,525	\$ 3,240,000	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
6	Urban Road Builders	\$ 148,790,670	\$ 2,975,813	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
7	Supreme Builders Services	Form of Tender Page Not Completed & Signed	\$ 3,040,690	Premier	✓	✓	X		2
8	D. Chowkai & Sons Construction	\$ 132,509,475	\$ 2,650,190	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
9	Mohamed Rafi Yusoof Construction	\$ 160,854,834	\$ 3,240,000	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
10	MEP Engineering Services	\$ 142,147,688	No Bid Security Seen		✓	✓	✓		0
11	Metal & Fabrication Ink	\$ 148,754,466	\$ 3,240,000	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
12	J. Nimnauth Trucking Services	\$ 141,908,655	No Bid Security Seen		✓	✓	✓		2
13	R&M Mining Investments Project Inc	\$ 159,855,717	\$ 3,240,000	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
14	Navin & Sons Construction	\$ 113,344,266	\$ 2,266,886	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
15	A. Alli Construction	\$ 134,660,400	\$ 2,693,208	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
16	JR Engineering Solutions	\$ 144,635,826	\$ 2,060,000	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
17	N&A General Construction Maintenance, Supplies & Janitorial Services	\$ 158,194,260	\$ 3,164,755	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
18	Ziona's Enterprise	\$ 150,173,100	\$ 3,240,000	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
19	Properity Investments Inc.	\$ 159,786,995	\$ 3,240,000	nafico	✓	✓	✓		2

20	Am Concepts Inc	\$ 98,181,090	\$ 3,240,000	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
21	R. Kissoon Contracting Service	\$ 195,980,400	\$ 3,920,000	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
22	J Hussain's Construction & Supplies	\$ 120,020,334	\$ 2,400,407	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		2
23	Yhadram & Sons Construction Establishment	\$ 138,393,150	\$ 1,398,720	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		2
24	Superior Gorup Inc	\$ 161,493,625	\$ 3,229,783	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
25	Ilya's Legacy Farms	\$ 141,228,150	\$ 3,240,000	Premier	✓	✓	✓		2
26	Amos & Junior Engineering Inc.	\$ 156,094,260	\$ 3,122,755	Premier	✓	✓	✓		3
27	K Mahabir Construction Firm	\$ 141,758,150	\$ 2,835,163	Caricom	✓	✓	✓		4
28	RNR Auto Rental	\$ 168,029,568	\$ 3,240,000	Assuria	✓	✓	✓		5
29	4A Engineering Enterprise	\$ 152,737,337	\$ 3,240,000	Premier	✓	✓	✓		6
	Engineer's Estimate	\$ 161,647,019.55							