Date of Tender Opening: April 14, 2026

File Number: Audit Office of Guyana (02/2026/08) - Supply & Network of Server & Printers

. . Bid Securit Form of
B;lg.er Name of Bidder Bl(éi?;::::; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Igzll;(; flif:‘s,:
Currency signed
1 |Barker Systems $ 5,870,200 | $ 117,404 Assuria v v v 2
2 |Stuart Trading Establishment $ 5,849,000 | $ 5,849,000 Caricom v v v 1
3 [Novate Solutions Inc Form of Tender Bid Security Not Seen v v X 0
Page Not Seen
4 |MAEC Enterprises $ 7,961,750 | $ 159,235 Assuria v v v 2
5 |Promotech Inc $ 10,444,270 | $ 208,885 Premier v v v 1
6 |Digital Technology Group of Companies $ 7,964,000 | $ 159,280 Assuria v v v 2
7 |PBS Technologies (Guyana) Inc $ 10,318,853 | $ 210,985 Premier v v v 2
8 |Laparkan Trading (Guyana) Limited $ 5,760,000 | $ 115,200 | Mutual Fire Ins v v v 2
9 |FDT Solutions $ 6,770,300 Bid Security Not Seen v v v 0




Date of Tender Opening: April 14, 2026

File Number: Ministry of Home Affairs (94/2026/51) - Procurement of Arms & Ammunition

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fk}Sh
No. Currency . Copy | drive
Currency signed
1  |Queensway Security Service Inc $ 240,050,000 | $ 4,801,000 Premier v v v 1




Date of Tender Opening: April 14, 2026

File Number: Georgetown Public Hospital Corporation (157/2026/47) - Supply & Delivery of IT Equipment for 2026

. . Bid Securit Form of
B;lg.er Name of Bidder Bl(éi?;::::; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Igzll;(; flif:‘s,:
Currency signed
1 |Bits and Bytes Computer Store $ 10,447,000 | $ 208,940 Premier v v v 2
2 |Barker Systems $ 69,618,757 | $ 1,392,376 Assuria v v v 2
3 |Digital Technology Group of Companies Inc $ 111,083,600 | $ 2,221,672 Assuria v v v 2
4 |KM Technology $ 72,221,250 | $ 1,444,425 Diamond v v v 1
5 |Nationwide Imports $ 195,592,145 | $ 3,911,843 Caricom v v v 2
6 |PBS Technologies (Guyana) Inc $ 105,255,397 | $ 2,768,684 Premier v v v 2
7 |MAEC Enterprises $ 120,473,200 | $ 2,409,464 Assuria v v v 2
8 |Vishnu Panday and Associates $ 24,809,160 | $ 496,200 Republic v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 14, 2026

File Number: Office of the President (62/2026/01) - Procurement of Vehicles Lots 1-3

. . Bid Security Form of
B;lg.er Name of Bidder Bl(éi?;::::; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Iél(z:;(}l’ gf:‘slg
Currency signed

1 |Jumbo Jet Auto Sales L1 $ 9,500,000| $ 1,250,000 Premier v v v 2
1 [Jumbo Jet Auto Sales L2 $ 27,000,000

1 [Jumbo Jet Auto Sales L3 $ 26,000,000

2 |Marics & Co. Ltd L2 $ 31,522,500| $ 085,648 Assuria v v v 2
2 |Marics & Co. Ltd L3 $ 17,759,804

3 |Voltex Auto Sales L1 $ 12,000,000 | $ 2,460,000 Premier v v v 2
3 | Voltex Auto Sales L2 $ 75,000,000

3 |Voltex Auto Sales L3 $ 36,000,000

4 |Auto Fashion L1 $ 8,350,000 | $ 167,000 Premier v v v 2
4 |Auto Fashion L2 $ 19,350,000

4 |Auto Fashion L3 $ 31,000,000

5 |BM Soat Auto Sale L1 $ 8,500,000 | $ 170,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |BM Soat Auto Sale L2 $ 45,000,000 | $ 900,000

5 |BM Soat Auto Sale L3 $ 24,000,000 | $ 480,000

6 |RRT Enterprise & Auto Sales L1 $ 9,489,000 | $ 1,929,180 Premier v v v 2
6 |RRT Enterprise & Auto Sales L2 $ 56,970,000

6 |RRT Enterprise & Auto Sales L3 $ 30,000,000

7 |J's Auto Imports Inc. L1 $ 8,144,000 | $ 843,524 Premier v v v 2




7 |J's Auto Imports Inc. L2 20,535,000
7 |J's Auto Imports Inc. L3 13,497,200
3 S&K Constmctlon, Consultancy Services & General 14,250,000 | § 1,333,000 Premier
Supplies Inc. LI
3 S&K Constmctlon, Consultancy Services & General 26.850,000
Supplies Inc. L2
3 S&K Constmctlon, Consultancy Services & General 25,550,000
Supplies Inc. L3
9 |Beharry Automotive Ltd L1 103,000,000 | $ 2,702,400 Nafico
9 |Beharry Automotive Ltd L2 58,500,000
9 |Beharry Automotive Ltd L3 66,320,000
10 |Car Clean Enterprise L1 7,000,000 | $ 2,000,000 Hand in Hand
10 |Car Clean Enterprise L2 25,200,000
10 |Car Clean Enterprise L3 19,800,000




Date of Tender Opening: April 14, 2026

File Number: Guyana Defence Force (78/2026/53) - Rehabilitation of All Ranks Kitchen

. . Bid Securit Form of
B;lg.er Name of Bidder Bl(éi?;::::; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Igzll;(; flif:‘s,:
Currency signed
1 | Visho's Hollow Blocks & Trucking Service $ 44,793,630 | $ 985,873 Caricom v v v 2
2 |Mohamed Sadique Ramjohn Contracting Services $ 58,031,694 | $ 1,180,000 Assuria v v v 2
3 |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 34,567,995 | $ 1,000,000 Caricom v v v 2
4 |Metal and Fabrication Ink $ 25,793,875 | $ 600,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |P&N International $ 49,768,400 | $ 1,168,600 Premier v v v 1
6 |Kaizen Industries $ 34,343,190 | $ 1,100,000 Premier v v v 1
7 |Innovative Development Solutions Guyana $ 16,030,455 | $ 366,289 Premier v v v 2
8 |Valiant Industrial Service $ 23,853,795 | $ 477,076 Caricom v v v 2
9 |T.P Construction $ 45,476,130 | $ 909,523 Caricom v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 14, 2026

File Number: Guyana Defence Force (79/2026/53) - Rehabilitation of Drivers & Sports Corp Barracks

. . Bid Securit Form of
B;lg.er Name of Bidder Bl(éi?;::::; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Igzll;(; flif:‘s,:
Currency signed
1 |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 53,409,000 | $ 1,500,000 Caricom v v v 2
2 |Innovative Development Solution Guyana (IDSGY) $ 52,465,400 | $ 1,160,210 Premier v v v 1
3 |Metal & Fabrication Ink $ 40,234,400 | $ 900,000 Caricom v v v 2
4 |Memorex Enterprise $ 67,732,720 | $ 1,400,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |SB Plumbing,Welding and General Construction $ 47,921,800 | $ 958,436 Caricom v v v 2
6 |AIMS Contracting $ 48,217,100 | $ 970,000 Premier v v v 2
7 |Emeralds General Constracting & Distribution $ 48,778,300 | $ 980,000 Premier v v v 2
8 |B.M. Property Investments INC. $ 66,409,000 | $ 1,328,180 Caricom v v v 2
9 |Valiant Industrial Service $ 59,913,980 | $ 1,198,280 Caricom v v v 2
10 |Vas Global $ 54,929,000 | $ 1,200,000 Premier v v v 2
11 |Garnet Logistics & Contracting $ 48,444,800 | $ 990,000 Premier v v v 2
12 |Vertex Ventures $ 48,287,850 | $ 980,000 Premier v v v 2
13 |Major Construction and Supplier $ 40,566,300 | $ 1,011,336 Assuria v v v 1
14 |Westbrook Caribbean Inc. $ 44,089,236 | $ 1,460,000 Caricom v v v 2
15 |Mahinda A.Ramkissoon Construction $ 52,148,100 | $ 1,042,962 Assuria v v v 2
16 |Telo's General Contracting $ 56,191,200 | $ 1,123,824 Caricom v v v 2
17 |P&N International $ 76,072,000 | $ 1,521,440 Premier v v v 1
18 |Norek Construction $ 56,293,898 | $ 1,125,878 Assuria v v v 2
19 |Rishma & Sisters Enterprise $ 53,191,500 | $ 1,063,839 Premier v v v 0
20 |D. De Souza Contracting Services $ 52,959,200 | $ 1,059,184 Assuria v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 14, 2026

File Number: Guyana Defence Force (80/2026/53) - Construction of GYM & Basketball Court Base Camp Seweyo

. . Bid Securit Form of
B;lg.er Name of Bidder Bl(éi?;::::; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Igzll;(; flif:‘s,:
Currency signed

1 |B.M. Property Investments INC. $ 58,506,600 | $ 1,170,132 Caricom v v v 2
2 |Major Construction and Supplier $ 61,569,000 | $ 1,231,380 Assuria v v v 1
3 |Vertex Ventures $ 40,816,750 | $ 820,000 Premier v v v 2
4 |Metal & Fabrication Ink $ 40,330,000 | $ 900,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |P&N International $ 51,939,500 | $ 1,038,800 Premier v v v 1
6 |Royal Genaral Supplies and Contracting Services $ 65,692,000 | $ 1,500,000 Premier v v v 2
7 |1 & S Sankar's Importers & Distributors $ 39,655,875 | $ 800,000 Premier v v v 2
8 |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 49,427,950 | $ 1,500,000 Caricom v v v 2
9 |Innovative Development Solution Guyana (IDSGY) $ 37,327,300 | $ 807,387 Premier v v v 1
10 |Mahinda A.Ramkissoon Construction $ 34,781,650 | $ 695,633 Assuria v v v 2
11 |Garnet Logistics & Contracting $ 39,309,135 | $ 790,000 Premier v v v 2
12 |Westbrook Caribbean Inc $ 34,651,380 | $ 1,360,000 Caricom v v v 2
13 |Valiant Industrial Service $ 37,968,445 | $ 759,369 Caricom v v v 2
14 |Vas Global $ 41,380,400 | $ 900,000 Premier v v v




Date of Tender Opening: April 14, 2026

File Number: Guyana Defence Force (81/2026/53) - Construction of GYM Court Base Ayanganna

Bid Security

Form of

B;ig.er Name of Bidder Bl(éi?;::::; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Igzll;(; flif:‘s,il
Currency signed
1  |Major Construction and Supplier $ 64,628,540 | $ 1,292,571 Assuria v v v 1
2 |NOVA VITA Enterprise $ 74,996,250 | $ 1,499,925 Premier v v v 2
3 |Valiant Industrial Service $ 35,883,141 | $ 717,663 Caricom v v v 2
4 |Innovative Development Solutions Guyana $ 33,949,262 | $ 804,108 Premier v v v 2
5 [Metal & Frabrication Ink $ 46,999,292 | $ 940,000 Caricom v v v 2
6 |D. De Souza Contracting Services $ 56,179,200 | $ 1,123,584 Assuria v v v 2
7 |Vas Global $ 36,405,180 | $ 800,000 Premier v v v 2
8 [P & N International $ 104,293,875 | $ 2,085,880 Premier v v v 1
9 |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 66,534,300 | $ 1,500,000 Caricom v v v 2
Form of Tender Page
10 |[Memorex Enterprise Not Completed But | $ 1,500,000 Caricom v v v 2
Signed
11 |Aims Contracting $ 39,170,775 | $ 800,000 Premier v v v 2
12 |Emeralds General Contracting & Distributors $ 38,809,050 | $ 780,000 Premier v v v 2
13 |SB Plumbing Welding and General Construction $ 49,611,440 | $ 992,229 Caricom v v v 2
14 |Mahinda Ramkissoon Construction $ 38,128,125 | $ 762,563 Assuria v v v 2
15 |Westbrook Caribbean Inc. $ 48,531,532 | $ 1,240,000 Caricom v v v 2
16 |Kaizen Industries $ 62,531,700 | $ 1,300,000 Premier v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 14, 2026

File Number: National Agricultural Research & Extension Institute (150/2026/21) - Supply & Delivery of Office Furniture

. . Bid Securit Form of
B;lg.er Name of Bidder Bl(éi?;::::; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Iél(z:;(}l’ flif:‘s,:
Currency signed
1 |Meditron Inc. $ 2,484,000 v v v 2
2 |Nationwide Imports $ 12,191,328 | $ 243,827 Caricom v v v 2
3 |Modern Engineering Supplies & Services $ 2,280,000 | $ 45,600 Assuria v v v 2
4  |Prospectra Solutions $ 2,741,264 v v v 2
5 |SKC General Supplies & Logistics $ 7,274,560 | $ 145,491 Caricom v v v 2
6 |K.P Distribution Service $ 7,329,360 | $ 146,587 Caricom v v v 2
7 |AZ-SAV Investments $ 1,800,000 v v v 2
8 |Giftland OfficeMax $ 2,584,000 v v v 2
9 |A & P Logistics & Transportation Service $ 4,752,000 | $ 95,040 Assuria v v v 2
10 |Technest Solutions $ 9,244,000 | $ 117,206 Assuria v v v 2
11 |SKM Pharmaceuticals $ 2,320,000 | $ 48,000 Assuria v v v 2
12 |Two Brothers Construction $ 3,400,000 | $ 68,000 Nafico v v 2
3 S& K Construction Consultancy Services & General S 13,476,000 | $ 269.520 Premier Y Y Y )
Supplies Inc

14 |VMS Business Enterprise $ 6,080,000 | $ 121,600 Assuria v v v 2

15 |Laparkan Trading Guyana Company Limited $ 1,061,600 v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 14, 2026

File Number: National Agricultural Research & Extension Institute (151/2026/21) - Supply, Delivery & Testing of New Small Farming Equipment

. . Bid Securit Form of
B;lg.er Name of Bidder Bl(éi?;::::; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Igzll;(; flif:‘s,:
Currency signed

1 |[Two Brothers Construction $ 33,688,650 | $ 673,773 Nafico v v v 2
2 |Shop Modern Guyana $ 62,680,000 | $ 980,000 Assuria v v v 2
3 |Jentech Office Supplies & Solutions $ 34,087,245 | $ 681,748 Caricom v v v 2
4 |SKC General Supplies & Logistics $ 46,500,000 | $ 930,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |AZ-SAV Investments $ 12,800,000 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
6 |Nationwide Imports $ 49,715,160 | $ 1,501,500 Caricom v v v 2
7 |Modern Agri $ 10,270,000 | $ 205,400 Assuria v v v 2
8 (2020 FMCG Inc. $ 36,573,540 | $ 850,000 | Republic Bank v v v 2
9 |Meditron Inc. $ 15,407,000 | $ 308,140 Diamond v v v 2
10 |Millennium Supplies and Distribution Inc. $ 29,000,000 | $ 1,100,000 Premier v v v 2
11 |K.P Distribution Service $ 46,370,000 | $ 927,400 Caricom v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 14, 2026

File Number: National Agricultural Research & Extension Institute (152/2026/21) - Supply, Delivery & Testing of New Equipment for Soils Equipment

Bid Security

Form of

Bil;lg.er Name of Bidder Bi(éi?;::::; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Igzll;(; flif:‘s,:
Currency signed
1 S &K 'Constructlon, Cosultancy Services & General S 5.755.000 | § 115,100 Premier v v v )
Supplies Inc.
o . Republic Bank-
2 |Western Scientific Company Limited USD $2,782.13 USD $25,000 Cheque v v v 2
3 |Nationwide Imports $ 4,200,440 | $ 84,009 Caricom v v v 2
4 |Meditron Inc $ 5,073,460 | $ 101,469 |Diamond Insurance| V' v v 2
5 |Azsav Investment $ 500,000 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
6 |Clever Solutions $ 14,435,300 | $ 300,000 \ Assuria v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 14, 2026

File Number: National Agricultural Research & Extension Institute (153/2026/21) - Supply, Delivery & Testing of Computer Tablets

. . Bid Securit Form of
B;lg.er Name of Bidder Bl(éi?;::::; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Igzll;(; flif:‘s,:
Currency signed
1 Prospectra Solutions $ 6,301,200| $ 126,024 Nafico v v v 2
2 |KP Distribution Service $ 5,296,000| $ 105,920 Caricom v v v 2
3  |SKM Pharmaceuticals $ 11,336,000| $ 240,000 Assuria v v v 2
4 |Nationwide Imports $ 7,355,680| $ 147,114 Caricom v v v 2
5 |Millennium Supplies and Distribution Inc. $ 2,240,000 v v v 2
6 |Modern Engineering Supplies & Services $ 5,800,000 | $ 116,000 Assuria v v v 2
- S&K Constmctlon, Consultancy Services & General 3 5,400,000 | $ 108,000 Premier v v v )
Supplies Inc.
8 |KJM Industrial Supply $ 3,200,000 | $ 64,000 Premier v v v 2
9 |SKC General Supplies and Logistics $ 5,316,000 | $ 106,320 Caricom v v v 2
10 |Technest Solutions $ 6,400,000 | $ 81,280 Assuria v v v 2
11 |Mohabir's Construction $ 6,919,800 | $ 138,396 Nafico v v v 1
12 |Cellphone Shack $ 6,233,920 | $ 124,678 Premier v v v 1




Date of Tender Opening: April 14, 2026

File Number: National Agricultural Research & Extension Institute (154/2026/21) - Supply, Delivery & Testing New Small Farming Tools

. . Bid Securit Form of
B;lg.er Name of Bidder Bl(éi?;::::; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Igzll;(; flif:‘s,:
Currency signed
1 |Nationwide Imports $ 70,075,000 | $ 994,303 Caricom v v v 2
2 |Shop Modern Guyana $ 14,252,000 | $ 950,000 Assuria v v v
3 |Millennium Supplies & Distribution Inc. $ 8,450,000 | $ 200,000 Premier v v v 2
4 |Rafeek Investment Company $ 35,120,000 | $ 720,000 Assuria v v v 2
5 |Jentech Office Supplies & Solutions $ 31,777,740 | $ 635,555 Caricom v v v
6 |Prospectra Solutions $ 24,920,000 | $ 568,176 Nafico v | Letter v 2
7 |Modern Engineering Supplies & Services $ 30,900,000 | $ 618,000 Assuria v v v 2
8 |Meditron Inc. $ 9,556,000 | $ 191,120 Diamond’ v v v 1
9 |Azsav Investment $ 14,554,000 | $ 300,000 Caricom v | Letter v 2
10 |SKC General Supplies & Logistics $ 30,472,000 | $ 609,440 Caricom v | Letter v 2
11 |K.P Distribution Service $ 33,226,000 | $ 664,520 Caricom v | Letter v 2
12 |Mohabir's Construction $ 20,034,200 | $ 400,684 Nafico v v v 2
13 |Modern Agri $ 7,900,000 | $ 158,000 Assuria v v v 2
14 gil(phce(;nstructlon & Consultancy Services & General S 13,160,000 | $ 263.200 Premier v v v )
15 |VMS Business Enterprise $ 14,750,000 | $ 295,000 Assuria v v v 2
16 |Clever Solutions (Guyana) Inc. $ 64,544,106 $ 1,500,000 Assuria v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 14, 2026

File Number: National Agricultural Research & Extension Institute (155/2026/21) - Supply, Delivery & Testing of New Tractor Dump Trailers Rotary Tractor Drawn Brush Cutter &
Rotovator Lots 1-3

Bid Security

Form of

Bil;lg.er Name of Bidder Bi(éi?;::::; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Iél(z:;(}l’ flif:‘s,:
Currency signed
1 |Farm Supplies L1 $ 282,456,000 $ 282,000 Assuria v v v 2
1 |Farm Supplies L2 $ 1,050,000, $ 21,000
1 |Farm Supplies L3 $ 1,400,000| $ 28,000
5 S&K Constmctlon, Consultancy Services & General S 48.850,000| $ 977,000 Assuria v v v )
Supplies Inc. LI
5 S&K Constmctlon, Consultancy Services & General 3 41,850,000
Supplies Inc. L2
5 S&K Constmctlon, Consultancy Services & General 3 7,000,000
Supplies Inc. L3
3 |MASSY Motors (Guyana) Ltd L1 $ 14,600,000 | $ 352,000 CG United v v v 2
3 |MASSY Motors (Guyana) Ltd L2 $ 1,000,000
3 |MASSY Motors (Guyana) Ltd L3 $ 2,000,000
4 |General Equipment Guyana Ltd L1 $ 24,400,200 | $ 552,704 Assuria v v v 2
4  |General Equipment Guyana Ltd L2 $ 1,235,000
4 |General Equipment Guyana Ltd L3 $ 2,000,000




Date of Tender Opening: April 14, 2026

File Number: National Agricultural Research & Extension Institute (156/2026/21) - Establishment of MG Research Facility NAREI Mon Repos

. . Bid Security Form of
B;lg.er Name of Bidder Bl(éi?;::::; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Igzll;(; flif:‘s,:
Currency signed
1 |Kraft Innovation Momentum Inc. $ 39,483,145| $ 720,000 Nafico v v v 0
2 |K. Rameshwarsingh Construction Company & Supplies | $ 26,673,910, $ 553,478 Premier v v v 2
3 |Al Architects $ 24,227,351 v v v 1
4  |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 26,302,595| $ 700,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |SAAM General Contracting $ 30,949,543 | $ 500,000 Premier v v v 1
6 |Kaizen Industries $ 39,098,025 | $ 1,000,000 Premier v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 14, 2026

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (157/2026/21) -Supply & Delivery of a New Set of Mill Rollers for Uitvlugt Estate

Bid Security

Form of

Bidder . Bid Amount & . . Hard | Flash
No. Name of Bidder Currency %Izg:eriltc& Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.endedr Copy | drive
M signe
y Saisisha Sugar Equipment and Engineering Company | ;5 ¢109 199 17 | g 630,000 Assuria NA | NA| 2
Private Ltd (India)
US $149,132 US $2982 (Cgltlz(f?z}i anke) NA | NA| Y !
2 |Fundiciones Universo S.A.S US $85.586 Py qu
US $149,132
. : : COSMOS co-op.
3 |Airotherm Engineering PVT Ltd US $339,300 Bank Ltd N/A | N/A v 1
4 |Garnet Engineers US $104,888 US $2097 Ontario Inc. 1/ N/ v 2

(cheque)




Date of Tender Opening: April 14, 2026

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (158/2026/21) -Supply & Delivery of Crane Carrier Chains for Uitvlugt Estate

. . Bid Security Form of
B;lg.er Name of Bidder Bl(éi?;::::; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Igzll;(; flif:‘s,:
Currency signed
1 |Garnet Engineers US $48,888 US $977 Ontario Inc. 1 \)) | \ja | v 2
(cheque)
2 |Airotherm Engineering PVT Ltd US $41,850 US13,500 COSMOS co-0p. |\, | o v 1

Bank Ltd




Date of Tender Opening: April 14, 2026

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (159/2026/21) -Supply & Delivery of Drag Chains for Uitvlugt Estate

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder . Bid Amount & . . Hard | Flash
No. Name of Bidder Currency Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Copy | drive
Currency signed
_ Ontario Inc.
1 |Garnet Engineers US $42,888 US $857 N/A | N/A v 2

(cheque)




Date of Tender Opening: April 14, 2026

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (160/2026/21) -Supply & Delivery of Crystallizer Drives for Rose Hall & Uitvlugt Estate Lots 1-3

. . Bid Security Form of
B;lg.er Name of Bidder Bl(éi?;::::; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Iél(z:;(}l’ flif:‘s,:
Currency signed
1 |CREMMS Ltd L1 US $8,075 $ 252,000 Assuria N/A | N/A v 2
1 CREMMS Ltd L2 US $12,112.5
1 CREMMS Ltd L3 US $8,075
2 |Airotherm Engineering PVT Ltd L1 US $12,087 US $13,500 COSBI\;II%SLCK(I}OP N/A | N/A v 1
2 |Airotherm Engineering PVT Ltd L2 US $8091
2 |Airotherm Engineering PVT Ltd L3 US $8092
3 |Arrowhead Construction Inc. L1 $ 2,721,636| $ 1,000,000 Assuria v v v 2
3 |Arrowhead Construction Inc. L2 $ 3,408,714 | $ 1,000,000
3 |Arrowhead Construction Inc. L3 $ 2,721,636 | $ 1,000,000
4 |Garnet Engineers L1 US $19,888 US $397 Ontario Inc. | p/) ya | v 2
(cheque)
4 |Garnet Engineers L2 US $26,888 US $537
4 |Garnet Engineers L3 US $19,888 US $397
5 |Electro Fix Electrical Services L1 $ 2,700,000 | $ 190,000 RBL (cheque) v v v 2
5 |Electro Fix Electrical Services L2 $ 4,050,000
5 |Electro Fix Electrical Services L3 $ 2,700,000




Date of Tender Opening: April 14, 2026

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (161/2026/21) - Construction of 100m Light Duty Revetment at Blairmont Estate Lots 1-2

. . Bid Security Form of
B;lg.er Name of Bidder Bl(éi?;::::; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Iél(z:;(}l’ flif:‘s,:
Currency signed

1 |Moore and Son Business Enterprise Lot 1 $ 46,939,400 | $ 938,788 Premier v v v 2
Moore and Son Business Enterprise Lot 2 $ 45,809,400 | $ 938,788

2 |S & A Engineering Service Lot 1 $ 29,845,600 | $ 598,000 Premier v v v 2
S & A Engineering Service Lot 2 $ 29,922,200 | $ 560,000

3 |Rant Group of Companies Lot 1 $ 77,638,110 | $ 1,552,762 Premier v v v 2
Rant Group of Companies Lot 2 $ 77,321,029 | $ 1,552,762

4 |A & K Construction and Maintenance Services Lot 1 $ 47,193,000 | $ 943,860 Premier v v v 2
A & K Construction and Maintenance Services Lot 2 $ 46,063,000 | $ 943,860

5 |AYN Construction & General Services Lot 1 $ 47,741,000 | $ 2,020,000 Nafico v v v 2
AYN Construction & General Services Lot 2 $ 48,141,000 | $ 2,020,000

6 |Memorex Enterprise Lot 1 $ 71,563,500 | $ 1,500,000 Caricom v v v 2
Memorex Enterprise Lot 2 $ 71,063,500 | $ 1,500,000

7  |Orvin Mangru Contracting Services Lot 1 $ 37,772,060 | $ 800,000 Premier v v v 2
Orvin Mangru Contracting Services Lot 2 $ 37,137,260 | $ 800,000

8 |KT Construction Inc. Lot 1 $ 111,335,000 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
KT Construction Inc. Lot 2 $ 108,335,000




9 |K.H Construction & General Merchandise Lot 1 $ 32,946,800 658,936 Assuria
K.H Construction & General Merchandise Lot 2 $ 32,946,800 658,936

10 |Six S General Construction Lot 1 $ 34,146,500 700,000 Caricom
Six S General Construction Lot 2 $ 34,146,500 700,000

11 | M.Moore Construction Lot 1 $ 47,319,800 946,396 Premier
M.Moore Construction Lot 2 $ 46,189,800 946,396




Date of Tender Opening: April 14, 2026

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (162/2026/21) - Construction of 100m Light Duty Revetment at Albion Estate Lots 1-2

. . Bid Security Form of
B;’der Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS | Tender |L2rd| Flash
0. Currency . Copy | drive
Currency signed

1 |Six S General Construction Lot 1 $ 40,468,600 | $ 820,000 Caricom v v v 2
Six S General Construction Lot 2 $ 38,897,900 | $ 820,000

2 |Engineered Construction Company Lot 1 $ 57,640,900 | $ 1,152,818 Premier v v v 2
Engineered Construction Company Lot 2 $ 50,474,700 | $ 1,009,494

3  |Memorex Enterprise Lot 1 $ 71,617,950 | $ 1,500,000 Caricom v v v 2
Memorex Enterprise Lot 2 $ 93,478,400 | $ 1,900,000

4 |KT Construction Inc. Lot 1 $ 127,965,500 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
KT Construction Inc. Lot 2 $ 123,322,000

5 |Alpha Construction Sevices Lot 1 $ 39,688,800 | $ 800,000 Premier v v v 2
Alpha Construction Sevices Lot 2 $ 37,590,700 | $ 760,000

6 [Rant Group of Companies Lot 1 $ 83,236,810 | $ 1,712,176 Premier v v v 2
Rant Group of Companies Lot 2 $ 85,608,778 | $ 1,712,176

7  |N.Abdulla Construction Service Lot 1 $ 67,097,400 | $ 4,000,000 Premier v v v 1
N.Abdulla Construction Service Lot 2 $ 75,638,700 | $ 4,000,000

8 |AE & N General Contracting Lot 1 $ 66,853,800 | $ 4,000,000 Premier v v v 2
AE & N General Contracting Lot 2 $ 74,893,700 | $ 4,000,000

9  |Orvin Mangru Contracting Services Lot 1 $ 44,597,268 | $ 900,000 Premier v v v 2
Orvin Mangru Contracting Services Lot 2 $ 48,960,780 | $ 1,000,000




Date of Tender Opening: April 14, 2026

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (163/2026/21) - Construction of Skm All Weather Road at Skeldon Estate Lots 1-3

. . Bid Security Form of
B;lg.er Name of Bidder Bl(éi?;::::; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Iél(z:;(}l’ flif:‘s,:
Currency signed

1  |Quality Deliverer L1 $ 75,479,580 1,509,592 Premier v v v 2
1  |Quality Deliverer L2 $ 110,912,780 2,218,256

1  |Quality Deliverer L3 $ 154,564,190 3,091,284

2 |Shaffeeullah Sawmill L1 $ 83,167,040 1,663,340 Assuria v v v 2
2 Shaffeeullah Sawmill L2 $ 112,085,050 2,241,701

2 Shaffeeullah Sawmill L3 $ 152,623,350 3,052,467

3 |A&K Construction & Maintenance Services L1 $ 85,679,550 3,504,523 Premier v v v 2
3 |A&K Construction & Maintenance Services L2 $ 122,807,830

3 |A&K Construction & Maintenance Services L3 $ 175,226,150

4 |M. Moore Construction L1 $ 99,565,180 3,804,883 Premier v v v 2
4 |M. Moore Construction L2 $ 137,453,580

4 |M. Moore Construction L3 $ 190,244,120

5 |AE&N General Contracting L1 $ 69,890,040 4,000,000 Premier v v v 2
5 |AE&N General Contracting L2 $ 100,573,440

5 |AE&N General Contracting L3 $ 144,701,260

6 |Six S General Construction L1 $ 70,174,280 2,900,000 Caricom v v v 2
6 |Six S General Construction L2 $ 99,104,940

6 |Six S General Construction L3 $ 141,202,930

7 |Moore and Son Business Enterprise L1 $ 92,808,210 3,744,398 Premier v v v 2
7 |Moore and Son Business Enterprise L2 $ 133,099,230




7 |Moore and Son Business Enterprise L3 187,219,890

8 |KT Construction Inc. L1 108,820,800

8 |KT Construction Inc. L2 143,041,000

8 |KT Construction Inc. L3 230,756,350

9 |Modern Craft Construction Service L1 94,977,520 3,600,000 Assuria
9 |Modern Craft Construction Service L2 129,946,190

9 |Modern Craft Construction Service L3 188,099,065

10 K&K Construction Service L1 94,567,440 4,000,000 Premier
10 K&K Construction Service L2 129,261,000

10 K&K Construction Service L3 186,303,260

11 |Anand Singh Construction and Services L1 -

11 |Anand Singh Construction and Services .2 65,202,280

11 |Anand Singh Construction and Services L3 -

12 |AYN Construction L1 88,518,320 8,100,000 Nafico

12 |AYN Construction L2 126,821,090

12 |AYN Construction L3 180,136,110

13 |S.J General Contracting L1 73,180,140 4,000,000 Premier
13 |S.J General Contracting .2 106,798,120

13 |S.J General Contracting L3 147,746,192

14 |RANT Group of Companies L1 64,135,739 2,645,193 Premier
14 |RANT Group of Companies L2 99,173,693

14 |RANT Group of Companies L3 132,259,667

15 |Kumar Narine Construction Services Lot 1 85,620,590 3,391,758 Premier




Kumar Narine Construction Services Lot 2 $ 12,280,960 3,391,758
Kumar Narine Construction Services Lot 3 $ 169,587,880 3,391,758

16 |Alpha Construction Services Lot 1 $ 79,016,520 1,760,000 Premier
Alpha Construction Services Lot 2 $ 108,315,900 2,560,000
Alpha Construction Services Lot 3 $ 154,721,765 3,600,000

17 |N.Abdulla Construction Services Lot 1 $ 70,440,040 4,000,000 Premier
N.Abdulla Construction Services Lot 2 $ 100,683,440 4,000,000
N.Abdulla Construction Services Lot 3 $ 144,864,060 4,000,000

18 |Kascon Engineering Service Lot 1 $ 80,446,520 1,760,000 Premier
Kascon Engineering Service Lot 2 $ 108,329,540 2,560,000
Kascon Engineering Service Lot 3 $ 155,381,710 3,600,000

19 |T & R Construction Services Lot 1 $ 72,933,410 4,341,280 Premier
T & R Construction Services Lot 2 S - 4,341,280
T & R Construction Services Lot 3 $ 144,130,580 4,341,280

20 |KP Jagdeo General Contractor Lot 1 $ 72,894,910 4,339,520 Premier
KP Jagdeo General Contractor Lot 2 4,339,520
KP Jagdeo General Contractor Lot 3 $ 144,081,080 4,339,520

21 |Premium Asphalt Lot 1 $ 72,900,410 4,339,740 Premier
Premium Asphalt Lot 2 4,339,740
Premium Asphalt Lot 3 $ 144,086,580 4,339,740

22 |Tesseract Construction Guyana Lot 1 $ 94,192,780 3,802,654 Premier
Tesseract Construction Guyana Lot 2 $ 132,323,510 3,802,654
Tesseract Construction Guyana Lot 3 $ 190,132,690 3,802,654




23 |Z & J Enterprise Inc. Lot 1 $ 85,387,500 | $ 3,452,946 Premier
Z & J Enterprise Inc. Lot 2 $ 114,296,270 | $ 3,452,946
Z & J Enterprise Inc. Lot 3 $ 172,647,310 | $ 3,452,946

24 |AIM Enterprise Lot 1 $ 85,497,500 | $ 3,455,146 Premier
AJM Enterprise Lot 2 $ 114,406,200 | $ 3,455,146
AJM Enterprise Lot 3 $ 172,757,310 | $ 3,455,146

25 |Armco Construction Company Lot 1 $ 84,601,990 | $ 1,800,000 Caricom
Armco Construction Company Lot 2 $ 123,271,720 | $ 2,600,000
Armco Construction Company Lot 3 $ 180,296,325 | $ 3,700,000

26 |Orvin Mangru Contracting Services Lot 1 $ 81,670,600 | $ 1,700,000 | Premier
Orvin Mangru Contracting Services Lot 2 $ 117,894,050 | $ 2,400,000
Orvin Mangru Contracting Services Lot 3 $ -1 98 3,500,000

27 |Daks Engineering Guyana Lot 1 $ 94,082,780 | $ 3,799,354 Premier
Daks Engineering Guyana Lot 2 $ 172,697,900 | $ 3,799,354
Daks Engineering Guyana Lot 3 $ 189,967,690 | $ 3,799,354

28 |Memorex Enterprise Lot 1 $ 100,123,200 | $ 2,200,000 Caricom
Memorex Enterprise Lot 2 $ 141,465,940 | $ 2,900,000
Memorex Enterprise Lot 3 $ 221,930,830 | $ 4,600,000

29 |Satken Construction 1 $ 95,810,440 | $ 4,000,000 Premier
Satken Construction 2 $ 130,561,200 | $ 4,000,000
Satken Construction 3 $ 188,615,460 | $ 4,000,000

30 |Engineered Construction Company Lot 1 $ 71,954,080 | $ 1,439,082 Premier
Engineered Construction Company Lot 2 $ 94,829,130 | $ 1,896,583
Engineered Construction Company Lot 3 $ 135,343,175 $ 2,706,864




31 |K.H Construction & General Merchandise L1 $ 85,295,540 | $ 1,705,911 Assuria
K.H Construction & General Merchandise L2 $ 120,936,530 | $ 2,418,731
K.H Construction & General Merchandise L3 $ 172,774,470 | $ 3,455,490

32 |Sawh Construction Inc L1 $ 85,332,500 | $ 1,706,650 Premier
Sawh Construction Inc L2 $ 114,241,270 | $ 2,284,825
Sawh Construction Inc L3 $ 172,592,310 | $ 3,451,846




Date of Tender Opening: April 14, 2026

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (164/2026/21) - Supply & Delivery of Lumber Required for Bridges at Albion, Blairmont & Uitvlugt Estates

. . Bid Securit Form of
B;lg.er Name of Bidder Bl(éi?;::::; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Iél(z:;(}l’ flif:‘s,:
Currency signed

1 |Alliance Investments L 1 $ 7,508,810 | $ 873,275 Premier v v v 2
Alliance Investments L 2 $ 28,078,000
Alliance Investments L 3 $ 8,076,960

2 |Supreme Wood Products L1 $ 6,976,725 | $ 672,370 Assuria v v v 2
Supreme Wood Products L2 $ 19,230,250
Supreme Wood Products L3 $ 7,411,527




Date of Tender Opening: April 14, 2026

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (165/2026/21) - Supply & Delivery of Materials to Rehabilitate #4 Evaporator Body & Tube & Retubing Same at Rose Hall Estate

. . Bid Security Form of
B;lg.er Name of Bidder Bl(éi?;::::; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Igzll;(; flif:‘s,:
Currency signed
1 |Garnet Engineers USD $97,888.00 | USD $1957 b Cé?laef;gm“' NA | NA| 2
2 |TPLB INC. USD $101,220 $ 425,124 Assuria v v v 2
) ) ) Cosmos CO-
3 |Airotherm Engineering USD 13,500 OP Bank LTD N/A | N/A X 2
4 |Alliance Investments $ 16,436,510 | $ 328,730 Premier v v v 2
5 |Arrowhead Construction Inc. $ 15,902,213 | $ 1,000,000 Premier v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 14, 2026

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (166/2026/21) - Supply & Delivery of 30" Steam Valve for Rehabilitation of Evaporator at Rose Hall Estate

. . Bid Security Form of
B;lg.er Name of Bidder Bl(éi?;::::; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Igzll;(; flif:‘s,:
Currency signed
1 |D. Rampersaud & Company (Guyana) Inc USD $38,058.90 | $ 140,217 Premier v v v 2
2 |CREMMS Limited USD $10,802 $ 210,000 Assuria v v v 1
. : : Cosmos CO-
3 |Airotherm Engineering USD 13,500 OP Bank LTD N/A | N/A X 2
4  |Garnet Engineers USD $18,888 UsD $377.76 | 1D CanadaTrust- 1, ) \pa v 2
Cheque
5 |Mars. Trading LTD $ 15,390,000 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 14, 2026

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (167/2026/21) - Supply & Delivery of New Shaping Machine for Uitvlugt Estate

. . Bid Security Form of
B;lg.er Name of Bidder Bl(éi?;::::; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Igzll;(; flif:‘s,:
Currency signed
1  |Shop Modern Guyana $ 4,360,000 | $ 190,000 Caricom v v v 2
2 |Garnet Engineers USD $19,888 USD $397 b Cé?laef;gm“' NA | NA| 2
3 |Arrowhead Construction Inc. $ 4,560,000 | $ 1,000,000 Premier v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 14, 2026

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (168/2026/21) - Supply & Delivery of Laboratory Equipment for Albion & Blairmont Estates

. . Bid Security Form of
B;lg.er Name of Bidder Bl(éi?;::::; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Igzll;(; flif:‘s,:
Currency signed
: : Republic Bank-
1 |Analogic Solutions Inc. USD $38,108.75 USD §$958 Cheque N/A | N/A v 2
2 |Caribbean Medical Supplies Inc. $ 1,675,584 | $ 33,510 Nafico v v v 2
3  |Meditron Inc. $ 3,089,863 | $ 61,798 |Diamond Insurance| v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 14, 2026

File Number: National Drainage & Irrigation Authority (169/2026/21) - Construction of Spring Hall Sluice Region #5

. . Bid Securit Form of
B;lg.er Name of Bidder Bl(éi?;::::; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Igzll;(; flif:‘s,:
Currency signed
1 |DAKS Engineering Guyana $ 531,146,026 | $ 5,231,461 Premier Ins v v v 2
2 |Naran Construction $ 532,858,725 | $ 5,328,587 Caricom v v v 0
3 | Al Architects $ 500,946,149 | $ 5,009,461 Assuria v v v 2
4 |VS Construction & Rice Industries $ 524,656,807 | $ 5,246,568 Premier Ins v v v 2
5 |Legalize Trucking & Contracting Service $ 465,056,602 | $ 5,342,357 Premier Ins. v v v 2
6 |Urban Edge Builders Inc. $ 586,158,447 | $ 5,861,585 Assuria v v v 2
7 |CI Construction Supplies $ 508,664,783 | $ 5,086,648 Assuria v v v 2
8 |R. Razack Business Enterprise $ 521,595,884 | $ 5,342,357 Premier Ins. v v v 2
9 |NK Engineering Services $ 490,265,250 | $ 5,342,357 Caricom v v v 2
10 |Rafeek Khan Investment Company $ 590,747,525 | $ 6,000,000 Assuria v v v 2
11 |Persaud Engineering & Hydraulic Services $ 565,194,588 | $ 10,684,714 Caricom v v v 2
12 |AE & N General Contracting $ 487,271,610 | $ 5,342,357 Premier Ins. v v v 2
N&S Gumai & Sons Sawmill & Lumber Yard and Home
13 |Decoration Complex, Auto Automotive Accessories and | $ 503,108,959 No Bid Security seen v v v 2
Contracting Services
14 |Crown Road & Drainage Contractors $ 498,255,266 | $ 5,342,357 Premier Ins. v v v 2
15 |Z&J Enterprise Inc. $ 529,731,300 | $ 5,297,313 Premier Ins. v v v 2
16 |Tesseract Construction Guyana $ 524,196,025 | $ 5,241,961 Premier Ins. v v v 2
17 |Holistic Contracting & Procurement Inc. $ 537,999,840 | $ 5,288,933 Caricom v v v 2
18 |SAJ Investments $ 506,358,820 | $ 5,063,858 Assuria v v v 2
19 |Blue Print Builders Inc. $ 540,952,408 | $ 5,409,524 Assuria v v v 2
20 |M&B Construction $ 517,148,940 | $ 5,341,356 Assuria v v v 2
21 |Yunas Civil & Building Construction Services $ 520,660,507 | $ 5,342,357 Caricom v v v 2
22 |HE & Sai Investment $ 518,560,507 | $ 5,342,357 Premier Ins. v v v 2
23 |KT Fabrication & Construction $ 492,099,352 | $ 9,841,987 Caricom v v v 2
24 |Seenarine's Construction & Landscaping Services $ 531,676,950 | $ 5,342,257 Caricom v v v 1




25 |H2 Asset (Guyana) Inc. & Cummings Electrical Co. Ltd | $ 516,367,642 | $ 5,163,677 Nafico v v v 2
26 |NABI Construction Inc. $ 650,065,573 | $ 11,000,000 Assuria v v v 2
27 |Rishal's Construction & Maintenance Service $ 498,095,010 | $ 5,342,357 Premier Ins. v v v 2
28 | Kraft Innovation Momentum Inc. $ 524,012,318 | $ 5,342,357 Nafico v v v 2
29 |Longreach Investments & Construction Inc $ 480,245,430 | $ 4,802,454 Nafico v v v 2
30 |Permaul Trading & Distribution $ 555,170,884 | $ 5,552,000 Premier Ins. v v v 2
31 |Wazeer Khan & Sons Construction $ 520,014,600 | $ 5,202,356 Caricom v v v 1
32 |Professional Engineering & Construction Service $ 531,722,468 | $ 10,634,449 Caricom v v v 2
33 |K&A Contracting Services $ 524,462,610 | $ 5,244,627 Premier Ins v v v 2
34 |J. S Engineering Services & Supplies $ 524,256,180 | $ 5,242,562 Premier Ins. v v v 2
35 |D. Chowkai & Sons Construction $ 532,644,840 | $ 5,182,086 Caricom v v v 2
36 |Avinash Contracting & Scrap Metal Inc. $ 531,983,151 | $ 5,319,832 Premier Ins. v v v 2
37 |Brandon Establishment Zone $ 478,341,728 | $ 5,342,357 Premier Ins. v v v 2
38 |NK Enterprise Inc. $ 533,087,762 | $ 5,342,357 | Demerara Mutal v v v 2
39 |AJM Enterprise $ 530,781,300 | $ 5,307,813 Premier Ins. v v v 2
40 |C. Jorree Farming & Contracting Services $ 507,699,843 | $ 5,340,000 Premier Ins. v v v 2
41 |Digital Design Construction, Logistics & Supplies $ 512,517,863 | $ 5,125,179 Caricom v v v 2
42 |Parijan Construction $ 496,239,266 | $ 5,342,357 Premier v v v 2
43 |Buddy's Construction $ 528,166,380 | $ 8,000,000 Premier v v v 2
44 |DG Enterprise $ 531,919,374 | $ 5,342,257 Caricom v v v 2
45 |Dundas Construction $ 530,684,417 | $ 5,342,257 Caricom v v v 1
46 |Dynotech Construction Chemicals Inc $ 480,000,000 No Bid Security seen v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 14, 2026

File Number: National Drainage & Irrigation Authority (170/2026/21) - Rehabilitation of Concrete Bridge at Foulis Hole Cultivation Right Bank Abary Creek

. . Bid Securit Form of
B;lg.er Name of Bidder Bl(éi?;::::; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Igzll;(; flif:‘s,:
Currency signed
1  |Truck Smart $ 38,715,432 $ 800,000 Premier Ins. v v v 2
2  |B&N Construction Services Inc. $ 37,818,459 | $ 799,368 Premier Ins. v v v 2
3 |C. Jorree Farming & Contracting Services $ 38,968,335 | $ 780,000 Premier Ins. v v v 2
4 |SAJ Investments $ 35,945,952 | $ 718,919 Assuria v v v 2
5 |AAJ Enterprise $ 35,022,267 | $ 700,445 Assuria v v v 2
6 |Seenarine's Construction & Landscaping Services $ 39,510,529 | $ 799,368 Caricom v v v 2
7 |Michael Rodrigues Enterprise $ 38,877,825 $ 777,557 Premier Ins. v v v 2
8 |R&R General Construction & Supplies $ 37,455,863 | $ 561,838 Caricom v v v 2
9 |Holistic Contracting & Procurement Inc. $ 43,839,128 | $ 795,371 Caricom v v v 2
N&S Gumani & Sons Sawmill & Lumber Yard and
10 |Home Decoration Complex, Auto & Automotive $ 36,072,960 No Bid Security seen v v v 2
Accessories & Contracting Services
11 |KR Project Management $ 33,938,142 | $ 678,763 Assuria v v v 2
12 |Gavin Mohabir & Son Investments $ 36,332,961 | $ 800,000 Caricom v v v 2
13 |R. Ally Construction & Landscaping Services $ 39,422,670 | $ 799,368 Caricom v v v 2
14 |D. Chowkai & Sons Construction $ 42,221,128 | $ 775,387 Caricom v v v 2
15 |Professional Engineering & Construction Service $ 38,795,820 | $ 775,916 Caricom v v v 2
16 |Zeebo & Sons Construction Inc. $ 36,921,161 | $ 738,423 Premier Ins. v v v 2
17 |Engineering OPS $ 35,330,775 $ 706,616 Caricom v v v 2
18 |Persaud Engineering & Services Hydraulic $ 42,004,158 | $ 799,368 Caricom v v v 2
19 |Crown Road & Drainage Contractors $ 39,902,987 | $ 799,368 Premier Ins. v v v 2
20 |VS Construction & Rice Industries $ 34,147,722 | $ 674,574 Premier Ins. v v v 2
21 |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 38,564,547 | $ 799,368 Caricom v v v 2
22 |Nicozy General Construction $ 38,100,563 | $ 762,012 Premier Ins. v v v 1
23 |NK Enterprise Inc. $ 62,022,188 | $ 639,731 | Demerara Mutal v v v 2
24 |Brandon Establishment Zone $ 34,369,335 | $ 799,368 Premier Ins. v v v 1




25 |KT Fabrication & Construction $ 36,872,010 | $ 737,440 Caricom v v v 2
26 |Sol & Sons Construction Services $ 62,523,111 | $ 1,250,462 Caricom v v v 2
27 |F4L Construction & Services $ 36,845,015 $ 5,342,357 Premier Ins. v v v 2
28 |Kraft Innovation Momentum Inc. $ 37,537,448 | $ 720,000 Nafico v v v 2
29 |A&K Construction & Maintenance Services $ 40,392,020 | $ 807,841 Premier Ins. v v v 2
30 |BM Soat Property Management Inc. $ 39,968,408 | $ 799,368 Caricom v v v 2
31 |Ramesh Persaud & Son General Construction $ 36,861,195 | $ 737,224 Caricom v v v 1
32 |Timehri Contracting Services $ 37,374,540 | $ 747,491 Primer Ins. v v v 2
33 |Global Builders Engineering Inc. $ 22,639,995 | $ 799,368 Caricom v v v 2
34 |Naran Construction $ 39,441,255 | $ 788,825 Caricom v v v 2
35 |RHR Enterprise $ 33,684,515 | $ 673,690 Caricom v v v 2
36 |K&A Contracting Services $ 33,958,722 | $ 674,574 Premier Ins. v v v 2
37 |Colling Mentore Construction $ 39,724,808 | $ 794,496 Premier Ins. v v v 2
38 |Parijan Construction $ 39,080,837 | $ 799,368 Premier Ins. v v v 2
39 |J.S Engineering Services & Supplies $ 33,728,688 | $ 674,574 Premier Ins. v v v 2
40 |M&B Construction $ 37,065,179 | $ 799,368 Assuria v v v 2
41 |I.Khan Contracting Services $ 35,938,119 | $ 718,762 Assuria v v v 2
42 |V.IEnterprise $ 37,644,968 | $ 760,000 Premier Ins. v v v 2
43 |DG Enterprise $ 38,865,750 | $ 799,368 Caricom v v v 1
44 |Dundas Construction Inc $ 38,872,260 | $ 799,368 Caricom v v v 2
45 |Qu-Pro $ 39,251,352 | $ 785,027 Assuria v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 14, 2026

File Number: National Drainage & Irrigation Authority (171/2026/21) - Rehabilitation of Drainage Structure in Wauna

. . Bid Securit Form of
B;lg.er Name of Bidder Bl(éi?;::::; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Igzll;(; flif:‘s,:
Currency signed

1 |Holistic Contracting & Procurement Inc. $ 24,624,075 | $ 461,511 Caricom v v v 2
2 |D. Chowkai & Sons Construction $ 23,934,750 | $ 449,915 Caicom v v v 2
3  |Supreme Contracting & Supplies $ 21,138,600 | $ 422,772 Caricom v v v 2
4 |MCRAE'S Supermarket and General Satore $ 22,097,400 | $ 441,588 Assuria v v v 2
5 |ARK Trading $ 56,453,250 | $ 1,129,065 Nafico v v v 2
6 |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 22,328,408 | $ 463,330 Caricom v v v 2
7 |K & K Boat Building Construction & General Supplies | $ 22,976,100 | $ 459,522 Assuria v v v 2
8 |Naran Construction $ 22,779,750 | $ 455,595 Caricom v v v 2
9 |Jemcorp Engineering and Imports $ 20,430,000 | $ 460,000 Assuria v v v 2
10 |Gopie Investment Inc $ 48,052,200 | $ 961,044 Caricom v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 14, 2026

File Number: National Drainage & Irrigation Authority (172/2026/21) - Rehabilitation of Concrete Bridge at Esah & Jacob Along Phase 2 All Weather Road

. . Bid Securit Form of
B;lg.er Name of Bidder Bl(éi?;::::; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Igzll;(; flif:‘s,:
Currency signed
1 |DJ General Construction and Supplies $ 36,525,264 | $ 730,505 Premier v v v 2
2 |Imran & Son Drainage & Irrigation $ 30,141,605 | $ 639,731 Premier v v v 2
3 |K & A Contracting Services $ 27,838,860 | $ 639,732 Premier v v v 2
4 |V S Construction & Rice Industries $ 28,233,723 | $ 639,732 Premier v v v 2
5 |R. ALLY Construction & Landscaping Service $ 31,154,813 | $ 639,731 Caricom v v v 2
6 |B. M Property Investment Inc. $ 31,986,570 | $ 639,731 Caricom v v v 2
7  |Kraft Innovation Momentum Inc. $ 27,265,613 | $ 700,000 Nafico v v v 2
8 |NICOZY General Construction $ 26,384,138 | $ 527,683 Premier v v v 2
9 |Michael Rodrigues Enterprise $ 30,412,410 | $ 608,249 Premier v v v 2
10 |Komera General Construction $ 31,438,103 | $ 628,762 Caricom v v v 2
11 |Parijan Construction $ 29,076,920 | $ 639,731 Premier v v v 2
12 |D. Chowkai & Sons Construction $ 30,968,543 | $ 620,520 Caricom v v v 2
13 | Arjune Construction Inc. $ 34,047,252 | $ 680,945 Premier v v v 2
14 |Engineering OPS $ 28,453,294 | $ 569,066 Caricom v v v 2
15 |A & K Construction and Maintenance Services $ 27,585,810 | $ 551,717 Premier v v v 2
16 N&S Gumam' & Sons Sawmill & Lumber Yard and S 28.433.160 No Bid Security Seen v v v )
Home Decoration
17 |F 4 L Construction & Service $ 29,635,221 | $ 639,732 Premier v v v 2
18 |K. T Frabrication & Construction $ 29,496,075 | $ 589,921 Caricom v v v 2
19 |Professional Engineering & Construction Service $ 30,635,850 | $ 612,717 Caricom v v v 2
20 |R. C Construction Inc. $ 47,474,083 | $ 949,482 Caricom v v v 2
21 |Ramesh Persaud & Sons General Construction $ 28,073,955 | $ 561,479 Caricom v v v 2
22  |Truck Smart $ 30,694,524 | $ 800,000 Premier v v v 2
23 |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 30,331,329 | $ 639,731 Caricom v v v 2
24 |K R Project Management $ 27,399,540 | $ 509,014 Assuria v v v 2
25 |AJM Enterprise $ 31,972,500 | $ 639,450 Premier v v v 2




26 |VIEnterprise $ 29,483,423 | $ 610,000 Premier v v v 2
27 |Z & J Enterprise Inc. $ 31,762,500 | $ 635,250 Premier v v v 2
28 |NK Enterprise Inc. $ 31,718,337 | $ 799,36 | DemeraraFire & | 1, v 2
General
29 |Collin Mentore Construction $ 31,760,873 | $ 635,200 Premier v v v 2
30 |R & R General Construction & Supplies $ 32,640,038 | $ 652,801 Caricom v v v 2
31 |Timehri Contracting Services $ 31,683,435 | $ 633,669 Premier v v v 2
32 |Roadmaster Construction $ 27,912,570 | $ 558,251 Assuria v v v 2
33 |Persaud Engineering & Hydraulic Services $ 32,561,550 | § 639,731 Caricom v v v 2
34 |M & B Construction $ 29,463,950 | $ 639,731 Assuria v v v 2
35 |RHR Enterprise $ 27,731,242 | $ 554,625 Caricom v v v 2
36 |Crown Road and Drainage Contractors $ 28,551,920 | $ 639,731 Premier v v v 2
37 |J. S Engineering Services & Supplies $ 28,044,723 | $ 639,732 Premier v v v 2
38 |Holistic Contracting & Procurement Inc $ 31,834,793 | $ 636,513 Caricom v v v 2
39 |C. Jorree Farming & Contracting Services $ 30,931,320 | $ 620,000 Premier v v v 2
40 |B&N Construction Inc $ 29,501,787 | $ 639,731 Premier v v v 2
41 |Qu-Pro $ 31,510,500 | $ 630,210 Assuria v v v 2
42 |Abary Investments $ 28,483,098 | $ 639,732 Premier v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 14, 2026

File Number: National Drainage & Irrigation Authority (173/2026/21) - Construction of Farm to Market Access Road at Salem

. . Bid Securit Form of
B;lg.er Name of Bidder Bl(éi?;::::; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Igzll;(; flif:‘s,:
Currency signed
1 |DCSN Construction & General Supplies Inc. $ 276,328,710 | $ 4,500,000 Premier Ins v v v 2
2  |BK International Inc. $ 303,771,405 | $ 4,556,600 Nafico v v v 2
3 |Parijan Construction $ 265,319,145 | $ 4,649,976 Premier Ins v v v 2
4  |Multitech Engineering Services Inc. $ 308,081,760 | $ 4,621,226 Premier Ins v v v 2
5 |Khan's Construction & Transportation Services Inc. $ 270,992,479 | $ 4,649,975 Nafico v v v 2
6 |Al Architects $ 265,773,018 | $ 3,986,595 Assuria v v v 1
7 Archie's & Son Stone & Sand Supply $ 250,088,984 | $ 4,649,976 Assuria v v v 2
8 |A. Nazier & Son Contracting &General Supplies $ 287,432,880 | $ 4,311,493 Assuria v v v 2
9 |Amic General Contracting Services $ 281,284,290 | $ 4,650,000 Caricom v v v 2
10 |Z&]J Enterprise Inc. $ 306,661,005 | $ 4,599,915 Premier Ins v v v 2
11 |RZB Construction & General Supplies $ 298,568,865 | $ 4,514,975 Caricom v v v 1
12 |[MSR International Enterprise $ 296,931,854 | $ 4,649,975 Caricom v v v 2
13 |Khan's Enterprise $ 284,522,616 | $ 6,199,967 Assuria v v v 2
14 |AJM Enterprise $ 304,204,005 | $ 4,563,060 Premier Ins v v v 2
15 Romcol Construction, Engineering & Maintenance S 308.503.335| § 4,649.976 Caricom v v v )
Services Inc.
: Not completed nor :
16 |Lenel Enterprise signed $ 4,339,162 Assuria v v X 2
17 |MMS Enterprise $ 298,639,425 | $ 4,649,975 Caricom v v v 2
18 |Arjune Construction Inc. $ 326,264,445 | $ 4,893,967 Premier Ins v v v 2
19 |BM Property Investments Inc. $ 309,998,367 | $ 4,649,975 Caricom v v v 2
20 |S. Singh Construction Service $ 314,542,935 | $ 4,718,144 Premier Ins v v v 2
21 |JD Investments Inc. $ 303,163,875 | $ 4,547,458 Premier Ins v v v 2
22 |Dada's Realtor & Marketing Inc. Signed not $ 4,649,975 Assuria v v v 2

completed




23 |S. Maraj Contracting Services $ 287,233,695 | $ 4,500,000 Caricom v v v 2
24 |Zeebo & Sons Construction Inc. $ 293,000,558 | $ 4,395,009 Premier Ins v v v 1
25 |AM Shaffi Contracting $ 625,177,265 | $ 9,392,659 Premier Ins v v v 2
26 |EECS (Empire Electrical Contrcating Services) $ 305,483,325 | $ 4,582,250 Premier Ins v v v 2
27 |Midnight Trucking & Heavy Services & Construction $ 302,014,020 | $ 4,530,211 Premier Ins. v v v 2
28 |Basdeo Engineering Services $ 291,376,050 | $ 4,370,640 Assuria v v v 2
29 |Eagle Transportation & Construction Inc. $ 299,114,865 | $ 4,500,000 Caricom v v v 2
30 |Triple 'A' Construction Services & Supplies $ 250,225,133 | $ 3,753,377 Assuria v v v 2
31 |Engineered Construction Company $ 276,635,100 | $ 4,149,527 Premier Ins. v v v 1
32 |Hollistic Contracting & Procurement Inc. $ 307,965,525 | $ 4,603,476 Caricom v v v 2
33 |D. David International $ 303,233,700 | $ 4,649,975 Caricom v v v 2
34 |J&M Shipping Inc. $ 438,536,438 | $ 6,578,047 | Demerara Mutual v v v 2
35 |Triple P Construction & General Supplies $ 270,052,440 | $ 405,078 Caricom v v v 2
36 |Urban Edge Builders Inc. $ 304,230,465 | $ 4,563,457 Assuria v v v 2
37 |Extreme Construction & Supplies $ 300,452,040 | $ 4,506,781 Caricom v v v 2
38 |CI Construction Supplies $ 273,979,388 | $ 4,109,691 Assuria v v v 2
39 |Legalize Trucking & Contracting Service $ 278,396,265 | $ 4,649,976 Premier Ins. v v v 2
40 |J. Hussain's Construction & Supplies $ 304,799,880 | $ 4,571,998 Premier Ins. v v v 2
41 |Gryphon Engineering Inc. $ 294271,425 | $ 5,250,000 Caricom v v v 2
42 |C. Jorree Farming & Contrcating Services $ 289,973,460 | $ 4,350,000 Premier Ins. v v v 2
43 |LongReach Investments & Construction Inc. $ 279,096,878 | $ 4,186,453 Nafcio v v v 2
44 |Yunas Civil & Building Construction Services $ 292,618,725 | $ 4,649,976 Caricom v v v 2
45 |Build Smart Construction & Supplies Inc. $ 322,719,810 | $ 4,649,976 Caricom X v v

46 |International Import & Supplies $ 333,678,564 | $ 5,005,178 Premier Ins v v v 2
47 |Blue Print Builders Inc. $ 286,847,033 | $ 4,302,706 Assuria v v v 2
48 |Repaul International Enterprise $ 297,957,765 | $ 4,649,975 Caricom v v v 2
49 |JKP Construction $ 292,436,700 | $ 4,386,551 Premier INS v v v 2
50 |A. Alli Construction $ 299,420,205 | $ 4,491,303 Premier Ins. v v v 2
51 |K&S Construction Not completed nor | ¢ ¢ 199 967 Assuria v | v X 2

signed




52 |Rafeek Khan Investment Company $ 287,813,873 | $ 4,350,000 Assuria v v v 2
53 |Sheik Hussein Contracting Services $ 287,453,761 | $ 4,649,976 Premier ins. v v v 2
54 |R. Razack Business Enterprise $ 300,667,920 | $ 4,350,000 Assuria v v v 2
55 |NK Engineering Services $ 295,318,853 | $ 4,649,976 Caricom v v v 2
56 |IB Contracting & Machinery Rental $ 277,367,160 | $ 4,650,000 Assuria v v v 2
57 |Crown Road & Drainage Contractors $ 264,269,145 | $ 4,649,976 Premier Ins v v v 2
58 |R&R General Construction & Supplies $ 294,126,420 | $ 4,411,896 Caricom v v v 2
59 |Formidable Investments $ 278,798,625 | $ 4,649,976 Assuria v v v 2
60 |NR Enterprisc Signed not 1 ¢ 4 17650 | Premier Ins v | v v 2
completed
61 |Avinash Contracting & Scrap Metal Inc. $ 308,588,952 | $ 4,628,834 Premier Ins. v v v 2
62 |Probuild Construction Service $ 308,711,760 | $ 4,630,676 Premier Ins. v v v 2
63 |Firma General Contracting Service $ 298,603,200 | $ 4,649,976 Premier v v v 2
64 |You Nailed It Contracting Services $ 308,581,875 | $ 4,650,000 Caricom v v v 2
65 |B&N Construction Inc $ 299,146,680 | $ 4,649,976 Premier v v v 2
66 | Dynotech Construction Chemicals Inc $ 359,706,900 No Bid Security seen v v v 2
67 |Sawa Investments Inc Not C(;Iil;fllee;ed nor $ 5,000,000 Premier v v X 2
68 |Buddy's Construction $ 290,408,895 | $ 4,400,000 Premier v v v 2
69 |D. Chowkai & Sons Construction $ 307,571,775 | $ 4,510,476 Caricom v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 14, 2026

File Number: National Drainage & Irrigation Authority (174/2026/21) - Procurement of (3) Surveying Drones

. . Bid Securit Form of
B;lg.er Name of Bidder Bl(él?lzl:::; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Igzll;(; flif:‘s,il
Currency signed
1 |MAEC Enterprise $ 18,343,500 | $ 366,870 Assuria v v v 2
2 |Sustainable Energy & Energy Efficiency Solutions Inc. $ 29,620,268 | $ 500,000 Caricom v v v 2
3 |BD General Supplies $ 16,500,000 | $ 330,000 Assuria v v v 2
4 |DCSN Construction and General Supplies $ 14,455,000 | $ 500,000 Premier v v v 2
5 |Shop Modern Guyana $ 16,363,000 | $ 840,000 Assuria v v v 2
6 |Novate Solutions Inc. $ 15,197,550 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
7 |Digital Technology Group of Companies Inc. $ 18,348,000 | $ 366,960 Assuria v v v 2
8 |AVARIS Inc. $ 13,300,000 | $ 266,000 Assuria v v v 2
9 S and K Constmctlon and Consultancy Services and S 19,880,000 | $ 397,600 Premier v v v )
General Supplies

10 |Latitude Geospatial Consulting Inc. $ 14,084,928 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
11 |Caribbean Shipyard (Guyana) Inc. $ 18,600,000 | $ 372,000 Premier v v v 2
12 |Zoon Inc. $ 24,977,892 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
13  |Crystal Lam Designs $ 14,047,687 | $ 311,564 | Demerarafire & |, v 2

General
14 |PBS Technologies Guyana Inc $ 20,973,973 | § 419,480 Premier v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 14, 2026

File Number: National Drainage & Irrigation Authority (175/2026/21) - Procurement of Sheet Piles

. . Bid Securit Form of
B;lg.er Name of Bidder Bl(él?lzl:::; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Iél(z:;(}i’ flif:‘s,il
Currency signed
1 |HR Distributors $ 37,136,640 | $ 800,000 Assuria v v v 2
2 |Alliance Investments $ 48,372,428 | $ 967,449 Premier v v v 2
3 |Timehri Contracting Services $ 74,687,738 | $ 1,493,755 Premier v v v 2
4 |General Marine Company $ 83,146,637 | $ 1,800,000 Premier v v v 2
5 |Parijan Construction $ 471,035,200 | $ 10,000,000 Premier v v v 2
6 |Dax Contracting Services $ 83,541,600 | $ 2,000,000 Caricom v v v 1
7  |Avaris Inc $ 67,476,280 | $ 1,349,446 Assuria v v v 2
8 |Toolsie Persaud Limited $ 91,837,547 | $ 2,500,000 Caricom v v v 2
9 |DCSN Construction and General Supplies Inc $ 69,039,744 | $ 2,000,000 Premier v v v 2
10 |Expert Builders & Supplies Contractors $ 163,143,488 | $ 3,262,870 Premier v v v 2
11 | VR Construction Inc $ 69,000,000 | $ 1,380,000 Premier v v v 2
12 |Rafeek Khan Investment Company $ 114,841,600 | $ 2,300,000 Assuria v v v 2
13 |SKM Pharmaceuticals $ 15,909,018 | $ 2,400,000 Assuria v v v 2
14 |Akamai Inc $ 44,042,800 | $ 1,280,000 Caricom v v v 2
15 |Crown Road and Drainage Contractors $ 49,992,000 | $ 10,000,000 Premier v v v 2
16 |A.Z Rock Inc $ 122,405,200 | $ 2,800,000 Assuria v v v 2
17 |Caribbean Shipyard(Guyana) Inc $ 70,000,000 | $ 1,600,084 Premier v v v 2
18 |Guyana Tractor and Equipment $ 73,760,620 | $ 1,475,212 Caricom v v v 2
19 |General Supplies $ 71,166,080 | $ 1,423,322 Assuria v | letter v 2
20 |Gopie Investments Incorporated $ 80,947,360 | $ 1,618,948 Caricom v v v 2
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