Date of Tender Opening: April 15, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Public Works (30/2025/31) - Consultancy Services for Needs Assessment Capacity Building and Grant Assistance for Micro Small and Medium

Enterprises- Linden to Mabura Hill

. . Bid Security . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Flefsh
No. Currency Agency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
EZ Information Jamaica Limited (Jamaica) Technical
. v
1 & Financial Proposal Submitted WA | N/A 2 !
) T.revor.Hamllton & Asso?lates (Jamaica) Technical & NA | N/A P ) |
Financial Proposal Submitted
3 Project Development Consultancy (Guyana) Technical v v v ) |

& Financial Proposal Submitted




Date of Tender Opening: April 15, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Agriculture-Fisheries Department (158/2025/21) - Supply and Delivery of Aquaculture Cage Mesh for Aquaculture Cage Project

. . Bid Security . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Flz}sh
No. Currency Agency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |BD General Supplies $ 4,846,600 | $ 96,932 Assuria v v v 1
2 |Braspeixe Aquicultura Limited (Brazil) $ 30,100,000 No Bid Security Seen N/A | N/A v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 15, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Agriculture-Hydrometeorological Servie (192/2025/21) - Construction of Phase Two Laboratory at Hydrometeorological Department

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & lilﬁslel::lzy Bid Security GRA | NIS ilin;;f Hard Flz}sh
No. Currency Agency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 57,220,884 | $ 1,053,000 Assuria v v v 2
2 |Anaz Construction Inc $ 85,530,871 | $ 1,053,000 Caricom v v v 1
3 |Maleya's Home Furnishing $ 53,668,224 | $ 1,053,000 Assuria v v v 2
4 |Gryphon Engineering $ 54,859,896 | $§ 1,053,000 Premier v v v 2
5 |Hana's Construction Cleaning Service & Supplies $ 49,844,454 | $ 1,053,000 Assuria v v v 2
6 |J Hussain's Construction & Supplies $ 48,381,084 | $ 1,053,000 Assuria v v v 2
7 |BM Property Investments Inc $ 60,335,172 | $ 1,053,000 Caricom v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 58,677,264




Date of Tender Opening: April 15, 2025

File Number: Guyana Marketing Corporation (213/2025/21) - Supply, Delivery & Installation of Four Temperature Control Fans at CPE, Sophia, Georgetown

. . Bid Security . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Flz}sh
No. Currency Agency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |IMS Construction & Logistics Services $ 2,800,000 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 15, 2025

File Number: Guyana Elections Commission (36/2025/11) - Procurement of Office Supplies Lot 1-2

. . Bid Security . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Flersh
No. Currency Agency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 United Trading & Business Services L1 $ 952,200 | $ 142,016 Assurs P P P )
United Trading & Business Services 1.2 $ 14,201,640 (L1-2) ssuria
Robin Sarabdial Enterprise L1 $ 2,263,755 | $ 195,438 )
v v v
2 Robin Sarabdial Enterprise L2 $ 17,280,000 (L1-2) Assuria 2
3 1&S Sankar's Importers & Distributors L1 $ 9,579,690 | $ 95,797 Premi v v v )
1&S Sankar's Importers & Distributors L2 $ 18,493,200 | $ 184,932 rethiet
. Bid Secure Declaration
4 4 4
4 |Paradise Food Products L1 $ 1,790,775 Completed & Signed 2
5 |Jalex L2 $ 46,134,000 | $ 461,340 Diamond v v v 2
Bid Secure Declaration
P. R L1 1,663,750 . v v v 2
6 amroop & Sons 5 ,063,7 Completed & Signed
Promotech Guyana Inc L1 $ 7,511,676 | $ 75,117 .
v v v
7 [Promotech Guyana Inc 1.2 S 26,209,471 $ 262,005 |  fremier 2
8 |NAB Establishment L1 $ 2,764,500 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
PBS Technologies Guyana Inc L1 $ 1,209,540 | $ 228,095 .
v v v
?  |PBS Technologies Guyana Inc L2 $ 1,209,540 (L1-2) Premier 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 15, 2025

File Number: Georgetown Public Hospital Corporation (127/2025/46) - Supply, Installation & Commissioning of Online Uninterrupted Power Supplies

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & lil;ingf:::lzy Bid Security GRA | NIS F,;,Oel;ln(;e(;_f Hard Flz}sh
No. Currency Agency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |Quintech Engineering Solutions Inc $ 17,850,000 | $ 357,000 Caricom v v v |
2 |Synetech $ 6,265,000 | $ 200,000 Premier v v v 1
3 |MAEC Enterprise $ 11,126,900 | $ 222,538 Assuria v v v 2
4 |Meditron Inc $ 3,974,685 | $ 79,494 Diamond 4 v 4 2
5 [Promotech Inc $ 7,948,946 | $ 279,938 Premier v v v 2
6 |Digital Technology Inc $ 11,142,423 | $ 222,848 Assuria v v v 2
Form of Tender
7 |Standby Power Engineering Company (SPECOM) Page Not Completed, $ 200,000 Assuria v v X 2

& Signed




Date of Tender Opening: April 15, 2025

File Number: Civil Defense Commission (98/2025/02) - Provision of Security Services for CDC Offices 2025-2026

. . Bid Security . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Flz}sh
No. Currency Agency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1  |Frontline Security Services & Supplies Inc $ 32,615,856 | $ 400,000 Re?gig;fe;‘nk v | v v 2
2 |Centaur Security Service $ 12,737,856 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
3 |Amalgamated Security Services $ 31,317,000 | $ 357,014 Assuria v X v 2
4 |RK's Guyana Security Services $ 32,921,988 | $ 400,000 Premier v v v 1
5 |Elite Protection Services $ 32,887,800 | $ 374,921 Premier v v v 2
6 |Nel Global Security Company Inc $ 28,967,400 | $ 289,674 Assuria v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 15, 2025

File Number: Civil Defense Commission (99/2025/02) - Supply & Delivery of One Cargo Truck with Stiff Crane (Hiab)

. . Bid Security . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Flz}sh
No. Currency Agency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |Massy Motors Guyana Limited $ 22,400,000 | $ 448,000 CG United v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 15, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Home A ffairs (126/2025/51) - Construction of Barracks at CANU Headquarters

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & lilﬁl:lel::lzy Bid Security GRA | NIS l;(::rnn(;eorf Hard Fla}Sh
No. Currency Agency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 SICS Builders (Sovereignty Investments Construction S 119,450,888 | $ 2,400,000 Assuria v P v )
Services)
2 |BM Property Investments Inc $ 250,005,945 | $ 5,000,118 Caricom v v v 2
3 |Republic Mining Enteprise & Construction $ 128,130,224 | $ 2,562,604 Premier v v v 2
4 |Vishal's Contracting Company $ 135,484,440 | $ 1,447,054 Caricom v v v 1
5 |ID Investments Inc $ 166,219,137 | $ 3,378,383 Premier v v v 2
6 Guyana Gypsum Innovations & Construction S 149.835.257 | $ 3,000,000 Nafico P P P 5
Company
7 |Romano Builders $ 156,206,321 | $ 3,120,000 Nafico v v v 2
8 |Digital Design Construction, Logistics & Supplies $ 127,730,696 | $ 2,554,614 Caricom v v v 2
9 |Green Plains Enterprise $ 111,964,377 | $ 2,239,288 Caricom v v v 2
10 |Sheriff Construction Inc $ 140,128,517 | $ 2,802,570 Assuria v v v 2
11 |Blue Print Builders Inc $ 136,208,867 | $ 2,724,177 Assuria v v v 2
12 |Urban Edge Builders Inc $ 130,269,542 | $ 2,605,390 Assuria v v v 2
13 [JPM's General Construction & Engineering Services | $ 116,959,068 | $ 2,400,000 Caricom v v v 2
14 |Ziona's Enteprise $ 144,220,335 | $ 2,900,000 Caricom v v v 2
15 |Civil EC Engineering Solutions $ 79,590,616 | $ 1,900,000 Assuria v v v 1
16 |Westbrook Caribbean Inc $ 106,294,919 | $ 3,200,000 Caricom v v v 2
17 |K&S General Contractors Inc $ 134,312,750 | $ 3,026,000 Caricom v v v 2
18 |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 120,244,908 | $ 3,000,000 Assuria v v v 2
19 |[STP Investments Inc $ 143,164,403 | $ 2,863,288 Premier v v v 2
20 |Reliable Investment Company $ 170,000,912 | $ 1,000,000 Premier v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 122,833,788




Date of Tender Opening: April 15, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Home A ffairs (127/2025/51) - Rehabilitation to Turkeyen Police Station

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & lilﬁl:lel::lzy Bid Security GRA | NIS l;(::rnn(;eorf Hard Fla}Sh
No. Currency Agency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1  [Sheriff Construction Inc $ 91,954,087 | $ 1,839,081 Assuria v X v 2
2 |Megapower Electrical & Construction Services $ 93,100,087 | $ 1,862,001 Assuria v v v 0
3 |Digital Design Construction, Logistics & Supplies $ 93,364,127 | $ 1,867,283 Caricom v v v 2
4 |Republic Mining Enterprise & Construction $ 65,959,040 | $ 1,319,181 Premier v v v 2
5 |Blue Print Builders Inc $ 86,963,087 | $ 1,701,311 Assuria v v v 2
6 |Urban Edge Builders Inc $ 85,065,587 | $ 1,739,261 Assuria v v v 2
7 | Vishal's Contracting Company $ 72,352,701 | $ 1,447,054 Caricom v v v 2
8 |JD Investments Inc $ 107,777,223 | $ 2,155,540 Premier v v v 2
9 |BM Property Investments Inc $ 69,166,888 | $ 1,383,337 Caricom v 4 v 2
10 Guyana Gypsum Innovations & Construction S 92.276.904 | $ 1,900,000 Nafico v v v )
Company
11 |Civil EC Engineering Solutions $ 57,277,138 | $ 1,300,000 Assuria v v v 1
12 |Gryphon Engineering Inc $ 67,211,888 | $ 3,000,000 Premier v v v 2
13 |Hana's Construction, Cleaning Services & Supplies $ 63,401,261 | $ 1,280,000 Assuria v v v 2
14 |K&S General Contractors Inc $ 62,575,500 | $ 1,450,502 Caricom v v v 2
15 |Maleya's Home Furnishing $ 86,029,304 | $ 1,720,586 Assuria v v v 2
16 |JKH Enterprise $ 72,111,706 | $ 1,460,000 Assuria v v v 2
17 |Reliable Investment Company $ 61,574,363 | $ 1,240,000 Premier v v v 2
18 SICS Builders (Sovereignty Investments Construction S 66.952.639 | $ 1,400,000 Assuria v v v )
Services)
19 [Emerald General Contractor & Distributors $ 72,212,288 | $ 1,044,246 Premier v v v 2
20 |Green Plains Enterprise $ 69,928,389 | $ 1,400,000 Caricom v v v 2
21 |J. Hussein's Construction & Supplies $ 64,399,898 | $ 1,287,998 Assuria v v v 2




22 |MDSG General Services $ 76,555,286 | $ 1,588,199 Premier v v v 2
23 | Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 63,582,332 | $ 1,000,000 Assuria v v v 2
24 |Teleform Solutions $ 65,017,809 | $ 1,320,000 Assuria v v v 2
25 |AYN Construction & General Services $ 68,146,694 | $ 1,600,000 Premier v v v 2
26 |P&P Investments $ 82,404,883 | $ 1,648,098 Assuria v v v 2
27 |MAEC Enterprises $ 67,996,942 | $ 1,888,000 Assuria v v v 2
28 |Westbrook Caribbean Inc $ 68,446,201 | $ 1,300,000 Caricom v v v 2
29 |STP Investments Inc $ 93,852,282 | $ 1,877,046 Assuria v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 67,211,888




Date of Tender Opening: April 15, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Home Affairs (128/2025/51) - Construction of Police Living Quarters Mahadia

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & lilﬁslel::lzy Bid Security GRA | NIS ilin;;f Hard Flz}sh
No. Currency Agency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |Prosperity Investment Inc $ 151,914,158 | $ 318,283 | Demerara Mutal v v v 2
2 |R&M Mining Investment Project Inc $ 64,271,130 | $ 1,780,000 Caricom v v v 2
3 |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 87,626,248 | $ 1,900,000 Assuria v v v 2
4 |NP Contracting & Transportation Services $ 94,504,809 | $ 1,890,096 Premier v v v 2
5 |K&D Contracting Services $ 59,000,000 | $ 1,180,000 | Demerara Mutal | ¢ v v 2
6 |R&J Construction $ 69,199,153 | $ 1,383,983 Caricom v v v 2
- SICS Builders (Sovereignty Investments Construction S 79,796,042 | $ 1,600,000 Assuria P P v )
Services)
8 |Ziona's Enterprise $ 91,207,380 | $ 1,840,000 Caricom v 4 v 1
9 |Dundas Construction Inc $ 90,024,365 | $ 1,800,000 Caricom v v v 2
10 |Sheriff Construction Inc $ 88,053,158 | $ 1,761,063 Assuria v X v 2
11 |Blue Print Builders Inc $ 84,701,873 | $ 1,692,037 Assuria v v v 2
12 |Urban Edge Builders Inc $ 79,996,823 | $ 1,599,936 Assuria v v v 2
13 J;i(;i‘\];lr.\)nUdl J.)uuuulg, wolibduuLuull ¢ Jcllicial $ 167’824’230 $ 3’5423072 Assurla / / / 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 94,190,240




Date of Tender Opening: April 15, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Home A ffairs (129/2025/51) - Procurement of Medical Supplies, Guyana Prison Service

. . Bid Security . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Flz}sh
No. Currency Agency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |New GPC Inc $ 45,109,315 | $ 1,000,000 Premier v v v 2
2 |Total Health Care Solutions Inc $ 56,294,100 | $ 1,500,000 Premier v v v 2
3 |ABD Medicare Investment Inc $ 203,793,877 | $ 4,075,878 Nafico v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 15, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Home Affairs (130/2025/51) - Procurement of Building Materials Lots 1-4

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & lilﬁslel::lzy Bid Security GRA | NIS ilin;;f Hard Flz}sh
No. Currency Agency . Copy| drive
Currency signed

1 |Jeetendra Enterprise L1 $ 7,295,420 | $ 145,908 Premier v v v 2
1 |Jeetendra Enterprise L2 $ 7,532,280 | $ 150,645

1 |Jeetendra Enterprise L3 $ 2,780,250 | $ 118,263

2 |Prosperity Investment Inc L1 $ 7,682,000 | $ 153,640 | Demerara Mutual| v v v 2
2 |Prosperity Investment Inc L2 $ 14,025,000 | $ 280,500

2 |Prosperity Investment Inc L3 $ 14,820,000 | $ 296,400

2 |Prosperity Investment Inc L4 $ 17,000,000 | $ 340,000

3 (David Persaud Investments Ltd L1 $ 2,808,770 | $ 250,000 Diamond v v v 2
3 |David Persaud Investments Ltd L2 $ 4,590,580

3 |David Persaud Investments Ltd L3 $ 1,722,560

3 |David Persaud Investments Ltd L4 $ 829,840

4 |Toolsie Persaud Limited L1 $ 4,936,637 | $ 390,000 Caricom v v v 2
4 |Toolsie Persaud Limited L2 $ 3,838,905

4 |Toolsie Persaud Limited L3 $ 2,184,380

4 |Toolsie Persaud Limited L4 $ 2,803,566

5 |GuyBiz Establishment L1 $ 7,281,990 | $ 145,639 Assuria v v v 2
5 |GuyBiz Establishment L2 $ 7,394,890 | $ 147,897

5 |GuyBiz Establishment 13 $ 2,346,440 | $ 469,268

5 |GuyBiz Establishment L4 $ 9,218,240 | $ 184,364




6 |True Value Trading L1 $ 6,979,840 | $ 622,412 Caricom
6 |True Value Trading [.2 $ 6,734,250

6 |True Value Trading L3 $ 4,137,150

6 |True Value Trading L4 $ 13,269,360

7 |Alliance Investments L1 $ 163,637.14 | $ 310,651 Assuria
7 |Alliance Investments L2 $ 720,156.31

7 |Alliance Investments L3 $ 203,582.95

8 |Hardware Haven L1 $ 6,588,000 | $ 131,760 Assuria
8 |Hardware Haven L2 $ 5,297,500 | $ 105,095

8 |Hardware Haven L3 $ 3,013,750 | $ 60,275

8 |Hardware Haven L4 $ 7,672,000 | $ 153,440

9 |Memorex Enterprise L1 $ 5,186,880 | $ 104,000 Caricom
9 |Memorex Enterprise L2 $ 6,269,350 | $ 127,000

9 |Memorex Enterprise L3 $ 2,965,725 | $ 59,600

9 |Memorex Enterprise L4 $ 9,201,540 | $ 186,000




Date of Tender Opening: April 15, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Home A ffairs (131/2025/51) - Procurement of New Motor Bus

. . Bid Security . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Flz}sh
No. Currency Agency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |BM Soat Auto Sale $ 18,000,000 No Bid Security Seen v 4 v 1
2 |[Jumbo Jet Auto Sales $ 15,000,000 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
3 |Car Clean Enterprise $ 13,900,000 | $ 300,000 | Hand in Hand v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 15, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Home Affairs (132/2025/51) - Procurement of Land & Water Transport

. . Bid Security . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Flz}sh
No. Currency Agency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |K&K Boat Building Construction & General Supplies| $ 32,000,000 | $ 640,000 Assuria v v v 2
Form of Tender
2 |Prosperity Investment Inc Page Not Completed | $ 748,000 | Demerara Mutual | v v X 2

& Signed




Date of Tender Opening: April 15, 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (222/2025/21) - Supply & Delivery of Crusher Head Stocks for Blairmont Estate

. . Bid Security . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Flz}sh
No. Currency Agency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1  |Garnett Engineers USS74,888.00 | Uss1.497.76 | RovalBankof o Al v 1
Canada
2 |Cremms Limited US$93,733.60 $ 630,000 Assuria N/A | N/A v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 15, 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (223/2025/21) - Supply & Delivery of Double Wheel Rotary Ditchers for Albion Rose Hall & Uitvlugt Estate

. . Bid Security . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Flz}sh
No. Currency Agency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |Game Equipment LLC US$122,010.00 US§$2,440.20 Synergy Bank | N/A | N/A v 0
2 |Alliance Investments $ 55,055,683.26 | $ 1,110,114 Premier v v v 2
3 |General Equipment Guyana Ltd $ 4,443,000 | $ 88,860 GTM v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 15, 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (224/2025/21) - Supply & Delivery of Seven Inter-Row Cultivators for Industry

. . Bid Security Form of
B . Bid A i i
idder Name of Bidder id Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Flz}sh
No. Currency Agency . Copy| drive
Currency signed

NO BIDS RECEIVED




Date of Tender Opening: April 15, 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (225/2025/21) - Supply & Delivery of One 17 Ton Tare Weight Hiab Truck for Albion

. . Bid Security . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Flz}sh
No. Currency Agency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |Digital Designs Construction Logistics & Supplies $ 26,976,200 | $ 539,524 Caricom v v v 2
2 |Cevon's Waste Management $ 27,950,000 | $ 560,000 Assuria v v v 2
3 |S. Jagmohan Construction & General Supplies Inc $ 31,900,000 | $ 700,000 Premier v v v 2
4 |Guyana Tractor & Equipment $ 25,500,000 | $ 510,000 Caricom v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 15, 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (226/2025/21) - Supply & Delivery of One Diesel Type RPM 1800-1950 Hydraulic (Long Boom) Excavator

. . Bid Security . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Flz}sh
No. Currency Agency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |General Equipment Guyana Limited $ 49,200,000 | $ 984,000 Assuria v v v 2
2 |Guyana Tractor & Equipment $ 40,000,000 | $ 800,000 Caricom v v v 2
3 |Farm Supplies Limited $ 51,400,000 | $ 1,028,000 Assuria v v v 2
4 |Ibis Construction, Equipment, Sales & Rentals Inc $ 35,000,000 | $ 700,000 Diamond v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 15, 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (227/2025/21) - Supply & Delivery of Four S0OHP 2WD Agriculture Tractors for Rose Hall & Uitvlugt Estate

. . Bid Security . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Flz}sh
No. Currency Agency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |General Equipment Guyana Limited $ 27,067,440 | $ 541,349 Assuria v v v 2
2 |Guyana Tractor & Equipment $ 22,400,000 | $ 448,000 Caricom v v v 2
Machinery Corporation of Guyana Limited
v v v
3 (MACORP) $ 35,076,200 | $ 969,193 Nafico 1
4 |Farm Supplies Limited $ 22,400,000 | $ 448,000 Assuria v v v 2
5 |Jumbo Jet Auto Sales $ 26,749,224 | $ 534,984 Premier v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 15, 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (228/2025/21) - Supply & Delivery of Lot 1: Three 100-110HP 4WD Agriculture Tractors with Creeper Gear for Albion Lot 2: Nine

100-110 HP 4WD Agriculture Tractors without Creeper Gear for Albion & Uitvlugt Estate

. . Bid Security . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla}sh
No. Currency Agency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
Guyana Tractor & Equipment L1 $ 24,300,000 | $ 486,000 :
v v v
1 Guyana Tractor & Equipment L2 $ 72,000,000 | $ 440,000 Caricom 2
5 Machinery Corportation of Guyana Limited L1 $ 35,675,700 | $ 883,384 Nafi y y y 5
Machinery Corportation of Guyana Limited L2 $ 103,878,090 | $ 2,587,132 atico
General Equipment Guyana Limited L1 $ 79,200,000 | $ 5,931,000 )
» . v v "4
3 General Equipment Guyana Limited L2 $ 217,350,000 (L1-2) Assuria 2
Massy Motors Guyana Limited L1 $ 39,450,000 | $ 156,450 )
v v v
4 [Massy Motors Guyana Limited L2 $ 117,000,000 CG United 2
Jumbo Jet Auto Sales L1 $ 32,999,811 .
v v v
5 [Jumbo Jet Auto Sales L2 $  98,999.433[$ 1,979,989 Premier 2
Farm Supplies Limited L1 $ 27,000,000 | $ 540,000 )
v v v
6 [Farm Supplies Limited 1.2 $ 63,900,000 $ 1,278,000 Assuria 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 15, 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (229/2025/21) - Supply & Delivery of Four 180-200 HP 4WD Agriculture Tractors for Albion Estate

. . Bid Security . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Flz}sh
No. Currency Agency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
Machinery Corporation of Guyana Limited
4 4 4
1 (MACORP) $ 129,808,880 | $ 2,586,177 Nafico 1
2 |[Jumbo Jet Auto Sales $ 133,625,724 | $ 2,672,514 Premier v v v 2
3 |General Equipment Guyana Limited $ 153,880,000 | $ 3,077,600 Assuria v v v 2
4 |Guyana Tractor & Equipment $ 92,800,000 | $ 1,856,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |Rudisa Motor Company Guyana Inc $ 76,500,000 | $ 1,530,000 GTM v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 15, 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (230/2025/21) - Supply & Delivery of Four SSHP 2WD Agriculture Tractors for Blairmont Estate

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & lilﬁslel::lzy Bid Security GRA | NIS ilin;;f Hard Flz}sh
No. Currency Agency . Copy| drive
Currency signed

1 |General Equipment Guyana Limited $ 21,202,524 | $ 424,050 Assuria v v v 2

2 |[Jumbo Jet Auto Sales $ 18,499,672 | $ 369,993 Premier v v v 2

3 |Guyana Tractor & Equipment $ 72,200,000 | $ 344,000 Caricom v v v 2

4 |Farm Supplies Limited $ 13,700,000 | $ 274,000 Assuria v v v 1 2

5 ?ﬁ;@rggpf orporation of Guyana Limited S 20,505952| % 446,156 Nafico v | v v I

6 |Rudisa Motor Company Guyana Inc $ 15,200,000 | $ 304,000 GTM v v v 2




