Date of Tender Opening: April 23, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Tourism, Industry & Commerce (23/2025/23) - Supply & Delivery of Equipment for the GNBS Lots 1-5

. . . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Bid Security Amount Bid Security Agency GRA NIS Tender Hard Fla}sh
No. Currency & Currency signed Copy | drive
1  |Western Scientific Company Limited L1 US$2,126,977.48| $ 11,550,000 Premier N/A | N/A v 2 0
1  |Western Scientific Company Limited L2 US$69,098.37| $ 3,675,000
1 |Western Scientific Company Limited L4 US$29,872.64| $ 210,000
1 |Western Scientific Company Limited L5 US$339,973.01| $ 3,780,000
Clever Solutions Ltd. L1 $ 404,541,783 $ 8,100,000 Assuria v v v 2 0
Clever Solutions Ltd. L5 $ 116,528,664 $ 2,352,000
3 |Laparkan Trading (Guyana) Company Limited L3 $ 11,760,000( $ 235,200 GTM v v v 2 0
4  |Promotech Inc. L2 $ 13,967,674 $ 279,353 Premier v v v 2 0
5 |SKM Pharmaceuticals L2 $ 13,965,000( $ 280,000 Assuria v v v 2 0
6 |PBS Technologies (Guyana) Inc. L2 $ 20,323,816| $ 581,420 Premier v v v 0 0
6 |PBS Technologies (Guyana) Inc. L3 $ 8,747,100
7 Karligo Inc. L2 3 40,887,422 $ 817,748 Premier v v v 1 0




Date of Tender Opening: April 23, 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council Region 4 (06/2025/74) - Supply & Delivery of One New Refridgerated Truck

. . . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Bid Security Amount Bid Security Agency | GRA NIS Tender Hard Fla}sh
No. Currency & Currency signed Copy | drive
1 [Jumbo Jet Auto Sales $ 12,000,000 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
2 |Car Clean Enterprise $ 11,900,000 | $ 300,000 Hand in Hand v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 23, 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council Region 7 (06/2025/77) - Construction of Health Post at Arau

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Bid Security Amount Bid Security Agency GRA NIS Ifr()el;]n;e()rf Hard Fla}sh
No. Currency & Currency signed Copy | drive

1 |Raising Transportation & Construction $ 40,500,000| $ 405,000 Premier v v v 2

2 |Builder's First Choice Construction Company Inc. $ 45,124,400| $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2

3 |L.S Contracting Services $ 37,078,750 $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2

4 R.F I_nnovatlve Construction and Engineering $ 26,760,600 $ 940,000 Nafico v v v 9

Services

5 |Radon Construction $ 43,611,400| $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 0

6 |Day Clean Shop-Supply & Service $ 41,590,550| $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2

7  |VRP Investment $ 45,583,252 $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 23, 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council Region 7 (07/2025/77) - Construction of Doctor's Living Quarters at Wax Creek

. . . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Bid Security Amount Bid Security Agency GRA NIS Tender Hard Fla}sh
No. Currency & Currency signed Copy | drive
1  |Elite Builders Enterprise $ 40,752,999 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 0
2  |Raising Transportation & Construction $ 43,000,500 | $ 435,000 Premier v v v 2
3 |KLM Construction $ 46,467,691 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
4 |R.F Innovative Construction & Engineering Services | $ 30,661,419 | $ 1,000,000 Nafico v v v 2
5 |Radon Construction $ 53,800,606 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
6 |[VRP Investment 3 48,267,495.94 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 23, 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council Region 7 (08/2025/77) - Construction of Health Post at Dagg Point, Lower Mazuruni

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Bid Security Amount Bid Security Agency | GRA NIS Ifr()el;]n;e()rf Hard Fla}sh
No. Currency & Currency signed Copy | drive
1 [Jardine Construction $ 26,500,000 $ 265,000 Premier v v v 2
2 |Radon Construction $ 28,780,000 $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
3 |G&F Construction & Furniture Supplies $ 25,795,679 $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
4 Band N Contstructlon, Cabinets, Landscaping and $ 28.184.330| $ 300,000 Premier v v v 5

General Services
5 |Payless General Store $ 30,084,654| $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
6 |A.M.R Engineering & General Services 3 27,345,589 $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
7 R.F I_nnovatlve Construction and Engineering $ 26.741.834| $ 620000 Nafico v v v 9
Services
8 |B'Anns General Construction and Supplies 3 28,890,363 $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
9 |B&S Contracting Service $ 27,975,800| $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
10 |Builder's First Choice Construction Company Inc. $ 30,554,636 $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
11 [L.S Contracting Services $ 24,308,560 $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
12 |Elliott's Construction and Supplies 3 26,434,737 $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
13 |Sheik Hussein Contracting Services $ 28,915,694 $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
14 |KLM Construction 3 25,807,677 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 23, 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council Region 8 (01/2025/78) - Supply & Delivery of Nine All-Terrain Vehicles

. . . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Bid Security Amount Bid Security Agency | GRA NIS Tender Hard Fla}sh
No. Currency & Currency signed Copy | drive
1 |K&D Contracting Services $ 27,086,400 | $ 200,000 Demgr:r:zrzre & | v v v 2
2 |Marics & Company Limited $ 19,250,000 | $ 500,000 Hand in Hand v v v 2
3 |Car Clean Enterprise $ 21,600,000 | $ 200,000 Assuria v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 23, 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council Region 8 (02/2025/78) - Construction of Heavy Duty Green Heart Timber Bridge Monkey Mountain Tuseneng

. . . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Bid Security Amount Bid Security Agency | GRA NIS Tender Hard Fla}sh
No. Currency & Currency signed Copy | drive
1 |K&D Contracting Services $ 21,953,960 | $ 450,000 Demgr:rzzrzre & | v v v 2
2 |Putay Construction Company $ 21,213,200 | $ 450,000 Nafico v v v 2
3 [Platinum Engineering $ 22,589,000 | $ 450,000 Premier v v v 2
4  |Edwards & Son's Contracting Firm $ 20,000,000 No Bid Security Seen v v v 0




Date of Tender Opening: April 23, 2025
File Number: Regional Democratic Council Region 8 (03/2025/78) - Construction of Heavy Duty Green Heart Timber BridgeKurukabaru Village
. . . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Bid Security Amount Bid Security Agency | GRA NIS Tender Hard Fla}sh
No. Currency & Currency signed Copy | drive
1  |Putay Construction Company $ 26,172,800 | $ 450,000 Nafico v v v 2
2 |Platinum Engineering $ 27,333,520 | $ 450,000 Premier v v v 2
. . Demerara Fir
3 |K&D Contracting Services $ 27,458,900 | $ 450,000 | ~° g:nzral e& | v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 23, 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council Region 8 (04/2025/78) - Supply & Delivery of One New Motor Grader

. . . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Bid Security Amount Bid Security Agency GRA NIS Tender Hard Fla}sh
No. Currency & Currency signed Copy | drive
1 |Car Clean Enterprise 18,238,000 | $ 400,000 Hand in Hand v v v 2
2 |Digital Design Construction Logistics & Supplies 28,428,000 | $ 400,000 Caricom v v v 2
3 [Ragnauth General Enterprise 30,000,000 | $ 300,000 Nafico v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 23, 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council Region 8 (05/2025/78) - Extension of Primary School Campbell Town Potaro/Siparuni

. . . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Bid Security Amount Bid Security Agency | GRA NIS Tender Hard Fla}sh
No. Currency & Currency signed Copy | drive
1 |Edwards & Son's Contracting Firm $ 21,000,000 No Bid Security Seen v v v 0
2 |FS Construction $ 18,974,900 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
3 |K&D Contracting Services $ 21,351,910 | $ 250,000 Demg:;zr';:re &\ v | v v 2
4 |Ziona's Enterprise 3 22,227,550 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 1




Date of Tender Opening: April 23, 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council Region 8 (06/2025/78) - Construction of Heavy Duty Green Heart Timber Bridge Tumong Village

Form of

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Bid Security Amount Bid Security Agency | GRA NIS Tender Hard Fla}sh
No. Currency & Currency signed Copy | drive
. . Demerara Fire &
1 |K&D Contracting Services 3 21,953,960 | $ 450,000 v v v 2

General




Date of Tender Opening: April 23, 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council Region 8 (07/2025/78) - Extension of Mahdia Secondary School

. . . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Bid Security Amount Bid Security Agency | GRA NIS Tender Hard Fla}sh
No. Currency & Currency signed Copy | drive
1 |Ziona's Enterprise $ 34,621,950 | $ 450,000 Caricom v v v 1
2  |FS Construction $ 29,253,890 | $ 450,000 Caricom v v v 2
3 |Edwards & Son's Contracting Firm $ 30,846,130 No Bid Security Seen v v v 0
4  |K&D Contracting Services $ 37,064,955 | $ 450,000 | DemeraraFire& -, v v 2

General




Date of Tender Opening: April 23, 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council Region 10 (14/2025/80) - Construction & Rehabilitation of Perimeter Fence Upper Demerara Hospital Linden (West)

. . . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Bid Security Amount Bid Security Agency | GRA NIS Tender Hard Fla}sh
No. Currency & Currency signed Copy | drive
1  |Energy Empire $ 22,582,285 $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
2 |Jassy's Stationery and School Supply $ 22,411,675 $ 300,000 Demg?r::rz: re & v v v 2
3 |Double 'G' Construction $ 23,050,335| $ 300,000 Demgfr::rz:re &1 v v v 2
4 |Profitz Contracting $ 22,314,050 No Bid Security Seen v v v 1
5 |Hana's Construction, Cleaning Service and Supplies $ 24,342,802 $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 1
g |Winston Caesar General Contracting and $ 23,681,625 No Bid Security Seen v v v 1
Construction Services
7 |Joshua Sukhu Contracting Service $ 20,138,415 $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 1
8 B.T.B Construction $ 21,163,175 $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
9  |Supreme Wood Products $ 21,731,820 $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
10 |S. Duggan Welding and Fabricating World Form of Tender pot $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 1
completed nor sign
11 [Naran Construction $ 21,584,915| $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
12 |Ziona's Enterprise $ 20,671,090 $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 1
13 |Jonesco Enterprise $ 24,799,029 No Bid Security Seen v v v 1
14 |Rickford Douglas and Son Construction $ 20,193,415 $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
15 |D. De Souza Contracting Services $ 22,722,370| $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
16 |[Stephan's Investments $ 22,153,670 $ 300,000 Caricom v | Receipt v 2
17 |J. Hussain's Construction & Supplies $ 24.584.802| $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 1
18 |Mcrae's Supermarket and General Store $ 22,941,380 $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 1
19 [Aleema's General Construction $ 17,123,150 $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
20 |H & S Contracting Services $ 22,288,750 $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2




21 |SandJ's Cambio & Variety Store $ 24,900,000 No Bid Security Seen v | Receipt v 2
22 |Natty & Kids Grocery $ 19,346,195 300,000 Demgfr::rz:re & | v v v 2
23  |Three Brothers Investments $ 20,773,670 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
24 ;?J\ille:jrgrlg)nty Investments Construction Services (SICS $ 20.274.870 300,000 Assuria v v v 5
25 |Ramlochan Construction & Trucking Inc. $ 22,918,390 300,000| DemeraraFire& o, v v 2

General




Date of Tender Opening: April 23, 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council Region 10 (15/2025/80) - Rehabilitation of Blueberry Hill Access Bridge

. . . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Bid Security Amount Bid Security Agency GRA NIS Tender Hard Fla}sh
No. Currency & Currency signed Copy | drive
1 SO\_/erelgnty Investments Construction Services (SICS $ 26606.261| $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 5
Builders)
2 |Stephan’s Investments $ 26,108,940 $ 300,000 Demgfr::rg:re & | v v v 2
3 |SandJ's Cambio & Variety Store $ 27,390,506 No Bid Security Seen v Receipt v 2
4 [Naran Construction $ 24,618,000( $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |Double 'G' Construction $ 28,071,450| $ 300,000 Demgfr::rg:re &1 v v v 1
6 |D. De Souza Contracting Services $ 28,383,300 $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
7 |M.A.S Construction, Mainteance and Logistics $ 27,045,700 $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
8 |Ziona's Enterprise $ 23,014,750| $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 1
9  |Supreme Wood Products $ 23,996,940| $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
10 |Mcrae's Supermarket and General Store Form of Tender_not $ 300,000 Assuria v v X 1
completed nor sign
11 [J. Hussain's Construction & Supplies $ 19,090,170| $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 1
12 |B.T.B Construction $ 25,443,000 $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
13 |H & S Contracting Services $ 25,941,520| $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
14 |Natty & Kids Grocery $ 25,833,940 $ 300,000 DemeraraFire& -, v v 2
General

15 |Hana's Construction, Cleaning Service and Supplies 18,430,170 300,000 Assuria v v v 1
16 |Three Brothers Investments 23,886,940 300,000 Assuria v v 2
17  |[Ramlochan Construction & Trucking Inc. $ 27,360,300 $ 300,000 Demerara Fire & v 2

General




Date of Tender Opening: April 23, 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council Region 10 (16/2025/80) - Construction of Kwakwani Admin Block

. . . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Bid Security Amount Bid Security Agency | GRA NIS Tender Hard Fla}sh
No. Currency & Currency signed Copy | drive
1 |MSR International Enterprise $ 43,447,160| $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
5 ;?J\i/ﬁjrsrlg)nty Investments Construction Services (SICS $ 48587.595 $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 5
3 |Naran Construction $ 52,520,160 $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
4  [Rickford Douglas and Son Construction 3 46,189,815 $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |B.T.B Construction $ 49,519,312| $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
6 |Ziona's Enterprise 3 42,941,693 $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 1
7 |D. David International $ 45,891,930| $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 1
8 |D. De Souza Contracting Services 3 45,882,270 $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
9  [Supreme Wood Products $ 45,216,517 $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
10 |Three Brothers Investments 3 45,405,517 $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
11 |Double ‘G’ Construction $ 47,307,015| $ 300,000 Demg:;zg:re S v v 2
12 |J. Hussain's Construction & Supplies $ 44,250,339 No Bid Security Seen v v v 1
13 |H & S Contracting Services $ 48,759,134 $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
14 |KV Contracting Services 3 49,056,210 $ 300,000 Nafico v v v 2
15 |Rahaman Construction and Transportation Services $ 37,996,980 $ 300,000( Caricom v v v 2
16 |Hana's Construction, Cleaning Service and Supplies $ 43,935,339 No Bid Security Seen v v v 1
17 |Ramlochan Construction & Trucking Inc. $ 49,892,050| $ 300,000 Demerara Fire & v v v 2

General




Date of Tender Opening: April 23, 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council Region 10 (17/2025/80) - Construction of Linden Hospital Complex Admin Block

. . . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Bid Security Amount Bid Security Agency GRA NIS Tender Hard Fla}sh
No. Currency & Currency signed Copy | drive
1 |D. De Souza Contracting Services $ 94,323,600 | $ 600,000 Assuria v v v 2
2 |Ziona's Enterprise $ 93,662,100 | $ 600,000 Caricom v v 1
3 SICS_ Builders (Sovereignty Investments Construction $ 98.304.003 | $ 600,000 Assuria v v v )
Services)
4  |S&J's Cambio & Variety Store $ 94,600,000 No Bid Security Seen v Rec v 2
5 |D. David International $ 81,896,840 | $ 600,000 Assuria v v v 2
6 |Supreme Wood Products 3 87,335,692 | $ 600,000 Assuria v v v 2
7  |MSR International Enterprise $ 92,281,935 | $ 600,000 Assuria v v v 2
8 [Hana's Construction, Cleaning Service & Supplies $ 08,520,870 | $ 600,000 Assuria v v v 2
9 |B.T.B Construction $ 87,171,578 | $ 600,000 Assuria v v v 2
10 |H&S Contracting Services 3 90,414,660 | $ 600,000 Assuria v v v 2
11 |Rahaman Construction & Transportation Services 3 79,452,345 | $ 600,000 Caricom v v v 2
12 |Ramlochan Construction & Trucking Inc $  87,789,189.50 | $ 600,000 Demgr;:zr';;re &yl v v 2
13 |J. Hussain's Construction & Supplies $ 103,016,655 No Bid Security Seen v v v 1
14 |Naran Construction 3 85,222,200 | $ 600,000 Caricom v v v 2
15 |Stephan's Investments $ 89,268,690 600,000 | DemeraraFire& | | pac v 2

General




Date of Tender Opening: April 23, 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council Region 10 (18/2025/80) - Construction of Special Needs Education Facility

. . . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Bid Security Amount Bid Security Agency GRA NIS Tender Hard Fla_ish
No. Currency & Currency signed Copy | drive
1 [MSR International Enterprise $ 78,243,365 $ 600,000 Assuria v v v 2
2  |Stephan's Investments $ 84,708,435 $ 600,000 Demgr:trzzrz: re & v | Receipt 2
3 |H&S Contracting Services $ 133,613,773| $ 600,000 Assuria v v v 2
4 |Naran Construction $ 98,733,075 $ 600,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |D. David International $ 79,502,446 $ 600,000 Assuria v v v 2
6 |Ramlochan Construction & Trucking Inc. $ 91,093,375| $ 600,000 Demg?r::rz:re & v v v 2
7 |Hana's Construction, Cleaning Service and Supplies $ 79,490,008| $ 600,000 Assuria v v v 1
8 |Rahaman Construction and Transportation Services $ 78,314,271 $ 600,000 Caricom v v v 2
9 |J. Hussain's Construction & Supplies $ 79,600,258 No Bid Security Seen v v v 1
10 |D. De Souza Contracting Services $ 92,961,330| $ 600,000 Premier v v v 2
11 [B.T.B Construction $ 90,112,575 $ 600,000 Assuria v v v 2
12 |R&R Construction Services $ 89,334,206| $ 600,000 Caricom v v v 2
13  [Supreme Wood Products $ 84,582,435 $ 600,000 Assuria v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 23, 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council Region 10 (19/2025/80) - Rehabiliation of Fence (Chain Link & Concrete) Linden Hospital Complex

. . . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Bid Security Amount Bid Security Agency | GRA NIS Tender Hard Fla_ish
No. Currency & Currency signed Copy | drive
1 |Stephan's Investments $ 22,153,670 $ 300,000 Demgfr::rlg:re & v Receipt v 2
2  |Jonesco Enterprise $ 26,634,029 No Bid Security Seen v v 1
3 |Ramlochan Construction & Trucking Inc. $ 22,045,650 $ 300,000 Demg?rzzrz: re & v v v 2
4 Profitz Contracting $ 22,672,815 No Bid Security Seen v v v 1
5 |Mcrae's Supermarket and General Store $ 21,256,950| $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 1
6 [Naran Construction $ 21,584,915| $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 1
7  |Benjec C & S General Services $ 21,352,430| $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
8 |H & S Contracting Services $ 20,927,390| $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
9 |S&L Enterprise $ 10,848,345 $ 300,000 DemeraraFire& |, v v 2
General
10 |Three Brothers Investments $ 20,773,670 $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
11 [Joshua Sukhu Contracting Service $ 20,921,175| $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 1
12 |B.T.B Construction $ 20,446,415 $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
13 |D. De Souza Contracting Services $ 23,493,470| $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
14 |Supreme Wood Products $ 21,731,820 $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
15 | Winston Caesar General Contracting and $ 23,681,625 No Bid Security Seen v v v 1
Construction Services
16 |Rickford Douglas and Son Construction $ 20,976,175| $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
17 SO\_/erelgnty Investments Construction Services (SICS $ 20274.870| $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 9
Builders)

18 |Natty & Kids Grocery $ 19,346,195 $ 300,000 Demér;::rg:re & | v v v

19 |SandJ's Cambio & Variety Store $ 22,170,060 No Bid Security Seen v Receipt v 2
20 |Aleema's General Construction $ 17,122,150| $ 300,000 | Caricom v v v 2




21 |Hana's Construction, Cleaning Service and Supplies $ 21,401,847 No Bid Security Seen v v v 1
22 |Jassy's Stationery and School Supply $ 22,630,069 $ 300,000 Demgrgzrlg: e & v v v 2
23 |Energy Empire $ 22,307,285 $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
24 |Ziona's Enterprise $ 20,671,090 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 1
25 |J. Hussain's Construction & Supplies $ 21,517,348 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 1
26 |S. Duggan Welding and Fabricating World Form o;l’::der Not $ 300,000 Assuria X X X 1




Date of Tender Opening: April 23, 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council Region 10 (20/2025/80) - Upgrading of Parking - Lot 2 Linden Hospital Complex

. . . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Bid Security Amount Bid Security Agency GRA NIS Tender Hard Fla_ish
No. Currency & Currency signed Copy | drive
1 |Mcrae's Supermarket and General Store $ 20,176,800| $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 1
2 |Stephan's Investments $ 21,304,500 $ 300,000 Demg?rzzrlg:re & v | Receipt v 2
3 |Ross Construction Enterprise $ 21,953,400| $ 300,000 Assuria v Receipt v 2
4 |J. Hussain's Construction & Supplies $ 18,225,900 No Bid Security Seen v v v 1
5 Hana's Construction, Cleaning Service and Supplies $ 18,152,400 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
6 |Jassy's Stationery and School Supply $ 19,980,450| $ 300,000 Demg?rzzrz: e & v v v 2
7 |s&L Enterprise $ 19,687,500| $ 300,000| DemeraraFire & o, v v 2
General
8 D. De Souza Contracting Services $ 17,629,500| $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
9 |Naran Construction $ 20,217,750 $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
10 |Energy Empire $ 19,902,750| $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
11 |Ziona's Enterprise $ 20,328,000 $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 1
12 ;?J\ille(zjr:rlg)nty Investments Construction Services (SICS $ 19.726.770| $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 5
13 |Aleema's General Construction $ 18,076,800| $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
14 [Ramlochan Construction & Trucking Inc. $ 20,291,250| $ 300,000 Demérgzrz:re & v v v 2
15 |SandJ's Cambio & Variety Store $ 10,886,925 No Bid Security Seen v Receipt v 2
16 |H & S Contracting Services $ 20,006,700| $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
17 [M,A,S Construction, Maintenance and Logistics 3 20,055,000 $ 300,000 Assuria v v 2
18 |Pacific Service System $ 16,621,500 $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 0
19 |[B.T.B Construction $ 19,125,750 $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 1




Demerara Fire &

20 |Double 'G' Construction 17,094,000| $ 300,000 General v
21 |Supreme Wood Products 18,763,500| $ 300,000 Assuria v
22 |R&R Construction Servicesa 20,398,350| $ 300,000 Caricom v




Date of Tender Opening: April 23, 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council Region 10 (21/2025/80) - Rehabiliation of Richmond Hill Doctor's Quarters, Linden

. . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency Bid Security Amount Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FIQSh
No. & Currency signed Copy | drive
1 |Rahaman Construction & Transportation Services $ 36,821,190 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
2 |S&J's Cambio & Variety Store $ 48,800,000 No Bid Security Seen v Rec v 2
3 |Stephan's Investments $ 45,082,695 | $ 300,000 Demgfr::rg:re &1 v | v v 2
4 |Energy Empire $ 61,984,125 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 0
5 |Double 'G' Construction $ 48,222,458 | $ 300,000 Demgr;:zrz:re &1 v | v v 2
6 |H&S Contracting Services $ 45,607,748 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
7  [Hana's Construction, Cleaning Service & Supplies $ 48,090,105 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 1
8 |D. De Souza Contracting $ 69,753,180 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
9 \S/\élrr:/slzf;: Caesar General Contracting & Construction $ 45,160,374 No Bid Security Seen v v v 1
10 [Ross Contracting Enterprise $ 47,897,325 | $ 300,000 | Assuria v v v 2
11 |J. Hussain's Construction & Supplies $ 48,090,105 No Bid Security Seen v v v 1
12 |S&L Enterprise $ 43,534,050 | $ 300,000 Demg:r:grg:re &1 v | v v 2
13 |Supreme Wood Products $ 45,639,195 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
14 |Naran Construction $ 43,987,388 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
15 [Pacific Service System $ 64,807,140 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
16 |R&R Construction Services $ 46,058,040 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
17 |[MSR International Enterprise $ 39,728,199 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
18 |D. David International $ 39,770,380 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 1
19 |Ziona's Enterprise 3 47,084,415 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
20 SICS_ Builders (Sovereignty Investments Construction $ 64.468.908 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 5
Services)
21 |B.T.B Construction $ 41,495,738 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2




Demerara Fire &

22 |Ramlochan Construction & Trucking Inc $ 45,373,598 | $ 300,000 General
Form of Tender Page
23 |Boundless Construction & Trucking Service Not Completed & | $ 300,000 Assuria
Signed
24 |Benje C&S General Services $ 44,321,335 | $ 300,000 Assuria




Date of Tender Opening: April 23, 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council Region 10 (22/2025/80) - Construction of Cafeteria at Linden Hospital Complex

. . . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Bid Security Amount Bid Security Agency GRA NIS Tender Hard Fla}sh
No. Currency & Currency signed Copy | drive
1 |H&S Contracting Services $ 21,080,640 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
2 |Ramlochan Construction & Trucking Inc $ 22,235,840 | $ 300,000 Demgrsrzzrg: e & v v v 2
3 |B.T.B Construction $ 20,204,048 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
4  |Ross Construction Enterprise 3 24,588,060 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
5 |Aleema's General Construction $ 18,422,985 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
6 [Hana's Construction, Cleaning Services & Supplies $ 18,805,111 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 1
7 |J. Hussain's Construction & Supplies $ 18,882,011 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 1
8 Mcrae's Supermarket & General Store 3 21,644,023 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
9 [Naran Construction $ 21,363,300 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
10 |Double ‘G’ Construction $ 18,929,032 | $ 300,000 Demgr;:zr';;re & | v v v 2
11 [Stephan's Investments $ 20,586,772 | $ 300,000 Demér:rzgrlg:re & v v v 2
12 |D. De Souza Contracting Services 3 24694530 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
13  |Rickford Douglas & Son Construction $ 19,709,497.05 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
14 |S&L Enterprise $ 20,681,272 | $ 300,000 | DemeraraFire& |-, v v 2
General
15 |Supreme Wood Products 3 20,968,972 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
16 |S&J's Cambio & Variety Store $ 24,917,000 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
17 |Ziona's Enterprise $ 23,539,110 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 1
18 |Three Brothers Enterprise $ 21,063,472 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2




