Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Guyana Water Inc (79/2025/45) - Construction of Potable Water Wells Lots 1&2

. . Bid Security Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |ACE - Hugel (JV) L2 $ 569,087,943 30,000,000 Premier N/A | N/A v 2 2
2 |Zeco Group of Services Inc L2 $ 420,926,116.50 30,000,000 Assuria v v v 1 2
3 |R. Kissoon Contracting Service L1 $ 359,967,900 30,000,000 Premier v v v 2 1
3 |R. Kissoon Contracting Service L2 $ 463,179,900 30,000,000
4 |S. Jagmohan Construction & General Supplies Inc L1 $ 371,518,850 30,000,000 Premier v v v 1
5 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L1 $ 756,960,120 30,000,000 Assuria v v v 2 2
5 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L2 $ 850,564,620 30,000,000
6  |Sheriff Construction L1 $ 793,564,270 30,000,000 Assuria v v v 2 2
6 |Sheriff Construction L2 $ 855,068,770 30,000,000
7 |K&N Solutions Inc L1 $ 780,000,000 30,000,000 Premier v v v 2 2
7 |K&N Solutions Inc L2 $ 786,000,000 30,000,000
8 |Blue Print Builders Inc L1 $ 661,785,075 30,000,000 Assuria v v v 2 2
8 |Blue Print Builders Inc L2 $ 722,175,075 30,000,000




Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Audit Office of Guyana (03/2025/08) - Supply and Delivery of Laptops

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed

1 |Keyboard Kiosk $ 8,750,000 | $ 175,000 Assuria v v v 2
2 |Promotech Inc $ 7,168,127 | $ 144,598 Premier v v v 2
3  [Nextech Inc $ 7,317,000 | $ 200,000 Premier v v v 2
4 |Cellphone Shack $ 13,791,840 | $ 275,837 Premier v v v 2
5 |Rsconex Investment & Management Inc $ 18,250,000 | $ 295,000 Caricom v v v 1
6 |Bits & Bytes Computer Store $ 8,400,000 | $ 168,000 Premier v v v 2
7  |Digital Technology Group of Companies Inc $ 10,875,000 | $ 217,500 Assuria v v v 2
8 |Millennium Supplies & Distribution Inc $ 3,675,000 | $ 73,500 Premier v v v 2
9 |KM Technology $ 7,470,000 | $ 149,400 Diamond v v v 1
10 |MAEC Enterprises $ 10,827,000 | $ 215,540 Assuria v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Guyana Energy Agency (137/2025/02) - Supply & Delivery of Office Equipment Lots 1-5

. . Bid Security Form of
Bl;i?r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
| [Yellowthree L3 $ 2.168.800 Bid Security Decl?ratlon Completed v v v )
& Signed
1 |Yellowthree L4 $ 830,000
2 |K.P Distribution Service L2 $ 640,000 | Did Security Declaration Completed |, |~ v I
& Signed
2 |K.P Distribution Service L3 $ 3,758,797
2 |K.P Distribution Service L4 $ 587,600
2 |K.P Distribution Service L5 $ 1,820,560
3 |Starr Computer Inc L2 $ 1,025,328 | Bid Security Declaration Not Seen v v v 2
4 |MAEC Enterprises L2 $ 2,535,984 | $ 273,694 Assuria v v v 2
4 |MAEC Enterprises L3 $ 4,064,726
4 |MAEC Enterprises L4 $ 1,914,000
4 |MAEC Enterprises L5 $ 5,170,000
Bid Security Declaration Not
5 |G&L Office Guyana Inc 13 $ 3,409,657.92 Completed & Signed v v v 2
6 |Nationwide Imports L2 $ 038,928 | $ 127,743 Caricom v v v 2
6 |Nationwide Imports L3 $ 3,201,014
6 |Nationwide Imports L4 $ 1,634,730
6 |Nationwide Imports L5 $ 612,507
7 |Keyboard Kiosk L1 $ 6,000,000 | $ 376,600 Assuria v v v 1




7 |Keyboard Kiosk L2 $ 2,480,000

7 |Keyboard Kiosk L3 $ 8,000,000

7 |Keyboard Kiosk L4 $ 1,350,000

7 |Keyboard Kiosk L5 $ 1,000,000

8 |Gifiland Office Max L1 3 2,180,000 Bid Security Decl?ration Completed
& Signed

8 |Giftland Office Max L2 $ 1,620,000

8 |Giftland Office Max L3 $ 2,399,500

8 |Giftland Office Max L4 $ 792,499

8 |Giftland Office Max L5 $ 1,750,000

0 |Meditron Inc L1 3 5,768,000 Bid Security Decl?ration Completed
& Signed

9 |Meditron Inc L2 $ 2,248,800

9 |Meditron Inc L3 $ 3,135,020

9 |Meditron Inc L4 $ 1,748,300

9 |Meditron Inc L5 $ 2,786,530

10 |Kojac L3 $ 2,773,300 | $ 72,646 Nafico

10 |Kojac L4 $ 858,999




Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Demerara Harbour Bridge Corportation (58/2025/31) - Rehabilitation of Dredge Rickford L

. . Bid Security Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |Guyana Port Inc. $ 21,899,555 $ 726,659 Premier v v v 2
2 |Caribbean Shipyard (Guyana) Inc. $ 21,000,000 | $ 420,000 Premier v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Office of the Prime Minister (212/2025/02) - Procurement of Single Cab Vehicles

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;

Currency signed
1 |Massy Motors (Guyana) Ltd $ 30,400,000 | $ 480,000 CG United v v v 2
2 |(Ideal Autos Inc. $ 38,400,000 | $ 320,000 Nafico v v v 2
3 |Car Clean Enterprise $ 37,505,540 | $ 800,000 | Hand-In-Hand v v v 2
4 |MS Trading $ 39,400,000 | $ 1,300,000 Premier v v v 2
5 |RRT Enterprise & Auto Sales $ 37,800,000 | $ 320,000 Premier v v v 2
6 |Marics & Company Limited $ 29,804,990 | $ 320,000 Assuria v v v 2
7 |B. M. Soat Auto Sale $ 30,000,000 | $ 320,000 Caricom v v v 2
8 |Jumbo Jet Auto Sales $ 32,000,000 | $ 320,000 Premier v v v 2
9 |JC Auto Trading & Supplies $ 42,000,000 | $ 320,000 Assuria v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Teaching Service Commission (04/2025/10) - Construction of Concrete Drain and Parapet at TSC

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |R. Pooran Bobcat Rental Service $ 6,946,170 Bid Securing Declaration Sign v v v 1
2 |Diamond's Auto Body Shop $ 6,873,790 Bid Securing Declaration Sign v v v 1
3 |C&N Construction And General Supplies $ 6,554,570 Bid Securing Declaration Sign v v v 1
4  |One Million Design and Construction $ 12,887,408 Bid Securing Declaration Sign v v v 1
Form of Tender not
5 |Diversity Investments Inc. completed but Bid Securing Declaration Sign v v v 2
signed
6 |IMS Construction and Logistics Services $ 6,467,340 Bid Securing Declaration Sign v v v 2
7 |Xymari General Services $ 6,996,830 Bid Securing Declaration Sign v v v 1
Engineer's Estimate $ 6,900,135




Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Guyana Lands & Surveys Commission (62/2025/01) - Supply of One New 4x4 Pick-Up Motor Vehicle

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |B. M. Soat Auto Sale $ 12,500,000 BSD C/S v v v 2
2 |Massy Motors (Guyana) Ltd $ 11,220,000 BSD C/S v v v 2
3 |Car Clean Enterprise $ 10,146,000 | $ 300,000 \ Hanad-In-Hand v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Maritime Administrative Department (59/2025/31) - Removal of Wrecks (Demerara River-Beyond Southern Limits on "No Cure No Pay Basis (Lots 1-4)

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed

1 |Industrial Fabrications Inc L1 $ 332,782,523 | $ 1,600,000 Premier v v v 2
1 |Industrial Fabrications Inc L2 $ 184,160,714 | $ 1,000,000

1 |Industrial Fabrications Inc L3 $ 144,477,252 | $ 800,000

1 |Industrial Fabrications Inc L4 $ 288,250,901 | $ 1,200,000

2  |BK International Inc L1 $ 80,000,000 Nafico v v v 2
2  |BK International Inc L2 $ 50,000,000

2 |BK International Inc L3 $ 40,000,000

2 |BK International Inc L4 $ 60,000,000

3  |Fazam Future Builders L1 $ 74,500,000 Caricom v v v 2
3 |Fazam Future Builders L2 $ 44,000,000

3  |Fazam Future Builders L3 $ 54,000,000

3 |Fazam Future Builders L4 $ 54,000,000

4 |Mahase Construction L1 $ 71,450,000 Premier v v v 2
4 |Mahase Construction L2 $ 45,100,000

4 |Mahase Construction L3 $ 39,000,000

4 |Mahase Construction L4 $ 54,300,000

5 |FD Investments L1 $ 422,589,460 Premier v v v 2
5 |FD Investments L2 $ 396,145,896

5 |FD Investments L3 $ 340,578,453

5 |FD Investments L4 $ 550,641,230

6 |McRae's Supermarket & General Store L1 $ 77,500,000 Assuria v v v 2




6 |McRae's Supermarket & General Store 1.2 $ 48,000,000
6 |McRae's Supermarket & General Store L3 $ 38,500,000
6 |McRae's Supermarket & General Store L4 $ 57,600,000
7 |KMS BV (Netherlands) L1 $ 549,830,880 | Bid Security Declaration Completed | N/A | N/A
7 |KMS BV (Netherlands) L2 $ 801,836,700
7 |KMS BV (Netherlands) L3 $ 274,915,440
7 |KMS BV (Netherlands) L4 $ 738,835,245
3 LGS Barpes General Building Construction & Civil 3 74,000,000 Caricom v v
Engmeering L1
3 LGS Barpes General Building Construction & Civil S 44,000,000
Engineering L2
3 LGS Barpes General Building Construction & Civil S 37,000,000
Engineering L3
3 LGS Barpes General Building Construction & Civil S 53.500.000
Engineering 1.4
9 |Jemcorp Engineering & Imports L1 $ 75,000,000 Assuria v v
9 |Jemcorp Engineering & Imports .2 $ 48,000,000
9 |Jemcorp Engineering & Imports L3 $ 39,000,000
9 |Jemcorp Engineering & Imports L4 $ 56,000,000
Engineer's Estimate L1 $ 80,000,000
Engineer's Estimate 1.2 $ 50,000,000
Engineer's Estimate L3 $ 40,000,000
Engineer's Estimate 1.4 $ 60,000,000




Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Maritime Administrative Department (60/2025/31) - Removal of Obstructions Derelict Vessels Wrecks and Debris from Parika Foreshore Lots 1-5 (Bushy Park Beach to Hubu

. . Bid Securi Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount &ty Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency ) Copy | drive
Currency signed

1 |Industrial Fabrications Inc L1 $ 325,784,959 | $ 1,600,000 Premier v v v 2
1 |Industrial Fabrications Inc L2 $ 36,198,329 | $ 500,000

1 |Industrial Fabrications Inc L3 $ 45247911 | $ 500,000

1 |Industrial Fabrications Inc L4 $ 156,376,780 | $ 800,000

1 |Industrial Fabrications Inc L5 $ 180,991,644

1 |Industrial Fabrications Inc L6 $ 314,925,461

1 |Industrial Fabrications Inc L7 $ 352,933,706

1 |Industrial Fabrications Inc L8 $ 199,090,808

1 |Industrial Fabrications Inc L9 $ 226,239,555

1 |Industrial Fabrications Inc L10 $ 461,528,692

1 |Industrial Fabrications Inc L11 $ 515,826,185

1 |Industrial Fabrications Inc L12 $ 495,885,586

1 |Industrial Fabrications Inc L13 $ 461,686,580

1 |Industrial Fabrications Inc L14 $ 515,985,089

1 |Industrial Fabrications Inc L15 $ 436,039,325

2 |KMS BV (Netherlands) L1 $ 635,054,666.40 |Bid Security Declaration Completed & | N/A | N/A v 2
2 |KMS BV (Netherlands) L2 $ 211,686,888.80

2 |KMS BV (Netherlands) L3 $ 105,842,444.40

2 |KMS BV (Netherlands) L4 $ 370,448,555.40

2 |KMS BV (Netherlands) L5 $ 79,381,833.30

2 |KMS BV (Netherlands) L6 $ 396,909,166.50

2 |KMS BV (Netherlands) L7 $ 635,054,666.40

2 |KMS BV (Netherlands) L8 $ 396,909,166.50

2 |KMS BV (Netherlands) L9 $ 132,303,055.50

2 |KMS BV (Netherlands) L10 $ 423,369,777.60

2 |KMS BV (Netherlands) L11 $ 529,212,222.00

2 |KMS BV (Netherlands) L12 $ 396,909,166.50




2 |KMS BV (Netherlands) L13 $ 396,909,166.50
2 |KMS BV (Netherlands) L14 $ 476,290,999.80
2 |KMS BV (Netherlands) L15 $ 595,363,749.75
3 |FD Investments L1 $ 405,938,215 | $ 1,600,000 Premier
3 |FD Investments L2 $ 33,015,864 | $ 500,000
3 |FD Investments L3 $ 37,845,090 | § 500,000
3 |FD Investments 14 $ 201,855,015 | $ 800,000
3 |FD Investments L5 $ 79,849,120 | $ 500,000
3 |FD Investments L6 $ 382,650,321 | $ 800,000
3 |FD Investments L7 $ 410,689,984 | $ 1,100,000
3 |FD Investments L8 $ 342,059,821 | $ 1,000,000
3 |FD Investments L9 $ 271,001,595 | § 600,000
3 |FD Investments L10 $ 665,900,148 | $ 1,200,000
3 |FD Investments L11 $ 675,981,056 | $ 1,500,000
3 |FD Investments L12 $ 680,945,345 | $ 1,400,000
3 |FD Investments L13 $ 645,980,912 | $ 1,400,000
3 |FD Investments L14 $ 980,254,789 | $ 1,200,000
3 |FD Investments L15 $ 995,868,085 | $ 1,300,000
4 Sealand Marine Transport & Harbour & Sealand $ 45,000,000 Caricom

Petroleum L1
4 Sealand Marine Transport & Harbour & Sealand $ 19,000,000

Petroleum L2
4 Sealand Marine Transport & Harbour & Sealand $ 20,500,000

Petroleum L3
4 Sealand Marine Transport & Harbour & Sealand $ 32,000,000

Petroleum L4
4 Sealand Marine Transport & Harbour & Sealand $ 14,500,000

Petroleum L5
4 Sealand Marine Transport & Harbour & Sealand $ 34,000,000

Petroleum L6




Sealand Marine Transport & Harbour & Sealand

4 Petroleum L7 $ 41,000,000
4 Sealand Marine Transport & Harbour & Sealand $ 25.000,000
Petroleum L8
4 Sealand Marine Transport & Harbour & Sealand $ 27,000,000
Petroleum L9
4 Sealand Marine Transport & Harbour & Sealand $ 55,000,000
Petroleum L10
4 Sealand Marine Transport & Harbour & Sealand $ 74,000,000
Petroleum L11
5 |Ideal Engineering Services Inc L1 $ 73,500,800 Caricom
5 |Ideal Engineering Services Inc 1.2 $ 22,300,700
5 |Ideal Engineering Services Inc L3 $ 22,601,050
5 |Ideal Engineering Services Inc 1.4 $ 37,010,700
5 |Ideal Engineering Services Inc L5 $ 17,750,340
5 |Ideal Engineering Services Inc L6 $ 35,900,000
5 |Ideal Engineering Services Inc L7 $ 48,900,000
5 |Ideal Engineering Services Inc L8 $ 45,600,000
5 |Ideal Engineering Services Inc L9 $ 26,300,000
5 |Ideal Engineering Services Inc L10 $ 54,580,120
5 |Ideal Engineering Services Inc L11 $ 69,500,500
5 |Ideal Engineering Services Inc L12 $ 63,901,300
5 |Ideal Engineering Services Inc L13 $ 64,400,980
5 |Ideal Engineering Services Inc L14 $ 54,901,080
5 |Ideal Engineering Services Inc L15 $ 54,820,940
6 |R&N Construction Services L1 $ 68,000,000 Assuria
6 |R&N Construction Services L4 $ 36,000,000
6 |R&N Construction Services L6 $ 35,000,000
6 |R&N Construction Services L7 $ 45,000,000
6 |R&N Construction Services L8 $ 38,500,000
6 |R&N Construction Services L9 $ 25,000,000




6 |R&N Construction Services L10 $ 51,000,000

6 |R&N Construction Services L11 $ 63,100,000

6 |R&N Construction Services L12 $ 60,500,000

6 |R&N Construction Services L13 $ 63,000,000

6 |R&N Construction Services L14 $ 49,500,000

6 |R&N Construction Services L15 $ 58,000,000

7 |Pioneer Contracting Services L1 $ 70,000,000 No Bid Security Seen
7 |Pioneer Contracting Services L4 $ 35,000,000

7 |Pioneer Contracting Services L6 $ 34,000,000

7 |Pioneer Contracting Services L7 $ 44,500,000

7 |Pioneer Contracting Services L9 $ 25,500,000

7 |Pioneer Contracting Services L10 $ 49,500,000

7 |Pioneer Contracting Services L11 $ 63,300,000

7 |Pioneer Contracting Services L13 $ 65,250,000

8 |L.B Contracting & Machinery Rental L1 $ 69,000,000 Assuria
8 |L.B Contracting & Machinery Rental 1.4 $ 32,000,000

8 |L.B Contracting & Machinery Rental L6 $ 35,000,000

8 |L.B Contracting & Machinery Rental L7 $ 50,000,000

8 |L.B Contracting & Machinery Rental L8 $ 39,250,000

8 |L.B Contracting & Machinery Rental L9 $ 25,750,000

8 |L.B Contracting & Machinery Rental L10 $ 48,500,000

8 |L.B Contracting & Machinery Rental L11 $ 65,300,000

8 |LB Contracting & Machinery Rental .12 $ 58,750,000

8 |LB Contracting & Machinery Rental L13 $ 63,750,000

8 |LB Contracting & Machinery Rental .14 $ 48,250,000

8 |LB Contracting & Machinery Rental L15 $ 57,000,000

9 |Mahase Contracting L1 $ 75,500,000 Premier
9 |Mahase Contracting 1.2 $ 24,150,000

9 |Mahase Contracting L3 $ 23,900,000

9 |Mahase Contracting 14 $ 28,800,000




9 |Mahase Contracting L5 $ 19,500,000
9 |Mahase Contracting L6 $ 37,580,000
9 |Mahase Contracting L7 $ 53,500,000
9 |Mahase Contracting L8 $ 48,900,000
9 |Mahase Contracting L9 $ 29,500,000
9 |Mahase Contracting L10 $ 57,800,000
9 |Mahase Contracting L11 $ 72,930,000
9 |Mahase Contracting L12 $ 68,000,000
9 |Mahase Contracting L13 $ 67,900,000
9 |Mahase Contracting L14 $ 57,000,000
9 |Mahase Contracting L15 $ 58,900,000
10 |M.G Investments Guyana L1 $ 21,250,000 Assuria
10 |M.G Investments Guyana L3 $ 21,250,000
10 |M.G Investments Guyana L4 $ 36,000,000
10 |M.G Investments Guyana L5 $ 17,000,000
10 |M.G Investments Guyana L6 $ 36,000,000
11 |S. Maraj Contracting Services L1 $ 72,000,000 Caricom
11 |S. Maraj Contracting Services L2 $ 20,000,000
11 |S. Maraj Contracting Services L6 $ 38,000,000
11 |S. Maraj Contracting Services L8 $ 48,000,000
12 |Zakariyah's Investment [.2 $ 21,900,500 Assuria
12 |Zakariyah's Investment L3 $ 21,751,400
A144:J| Zakariyah's Investment L4 $ 35,901,000
12 |Zakariyah's Investment L6 $ 36,391,400
12 |Zakariyah's Investment L8 $ 42,971,250
12 |Zakariyah's Investment L10 $ 55,060,800
12 |Zakariyah's Investment L12 $ 63,880,900
13 |GAF Investments Guyana L1 $ 69,000,000 Assuria
13 |GAF Investments Guyana L4 $ 34,000,000




13 |GAF Investments Guyana L6 $ 34,000,000
13 |GAF Investments Guyana L7 $ 47,500,000
13 |GAF Investments Guyana L8 $ 40,500,000
13 |GAF Investments Guyana L9 $ 25,500,000
13 |GAF Investments Guyana L11 $ 61,550,000
13 |GAF Investments Guyana L12 $ 60,000,000
13 |GAF Investments Guyana L13 $ 62,000,000
13 |GAF Investments Guyana L14 $ 47,500,000
13 |GAF Investments Guyana L15 $ 56,500,000
14 |Colin Talbot Contracting Services L1 $ 72,000,000 Assuria
14 |Colin Talbot Contracting Services 14 $ 35,000,000
14 |Colin Talbot Contracting Services L6 $ 36,000,000
14 |Colin Talbot Contracting Services L7 $ 49,000,000
14 |Colin Talbot Contracting Services L8 $ 41,500,000
14 |Colin Talbot Contracting Services L9 $ 25,000,000
14 |Colin Talbot Contracting Services L10 $ 50,750,000
14 |Colin Talbot Contracting Services L11 $ 64,500,000
14 |Colin Talbot Contracting Services L12 $ 61,000,000
14 |Colin Talbot Contracting Services L13 $ 62,550,000
14 |Colin Talbot Contracting Services L14 $ 50,250,000
14 |Colin Talbot Contracting Services L15 $ 57,500,000
15 |Ace Construction & General Services L1 $ 79,000,000 No Bid Security Seen
15 |Ace Construction & General Services L2 $ 24,100,000
15 |Ace Construction & General Services L3 $ 24,800,000
15 |Ace Construction & General Services L4 $ 39,900,000
15 |Ace Construction & General Services L5 $ 19,950,000
15 |Ace Construction & General Services L6 $ 39,300,000
15 |Ace Construction & General Services L7 $ 54,650,000
15 |Ace Construction & General Services L8 $ 49,020,000
15 |Ace Construction & General Services L9 $ 29,794,000
15 |Ace Construction & General Services L10 $ 59,387,000




15 |Ace Construction & General Services L11 $ 75,000,000
15 |Ace Construction & General Services L12 $ 69,880,000
15 |Ace Construction & General Services L13 $ 70,000,000
15 |Ace Construction & General Services L14 $ 60,000,000
15 |Ace Construction & General Services L15 $ 65,000,000
16 |Onyx Engineering Inc L1 $ 78,500,000 Premier
16 |Onyx Engineering Inc .2 $ 24,500,000
16 |Onyx Engineering Inc L3 $ 24,500,000
16 |Onyx Engineering Inc 14 $ 38,000,000
16 |Onyx Engineering Inc L5 $ 19,500,000
16 |Onyx Engineering Inc L6 $ 39,500,000
16 |Onyx Engineering Inc L7 $ 55,000,000
16 |Onyx Engineering Inc L8 $ 48,000,000
16 |Onyx Engineering Inc L9 $ 29,500,000
16 |Onyx Engineering Inc L10 $ 59,000,000
16 |Onyx Engineering Inc L11 $ 76,000,000
16 |Onyx Engineering Inc L12 $ 69,500,000
16 |Onyx Engineering Inc L13 $ 69,700,000
16 |Onyx Engineering Inc L14 $ 59,500,000
16 |Onyx Engineering Inc L15 $ 65,000,000
17 |Jemcorp Engineering & Imports L1 $ 76,000,000 Assuria
17 |Jemcorp Engineering & Imports L3 $ 22,000,000
17 |Jemcorp Engineering & Imports L4 $ 36,000,000
17 |Jemcorp Engineering & Imports L5 $ 17,000,000
17 |Jemcorp Engineering & Imports L6 $ 35,000,000
17 |Jemcorp Engineering & Imports L7 $ 48,000,000
17 |Jemcorp Engineering & Imports L8 $ 46,000,000
17 |Jemcorp Engineering & Imports L9 $ 28,000,000
17 |Jemcorp Engineering & Imports L10 $ 56,000,000
18 |[Sino Estates & Management Inc 14 $ 36,000,000 Caricom




18 |Sino Estates & Management Inc L10 $ 56,000,000
18 |Sino Estates & Management Inc .14 $ 56,000,000
Engineer's Estimate L1 $ 80,000,000
Engineer's Estimate L2 $ 25,000,000
Engineer's Estimate L3 $ 25,000,000
Engineer's Estimate L4 $ 40,000,000
Engineer's Estimate L5 $ 20,000,000
Engineer's Estimate L6 $ 40,000,000
Engineer's Estimate L7 $ 55,000,000
Engineer's Estimate L8 $ 50,000,000
Engineer's Estimate L9 $ 30,000,000
Engineer's Estimate L10 $ 60,000,000
Engineer's Estimate L11 $ 75,000,000
Engineer's Estimate 1.12 $ 70,000,000
Engineer's Estimate L.13 $ 70,000,000
Engineer's Estimate L.14 $ 60,000,000
Engineer's Estimate L15 $ 65,000,000




Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Home Affairs (166/2025/51) - Procurement of Vehicles Spares-GPF

. . Bid Security Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |Andy's Auto Electrical Services & Repairs $ 48,800,000 | $ 976,000 Assuria v v v 0
5 S&K Constru.ctlon and Consultancy Services and S 40.994.560 | S 819.891 Premier v v v )
General Supplies
3 |Marics & Company Limited $ 15,059,354 | $ 301,188 Assuria v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Home Affairs (167/2025/51) - Procurement of Equipment- GPF

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |MAEC Enterprises $ 50,096,200 | $ 1,001,924 Assuria v v v 1
2 |General Distributors $ 45,365,752 | $ 920,000 Caricom v v v 2
3 |Digital Technology Group of Companies Inc. $ 50,332,260 | $ 98,645 Assuria v v v 2
4 |K.P Distribution Service $ 51,985,315 | $ 136,539 Caricom v v v 1
5 S & K Construction, Consultancy Services & General 3 402,590,200 | $ 8,051,804 Premier Y Y Y )
Supplies Inc.
6 |Meditron Inc. $ 91,774,664 | $ 1,835,493 Diamond v v v 6




Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Home Affairs (168/2025/51) - Procurement of Computers and Servers

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |KM Technology $ 15,620,000 | $ 312,400 Diamond v v v 0
2 |Digital Technology Group of Companies Inc. $ 25,396,663 | $ 819,891 Assuria v v v 2
3 |Peerless Solutions $ 2,988,000 | $ 507,933 Assuria v v v 1




Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education (153/2025/40) - Rehabilitation of Senior Common Room Building-University of Guyana

Bldder Name of Bidder Bi%ﬁ?ﬁﬁﬁ?; * lf{j%;;gfgy Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Fr}ignlie}f Ié‘;‘);‘; Flash
1  |Fast Signs Guyana 14,507,482 Bid Securing Declaration Signed v v v 1
2 |BM Property Investments Inc 16,635,080 Bid Securing Declaration Signed v v v 2
3 |D. Chowkai & Sons Construction 14,900,000 Bid Securing Declaration Signed v v v 2
4 |JJ Construction & General Services 20,313,018 Bid Securing Declaration Signed v v v 2
5 |Delph Construction Inc 20,313,018 Bid Securing Declaration Signed v v v 2
6 |Professional Build Experts 17,315,461 Bid Securing Declaration Signed v v v 1
7  |Bulletwood Construction 14,722,840 Bid Securing Declaration Signed v v v 1
8 |AKM Investment & Supplies 11,509,216|  Bid Securing Declaration Signed v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education (154/2025/40) - Remodeling and Rehabilitation works FNS Mushroom House-University of Guyana

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;

Currency signed

1 |B.M. Property Investments Inc. $ 16,680,895 Bid Securing Declaration C/S v v v 2

2 |Bulletwood Construction $ 12,504,141 Bid Securing Declaration C/S v v v 1

3  |Fast Signs Guyana $ 12,374,891 Bid Securing Declaration C/S v v v 1

4 |KW & C Enterprise $ 11,515,174 Bid Securing Declaration C/S v v v 1

5 |D. Chowkai & Sons Construction $ 14,900,000 Bid Securing Declaration C/S v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education (155/2025/40) - Rehabilitation of NBS Dorms Including Fire Escape-University of Guyana

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;

Currency signed

1  |Builders Supplies $ 34,330,010| $ 686,600 | Premier Insurance v v v 2

2 |JJ Construction & General Services $ 46,105,950 | $ 922,119 | Premier Insurance v v v 2

3 |Two Brothers Construction $ 27,817,440| $ 700,000 Nafico v v v 1

4 |BM Property Investments Inc $ 36,195,500| $ 723,910 Caricom v v v 2

5 |Delp Construction Inc $ 46,105,950| $ 922,119 | Premier Insurance | v v v 2

6 |Fast Signs Guyana $ 33,947,485 No Bid Security Seen v v v 1

7 |R&P Engineering & General Construction $ 24,038,850| $ 660,000 \ Assuria v v v 1




Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education (156/2025/40) - Electrical Upgrade & Civil Works Old Registry Building-University of Guyana

. . Bid Security Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |JJ Construction & General Services $ 38,268,867 | $ 765,377 | Premier Insurance v v v 2
2 |Delp Construction Inc $ 38,268,867 | $ 765,377 | Premier Insurance v v v
3 |Mega Power Electrical & Construction Services $ 33,935,592 | $ 644,066 Assuria v v v 2
4 |Mohabir's Construction $ 33,591,699 | $ 700,000 Nafico v v v 1
5 |BM Property Investments Inc $ 36,469,210 | $ 729,384 Caricom v v v 2
6 |Cummings Electrical Co. Ltd Contractor's Bid $ 1,000,000 Nafico v v X 2
Page not completed
7 |D. Chowkai & Sons Construction $ 29,532,366 | $ 666,544 Caricom v v v 2
8 |Builders Supplies $ 34,410,641| $ 688,213 | Premier Insurance v v v 2
9 |R&P Engineering & General Construction $ 26,680,347| $ 660,000 Assuria v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education (157/2025/40) - Construction of 2 Storey Building for Classrooms and Laboratories-Johns Science Centre University of Guyana

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |Yhadram & Sons Construction Establishment $ 99,820,502 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
2 |Professional Build Experts $ 98,883,094 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
3 |B.M. Property Investments Inc. $ 102,314,355| $ 2,046,287 Caricom v v v 2
4 |D. Chowkai $ 93,969,611| $ 1,879,392 Caricom v v v 2
5 |S. Hussain Ideal Engineering Solutions $ 92,213,960 No Bid Security Seen v v v
6 |Builderss Supplies $ 96,925,122 | $ 1,858,502 Premier v v v 2
7 |Delph Construction $ 117,583,403 | $ 2,351,668 Premier v v v 2
8 |J.J Construction & General Services $ 117,583,403 | $ 2,351,668 Premier v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education (158/2025/40) - Rewiring of FAF Building-University of Guyana

. . Bid Security Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1  |Builders Supplies $ 34,331,160| $ 686,623 | Premier Insurance v v v 2
2 |JJ Construction & General Services $ 30,422,010 | $ 608,440 | Premier Insurance v v v 2
3 |Mega Power Electrical & Construction Services $ 32,203,297| $ 678,712 Assuria v v v 2
4 |BM Property Investments Inc $ 36,810,270| $ 736,205 Caricom v v v 2
5 |R Persid Construction $ 28,643,130| $ 700,000 Nafico v v v 1
6 | Two Brothers Construction $ 27,467,580| $ 700,000 Nafico v v v 2
- I‘;Il.lriilif(s)bm & Sons Contracting Services & Electrical S 28,186,578 680,000 Assuria v v v )
8 |R&P Engineering & General Construction $ 20,251,976| $ 660,000 Assuria v v v 1
9 |Elliot's Construction and Supplies $ 29,400,304| $ 300,000 | Assuria (copy) v v v 1
: : . Contractor's Bid :
10 |Smart Builders Construction & Supplies Inc $ 680,000 | Premier Insurance | v v X 2
Page not completed
11 |Cummings Electrical Co. Ltd $ 30,351,961| $ 1,000,000 Nafico v v v 2
12 |Delph Construction Inc $ 30,422,010| $ 608,440 | Premier Insurance | v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education (159/2025/40) - Rehabilitation of FNS Annex-University of Guyana

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;

Currency signed

1  |Builders Supplies $ 35,343,242| $ 706,865 | Premier Insurance v v v 2

2 |Delph Construction Inc $ 42,820,525| $ 856,411 | Premier Insurance v v v 2

3 |Fast Signs Guyana $ 35,092,805 No Bid Security Seen v v v 1

4 |JJ Construction & General Services $ 42,820,525 | $ 856,411 | Premier Insurance v v v 2

5 |Professional Build Experts $ 35,758,844 | $ 720,000 | Premier Insurance v v v 2

6 |Mohabir's Construction $ 30,807,504| $ 700,000 Nafico v v v 1

7 |D Chowkai & Sons Construction $ 30,296,189 $ 605,924 Caricom v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Local Government & Regional Development (37/2025/13) - Construction of Bath Settlement Market

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |Urban Egde Builders Inc. $ 111,643,434 | $ 200,000 Assuria v v v 2
2 [Sheriff Construction Inc. $ 111,695,934 | $ 200,000 Assuria v v v 2
3 |Blue Print Builders Inc. $ 113,583,834 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 1
4 |JK Enterprise Inc. $ 152,682,285 No Bid Security Seen v Rec v 2
5 |Anil Lalsa Construction $ 123,925,862 | $ 250,000 Assuria v v v 2
6 |HD Investment $ 101,016,116 | $ 200,000 Caricom v v v 2
7 |B.M Property Investments Inc. $ 135,425,745 | $ 2,708,514 Caricom v v v 2
8 |Mohangoo Business Development $ 113,501,640 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
9 |PS 23 Construction $ 158,323,430 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
10 |Green Plains Enterprise $ 97,962,869 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
11 |Angad Ganesh Building & General Construction $ 158,273,439 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
12 |A. Alli Construction $ 103,197,045 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
13 |DBL Group Inc. $ 101,121,116 | $ 200,000 Caricom v v v 2
14 |Permaul Trading & Distribution $ 169,267,350 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
15 |Singh And Son Construction $ 107,056,530 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Local Government & Regional Development (38/2025/13) - Construction of Rosignol Railway Line Market

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1  |Green Plains Enterprise $ 61,030,410 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
2 |A. Alli Construction $ 32,341,260 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
3 [Sheriff Construction Inc $ 68,376,933 | $ 200,000 Assuria v v v 2
4 |Urban Edge Builders Inc $ 69,857,933 | $ 200,000 Assuria v v v 2
5 |D. Chowkai & Sons Construction $ 40,424,370 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
6 |Panko Steel Fabrication & Construction $ 58,005,150 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
7 |DBL Group Inc $ 34,772,693 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
8 |HD Investment $ 34,667,693 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
9 |Takdari Construction $ 39,610,095 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
10 |[Singh & Son Construction $ 39,129,405 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
11 |BM Property Investments Inc $ 67,851,000 | $ 1,357,020 Caricom v v v 2
12 |Angad Ganesh Building & General Construction $ 46,168,185 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
13 |JK Enterprise Inc $ 43,228,185 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
14 |Mohangoo Business Development $ 39,347,595 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
15 |Yhadram & Sons Construction Establishment $ 38,245,095 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
16 |PS 23 Construction $ 46,268,185 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
17 |Blue Print Builders Inc $ 70,901,933 | $ 200,000 Assuria v v v 2
18 |P. Baijnauth Construction Service $ 37,640,820 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
19 |[S.S.S Enterprise $ 38,298,025 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 0




Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Local Government & Regional Development (39/2025/13) - Rehabilitation of Port Mourant Market

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;

Currency signed
1 |Yhadram & Sons Construction Establishment $ 52,135,125 | $ 200,000 Caricom v v v 2
2 |P. Baijnauth Construction Service $ 51,610,125 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
3 |Takdari Construction $ 53,500,125 | $ 200,000 Assuria v v v 2
4 |Mohangoo Business Development $ 53,185,125 | $ 200,000 Premier v v v 2
5 |Z. Khan Construction $ 44,123,100 | $ 200,000 Premier v v v 2
6 |AE&N General Contracting $ 46,664,625 | $ 200,000 Premier v v v 2
7 |HE & Sai Investment $ 45,637,200 | $ 200,000 Premier v v v 2
8 |JK Enterprise Inc $ 54,438,825 No Bid Security Seen v Rec v 2
9 |BM Property Investments Inc $ 43,884,876 | $ 876,697 | Caricom v v v 2
10 | Avi Construction and Supply $ 45,270,225 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
11 |D. Chowkai & Sons Constructyion $ 45,638,225| $ 200,000 | Premier Insurance v v v 2
12 |Sheriff Construction Inc $ 55,549.987| $ 200,000 Assuria v v v 2
13 |Blue Print Builders Inc $ 54,814,988 | $ 200,000 Assuria v v v 2
14 |Urban Edge Builders Inc $ 53,061,487 | $ 200,000 Assuria v v v 2
15 |Sign and Son Construction $ 47,784,450| $ 200,000 Caricom v v v 1
16 |Feroz Construction Services $ 45,855,600| $ 200,000 | Premier Insurance | v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Local Government & Regional Development (40/2025/13) - Rehabilitation of #79 Market

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1  |Green Plains Enterprise $ 163,690,229 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
2 |Blue Print Builders Inc $ 162,298,269 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
3 |JK Enterprise Inc $ 150,911,712 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
4 |Singh & Son Construction $ 133,923,510 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |Urban Edge Builders Inc $ 160,737,350 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
6 |Takdari Construction $ 123,177,915 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
7 |Yhadram & Sons Construction Establishment $ 121,812,915 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
8 |Sheriff Construction $ 168,221,781 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 1
9 |S.J General Contracting $ 122,705,415 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
10 |BM Property Investments Inc $ 132,849,950 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
11 |Mohangoo Business Development $ 122,915,415 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Local Government & Regional Development (41/2025/13) - Rehabilitation of Rose Hall Municipal Market

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |Mohangoo Business Development $ 41,429,325 | $ 200,000 Premier v v v 2
2 |BM Property Investments Inc $ 40,131,525 | $ 200,000 Caricom v v v 2
3 |Feroz Construction Services $ 35,724,360 | $ 200,000 Premier v v v 2
4 |D. Chowkai & Sons Construction $ 47,628,000 | $ 200,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |Avi Construction & Supply $ 42,238,245 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
6 |Singh & Son Construction $ 44,152,920 | $ 200,000 Caricom v v v 2
7 |Yhadram & Sons Construction Establishment $ 40,379,325 | $ 200,000 Caricom v v v 2
8 |Takdari Construction $ 41,744,325 | $ 200,000 Assuria v v v 2
9 |P. Baijnauth Construction Service $ 39,380,250 | $ 200,000 Premier v v v 2
10 |Rishal's Construction & Maintenance Service $ 41,172,915 | $ 200,000 Premier v v v 2
11 |Z. Khan Construction $ 34,096,860 | $ 200,000 Premier v v v 2
12 |Urban Edge Builders Inc $ 41,826,750 | $ 200,000 Assuria v v v 2
13 |ATL Engineering $ 47,731,110 | $ 200,000 Premier v v v 2
14 |Sheriff Construction Inc $ 42,713,475 | $ 200,000 Assuria v v v 2
15 |JK Enterprise Inc $ 44,440,306 No Bid Security Seen v v v 0
16 |A,E&N General Contracting $ 42,450,450 | $ 200,000 Premier v v v 2
17 |Blue Print Builders Inc $ 41,997,480 | $ 200,000 Assuria v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council, Region #5 (01/2025/75) - Extension of Mortice Primary School

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |L&M Engineering & Computer Services $ 14,823,732 | § 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
2 |Tripple A Construction & Landscaping $ 23,345,890 | $ 250,000 Premier v v v 2
3  |Ramesh Persaud & Son General Construction $ 13,114,002 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
4 |Motiram Construction $ 14,276,467 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |RHR Enterprise $ 13,690,400 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
6 |Safraz Construction Services & Supplies $ 13,853,880 | $ 250,000 Assuria v v v 2
7  |Quality Home Construction $ 13,135,815 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
8 |Sheldon Contracting Firm $ 13,365,845 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
9 |Jane Ann Robinson Contracting $ 12,387,007 | $ 360,000 Nafico v v v 1 2
10 |A&K Construction & Maintenance Services $ 16,806,604 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
11 |Momin & Son's Construction $ 12,517,470 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
12 |Anil Lalsa Construction $ 16,923,469 | $ 250,000 Assuria v v v 2
13 |G&R Construction $ 14,562,644 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
14 |R.A&D Construction Firm $ 14,276,467 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
15 Ryan Mphamed & Son Genral Construction/Fabrication 3 12,384,687 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v )
& Welding
16 |Latchman Construction & Landscaping $ 13,334,874 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
17 |N&K General Construction $ 14,802,732 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
18 |Archie's Construction $ 14,682,833 | $ 250,000 Assuria v v v 2
19 |Teon Peters Construction $ 14,779,695 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council, Region #5 (02/2025/75) - Extension of Bath Nursery School

. . i i Form of
B'gder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & l?;?nifn;ltlgy Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender |Hard | Flash
0. Currency . Copy | drive
Currency signed
1 |Dave's Contracting & Rental Services $ 20,765,104 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
2 |Teon Peters Construction Service $ 19,678,887 No Bid Secuirty Seen v v v 2
3 |RHR Enterprise $ 18,572,947 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
4  |Sheldon Contracting Firm $ 19,049,226 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |A&K Construction & Maintenance Services $ 21,215,260 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
6 |Anthony Business Establishment $ 22,018,815 | $ 250,000 Assuria v v v 2
7  |Motiram Construction $ 19,736,404 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
8 |F&A Mohamed Construction Firm $ 15,187,660 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
9 |Ramesh Persaud & Son General Construction $ 18,450,257 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
10 |KNPS Contracting & Supplies $ 24,652,530 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
11 |Latchman Construction & Landscaping $ 18,163,740 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
12 |Reality Construction $ 21,629,002 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
13 |G&R Construction $ 19,809,720 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
14 |Safraz Construction Services & Supplies $ 18,387,653 | $ 250,000 Assuria v v v 2
15 |Archie's Construction $ 20,035,050 | $ 250,000 Assuria v v v 2
16 |Anil Lalsa Construction $ 20,758,469 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
17 |KNV Designs, Construction & Supplies $ 17,017,539 | $ 360,000 Nafico v v v 2
18 |R. Dudnauth Welding & Fabrication $ 21,940,805.78 No Bid Secuirty Seen v v v |
19 |NK Enterprise Inc $ 21,730,327 No Bid Secuirty Seen v v v 1
20 |Anthony's Visionary Projects $ 19,411,297 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
21 |R.A&D Construction Firm $ 19,767,668 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
22 |FS Construction $ 16,106,695 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
23 Ryan Mphamed & Son General Construction/Fabrication $ 17.373.615 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 5
& Welding

24  |Quality Home Construction $ 20,997,654 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2

25 |Tripple A Construction & Landscaping $ 29,364,980 | $ 250,000 Premier v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council, Region #5 (03/2025/75) - Extension of Cotton Tree Nursery School

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed

1 |RHR Enterprise $ 1,653,915 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
2 |Reality Construction $ 19,088,632 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
3 |Sheldon Contracting $ 16,859,714 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
4 |Anil Lalsa Construction $ 17,671,101 | $ 250,000 Assuria v v v 2
5 |Ash Civil Engineering Works $ 18,495,897 | $ 360,000 Nafico v v v 1 2
6 |Anthony Business Establishment $ 22,087,548 | $ 250,000 Assuria v v v 2
7 |FS Construction $ 13,466,145 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
8 |G&R Construction $ 17,674,392 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
9 |Tripple A Construction & Landscaping $ 23,975,238 | $ 250,000 Premier v v v 1
10 |Latchman Construction & Landscaping $ 16,588,908 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
11 |A&K Construction & Maintenance Services $ 18,924,885 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
12 |Archie's Construction $ 17,513,003 | $ 250,000 Assuria v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council, Region #5 (04/2025/75) - Extension of Dundee Health Centre

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |KNPS Contracting & Supplies $ 15,374,415 | $ 250,000 Premier v v v 2
2  |N&K General Construction $ 13,376,706 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
Ryan Mohamed & Son General .
3 Construction/Fabrication & Welding $ 12,830,511 | § 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
4 |Tripple A Construction & Landscaping $ 20,695,794 | $ 250,000 Premier v v v 2
5 |R.A &D Construction Firm $ 13,760,665 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
6 |Ramesh Persaud & Son General Construction $ 12,609,898 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
7 |RHR Enteprise $ 12,630,948 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
8 |R. Dudnauth Welding & Fabrication $ 15,240,175 No Bid Security Seen v v v 1
9 |Momin & Son's Construction $ 11,922,786 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
10 |A&K Construction & Maintenance Services $ 15,329,976 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
11 |Latchman Construction & Landscaping $ 12,695918 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
12 |Motiram Construction $ 13,756,744 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
13 [Sheldon Contracting Firm $ 13,418,506 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
14 |NV Engineering $ 13,400,226 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
15 |Quality Home Construction $ 12,076,351 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
16 |NK Enterprise Inc $ 15,078,947 No Bid Security Seen v v v 1
17 |Ash Civil Engineering Works $ 13,928,653 | $ 36,000 Nafico v v v 2
18 |G&R Construction $ 14,385,446 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
19 |Teon Peters Construction Service $ 13,492,343 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
20 |Reality Construction $ 14,704,403 | $ 250,000 \ Caricom v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council, Region #5 (05/2025/75) - Extension of West End Nursery School

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |Reality Construction $ 16,250,419 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
2 |Latchman Construction & Landscaping $ 15,097,919 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
3  |RF Innovative Construction & Engineering Services $ 13,766,823 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
4 |NK Enterprise Inc $ 16,905,771.75 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
5 |Teon Peters Construction Service $ 16,692,910 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
6 |RHR Enterprise $ 14,582,347 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
7 |Sheldon Contracting Firm $ 14,725,484 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
8 |Safraz Construction Services & Supplies $ 14,807,400 | $ 250,000 Assuria v v v 2
9 |F&A Mohamed Construction Firm $ 13,728,435 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
10 |Tripple A Construction & Landscaping $ 21,984,000 | $ 250,000 Premier v v v 1
11 |Quality Home Construction $ 16,546,112 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
12 |Jane Ann Robinson Contracting $ 17,120,680 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
Ryan Mohamed & Son General )
13 CZnstruction/F abrication & Welding $ 13,473,484.50 1 3 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
14 |G&R Construction $ 15,111,553 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
15 |R.A&D Construction Firm $ 15,695,390 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
16 |L&M Engineering & Computer Services $ 15,629,355 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
17 |Nate's Stationery & General Construction Establishment | §  16,069,184.25 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
18 |A&K Construction & Maintenance Services $ 17,117,457 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
19 |Motiram Construction $ 14,762.911 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
20 |Archie's Construction $ 15,540,520 | $ 250,000 Assuria v v v 2
21 |Ramesh Persaud & Son General Construction $ 14,044,421 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council, Region #5 (06/2025/75) - Farm to Market Road at Abary

Bid Security

Form of

Blg((ifr Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iilé
Currency signed
1 |F & K Civil Works $ 45,837,884 | $ 250,000 Assuria v v v 2
2 |Thakoor's Enterprise $ 46,826,684 | $ 250,000 Assuria v v v 2
3  |Sheldon Contracting Firm $ 44,292,678 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
4 |KNPS Contracting and Supplies $ 45,723,245 | $ 250,000 Premier v v v 2
5 |Anil Lalsa Construction $ 46,614,092 | $ 250,000 Assuria v v v 2
6 |S.T.A.R.S Construction Services and Supplies $ 50,249,065 | $ 250,000 Premier v v v 2
7 |Ramesh Persaud & Son General Construction $ 41,457,294 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
8 |Triple A Construction and Landscaping $ 61,703,180 | § 250,000 Premier v v v 1
9 |F & A Mohamed Construction Firm $ 47,872,649 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
10 |Renish Construction & Association Form ofTender. not $ 250,000 Premier v v v 2
completed but signed
11 |Motiram Construction $ 47,169,365 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
12 |Momin and Son's Construction $ 47,488,459 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
13 |Quality Home Construction $ 43,504,522 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
Ryan Mohamed and Son General .
14 Construction/Fabrication & Welding $ 46,517,890 | § 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
15 |Tesseract Construction Guyana $ 46,580,926 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
16 |Eman reasar Construction Services $ 47,349,512 | $ 250,000 Premier v v v 2
17 |Daks Engineering Guyana $ 46,529,426 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
18 |R.A & D Construction Firm $ 47,478,777 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2
19 |G & R Construction $ 48,210,180 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council, Region #5 (07/2025/75) - Supply and Delivery of One New Bus Ambulance

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder . Bid Amount & . . Hard | Flash
No. Name of Bidder Currency Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Copy | drive
Currency signed
1 |FH Computer & General Merchandise $ 16,740,000 | $ 150,000 Assuria v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council, Region #1 (01/2025/71) - Rehabilitation of Health Cente at Cloud Land Moruca

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder . Bid Amount & . . Hard | Flash
No. Name of Bidder Currency Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Copy | drive
Currency signed
. , Form of Tender :
1 |Ziona's Enterprise $ 200,000 Caricom v v X 2

Page Not Seen




Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council, Region #1 (02/2025/71) - Construction of Health Centre Arawanaz Moruca

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency . Copy | drive
Currency signed
1 (Bull Investments $ 36,980,750 | $ 200,000 Premier v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council, Region #1 (03/2025/71) - Construction of Health Centre Haimaruni Moruca

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;

Currency signed

1 |Bull Investments $ 36,980,750| $ 200,000 | Premier Insurance v v v 2

2 |FS Construction $ 33,375,800| $ 200,000 Caricom v v v 2

3 |Ziona's Enterprise $ 38,234,950| $ 200,000 Caricom v v v 1

4 |The Dependable Construction & General Services $ 45,416,500 | $ 200,000 Caricom X v v 2

5 |Radon Construction $ 40,718,700 | $ 720,000 assuria v v v 0

6 |RF Innovative Construction and Engineering Services $ 29,909,850 No Bid Security Seen v v v 1

7 | VK Supplies and Construction Services $ 40,713,440| $ 200,000 \ Caricom v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council, Region #1 (04/2025/71) - Construction of Mabaruma Settlement

Bid Security

Form of

Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |2K's Enterprise $ 40,134,840| $ 200,000 Caricom v v v 2
2 | The Dependables Construction & General Services $ 46,976,700| $ 200,000 Caricom X v v 2
3 |Ziona's Enterprise $ 38,234,950| $ 200,000 Caricom v v v 1
4  |Bull Investments $ 36,980,750 | $ 200,000 | Premier Insurance v v v 2
5 |FS Construction $ 33,040,800 | $ 200,000 Caricom v v v 2
6 |RF Innovative Construction & Engineering Services $ 32,923,700 No Bid security seen v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council, Region #1 (05/2025/71) - Rehabilitation of Revetment at White Water

. . Bid Security Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1  |Michael Adams & Son's Enterprise & Logging Supplies | $ 44,858,320 $ 200,000 Assuria v v v 1 0
2 |Supreme Contracting & Supplies $ 46,968,200 $ 200,000 Caricom v v v 2
3 |Ziona's Enterprise $ 42,328,700| $ 200,000 Caricom v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council, Region #1 (06/2025/71) - Extension Of Arakaka Primary School Matatkai

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |Prored Resources $ 33,100,000 | $ 200,000 Premier v v v 2
2 FS Construction $ 25,807,800 | $ 200,000 Caricom v v v 2
3 |Ziona's Construction $ 30,926,000 | $ 200,000 Caricom v v v 1




Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council, Region #1 (07/2025/71) - Extension of Canal Bank Road, Matarkari

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1  |Supreme Contracting & Supplies $ 62,924,520 | $ 150,000 Caricom v v v 2
2 |Prored Resources $ 67,900,000 | $ 150,000 Premier v v v 2
3 |Ziona's Enterprise $ 69,525,000 | $ 150,000 Caricom v v v 1




Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council, Region #1 (08/2025/71) - Reconstruction of Kariako Primary

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency . Copy | drive
Currency signed
1 |Ziona's Enterprise $ 21,089,000 | $ 200,000 Caricom v v v 1




Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council, Region #1 (09/2025/71) - Reconstruction of Powaikuru Primary School

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |Ziona's Enterprise $ 20,439,000 | $ 200,000 Caricom v v v 2
2 |Radon Construction $ 21,647,800 | $ 200,000 Assuria v v v 0
3 |2K's Enterprise $ 21,124,300 | $ 200,000 Caricom v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council, Region #1 (10/2025/71) - Upgrading of Switch Gear and Synchronisation of Generator Sets at Moruca

. . Bid Security Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |AMR Engineering & General Services $ 15,750,000| $ 200,000 Caricom v v v 2
2 |RF Innovative Construction and Engineering Services $ 9,600,000 No Bid Security seen v v v 2
3 |Ziona's Enterprise $ 14,000,000| $ 200,000 \ Caricom v v v 1




Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council, Region #1 (11/2025/71) - Establishing of Electricity Grid Distribution Network at Karaburi Moruca

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |AMR Engineering & General Services $ 53,877,840| $ 150,000 Caricom v v v 2
2 |Ziona's Enterprise $ 49,234,500| $ 150,000 Caricom v v v 1
3  |Supreme Contracting & Supplies $ 54,479,600| $ 150,000 Caricom v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council, Region #1 (12/2025/71) - Extension of Kumaka Electricity Grid to Huridiah

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |Ziona's Enterprise $ 24,730,500| $ 150,000 Caricom v v v 1
2 |AMR Engineering and General Services $ 27,992,600| $ 150,000 Assuria v v v 2
3  |Supreme Contracting & Supplies $ 26,257,050| $ 150,000 Caricom v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council, Region #1 (13/2025/71) - Repairs to Port Kaituma Teachers Quarters Matarkai

Bidder
No.

Name of Bidder

Bid Amount &
Currency

Bid Security
Amount &
Currency

Bid Security Agency

GRA

NIS

Form of
Tender
signed

Hard
Copy

Flash
drive

NO BIDS RECEIVED




Date of Tender Opening: April 29, 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council, Region #7 (09/2025/77) - Construction of Primary School at Chinoweign

Bid Security

Form of

Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1  |Ash Civil Engineering Works $ 75,102.911 | $ 300,000 Nafico v v v 1 2
2 |Builder's First Choice Construction Company Inc $ 103,220,342 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
3 |JJ Mining & Construction $ 91,853,175 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
4 |KLM Construction $ 87,447,889 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
5 |J's General Store & Construction Company $ 95,814,937 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
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