
Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy

Flash 
drive

1 No Bids Received

Date of Tender Opening: December 4th 2025

File Number:National Drainage & Irrigation Authority (354/2024/21) - Consultancy Services for the Preparation of Designs, Bidding Documents and Construction Supervision 
and Capacity Building Activates for Guyana Coastal Adaption and Resilience Projects



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 
 Bid Security Amount & 

Currency Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 
Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard Copy Flash 
drive

1 Garnet Enterprise (Canada)  UD$21,888.00  UD$437.76 TD Canada Trust ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
2 Creamms Limited  US$6618.00  $                            105,000 Assuira ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

Date of Tender Opening: December 4th 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (522/2025/21) - Supply & Delivery of Feeder Gear Box, Motor & Starter - Albion Estate



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
 

Copy

Flash 
drive

1 Peter P Imports and Exports  $                      75,342,000  $              1,520,000 Diamond ✓ ✓ ✓ 1 1

2 Southwind Health and Defence  $                      91,800,000  $              2,088,000 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

3 TPLB Incorporated (USA)  US$                 336, 000  $              1,414,224 Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

Date of Tender Opening: December 4th 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (523/2025/21) - Supply & Delivery of Quicklime for the Industry



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & Currency  Bid Security Amount 

& Currency 
Bid Security 

Agency GRA NIS 
Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy

Flash 
drive

1 Garnet Engineers  US$                628,888  US$         12,577.76 TD Canada Trust N/A N/A ✓ 2

2 Machinery Corporation of Guyana Limited  $                    129,337,656  $                  2,586,753 Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

3 General Equipment (Guyana) Ltd  $                    154,268,800  $                  3,085,376 Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

Date of Tender Opening: December 4th 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (524/2025/21) - Supply and Delivery of Four (4) 180-200 HP 4 WD Agriculture Tractor



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & Currency  Bid Security Amount 

& Currency 
Bid Security 

Agency GRA NIS 
Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy

Flash 
drive

1 Farm Supplies Limited  $                 69,600,000.00  $             1,392,000.00  Assuria  ✓ ✓ ✓ 1 2

2 Machinery Corporation of Guyana Limited  $               133,450,880.00  $             2,669,018.00 Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

3 General Equipment (Guyana) Ltd  $               197,360,000.00  $             3,947,200.00 Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

4 Garnet Engineers US$                     635,888 12,717.76$                  TD Canada Trust N/A N/A ✓ 2

Date of Tender Opening: December 4th 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (525/2025/21) - Supply and Delivery of 100-110 HP 4WD Agriculture Tractors with Creeper Gear - QTY 8



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & Currency  Bid Security Amount 

& Currency 
Bid Security 

Agency GRA NIS 
Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy

Flash 
drive

1 Farm Supplies Limited  $                 92,430,000.00  $             1,848,600.00  Assuria  ✓ ✓ ✓ 1 2

2 Ansa Motors Guyana Inc.  $               117,000,000.00  $             2,340,000.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

3 Alliance Investments  $                 72,000,000.00  $             1,440,000.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

4 IMS Construction and Logistics Services 120,000,000.00$               2,600,000.00$             Caricom N/A N/A ✓ 2

5 Machinery Corporation of Guyana Limited 112,890,000.00$               2,257,800.00$             Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

6 Greenway Distributors Inc. 108,658,530.00$               2,173,173$                  Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

7 NM Trucking Auto Sales & Agri Machinery 121,650,000.00$               2,433,000.00$             Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

8 Guyana Tractor and Equipment 120,000,000.00$               2,400,000.00$             Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

9 General Equipment (Guyana) Ltd 122,850,000.00$               2,457,000.00$             Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

Date of Tender Opening: December 4th 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (526/2025/21) - Supply and Delivery of Three (3) Diesel Type - RPM 1800- 1950 Hydraulic (Long Boom) Excavator



Bidder 
 No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & Currency  Bid Security Amount 

& Currency 
Bid Security 

Agency GRA NIS 
Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy

Flash 
drive

1 Farm Supplies Limited  $                              32,950,000  $                        659,000 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 1 0

2 Yellow Steel Inc  $                              11,400,000  $                        228,000 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

3 IMS Construction &  Logistics  $                              17,500,000  $                        360,000 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

4 Alliance Investments  $                              13,000,000  $                        260,000 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

5 Geneal Equipment  $                              34,650,000  $                        693,000 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

6 Southwind Health & Defence  $                              20,500,000  $                        376,000 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

7 NM Trucking Auto Sales & Agri 
Machinery 

 $                              30,000,000  $                        600,000 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

8 MACORP  $                              17,800,000  $                        356,000 nafico ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

9 Guyana Tractor & Equipment  $                              26,600,000  $                        532,000 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

Date of Tender Opening: December 4th 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (527/2025/21) - Supply & Delivery of One (1) wheeled Front End Loader



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
 

Copy

Flash 
drive

1 Farm Supplies Limited  $                      38,640,000  $                 772,800 Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 1 2

2 Machinery Corporation of Guyana Limited  $                      37,000,000  $                 740,000 Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

3 IMS Construction and Logistics Services  $                      40,500,000  $                 900,000 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

4 Alliance Investments 27,000,000$                      540,000$                  Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

5 N.M Trucking Security Services  $                      41,300,000 826,000$                  Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

6 Guyana Tractor and Equipment  $                      35,200,000 704,000$                 Caricom

Date of Tender Opening: December 4th 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (528/2025/21) - Supply and Delivery of One (1) Wheeled Excavator



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 
 Bid Security Amount & 

Currency Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 
Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy

Flash 
drive

1 MACORP  $                348,089,320  $                           6,961,786 Nafico ✔ letter ✔ 1

2 Garnet Enterprise (Canada)  US$ 1598888  US$31,977.76 TD Canada Trust ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

3 Fix It  Depot  US$3,302,300.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 1 0

4 Farm Supplies Limited  $                186,000,000  $                           3,720,000 Assuria 

 No bid security seen  

Date of Tender Opening: December 4th 2025

File Number: 529/2025/21 - Supply & Delivery of 20 120 HP 4WD cab Cane Haulage Tractors



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
 

Copy

Flash 
drive

1 LA Projects and Services  $                      82,973,642  $              1,596,953 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

2 SRK General Maintenance Infrastructure Construction Engineering  $                      80,048,360  $              1,600,967 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

3 SOC Construction  $                      82,973,642  $                 272,000 Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

4
S&K General Construction Services and General 
Supplies Inc 42,032,000$                      840,640$                  Premier  ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

5 MS Investments  $                      48,620,300 972,406$                 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

6 MB Enterprise  $                    120,000,000 2,400,000$              Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

7 Energy Empire 106,926,057$                    2,138,533$              Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

8 IMS Construction and Logistics 99,993,000$                      2,000,000$              Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

9 Steel Pro Guyana 71,547,881$                      1,430,958$              Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

Date of Tender Opening: December 4th 2025

File Number: Ministry Culture,Youth& Sports  (446/2025/44) - Procurement & Installation Fixed Metal Bleacher with Retractable Seats- Cliff Anderson Sports Hall



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
 

Copy

Flash 
drive

1 Marshall Contracting and Landscaping Services  $               149,353,785.00  $         2,416,899.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

2 PBS Construction  $               156,857,925.00 X X ✓ 2

3 Rabin Construction and Transportation Services  $               160,007,925.00 X X ✓ 2

4 K&S Civil Engineering Contracting Service Inc. 147,463,180.00$               1,941,381.00$          Premier  ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

5 Trevor and Sons General Construction Services  $               146,144,040.00 2,196,160.00$         Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

6 A&K Construction and Maintenance Services  $               204,476,974.00 3,067,154.00$         Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

7 Builders Engineering and Architectural Consultancy 170,105,250.00$               2,551,579.00$         Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

8 Metal and Fabrication Ink 148,000,000.00$               2,415,000.00$         Nafico ✓ X ✓ 2

9 GBS Investment Inc. 154,909,860.00$               2,323,648.00$         Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

10 Eze Way Construction Inc. 125,243,224.00$               1,938,648.00$         Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

11 Holistic Contracting 190,189,650.00$               2,344,392.00$         Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

12 Shury Enterprise 151,129,880.00$               2,280,000.00$         Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

13 Singh and Son Construction 192,925,320.00$               2,893,880.00$         Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

Date of Tender Opening: December 4th 2025

File Number: Ministry Culture,Youth& Sports  (439/2025/44) - Completion of Multi-Purpose Hall Mabaruma

 No Bid Security Seen 

 No Bid Security Seen 



14 Blacks and Son Construction 206,046,947.00$               2,193,000.00$         Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

15 Panko Steel Fabrication and Construction 219,897,615.00$               3,298,464.00$         Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

16 Avionics Engineering Inc. 145,981,531.00$               2,416,899.00$         Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

17 Dynamic innovation Civil Engineering 198,479,295.00$               2,416,899.00$         Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

18 KBB Enterprise Inc. 151,606,665.00$               2,274,100.00$         Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

19 D. Chowkai and Sons Construction 187,123,650.00$               2,296,053.00$         Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

20 Gopie Investments Inc 185,318,669.00$               2,779,780.00$         Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

21 JD's Construction Company 131,289,060.00$               2,416,899.00$         Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

22 P&N International 158,786,985.00$               2,415,000.00$         Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

23 Vijay Persaud and Sons Contracting Services 158,127,978.75$               2,371,920.00$         Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

24 Rockey and Son Construction 122,101,035.00$               2,416,899.00$         Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

25 The Dependable Construction and General Services 226,886,310.00$               3,403,295.00$         Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

Engineer Estimate 161,126,595.00$             



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
 

Copy

Flash 
drive

1 PR Enterprise  $                    111,377,200  $              9,941,388 Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

2 D. Chowkai and Sons Construction  $                    158,694,250  $              1,844,319 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

3 Dynamic innovation Civil Engineering  $                    130,759,900  $              1,941,389 Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

4 Trevor and Sons General Construction Services 118,745,200$                    1,781,175$               Assuria  ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

5
Water Man and Sons Contracting and Fabrication 
Services  $                    122,887,666 1,845,000$              Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

6
Keron Evans General Construction and 
Transportation Enterprise  $                    107,270,570 1,609,059$              Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

7 DJ General Construction and Supplies 128,484,826$                    1,927,273$              Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

8 Panko Steel Fabrication and Construction 183,707,580$                    2,740,614$              Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

9 RS Services 119,077,200$                    1,941,388$              Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

10 Blacks and Son Construction 149,914,902$                    1,654,500$              Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

11 The Dependable Construction and General Services 200,070,445$                    3,001,057$              Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

12 K&D Constracting Services 117,519,700$                    1,762,796$              Demerara Fire 
and General ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

13 K&S Civil Enginering Contracting Services Inc 115,604,957$                    2,416,899$              Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

Date of Tender Opening: December 4th 2025

File Number: Ministry Culture,Youth& Sports  (440/2025/44) - Completion of Multi-Purpose Hall Mahdia



14 Shury Enterprise 121,755,370$                    1,830,000$              Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

15 Rahaman Construction and Transportation Services 105,733,980$                    1,935,000$              Caricom ✓ X ✓ 1

16 Holistic Contracting 159,299,250$                    1,883,147$              Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

17 Country Side Recycling 100,900,470$                    1,513,500$              Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

18 Rockey and Son Construction 115,060,785$                    1,941,388$              Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

19 Builders Engineering and Architectural Consultancy 129,354,170$                    1,940,313$              Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

20 Metal and Fabrication Ink 111,500,000$                    1,935,000$              Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

21 Robindra Balram 127,526,850$                    X X ✓ 2

22 PBS Construction 128,076,850$                    X X ✓ 2

23 Singh and Son Construction 166,629,375$                    2,499,441$              Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

24 P&N International 112,067,120$                    1,935,000$              Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

25 Construct IT Inc. 269,578,012$                    4,043,760$              Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

26 Avionics Engineering Inc. 118,730,557$                    1,941,388$              Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

27 Z&H Investment Inc 155,855,655$                    2,412,835$              Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

28 JD's Construction Company 115,055,820$                    1,941,388$              Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

 No Bid Security Seen 

 No Bid Security Seen 



Engineer Estimate 129,425,890$                  



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 
Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard Copy Flash drive

1 Maxmart  $                  14,000,000  $            280,000 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

2 LA Projects & Services  $                  12,295,275  $         2,138,521 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

3 Detect Logistics  $                  13,299,000  $            260,000 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

4 Steel Pro Guyana  $                  15,100,000  $            319,000 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

5 AK Premier Investments  $                  14,000,000 ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

6
SRK General Maintenance, 
Infrastructure Construction 
Engineering 

 $                  11,983,700  $            239,674 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

7 SOC Construction  $                  12,295,275  $         1,783,901 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

8 Energy Empire  $                  13,600,080  $            272,000 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

9 S&K Construction, Consultancy 
Services & General  $                    5,220,000  $            104,400 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

10 MS Investments  $                  52,205,000  $            104,410 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

11 MB Enterprise  $                  18,000,000  $            360,000 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

Date of Tender Opening: December 4th 2025

File Number: Ministry Culture,Youth& Sports (441/2025/44)  - Procurement  & Installation of Fixed Metal Bleachers with retractable seats - Multi Purpose Hall Leonora

 No bid security seen  



12 IMS Construction &  Logistics  $                  14,980,000  $            300,000 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 1



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
 

Copy

Flash 
drive

1 SOC Construction  $                 71,443,000.00  $                 292,000 Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

2 SRK General Maintenance, Infrastructure Construction  $                 71,517,735.00  $              1,430,355 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

3 Jemcorp Engineering and Imports  $               184,281,251.00  $              3,685,625 Demerara Fire 
and General ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

4 LA Projects & Services 71,443,000.00$                 272,000$                  Premier  ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

5 K&D Contracting Services  $                 20,000,000.00 2,400,000$              Demerara Fire 
and General ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

6  AK Premier Investments  69,000,000.00$                 1,380,000$              Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

7 Energy Empire 89,200,000.00$                 1,783,901$              Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

8 Steel Pro Guyana 57,500,000.00$                 1,150,000$              Premier ✓ Receipt ✓ 2

9 IMS Contracting and Logistics Services 90,000,000.00$                 1,800,000$              Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

10 MB Enterprise 104,000,000.00$               2,080,000$              Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

11 MS Investments 50,179,900.00$                 1,003,598$              Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

12
S&K Construction, Consultancy Services & General 
Supplies 50,380,000.00$                 1,007,600$              Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

Date of Tender Opening: December 4th 2025

File Number: Ministry Culture,Youth& Sports  (442/2025/44) - Procurement & Installation Fixed Metal Bleacher with Retractable Seats Synthetic Track Bayroc



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
 

Copy

Flash 
drive

1 Detect Logistics  $                 14,170,000.00  $                 280,000 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

2 SOC Construction  $                 12,295,275.00  $              2,138,521 Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

3 S&K General Maintenance, Infrastructure Construction  $                 22,980,000.00  $                 459,600 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

4 Steel Pro Guyana 15,100,000.00$                 300,000$                  Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

5 MB Enterprise  $                 18,000,000.00 360,000$                 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

6  Energy Empire  14,600,300.00$                 292,000$                 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

7 LA Project and Services 12,295,275.00$                 1,783,901$              Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

8
SRK General Maintenance, Infrastructure 
Construction Engineering 12,483,700.00$                 249,674$                 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

9 MS Investments 7,760,000.00$                   155,200$                 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

10 IMS Construction and Logistics Services 15,990,000.00$                 320,000$                 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

Date of Tender Opening: December 4th 2025

File Number: Ministry Culture,Youth& Sports  (443/2025/44) - Procurement & Installation Fixed Metal Bleacher with Retractable Seats Multi-Purpose Hall 
Mongrippa Hill



Bidde
r No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid 
Security 
Agency

GRA NIS 
Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard Copy Flash drive

1 MS Investments  $            38,927,800.00 $1,360,000 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

2
S&K Construction, 
Consultancy Services & 
General 

 $            38,928,000.00  $                   778,560 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

3 SOC Construction  $            72,404,880.00  $           1,596,953.00 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

4 Steel Pro Guyana  $            54,374,000.00  $           1,087,480.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

5 MB Enterprise  $            97,000,000.00  $           1,940,000.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

6 AK Premier Investments  $            68,000,000.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

7
SRK General Maintenance, 
Infrastructure Construction 
Engineering 

 $            65,484,480.00  $           1,309,689.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

8 Energy Empire  $            79,895,520.00  $           1,596,953.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

9 LA Projects & Services  $            72,404,880.00  $              272,000.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

Date of Tender Opening: December 4th 2025

File Number: Ministry Culture,Youth& Sports  (444/2025/44)  - Procurement  & Installation of Fixed Metal Bleachers with retractable seats - Synthetic Track New 
Amsterdam

 No bid security seen  



10 IMS Construction &  Logistics  $            84,984,000.00  $           1,700,000.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy Flash drive

1 SOC Construction  $                    12,295,275  $                 272,000 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

2 Detect Logistics  $                    14,560,000  $                 292,000 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

3 LA Projects & Services  $                    12,295,275  $                 292,000 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

4
SRK General Maintenance, 
Infrastructure Construction 
Engineering 

 $                    15,036,250  $                 300,725 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

5 IMS Construction &  Logistics  $                    16,980,000  $                 340,000 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

6
S&K Construction, Consultancy 
Services & General  $                    20,350,000  $                 407,000 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

Date of Tender Opening: December 4th 2025

File Number: Ministry Culture,Youth& Sports (445/2025/4)  - Procurement  & Installation of Fixed Metal Bleachers with retractable seats - Multi purpose Hall 
Lethem 
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