
Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
 

Copy

Flash 
drive

1 PBS Technologies Guyana Inc.  $                 40,676,774.12  $            100,000.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 1 1
2 DynamiQ Inc 43,770,000.00$                 100,000.00$            Demerara Bank ✓ ✓ ✓ 1 1
3 KM Technologies Guyana Inc. 68,250,000.00$                 100,000.00$            Diamond ✓ ✓ ✓ 1 1
4 Synetech Inc. 53,950,000.00$                 100,000.00$            Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 1 1
5 Resconec Invetsment and Management Inc. 58,310,000.00$                 100,000.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 1 1
6 Qubit Tech Global Inc. 52,250,000.00$                 US$           550 Chase Bank ✓ ✓ ✓ 1 1
7 Digital Technologies Group of Companies Inc 68,197,890.00$                 100,000.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
8 MAEC Enterprises 68,196,000.00$                 100,000.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

Date of Tender Opening: 16th December 2025

File Number: Ministry of Health (506/2025/47) - Supply and Delivery of Servers 



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
 

Copy

Flash 
drive

1 KD Enterprise L2  $                 28,000,000.00  $            200,000.00 Bank of Baroda ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
1 KD Enterprise L3 869,500,000.00$               
1 KD Enterprise L6 10,500,000.00$                 

2 Western Scientific Company Limited L1  US$              807035.32 31,500,000.00$       Premier ✓ 2
2 Western Scientific Company Limited L2 US$                     525106
2 Western Scientific Company Limited L3 US$               1757113.88
2 Western Scientific Company Limited L4 US$                 129736.43
2 Western Scientific Company Limited L5 US$                 169686.12
2 Western Scientific Company Limited L6 US$               894761.28

3 Meditron Inc L1 20,773,774.00$                 51,964,786.00$       Diamond ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
3 Meditron Inc L2 49,685,020.00$                 
3 Meditron Inc L3 380,685,020.00$               
3 Meditron Inc L4 21,442,320.00$                 
3 Meditron Inc L5 36,782,020.00$                 
3 Meditron Inc L6 10,211,300.00$                 

4 New GPC Inc. L1 29,622,274.00$                 12,000,000.00$       RBL ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
4 New GPC Inc. L2 69,683,959.00$                 
4 New GPC Inc. L3 274,908,712.00$               
4 New GPC Inc. L4 14,720,036.00$                 
4 New GPC Inc. L5 29,533,876.00$                 
4 New GPC Inc. L6 55,805,562.00$                 

5 Caribbean Medical Supplies Inc. L1 15,175,472.00$                 11,504,920.00$       Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

Date of Tender Opening: 16th December 2025

File Number: Ministry of Health (524/2025/47) - Supply, Delivery & Instillation of Medical Equipment Lot 1-6



5 Caribbean Medical Supplies Inc. L2 51,034,484.00$                 
5 Caribbean Medical Supplies Inc. L3 428,400,019.00$               
5 Caribbean Medical Supplies Inc. L4 5,157,791.00$                   
5 Caribbean Medical Supplies Inc. L5 5,761,770.00$                   
5 Caribbean Medical Supplies Inc. L6 89,716,459.00$                 



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
 

Copy

Flash 
drive

1 GT Automotive Inc.  $                 19,200,000.00  $            200,000.00 Demerara Bank ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

Date of Tender Opening: 16th December 2025

File Number:Guyana Power & Light (586/2025/02) - Procurement of Two Motor Vehicle Double Cab Pickup



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
 

Copy

Flash 
drive

1 R Sookraj and Sons  $                   3,306,858.00  $         3,306,850.00 Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 1
2 Yellow Three 6,561,700.00$                   65,617.00$              Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

3 Southwind Health and Defence  Form of Tender Not 
Completed or Signed  ✓ ✓ X 2

4 SP Worldwide Inport and Export 5,351,196.00$                   53,512.00$              Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

Date of Tender Opening: 16th December 2025

File Number: Guyana Election Commission (390/2025/11) - Procurement of Uniform Materials, Shirt and Shirt Jacs

No Bid Security Seen



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
 

Copy

Flash 
drive

1 McRae's Supermarket and General Store  $                 28,965,051.00  $            100,000.00 Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 1
2 Naran Construction 28,021,733.00$                 100,000.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 1
3 Komera General Construction  $                 27,534,236.00 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

Engineer Estimate 30,006,721.00$               

Date of Tender Opening: 16th December 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council Region 10 (23/2025/80) - Construction of Teachers Quarters (3 Apartments) at Maria Henritea 



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
 

Copy

Flash 
drive

1 Thakoor's Enterprise  $                 17,362,748.00  $            100,000.00 Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 0
2 Sheldon Contracting Firm 16,459,244.00$                 100,000.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
3 Latchman Construction and landscaping  $                 16,597,849.00 100,000.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

4 Meighoo Contracting Services  Form of Tender not 
Completed or Signed  ✓ ✓ X 2

5 Chatterpaul Construction 18,585,000.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1 0
6 P&S General Contracting Services 18,360,247.00$                 100,000.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
7 F&K Civil Works 17,978,048.00$                 100,000.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
8 Motoeram Construction 16,749,054.00$                 100,000.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 0
9 RA&D Construction Firm 16,946,976.00$                 100,000.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
10 Ishmeals and Son Construction and Drainage Services 18,585,000.00$                 100,000.00$            Assuria ✓ Letter ✓ 2

11 WJS Construction 18,524,572.00$                 3,468,374.00$         Premier ✓ Receipt ✓ 2

12 Ricks Concrete Blocks and Supplies 18,465,247.00$                 100,000.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
13 RHR Enterprise 16,444,218.00$                 100,000.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
14 Adam's and Son Construction 17,962,875.00$                 100,000.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
15 S&S Proserve 20,430,000.00$                 100,000.00$            Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

Engineer Estimate 20,430,218.00$               

Date of Tender Opening: 16th December 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council Region 5 (19/2025/75) - Extension to Bath Nursery School Bath Settlement 

No Bid Security Seen

No Bid Security Seen



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
 

Copy

Flash 
drive

1 RK's Guyana Security Services  $                   6,806,703.00  $            100,000.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
2 Castle Security Services Inc. 6,312,499.00$                   63,124.00$              Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
3 Nel Global Security Company Inc  $                   5,731,200.00 57,312.00$              Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
4 Strategic Action Security Limited  $                   5,614,272.00 56,143.00$              Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
5 Centry 21 Security 5,739,033.00$                   57,390.00$              Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
6 Panther Security Service Inc. 5,991,840.00$                   59,918.00$              Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 1
7 Amalgamated Security Services Guyana Inc. 6,491,160.00$                   64,912.00$              Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
8 Centur Security Services Inc 12,344,230.00$                 123,442.00$            Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

Date of Tender Opening: 16th December 2025

File Number:  Ministry of Natural Resource (31/2025/26) - Provision of Security Services for the Chief Administrative Offiers Residence



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
 

Copy

Flash 
drive

1 Centur Security Service Inc  $                 37,032,690.00  $            370,327.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 0
2 RK's Guyana Security Services 20,420,109.00$                 250,000.00$            Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 1
3 Nel Global Security Company Inc.  $                 17,193,600.00 171,936.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
4 Strategic Action Security Limited  $                 16,842,816.00 168,428.00$            Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 1
5 Centry 21 Security 17,217,099.00$                 172,171.00$            Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
6 Panther Security Service 17,975,520.00$                 179,755.00$            Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
7 Amalgamated Security Services Guyana Inc. 19,473,480.00$                 194,735.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
8 Castle Security Services Inc 18,937,498.00$                 189,374.00$            Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

Date of Tender Opening: 16th December 2025

File Number:  Ministry of Natural Resource (32/2025/26) - Provision of Security Services for Head Office 



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
 

Copy

Flash 
drive

1 Humming Bird General Construction  $                 59,570,000.00  $            893,550.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
2 R. Kissoon Contrcating Services 47,489,250.00$                 750,000.00$            Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
3 Vijay Persaud & Sons Contracting Services  $                 53,363,335.00 800,450.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
4 ACL Construction Guyana  $                 56,015,350.00 840,000.00$            Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
5 N & N Construction Services 52,193,500.00$                 900,000.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
6 DJ General Construction and Supplies 61,346,175.00$                 920,193.00$            Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
7 Faldhari Singh and Son Contracting Service 53,101,250.00$                 900,000.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
8 Amic General Contracting Service 49,997,400.00$                 900,000.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
9 S&D Construction 61,352,500.00$                 920,288.00$            Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
10 Innovative Engineering Solution 56,543,775.00$                 813,657.00$            Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
11 Deo's Imperial Construction Inc. 55,696,800.00$                 870,000.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
12 NP Contracting and Transportation Services 56,259,725.00$                 900,683.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

13 King Kong Constructions  Form of Tender not 
Completed or Signed  

891,759.00$            Premier ✓ ✓ X 2

14 GM Futurestic Development 55,273,225.00$                 900,000.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
15 Expert Builders and Supplies Contractors 47,490,400.00$                 750,000.00$            Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
16 Engineered Construction Company 53,607,250.00$                 900,000.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
17 Joshie Construction and Supplies 56,361,155.00$                 845,417.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

Engineer Estimate 67,981,744.00$                 

Date of Tender Opening: 16th December 2025

File Number:  Guyana Water Inc. (156/2025/45) - Supply and Instillation of 100mm & 150mm PVC Pipes or a New Distribution Network at Washington Scheme, 
Parika, Region No.3



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

 
Hard 

 
Copy 

Flash 
drive

1 K&J Persaud Con. Ser. L 1  $              74,999,400.00  $         1,508,913.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
1 K&J Persaud Con. Ser. L 2  $            720,011,225.00  $         1,440,023.00 
1 K&J Persaud Con. Ser. L 3  $              78,089,140.00  $         1,561,783.00 
1 K&J Persaud Con. Ser. L 4  $            101,828,967.00  $         2,036,579.00 
1 K&J Persaud Con. Ser. L 5  $            209,168,530.00  $         4,183,371.00 

2 Emeralds General Contracting & Distributors L 1  $              81,377,100.00  $         1,700,000.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
2 Emeralds General Contracting & Distributors L 2  $              78,878,100.00  $         1,600,000.00 
2 Emeralds General Contracting & Distributors L 3  $              87,230,798.00  $         1,744,616.00 
2 Emeralds General Contracting & Distributors L 4  $            103,408,204.00  $         2,300,000.00 
2 Emeralds General Contracting & Distributors L 5  $            203,863,155.00  $         4,200,000.00 

3 GroupOn Trading & General Contracting L1  $              84,328,965.00  $         4,720,000.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
3 GroupOn Trading & General Contracting L2  - -
3 GroupOn Trading & General Contracting L3  $              88,914,154.00  $         2,350,000.00 
3 GroupOn Trading & General Contracting L4  $            113,873,410.00  $         1,840,000.00 
3 GroupOn Trading & General Contracting L5  $            220,955,115.00  $         1,840,000.00 

4 Dowdatram Construction & Engineering Ent L1  $              88,808,580.00  $         1,800,000.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
4 Dowdatram Construction & Engineering Ent L2  -  - 
4 Dowdatram Construction & Engineering Ent L3  $              88,507,587.00  $         1,850,000.00 
4 Dowdatram Construction & Engineering Ent L4  $            120,290,285.00  $         4,660,000.00 
4 Dowdatram Construction & Engineering Ent L5  $            218,428,036.00  $         2,400,000.00 

5 RAPS L1  $              87,684,135.00  $         1,820,000.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
5 RAPS L2  - 
5 RAPS L3  $              84,407,250.00  $         1,820,000.00 

Caricom

Date of Tender Opening: 16th December 2025

File Number: Ministry of Home Affairs (856/2025/51) - Construction of Farm at Mazaruni Prison Lots 1-5

Caricom

Premier

Assuira

Caricom



5 RAPS L4  $            118,873,110.00  $         2,300,000.00 
5 RAPS L5  $            223,987,600.00  $         4,700,000.00 

6 Javir's Construction  & Supplies L1  $              77,222,250.00  $         1,780,000.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
6 Javir's Construction  & Supplies L2  $              80,969,175.00  $         1,780,000.00 
6 Javir's Construction  & Supplies L3  $              80,688,563.00  $         1,880,000.00 
6 Javir's Construction  & Supplies L4  $            100,432,990.00  $         3,073,684.00 
6 Javir's Construction  & Supplies L5  $            224,159,359.00  $         4,560,000.00 

7 AYN Construcrion & General Services L1  $              81,548,250.00  $         2,000,000.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
7 AYN Construcrion & General Services L2  $            114,894,938.00  $         3,000,000.00 
7 AYN Construcrion & General Services L3  $              98,072,363.00  $         3,000,000.00 
7 AYN Construcrion & General Services L4  $            140,772,547.00  $         3,000,000.00 
7 AYN Construcrion & General Services L5  $            218,997,143.00  $         5,000,000.00 

8 Ceraturium L1  $              79,952,250.00  $         1,780,000.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
8 Ceraturium L2  $              78,071,175.00  $         1,780,000.00 
8 Ceraturium L3  $              82,799,063.00  $         1,880,000.00 
8 Ceraturium L4  $            103,684,190.00  $         3,073,684.00 
8 Ceraturium L5  $            211,689,333.00  $         4,560,000.00 

9 Gryphon Engineering Inc L1  $              41,406,750.00  $            840,000.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
9 Gryphon Engineering Inc L2  $              60,018,000.00  $         1,220,000.00 
9 Gryphon Engineering Inc L3  $              75,219,375.00  $         1,520,000.00 
9 Gryphon Engineering Inc L4  $            102,767,580.00  $         2,060,000.00 
9 Gryphon Engineering Inc L5  $            190,027,873.00  $         3,820,000.00 

10 Holistic Contracting & Procurement Inc L1  $              61,111,260.00  $         6,860,718.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
10 Holistic Contracting & Procurement Inc L2  $              90,871,620.00  $         2,338,069.00 
10 Holistic Contracting & Procurement Inc L3  $              95,107,425.00  $         1,902,149.00 
10 Holistic Contracting & Procurement Inc L4  $            116,903,458.00  $         1,222,225.00 
10 Holistic Contracting & Procurement Inc L5  $            343,035,898.00  $         1,817,432.00 

11 Mohamed Rafi Yusoof Construction L1  $              88,065,600.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

Caricom

Premier

Caricom

Caricom

Caricom



11 Mohamed Rafi Yusoof Construction L2  $              86,056,425.00 
11 Mohamed Rafi Yusoof Construction L3  $              97,856,850.00 
11 Mohamed Rafi Yusoof Construction L4  $            134,538,562.00 
11 Mohamed Rafi Yusoof Construction L5  $            239,817,385.00 

12 Gopie Investement Inc L1  $            100,472,767.00  $            943,247.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
12 Gopie Investement Inc L2  $              86,618,915.00  $         1,409,268.00 
12 Gopie Investement Inc L3  $              69,980,663.00  $         1,399,614.00 
12 Gopie Investement Inc L4  $              70,463,400.00 1,732,379.00$         
12 Gopie Investement Inc L5  $              47,162,325.00  $         2,009,456.00 

13 Amaya Trading L1  $              88,936,050.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
13 Amaya Trading L2  $              85,922,025.00 
13 Amaya Trading L3  $              98,711,550.00 
13 Amaya Trading L4  $            133,164,157.00 
13 Amaya Trading L5  $            240,634,680.00 

14 Triple P Construction & Gen L1  $              75,445,650.00  $         1,500,000.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
14 Triple P Construction & Gen L2  $              72,000,075.00  $         1,444,000.00 
14 Triple P Construction & Gen L3  $              78,619,140.00  $         1,560,000.00 
14 Triple P Construction & Gen L4  $            101,471,996.00  $         2,030,000.00 
14 Triple P Construction & Gen L5  $            209,424,262.00  $         4,190,000.00 

✔ ✔ ✔ 2
15 Wong Genesis Enterrpise L1 -
15 Wong Genesis Enterrpise L2  - 
15 Wong Genesis Enterrpise L3  - 
15 Wong Genesis Enterrpise L4  $            112,704,096.00  $         2,254,082.00 
15 Wong Genesis Enterrpise L5  -  - 

16 SOC Construction L1  $              85,285,200.00  $         1,700,000.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
16 SOC Construction L2  $              86,413,950.00  $         1,680,000.00 
16 SOC Construction L3  $              96,335,925.00  $         1,760,000.00 
16 SOC Construction L4  - 
16 SOC Construction L5  $            214,784,203.00  $         4,200,000.00 

Caricom

 $         4,796,348.00 Premier

Caricom

 $         4,812,694.00 Premier

Assuira

Assuira



17 A&B Transportation Service & Supplies L1  $              82,702,725.00  $         4,460,425.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
17 A&B Transportation Service & Supplies L2  $              81,226,425.00  $         2,212,793.00 
17 A&B Transportation Service & Supplies L3  $              88,155,854.00  $         1,763,117.00 
17 A&B Transportation Service & Supplies L4  $            110,639,654.00  $         1,624,529.00 
17 A&B Transportation Service & Supplies L5  $            223,021,276.00  $         1,654,055.00 

18 Sheik Hussein Contracting Services Inc L1  $              43,077,714.00  $            900,000.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
18 Sheik Hussein Contracting Services Inc L2  $              67,814,956.00  $         1,400,000.00 
18 Sheik Hussein Contracting Services Inc L3  $              69,489,767.00  $         1,400,000.00 
18 Sheik Hussein Contracting Services Inc L4  $            107,703,373.00  $         2,160,000.00 
18 Sheik Hussein Contracting Services Inc L5  $            151,682,957.00  $         4,100,000.00 

19 Andrect Engineering &Construction L 1  $              41,429,850.00  $         1,000,000.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
19 Andrect Engineering &Construction L 2  $              64,191,986.00  $         1,000,000.00 
19 Andrect Engineering &Construction L 3  $              73,840,620.00  $         1,000,000.00 
19 Andrect Engineering &Construction L 4  $              92,593,089.00  $         1,000,000.00 
19 Andrect Engineering &Construction L 5  $            150,485,415.00  $         1,000,000.00 

20 Vijay Persaud & Sons Contracting Services L1  $              79,445,100.00  $         1,588,902.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
20 Vijay Persaud & Sons Contracting Services L2  $              84,913,500.00  $         1,698,270.00 
20 Vijay Persaud & Sons Contracting Services L3  $              83,380,190.25  $         1,667,603.00 
20 Vijay Persaud & Sons Contracting Services L4  $            133,637,132.00  $         2,672,742.00 
20 Vijay Persaud & Sons Contracting Services L5  $            227,321,383.00  $         4,546,428.00 

21 P&N International L1  $              84,152,250.00  $         1,780,000.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
21 P&N International L2  $            841,198,175.00  $         1,780,000.00 
21 P&N International L3  $              85,938,562.00  $         1,880,000.00 
21 P&N International L4  $            106,528,990.00  $         2,200,000.00 
21 P&N International L5  $            232,014,915.00 4,560,000.00$         

22 D. Chowkai & Sons Construction L1  $              58,538,760.00  $         6,737,540.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
22 D. Chowkai & Sons Construction L2  $              86,682,120.00  $         2,250,559.00 
22 D. Chowkai & Sons Construction L3  $              90,443,850.00  $         1,808,877.00 

Premier

Premier

Assuria 

Assuria 

Premier

Caricom



22 D. Chowkai & Sons Construction L4  $            112,527,940.00  $         1,733,642.00 
22 D. Chowkai & Sons Construction L5  $            336,876,996.00  $         1,170,775.00 

23 R&R General Construction & Supplies L1  $              85,163,925.00  $         1,703,279.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
23 R&R General Construction & Supplies L2  $              82,457,025.00  $         1,649,141.00 
23 R&R General Construction & Supplies L3  $            121,467,053.00  $         2,429,281.00 
23 R&R General Construction & Supplies L4  $            120,314,740.00  $         2,406,299.00 
23 R&R General Construction & Supplies L5  $            224,379,309.00  $         4,487,587.00 

24 G.S Contracting & General Supplies L1  $              87,082,800.00  $         1,741,656.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
24 G.S Contracting & General Supplies L2  - 
24 G.S Contracting & General Supplies L3  $              85,885,117.00  $         1,717,702.00 
24 G.S Contracting & General Supplies L4  - 
24 G.S Contracting & General Supplies L5  - 

25 Global Builders Engineering Inc L1  $              83,048,175.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
25 Global Builders Engineering Inc L2  $              58,753,000.00 
25 Global Builders Engineering Inc L3  $              87,507,522.00 
25 Global Builders Engineering Inc L4  $            110,791,547.00 
25 Global Builders Engineering Inc L5  $            180,194,605.00 

26 Builders First Choice Construction Co. Inc L1  $              83,752,725.00  $         1,675,054.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
26 Builders First Choice Construction Co. Inc L2  $              82,276,425.00  $         1,645,528.00 
26 Builders First Choice Construction Co. Inc L3  $              87,095,854.00  $         1,741,917.00 
26 Builders First Choice Construction Co. Inc L4  $            111,655,654.00  $         2,233,113.00 
26 Builders First Choice Construction Co. Inc L5  $            224,021,276.00  $         4,480,425.00 

Engineer Estimate L1  $            89,044,725.00 
Engineer Estimate L2 86,476,425.00$            
Engineer Estimate L3 93,985,854.00$            
Engineer Estimate L4 -
Engineer Estimate L5 228,021,276.00$          

 $         3,603,892.00 Premier

Assuria 

Caricom

Assuria



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
 

Copy

Flash 
drive

1 Triple P Construction & General Supplies  $                 65,083,140.00  $         1,301,663.00 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
2 K&J Persaud Contrating Service 64,573,140.00$                 1,291,463.00$         Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
3 A&R Naraine Contracting Services  $                 65,102,112.00 1,302,042.00$         Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
4 Javir's Construction and Supplies General  $                 46,763,175.00 1,620,000.00$         Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 1
5 Sovereignty Investments Construction Service (SICS Builders) 76,311,912.00$                 1,800,000.00$         Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 1
6 STP Investments Incorporated 73,557,300.00$                 1,472,000.00$         Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
7 A.G Enterprise 53,000,000.00$                 1,060,000.00$         Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
8 Top Tier Builders No Bid Page Seen 14,000,000.00$       Premier ✓ ✓ X 0
9 D.D.A Enterprise 43,422,060.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
10 R&R General Construction and Supplies 94,020,540.00$                 1,880,411.00$         Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
11 Alpha and Omega Engineering 74,657,574.00$                 1,573,731.00$         Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
12 Wesley Haynes 46,084,620.00$                 100,000.00$            Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
13 Mohamed Rafi Yusoof Construction 106,080,612.00$               2,121,612.00$         Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
14 D. Chowkai & Sons Construction 121,159,680.00$               851,551.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
15 P&N International 49,063,530.00$                 1,620,000.00$         Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
16 Ceraturium 47,560,050.00$                 1,620,000.00$         Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 1
17 Technocon Investments Procurement and General Contracting Solutions51,925,548.00$                 1,120,000.00$         Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
18 VG's Construction Services 52,062,840.00$                 1,139,860.00$         Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
19 Metal and Fabrication Ink 80,000,000.00$                 1,980,000.00$         Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
20 Global Builders Engineering Incorporated 105,112,020.00$               212,240.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
21 Andrect Engineering & Construction 87,468,264.00$                 800,000.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
22 Steff Construction 60,913,227.00$                 1,218,265.00$         Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
23 Green Plains Enterprise 61,674,096.00$                 1,233,482.00$         Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
24 Seenaraine's Construction & Landscaping Services 40,978,602.00$                 1,200,000.00$         Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
25 IMS Construction and Logistics Services 73,557,810.00$                 1,600,000.00$         Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
26 Ciachecal P3 Farms 69,375,810.00$                 1,387,516.00$         Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

Date of Tender Opening: 16th December 2025

File Number:  Ministry of Home Affaits (857/2025/51) - Construction of Fence at Charity Police Station Region No.2

No Bid Security Seen



27 Amaya's Trading 123,178,170.00$               2,463,575.00$         Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
28 Kawal Ramdeen General Construction & Office Furnishing 72,571,980.00$                 1,451,440.00$         Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
29 Trevor & Son General Constructuion Services 45,972,930.00$                 919,459.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
30 L. Pool Civil Works 71,629,500.00$                 1,500,000.00$         Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
31 Dundas Construction Inc. 42,080,202.00$                 1,200,000.00$         Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
32 Holistic Contracting & Procurement Inc 124,451,730.00$               2,489,035.00$         Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
33 united Builders Engineering and General Supplies 72,020,160.00$                 1,440,403.00$         Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
34 Vijay Persaud & Sons Contracting Services 71,381,844.00$                 1,427,637.00$         Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
35 K and J Persaud Contracting Service 27,145,250.00$                 542,905.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
36 Ican Engineering & Construction 73,740,900.00$                 1,474,818.00$         Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓

Engineer Estimate 74,385,030.00$               



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 
Form of 
Tender 
signed 

 
Hard 
Copy 

Flash 
drive

1 Emeralds General Contracting & Distributors  $                   41,954,660  $              5,000,000 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
2 WJS Construction  $                 173,418,718  $                 100,000 ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
3 Full Service Enterprise  $                 175,000,359  $              3,500,000 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
4 P&N International  $                   33,083,600  $                 720,000 ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
5 SICS Builders  $                   36,526,600  $                 800,000 Assuira ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
6 Seenarine's Construction & Landscaping  $                   34,643,215  $                 740,000 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
7 R&R General Construction & Supplies  $                   67,724,470  $              1,354,490 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
8 Ceraturium  $                   34,145,100  $                 720,000 ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
9 Singh & Son Construction  $                   85,125,150  $              1,702,503 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

10 Mohamed Rafi Yusoof Construction  $                   72,512,585  $              1,450,252 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

11 Top Tier Builders  Form of tender page not 
seen  $                 720,000 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

12 D. Chowkai & Sons Construction  $                   52,803,360  $              1,371,997 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
13 STP Investment Inc  $                   48,665,925  $                 974,000 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
14 L. Pool Civil Works  $                   34,104,510  $                 740,000 Assuira ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
15 DG Enterprise  $                   34,955,415  $                 740,000 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
16 Holistic Contracting & Procurement Inc  $                   70,553,450  $              1,411,069 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
17 SOC Construction  $                   34,001,000  $                 640,000 Assuira ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
18 KP Enterprise  $                   35,240,590  $                 704,812 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
19 Andrect Engineering &Construction  $                   51,364,610  $              1,560,000 Assuira ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
20 ECS Construction & General Supplies  $                   35,768,711  $                 715,374 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
21 Javir's Construction  & Supplies  $                   30,739,700  $                 720,000 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
22 Westbrook Caribbean Inc.  $                   32,615,110  $              1,200,000 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
23 JKH Enteprise  $                   35,055,020  $                 701,100 Assuira ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
24 M&D Investments  $                   32,529,090  x x ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
25 Green Plains Enterprise  $                   31,540,850  $              1,000,000 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

Date of Tender Opening: 16th December 2025

File Number: 858/2025/51 - Infrastructure wroks to Wisroc Fire Station & Living Quarters, Region No. 10



Engineer Estimate  $                   36,317,270 



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & Currency 

1 P&N Internaional  $              252,112,380.00 

2 Singh and Son Construction 561,774,639.00$               
3 LF Global Inc.  $              340,692,668.00 
4 Global Builders Engineering Incorporated  $              393,671,101.00 
5 Vishal's Contracting Co 264,601,056.00$               
6 Kawal Ramdeen Genera Construction & Office Furnishings 258,302,658.00$               
7 Truck Smart 303,460,812.00$               
8 J.B.S Investments Inc. 278,358,480.00$               
9 Romano Builders 289,658,284.00$               

10 M&D Investments 297,494,448.00$               
11 Amaya's Trading 483,061,290.00$               
12 KP Engineering 232,324,278.00$               
13 L. Pool Civil Works 250,549,067.00$               
14 Ceraturium 249,419,580.00$               
15 D.Chowkai & Sons Construction 426,156,663.00$               
16 Andrect Engineering & Construction 537,954,783.00$               
17 Full Service Enterprise 649,999,999.00$               
18 D&S Construction 234,147,900.00$               
19 Sovereignty Investments Construction Service (SICS Builders) 279,886,368.00$               
20 Holistic Contracting & Procurement Inc. 439,886,679.00$               
21 SOC Construction 266,958,786.00$               
22 ECS Construction and General Supplies 257,839,017.00$               
23 C.A.J Construction Firm 240,755,659.00$               
24 Westbrook Caribbean Inc. 259,898,914.00$               

25 Top Tier Builders  No Form of Tender Page 
Seen 

26 Kbee Enterprise Inc. 361,985,505.00$               
27 Emeralds General Constracting & Distributors 255,989,961.00$               
28 AYN Construction & General Services 260,022,837.00$               
29 JD Investments Inc. 260,273,257.00$               
30 STP Investments Inc. 231,286,412.00$               
31 Dundas Construction Inc. 255,150,195.00$               
32 Green Plains Enterprise 

Engineer Estimate 262,352,650.00$               

Date of Tender Opening: 16th December 2025

File Number:  Ministry of Home Affaits (859/2025/51) - Construction of Timehri Fire Station



 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy

Flash 
drive

 $        5,400,000.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

11,235,493.00$       Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
6,813,853.00$         Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
7,873,422.00$         Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
5,292,021.00$         Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
5,166,054.00$         Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
6,020,000.00$         Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
5,567,168.00$         Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
5,800,000.00$         Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

800,000.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
9,661,226.00$         Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
4,646,485.00$         Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
5,020,000.00$         Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
5,400,000.00$         Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 1
8,523,133.00$         Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

300,000.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 1
13,000,000.00$       Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
3,525,000.00$         Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
5,600,000.00$         Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
8,797,734.00$         Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
5,340,000.00$         Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
5,156,781.00$         Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
5,240,000.00$         Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 1
4,400,000.00$         Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

4,900,000.00$         Premier ✓ ✓ X 2

7,239,710.00$         Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
6,000,000.00$         Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
6,000,000.00$         Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
5,205,465.00$         Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
6,626,000.00$         Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
3,860,000.00$         Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
5,400,000.00$         Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

File Number:  Ministry of Home Affaits (859/2025/51) - Construction of Timehri Fire Station



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

1 Maxmart  $              28,000,000.00 
2 Wesley Haynes  $              24,122,340.00 
3 Kaydar Persaud Contracting  $              39,920,925.00 

4 Top Tier Builders  Form of tender page not 
seen 

5 Infinity Contracting & General Services  $              30,574,060.00 
6 Mohamed Rafi Yusoof Construction  $              54,173,460.00 
7 Gurdev Mahadeo Contracting Services  $              30,090,500.00 
8 Green Plains Enterprise  $              27,216,530.00 
9 Javir's Construction  & Supplies  $            250,439,580.00 

10 STP Investments Inc  $              40,470,925.00 
11 Amaya Trading  $              51,558,650.00 
12 Metal & Fabrication INK  $              36,500,001.00 
13 Dundas Construction  $              28,518,820.00 
14 Holistic Contracting & Procurement Inc  $              44,828,190.00 
15 Andrect Engineering &Construction  $              42,466,380.00 
16 DDA Enterprise  $              34,448,095.00 
17 Kawal Ramdeen  $              32,336,370.00 
18 Singh & Son Construction  $              49,034,700.00 
19 L. Pool Civil Works  $              28,919,990.00 
20 KAN Engineering & Construction  $              31,448,890.00 
21 Ceraturium  $              29,027,350.00 
22 NP Investment  $              73,047,300.00 
23 Triple P Construction & Gen  $              26,815,250.00 

24 Techocon Investments Procurement & Gen Contracting 
Solution  $              26,772,350.00 

25 SAAM General Contracting  $              29,384,990.00 
26 P&N International  $              28,345,350.00 
27 D. Chowkai & Sons Construction  $            528,033,601.00 
28 Javir's Construction  & Supplies  $              27,575,350.00 

Engineer Estimate 30,852,470$                   

Date of Tender Opening: 16th December 2025

File Number: Ministry of Home Affairs (860/2025/51) - Infrastructural Works to Charity Fire Station



 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 
Form of 
Tender 
signed 

 
Hard 
Copy 

Flash 
drive

 $                560,000 Assuia ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
 $                500,000 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
 $                809,419 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

 $                620,000 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

 $                589,481 Assuia ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
 $             1,083,469 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
 $                601,810 Assuia ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
 $             1,000,000 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
 $             5,400,000 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
 $                810,000 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
 $             1,031,173 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
 $                840,000 Nafico ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
 $                620,000 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
 $                896,564 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
 $             1,300,000 Assuia ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
 x x
 $                646,728 Assuia ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
 $                  98,694 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
 $                620,000 Assuia ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
 $                628,977 Assuia ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
 $                700,000 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
 $             1,460,946 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
 $                536,305 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

 $                620,000 Assuia ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

 $                700,000 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
 $                700,000 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
 $             2,423,194 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
 $                700,000 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

File Number: Ministry of Home Affairs (860/2025/51) - Infrastructural Works to Charity Fire Station
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