
Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy

Flash 
drive

1 General Equipment Guyana Limited (Technical Score 60 
Points)  $                  28,265,600.00 ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 0

Date of Tender Opening: 18th December 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education - HTTI (85/2025/40 Financial) - Supply and Delivery of Agricultural Machinery & Equipment (Essequibo Technical Institute)



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy

Flash 
drive

4 Supreme Distributors (Technical Score 95 Points)  $                355,350,000.00 ✓ 0

11 Western Scientific Company Limited (Technical Score 
70 Ponits) US$                641,400 ✓ 1 1

Date of Tender Opening: 18th December 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education - HTTI (568/2025/40 Financial) - Supply & Delivery of Smartboards and Mobile Stands 



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy

Flash 
drive

1 Western Scientific Company Limited L1  US$            226,905.81 N/A N/A ✓ 2

1 Western Scientific Company Limited L2 US$             190,946.86
1 Western Scientific Company Limited L3 US$             168,299.10
1 Western Scientific Company Limited L4 US$               325,701.74
1 Western Scientific Company Limited L5 US$              109,684.19
1 Western Scientific Company Limited L6 US$                55,006.74

2 Essco Guyana Inc  Form of Tender Not 
Completed But Signed  ✓ ✓ ✓ 1 0

3 Meditron Inc. L1 32,689,336.00$                   X X ✓ 1 0

3 Meditron Inc. L2 27,585,569.00$                   
3 Meditron Inc. L3 28,146,975.00$                   
3 Meditron Inc. L4 59,713,350.00$                   
3 Meditron Inc. L5 17,245,425.00$                   
3 Meditron Inc. L6 4,579,000.00$                     

4 ABD Medicare Investment Inc. L1  Form of Tender Not 
Completed But Signed  281,828.00$             Nafico ✓ ✓ X 1 1

Date of Tender Opening: 18th December 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education - HTTI (1001/2025/40) - Supply, Delivery, Instillation and Commissioning of Equipment & Furniture at the Hospitality Tourism Training 
Institute Los 1-6

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy

Flash 
drive

1 Action Construction Equipment Limited JV Iris Global 
Services Private Limited 

 Technical and Financial 
Proposal Submitted  

Sample of the Laptop was 
Submitted  

 US$           36,740 Demerara Fire 
and General ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

2 Giftland Office Max  Technical and Financial 
Proposal Submitted  7,660,290.00$          Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

3 Digital Technology Group of Companies Inc.  Technical and Financial 
Proposal Submitted 7,660,290.00$          Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

4 ASP Global 
 Technical and Financial 
Proposal Submitted but it 

Was Merged  
7,660,290.00$          Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

5 PBS Technologies Guyana Inc.  Technical and Financial 
Proposal Submitted 7,660,290.00$          Premier X X ✓ 0

6 Nationwide Imports  Technical and Financial 
Proposal Submitted 7,660,290.00$          Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 0

7 CET-AMR Group Inc.  Technical and Financial 
Proposal Submitted 7,660,290.00$          GTM ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

8 Next Tech Inc  Technical and Financial 
Proposal Submitted 7,660,290.00$          Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

9 MAEC Enterprises  Technical and Financial 
Proposal Submitted 7,660,290.00$          Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

10 Cell Phone Shack  Technical and Financial 
Proposal Submitted 7,660,290.00$          Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

11 Dynamiq Inc  Technical and Financial 
Proposal Submitted 7,660,290.00$          Demerara Bank ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

Date of Tender Opening: 18th December 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education - HTTI (1008/2025/40) - Supply and Delivery of Laptops for Schools 



12 Qubit Tech Global Inc.  Technical and Financial 
Proposal Submitted US$           36,740 Chase Bank ✓ ✓ ✓ 2



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 
Form of 
Tender 
signed 

 
Hard 
Copy 

Flash 
drive

1 Industrial Safety Supplies Inc Lot 1  $                 3,135,000.00  $              1,421,472 Hand in Hand ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
1 Industrial Safety Supplies Inc Lot 2  $                 3,580,000.00 
1 Industrial Safety Supplies Inc Lot 3  $                    354,000.00 
1 Industrial Safety Supplies Inc Lot 4  $                    490,000.00 
1 Industrial Safety Supplies Inc Lot 5  $                 1,812,000.00 
1 Industrial Safety Supplies Inc Lot 6  $               19,996,000.00 
1 Industrial Safety Supplies Inc Lot 7  $               15,100,800.00 
1 Industrial Safety Supplies Inc Lot 8 9,768,000.00$                 0
1 Industrial Safety Supplies Inc Lot 9 252,000.00$                    
1 Industrial Safety Supplies Inc Lot 10 475,000.00$                    
1 Industrial Safety Supplies Inc Lot 11 436,000.00$                    
1 Industrial Safety Supplies Inc Lot 12 1,358,000.00$                 
1 Industrial Safety Supplies Inc Lot 13 16,508,800.00$               
1 Industrial Safety Supplies Inc Lot 15 1,470,000.00$                 
1 Industrial Safety Supplies Inc Lot 16 980,000.00$                    
1 Industrial Safety Supplies Inc Lot 22 358,000.00$                    

2 The Hardware Depot Lot 1 (Samples Submitted) 2,625,000.00$                 590,750$                  Diamond ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
2 The Hardware Depot Lot 2 6,500,000.00$                 
2 The Hardware Depot Lot 3 1,050,000.00$                 
2 The Hardware Depot Lot 10 900,000.00$                    
2 The Hardware Depot Lot 11 600,000.00$                    
2 The Hardware Depot Lot 12 400,000.00$                    
2 The Hardware Depot Lot 14 1,800,000.00$                 
2 The Hardware Depot Lot 15 2,100,000.00$                 
2 The Hardware Depot Lot 16 1,225,000.00$                 
2 The Hardware Depot Lot 17 3,625,000.00$                 
2 The Hardware Depot Lot 18 8,032,500.00$                 
2 The Hardware Depot Lot 22 600,000.00$                    

Date of Tender Opening: 18th December 2025

File Number: Guyana Power & Light (617/2025/02) - Supply and Delivery of Safety Equipment & Clothing



3 International Gas and Oil Trading Guyana Inc Lot 1 10,323,514.00$               8,408,201$               Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
3 International Gas and Oil Trading Guyana Inc Lot 2 13,566,220.00$               
3 International Gas and Oil Trading Guyana Inc Lot 4 2,008,038.00$                 
3 International Gas and Oil Trading Guyana Inc Lot 5 5,726,414.00$                 
3 International Gas and Oil Trading Guyana Inc Lot 6 26,664,650.00$               
3 International Gas and Oil Trading Guyana Inc Lot 7 19,493,252.00$               
3 International Gas and Oil Trading Guyana Inc Lot 8 13,785,460.00$               
3 International Gas and Oil Trading Guyana Inc Lot 9 3,712,626.00$                 
3 International Gas and Oil Trading Guyana Inc Lot 10 13,828,678.00$               
3 International Gas and Oil Trading Guyana Inc Lot 11 2,316,310.00$                 
3 International Gas and Oil Trading Guyana Inc Lot 12 3,307,550.00$                 
3 International Gas and Oil Trading Guyana Inc Lot 13 32,147,007.00$               
3 International Gas and Oil Trading Guyana Inc Lot 14 4,474,738.00$                 
3 International Gas and Oil Trading Guyana Inc Lot 15 10,069,383.00$               
3 International Gas and Oil Trading Guyana Inc Lot 17 6,639,304.00$                 
3 International Gas and Oil Trading Guyana Inc Lot 18 18,227,442.00$               
3 International Gas and Oil Trading Guyana Inc Lot 19 26,711,764.00$               
3 International Gas and Oil Trading Guyana Inc Lot 20 31,346,611.00$               
3 International Gas and Oil Trading Guyana Inc Lot 21 51,065,298.00$               
3 International Gas and Oil Trading Guyana Inc Lot 22 441,301.00$                    
3 International Gas and Oil Trading Guyana Inc Lot 23 5,494,319.00$                 

4 Linco's Garment Factory (Samples Submitted) 50,812,650.00$               1,016,253$               Diamond ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

5 Crystal Lam Designs Lot 1 (Sample Submitted) 4,125,000.00$                 2,515,876$               Demerara Fire & 
General ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

5 Crystal Lam Designs Lot 2 7,000,000.00$                 
5 Crystal Lam Designs Lot 3 1,050,000.00$                 
5 Crystal Lam Designs Lot 4 825,000.00$                    
5 Crystal Lam Designs Lot 5 1,875,000.00$                 
5 Crystal Lam Designs Lot 6 13,000,000.00$               
5 Crystal Lam Designs Lot 7 7,800,000.00$                 
5 Crystal Lam Designs Lot 8 5,100,000.00$                 
5 Crystal Lam Designs Lot 9 360,000.00$                    
5 Crystal Lam Designs Lot 10 6,000,000.00$                 
5 Crystal Lam Designs Lot 11 240,000.00$                    



5 Crystal Lam Designs Lot 12 350,000.00$                    
5 Crystal Lam Designs Lot 13 22,112,000.00$               
5 Crystal Lam Designs Lot 14 1,350,000.00$                 
5 Crystal Lam Designs Lot 15 1,875,000.00$                 
5 Crystal Lam Designs Lot 16 4,725,000.00$                 
5 Crystal Lam Designs Lot 17 1,305,000.00$                 
5 Crystal Lam Designs Lot 18 2,975,000.00$                 
5 Crystal Lam Designs Lot 19 4,620,000.00$                 
5 Crystal Lam Designs Lot 20 5,000,000.00$                 
5 Crystal Lam Designs Lot 21 9,450,000.00$                 
5 Crystal Lam Designs Lot 22 400,000.00$                    
5 Crystal Lam Designs Lot 23 1,620,000.00$                 

6 Nationwide Imports Lot 1 1,688,700.00$                 1,738,359$               Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
6 Nationwide Imports Lot 2 5,683,000.00$                 
6 Nationwide Imports Lot 3 1,174,320.00$                 
6 Nationwide Imports Lot 4 63,150.00$                      
6 Nationwide Imports Lot 5 135,300.00$                    
6 Nationwide Imports Lot 6 3,735,400.00$                 
6 Nationwide Imports Lot 7 6,091,904.00$                 
6 Nationwide Imports Lot 8 5,511,120.00$                 
6 Nationwide Imports Lot 9 19,800.00$                      
6 Nationwide Imports Lot 10 3,944,500.00$                 
6 Nationwide Imports Lot 11 137,600.00$                    
6 Nationwide Imports Lot 12 94,800.00$                      
6 Nationwide Imports Lot 13 1,143,200.00$                 
6 Nationwide Imports Lot 14 422,700.00$                    
6 Nationwide Imports Lot 15 1,090,050.00$                 
6 Nationwide Imports Lot 16 3,030,650.00$                 
6 Nationwide Imports Lot 17 2,632,330.00$                 
6 Nationwide Imports Lot 18 3,697,687.00$                 
6 Nationwide Imports Lot 19 7,863,900.00$                 
6 Nationwide Imports Lot 20 6,610,000.00$                 
6 Nationwide Imports Lot 21 29,406,600.00$               
6 Nationwide Imports Lot 22 61,340.00$                      
6 Nationwide Imports Lot 23 2,679,885.00$                 



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy

Flash 
drive

1 New Amazon Business Consultant Inc L2  $                  73,695,938.00  $          2,410,835.00 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 0

1 New Amazon Business Consultant Inc L3 6,803,748.00$                     

2 Groupon Trading and General Contracting L1 2,043,200.00$                     48,000.00$               Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 1
2 Groupon Trading and General Contracting L2 45,609,500.00$                   925,000.00$             
2 Groupon Trading and General Contracting L3 4,613,000.00$                     98,000.00$               

3 Mec Enterprises L1 2,248,000.00$                     44,960.00$               Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
3 Mec Enterprises L2 25,038,620.00$                   500,772.00$             

4 Resconex Investment and Management Inc L1 3,113,000.00$                     100,000.00$             Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

Date of Tender Opening: 18th December 2025

File Number: National Data Management Authority (616/2025/02) - Procurement of Batteries and Materials for the NDMA Lots 1-3



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy

Flash 
drive

1 Holistic Contracting & Procurement Inc.  $                  40,463,400.00  $             809,268.00 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

2 DG Enterprise 35,776,500.00$                   900,000.00$             Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
3 Seenarine's Construction & Landscaping Services 37,051,500.00$                   900,000.00$             Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
4 Caribeean Construction, Consultancy and International Supplies Inc 62,398,500.00$                   1,247,970.00$          Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
5 M.B.N Group of Companies Inc. 20,888,580.00$                   416,000.00$             Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
6 ECS Construction and General Supplies 23,267,763.00$                   445,355.00$             Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
7 Guybuild Construction & Logistics Services 26,673,000.00$                   533,460.00$             Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
8 MB Enterprise 74,235,600.00$                   1,484,712.00$          Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
9 Metal & Fabrication Ink 22,000,000.00$                   480,000.00$             Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
10 D.Chowkai & Sons Construction 36,281,400.00$                   725,628.00$             Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

Engineer Estimate 19,170,900.00$                   

Date of Tender Opening: 18th December 2025

File Number: Ministry of Home Affairs (905/2025/51) - Rehabilitation and Furnishing of Leonora Fire Station 



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 
Form of 
Tender 
signed 

 
Hard 
Copy 

Flash 
drive

1 Meighoo Contracting Services  $      308,752,290.00  No Bid Securty 
Seen ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

2 Seenarine's Constrcution and Landscaping 
Services  $      159,955,940.00  $    4,000,000.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

3 Vishal's Contracting Co  $      170,787,855.00  $    3,415,757.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
4 Birdman Contracting Services  $      170,333,415.00  $    3,406,668.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
5 AYN Construction & General Services  $      164,940,479.00  $    3,500,000.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
6 Metal & Fabrication Ink  $      149,000,000.00  $    3,300,000.00 NAFICO ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

7 Trevor & Son General Construction Services  $      183,580,530.00  $    3,671,611.00 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

8 Icon Construction and Maintenance Services  $      172,127,970.00  $    3,442,559.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

9 Yhadram and Sons Construction Establishment  $      171,497,970.00  $    3,429,959.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

10 S.A.H Construction  $      170,115,540.00  $    3,406,668.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
11 Holistic Contracting & Procurement Inc  $      283,149,615.00  $    5,662,992.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
12 D. Chowkai & Sons Construction  $      271,638,360.00  $    5,432,767.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
13 DG Enterprise  $      158,729,802.00  $    4,000,000.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
14 Dundas Construction Inc  $      199,801,182.00  $    4,000,000.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

15 Kawal Ramdeen General Construction & Office 
Furnishing  $      150,240,972.00  $       300,482.00 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

16 M.B.N Group of Companies Inc  $      121,113,645.00  $    2,422,000.00 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
17 Westbrook Caribbean Inc  $      146,219,254.00  $    3,200,000.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

Date of Tender Opening:18th December 2025

File Number: Ministry of Home Affairs (906/2025/51) - Construction of Appliance Bay & Rehabilitation of Workshop at New Amsterdam Fire Station



18 Structural Core Construction  $      172,652,970.00  $    3,453,059.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
19 GD's Construction and Supplies  $      153,189,603.00  $    3,200,000.00 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 
Form of 
Tender 
signed 

 
Hard 
Copy 

Flash 
drive

1 Ayn Construction & General Services lot 1  $              17,970,000.00  $         2,500,000.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
1 Ayn Construction & General Services lot 2  $                8,600,000.00 
1 Ayn Construction & General Services lot 3  $              17,970,000.00 
1 Ayn Construction & General Services lot 4  $                8,600,000.00 
1 Ayn Construction & General Services lot 5  $              17,970,000.00 
1 Ayn Construction & General Services lot 6  $              17,970,000.00 

2 M.E.P Engineering Services Inc lot 1  $                9,397,296.00  $         1,002,016.00 Demerara Fire & 
General ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

2 M.E.P Engineering Services Inc lot 2  $                6,255,798.00 
2 M.E.P Engineering Services Inc lot 3  $                9,397,296.00 
2 M.E.P Engineering Services Inc lot 4  $                6,255,798.00 
2 M.E.P Engineering Services Inc lot 5  $                9,397,296.00 
2 M.E.P Engineering Services Inc lot 6  $                9,397,296.00 

Date of Tender Opening:18th December 2025

File Number: Ministry of Home Affairs (907/2025/51) - Procurement and Installation of an Automatic Airflow System Lots 1-6



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 
Form of 
Tender 
signed 

 
Hard 
Copy 

Flash 
drive

1 R K's Guyana Security Services  $            263,492,588.00  $         3,000,000.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
2 Norek Safety and Security  $         2,364,556,245.00  $       23,645,562.00 Assura ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
3 Maximatic Security Services  $            378,543,111.00  $         3,785,431.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
4 Castle Security Services Inc  $            237,082,060.00  $         2,370,820.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
5 Hoosein's Security Services Inc  $            242,206,862.00  $         2,422,069.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
6 Nel Global Security Company Inc  $            230,834,448.00  $         2,308,344.00 Assura ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
7 Amalgamated Security Services (Guyana) Inc  $            247,662,720.00  $         2,476,627.00 Assura ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
8 Strategic Action Security Limited  $            241,870,608.00  $         2,418,706.00 NAFICO ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

Date of Tender Opening:18th December 2025

File Number: Guyana Elections Commission (393/2025/11) - Provision of Security Service for January 2026 to December 2026



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 
Form of 
Tender 
signed 

 
Hard 
Copy 

Flash 
drive

1 Clean Products & Services Lot 1  $                   630,000.00 ✔ ✔ ✔

2 Terminex Pest Control Lot 1  $                1,026,000.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

2 Terminex Pest Control Lot 2  $                1,427,280.00 

3 Pest Ex Environmental Solutions Lot 1  $                1,296,000.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

3 Pest Ex Environmental Solutions Lot 2  $                   936,082.00 

4 Western Pest Control Lot 1  $                1,119,024.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

4 Western Pest Control Lot 2  $                1,212,960.00 

5 Service Pros Pest Control lot 1  $                   650,000.00 ✔ ✔ ✔

5 Service Pros Pest Control lot 2  $                   852,000.00 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page Completed 
and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page Completed 
and Signed 

Date of Tender Opening:18th December 2025

File Number: Guyana Elections Commission (395/2025/11) - Provision of Services: Lot 1-Sanitary Disposal Service Lot 2-Pest Control Service

Bid Secure and Decliration Page Completed 
and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page Completed 
and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page Completed 
and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page Completed 
and Signed 



6 Sam Cleaners & Washroom Hygiene Services Lot 1  $                1,545,000.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
Bid Secure and Decliration Page Completed 

and Signed 



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 
Form of 
Tender 
signed 

 
Hard 
Copy 

Flash 
drive

1 Sandip Waste Management Solutions Inc. (Monthly)  $                1,435,000.00  $            344,400.00 Premier Receipt Receipt ✔ 2
1 Sandip Waste Management Solutions Inc. (Yearly)  $              17,220,000.00 

2 Puran Bros. Disposal Inc.  $              21,012,000.00  $            462,264.00 Asauria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

3 Cevons Waste Management Incorporated  $              34,971,552.00  $            700,000.00 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

Date of Tender Opening:18th December 2025

File Number: Guyana  Power & Light Inc. (662/2025/02) - Supply of Waste Disposal Bins and Provision of Disposal Services for Year 2026 (12 Months)



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 
Form of 
Tender 
signed 

 
Hard 
Copy 

Flash 
drive

1 Amalgamated Security Services (Guyana) Inc,  $              46,137,168.00  $            461,372.00 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
2 Nel Global Security Company Inc.  $              43,879,320.00  $            438,793.00 Asauria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
3 Hoosein's Security Services Inc.  $              49,125,564.00  $            481,160.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

Date of Tender Opening:18th December 2025

File Number: Nationl Data Management Authority (653/2025/02) - Procurement of Private Security Services for the NDMA



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 
Form of 
Tender 
signed 

 
Hard 
Copy 

Flash 
drive

1 Diversity Investments Inc  $              36,902,859.00  $            738,057.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
2 M. Ali Contracting & Engineering Services  $              32,677,890.00  $            653,558.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
3 FNS Investments  $              36,971,949.00  $            739,439.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
4 Kaiveri Procurement Logistics and Investments Inc  $              31,919,160.00  $            638,383.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
5 Primo General Building & Contracting Works  $              32,051,554.00  $            641,031.00 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
6 Innovative Development Solution Guyana (IDSGY)  $              34,040,000.00  $            740,000.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
7 Ceraturium  $              31,288,425.00  $            640,000.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
8 Emeralds General Contracting & Distributors  $              36,215,802.00  $            800,000.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
9 D&S Construction  $              37,128,000.00  $            610,000.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

10 Guybuild Construction & Logistics Services  $              36,933,645.00  $            738,673.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
11 JD's Construction Company  $              31,823,956.00  $            740,000.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
12 M.B.N Group of Companies Inc  $              34,800,517.00  $            740,000.00 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
13 Oneika & Son's Development  $              35,173,246.00  $            740,000.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
14 The Acacia Group  $              36,336,405.00  $            740,000.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
15 Mohamed Rafi Yusoof Construction  $              39,737,827.00  $            794,757.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
16 Randolph Taylor Construction  $              35,072,226.00  $            701,445.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
17 Dicon Construction & Surveying Services  $              31,332,000.00  $            740,000.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
18 Allicock's Construction and Supplies  $              34,606,320.00  $            692,126.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
19 Westbrook Caribbean Inc  $              29,668,747.00  $            720,000.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
20 Icon Construction and Maintenace Service  $              31,780,035.00  $            635,601.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
21 IMS Construction and Logistics Services  $              37,732,170.00  $            760,000.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
22 Chenoa's Construction & Engineering Enterprise  $              34,387,069.00  $         1,198,000.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
23 A&K Construction and Maintenance Services  $              37,254,840.00  $            745,097.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
24 A. Anderson & Son General Construction and Supplies  $              28,950,660.00  $            740,000.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
25 Dalton's Construction  $              32,915,988.00  $            658,320.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

Date of Tender Opening:18th December 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education (1002/2025/40) - Rehabilitation of East Ruimmveldt Secondary School



26 Z&H Investment Inc  $              36,000,542.00  $            720,000.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

27 Sovereignty Investments Construction Services (SICS 
Builders)  $              35,420,700.00  $            398,000.00 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

28 T-Square Innovative Solutions and Investment Group Inc  $              34,500,900.00  $            740,000.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

29 I. Khan Contracting Service  $              35,945,994.00  $            718,920.00 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 1



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy

Flash 
drive

1 Olive Green Clean  $                  13,587,750.00 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

2 Diversity Investments Inc 11,291,595.00$                   ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

3 FNS Investments 12,177,795.00$                   ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

4 Land Mark Green Construction  Form of Tender Page Not 
Completed or Signed ✓ ✓ X 1

5 Westbrook Caribbean Inc. 11,233,016.00$                   ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

6 A. Anderson & Son General Construction and Supplies 10,470,800.00$                   ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

7 Icon Construction and Maintenance Services 12,030,690.00$                   ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

8 Blanco's Supplies and General Service 13,987,890.00$                   ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

9 Innovative Development Solution Guyana (IDSGY) 13,342,980.00$                   ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

10 Oneika & Son's Development 12,939,150.00$                   ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

11 Jace Enterprise 14,588,700.00$                   ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Date of Tender Opening: 18th December 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education (1003/2025/40) - Rehabilitation of Drain at Charlestown Secondary School

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page Not 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 



12 Guybuild Construction & Logistics Services 10,893,960.00$                   ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

13 Kaiveri Procurement Logistics and Investments Inc 9,755,025.00$                     ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

14 Ceraturium 11,558,400.00$                   ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

15 Allicock's Construction and Supplies 13,706,805.00$                   ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

16 Dicon Construction & Surveying Services 12,285,525.00$                   ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

17 Emeralds General Contracting & Distributors 14,195,895.00$                   ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

18 T-Square Innovative Solutions and Investment Group Inc. 16,422,840.00$                   ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

19 Dalton's Construction 11,335,800.00$                   ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

20 UK Goods& Consultancy Services 14,068,950.00$                   ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

21 Randolph Taylor Construction 9,419,865.00$                     ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

22 S.A General Services 11,685,240.00$                   ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

23 Axis Solutions 14,410,200.00$                   ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

24 Mohamed Rafi Yusoof Construction 1,481,392.00$                     ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

25 I Khan Contracting Services 14,297,850.00$                   ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page Not 
Completed and Not Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 



26 M.B.N Group of Companies Inc. 12,445,125.00$                   ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

27 Alesha Mohamed Construction 12,404,490.00$                   ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & Currency  Bid Security 

Amount & Currency 
Bid Security 

Agency GRA NIS 
Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy

Flash 
drive

1 Olive Green Clean  $                     13,134,000.00 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

2 FNS Investments 10,906,510.00$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

3 Mohamed Rafi Yusoof Construction 14,105,700.00$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

4 Sovereignty invetsments Construction Services (SCSI Builders)  $                     12,457,935.00 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

5 Dalton's Construction 10,899,420.00$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

6 A. Anderson & Son General Construction and Supplies 10,309,000.00$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

7 Swain Babb's Enterprise 12,000,000.00$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

8 MDSG General Services 8,961,330.00$                        ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

9 IMS Construction and Logistics Services 10,745,175.00$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

10 Fast Signs Guyana 7,646,700.00$                        ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

11 Randolph Taylor Construction 10,232,250.00$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

12 Ceraturium 11,044,425.00$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

13 Aleisha Mohamed Construction 11,652,480.00$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

14 M.B.N Group of Companies Inc. 12,040,560.00$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 1 zz

15 Westbrook Caribbean Inc. 9,350,040.00$                        ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page Not 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Date of Tender Opening: 18th December 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education (1004/2025/40) - Reconstruction of Back Fence at Central Secondary School

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 



16 Trevor & Son General Construction Services 11,773,125.00$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

17 Icon Construction and Maintenance Services 11,214,420.00$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

18 I Khan Contracting Service 13,838,790.00$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

19 Guybuild Construction & Logistics Services 11,676,105.00$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

20 Emeralds General Contracting & Distributors 10,147,042.00$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

21 UK Goods & Consultancy Services 14,021,175.00$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

22 Bulletwood Construction 7,836,000.00$                        ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

23 Innovative Development Solution Guyana (IDSGY) 13,056,750.00$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

24 Oneika's & Son's Development 12,702,900.00$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

25 S.A General Services 12,590,550.00$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

26 K. Primo General building & Contracting Works 13,079,010.00$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

27 Diversity Investments Inc 11,110,260.00$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

28 Rahaman's Investment 7,486,700.00$                        ✓ ✓ ✓ 1
Bid Secure and Decliration Page 

Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page 
Completed and Signed 



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 
Form of 
Tender 
signed 

 
Hard 
Copy 

Flash 
drive

1 Westbrook Caribbean Inc  $              62,238,550.00  $         1,200,000.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
2 Icon Construction and Maintenance Servicex  $              54,083,505.00  $         1,081,670.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
3 R. Persid Construction  $              50,274,472.00  $         1,198,000.00 Nafico ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

4 Soverignty Investments Construction Services (SICS 
Builders)  $              55,911,145.00  $         1,298,000.00 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

5 Mohamed Rafi Yusoof Construction  $              58,393,072.00  $         1,167,861.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
6 A&K Construction and Maintenance Services  $              57,576,067.00  $         1,151,521.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
7 S&E Persaud Construction Services  $              54,919,620.00  $         1,098,392.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
8 The ACACIA Group  $              52,585,417.00  $         1,198,000.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
9 K&S General Contractors Inc  $              51,266,850.00  $            820,000.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

10 Fast Signs Guyana  $              52,532,970.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
11 Z&H Investment Inc  $              51,368,205.00  $         1,120,000.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
12 Rishma and Sisters Enterprise  $              53,110,983.00  $         1,062,220.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
13 A. Anderson & Son General Construction and Supplies  $              47,321,500.00  $         1,198,000.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
14 K. Primo General Building & Contracting Works  $              52,052,017.00  $         1,041,040.00 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
15 Allicock's Construction and Supplies  $              53,570,895.00  $         1,071,417.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
16 I. Khan Contracting Service  $              55,786,920.00  $         1,115,738.00 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
17 Innovative Development Solution Guyana (IDSGY)  $              55,000,000.00  $         1,198,000.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
18 Ceraturium  $              45,589,425.00  $            920,000.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
19 Guybuild Construction & Logistcis Services  $              56,324,835.00  $         1,126,497.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
20 Chenoa's Construction & Engineering Enterprise  $              53,636,520.00  $            740,000.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
21 Bulletwood Construction  $              55,444,200.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
22 Kaiveri Procurement Logistics and Investments Inc  $              55,798,102.00  $         1,115,962.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
23 Diversity Investments Inc  $              52,596,337.00  $         1,051,927.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
24 FNS Investments  $              52,292,887.00  $         1,045,858.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

Date of Tender Opening: 18th December 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education1005/2025/40 - General Rehabilitation at Cummings Lodge Secondary School

 No Bid Security Seen 

 No Bid Security Seen 



25 Emeralds General Contracting & Distributors  $              55,789,545.00  $         1,300,000.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
26 VMR Investment  $              56,984,760.00  $         1,139,696.00 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
27 M. Ali Contracting & Engineering Services  $              50,692,162.00  $         1,013,843.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
28 Rahaman's Investment  $              54,888,750.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 1 No Bid Security Seen 



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy

Flash 
drive

1 M Ali Contracting & Engineering Services  $                257,714,090.00  $         3,865,561.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

2 Icon Construction and Maintenance Services 252,305,890.00$                 $         3,784,588.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

3 Guybuild Construction & logistics Services 266,076,290.00$                 $         3,993,000.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

4 D. Chowkai & Sons Construction  $                318,439,290.00  $         4,776,589.00 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

5 Westbrook Caribbean Inc. 238,983,290.00$                 $         4,050,000.00 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

6 Mohamed Rafi Yusoof Construction 320,650,360.00$                 $         4,809,755.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

7 Kbee Enterprise Inc. 257,368,500.00$                 $             386,528.00 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

8 Holistic Contracting & Procurement Inc 324,844,290.00$                 $         4,872,664.00 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

9 The Acacia Group 232,674,710.00$                 $         3,993,000.00 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

10 A&K Construction and Maintenance Services 312,545,940.00$                 $         3,688,189.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

11 VMR Investment 255,737,790.00$                 $         3,393,000.00 Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

12 K&S General Contractors Inc 231,356,000.00$                 $         3,465,000.00 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

13 Vishal's Contracting Company 279,494,140.00$                 $         4,192,412.00 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

14 JD's Construction Company 227,993,690.00$                 $         3,993,000.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 1 zz

Date of Tender Opening: 18th December 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education (1006/2025/40) - Extension of St. Mary's Primary School



15 Emeralds General Contracting & Distributors 262,986,840.00$                 $         3,944,803.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

16 Sovereignty invetsments Construction Services 265,232,790.00$                 $         3,944,803.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

17 A. Anderson & Son General Construction and Supplies 228,402,400.00$                 $         4,068,000.00 Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

18 Compton Bess Construction Enterprises 264,114,637.00$                 $             443,325.00 Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

19 Ceraturium 249,400,390.00$                 $         3,990,000.00 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

20 Z&H Investment Inc. 265,352,150.00$                 $         3,990,000.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

21 Rishma and Sisters Enterprise 254,818,890.00$                 $         3,822,283.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

22 Digital Design Construction Logistics and Supplies 225,893,890.00$                 $         3,761,297.00 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 
Form of 
Tender 
signed 

 
Hard 
Copy 

Flash 
drive

1 M. Ali Contracting & Engineering Services  $              10,529,967.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

2 A. Anderson & Son General Construction and Supplies  $              10,329,280.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

3 Blanco's Supplies and General Service  $              12,720,802.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

4 Westbrook Caribbean Inc  $              10,115,574.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

5 Rahaman's Investment  $              13,385,505.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

6 Innovative Development Solution Guyana (IDSGY)  $              12,915,787.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

7 Emeralds General Contracting & Distributors  $              11,902,359.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

8 K. Primo General Building & Contracting Works  $              13,056,372.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

9 S.A General Services  $              12,754,208.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

Bid Secure and Decliration Page Completed 
and Signed 

Date of Tender Opening:18th December 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education (1007/2025/40) - Construction of Sanitary Block at Annandale Secondary School

Bid Secure and Decliration Page Completed 
and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page Completed 
and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page Completed 
and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page Completed 
and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page Completed 
and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page Completed 
and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page Completed 
and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page Completed 
and Signed 



10 M.B.N Group of Companies Inc  $              12,069,435.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

11 Aleisha Mohamed Construction  $              11,536,518.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

12 Dalton's Construction  $              11,766,825.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

13 I. Khan Contracting Service  $              13,969,242.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

14 Guybuild Construction & Logistics Services  $              11,624,539.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

15 Trevor & Son General Construction Services  $              12,395,775.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

16 Mohamed Rafi Yusoof Construction  $              14,832,720.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

17 Sovereignty Investments Construction Services (SICS 
Builders)  $              12,689,302.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

18 Diversity Investments Inc  $              11,036,928.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

19 FNS Investments  $              11,409,184.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

20 Randolph Taylor Construction  $              10,394,958.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

21 Uk Goods & Consultancy Services  $              14,068,372.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

22 T-Square Innovative Solutions and Investment Group Inc  $              16,507,946.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

Bid Secure and Decliration Page Completed 
and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page Completed 
and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page Completed 
and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page Completed 
and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page Completed 
and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page Completed 
and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page Completed 
and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page Completed 
and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page Completed 
and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page Completed 
and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page Completed 
and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page Completed 
and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page Completed 
and Signed 



23 Bulletwood Construction  $              12,806,640.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

24 Ceraturium  $              11,446,313.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

25 Fast Signs guyana  $              12,438,594.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

26 Icon Construction and Maintenance Services  $              11,694,375.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

Bid Secure and Decliration Page Completed 
and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page Completed 
and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page Completed 
and Signed 

Bid Secure and Decliration Page Completed 
and Signed 
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