
Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
 

Copy

Flash 
drive

1
IT transport Limited UK in SRKN'gineering and 
Associates  (Technical Score 77.91 Points)  US$    224,319.75 ✓ 2 1

2 CB and Associates Inc (72.13 Points) Including all 
Direct Local Taxes 

US$    822,225 ✓ 2 1

2 CB and Associates Inc (72.13 Points) Including all 
Indirect Local Taxes 

US$     100,975

Date of Tender Opening: December 30 2025

File Number: Ministry of Public Works Financial (158/2025/31) - Consulting Services for Strenghtening of Axle Load Control - LMH



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
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Hard 
 

Copy

Flash 
drive

1 A&P Logistics and Transportation Service L2  $                 37,865,100.00  $            757,302.00 Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 1 0

2 Nextgen Precision Builders L1 32,850,000.00$                 1,248,300.00$         Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 1 0
2 Nextgen Precision Builders L2 21,900,000.00$                 

3 Sam Transportation Service L1 30,208,860.00$                 600,000.00$            Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 2 0
3 Sam Transportation Service L2 14,147,400.00$                 300,000.00$            

4 Arrowhead General Contracting L2 12,567,000.00$                 251,340.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2 0

Date of Tender Opening: December 30 2025

File Number: Guyana Civil Aviation Authority (186/2025/31) - Supply of Transportation Services for Air Navigation Service Staff 
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No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
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signed 
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Copy
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drive

1 AR Copy Centre and Contracting Service  $                 37,529,000.00  $            750,580.00 Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

2 Naseeb Ally Poultry Establishment  $                 37,640,080.00  $            752,913.00 Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
3 WGS Construction 22,933,570.00$                 458,671.00$            Premier ✓ Receipt ✓ 2
4 King of Hardware 31,399,170.00$                 627,983.00$            Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
5 Trinity Building Services 45,624,304.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1 2
6 VR Enterprise 22,608,080.00$                 452,162.00$            Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

7 Sovereignty Investments Construction Services (SICS 
Builders)

33,701,437.00$                 720,000.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

8 Sukram Contracting 34,715,560.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
9 D&D Contracting 38,073,420.00$                 694,311.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
10 G&B Sugrim Enterprise 36,134,670.00$                 660,000.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
11 Holictic Contracting and Procurement Inc. 41,895,150.00$                 1,605,587.00$         Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
12 Delon J Bagott Construction ad Drainage Development 32,158,170.00$                 643,164.00$            Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
13 Major Construction and Supplier 22,361,405.00$                 300,000.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
14 Westbrook Caribbean Inc 30,924,718.00$                 900,000.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
15 Yhadram & Sons Construction Establishment 22,844,910.00$                 456,898.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
16 Chandradat's Construction 42,471,260.00$                 849,425.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
17 J&D Swift Contracting 36,813,920.00$                 736,278.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
18 Gopie Investment Inc. 29,876,220.00$                 597,525.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
19 D. Chowkai and Son Construction 38,817,900.00$                 776,358.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
20 AL Ghafa Engineering Inc. 35,262,524.00$                 705,252.00$            Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
21 FN Electrical and General Contracting 34,323,080.00$                 686,462.00$            Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
22 Sharda Narine Construction 30,629,170.00$                 612,583.00$            Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
23 Jalil and Daughters Business Establishment 26,980,112.00$                 539,602.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
24 Nitesh Contracting 40,720,110.00$                 919,238.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
25 Destiny Builders Contracting 32,948,234.00$                 658,964.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

Date of Tender Opening: December 30 2025

File Number: Guyana Revenue Authority (241/2025/03) - Construction of Parking Lot Integrated Regional Tax Office, Corriverton

No Bid Security Seen

No Bid Security Seen



26 Icon Construction and Maintenance Services 22,476,080.00$                 449,523.00$            Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
27 DG Enterprise 43,433,940.00$                 2,000,000.00$         Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

28 Caribbean Construction Consultancy and 
International Suppliers Inc,

47,745,594.00$                 954,912.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

29 Dundas Construction Inc. 44,980,045.00$                 2,000,000.00$         Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
30 Ramsarran Business Enterprise 22,946,550.00$                 458,931.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

✓ ✓ ✓ 2
Engineer Estimate 23,517,670.00$               
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1 DG Enterprise  $                 39,118,695.00  $         2,000,000.00 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

2 Dundas Construction Inc.  $                 44,313,045.00  $         2,000,000.00 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
3 Westbrook Caribbean Inc. 18,531,481.00$                 800,000.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
4 A2 Buildtech Construction Service 58,588,635.00$                 1,171,773.00$         Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
5 D. Chowkai and Son Construction 78,195,075.00$                 1,563,902.00$         Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
6 FN Electrical and General Contracting 38,707,830.00$                 774,157.00$            Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
7 AL Ghafa Engineering Inc. 38,939,880.00$                 778,798.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
8 Holictic Contracting and Procurement Inc. 80,279,325.00$                 837,903.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
9 Major Construction and Supplier 25,014,150.00$                 300,000.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
10 King of Hardware 21,864,780.00$                 437,296.00$            Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

Engineer Estimate 30,841,650.00$               

Date of Tender Opening: December 30 2025

File Number: Guyana Revenue Authority (242/2025/03) - Construction of Central Monitoring Room GRA - Headquarters
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No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
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Currency 
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Form of 
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1 Agrex  $                 18,664,500.00  $            279,968.00 Caricom ✓ Receipt ✓ 2

2 K. Kissoon Contracting Service  $                 18,999,725.00  $            375,000.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
3 GM Futuristic Development 19,274,230.00$                 330,000.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
4 VRP Investment 17,321,875.00$                 259,828.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
5 Expert Builders & Supplies Contractors 19,022,725.00$                 375,000.00$            Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
6 Superior Farms 17,744,500.00$                 266,167.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
7 N and N Construction Services 19,136,460.00$                 330,000.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

Engineer Estimate 18,664,500.00$               

Date of Tender Opening: December 30 2025

File Number: Guyana Water Inc (157/2025/45) -Relocation of 300mm Mains around Proposed Area of Utility Pole at Guyhoc, Georgetown, Region 4
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1 K. Kissoon Contracting Service  $                 24,890,000.00  $            375,000.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

2 Inspire Investment  $                 20,086,000.00  $            301,290.00 Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
3 Gilpin Enterprise 21,380,000.00$                 320,700.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
4 GM Futuristic Development 17,900,000.00$                 300,000.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
5 Expert Builders & Supplies Contractors 24,840,000.00$                 375,000.00$            Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
6 VRP Investment 20,300,000.00$                 304,500.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
7 A.M.I.C General Contracting Services 17,895,000.00$                 300,000.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
8 Superior Farms 18,256,000.00$                 273,840.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

Engineer Estimate 17,340,000.00$               

Date of Tender Opening: December 30 2025

File Number: Guyana Water Inc (161/2025/45) -Rehabilitation Works for Friendship Water Treatment Plant



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
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Hard 
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1 Shandong Hi-Speed Dejian Group Ltd  $          10,784,040,000.00  $     132,000,000.00 Premier ✓ 2 1

2 Jiangsu Gaia Environmental Technology Co. Ltd  $            3,476,624,420.00  $     132,000,000.00 Assuria ✓ 2 1
3 Hi-Pro Ecologicos SA de CV 4,492,069,000.00$            132,000,000.00$     Premier ✓ 2 2

4 Sinohydro 12 - Sinohydro Joint Venture (VAT 
Exclusive and Inclusive of Provsional Sums)

US$      44,302,689.47 132,000,000.00$     Assuria ✓ 2 1

4 Sinohydro 12 - Sinohydro Joint Venture (VAT) US$        6,002,804.18

5

JV with China Railway International Group Co. Ltd 
and China Tiegong Investment & Construction Group 
Co. Ltd and North China Municipal Engineering 
Design & Research Institute Co., Lrd

7,276,320,784.47$            132,000,000.00$     

Agricultural 
Bank of China 
Limited Beijing 

Branch

✓ 2 1

Engineer Estimate 6,142,500,000.00$          

Date of Tender Opening: December 30 2025

File Number: Guyana Water Inc (162/2025/45) - Design Supply Instillation and Commissioning at Diamond Water Treatment Plant 
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No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 
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Copy
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1 Castle Security Servives Inc L1  $                 46,651,086.00  $         4,459,193.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

1 Castle Security Servives Inc L2  $               145,070,015.00 
1 Castle Security Servives Inc L3 35,922,097.00$                 
1 Castle Security Servives Inc L4 103,361,433.00$               
1 Castle Security Servives Inc L5 114,914,726.00$               

2 Centaur Security Service Inc L1 96,016,381.00$                 4,132,880.00$         Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
2 Centaur Security Service Inc L2 242,128,266.00$               
2 Centaur Security Service Inc L3 75,143,255.00$                 

3 Amalgamated Security Services (Guyana) Inc L1 49,765,560.00$                 4,738,547.00$         Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
3 Amalgamated Security Services (Guyana) Inc L2 151,460,400.00$               
3 Amalgamated Security Services (Guyana) Inc L3 38,946,960.00$                 
3 Amalgamated Security Services (Guyana) Inc L4 112,513,440.00$               
3 Amalgamated Security Services (Guyana) Inc L5 121,168,320.00$               

4 Strategic Action Security Limited L1 43,176,579.00$                 8,803,042.00$         Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
4 Strategic Action Security Limited L2 131,406,979.00$               
4 Strategic Action Security Limited L3 33,978,030.00$                 
4 Strategic Action Security Limited L4 98,701,200.00$                 
4 Strategic Action Security Limited L5 105,834,736.00$               

5 Hopkinson Mining Security Services Inc. L1 72,335,000.00$                 7,301,950.00$         Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
5 Hopkinson Mining Security Services Inc. L2 220,150,000.00$               
5 Hopkinson Mining Security Services Inc. L3 56,600,000.00$                 

Date of Tender Opening: December 30 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education (1072/2025/40) - Procurement of Security Service - Twenty Three Location 2026 Lots 1-5



5 Hopkinson Mining Security Services Inc. L4 192,400,000.00$               
5 Hopkinson Mining Security Services Inc. L5 188,700,000.00$               

6 Norek Safety and Security L1 59,629,729.00$                 4,939,183.00$         Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
6 Norek Safety and Security L2 180,049,867.00$               
6 Norek Safety and Security L3 46,666,738.00$                 
6 Norek Safety and Security L4 204,815,141.00$               
6 Norek Safety and Security L5 141,908,714.00$               

7 Home Safe Security & Domestic Service L1 92,163,300.00$                 8,775,549.00$         Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
7 Home Safe Security & Domestic Service L2 280,497,000.00$               
7 Home Safe Security & Domestic Service L3 72,127,800.00$                 
7 Home Safe Security & Domestic Service L4 208,369,200.00$               
7 Home Safe Security & Domestic Service L5 224,397,600.00$               

8 Atlas Security Services Inc. L1 39,123,386.00$                 391,234.00$            Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
8 Atlas Security Services Inc. L2 119,071,176.00$               1,190,712.00$         
8 Atlas Security Services Inc. L3 30,618,302.00$                 306,183.00$            
8 Atlas Security Services Inc. L4 93,555,924.00$                 935,559.00$            
8 Atlas Security Services Inc. L5 90,153,890.00$                 901,539.00$            

9 Sheriff Security Inc L1 44,731,320.00$                 4,322,971.00$         Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
9 Sheriff Security Inc L2 136,138,800.00$               
9 Sheriff Security Inc L3 35,007,120.00$                 
9 Sheriff Security Inc L4 169,966,200.00$               
9 Sheriff Security Inc L5 103,076,520.00$               

10 Queensway Security Service Inc. L1 65,460,852.00$                 6,629,000.00$         Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
10 Queensway Security Service Inc. L2 199,228,680.00$               
10 Queensway Security Service Inc. L3 51,230,232.00$                 
10 Queensway Security Service Inc. L4 167,039,184.00$               
10 Queensway Security Service Inc. L5 179,888,352.00$               
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1 Strategic Action Security Limited L1  $               336,318,349.00  $         4,130,976.00 Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

1 Strategic Action Security Limited L2  $                 82,723,817.00 
1 Strategic Action Security Limited L3 260,310,920.00$               
1 Strategic Action Security Limited L4 200,951,101.00$               

2 Atlas Security Services Inc. L1 302,780,900.00$               3,027,810.00$         Nafico X ✓ ✓ 2
2 Atlas Security Services Inc. L2 74,844,739.00$                 748,447.00$            
2 Atlas Security Services Inc. L3 236,441,335.00$               2,364,413.00$         
2 Atlas Security Services Inc. L4 183,709,814.00$               1,837,098.00$         

3 Norek Safety and Security L1 456,297,084.00$               10,508,778.00$       Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
3 Norek Safety and Security L2 116,666,870.00$               
3 Norek Safety and Security L3 345,036,194.00$               
3 Norek Safety and Security L4 280,000,489.00$               

4 Amalgamated Security Services (Guyana) Inc L1 385,142,160.00$               10,147,847.00$       Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
4 Amalgamated Security Services (Guyana) Inc L2 95,203,680.00$                 
4 Amalgamated Security Services (Guyana) Inc L3 300,757,080.00$               
4 Amalgamated Security Services (Guyana) Inc L4 233,681,760.00$               

5 R K's Guyana Security L1 407,191,376.00$               11,500,000.00$       Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
5 R K's Guyana Security L2 100,654,048.00$               
5 R K's Guyana Security L3 317,975,288.00$               
5 R K's Guyana Security L4 247,059,936.00$               

Date of Tender Opening: December 30 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education (1071/2025/40) - Procurement of Security Service - Schools in Georgetown Lot 1-4



6 Castle Security Services Inc. L1 362,803,549.00$               9,430,836.00$         Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
6 Castle Security Services Inc. L2 68,390,150.00$                 
6 Castle Security Services Inc. L3 288,067,603.00$               
6 Castle Security Services Inc. L4 223,822,310.00$               

7 Centaur Security Service Inc. L2 743,083,299.00$               5,598,100.00$         Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
7 Centaur Security Service Inc. L3 183,683,512.00$               3,396,600.00$         
7 Centaur Security Service Inc. L4 580,272,914.00$               4,371,550.00$         
7 Centaur Security Service Inc. L5 450,859,530.00$               1,383,800.00$         

8 Home Safe Security & Domestic Service L1 713,263,800.00$               18,793,299.00$       Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
8 Home Safe Security & Domestic Service L2 176,312,400.00$               
8 Home Safe Security & Domestic Service L3 556,986,900.00$               
8 Home Safe Security & Domestic Service L4 432,776,800.00$               

9 Sheriff Security Inc. L1 346,181,520.00$               9,043,506.00$         Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
9 Sheriff Security Inc. L2 75,848,760.00$                 
9 Sheriff Security Inc. L3 272,277,600.00$               
9 Sheriff Security Inc. L4 210,042,720.00$               

10 Elite Protection Security L1 405,109,488.00$               4,051,095.00$         Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 25
10 Elite Protection Security L2 100,139,424.00$               1,001,394.00$         
10 Elite Protection Security L3 316,349,544.00$               3,163,495.00$         
10 Elite Protection Security L4 245,796,768.00$               2,457,968.00$         

11 Queensway Security Service Inc. L1 506,610,072.00$               13,349,000.00$       Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
11 Queensway Security Service Inc. L2 125,229,456.00$               
11 Queensway Security Service Inc. L3 395,611,236.00$               
11 Queensway Security Service Inc. L4 307,381,392.00$               

12 Hopkinson Mining Security Services Inc. L1 559,810,000.00$               5,598,100.00$         Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
12 Hopkinson Mining Security Services Inc. L2 138,380,000.00$               1,383,800.00$         
12 Hopkinson Mining Security Services Inc. L3 427,155,000.00$               4,371,550.00$         



12 Hopkinson Mining Security Services Inc. L4 339,660,000.00$               3,396,600.00$         
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1 Chavi Construction L1  Form of Tender Not 
Completed or Signed  438,000.00$            Assuria ✓ Receipt X 2

Chavi Construction L2 1,075,500.00$         
Chavi Construction L3 834,000.00$            
Chavi Construction L4 594,000.00$            

2 Taylor's Construction and Transport L1 19,491,100.00$                 X ✓ ✓ 2
Taylor's Construction and Transport L2 50,794,100.00$                 
Taylor's Construction and Transport L3 34,855,350.00$                 
Taylor's Construction and Transport L4 29,855,200.00$                 

3 Ali's Construction and Maintenance Services L1 30,043,900.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1
Ali's Construction and Maintenance Services L2 76,748,000.00$                 
Ali's Construction and Maintenance Services L3 59,804,000.00$                 
Ali's Construction and Maintenance Services L4 38,619,300.00$                 

4 M&M and Daughters Grocery L1 25,333,600.00$                 2,654,451.00$         Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 1 2
M&M and Daughters Grocery L2 61,053,100.00$                 
M&M and Daughters Grocery L3 45,611,350.00$                 
M&M and Daughters Grocery L4 32,328,500.00$                 

No Bid security Seen

Date of Tender Opening: December 30 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education (1073/2025/40) - Construction of Orella Secondary School Lots 1-4

No Bid security Seen
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