
Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy

Flash 
drive

1 Chemical King  $                       25,130,000  $                  502,600 Demerara Bank ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

Date of Tender Opening: December 9th 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (531/2025/21) - Supply and Delivery of Storm Flocoumafen



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
 

Copy

Flash 
drive

1 Chemical King  $                        8,370,000  $                 167,400 Demerara Bank ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

2 Agroyn  No Form of Tender Page 
Seen 191,520$                 Nafico X X X 1 2

Date of Tender Opening: December 9th 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (532/2025/21) -Supply and Delivery of Raticate Brodifacoum



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
 

Copy

Flash 
drive

1 Queensway Security Service Inc  $                      18,608,906  $                 187,000 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

2 RK's Guyana Security Services  $                      14,290,730 200,000$                 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

3 Hoosein Security Services Inc, 13,635,130$                      272,703$                 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

4 Nel Global Security Company Inc. 12,086,400$                      120,864$                 Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

5 Isecure Security Services Inc 10,267,200$                      102,672$                 Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

6 Strategic Action Security Limited 13,227,192$                      132,271$                 Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

7 Centry 21 Security 5,820,839$                        134,803$                 Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

8 Amalagamated Security Services Guyana Inc 13,533,898$                      135,339$                 Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

9 Sleep Inn Hotel Security 76,035,600$                      760,356$                 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

10 Elite Protection Services Inc. 14,727,888$                      147,279$                 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

11 Castle Security Services Inc. 13,380,134$                      133,801$                 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

Date of Tender Opening: December 9th 2025

File Number: Telecommunications Agency (601/2025/02) - Procurement of Security Services for January- December 2026



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
 

Copy

Flash 
drive

1 Hi-Pro Ecologicos SA De CV (Mexico)  $            2,599,000,069.00  $       20,000,000.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2 2

2 D&R Construction and Machinery Rental  $            2,953,989,213.00 20,000,000.00$       Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 1 2

3
Prokaizec Water Company Inc. JV Zico Group of 
Services Inc and Protecnosrl and Kaizen Group 
Ingenieria S.A.S

7,020,650,900.67$            20,000,000.00$       Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2 2

4 Singh and Son Construction  No Form of Tender Page 
Seen 20,000,000.00$       Caricom ✓ ✓ X 2 2

Engineer Estimate 2,827,500,000.00$          

Date of Tender Opening: December 9th 2025

File Number: Guyana Water Inc (153/2025/45) - Design, Supply, Installation & Commissioning of Water Treatment Facilities at Mabaruma, Region No 1



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
 

Copy

Flash 
drive

1 Sigma Engineers Limited Inc.  $                 2,439,894,525  $            10,000,000 Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

2 Hi-Pro Ecologicos SA De CV (Mexico)  $                 2,399,419,069 10,000,000$            Premier ✓ 2 2

Engineer Estimate 2,986,250,000$               

Date of Tender Opening: December 9th 2025

File Number: Guyana Water Inc (154/2025/45) - Shelterbelt Surface Water Treatment Plant Rehabilitation and Expansion Georgetown, Region No 4



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
 

Copy

Flash 
drive

J&R Construction and General Services Inc Lot 2  $                      51,890,000  $              1,061,200 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

J&R Construction and General Services Inc Lot 3  $                      22,550,000 480,000$                 Premier

D&R Construction and Machinery Rental Lot 1 20,000,000$                      410,000$                 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

D&R Construction and Machinery Rental Lot 2 52,540,000$                      1,061,200$              Caricom

D&R Construction and Machinery Rental Lot 3 23,100,000$                      480,000$                 Caricom

C.A.J Contracting Services Lot 2 52,120,000$                      1,061,200$              Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

C.A.J Contracting Services Lot 3 21,900,000$                      480,000$                 Caricom

C.A.J Contracting Services Lot 10 410,000$                 Caricom

4 AH Supplies & Contracting Services Inc Lot 1 19,550,000$                      410,000$                 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

Date of Tender Opening: December 9th 2025

File Number: National Drainage & Irrigation Authority (517/2025/21) - Transportation of Fuel and Lubricants for the National Drainage and Irrigation Authority 
for Regions No 3,4 and 5 for 2026 Lots 1-3

1

2

3



AH Supplies & Contracting Services Inc Lot 2 52,860,000$                      1,061,200$              Caricom

AH Supplies & Contracting Services Inc Lot 3 22,800,000$                      480,000$                 Caricom

5 Engels Contracting & Supply Services Lot 2 49,560,000$                      1,061,200$              Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

Engels Contracting & Supply Services Lot 3 22,200,000$                      480,000$                 Caricom

6 C. Jorree Farming & Contracting Services Lot 2 51,000,000$                      1,061,200$              Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

C. Jorree Farming & Contracting Services Lot 3 22,800,000$                      480,000$                 Caricom

7 Crystal Lam Designs Lot 2 48,860,000$                      732,900$                 Demerara Fire 
& General ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

Crystal Lam Designs Lot 3 20,600,000$                      309,000$                 

8 Persaud Engineering & Hydraulic Services L2 51,100,000$                      1,061,200$              Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

Persaud Engineering & Hydraulic Services L3 19,400,000$                      480,000$                 

9 Triple P Construction & General Supplies L1 17,850,000$                      357,000$                 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2



10 Greenway Distributors Inc. L2 51,560,000$                      1,031,200$              Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
Greenway Distributors Inc. L3 23,000,000$                      460,000$                 

11 Andrect Engineering & Construction L1 19,925,000$                      800,000$                 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
Andrect Engineering & Construction L3 23,400,000$                      800,000$                 

12 B. Sooklall Construction Service L1 20,400,000$                      410,000$                 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
B. Sooklall Construction Service L2 52,440,000$                      1,061,200$              
B. Sooklall Construction Service L3 23,700,000$                      480,000$                 

13 S.S. General Construction and Hardware Supplies 
Inc. L1

15,075,000$                      410,000$                 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

S.S. General Construction and Hardware Supplies 
Inc. L2

45,660,000$                      1,016,200$              

S.S. General Construction and Hardware Supplies 
Inc. L3

21,500,000$                      480,000$                 

14 VMR Investment L1 20,500,000$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
VMR Investment L2 58,230,000$                      
VMR Investment L3 23,900,000$                      

15 R&M Mining Investments Project Inc. L1 19,125,000$                      410,000$                 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
R&M Mining Investments Project Inc. L2 52,170,000$                      1,061,200$              
R&M Mining Investments Project Inc. L3 23,000,000$                      480,000$                 

16 Consol L1 19,150,000$                      410,000$                 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 1
Consol L2 52,190,000$                      1,061,200$              
Consol L3 23,400,000$                      480,000$                 

17 Prosperity Investment Inc. L1 17,745,000$                      410,000$                 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 1
Prosperity Investment Inc. L2 49,900,000$                      1,061,200$              
Prosperity Investment Inc. L3 21,200,000$                      480,000$                 

No Bid Security Seen



18 Seeram Civil Engineering and Woodworking 
Establishment L1

18,932,500$                      943,800$                 Diamond ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

Seeram Civil Engineering and Woodworking 
Establishment L2

47,190,000$                      398,000$                 

Seeram Civil Engineering and Woodworking 
Establishment L3

19,900,000$                      378,000$                 

19 KK General Construction L2 51,940,000$                      1,061,200$              Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 1
KK General Construction L3 22,600,000$                      480,000$                 



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 
Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy

Flash 
drive

Crown Road and Drainage Contractors Lot 1  $            358,317,173.00  $         5,576,207.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
Crown Road and Drainage Contractors Lot 2  $            257,033,700.00  $         4,121,600.00 Premier
Crown Road and Drainage Contractors Lot 3  $            382,959,150.00  $         6,239,512.00 Premier
Crown Road and Drainage Contractors Lot 4  $            205,728,337.00  $         3,321,462.00 Premier
Crown Road and Drainage Contractors Lot 5  $            438,980,850.00  $         7,446,140.00 Premier

2 K&P General Contractors and Services Lot 1  $              71,416,250.00 X X ✔ 2

K&P General Contractors and Services Lot 2  $              47,709,000.00 
K&P General Contractors and Services Lot 3  $            103,141,500.00 
K&P General Contractors and Services Lot 4  $              47,709,000.00 

3 Rafeek Khan Investment Company Lot 1  $            349,540,800.00  $         5,550,000.00 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

4 Gurdev Mahadeo Contracting Services Lot 1  $            345,850,722.00  $         5,187,760.00 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 4
Gurdev Mahadeo Contracting Services Lot 2  $            254,812,215.00  $         3,822,183.00 
Gurdev Mahadeo Contracting Services Lot 3  $            388,993,920.00  $         5,834,908.00 
Gurdev Mahadeo Contracting Services Lot 4  $            202,943,475.00  $         3,044,152.00 
Gurdev Mahadeo Contracting Services Lot 5  $            402,287,175.00  $         6,934,308.00 

4 Gurdev Mahadeo Contracting Services Lot 1 354,400,200$                  
Gurdev Mahadeo Contracting Services Lot 2  $            257,611,200.00 
Gurdev Mahadeo Contracting Services Lot 3  $            408,003,750.00 
Gurdev Mahadeo Contracting Services Lot 4  $            215,985,000.00 
Gurdev Mahadeo Contracting Services Lot 5  $            487,583,250.00 

5 Ah Supplies & Contracting Services Inc Lot 1  $            370,224,488.00  $         5,576,207.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
Ah Supplies & Contracting Services Inc Lot 2  $            273,568,129.00  $         4,121,600.00 

Date of Tender Opening: December 9th 2025
File Number: National Drainage & Irrigation Authority (518/2025/21) - Maintenance and Servicing to NDIA Drainage and Irrigation Pumps with in Regions No. 2,3,4,6 and 
Georgetown (January 1 to December 31,2026)

1

 No Bid Security Seen 



Ah Supplies & Contracting Services Inc Lot 3  $            414,660,078.00  $         6,239,512.00 
Ah Supplies & Contracting Services Inc Lot 4  $            220,634,652.00  $         3,321,462.00 
Ah Supplies & Contracting Services Inc Lot 5  $            495,161,530.00  $         7,446,140.00 

6 A and E Construction, Supplies and Services Lot 1  $            368,326,455.00  $         5,576,207.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
A and E Construction, Supplies and Services Lot 2  $            271,521,390.00  $         4,121,600.00 
A and E Construction, Supplies and Services Lot 3  $            414,971,550.00  $         6,239,512.00 
A and E Construction, Supplies and Services Lot 4  $            218,344,035.00  $         3,321,462.00 
A and E Construction, Supplies and Services Lot 5  $            493,326,225.00  $         7,446,140.00 

7 Ramesh's Enterprise Lot 2  $            271,201,266.00  $         4,068,019.00 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
Ramesh's Enterprise Lot 3  $            402,827,386.00  $         6,024,411.00 

8 Cedar Engineering Lot 1  $            370,110,930.00  $         5,576,207.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
Cedar Engineering Lot 2  $            269,574,690.00  $         4,121,600.00 
Cedar Engineering Lot 3  $            410,915,925.00  $         6,239,512.00 
Cedar Engineering Lot 4  $            217,695,135.00  $         3,321,462.00 
Cedar Engineering Lot 5  $            494,948,475.00  $         7,446,140.00 

9 Morris Jeffrey Enterprise Lot 1  $            367,353,105.00  $         5,576,207.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
Morris Jeffrey Enterprise Lot 2  $            273,684,390.00 4,121,600$              
Morris Jeffrey Enterprise Lot 3  $            412,267,800.00  $         6,239,512.00 
Morris Jeffrey Enterprise Lot 4  $            219,209,235.00  $         3,321,462.00 
Morris Jeffrey Enterprise Lot 5  $            495,759,600.00  $         7,446,140.00 

10 Beshaun Construction Service Lot 1  $            345,966,443.00  $         5,189,497.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

11 D. Shawn Mechanical Workshop Lot 5  $            396,290,876.00  $         7,446,140.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

12 Consol Lot 1  $            364,736,757.00  $         5,576,207.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
Consol Lot 2  $            269,824,517.00 4,121,600$              
Consol Lot 3  $            409,050,337.00  $         6,239,512.00 
Consol Lot 4  $            218,819,895.00  $         3,321,462.00 
Consol Lot 5  $            495,986,715.00  $         7,446,140.00 



13 Monarch Investments Lot 5  $            495,986,715.00  $         7,500,000.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

14 Al Ghafa Engineering Inc Lot 3  $            525,952,917.00  $         7,889,294.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

15 R & M Mining Investments Project Inc Lot 1  $            369,748,628.00  $         5,576,207.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
R & M Mining Investments Project Inc Lot 2  $            272,032,399.00 4,121,600$              
R & M Mining Investments Project Inc Lot 3  $            413,724,580.00  $         6,239,512.00 
R & M Mining Investments Project Inc Lot 4  $            219,845,157.00  $         3,321,462.00 
R & M Mining Investments Project Inc Lot 5  $            493,874,545.00  $         7,446,140.00 

16 RS Prime Construction Lot 2  $            270,189,150.00  No Bid Security 
Seen 2

17 FN Electrical & General Contracting Lot 4  $            215,516,994.00  $         3,232,755.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

18 General Engineering Supplies & Services C Inc Lot 1  $            323,842,197.00  $         5,576,207.00 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
General Engineering Supplies & Services C Inc Lot 2  $            230,212,632.00 4,121,600$              
General Engineering Supplies & Services C Inc Lot 3  $            343,636,675.00  $         6,239,512.00 
General Engineering Supplies & Services C Inc Lot 4  $            191,187,570.00  $         3,321,462.00 

19 VS Engineering and Investment Lot 1  $            350,092,365.00  $         5,244,750.00 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

20 Vijay Persaud & Sons Contracting Services Lot 1  $            300,176,814.00  $         4,502,652.00 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

21 KK General Construction Lot 2  $            264,922,077.00  $         4,121,600.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
KK General Construction Lot 3  $            394,552,830.00  $         6,239,512.00 
KK General Construction Lot 4  $            200,748,030.00  $         3,321,462.00 

22 Angel's Solutions Lot 1  $              60,146,541.00  $         1,534,746.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
Angel's Solutions Lot 2  $              49,814,436.00  $            747,216.00 
Angel's Solutions Lot 3  $            102,316,389.00  $            902,198.00 

23 KK General Construction Lot 2  $            266,987,490.00  $         4,121,600.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
KK General Construction Lot 3  $            396,361,350.00  $         6,239,512.00 
KK General Construction Lot 4  $            212,860,725.00  $         3,321,462.00 



24
Global Engineering Trading Environmental and 
Construction Services Lot 1  $            365,000,000.00  $         5,475,000.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

Global Engineering Trading Environmental and 
Construction Services Lot 2  $            270,000,000.00  $         4,050,000.00 

Global Engineering Trading Environmental and 
Construction Services Lot 3  $            411,000,000.00  $         6,165,000.00 

Global Engineering Trading Environmental and 
Construction Services Lot 4  $            218,000,000.00  $         3,270,000.00 

Global Engineering Trading Environmental and 
Construction Services Lot 5  $            491,000,000.00  $         7,365,000.00 

25 R. Kissoon Contracting Service Lot 2  $            251,892,165.00  $         4,050,000.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
R. Kissoon Contracting Service Lot 3  $            388,653,247.00  $         6,240,000.00 

26 K and J Persaud Contracting Service Lot 1  $            324,179,625.00  $         4,862,694.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

27
Joseph Weatherspoon Construction & Contracting 
Service Lot 1  $              68,712,021.00  $         1,030,680.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 1 1

Joseph Weatherspoon Construction & Contracting 
Service Lot 2  $              47,846,101.00  $            717,692.00 

Joseph Weatherspoon Construction & Contracting 
Service Lot 3  $            107,604,924.00  $         1,614,074.00 

28 Expert Builders & Supplies Contractors Lot 2  $            251,893,203.00  $         4,121,600.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
Expert Builders & Supplies Contractors Lot 3  $            388,655,951.00  $         6,239,512.00 

29 West General Supplies  FTP not completed  $         5,576,207.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

30 Roopan Ramotar Investment Lot 1  $            237,270,285.00  $         3,570,000.00 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
Roopan Ramotar Investment Lot 2  $            218,371,613.00  $         3,285,000.00 
Roopan Ramotar Investment Lot 3  $            298,888,207.00  $         4,485,000.00 
Roopan Ramotar Investment Lot 4  $            210,906,560.00  $         3,165,000.00 
Roopan Ramotar Investment Lot 5  $            334,355,999.00  $         5,025,000.00 



31 Guycan Investment Lot 1  $            315,000,000.00  $         5,625,000.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

32 Prosperity Investment Inc Lot 1  $            368,299,418.00  $         5,576,207.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
Prosperity Investment Inc Lot 2  $            270,475,039.00  $         4,121,600.00 
Prosperity Investment Inc Lot 3  $            412,572,783.00  $         6,239,512.00 
Prosperity Investment Inc Lot 4  $            218,882,622.00  $         3,321,462.00 
Prosperity Investment Inc Lot 5  $            492,278,251.00  $         7,446,140.00 

33 United Contracting & Supplies Lot1  $            368,029,200.00  No Bid Security 
Seen 1

34 Gopie Investments Inc Lot 3  $            380,731,260.00  $         6,099,093.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
Gopie Investments Inc Lot 4  $            188,386,485.00  $         3,017,842.00 

35
S.S General Construction and Hardware Supplies Inc 
Lot 1  $            365,360,982.00  $         5,576,207.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

S.S General Construction and Hardware Supplies Inc 
Lot 2  $            268,484,538.00  $         4,121,600.00 

S.S General Construction and Hardware Supplies Inc 
Lot 3  $            409,904,722.00  $         6,239,512.00 

S.S General Construction and Hardware Supplies Inc 
Lot 4  $            218,860,992.00  $         3,321,462.00 

S.S General Construction and Hardware Supplies Inc 
Lot 5  $            495,365,068.00  $         7,446,140.00 

36 Bhowan Trucking & Construction Services Lot 1  $            344,884,943.00  $       51,732,740.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

37 Veyron International Traders Lot 1  $            323,724,173.00  $         4,855,863.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
Veyron International Traders Lot 2  $            239,428,494.00  $         3,591,427.00 
Veyron International Traders Lot 3  $            361,025,086.00  $         5,415,376.00 
Veyron International Traders Lot 4  $            192,825,988.00  $         2,892,390.00 



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 
Form of 
Tender 
signed 

 
Hard 
Copy 

Flash 
drive

1 R. Kissoon Contracting Service lot 2  $              50,110,500.00  $         1,020,000.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
R. Kissoon Contracting Service lot 3  $            149,400,000.00  $         3,000,000.00 

2 Isabella Investments Lot 3  $            103,222,500.00  $         2,171,400.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
Isabella Investments Lot 4  $              44,958,000.00  $         1,004,400.00 

3 G. Persaud Contracting and Mechanical Services Lot 1  $              66,174,500.00  $         1,323,490.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

4 Expert Builders & Supplies Contractors Lot 2  $              50,112,325.00  $         1,004,400.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
Expert Builders & Supplies Contractors Lot 3  $            149,401,825.00  $         2,171,400.00 

5 Triple P Construction & General Supplies Lot 1  $              64,560,000.00  $         1,291,200.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

6
Top Notch Transportation, Supplies and Construction 
Services Lot 1  $              74,824,240.00  No Bid Security 

Seen ✔ ✔ ✔ 0

Top Notch Transportation, Supplies and Construction 
Services Lot 2  $              48,841,800.00 

Top Notch Transportation, Supplies and Construction 
Services Lot 3  $            107,816,600.00 

Top Notch Transportation, Supplies and Construction 
Services Lot 4  $              48,841,800.00 

7 MJ's Contracting & General Supplies Lot 1  $              66,430,000.00  $         1,503,500.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

8 Engels Contracting & Supply Services Lot 3  $              99,132,500.00  $         2,171,400.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
Engels Contracting & Supply Services Lot 4  $              46,035,000.00  $         1,004,400.00 

Date of Tender Opening: December 9th 2025
File Number:  National Drainage & Irrigation Authority (519/2025/21) - Operation and Security of NDIA Mobile and Fix Pumps Within Regions No. 2,3,4, and Georgetown 
(January 1 to December 31,2026) Lots 1-4



9 C.A.J Contracting Services lot 3  $            106,955,000.00  $         2,171,400.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
C.A.J Contracting Services lot 4  $              49,620,000.00  $         1,004,400.00 

10 Veyron International Traders Lot 1  $              74,095,000.00  $         1,481,900.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
Veyron International Traders Lot 2  $              49,855,000.00  $            997,100.00 
Veyron International Traders Lot 3  $            107,710,000.00  $         2,154,200.00 
Veyron International Traders Lot 4  $              49,372,500.00  $            987,450.00 

11 United Builder Engineering and General Supplies lot 1  $              67,525,000.00  $         1,350,500.00 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
United Builder Engineering and General Supplies lot 2  $              44,280,000.00  $            885,600.00 
United Builder Engineering and General Supplies lot 3  $              99,030,000.00  $         1,980,600.00 
United Builder Engineering and General Supplies lot 4  $              39,375,000.00 

12 Hoosein Logistics & Supplies Inc Lot 1  $              69,350,000.00  $         1,127,625.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
Hoosein Logistics & Supplies Inc Lot 2  $              47,850,000.00  $            753,300.00 
Hoosein Logistics & Supplies Inc Lot 3  $            106,900,000.00  $         1,628,550.00 
Hoosein Logistics & Supplies Inc Lot 4  $              47,850,000.00  $            753,300.00 

13 Al Ghafa Engineering Inc Lot 2  $              45,862,500.00  $            917,250.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

14 General Engineering Supplies & Services C Inc Lot 1  $              62,900,000.00  $         2,000,000.00 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
General Engineering Supplies & Services C Inc Lot 2  $              40,360,000.00  $         1,500,000.00 
General Engineering Supplies & Services C Inc Lot 3  $              97,500,000.00  $         2,500,000.00 
General Engineering Supplies & Services C Inc Lot 4  $              40,490,000.00  $         1,500,000.00 

15 Maximatic Security Services Lot 1  $              69,659,649.00  $         1,393,193.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
Maximatic Security Services Lot 2  $              46,202,400.00  $            924,048.00 
Maximatic Security Services Lot 3  $            105,000,000.00  $         2,100,000.00 
Maximatic Security Services Lot 4  $              46,202,400.00  $            924,048.00 

16 Brothers Security Firm Inc Lot 1  FTP not Completed  $         4,277,280.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
Brothers Security Firm Inc Lot 2  $         2,489,760.00 
Brothers Security Firm Inc Lot 3  $         8,982,480.00 
Brothers Security Firm Inc Lot 4  $         2,115,360.00 



17 R&M Mining Investments Project Inc Lot 1  $              70,080,000.00  $         1,503,500.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
R&M Mining Investments Project Inc Lot 2  $              42,200,000.00  $         1,004,400.00 
R&M Mining Investments Project Inc Lot 3  $            107,420,000.00  $         2,171,400.00 
R&M Mining Investments Project Inc Lot 4  $              49,800,000.00  $         1,004,400.00 

18 United Builder Engineering and General Supplies Lot 1  $              67,525,000.00  $         1,350,500.00 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
United Builder Engineering and General Supplies Lot 2  $              44,280,000.00  $            885,600.00 
United Builder Engineering and General Supplies Lot 3  $              99,030,000.00  $         1,980,600.00 
United Builder Engineering and General Supplies Lot 4  $              39,375,000.00 

19 Greenway Distributors Inc Lot 2  $              47,820,000.00  $            956,400.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
Greenway Distributors Inc Lot 3  $            122,310,000.00  $         2,446,200.00 
Greenway Distributors Inc Lot 4  $              47,820,000.00  $            956,400.00 

20 G.S Contracting and General Supplies Lot 4  $              67,765,000.00  $         1,340,000.00 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

21 VMR Investment Lot 1  $            847,530,000.00  No Bid Security 
Seen ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

VMR Investment Lot 2  $            430,920,000.00 
VMR Investment Lot 3  $         1,666,350,000.00 
VMR Investment Lot 4  $            372,690,000.00 

22 Andrect Engineering & Construction Lot 2  $              48,810,000.00  $         1,500,000.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
Andrect Engineering & Construction Lot 3  $            106,275,000.00  $         2,000,000.00 
Andrect Engineering & Construction Lot 1  $              73,820,000.00  $         1,500,000.00 

23 Ah Supplies & Contracting Services Inc Lot 1  $              73,730,000.00  $         1,503,500.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
Ah Supplies & Contracting Services Inc Lot 2  $              48,762,000.00  $         1,004,400.00 
Ah Supplies & Contracting Services Inc Lot 3  $            106,507,500.00  $         2,171,400.00 
Ah Supplies & Contracting Services Inc Lot 4  $              48,762,000.00  $         1,004,400.00 

24
S.S General Construction and Hardware Supplies Inc 
Lot 1  $              68,255,000.00  $         1,503,500.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2



S.S General Construction and Hardware Supplies Inc 
Lot 2  $              44,991,000.00  $         1,004,400.00 

S.S General Construction and Hardware Supplies Inc 
Lot 3  $            123,430,000.00  $         2,171,400.00 

S.S General Construction and Hardware Supplies Inc 
Lot 4  $              43,022,000.00  $         1,004,400.00 

25 Norek Safety and Security Lot 1  $              66,751,550.00  $         1,335,031.00 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
Norek Safety and Security Lot 2  $              40,881,000.00  $            817,620.00 
Norek Safety and Security Lot 3  $              83,585,000.00  $         1,671,700.00 
Norek Safety and Security Lot 4  $              39,081,000.00  $            781,620.00 

26 C. Jorree Farming & Contracting Services Lot 3  $            102,417,500.00  $         2,171,400.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
C. Jorree Farming & Contracting Services Lot 4  $              47,130,000.00  $         1,004,400.00 

27 Consol Lot 1  $              74,825,000.00  $         1,503,500.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔
Consol Lot 2  $              48,865,000.00  $         1,004,400.00 
Consol Lot 3  $            104,140,000.00  $         2,171,400.00 
Consol Lot 4  $              48,500,000.00  $         1,004,400.00 

28 Rafeek Khan Investment Company Lot 1  $              62,415,000.00  $         1,500,000.00 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

29 D&R Construction and Machinery Rental Lot 1  $              73,365,000.00  $         1,503,500.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
D&R Construction and Machinery Rental Lot 2  $              49,700,000.00  $         1,004,400.00 
D&R Construction and Machinery Rental Lot 3  $            106,590,000.00  $         2,171,400.00 
D&R Construction and Machinery Rental Lot 4  $              49,100,000.00  $         1,004,400.00 

30 Prosperity Investment Inc lot 1  $              72,270,000.00  $         1,503,500.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
Prosperity Investment Inc lot 2  $              46,515,000.00  $         1,004,400.00 
Prosperity Investment Inc lot 3  $            105,047,500.00  $         2,171,400.00 
Prosperity Investment Inc lot 4  $              46,880,000.00  $         1,004,400.00 



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
 

Copy

Flash 
drive

1 Proconstruct Solutions 14,794,500.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

2 S.A General Services 13,857,375.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

3 P.M.W Construction & General Services 13,039,425.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

4 Guybuild Construction & Logistics Services 16,088,877.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

5 JD's Construction Company 11,820,637.50$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

6 IMS Construction and Logistics Services 13,828,500.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

7 Aleisha Mohamed Construction 14,471,100.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

8 Pantheon Construction Inc. 16,425,675.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

9 Westbrook Caribbean Inc. 14,874,300.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

Date of Tender Opening: December 9th 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education (929/2025/40) - Construction of Drain Phase 2- Sophia Special Education School

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  



10 Grand Global Engineering and Consultancy 14,513,625.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

11 Eze Way Construction Inc. 13,400,000.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

12 AB Solutions 14,532,000.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

13 Oneika & Son's Development 13,323,450.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

14 Builders Engineering and Architectural Consultancy 14,130,375.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

15 K. Primo General Building & Contracting Works 13,062,000.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

16 Mark De Souza General Contracting Establishment 15,095,850.00$                  $                 298,000  Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

17 Dicon Construction & Surveying Services 11,616,275.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

18 Barron's Exclusive 14,815,500.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

19 Rakaya Construction 12,477,675.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

20 S&J Enterprise 14,201,250.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  



21 Ceraturium 12,993,750.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

22 Warner Bros Investments 14,542,500.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

23 Jemcorp Engineering and Imports 14,243,250.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

24 R&R General Supplies & Delivery 13,580,000.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

25 Emeralds General Contracting and Distributors 12,542,000.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

26 Atlas Global Supplies and Logistics 14,713,125.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

27 Z & H Investment Inc. 14,100,000.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

28 Dwan Babb's Enterprise 12,200,500.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

29 Simcon Engineering Inc. 12,039,300.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

30 EMT General Construction 11,845,000.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

31 Deluxe Contracting and Supplies  Form of Tender Signed 
but not Completed  ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  



32 I Khan Contracting Service 13,975,500.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

33 Exact Builders Construction 14,249,025.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

34 Shafina Construction & General Services 10,966,200.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

35 Top Tier Builders  No Form of Tender Page 
Seen ✓ ✓ X 2

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration Not Seen 



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 
 Bid Security Amount & 

Currency Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 
Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy

Flash 
drive

1 S&S Construction & Aggregates  $                470,088,080  $                             7,051,321 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
2 Westbrook Caribbean Inc  $                502,122,859  $                             8,301,000 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
3 Mohabir's Construction  $                529,142,040  $                             8,400,000 Nafico ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
4 JD's Construction Company  $                448,866,913  $                             8,301,000 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
5 EZE Way Construction Inc  $                532,062,690  $                             8,280,000 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
6 K&K Boat Building Construction & General Supplies  $                551,300,000  $                             8,269,500 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
7 I.Khan Contracting Service  $                549,179,400  $                             8,237,691 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
8 Z&H Investment Inc  $                531,950,000  $                             8,295,000 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
9 MSR International Enterprise  $                491,453,600  $                             8,301,000 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

10 Emeralds General Contracting & Distributors  $                627,147,114  $                             9,420,000 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
11 Ceraturium  $                546,804,500 Not Seen ✔ ✔ ✔
12 Singh and Son Construction  $                570,000,000  $                             8,550,000 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
13 R&J Construction  $                527,903,090  $                             7,918,546 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
14 JK Enterprise Inc  $                546,470,980 Not Seen ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
15 D. David International  $                494,965,763  $                             8,301,000 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
16 JD Investment Inc  $                604,769,990  $                             9,750,000 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
17 Dundas Construction Inc  $                549,358,544  $                             8,301,000 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
18 BC Builders & Block Factory  $                             7,200,000 Caricom ✔ ✔ x 1
19 Builders Engineering and Architectural  $                547,887,670  $                             8,218,315 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

Date of Tender Opening: December 9th 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education  (930/2025/40) - Rehabilitation of  (3) Dorms at Presidents College



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 
Form of 
Tender 
signed 

 
Hard 
Copy 

Flash 
drive

1 Westbrook Caribbean Inc  $              14,203,550.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
2 I. Khan Contracting Service  $              14,180,000.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
3 BC Builders & Block Factory  $              14,079,400.00  $            211,191.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
4 Simcon Engineering Inc  $              12,578,850.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
5 Dicon Construction & Surveying Services  $              10,295,000.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
6 Tu-Shin General Services & Supplies  $              13,546,000.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
7 Ceraturium  $              14,233,000.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
8 Shafina Construction & General Services  $              11,684,000.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
9 Eco Build Development  $              14,800,500.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

10 Oneika & Son's Development  $              12,965,550.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
11 DG Enterprise  $              14,534,800.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
12 Alpha and Omega Engineering  $              14,280,100.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
13 Dundas Construction Inc  $              14,587,800.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
14 PMD & Engineering Firm  $              14,935,000.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
15 J&A Construction  $              13,090,500.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 0
16 Innovative Development Solution Guyana (IDSGY)  $              14,015,800.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
17 Two Brothers Construction  $              14,425,500.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
18 PMW Construction & General Services  $              14,195,500.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
19 S&J Enterprise  $              14,837,600.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
20 United Building Solutions  $              13,367,600.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
21 Elite Vision Construction & Services  $              13,347,600.00  $            298,000.00 Nafico ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
22 Rajesh Woodworking & Construction Services  $              13,800,000.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
23 Mtech Contracting Solutions  $              16,025,100.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
24 S.A General Services  $              17,323,700.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔
25 Mathura's Construction  $              14,648,300.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
26 Aleema's General Construction  $              10,626,900.00  $            298,000.00 Nafico ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

Date of Tender Opening: December 9th 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education  (931/2025/40) - Residential Building 1- Presidents College



27 Z&H Investment Inc  $              13,601,000.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
28 K. Primo General Building & Contracting Works  $              13,023,400.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
29 Dwain Babb's Enterprise  $              12,379,948.00  BSD not C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
30 Exact Builders Construction  $              14,000,500.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
31 Aleisha Mohamed Construction  $              14,390,000.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
32 Dynamic Infrastructure  $              13,318,400.00  $            298,000.00 Nafico ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
33 Emeralds General Contracting & Distributors  $              14,297,000.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
34 Eze Way Construction Inc  $              13,349,000.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
35 Builders Engineering and Architectural Consultancy  $              14,478,500.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
36 Dalton's Construction  $              13,180,000.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
 

Copy

Flash 
drive

1 Dicon Construction & Surveying Services  $                      10,295,000 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

2 Dalton's Construction  $                      13,152,000 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

3 BC Builders & Block Factory 13,478,360$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

4 Innovative Development Solution Guyana 14,036,800$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

5 Builders Engineering and Architexturial Consultancy 14,232,000$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

6 Ceraturium 14,433,000$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

7 Dundas Construction Inc. 14,657,800$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

8 DG Enterprise 13,982,800$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

9 Eze Way Construction Inc. 13,190,000$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

10 Simcon Engineering Inc. 12,578,850$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

11 S.A Genral Services 16,280,400$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

12 Skyline Construction 14,106,000$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

Date of Tender Opening: December 9th 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education (932/2025/40) - Residential Building 2- Presidents College

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  



13 I Khan Contracting Service 14,180,000$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

14 Dwain Babb's Enterprise 12,500,000$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

15 Grand Global Engineering and Consultancy 14,779,000$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

16 Shafina Construction & General Services 11,684,000$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

17 Westbrook Caribbean Inc 14,263,550$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

18 TU-Shin General Services & Supplies 13,546,000$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

19 Bobo's Construction Services 14,796,500$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

20 Z&H Investment Inc. 14,300,000$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

21 Elite Vision Construction & Services 13,000,000$                       $                 298,000  Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

22 Aleema's General Construction 11,832,360$                      298,000$                 Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

23 S&J Enterprise 14,597,100$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

24 Mtech Contracting Solutions 15,683,100$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

25 Oneika & Son's Development 13,491,900$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

26 P.M.W Construction & General Services 14,196,500$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

27 Dynamic Infrastructures 12,980,500$                      298,000$                 Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

28 United Building Solutions 13,166,500$                      298,000$                 Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  



29 Emeralds General Contracting & Distributors 14,297,000$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

30 Rajesh Woodworking & Construction Services 13,800,000$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

31 Jemcorp Engineering and Imports 14,388,500$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

32 Guybuild Construction & Logistics Services 16,510,506$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

33 Aleisha Mohamed Construction 14,190,000$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

34 Mark De Souza General Contracting Establishment 14,316,000$                      298,000$                 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

35 K. Primo General Building & Contracting  Works 13,023,400$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

36 Eco Build Development 14,805,500$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

37 Rakaya Construction 12,976,000$                      ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 
Form of 
Tender 
signed 

 
Hard 
Copy 

Flash 
drive

1 Streamline Procurement  $              16,066,100.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
2 Oneika & Son's Development  $              12,935,850.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
3 Elite Vision Construction & Services  $              13,313,200.00  $            298,000.00 NAFICO ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
4 United Building Solutions  $              13,332,200.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
5 Guybuild Construction & Logistics Services  $              16,555,216.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
6 Vijay Persaud & Sons Contracting Services  $              14,200,080.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
7 S.A General Services  $              15,959,400.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
8 Emeralds General Contracting & Distributors  $              14,297,000.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
9 Skyline Construction  $              14,076,000.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

10 S&J Enterprise  $              14,808,100.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
11 Rajesh Woodworking & Construction Services  $              13,800,000.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
12 Aleisha Mohamed Construction  $              13,850,002.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
13 Aleema's General Construction  $              12,398,300.00  $            298,000.00 Nafico ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
14 Rakaya Construction  $              13,108,300.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
15 Dicon Construction & Surveying Services  $              10,295,000.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
16 Westbrook Caribbean Inc  $              14,263,350.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
17 I. Khan Contracting Service  $              14,180,000.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
18 Simcon Engineering Inc  $              12,578,850.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
19 Builders Engineering and Architectural Consultancy  $              14,234,500.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
20 Dalton's Construction  $              13,117,000.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
21 Ceraturium  $              14,433,000.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
22 Eze Way Construction Inc  $              13,950,000.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
23 Innovative Development Solution Guyana (IDSGY)  $              14,015,800.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
24 Two Brothers Construction  $              14,425,500.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
25 Mark De Souza General Contracting Establishment  $              14,316,000.00  $            298,000.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
26 BC Builders & Block Factory  $              13,028,000.00  $            195,426.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
27 Dynamic Infrastructures  $              13,299,400.00  $            298,000.00 Nafico ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
28 Mathura's Construction  $              14,648,300.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
29 P.M.W Construction & General Services  $              14,195,500.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

Date of Tender Opening: December 9th 2025
File Number: Ministry of Education  (933/2025/40) - Residential Building 3- Presidents College



30 Z&H Investment Inc  $              13,795,000.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
31 Medi Master Inc  $              14,894,020.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
32 Shafina Construction & General Services  $              11,684,000.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
33 Spar-Trives Enterprise  $              13,934,000.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
34 Proconstruct Solutions  $              14,792,500.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
35 Lulu's Construction & Maintenance  $              14,652,000.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
 

Copy

Flash 
drive

1 BC Builders & Block Factory 13,566,320.00$                  $            203,495.00  Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

2 Ceraturium 13,943,000.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

3 Dicon Construction & Surveying Services 10,295,000.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

4 S&E Persaud Construction Services 13,127,000.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

5 Elite Vision Construction & Services 13,270,100.00$                 298,000.00$            Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

6 P.M.W Construction & General Services 14,196,500.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

7 Rajesh Woodworking & Construction Services 13,800,000.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

8 I Khan Contracting Service 14,180,000.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

9 J&A Construction 13,032,500.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

10 Simcon Engineering Inc. 12,578,850.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

11 Z & H Investment Inc. 13,755,000.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

12 Builders Engineering and Architectural Consultancy 14,544,000.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

Date of Tender Opening: December 9th 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education (934/2025/40) - Residential Building 4- Presidents College

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  



13 Innovation Development Solution Guyana (IDSGY) 14,036,800.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

14 Mark De Souza General Contracting Establishment 14,316,000.00$                 298,000.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

15 Westbrook Caribbean Inc. 14,263,550.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

16 Aleisha Mohamed Construction 13,700,504.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

17 Full Circle Business Solutions 15,950,800.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

18 PMD & Engineering Firm 14,507,000.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

19 North Stone Construction and General Supplies 14,807,500.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

20 S&J Enterprise 14,790,000.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

21 Medi Master Inc. 14,894,020.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

22 Eze Way Construction Inc. 13,901,000.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

23 Dynamic Infrastructures 13,258,100.00$                  $                 298,000  Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

24 S.A General Services 16,692,700.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

25 Shafina Construction & General Services 11,102,000.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

26 Emeralds General Contracting & Distributors 14,297,000.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

27 Oneika & Son's Development 12,865,400.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

28 Skyline Construction 14,106,000.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  



29 United Building Solutions 13,300,100.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

30 Aleema's General Construction 11,885,800.00$                 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  

 Bid Secure and Declaration 
Completed and Signed  



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 
Form of 
Tender 
signed 

 
Hard 
Copy 

Flash 
drive

1 Barron's Exclusive  $        14,699,000.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

2 Lulu's Construction & Maintenance  $        14,451,000.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

3 Simcon Engineering Inc  $        12,578,850.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

4 I. Khan Contracting Service  $        14,180,000.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

5 S.A General Services  $        16,015,400.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

6 Eze Way Construction Inc  $        13,180,000.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

7 S&E Persaud Construction Services  $        13,097,000.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

8 Ceraturium  $        14,028,000.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

9 Elite Vision Construction & Services  $        13,194,500.00  $       298,000.00 Nafico ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

10 Dynamic Infrastructures  $        13,188,500.00  $       298,000.00 Nafico ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

11 Emeralds General Contracting & Distributors  $        14,297,000.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

12 Vijay Persaud & Sons Contracting Services  $        14,299,000.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

Date of Tender Opening: December 9th 2025
File Number: Ministry of Education  (935/2025/40) - Residential Building 5- Presidents College



13 United Building Solutions  $        13,213,500.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

14 Rajesh Woodworking & Construction Services  $        13,800,000.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

15 P.M.W Construction & General Services  $        14,195,500.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

16 Oneika & Son's Development  $        13,523,950.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

17 Supreme Builders Service  $        14,807,500.00  BSD C/S X ✔ ✔ 1

18 Shafina Construction & General Services  $        11,684,000.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

19 Builders Engineering and Architectural 
Consultancy  $        14,051,000.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

20 Aleema's General Construction  $        10,579,220.00  $       298,000.00 Nafico ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

21 Aleisha Mohamed Construction  $        13,650,208.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

22 Skyline Construction  $        13,887,000.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

23 Innovative Development Solution Guyana 
(IDSGY)  $        14,015,800.00  BSD C/S X ✔ ✔ 1

24 BC Builders & Block Factory  $        13,482,220.00  $       202,233.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

25 Z&H Investment Inc  $        13,145,000.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1



26 Mark De Souza General Contracting 
Establishment  $        14,316,000.00  $       298,000.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

27 S&J Enterprise  $        14,899,260.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

28 J&A Construction  $        13,470,000.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

29 Westbrook Caribbean Inc  $        14,263,550.00  BSD C/S ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

30 Mathura's Construction  $        14,648,300.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 1BSD not C/S
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