
Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 
 Bid Security 

Amount & Currency 
Bid Security 

Agency GRA NIS 
Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy

Flash 
drive

1 D. Chowkai and Sons Construction  $                 79,415,805.00  $            1,588,316.00 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

2 CS Green Thumb Landscapers  No Bid Doc Submitted 
only Bill of Quantity ✓ ✓ X 0 2

3
Arrowhead Management and Supplies JV KD 
Logistics and Corporate Service Inc 75,873,674.00$                 1,517,473.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

4 Willian's Landscaping and Services 80,008,950.00$                 1,600,179.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

5 G&B Sugrim Enterprise 77,039,807.00$                 1,653,962.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

Date of Tender Opening: February 10th 2026

File Number: Ministry of Culture Youth & Sport (01/2026/44) - Design Review for the Provision of Landscaping and Upkeep Services for the Berbice Stadium 
Palmyra East Bank Berbice

No Bid Security Seen



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy

Flash 
drive

1 Guybiz Establishment  $         203,592,805.00  $         4,071,856.00 Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

2 Acado Guyana Inc 13,947,542.00$            279,000.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

3 Fortify Services 4,560,101.00$              91,328.00$              GTM ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 1

4 Thrive Traders 49,696,077.00$            1,000,000.00$         Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

5 BPI Guyana Inc. 4,564,042.00$              91,281,000.00$       Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

6 Summit Resources 104,635,185.00$          13,016,500.00$       Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 1

7 Paradise Food Products 89,538,648.00$            1,790,773.00$         Diamond ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

8 I&S Sankar's Importers and Distributors 75,750,619.00$            2,000,000.00$         Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

9 Guybuild Construction and Logistics Services 154,747,483.00$          16,690,240.00$       Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 1

10 Supreme Distributors 16,465,400.00$            329,308.00$            Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

11 R. Warton Mini Mart 91,050,988.00$            1,821,020.00$         Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 1 2

12 Memorex Enterprise 121,611,335.00$          2,500,000.00$         Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

Date of Tender Opening: February 10th 2026

File Number: Georgetown Public Hospital Corporation (56/2026/46) - Supply and Delivery of Dietary Supplies 2026



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 
 Bid Security 

Amount & Currency 
Bid Security 

Agency GRA NIS 
Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy

Flash 
drive

1 Anil Lalsa Construction  $             335,103,485.00  $            5,326,553.00 Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

2 I&S Sankar's Importers and Distributors 196,909,231.00$             2,965,188.00$            Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

3 Superior Supplies and General Construction 172,968,600.00$             3,300,000.00$            Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

4 AB Solutions 188,405,998.00$             2,826,090.00$            Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

5 AYN Construction and General Services 166,778,740.00$             3,675,000.00$            Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

6 A Anderson and Son General Construction and Supplies 170,129,736.00$             2,880,000.00$            Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

7 Truck Smart 195,781,867.00$             2,895,000.00$            Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

8 VB New Approach General Construction Inc. 187,832,480.00$             3,760,000.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

9 Andrect Engineering and Construction 191,149,052.00$             4,000,000.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

10 D. Chowkai and Sons Construction 359,377,172.00$             5,390,658.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

11 CAJ Construction Firm 178,234,430.00$             2,880,000.00$            Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 1

12 VI Enterprise 189,039,884.00$             2,850,000.00$            Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

13 MEPequip Inc 269,968,094.00$             4,050,000.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

Engineer Estimate 192,178,778.00$           

Date of Tender Opening: February 10th 2026

File Number: Supreme Court of Judicature (05/2026/55) - Completion of Cove and John Magistrate's Court



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

 Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy

Flash 
drive

1 Strategic Action Security Limited L1  $             5,333,011.00  $            563,550.00  Nafico Lots 1-10 ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

1 Strategic Action Security Limited L2  $             5,333,011.00 
1 Strategic Action Security Limited L3 6,845,472.00$              
1 Strategic Action Security Limited L4 5,333,011.00$              
1 Strategic Action Security Limited L5 5,333,011.00$              
1 Strategic Action Security Limited L6 5,333,011.00$              
1 Strategic Action Security Limited L7 5,333,011.00$              
1 Strategic Action Security Limited L8 5,333,011.00$              
1 Strategic Action Security Limited L9 5,333,011.00$              
1 Strategic Action Security Limited L10 6,845,472.00$              

2 Centry 21 Security Inc. L1 5,817,830.00$              602,336.00$             Nafico Lots 1-10 ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

2 Centry 21 Security Inc. L2 5,817,830.00$              
2 Centry 21 Security Inc. L3 6,845,472.00$              
2 Centry 21 Security Inc. L4 5,817,830.00$              
2 Centry 21 Security Inc. L5 5,817,830.00$              
2 Centry 21 Security Inc. L6 5,817,830.00$              
2 Centry 21 Security Inc. L7 5,817,830.00$              
2 Centry 21 Security Inc. L8 5,817,830.00$              
2 Centry 21 Security Inc. L9 5,817,830.00$              
2 Centry 21 Security Inc. L10 6,845,472.00$              

3 Norek Safety and Security L1 12,120,480.00$            121,205.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2
3 Norek Safety and Security L2 12,120,480.00$            121,205.00$            
3 Norek Safety and Security L3 8,484,336.00$              84,843.00$              

Date of Tender Opening: February 10th 2026

File Number: Guyana Marketing Corporation (12/2026/21) - Provision of Security Services for GMC Lots 1-10



3 Norek Safety and Security L4 8,484,336.00$              84,843.00$              
3 Norek Safety and Security L5 14,544,576.00$            145,446.00$            
3 Norek Safety and Security L6 12,120,480.00$            121,205.00$            
3 Norek Safety and Security L7 12,120,480.00$            121,205.00$            
3 Norek Safety and Security L8 14,544,576.00$            145,446.00$            
3 Norek Safety and Security L9 12,120,480.00$            121,205.00$            
3 Norek Safety and Security L10 14,544,576.00$            145,446.00$            

4 Sheriff Security Inc L1 5,134,104.00$              536,288.00$             Assuria Lots 1-
10 ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

4 Sheriff Security Inc L2 5,134,104.00$              
4 Sheriff Security Inc L3 6,275,016.00$              
4 Sheriff Security Inc L4 5,134,104.00$              
4 Sheriff Security Inc L5 5,134,104.00$              
4 Sheriff Security Inc L6 5,134,104.00$              
4 Sheriff Security Inc L7 5,134,104.00$              
4 Sheriff Security Inc L8 5,134,104.00$              
4 Sheriff Security Inc L9 5,134,104.00$              
4 Sheriff Security Inc L10 6,275,016.00$              

5 Amalgamated Security Services Guyana Inc.  L1 6,491,160.00$              663,097.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2
5 Amalgamated Security Services Guyana Inc.  L2 6,491,160.00$              
5 Amalgamated Security Services Guyana Inc.  L3 7,190,208.00$              
5 Amalgamated Security Services Guyana Inc.  L4 6,491,160.00$              
5 Amalgamated Security Services Guyana Inc.  L5 6,491,160.00$              
5 Amalgamated Security Services Guyana Inc.  L6 6,491,160.00$              
5 Amalgamated Security Services Guyana Inc.  L7 6,491,160.00$              
5 Amalgamated Security Services Guyana Inc.  L8 6,491,160.00$              
5 Amalgamated Security Services Guyana Inc.  L9 6,491,160.00$              
5 Amalgamated Security Services Guyana Inc.  L10 7,190,208.00$              

6 Nel Global Security Company Inc. L1 6,099,600.00$              60,996.00$              Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2
6 Nel Global Security Company Inc. L2 6,099,600.00$              60,996.00$              



6 Nel Global Security Company Inc. L3 7,507,200.00$              75,072.00$              
6 Nel Global Security Company Inc. L4 6,099,600.00$              60,996.00$              
6 Nel Global Security Company Inc. L5 6,099,600.00$              60,996.00$              
6 Nel Global Security Company Inc. L6 6,099,600.00$              60,996.00$              
6 Nel Global Security Company Inc. L7 6,099,600.00$              60,996.00$              
6 Nel Global Security Company Inc. L8 6,099,600.00$              60,996.00$              
6 Nel Global Security Company Inc. L9 6,099,600.00$              60,996.00$              
6 Nel Global Security Company Inc. L10 7,507,200.00$              75,072.00$              

7 LA Security Solutions Inc. L1 4,726,987.00$              559,966.00$             Nafico Lots 1-10 ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

7 LA Security Solutions Inc. L2 4,726,987.00$              
7 LA Security Solutions Inc. L3 9,090,360.00$              
7 LA Security Solutions Inc. L4 4,726,987.00$              
7 LA Security Solutions Inc. L5 4,726,987.00$              
7 LA Security Solutions Inc. L6 4,726,987.00$              
7 LA Security Solutions Inc. L7 4,726,987.00$              
7 LA Security Solutions Inc. L8 4,726,987.00$              
7 LA Security Solutions Inc. L9 4,726,987.00$              
7 LA Security Solutions Inc. L10 9,090,360.00$              

8 Panther Security Service Inc. L1 6,990,480.00$              659,102.00$             Premier Lots 1-
10 ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

8 Panther Security Service Inc. L2 5,991,840.00$              
8 Panther Security Service Inc. L3 4,993,200.00$              
8 Panther Security Service Inc. L4 7,989,120.00$              
8 Panther Security Service Inc. L5 4,993,200.00$              
8 Panther Security Service Inc. L6 6,990,480.00$              
8 Panther Security Service Inc. L7 5,991,840.00$              
8 Panther Security Service Inc. L8 6,990,480.00$              
8 Panther Security Service Inc. L9 6,990,480.00$              
8 Panther Security Service Inc. L10 7,989,120.00$              



9 Accusafe Security Service Inc. L1 6,275,016.00$              650,319.00$             Assuria Lots 1-
10 ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

9 Accusafe Security Service Inc. L2 6,275,016.00$              
9 Accusafe Security Service Inc. L3 7,415,928.00$              
9 Accusafe Security Service Inc. L4 6,275,016.00$              
9 Accusafe Security Service Inc. L5 6,275,016.00$              
9 Accusafe Security Service Inc. L6 6,275,016.00$              
9 Accusafe Security Service Inc. L7 6,275,016.00$              
9 Accusafe Security Service Inc. L8 6,275,016.00$              
9 Accusafe Security Service Inc. L9 6,275,016.00$              
9 Accusafe Security Service Inc. L10 7,415,928.00$              

10 Atlas Security Services Inc. L1 5,932,742.00$              59,327.00$              Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2
10 Atlas Security Services Inc. L2 5,192,928.00$              51,929.00$              
10 Atlas Security Services Inc. L3 5,192,928.00$              51,929.00$              
10 Atlas Security Services Inc. L4 5,192,928.00$              51,929.00$              
10 Atlas Security Services Inc. L5 5,192,928.00$              51,929.00$              
10 Atlas Security Services Inc. L6 5,192,928.00$              51,929.00$              
10 Atlas Security Services Inc. L7 5,932,742.00$              59,327.00$              
10 Atlas Security Services Inc. L8 5,932,742.00$              59,327.00$              
10 Atlas Security Services Inc. L9 5,932,742.00$              59,327.00$              
10 Atlas Security Services Inc. L10 5,192,928.00$              51,929.00$              

11 NM trucking Security Services L1 7,878,312.00$              787,831.00$             Premier Lots 1-
10 X ✓ ✓ 0 2

11 NM trucking Security Services L2 7,878,312.00$              
11 NM trucking Security Services L3 7,878,312.00$              
11 NM trucking Security Services L4 7,878,312.00$              
11 NM trucking Security Services L5 7,878,312.00$              
11 NM trucking Security Services L6 7,878,312.00$              
11 NM trucking Security Services L7 7,878,312.00$              
11 NM trucking Security Services L8 7,878,312.00$              
11 NM trucking Security Services L9 7,878,312.00$              



11 NM trucking Security Services L10 7,878,312.00$              

12 RK's Guyana Security Services L1 6,686,811.00$              750,000.00$             Premier Lots 1-
10 ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 1

12 RK's Guyana Security Services L2 6,686,811.00$              
12 RK's Guyana Security Services L3 8,023,320.00$              
12 RK's Guyana Security Services L4 6,686,811.00$              
12 RK's Guyana Security Services L5 6,686,811.00$              
12 RK's Guyana Security Services L6 6,686,811.00$              
12 RK's Guyana Security Services L7 6,686,811.00$              
12 RK's Guyana Security Services L8 6,686,811.00$              
12 RK's Guyana Security Services L9 6,686,811.00$              
12 RK's Guyana Security Services L10 8,023,320.00$              



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy

Flash 
drive

1 Clever Solutions Guyana Inc.  $            91,176,784.00  $          2,000,000.00 Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

2 Western Scientific Company Limited US$           251086.48 US$    9,000.00 Premier N/A N/A ✓ 0 2

3 Meditron Inc. 50,422,644.00$             1,008,423.00$          Dianmond ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

4 Petran Corporation Inc. 127,026,612.00$           5,000,000.00$          Demerara Bank ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

5 Bras Aliminum and Cast Iron Foundry Limiyed 5,864,500.00$               117,290.00$             Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

6 Trillium Measurement Guyana Inc. 6,853,180.00$               ✓ ✓ ✓ 1 0

7 DB's General Services 8,010,400.00$               180,000.00$             Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 1

Date of Tender Opening: February 10th 2026

File Number: Guyana National Bureau of Standards (08/2026/23) - Procurement of Legal Metrology Equipment

No Bid Security Seen



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy

Flash 
drive

1 Clever Solutions Guyana Inc.  $           52,148,901.00  $         1,200,000.00 Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

2 Western Scientific Company Limited US$            125,719.45 US$            5,000.00 Premier N/A N/A ✓ 0 2

3 Petran Corporation Inc. 10,791,226.00$            3,000,000.00$         Demerara Bank ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

4 Meditron Inc 31,125,095.00$            622,502.00$            Diamond ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

Date of Tender Opening: February 10th 2026

File Number: Guyana National Bureau of Standards (09/2026/23) - Procurement of Industrial Metrology Equipment



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
 

Copy

Flash 
drive

1 Memorex Enterprise  $           19,131,555.00  $            400,000.00 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

2 Anil Lalsa Construction 17,944,843.00$           358,900.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

3 Andrect Engineering and Construction 17,258,884.00$           500,000.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

4 AYN Construction and General Services 21,145,786.00$           800,000.00$            Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

5 Fugenz Business Solution 26,407,700.00$           528,154.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

6 KH Construction and General Merchandise 14,378,727.00$           287,575.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 1

7 S&A Engineering Services 12,197,638.00$           250,000.00$            Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 0

Date of Tender Opening: February 10th 2026

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (10/2026/21) - Extension of PCMD Bond at Blairmont Estate



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy

Flash 
drive

1 Cremms Limited  US$               43,450  $            210,000.00 Assuria N/A N/A ✓ 0 2

2 Bras Aliminum and Cast Iron Foundry Limiyed 26,460,829.00$            529,217.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

3 Garnet Engineering US$                 35,888 717.76$                   Canada Trust N/A N/A ✓ 0 2

Date of Tender Opening: February 10th 2026

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (11/2026/21) - Supply and delivery of Scrapper Plates for the Industry



Bidder 
 No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
 

Copy

Flash 
drive

1 LA Security Solutions Inc. L1  $           12,319,752.00  $            123,197.00 Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2
1 LA Security Solutions Inc. L2 8,216,208.00$              
1 LA Security Solutions Inc. L3 8,216,208.00$              
1 LA Security Solutions Inc. L4 8,216,208.00$              
1 LA Security Solutions Inc. L5 4,108,104.00$              
1 LA Security Solutions Inc. L6 8,216,208.00$              

2 Panther Security Service Inc. L1 12,558,240.00$            502,330.00$            Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2
2 Panther Security Service Inc. L2 8,372,160.00$              
2 Panther Security Service Inc. L3 8,372,160.00$              
2 Panther Security Service Inc. L4 8,372,160.00$              
2 Panther Security Service Inc. L5 4,186,080.00$              
2 Panther Security Service Inc. L6 8,372,160.00$              

3 Centaur Security Service Inc. L1 27,487,152.00$            1,253,414.00$         Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2
3 Centaur Security Service Inc. L2 18,324,768.00$            
3 Centaur Security Service Inc. L3 18,324,768.00$            
3 Centaur Security Service Inc. L4 18,324,768.00$            
3 Centaur Security Service Inc. L5 9,162,384.00$              
3 Centaur Security Service Inc. L6 18,324,768.00$            

4 NM Trucking Security Services L1 20,540,520.00$            821,621.00$            Premier X ✓ ✓ 0 2
4 NM Trucking Security Services L2 13,693,680.00$            
4 NM Trucking Security Services L3 13,693,680.00$            
4 NM Trucking Security Services L4 13,693,680.00$            
4 NM Trucking Security Services L5 6,846,840.00$              
4 NM Trucking Security Services L6 13,693,680.00$            

Date of Tender Opening: February 10th 2026

File Number: Ministry of Amerindian Affairs (05/2026/16) - Procurement of Security Services for MOAA for 2026 for Lots 1-6



5 Atlas Security Services Inc. L1 11,258,352.00$            128,345.00$            Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2
5 Atlas Security Services Inc. L2 7,505,568.00$              85,563.00$              
5 Atlas Security Services Inc. L3 7,505,568.00$              85,563.00$              
5 Atlas Security Services Inc. L4 7,505,568.00$              85,563.00$              
5 Atlas Security Services Inc. L5 3,752,784.00$              42,782.00$              
5 Atlas Security Services Inc. L6 7,505,568.00$              85,563.00$              

6 Accusafe Security Service Inc. L1 14,117,400.00$            643,753.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2
6 Accusafe Security Service Inc. L2 9,411,600.00$              
6 Accusafe Security Service Inc. L3 9,411,600.00$              
6 Accusafe Security Service Inc. L4 9,411,600.00$              
6 Accusafe Security Service Inc. L5 4,705,800.00$              
6 Accusafe Security Service Inc. L6 9,411,600.00$              

7 Nel Global Security Company Inc. L1 15,654,600.00$            638,112.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2
7 Nel Global Security Company Inc. L2 10,436,400.00$            
7 Nel Global Security Company Inc. L3 10,436,400.00$            
7 Nel Global Security Company Inc. L4 10,436,400.00$            
7 Nel Global Security Company Inc. L5 5,218,200.00$              
7 Nel Global Security Company Inc. L6 10,436,400.00$            

8 Blackwater Tactical Security Firm L1 - 578,864.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2
8 Blackwater Tactical Security Firm L2 -
8 Blackwater Tactical Security Firm L3 16,538,956.00$            
8 Blackwater Tactical Security Firm L4 16,538,956.00$            
8 Blackwater Tactical Security Firm L5 8,269,478.00$              
8 Blackwater Tactical Security Firm L6 16,538,956.00$            

9 Hoosein Security Service Inc. L1 16,432,416.00$            660,000.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2
9 Hoosein Security Service Inc. L2 10,954,944.00$            
9 Hoosein Security Service Inc. L3 10,954,944.00$            
9 Hoosein Security Service Inc. L4 10,954,944.00$            
9 Hoosein Security Service Inc. L5 5,477,472.00$              



9 Hoosein Security Service Inc. L6 10,954,944.00$            

10 Strategic Action Security Services L1 12,196,800.00$            556,174.00$            Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2
10 Strategic Action Security Services L2 8,131,200.00$              
10 Strategic Action Security Services L3 8,131,200.00$              
10 Strategic Action Security Services L4 8,131,200.00$              
10 Strategic Action Security Services L5 4,065,600.00$              
10 Strategic Action Security Services L6 8,131,200.00$              

11 Centry 21 Security Inc. L1 13,305,600.00$            606,735.00$            Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2
11 Centry 21 Security Inc. L2 8,870,400.00$              
11 Centry 21 Security Inc. L3 8,870,400.00$              
11 Centry 21 Security Inc. L4 8,870,400.00$              
11 Centry 21 Security Inc. L5 4,435,200.00$              
11 Centry 21 Security Inc. L6 8,870,400.00$              

12 Amalgamated Security Services Guyana Inc. L1 16,325,712.00$            653,028.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2
12 Amalgamated Security Services Guyana Inc. L2 10,883,808.00$            
12 Amalgamated Security Services Guyana Inc. L3 10,883,808.00$            
12 Amalgamated Security Services Guyana Inc. L4 10,883,808.00$            
12 Amalgamated Security Services Guyana Inc. L5 5,441,904.00$              
12 Amalgamated Security Services Guyana Inc. L6 10,883,808.00$            

13 Norek Safety and Secuirty L1 20,540,520.00$            1,111,295.00$         Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2
13 Norek Safety and Secuirty L2 13,693,680.00$            
13 Norek Safety and Secuirty L3 25,280,640.00$            
13 Norek Safety and Secuirty L4 25,280,640.00$            
13 Norek Safety and Secuirty L5 9,480,240.00$              
13 Norek Safety and Secuirty L6 16,853,760.00$            

14 Queensway Security Services Inc. L1 19,718,640.00$            900,000.00$            Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2
14 Queensway Security Services Inc. L2 13,145,760.00$            
14 Queensway Security Services Inc. L3 13,145,760.00$            
14 Queensway Security Services Inc. L4 13,145,760.00$            



14 Queensway Security Services Inc. L5 6,572,880.00$              
14 Queensway Security Services Inc. L6 13,145,760.00$            

15 Sheriff Security Inc. L1 11,550,600.00$            526,707.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2
15 Sheriff Security Inc. L2 7,700,400.00$              
15 Sheriff Security Inc. L3 7,700,400.00$              
15 Sheriff Security Inc. L4 7,700,400.00$              
15 Sheriff Security Inc. L5 3,850,200.00$              
15 Sheriff Security Inc. L6 7,700,400.00$              

16 RK's Guyana Security Services L1 14,932,080.00$            700,000.00$            Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2
16 RK's Guyana Security Services L2 9,954,720.00$              
16 RK's Guyana Security Services L3 9,954,720.00$              
16 RK's Guyana Security Services L4 9,954,720.00$              
16 RK's Guyana Security Services L5 4,977,360.00$              
16 RK's Guyana Security Services L6 9,954,720.00$              



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 
 Bid Security 

Amount & Currency 
Bid Security 

Agency GRA NIS 
Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy

Flash 
drive

1 Guybiz Establishment L1  $               66,823,060.00  $            5,526,549.00 Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2
1 Guybiz Establishment L2 69,513,600.00$               
1 Guybiz Establishment L3 70,769,600.00$               
1 Guybiz Establishment L4 69,221,200.00$               

2 King Shiv General Supplies and Enterprise L1 - 2,774,080.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 1
2 King Shiv General Supplies and Enterprise L2 75,298,200.00$               
2 King Shiv General Supplies and Enterprise L3 54,529,200.00$               
2 King Shiv General Supplies and Enterprise L4 138,914,000.00$             

3 Memorex Enterprise L1 72,511,150.00$               6,000,000.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2
3 Memorex Enterprise L2 55,032,000.00$               
3 Memorex Enterprise L3 72,771,700.00$               
3 Memorex Enterprise L4 98,540,200.00$               

4 NT Ventures L1 92,521,800.00$               6,400,000.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2
4 NT Ventures L2 61,176,000.00$               
4 NT Ventures L3 61,238,600.00$               
4 NT Ventures L4 103,766,000.00$             

5 HR Distributors L1 135,988,500.00$             6,200,000.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2
5 HR Distributors L2 59,841,600.00$               
5 HR Distributors L3 55,890,200.00$               
5 HR Distributors L4 104,124,200.00$             

6 Gravity Holdings L1 73,510,710.00$               6,423,928.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

Date of Tender Opening: February 10th 2026

File Number: Ministry of Amerindian Affairs (06/2026/16) - Supply and Delivery of Dry and Fresh Ration for Amerindian Residence and Hinterland Scholarship Student 
Dormitory Lots 1-4



6 Gravity Holdings L2 87,273,600.00$               
6 Gravity Holdings L3 84,268,800.00$               
6 Gravity Holdings L4 76,143,320.00$               

7 hubbards Licenced Customs Brokerage and 
Logistics Firm L1

115,978,791.00$             1,100,000.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 0

7 hubbards Licenced Customs Brokerage and 
Logistics Firm L2

-

7 hubbards Licenced Customs Brokerage and 
Logistics Firm L3

-

7 hubbards Licenced Customs Brokerage and 
Logistics Firm L4

-

8 Guybuild Construction and Logistics Services L1 92,623,290.00$               2,166,000.00$            Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2
8 Guybuild Construction and Logistics Services L2 -
8 Guybuild Construction and Logistics Services L3 -
8 Guybuild Construction and Logistics Services L4 -

9 Summit Resources L1 91,398,190.00$               1,781,006.00$            Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 1
9 Summit Resources L2 -
9 Summit Resources L3 -
9 Summit Resources L4 -

10 OM's Fresh Fruits Vegetables and Catering Services 
L1

- Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2

10 OM's Fresh Fruits Vegetables and Catering Services 
L2

33,532,800.00$               670,656.00$               

10 OM's Fresh Fruits Vegetables and Catering Services 
L3

61,226,400.00$               1,224,528.00$            

10 OM's Fresh Fruits Vegetables and Catering Services 
L4

-

11 Andrect Engineering and Construction L1 112,313,971.00$             2,100,000.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2



11 Andrect Engineering and Construction L2 75,891,840.00$               2,100,000.00$            
11 Andrect Engineering and Construction L3 101,885,408.00$             2,100,000.00$            
11 Andrect Engineering and Construction L4 102,419,400.00$             2,100,000.00$            

12 I&S Sankar's Importers and Distributors L1 77,224,650.00$               6,678,511.00$            Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2
12 I&S Sankar's Importers and Distributors L2 58,860,000.00$               
12 I&S Sankar's Importers and Distributors L3 69,098,420.00$               
12 I&S Sankar's Importers and Distributors L4 128,742,500.00$             

13 RH Global L1 122,264,298.00$             2,445,286.00$            Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 0 2
13 RH Global L2 72,004,800.00$               1,440,096.00$            
13 RH Global L3 129,658,200.00$             2,593,164.00$            
13 RH Global L4 450,989,760.00$             3,019,795.00$            

14 A&Z Halaal Butchery L1  Form of Tender not 
Completed and Signed  

6,560,000.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ X 0 1

14 A&Z Halaal Butchery L2
14 A&Z Halaal Butchery L3
14 A&Z Halaal Butchery L4

15 Gasper Trading Enterprise L1 - 1,036,980.00$            GBTI ✓ X ✓ 0 2
15 Gasper Trading Enterprise L2 54,343,800.00$               
15 Gasper Trading Enterprise L3 -
15 Gasper Trading Enterprise L4 -



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 
 Bid Security Amount 

& Currency 
Bid Security 

Agency GRA NIS 
Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy

Flash 
drive

1 Alvin Chowramootoo Construction Services 
Lot 1 67,920,000.00$          680,000.00$                Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

1 Alvin Chowramootoo Construction Services 
Lot 2 97,700,000.00$          620,000.00$                Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔

1 Alvin Chowramootoo Construction Services 
Lot 3 125,690,000.00$        640,000.00$                Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔

2 Titanium Engineering and Construction Co.Inc.                                         
                                        Lot 1 74,712,000.00$          1,494,240.00$             Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

2 Titanium Engineering and Construction Co.Inc.                                         
                                        Lot 2 132,591,000.00$        2,651,820.00$             Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔

2 Titanium Engineering and Construction Co.Inc.                                         
                                        Lot 3 164,282,000.00$        3,285,640.00$             Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔

3 NP Contracting & Transportation Services Lot 1 64,879,800.00$          5,800,000.00$             Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

3 NP Contracting & Transportation Services Lot 2 92,655,800.00$          5,800,000.00$             Premier ✔ ✔ ✔

3 NP Contracting & Transportation Services Lot 3 126,010,000.00$        5,800,000.00$             Premier ✔ ✔ ✔

4 Amy's Enterprise 70,047,000.00$          1,400,940.00$             Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

Date of Tender Opening: February 10th 2026

File Number: Guyana Water Inc (09/2026/45) - Installation of Water Supply System in Region ( Los 1-3



5 Karnassa Investment Incorporated Lot 1 82,064,400.00$          2,500,000.00$             Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

5 Karnassa Investment Incorporated Lot 2 118,186,600.00$        2,500,000.00$             Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔

5 Karnassa Investment Incorporated Lot 3 158,328,800.00$        2,500,000.00$             Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔

6 Nk Engineering Services Lot 1 61,580,000.00$          5,800,000.00$             Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

7 CK Construction & Transportation Services 
Inc. Lot 1 64,011,300.00$          660,000.00$                Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

7 CK Construction & Transportation Services 
Inc. Lot 2 92,116,800.00$          620,000.00$                Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔

7 CK Construction & Transportation Services 
Inc. Lot 3 89,363,500.00$          640,000.00$                Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔

8 C.Jorree Farming & Contracting Services Lot 1 62,745,000.00$          5,800,000.00$             Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

8 C.Jorree Farming & Contracting Services Lot 2 91,437,500.00$          5,800,000.00$             Premier ✔ ✔ ✔

8 C.Jorree Farming & Contracting Services Lot 3 120,220,000.00$        5,800,000.00$             Premier ✔ ✔ ✔

9 Lerge Engineering Lot 1 65,450,190.00$          620,000.00$                Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2



9 Lerge Engineering Lot 2 95,426,320.00$          680,000.00$                Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔

10 K.Tularam Construction Lot 1 70,710,000.00$          1,414,200.00$             Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

10 K.Tularam Construction Lot 2 103,665,000.00$        2,073,300.00$             Premier ✔ ✔ ✔

10 K.Tularam Construction Lot 3 121,220,000.00$        2,424,400.00$             Premier ✔ ✔ ✔

11 Fabra Enterprise Inc. 71,000,000.00$          1,420,000.00$             Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

12 Expert Builders & Supplies Contractors Lot 1 67,674,000.00$          5,740,000.00$             Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

12 Expert Builders & Supplies Contractors Lot 2 95,836,000.00$          5,740,000.00$             Premier ✔ ✔ ✔

12 Expert Builders & Supplies Contractors Lot 3 125,348,000.00$        5,740,000.00$             Premier ✔ ✔ ✔

13 Monohar Services Lot 1 66,360,000.00$          5,820,000.00$             Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

13 Monohar Services Lot 2 96,908,000.00$          5,820,000.00$             Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔

13 Monohar Services Lot 3 125,849,000.00$        5,820,000.00$             Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔



14 Monarch Investments Lot 1 64,839,600.00$          5,800,000.00$             Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

14 Monarch Investments Lot 2 94,684,400.00$          5,800,000.00$             Premier ✔ ✔ ✔

14 Monarch Investments Lot 3 125,484,200.00$        5,800,000.00$             Premier ✔ ✔ ✔

15 Legalize Trucking and Contracting Service Lot 1 58,221,000.00$          1,340,000.00$             Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

15 Legalize Trucking and Contracting Service Lot 2 83,451,500.00$          1,940,000.00$             Premier ✔ ✔ ✔

15 Legalize Trucking and Contracting Service Lot 3 113,642,000.00$        2,520,000.00$             Premier ✔ ✔ ✔

16 Faldhari Singh and Son Contracting Services 
Lot 1 57,127,000.00$          1,300,000.00$             Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

16 Faldhari Singh and Son Contracting Services 
Lot 2 83,035,000.00$          1,900,000.00$             Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔

16 Faldhari Singh and Son Contracting Services 
Lot 3 110,704,000.00$        2,400,000.00$             Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔

17 R.Kissoon Contracting Service 66,674,000.00$          5,740,000.00$             Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy

Flash 
drive

1 J&M Shipping Inc. L1  $           29,000,000.00  $         1,160,000.00  GTM ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
1 J&M Shipping Inc. L2  $           58,000,000.00  $            580,000.00 

2 Expert Builders & Supplies Contractors L1  $           34,800,000.00  $         1,700,000.00  Premier Ins.  ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
2 Expert Builders & Supplies Contractors L2  $           50,950,000.00 

3 Faldhari Singh & Son Contracting Services L1 22,000,000.00$            6,000,000.00$         Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

4 Akamai Inc. L2 75,360,000.00$            4,000,000.00$         Caricom X ✔ ✔ 2

5 R. Kissoon Contracting Service L1 34,300,000.00$            1,700,000.00$         Premier Ins ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
5 R. Kissoon Contracting Service L2 50,450,000.00$            

6 Andrect Engineering & Construction L1 28,535,000.00$            1,300,000.00$         Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
6 Andrect Engineering & Construction L2 57,420,000.00$            

7 Statix Construction & General SuppliesL1 32,880,000.00$             $         1,924,800.00 Premier Ins. ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
7 Statix Construction & General SuppliesL2 63,360,000.00$            

8 JC Mining & Construction L1 28,880,000.00$            1,690,000.00$         Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
8 JC Mining & Construction L2 55,620,000.00$            

9 Fazam Future Builders L1 24,260,000.00$            485,200.00$            Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
9 Fazam Future Builders L2 58,570,000.00$            1,171,400.00$         

10 Alvin Chowramootoo Construction Services L1 35,400,000.00$            1,200,000.00$         Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

Date of Tender Opening: February 10th 2026

File Number: Guyana Water Inc (10/2026/45) - Installation of Hybrid PV Battery Systems Region 7 Lot 1-2



10 Alvin Chowramootoo Construction Services L2 57,800,000.00$            300,000.00$            

11
LGS Barnes General Building Construction & Civil 
Engineering L1 24,260,000.00$            1,009,000.00$         

Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

11
LGS Barnes General Building Construction & Civil 
Engineering L2 50,450,000.00$            485,200.00$            

12 Vertex Engineering Solution L1 32,837,086.00$            1,972,525.00$         Premier Ins. ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
12 Vertex Engineering Solution L2 65,789,172.00$            

13 D&R Construction & Machinery Rental L1 28,360,000.00$            1,740,000.00$         Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
13 D&R Construction & Machinery Rental L2 56,720,000.00$            

14 Monarch Investments L1 29,600,000.00$            1,740,000.00$         Premier Ins. ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
14 Monarch Investments L2 55,200,000.00$            

15 Boudnauth's Construction & General Supply L1 26,830,000.00$            1,568,200.00$         Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
15 Boudnauth's Construction & General Supply L2 51,580,000.00$            

16 NP Contracting & Transportation Services L1 28,280,000.00$            2,740,000.00$         Premier Ins. ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
16 NP Contracting & Transportation Services L2 83,530,000.00$            

17 Manohar Services L1 29,450,000.00$            ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
17 Manohar Services L2 57,250,000.00$            

 No Bid Security Seen  



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 

Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
 

Copy

Flash 
drive

1 NP Contracting & Transportation Services  $        83,575,000.00  $      1,720,000.00 Premier  ✓ ✓ ✓
2

2 Boudnauth's Construction & General Supply  $        74,780,000.00  $      1,495,600.00  Assuria  ✓ ✓ ✓
2

3 Statix Construction & General Supplies  $        92,110,000.00 
1,842,200.00$       

 Premier  ✓ ✓ ✓
2 ######

4 Faldhari Singh and Son Contracting Services  $        67,900,000.00  $      1,700,000.00  Assuria  ✓ ✓ ✓
2

5 JC Mining & Construction  $        81,440,000.00  $      1,628,800.00  Assuria  ✓ ✓ ✓
2

6 Monarch Investments  $        80,300,000.00  $      1,720,000.00  Premier  ✓ ✓ ✓
2

7 Manohar Services  $        85,225,000.00  $      1,740,000.00  Assuria  ✓ ✓ ✓
2

8 J&M Shipping Inc.  $        86,000,000.00  $      1,720,000.00  Demerara 
Mutual  ✓ ✓ ✓

2

9 Fazam Future Builders  $        78,370,000.00  $      1,556,400.00  Caricom  ✓ ✓ ✓

10 Expert Builders & Supplies Contractors  $        94,200,000.00  $      1,880,000.00  Premier  ✓ ✓ ✓
2

11 LGS Barnes General Building Construction & Civil 
Engineering 74,480,000.00$         1,489,600.00$       Caricom 

✓ ✓ ✓
2

12
Vertex Engineering Solution Inc. 97,511,259.00$         1,950,225.00$       Premier 

✓ ✓ ✓
1

13
Cedar Engineering 86,080,000.00$         1,720,000.00$       Caricom 

✓ ✓ ✓
2

14
R. Kissoon Contracting 93,700,000.00$         1,880,000.00$       Premier 

✓ ✓ ✓
2

15
Alvin Chowramootoo Construction Services 85,800,000.00$         1,800,000.00$       Caricom 

✓ ✓ ✓
2

16
Akamai Inc 110,110,000.00$       4,500,000.00$       Caricom 

✓ ✓ ✓
2

17 Andrect Engineering & Construction 84,855,000.00$         900,000.00$          Caricom 
✓ ✓ ✓

2

Date of Tender Opening: February 10th 2026

File Number: Guyana Water Inc (11/2026/45) - Installation of Hybrid PV Battery Systems Lot 3 Region 1



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy

Flash 
drive

1 Manohar Services  $                38,340,000  $                 780,000 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

2 Karnassa Investment Incorporated  $                37,856,000  $              2,500,000 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

3 Alvin Chowramootoo Construction Services  $                37,800,000  $                 800,000 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

4 Fabra Enterprise Inc.  $                40,000,000  $                 800,000 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

5 NK Engineering Services  $                42,425,000  $                 760,000 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

6 Faldhari Singh and Son Contracting Services  $                32,600,000  $                 700,000 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

7 Expert Builders & Supplies Contractors 32,410,000$                 680,000$                 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

8 Monarch Investments 35,550,000$                 1,720,000$              Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

9 Cedar Engineering 37,206,000$                 760,000$                 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

10 NP Contracting & Transportation Services 35,330,000$                 760,000$                 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

11 R.Kissoon Contracting Service 33,010,000$                 680,000$                 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

Date of Tender Opening: February 10th 2026

File Number: Guyana Water Inc (12/2026/45) - Installation and Drilling of Well for Water Supply System in Paramakatoi



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy

Flash 
drive

1 NP Contracting  & Transportation Services  $           53,920,000.00  $         1,100,000.00  Premier Ins  ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

2 Fabra Enterprise Inc.  $           55,000,000.00  $         1,100,000.00  Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

3 Manohar Services  $           55,412,000.00  $         1,120,000.00  Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

4 Expert Builders and Supplies Contractors  $           53,840,000.00  $         1,080,000.00  Premier Ins  ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

5 Karnassa Investment Inc.  $           52,982,000.00  $         2,500,000.00  Caricom  ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

6 Cutting Enterprise  $           54,440,000.00  $         1,100,000.00  Caricom  ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

7 R. Kissoon Contracting Service 55,040,000.00$            1,080,000.00$         Premier Ins ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

8 Hubbards Licensed Customs Brokerage and Logistics Firm 51,350,000.00$            1,100,000.00$         Assuria X ✔ ✔ 2

9 A & E Construction, Supplies and Services 54,284,000.00$            1,100,000.00$         Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

10 Monarch Investments 53,540,000.00$            1,100,000.00$         Premier Ins ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

Date of Tender Opening: February 10th 2026

File Number: Guyana Water Inc (13/2026/45) - Drilling of Potable Water Well at Red Hill & Hobodeian



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy

Flash 
drive

1 Lerge Engineering 18,637,180$                 380,000$                 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

2 Monarch Investments 18,790,000$                 380,000$                 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

3 NP Contracting & Transportation Services 18,670,000$                 380,000$                 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

4 Faldhari Singh and Son Contracting Services 15,970,000$                 360,000$                 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

5 Monohar Ser vices 19,846,000$                 400,000$                 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

6 R.Kissoon Contracting Service 18,690,000$                 380,000$                 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

7 Expert Builders & Supplies Contractors 18,680,000$                 380,000$                 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

8 Hubbards Licensed Customs Brokerage & Logistics Firm 16,195,000$                 380,000$                 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

9 Karnassa Investment Incorporated 19,826,000$                 2,500,000$              Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

10 Excellent Construction Vision 17,480,000$                 380,000$                 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

Date of Tender Opening: February 10th 2026

File Number: Guyana Water Inc (14/2026/45) - Drilling of Potable Water Wells at Karaudarnau



11 Titanium Engineering and Construction Co.Inc. 23,030,000$                 460,600$                 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

12 C.Jorree Farming & Contracting Services 18,685,000$                 380,000$                 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

13 CK Construction & Transportation Services Inc. 17,013,400$                 380,000$                 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

14 A and E Construction,Supplies and Services 17,742,000$                 380,000$                 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

15 Delz General Construction & electrical Services 18,995,000$                 380,000$                 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy

Flash 
drive

1 R. Kissoon Contracting  Service  $           53,900,000.00  $         1,080,000.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
2 Manohar Services  $           50,272,000.00  $         1,040,000.00  Assuria  ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
3 Monarch Investments  $           47,040,000.00  $         1,020,000.00  Premier  ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
4 Expert Buikders & Supplies Contractors  $           54,400,000.00  $         1,080,000.00  Premier  ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
5 Karnassa Investment Inc.  $           49,982,000.00  $         2,500,000.00  Caricom  ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
6 Hubbards Licensed Customs Brokerage & Logistics Firm  $           51,530,000.00  $         1,100,000.00  Assuria  ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
7 Morris Jeffrey Enterprise  $           50,184,000.00  $         1,020,000.00  Caricom  ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
8 NP Contracting & Transportation Services  $           46,940,000.00  $         1,020,000.00  Premier  ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

Date of Tender Opening: February 10th 2026

File Number: Guyana Water Inc (15/2026/45) - Drilling of Potable Water Wells at Wara& Kariako
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