Date of Tender Opening: February 17th 2026

File Number: Guyana Water Inc. (16/2026/45) - Installation of Water Supply Systems in Mora Camp & Kalcoon, Lower Mazaruni, Region #7

. . . . . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Bid Security Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency Amount & Currency Agency signed Copy | drive
1 Monarch Investments $ 87,198,000.00| $ 2,000,000 Premier v v v 0 2
2 Faldhari Singh and Son Contracting Services $ 64,000,000.00 | $ 1,900,000 Assuria v v v 0 2
3 Cedar Engineering $ 63,221,000.00 | $ 440,000 Caricom v v v 0 2
4 Expert Builders & Supplies Contractors $ 124,684,000.00 | $ 2,500,000 Premier v v v 0 2
5 LGS Barr.1s General Building Construction & Civil $ 87.534,000.00 | $ 1,750,680 Caricom v v v 0 5
Engineering
6 R .Kissoon Contracting Service $ 123,884,000.00 | $ 2,500,000 Premier v v v 0 2




Date of Tender Opening: 17th February 2026

File Number: Guyana Water Inc. 17/2026/45 - Installation of Water Supply Systems in Dagg Point,Lower Mazaruni,Region # 7

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS Tender |Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency . drive
Currency signed | Copy
1  |RD Construction, Consultancy and Supply Services $ 34,040,800.00 | $ 720,000 Assuria v v v 2
2 |Monarch Investments $ 25,164,800.00 | $ 2,120,000 Premier v v v 2
3 :I[(;lsrléleCOnstmctlon and Transportation Establishment g 29.392,000.00 | $ 587,840 Caricom v v v )
4 |C. Jorree Farming & Contracting Services $ 88,276,000.00 | $ 1,920,000 Premier v v v 2
5 LGS Barpes General Building Construction & Civil 3 82.396,000.00 | $ 1,647.920 Caricom v v v 5
Engineering
6  |Expert Builders & Supplies Contractors $ 29,508,000.00 | $ 600,000 Premier v v v 2
7  |Best Picl Investment Enterprise $ 81,508,000.00 | $ 1,824,000 Caricom v v v 2
8 |R. Kissoon Contracting Service $ 29,498,000.00 | $ 600,000 Premier v v v 2
9  [Manohar Services $ 36,276,000.00 | $ 1,940,000 Assuria v v v 2
10 |Cedar Engineering $ 93,474,500.00 | $ 1,920,000 Caricom v v v 2
11 |Expertedge Consultancy $ 87,914,000.00 | $ 1,758,280 Caricom v v v 2
12 |Faldhari Singh and Son Contracting Services $ 27,000,000.00 | $ 680,000 Assuria v v v 2
13 |R&P Engineering and General Construction $ 30,262,600.00 | $ 900,000 Assuria v v v 2
14 |Fazam Future Builders $ 82,202,000.00 | $ 1,920,000 Caricom v v v 2
Engineer Estimate $ 34,637,000




Date of Tender Opening: 17th February 2026

File Number: Guyana Water Inc. (18/2026/45) - Installation of Water Supply Systems in Wariquima,Turongbang,Abbou and Emoikeng,Upper Mazaruni,Region # 7

. . Bid Securit Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount &y Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS Tender |Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency . drive
Currency signed | Copy
1  |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 126,500,000.00 | $ 2,500,000 Caricom v v v 2
2 Expert Builders & Supplies Contractors $ 174,080,000.00 | $ 3,500,000 Premier v v v 2
3 LGS Barpes General Building Constrcution & Civil 3 147.500,000.00 | $ 295,000 Caricom v v v 3
Engineering
4  |Proaxis Construction Services $ 118,010,000.00 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
5 |R. Kissoon Contracting Service $ 174,040,000.00 | $ 3,500,000 Premier v v v 2
6 |Monarch Investments $ 125,280,000.00 | $ 2,820,000 Premier v v v 2
7  |Cedar Engineering $ 129,000,000.00 | $ 2,620,000 Caricom v v v 2
8 [Manohar Services $ 131,644,000.00 | $ 2,640,000 Assuria v v v 2
9 |C. Jorree Farming & Contracting Services $ 123,276,000.00 | $ 2,620,000 Premier v v v 2
10 [R&P Engineering and General Construction $ 73,142,400.00 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
11  |Vertex Engineering Solution Inc $ 184,613,274.00 | $ 3,692,265 | Premier v v v 2
12 |Hub Construction $ 111,500,000.00 No Bid Security Seen X v v 2
13 |Built Right Construction Services $ 105,708,000.00 | $ 2,114,160 Premier v v v 2
Engineer Estimate $ 131,728,000




Date of Tender Opening: February 17th 2026

File Number: Guyana Water Inc. (19/2026/45) - Supplemental Works at Cotton Tress Water Treatment Plant, Berbice Region #5

Form of

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Bid Security Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency Amount & Currency Agency signed Copy | drive
1 Delz General Construction & Electrical Services $ 15,556,000.00 | $ 320,000 Assuria v v v 0 2
2 Alvin Chowramootoo Construction Services $ 18,517,000.00 | $ 500,000 Caricom v v v 1 2
3 Expert Builders & Supplies Constructors $ 23,986,000.00 | $ 360,000 Premier v v v 0 2
4 |R.M Investment and Supplies $ 16,852,950.00 | $ 252,794 Caricom v v v 0 2
5 Morris Jeffrey Enterprise $ 15,341,100.00 | $ 240,000 Caricom v v v 0 2
6 R. Kissoon Contracting Service $ 23,988,000.00 | $ 360,000 Premier v v v 0 2
7 Johnson's General Construction & Transportation Servives | $ 9,838,000.00 | $ 240,000 Assuria v v v 0 2
8  |Marvin's Contracting Services Form of Tender Not =} ¢ 320,000 Caricom v v v 0 2

Completed or Signed
9 Double M Investments Form ofTender. Not $ 320,000 Caricom v X X 0 2
Completed or Signed
10  |Joshi Construction and Transportation Establishment Three| $ 14,970,000.00 | $ 224,550 Caricom v v v 0 2
11 |Satro Construction Services $ 14,418,000.00 | $ 217,500 Caricom v v v 0 2
12 |MS Trucking & Contracting Services $ 13,913,000.00 | $ 240,000 Premier v v v 0 2




Date of Tender Opening: February 17th 2026

File Number: Guyana Water Inc. (20/2026/45) -Drilling of Potable Water Well in Lower Moraikobai,Region # 5

. ] Bid Security . ) Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency Agency . Copy | drive
Currency signed
1 Alvin Chowramootoo Construction Services $ 35,900,000.00 | $ 720,000 Caricom v v v 1 2
2 K. Kissoon Contrcating Service $ 45,140,000.00 | $ 920,000 Premier v v v 0 2
3 Monarch Investment $ 35,570,000.00 | $ 920,000 Premier v v v 0 2
4  |Marvin's Contracting Services Form of Te“de? Not $ 720,000 Caricom v v X 0 2
Completed or Signed
5  |Manohar Service $ 36,802,000.00 | $ 720,000 Assuria v v v 0 2
6 Supreme Construction and Transportation $ 34,589,000.00 | $ 700,000 Premier v v v 0 2
7 C. Jorree Farming & Construction Services $ 33,344,000.00 | $ 720,000 Premier v v v 0 2
8 |Expert Bulilders & Supplies Contractors $ 45,130,000.00 | $ 920,000 Premier v v v 0 2
9 |Double M Investments Form of Tender Not -1 ¢ 720,000 | Caricom v X X 0 2
Completed or Signed
Engineer Estimate $ 36,702,000




Date of Tender Opening: February 17th 2026

File Number: Guyana Water Inc. (21/2026/45) - Drilling of Portable Water Wells in Siparuta & Orealla Region #6

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Bid Security Bid Security GRA | NIS lfl,(;:llgeif Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency Amount & Currency Agency signed Copy | drive
1 Alvin Chowramootoo Construction Services $ 76,000,000.00 [ $ 1,560,000 Caricom v v v 0 2
2 C. Jorree Farming & Construction Services $ 72,688,000.00 | $ 1,560,000 Premier v v v 0 2
3 Supreme Construction and Transportation $ 76,838,000.00 | $ 1,560,000 Premier v v v 0 2
4 Double M Investments Form ofTender. Not $ 1,560,000 Caricom v X X 0 2

Completed or Signed
5 Roopan Ramotar Investment $ 74,919,000.00 | $ 1,560,000 Assuria v v v 0 2
6 Manohar Services $ 77,312,000.00 | $ 1,580,000 Assuria v v v 0 2
7 Marvin's Contrcating Services Form of Tender Not Conl $ 1,560,000 Caricom v v v 0 2
8 Adamantium Holdings $ 98,780,000.00 | $ 2,000,000 Premier v v v 0 2
9 Karnassa Investment Incorporated $ 71,830,000.00 | $ 2,500,000 Caricom v v v 0 2
10 |Expert Builders & Supplies Contrcators $ 94,680,000.00 | $ 1,900,000 Premier v v v 0 2
11 |R. Kissoon Contracting Service $ 94,700,000.00 | $ 1,900,000 Premier v v v 0 2
12 |Monarch Investments $ 76,040,000.00 | $ 1,760,000 Premier v v v 0 2
Engineer Estimate $ 77,918,000




Date of Tender Opening: 17th February 2026

File Number: Guyana Water Inc. (22/2026/45) - Drilling of Potable Water Wells in Mashabo & Bethany,Region # 2

. . Bid Securit Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount &y Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS Tender |Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency . drive
Currency signed | Copy
1 Karnassa Investment Inc $ 64,586,000.00 | $ 2,500,000 Caricom v v v 2
2 |Expert Builders & Supplies Contractors $ 73,785,000.00 | $ 1,600,000 Premier v v v 2
3 Supreme Construction and Transportation $ 64,878,000.00 | $ 1,300,000 Premier v v v 2
4 |R. Kissoon Contracting Service $ 73,760,000.00 | $ 1,600,000 Premier v v v 2
5  |Vertex Engineering Solution Inc $ 89,109,956.00 | $ 1,782,199 Premier v v v 2
6 Saam General Contracting $ 63,500,000.00 | $ 1,320,000 Premier v v v 1
7  [Manohar Services $ 65,872,000.00 | $ 1,340,000 Assuria v v v 2
8 |Fabra Enterprise Inc $ 52,000,000.00 | $ 1,040,000 Caricom v v v 2
9  |Roopan Ramotar Investment $ 64,309,000.00 | $ 1,320,000 Assuria v v v 2
10 |Monarch Investments $ 63,090,000.00 | $ 1,520,000 Premier v v v 2
Engineer Estimate $ 66,804,000




Date of Tender Opening: February 17th 2026

File Number: Guyana Water Inc. (23/2026/45) - Installation of Water Supply Systems in Batavia & Drilling of Well at School Island, Lower a Mazaruni Region #2

. . . . . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Bid Security Bid Security GRA NIS Tender Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency Amount & Currency Agency signed Copy | drive
1 C. Jorree Farming & Contracting Services $ 64,640,300.00 [ $ 1,400,000 Premier v v v 0 2
2 [North Stone Construction and General Supplies $ 58,185,000.00 | $ 1,163,700 Premier v v v 0 2
3 R. Kissoon Contracting Service $ 78,698,000.00 | $ 1,580,000 Premier v v v 0 2
4 Ultralift (Guyana) Incorporated SI\eI: ZnForm of Tender $ 1,400,000 Caricom v v X 0 2
5 Morris Jeffrey Enterprise $ 67,938,500.00 | $ 1,400,000 Caricom v v v 0 2
6 Manohar Services $ 50,806,000.00 | $ 1,420,000 Assuria v v v 0 2
7 Expert Builders and Supplies Contracting $ 78,498,000.00 | $ 1,580,000 Premier v v v 0 2
8 Expertedge Consultancy $ 66,378,000.00 | $ 1,327,560 Caricom v v v 0 2
9 Fazam Future Builders $ 68,229,000.00 | $ 1,400,000 Caricom v v v 0 2
10 |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 66,306,500.00 | $ 2,500,000 Caricom v v v 0 2
11 |Monarch Investments $ 68,964,000.00 | $ 1,600,000 Premier v v v 0 2
12 |Karnassa Investment Incorporated $ 66,631,500.00 | $ 2,500,000 Caricom v v v 0 2
13 LGS Ba@es General Building Construction & Civil $ 68.209,000.00 | $ 1,264,180 Caricom J J J 0 )
Engineering
Engineer Estimate $ 70,647,000




Date of Tender Opening: 17th February 2026

File Number: Guyana Water Inc. (24/2026/45) - Drilling of Potable Water Well in Waramadong,Region # 7

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS Tender |Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency . drive
Currency signed | Copy
1 Monarch Investments $ 34,690,000.00 | $ 920,000 Premier v v v 2
2 |Karnassa Investment Inc $ 34,811,000.00 | $ 2,500,000 Caricom v v v 2
3 |Expert Builders & Supplies Contractors $ 49,340,000.00 | $ 1,000,000 Premier v v v 2
4  |Morris Jeffrey Enterprise $ 34,708,000.00 | $ 720,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |C. Jorree Farming & Contracting Services $ 32,950,000.00 | $ 720,000 Premier v v v 2
6 |R. Kissoon Contracting Service $ 49,330,000.00 | $ 1,000,000 Premier v v v 2
. :I[(;lsrléleCOnstmctlon and Transportation Establishment g 35.760,000.00 | 714,000 Caricom v v v )
8 [Manohar Services $ 35,936,000.00 | $ 740,000 Assuria v v v 2
Engineer Estimate $ 36,647,000




Date of Tender Opening: 17th February 2026

File Number: Guyana Water Inc. (25/2026/45) - Installation of Water Supply System In Kato,Region # 8

. . Bid Securit Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount &y Bid Security Agency| GRA [ NIS Tender Hard Fla'sh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 E;;Elbards Licensed Customs Brokerage & Logistics 3 47.920,000.00 | $ 1,000,000 Assuria v v v )
2 |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 47,620,000.00 | $ 2,500,000 Caricom v v v 2
3  |Karnassa Investment Inc $ 46,520,000.00 | $ 2,500,000 Caricom v v v 2
4 |D&R Construction and Machinery Rental $ 48,710,000.00 | $ 1,000,000 Caricom v v v 2
5  |Built Right Construction Services $ 42,000,000.00 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
6 |Proaxis Construction Services $ 39,992,000.00 | $ 799,840 | Premier v v v 2
7 Eco Build Development $ 43,958,000.00 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
8 |Faldhari Singh and Son Contracting Services $ 45,000,000.00 | $ 1,000,000 Assuria v v v 2
9 |C. Jorree Farming & Contracting Services $ 45,080,000.00 | $ 1,000,000 Premier v v v 2
10  |Nk Engineering Services $ 49,550,000.00 | $ 1,000,000 Caricom v v v 2
11 |N and A Construction $ 46,130,000.00 | $ 922,600 Caricom v v v 2
B :I[(;lsr};ieCOnstmction and Transportation Establishment g 47.350,000.00 | $ 947,000 Caricom v v v )
13  [Alvin Chowramootoo Construction Services $ 49,800,000.00 | $ 1,000,000 Caricom v v v 1 2
14 |Monarch Investments $ 49,700,000.00 | $ 1,200,000 Premier v v v 2
15 [R. Kissoon Contracting Service $ 52,600,000.00 | $ 1,060,000 Premier v v v 2
16 |Expert Builders & Supplies Contractors $ 52,800,000.00 | $ 1,060,000 Premier v v v 2
17 |Fazam Future Builders $ 43,560,000.00 | $ 1,000,000 Caricom v v v 2
18 |Manohar Services $ 47,250,000.00 | $ 1,020,000 Assuria v v v 2
19 |R&P Engineering and General Construction $ 38,150,000.00 | $ 900,000 Assuria v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: February 17th 2026

File Number: Guyana Water Inc. (26/2026/45) - Installation of Water Supply Systems in Wayaleng, Upper Mazaruni, Region #7

Form of

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Bid Security Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency Amount & Currency Agency signed Copy | drive
1 VRP Investment $ 20,500,000.00| $ 410,000 Assuria v v v 0 2
2 Fazam Future Builders $ 19,110,000.00 | $ 440,000 Caricom v v v 0 2
3 D&R Construction and Machinery Rental $ 21,156,000.00 | $ 440,000 Caricom v v v 0 2
4 Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 21,617,000.00 | $ 2,500,000 Caricom v v v 0 2
5 Monarch Investments $ 20,215,000.00 | $ 640,000 Premier v v v 0 2
6  |Expert Builders and Supplies Contracting $ 23,400,000.00 | $ 480,000 Premier v v v 0 2
7 Manohar Services $ 22,056,000.00 | $ 460,000 Assuria v v v 0 2
8 Ultralift (Guyana) Incorporated $ 23,370,000.00 | $ 440,000 Caricom v v v 0 2
9 R. Kissoon Contracting Service $ 23,390,000.00 | $ 480,000 Premier v v v 0 2
10 |Joshi Construction and Transportation Establishment Three| $ 21,226,000.00 | $ 424,520 Caricom v v v 0 2

Engineer Estimate $ 22,127,000




Date of Tender Opening: 17th February 2026

File Number: Guyana Water Inc. (28/2026/45) - Supply & Delivery of Well Discharge Materials,Pipes,Pumps & Spares for Drilling Rig,Lots 1-4

. . Bid Securit Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount &y Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS Tender |Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency . drive
Currency signed | Copy

1 R. Kissoon Contracting Service Lot 1 $ 36,824,000.00 | $ 585,000 Premier v v v 1
R. Kissoon Contracting Service Lot 2 $ 173,660,000.00 | $ 2,640,000 v v v
R. Kissoon Contracting Service Lot 3 $ 77,190,000.00 | $ 1,185,000 v v v
R. Kissoon Contracting Service Lot 4 $ 23,460,000.00 | $ 390,000 v v v
v v v

2 |Expert Builders & Supplies Contractors Lot 1 $ 36,814,000.00 | $ 585,000 v v v 2
2 |Expert Builders & Supplies Contractors Lot 2 $ 173,650,000.00 | $ 2,640,000 v v v
2 |Expert Builders & Supplies Contractors Lot 3 $ 77,178,000.00 | $ 1,185,000 v v v
2 |Expert Builders & Supplies Contractors Lot 4 $ 23,445,000.00 | $ 390,000 v v v
v v v

3 Saam General Contracting Lot 3 $ 188,626,562.00 | $ 4,500,000 Premier v v v 1
v v v

4 Pruvest Inc Lot 2 $ 232,515,383.00 | $ 3,487,731 Premier v v v 2
4 Pruvest Inc Lot 3 $ 90,264,200.00 | $ 1,353,963 v v v
v v v

5 |Dax Contracting Services Lot 2 $ 207,350,000.00 | $ 4,000,000 Caricom v v v 1
v v v

6 |Gafsons Industries Limited Lot 1 $ 1,307,000.00 | $ 23,000 Republic Bank v v v 2
6 |Gafsons Industries Limited Lot 3 $ 120,515,000.00 | $ 1,912,725 v v v
v v v

7  |General Procurement and Construction Inc Lot 1 $ 55,438,280.00 | $ 831,574 Premier v v v 2
7  |General Procurement and Construction Inc Lot 2 $ 324,470,469.00 | $ 4,867,057 v v v
7  |General Procurement and Construction Inc Lot 3 $ 366,356,000.00 | $ 5,495,340 v v v
7  |General Procurement and Construction Inc Lot 4 $ 18,990,345.00 | $ 284,855 v v v
v v v

8 |DCSN Construction and General Supplies Inc Lot 1 $ 45,490,000.00 | $ 750,000 Premier v v v 2
8 |DCSN Construction and General Supplies Inc Lot 2 $ 158,690,000.00 | $ 3,000,000 v v v
8 |DCSN Construction and General Supplies Inc Lot 3 $ 218,120,000.00 | $ 4,500,000 v v v
8 |DCSN Construction and General Supplies Inc Lot 4 $ 29,450,000.00 | $ 750,000 v v v




v v v
9  |Arka Imports and Hardware Supplies Lot 1 $ 36,181,140.00 | $ 542,717 Premier v v v
9 |Arka Imports and Hardware Supplies Lot 2 $ 155,850,000.00 | $ 2,337,750 v v v
9  |Arka Imports and Hardware Supplies Lot 3 $ 116,360,000.00 | $ 1,745,400 v v v
v v v
10 |Toolsie Persaud Ltd Lot 3 $ 168,565,288.00 | $ 3,200,000 Caricom v v v




Date of Tender Opening: 17th February 2026

File Number: Guyana Water Inc (30/2026/45) - Installation of Water Supply Systems Re

gion #10 Lots 1and 2

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency| GRA [ NIS Tender Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 Supreme Wood Products lot 1 $ 57,855,100.00 | $ 2,740,000 Assuria v v v 2
2 |Fabra Enterprise Inc Lot 1 $ 55,000,000.00 | $ 2,260,000 Caricom v v v 2
2 |Fabra Enterprise Inc Lot 2 $ 58,000,000.00 | $ 2,260,000 Caricom v v v
3  |Urban Road Builders lot 1 $ 116,600,000.00 No Bid Securitv Seen v v v 2
3 Urban Road Builders lot 2 $ 113,960,000.00 y v v v
4  [Built Right Construction Services Lot 1 $ 122,590,000.00 No Bid Securitv Seen v v v 2
4  |Built Right Construction Services Lot 2 $ 124,180,000.00 y v v v
5 [Manohar Services lot 1 $ 72,552,000.00 | $ 2,760,000 Assuria v v v 2
5 |Manohar Services lot 2 $ 64,042,000.00 v v v
6 |R. Kissoon Contracting Service lot 1 $ 91,715,000.00 | $ 3,600,000 Premier v v v 2
6 |R. Kissoon Contracting Service lot 2 $ 84,685,000.00 v v v
7  |Alvin Chowramootoo Construction Services lot 1 $ 72,055,000.00 | $ 2,740,000 Caricom v v v 1 2
7  |Alvin Chowramootoo Construction Services lot 2 $ 64,845,000.00 | $ 2,740,000 v v v
8 [Monarch Investments Lot 1 $ 75,760,000.00 | $ 2,940,000 Premier v v v 2
8 [Monarch Investments Lot 2 $ 59,690,000.00 v v v
9 [Clean Star Construction Services FTP not completed $ 2,620,000 Premier v v v 2
10 |C. Jorree Farming & Contracting Services Lot 1 $ 69,023,000.00 | $ 2,740,000 Premier v v v 2
10 |C. Jorree Farming & Contracting Services Lot 2 $ 59,168,000.00 v v v
11  |Supreme Construction and Transportation lot 1 $ 70,555,000.00 | $ 1,480,000 Premier v v v 2
11  |Supreme Construction and Transportation lot 2 $ 59,778,000.00 v v v




12 |Expert Builders & Supplies Contractors lot 1 91,690,000.00 3,600,000 Premier v v v
12 |Expert Builders & Supplies Contractors lot 2 84,660,000.00 v v v
13 |NK Engineering Services Lot 2 138,705,000.00 2,740,000 Caricom v v v
14 |Vertex Engineering Solution Inc lot 1 103,281,827.00 3,975,461 Premier v v v
14  [Vertex Engineering Solution Inc lot 2 95,491,232.00 v v v
15 |Karnassa Investment Inc Lot 1 70,272,000.00 2,500,000 Caricom v v v
Karnassa Investment Inc Lot 2 64,306,000.00 v v v
16 |Proaxis Construction Services Lot 1 109,655,000.00 No Bid Security Seen v v v
16 |Proaxis Construction Services Lot 2 102,430,000.00 y v v v
17 |Best Development Wor & Supplies Lot 1 114,980,000.00 : : v v v
No Bid S ty S
17 |Best Development Wor & Supplies Lot 2 93,350,000.00 0 BIC SeciTily Sedll v v v
18 Joshi Constructiona dn Transportation Establishment £8,020,000.00 2.673.700 Caricom v v v
Three lot 1
18 Joshi Constructiona dn Transportation Establishment 45.545,000.00 v v v
Three lot 2
19  |Andrect Engineering & Construction Lot 1 71,332,000.00 2,500,000 Caricom v v v
19  |Andrect Engineering & Construction Lot 2 63,156,000.00 v v v
20 [D&R Construction and Machinery Rental Lot 1 71,208,000.00 2,740,000 Caricom v v v
20 [D&R Construction and Machinery Rental Lot 2 65,232,000.00 2,740,000 v v v
21 |R&P Engineering and General Construction Lot 1 52,888,200.00 900,000 Assuria v v v
21 |R&P Engineering and General Construction Lot 2 47,231,200.00 v v v
22 [Satro Construction Services Lot 1 66,815,000.00 2,740,000 Caricom v v v
22 [Satro Construction Services Lot 2 62,870,000.00 v v v
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