Date of Tender Opening: February 18, 2025

File Number: Guyana Water Inc (37/2025/45) - Supply & Delivery of Ductile Iron Pipes Fittings & Appurtenances Lots 1-5

i . Bid Security Form
Bidder . Bid Amount & . . of Hard | Flash
No. Name of Bidder Currency Ag:l (::2;5; Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender | Copy | drive
1 |David Persaud Investment Limited L1 S 6,490,000 $ 2,250,000 Diamond Arani 2
1 |David Persaud Investment Limited L2 $ 30,466,400
1 |David Persaud Investment Limited L3 $ 24,493,000
2 |C&L Construction Inc L5 $ 63,960,000f $ 975,000 Premier v | V| VY 2
3 |Alliance Investments L5 $ 17,409,000, $ 261,135 Premier v | V|V 2 0
4 |Dax Contracting Services L1 $ 40,920,000, $ 650,000 Caricom v | V| VY 1
4 |Dax Contracting Services .2 $ 18,900,000f $ 400,000
4 |Dax Contracting Services L3 $ 32,632,000 $ 550,000
4 |Dax Contracting Services L4 $ 22,990,000/ $ 500,000
4 |Dax Contracting Services L5 $ 47,950,000 $ 750,000
5 inmcpﬁcicable Construction & General Supplies $ 23425200 | §  1412.425 Caricom JIv! v 5
5 Impeccable Construction & General Supplies $ 3,174,444 (L1-5)
Inc L2
5 Impeccable Construction & General Supplies S 13.852.641.60
Inc L3
5 Impeccable Construction & General Supplies $ 54,942,300
Inc 4
5 Impeccable Construction & General Supplies $ 19.987.506

Inc LS




S. Jagmohan Construction & General

6 . $ 43,937,057 | $ 1,500,000 Premier
Supplies Inc L1
6 S. Jagmohan Construction & General $ 4134602 | S 1,500,000
Supplies Inc 1.2
6 S. Jagmohan Construction & General $ 15891717 | $ 1,500,000
Supplies Inc L3
6 S.J agmohan Construction & General $ 59.825.752 | $ 1,500,000
Supplies Inc 1.4
6 S. Jagmohan Construction & General $ 24,838,546 | S 1.500,000
Supplies Inc L5
7 |ARKA Import & Hardware Supplies L1 $ 23,429,500 | $ 351,443 Premier
7 |ARKA Import & Hardware Supplies .2 $ 31,140,000 | $ 467,100
7 |ARKA Import & Hardware Supplies L3 $ 17,782,400 | $ 266,736
7 |ARKA Import & Hardware Supplies L4 $ 19,095,000 | $ 286,425
7 |ARKA Import & Hardware Supplies L5 $ 19,095,000 | $ 286,425
8 |Jeetendra Enterprise L1 $ 81,660,000 | $ 1,230,000 Premier
8 |Jeetendra Enterprise .2 $ 67,380,000 | $ 1,005,000
8 |Jeetendra Enterprise L3 $ 48,804,000 | $ 735,000
8 |Jeetendra Enterprise L5 $ 65,405,000 | $ 990,000
9 |Toolsie Persaud Limited L1 $ 25,765,500 | $ 450,000 Caricom
9 |Toolsie Persaud Limited L2 $ 35,275,460 | $ 600,000
9 |Toolsie Persaud Limited L3 $ 17,218,107 | $ 300,000
9 |Toolsie Persaud Limited L5 $ 28,970,089 | $ 450,000
10 |R. Kissoon Contracting Services L1 $ 52,125,230 | $ 4,245,000 Premier
10 |R. Kissoon Contracting Services L2 $ 18,100,000 (L1-5)
10 |R. Kissoon Contracting Services L3 $ 22,333,035
10 |R. Kissoon Contracting Services [ 4 $ 103,200,000




10 |R. Kissoon Contracting Services L5 $ 35,993,432

11 |RAPS Investments L1 $ 13,160,000 No Bid Security Seen
11 |RAPS Investments L2 $ 4,080,000

11 |RAPS Investments L3 $ 32,691,000

11 |RAPS Investments L4 $ 25,350,000

11 |RAPS Investments L5 $ 39,205,333

12 |AAQIB Consultancy L1 $ 25,035,846 | § 1,864,151 Caricom
12 |AAQIB Consultancy .2 $ 4,141,620 (L1-5)

12 |AAQIB Consultancy L3 $ 15,443,454.60

12 |AAQIB Consultancy L4 $ 55,078,758

12 |AAQIB Consultancy L5 $ 20,667,402




Date of Tender Opening: February 18, 2025

File Number: Guyana Water Inc (37/2025/45) - Supply & Delivery of Ductile Iron Pipes Fittings & Appurtenances Lots 1-5

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder . Bid Amount & . ) Hard | Flash
No. Name of Bidder Currency %ﬁ?::; c&; Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS ’l;i:;l(ll:s Copy| drive
1 |David Persaud Investment Limited L1 $ 6,490,000 $ 2,250,000 Diamond v v v 2
1 |David Persaud Investment Limited L2 $ 30,466,400
1 |David Persaud Investment Limited L3 $ 24,493,000
2 |C&L Construction Inc L5 $ 63,960,000 $ 975,000 Premier v v v 2
3 |Alliance Investments L5 $ 17,409,000 $ 261,135 Premier v v v 2 0
4 |Dax Contracting Services L1 $ 40,920,000{ $ 650,000 Caricom v v v 1
4 |Dax Contracting Services .2 $ 18,900,000 $ 400,000
4 |Dax Contracting Services L3 $ 32,632,000 $ 550,000
4 |Dax Contracting Services L4 $ 22,990,000 $ 500,000
4 |Dax Contracting Services L5 $ 47,950,000( $ 750,000
5 Impec.cable Construction & General $ 23425290 | $ 1,412,425 Caricom v v v )
Supplies Inc L1
Impeccable Construction & General
. 4,444 L1-
S Supplies Inc L2 5 3,174, (L1-5)
5 Impec.cable Construction & General § 13.852.641.60
Supplies Inc L3
5 Impeccable Construction & General $ 54.942.300

Supplies Inc L4




Impeccable Construction & General

S Supplies Inc L5 5 19,987,506
6 S.J agmohan Construction & General $ 43.937.057 | S 1.500,000 Premier
Supplies Inc L1
6 S.J agmohan Construction & General $ 42134602 | S 1,500,000
Supplies Inc L2
6 S.J agmohan Construction & General $ 15.891.717 |'$ 1,500,000
Supplies Inc L3
6 S.J agmohan Construction & General $ 59.825.752 | $ 1,500,000
Supplies Inc L4
6 S.J agmohan Construction & General $ 24.838.546 | $ 1,500,000
Supplies Inc L5
7 |ARKA Import & Hardware Supplies L1 $ 23,429,500 | $ 351,443 Premier
7 |ARKA Import & Hardware Supplies L2 $ 31,140,000 | $ 467,100
7 |ARKA Import & Hardware Supplies L3 $ 17,782,400 | $ 266,736
7 |ARKA Import & Hardware Supplies L4 $ 19,095,000 | $ 286,425
7 |ARKA Import & Hardware Supplies L5 $ 19,095,000 | $ 286,425
8 |Jeetendra Enterprise L1 $ 81,660,000 | $ 1,230,000 Premier
8 |Jeetendra Enterprise L2 $ 67,380,000 | $ 1,005,000
8 |Jeetendra Enterprise L3 $ 48,804,000 | $ 735,000
8 |Jeetendra Enterprise L5 $ 65,405,000 | $ 990,000
9 |Toolsie Persaud Limited L1 $ 25,765,500 | $ 450,000 Caricom




9 |Toolsie Persaud Limited 1.2 $ 35,275,460 | $ 600,000

9 |Toolsie Persaud Limited L3 $ 17,218,107 | $ 300,000

9 |Toolsie Persaud Limited L5 $ 28,970,089 | $ 450,000

10 |R. Kissoon Contracting Services L1 $ 52,125,230 | $ 4,245,000 Premier
10 |R. Kissoon Contracting Services [.2 $ 18,100,000 (L1-5)

10 |R. Kissoon Contracting Services L3 $ 22,333,035

10 |R. Kissoon Contracting Services L4 $ 103,200,000

10 |R. Kissoon Contracting Services L5 $ 35,993,432

11 |RAPS Investments L1 $ 13,160,000 No Bid Security Se
11 |RAPS Investments L2 $ 4,080,000

11 |[RAPS Investments L3 $ 32,691,000

11 |RAPS Investments L4 $ 25,350,000

11 [RAPS Investments L5 $ 39,205,333

12 |AAQIB Consultancy L1 $ 25,035,846 | $ 1,864,151 Caricom
12 |AAQIB Consultancy L2 $ 4,141,620 (L1-5)

12 |AAQIB Consultancy L3 $ 15,443,454.60

12 |AAQIB Consultancy L4 $ 55,078,758

12 |AAQIB Consultancy L5 $ 20,667,402




Date of Tender Opening: February 18, 2025

File Number: Guyana Revenue Authority (18/2025/03) - Supply & Delivery of Information Technology Equipment

. Bi ri Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Aiu?ﬁflltl &ty Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS | Tender |2rd | Flash
No. Currency ) Copy | drive
Currency signed

1 |Barker Systems L1 $ 93,217,706.40 | $ 3,515,754 Assuria v v v 1
1 |Barker Systems [.2 $  6,552,783.30 (L1-15)

1 |Barker Systems L3 $ 12,310,930.80

1 |Barker Systems 1.4 $ 6,719,687.10

1 |Barker Systems L5 $  3,194,100.00

1 |Barker Systems L6 $  6,546,540.00

1 |Barker Systems L7 $ 8,476,650.00

1 |Barker Systems L8 $ 1,075,092.90

1 |Barker Systems L9 $ 2,365,332.90

1 |Barker Systems L10 $ 1,128,922.20

1 |Barker Systems L11 $ 295,680.00

1 |Barker Systems L12 $ 27,436,500.00

1 |Barker Systems L13 $ 1,538,964.00

1 |Barker Systems L14 $ 2,403,525.60

1 |Barker Systems L15 $ 2,525,250.00

2 |Blizz Core Technology Guyana Inc L1 $ 124,200,000 | $ 195,000 Assuria v v v 2
2 |Blizz Core Technology Guyana Inc 1.2 $ 8,960,000

2 |Blizz Core Technology Guyana Inc L3 $ 16,800,000

2 |Blizz Core Technology Guyana Inc 1.4 $ 9,975,000

2 |Blizz Core Technology Guyana Inc L5 $ 3,762,000

2 |Blizz Core Technology Guyana Inc L6 $ 10,800,000

2 |Blizz Core Technology Guyana Inc L7 $ 3,450,000

2 |Blizz Core Technology Guyana Inc L8 $ 800,000

2 |Blizz Core Technology Guyana Inc L9 $ 3,200,000

2 |Blizz Core Technology Guyana Inc L10 $ 1,750,000

2 |Blizz Core Technology Guyana Inc L11 $ 684,000




2 |Blizz Core Technology Guyana Inc 1.12 $ 22,230,000
2 |Blizz Core Technology Guyana Inc L13 $ 1,812,600
2 |Blizz Core Technology Guyana Inc L14 $ 3,600,000
2 |Blizz Core Technology Guyana Inc L15 $ 3,135,000
3 |RS Conex Investment & Management Inc L1 $ 96,140,000 | $ 6,500,000 Caricom
3 |RS Conex Investment & Management Inc L2 $ 8,904,000
3 |RS Conex Investment & Management Inc L3 $ 10,230,000
3 |RS Conex Investment & Management Inc L4 $ 8,750,000
3 |RS Conex Investment & Management Inc L8 $ 2,600,000
3 |RS Conex Investment & Management Inc L9 $ 3,120,000
3 |RS Conex Investment & Management Inc L10 $ 12,180,000
3 |RS Conex Investment & Management Inc L11 $ 500,000
3 |RS Conex Investment & Management Inc L13 $ 1,701,000
3 |RS Conex Investment & Management Inc L14 $ 1,086,000
4 |MAEC Enterprises L1 $ 89,828,800 | $ 3,232,373 Assuria
4 |MAEC Enterprises 1.2 $ 6,804,000
4 |MAEC Enterprises L3 $ 9,627,000
4 |MAEC Enterprises 1.4 $ 7,250,000
4 |MAEC Enterprises L5 $ 4,896,600
4 |MAEC Enterprises L6 $ 8,412,000
4 |MAEC Enterprises L7 $ 4,500,000
4 |MAEC Enterprises L8 $ 1,644,000
4 |MAEC Enterprises L9 $ 2,084,000
4 |MAEC Enterprises L10 $ 1,135,260
4 |MAEC Enterprises L11 $ 424,000
4 |MAEC Enterprises L12 $ 18,000,000
4 |MAEC Enterprises L13 $ 2,161,470
4 |MAEC Enterprises L14 $ 1,764,000
4 |MAEC Enterprises L15 $ 3,187,500




5 |Yamin Investments L6 $ 6,700,000 | $ 354,220 Premier
5 |Yamin Investments L7 $ 3,840,000
5 |Yamin Investments L8 $ 2,000,000
5 |Yamin Investments L9 $ 2,320,000
5 |Yamin Investments L10 $ 8,260,000
5 |Yamin Investments L15 $ 2,025,000
6 |Zenith Services Inc L1 $ 61,468,420 | $ 3,200,000 Assuria
6 |Zenith Services Inc L2 $ 8,490,902
6 |Zenith Services Inc L3 $ 9,200,880
6 |Zenith Services Inc L4 $ 7,794,575
6 |Zenith Services Inc L5 $ 3,606,600
6 |Zenith Services Inc L6 $ 9,329,560
6 |Zenith Services Inc L7 $ 4,317,390
6 |Zenith Services Inc L8 $ 1,923,040
6 |Zenith Services Inc L9 $ 2,995,280
6 |Zenith Services Inc L10 $ 1,108,968
6 |Zenith Services Inc L11 $ 750,900
6 |Zenith Services Inc L12 $ 33,110,115
6 |Zenith Services Inc L13 $ 2,120,043
6 |Zenith Services Inc L14 $ 4,511,385
6 |Zenith Services Inc L15 $ 2,096,400
7 |Keyboard Kiosk L1 $ 100,000,000 | $§ 4,472,000 Assuria
7 |Keyboard Kiosk L2 $ 9,800,000
7 |Keyboard Kiosk L3 $ 15,000,000
7 |Keyboard Kiosk L4 $ 12,500,000
7 |Keyboard Kiosk L5 $ 6,000,000
7 |Keyboard Kiosk L6 $ 10,000,000
7 |Keyboard Kiosk L7 $ 7,000,000




7 |Keyboard Kiosk L8 $ 4,000,000
7 |Keyboard Kiosk L9 $ 8,000,000
7 |Keyboard Kiosk L10 $ 2,100,000
7 |Keyboard Kiosk L11 $ 700,000
7 |Keyboard Kiosk L12 $ 25,500,000
7 |Keyboard Kiosk L14 $ 18,000,000
7 |Keyboard Kiosk L15 $ 5,000,000
8 |Nationwide Imports L1 $ 119,945,000 | § 4,269,983 Caricom
8 |Nationwide Imports .2 $ 4,939,200
8 |Nationwide Imports L3 $ 6,510,000
8 |Nationwide Imports 1.4 $ 6,250,000
8 |Nationwide Imports L5 $ 8,290,500
8 |Nationwide Imports L6 $ 1,202,000
8 |Nationwide Imports L7 $ 9,592,140
8 |Nationwide Imports L8 $ 5,224,000
8 |Nationwide Imports L9 $ 6,640,000
8 [Nationwide Imports L10 $ 2,044,000
8 |Nationwide Imports L11 $ 1,778,000
8 |Nationwide Imports L12 $ 22,254,222
8 |Nationwide Imports L13 $ 2,592,273
8 |Nationwide Imports L14 $ 787,800
8 |Nationwide Imports L15 $ 4,650,000
9 |Robin Sarbdial Enterprise L1 $ 53,935,000 | § 2,275,800 Assuria
9 |Robin Sarbdial Enterprise L2 $ 3,780,000
9 |Robin Sarbdial Enterprise L3 $ 7,500,000
9 |Robin Sarbdial Enterprise L4 $ 5,000,000
9 |Robin Sarbdial Enterprise L5 $ 4,500,000
9 |Robin Sarbdial Enterprise L6 $ 7,000,000
9 |Robin Sarbdial Enterprise L7 $ 6,000,000




9 |Robin Sarbdial Enterprise L8 $ 1,720,000

9 |Robin Sarbdial Enterprise L9 $ 1,960,000

9 |Robin Sarbdial Enterprise L10 $ 1,400,000

9 |Robin Sarbdial Enterprise L11 $ 1,000,000

9 |Robin Sarbdial Enterprise L12 $ 13,500,000

9 |Robin Sarbdial Enterprise 13 $ 3,200,000

9 |Robin Sarbdial Enterprise L14 $ 795,000

9 |Robin Sarbdial Enterprise L15 $ 2,500,000

10 |Synetech L1 $ 63,250,000 | $ 2,000,000 Assuria
10 |Synetech L2 $ 5,208,000

10 |Synetech L3 $ 7,980,000

10 |Synetech L4 $ 7,625,000

10 |Synetech L5 $ 2,820,000

10 |Synetech L8 $ 1,760,000

10 |Synetech L9 $ 2,160,000

10 |Synetech L10 $ 1,596,000

11 |A&M Procuring & Construction Services L8 $ 2,972320 | $ 2,972,320 Premier
11 |A&M Procuring & Construction Services L11 $ 580,000 | $ 580,000

11 |A&M Procuring & Construction Services L15 $ 3,050,000 | $ 3,050,000

12 |Clickbait L10 $ 2,956,399 | $ 2,956,399 Assuria
12 |Clickbait L11 $ 1,058,200 | $ 1,058,200

12 |Clickbait L13 $ 2,804,094 | § 2,804,094

13 |CompuDel Business & IT Solutions L5 $ 3,623,832 | $ 931,399 Premier
13 |CompuDel Business & IT Solutions L6 $ 5,334,698

13 |CompuDel Business & IT Solutions L7 $ 4,593,120

13 |CompuDel Business & IT Solutions L8 $ 1,724,080

13 |CompuDel Business & IT Solutions L9 $ 1,909,600




13 |CompuDel Business & IT Solutions L12 $ 27,336,624
13 |CompuDel Business & IT Solutions L15 $ 2,048,010
14 |Alliance Investments 1.2 $ 11,642,400 | $ 1,389,812 Premier
14 |Alliance Investments L3 $ 8,910,000
14 |Alliance Investments L4 $ 8,000,000
14 |Alliance Investments L5 $ 4,500,000
14 |Alliance Investments L6 $ 17,820,000
14 |Alliance Investments L7 $ 7,128,000
14 |Alliance Investments L8 $ 2,024,000
14 |Alliance Investments L9 $ 2,376,000
14 |Alliance Investments L10 $ 1,680,000
14 |Alliance Investments L11 $ 475,200
14 |Alliance Investments L14 $ 1,800,000
14 |Alliance Investments L15 $ 3,135,000
15 |PBS Technologies Guyana Inc L1 $ 60,398,250.00 | $ 2,670,241 Premier
15 |PBS Technologies Guyana Inc L2 $  4,521,942.17
15 |PBS Technologies Guyana Inc L3 $  7,849,193.48
15 |PBS Technologies Guyana Inc L4 $  5,604,201.09
15 |PBS Technologies Guyana Inc L5 $  3,250,040.87
15 |PBS Technologies Guyana Inc L6 $  4,936,369.57
15 |PBS Technologies Guyana Inc L7 $  4,182,556.30
15 |PBS Technologies Guyana Inc L8 $  1,682,713.04
15 |PBS Technologies Guyana Inc L9 $  1,886,069.57
15 |PBS Technologies Guyana Inc L10 $  1,173,915.22
15 |PBS Technologies Guyana Inc L11 $ 474,012.00
15 |PBS Technologies Guyana Inc L12 $  27,927,682.76
15 |PBS Technologies Guyana Inc L13 $ 978,832.27
15 |PBS Technologies Guyana Inc L14 $  6,996,856.09
15 |PBS Technologies Guyana Inc L15 $  1,649,452.99




16 |C Mobile L1 $ 88,777,700 | $ 3,632,684 Nafico
16 |C Mobile L2 $ 9,014,513
16 |C Mobile L3 $ 9,643,095
16 |C Mobile L4 $ 9,117,108
16 |C Mobile L5 $ 3,029,786
16 |C Mobile L6 $ 7,956,930
16 |C Mobile L7 $ 4,466,850
16 |C Mobile L8 $ 2,436,572
16 |C Mobile L9 $ 3,426,429
16 |C Mobile L10 $ 1,758,900
16 |C Mobile L11 $ 487,314
16 |[C Mobile L12 $ 33,639,224
16 |C Mobile L13 $ 2,512,715
16 |C Mobile L14 $ 2,275,102
16 |C Mobile L15 $ 2,189,107
17 |PromoTech Guyana L1 $ 61,225,12854 | % 2,600,000 Premier
17 |PromoTech Guyana L2 $ 5,513,872.90
17 |PromoTech Guyana L3 $  7,689,793.25
17 |PromoTech Guyana L4 $  6,802,814.29
17 |PromoTech Guyana L5 $ 2,663,112.38
17 |PromoTech Guyana L6 $  6,139,606.78
17 |PromoTech Guyana L7 $  3,938,405.63
17 |PromoTech Guyana L8 $ 1,395,120.80
17 |PromoTech Guyana L9 $ 1,622,072.99
17 |PromoTech Guyana L10 $ 1,708,392.84
17 |PromoTech Guyana L11 $ 456,104.88
17 |PromoTech Guyana L12 $ 24,647,378.92
17 |PromoTech Guyana LL13

17 |PromoTech Guyana L14 $ 1,106,504.44




17 |PromoTech Guyana L15 $ 2,629.729.70
18 |KM Technology L1 $ 67,160,000 | $ 2.247.174 Diamond
18 |KM Technology L2 $ 5,138,000
18 |KM Technology L3 $ 9,450,000
18 |KM Technology L4 $ 7,150,000
18 |KM Technology L5 $ 4,907,187
18 |KM Technology L6 $ 5,460,000
18 |KM Technology L7 $ 3,600,000
18 |KM Technology L8 $ 1,600,000
18 |KM Technology L9 $ 1,840,000
18 |KM Technology L10 $ 1,330,000
18 |KM Technology L14 $ 2,817,000
18 |KM Technology L15 $ 1,852,500
19 |Micro Design Technology L1 $ 65,780,000 | § 2,674,610 Nafico
19 |Micro Design Technology 1.2 $ 5,544,000
19 |Micro Design Technology L3 $ 7,801,200
19 |Micro Design Technology L4 $ 7,700,000
19 |Micro Design Technology L5 $ 3,171,000
19 | Micro Design Technology L6 $ 5,504,400
19 | Micro Design Technology L7 $ 4,510,800
19 | Micro Design Technology L8 $ 1,997,600
19 |Micro Design Technology L9 $ 1,980,000
19 | Micro Design Technology L10 $ 1,441,440
19 | Micro Design Technology L11 $ 440,000
19 | Micro Design Technology L12 $ 25,740,000
19 |Micro Design Technology L13

19 | Micro Design Technology L14 $ 853,380
19 | Micro Design Technology L15 $ 1,969,000




20 |Starr Computer Inc L1 $ 63,457,000 | $ 2,050,000 Premier
20 |[Starr Computer Inc L2 $ 5,822,600
20 |[Starr Computer Inc L3 $ 6,549,520
20 |[Starr Computer Inc L4 $ 5,378,020
20 |Starr Computer Inc L5 $ 4,797,000
20 |[Starr Computer Inc L6 $ 5,618,000
20 |[Starr Computer Inc L7 $ 3,687,000
20 |[Starr Computer Inc L8 $ 1,440,000
20 |[Starr Computer Inc L9 $ 1,560,000
20 |Starr Computer Inc L14 $ 783,220
20 |[Starr Computer Inc L15 $ 1,597,500
21 |Cellphone Shack L1 $ 126,556,925 | $ 6,212,726 Premier
21 |Cellphone Shack 1.2 $ 11,440,133
21 |Cellphone Shack L3 $ 15,410,348
21 |Cellphone Shack L4 $ 18,873,580
21 |Cellphone Shack L5 $ 4,506,500
21 |Cellphone Shack L6 $ 16,552,800
21 |Cellphone Shack L7 $ 8,690,220
21 |Cellphone Shack L8 $ 2,238,500
21 |Cellphone Shack 1.9 $ 1,452,000
21 |Cellphone Shack L10 $ 1,524,600
21 |Cellphone Shack L11 $ 579,348
21 |Cellphone Shack L12 $ 93,109,500
21 |Cellphone Shack L13 $ 3,718,173
21 |Cellphone Shack L14 $ 2,062,748
21 |Cellphone Shack L15 $ 3,920,945
22 |Digital Technology L1 $ 79,183,000 | § 3,253,115 Assuria
22 |Digital Technology L2 $ 6,848,800
22 |Digital Technology L3 $ 7,663,000




22 |Digital Technology L4 $ 7,310,000
22 |Digital Technology L5 $ 4,979,700
22 |Digital Technology L6 $ 6,442,000
22 |Digital Technology L7 $ 4,572,000
22 |Digital Technology L8 $ 1,716,000
22 |Digital Technology L9 $ 2,156,000
22 |Digital Technology L10 $ 1,161,300
22 |Digital Technology L11 $ 454,000
22 |Digital Technology L12 $ 13,030,000
22 |Digital Technology L13 $ 2,167,050
22 |Digital Technology L14 $ 1,767,900
22 |Digital Technology L15 $ 2,205,000
23 |General Distributors L1 $ 54,038,270 | $ 2,560,000 Caricom
23 |General Distributors L2 $ 9,757,508
23 |General Distributors L3 $ 9,276,696
23 |General Distributors L4 $ 6,510,361
23 |General Distributors L5 $ 3,001,284
23 |General Distributors L6 $ 5,760,040
23 |General Distributors L7 $ 3,719,773
23 |General Distributors L8 $ 2,716,314
23 |General Distributors L9 $ 3,262,002
23 |General Distributors L10 $ 1,269,028
23 |General Distributors L11 $ 539,625
23 |General Distributors L12 $ 21,148,272
23 |General Distributors L13 $ 2,726,221
23 |General Distributors L14 $ 1,726,193
23 |General Distributors L15 $ 2,872,441
24 |The Hardware Depot L1 $ 96,600,000 | $ 3,561,200 Diamond
24 |The Hardware Depot L2 $ 12,320,000




24 |The Hardware Depot L3 $ 9,000,000
24 |The Hardware Depot L4 $ 8,500,000
24 |The Hardware Depot L5 $ 3,000,000
24 |The Hardware Depot L6 $ 8,500,000
24 |The Hardware Depot L7 $ 5,100,000
24 |The Hardware Depot L8 $ 3,000,000
24 |The Hardware Depot L9 $ 3,400,000
24 |The Hardware Depot L10 $ 1,330,000
24 |The Hardware Depot L11 $ 500,000
24 |The Hardware Depot L12 $ 19,800,000
24 |The Hardware Depot L13 $ 2,010,000
24 |The Hardware Depot L14 $ 2,250,000
24 |The Hardware Depot L15 $ 2,750,000
Demerara (Form of
25 |DynamlQ Inc Tender Page Not

Completed & Signed)




Date of Tender Opening: February 18, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Agriculture-MMA/ADA (21/2025/21) - Supply & Delivery of One Canter with HIAB

. . Bid Security . . Form of |Hard
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS | Tender Fla.sh
No. Currency Agency ) drive
Currency signed | Copy
1 |Guyana Tractor & Equipment $ 22,000,0000 $ 440,000 Caricom v | v v 2
2 |Massy Motors Guyana Limited $ 23,300,000 $§ 466,000] CG United v v v 1




Date of Tender Opening: February 18, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Agriculture-Fisheries Department (10/2025/21) - Procurement of Vessel Communication Base Station

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & i‘ifﬁi‘f’éty Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS FTOernnc;eOrf Hard | Flash
No. Currency Currency signed Copy | drive
1 |Keyboard Kiosk $ 7,458,900, $§ 1,149,178 Assuria v v v 2
2 |Gopie Investments Inc $ 5,700,000/ $ 114,000 Premier v v v 2
3 |Shop Modern Guyana $ 4,944,000/ $ 99,000 Assuria v v v 2
4 Impec.cable Construction & General $ 4,642,000| $ 112,840 Caricom v v v 1

Supplies Inc
5 |Queensway Security Services Inc $ 28,842,000 $ 576,840 Premier v v v 2
Caricom (Form of
6 |Xclusive Ledz $  117,953| Tender Not Completed | vV | V v 2
But Signed)
7 |Karligo Inc $ 4,567,675 | 9% 91,354 Premier v v v 1




Date of Tender Opening: February 18, 2025

File Number: National Drainage & Irrigation Authority (28/2025/21) - Construction of Flood Relief & River Defence Embankments in Region No.5 Mahaicony to Abary Lot 1-13

. . . Form of
B'gi?r Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency| D9 Sgc(‘:'lrl‘rtfeﬁx"““t Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS 1;;1::; Ié‘;‘);‘; Fd'j‘lsvl;

1 |Well Built Construction Service L1 $ 263,452,875 $ 3,983,293 Caricom v v v 1
1 |Well Built Construction Service L2 $ 263,452,875 $ 3,983,293

1 |Well Built Construction Service L3 $ 263,452,875 $ 3,983,293

1 |Well Built Construction Service L4 $ 263,452,875 $ 3,983,293

2 |Kingston Strategic Inc. L1 $ 264,529,125 $ 3,983,293 Caricom v v v 2
2 |Kingston Strategic Inc. L2 $ 264,529,125 $ 3,983,293

2 |Kingston Strategic Inc. L3 $ 264,529,125 $ 3,983,293

2 |Kingston Strategic Inc. L4 $ 264,529,125 $ 3,983,293

2 |Kingston Strategic Inc. L5 $ 264,529,125 $ 3,983,293

2 |Kingston Strategic Inc. L6 $ 264,529,125 $ 3,983,293

2 |Kingston Strategic Inc. L7 $ 264,529,125 $ 3,983,293

2 |Kingston Strategic Inc. L8 $ 264,529,125 $ 3,983,293

3 |M&B Construction L1 $ 261,008,937 | $ 3,989,293 Premier v v v 2
3 |M&B Construction L2 $ 261,008,937 | $ 3,989,293

3 |M&B Construction L3 $ 261,008,937 | $ 3,989,293

3 |M&B Construction L4 $ 261,008,937 | $ 3,989,293

3 |M&B Construction L5 $ 261,008,937 | $ 3,989,293

3 |M&B Construction L6 $ 261,008,937 | $ 3,989,293

3 |M&B Construction L7 $ 261,008,937 | $ 3,989,293

3 |M&B Construction L8 $ 261,008,937 | $ 3,989,293

3 |M&B Construction L9 $ 250,984,398 | $ 3,837,418

3 |M&B Construction L10 $ 250,984,398 | $ 3,837,418




3 |M&B Construction L11 $ 250,984,398 | $ 3,837,418
3 |M&B Construction L12 $ 250,984,398 | $ 3,837,418
3 |M&B Construction .13 $ 299,452,608 | $ 4,545,208
4 |D Sawh Mechanical Workshop L1 $ 240,474,622 | $ 3,825,000 Premier
4 |D Sawh Mechanical Workshop L2 $ 240,474,622 | $ 3,825,000
4 |D Sawh Mechanical Workshop L3 $ 240,474,622 | $ 3,825,000
4 |D Sawh Mechanical Workshop L4 $ 240,474,622 | $ 3,825,000
4 |D Sawh Mechanical Workshop L5 $ 240,474,622 | $ 3,825,000
4 |D Sawh Mechanical Workshop L6 $ 240,474,622 | $ 3,825,000
4 |D Sawh Mechanical Workshop L7 $ 240,474,622 | $ 3,825,000
4 |D Sawh Mechanical Workshop L8 $ 240,474,622 | $ 3,825,000
4 |D Sawh Mechanical Workshop L9 $ 232,434,846 | $ 3,825,000
4 |D Sawh Mechanical Workshop L10 $ 232,434,846 | $ 3,825,000
4 |D Sawh Mechanical Workshop L11 $ 232,434,846 | $ 3,825,000
4 |D Sawh Mechanical Workshop L12 $ 232,434,846 | $ 3,825,000
4 |D Sawh Mechanical Workshop L13 $ 254,817,019 | $ 3,825,000
5 |GSK Escavation Services Inc L1 $ 265,237,875 | $ 3,978,568 Assuria
5 |GSK Escavation Services Inc L2 $ 265,237,875 | $ 3,978,568
5 |GSK Escavation Services Inc L3 $ 265,237,875 | $ 3,978,568
5 |GSK Escavation Services Inc L4 $ 265,237,875 | $ 3,978,568
5 |GSK Escavation Services Inc L5 $ 265,237,875 | $ 3,978,568
5 |GSK Escavation Services Inc L6 $ 265,237,875 | $ 3,978,568
5 |GSK Escavation Services Inc L7 $ 265,237,875 | $ 3,978,568
5 |GSK Escavation Services Inc L8 $ 265,237,875 | $ 3,978,568
5 |GSK Escavation Services Inc L9 $ 255,527,827 | $ 3,832,970
5 |GSK Escavation Services Inc L10 $ 255,527,827 | $ 3,832,970
5 |GSK Escavation Services Inc L11 $ 255,527,827 | $ 3,832,970




5 |GSK Escavation Services Inc L12 $ 255,527,827 | $ 3,832,970

5 |GSK Escavation Services Inc L13 $ 302,700,000 | $ 4,540,500

6 |Adamantium Holdings L1 $ 301,584,281 | $ 4,530,000 Premier v
6 |Adamantium Holdings .2 $ 301,584,281 | $ 4,530,000

6 |Adamantium Holdings L13 $ 302,414,858 | $ 4,545,000

7 |I&R Construction L1 $ 256,188,975 | $ 3,983,293 Premier v
7 |I&R Construction L2 $ 256,188,975 | $ 3,983,293

7 |I&R Construction L3 $ 261,438,975 | $ 3,983,293

7 |I&R Construction L4 $ 263,118,975 | $ 3,983,293

7 |I&R Construction L5 $ 261,228.975 | $ 3,983,293

7 |I&R Construction L6 $ 263,538,975 | $ 3,983,293

7 |I&R Construction L7 $ 261,772,350 | $ 3,983,293

7 |I&R Construction L8 $ 260,722,350 | $ 3,983,293

7 |I&R Construction L9 $ 252,547,181 | $ 3,837,417

7 |I&R Construction L10 $ 252,127,181 | $ 3,837,417

7 |I&R Construction L11 $ 252,862,151 | $ 3,837,417

7 |I&R Construction L12 $ 252,862,181 | $ 3,837,417

7 |I&R Construction L13 $ 297,434,702 | $ 4,545,208

8 |Buddy's Construction L1 $ 262,560,375 | $ 4,000,000 Premier Receipt
8 |Buddy's Construction L2 $ 262,560,375 | $ 4,000,000

8 |Buddy's Construction L3 $ 262,560,375 | $ 4,000,000

8 |Buddy's Construction L4 $ 262,560,375 | $ 4,000,000

8 |Buddy's Construction L5 $ 262,560,375 | $ 4,000,000

8 |Buddy's Construction L6 $ 262,560,375 | $ 4,000,000

8 |Buddy's Construction L7 $ 262,560,375 | $ 4,000,000

8 |Buddy's Construction L8 $ 262,560,375 | $ 4,000,000




8 |Buddy's Construction L9 $ 252,835,328 | $ 4,000,000

8 |Buddy's Construction L10 $ 252,835,328 | $ 4,000,000

8 |Buddy's Construction L11 $ 252,835,328 | $ 4,000,000

8 |Buddy's Construction .12 $ 252,835,328 | $ 4,000,000

8 |Buddy's Construction L13 $ 300,747,169 | $ 4,700,000

9 |Associated Construction Services L1 $ 265,451,366 | $ 3,981,771 Caricom
9 |Associated Construction Services L2 $ 265,451,366 | $ 3,981,771

9 |Associated Construction Services L3 $ 265,451,366 | $ 3,981,771

9 |Associated Construction Services L4 $ 265,451,366 | $ 3,981,771

9 |Associated Construction Services L5 $ 265,451,366 | $ 3,981,771

9 |Associated Construction Services L6 $ 265,451,366 | $ 3,981,771

9 |Associated Construction Services L7 $ 265,451,366 | $ 3,981,771

9 |Associated Construction Services L8 $ 265,451,366 | $ 3,981,771

9 |Associated Construction Services L9 $ 255,815,553 | $ 3,837,234

9 |Associated Construction Services L10 $ 255,815,553 | $ 3,837,234

9 |Associated Construction Services L11 $ 255,815,553 | $ 3,837,234

9 |Associated Construction Services L12 $ 255,815,553 | $ 3,837,234

9 |Associated Construction Services L.13 $ 302,913,986 | $ 3,837,234

10 |Strategy & Development Consulting Inc L1 $ 264,870,375 | $ 4,650,000 Caricom
10 (Strategy & Development Consulting Inc L2 $ 264,870,375 Lots 1-13
10 |[Strategy & Development Consulting Inc L3 $ 264,870,375

10 |Strategy & Development Consulting Inc L4 $ 264,870,375




10 (Strategy & Development Consulting Inc L5 $ 264,870,375

10 |[Strategy & Development Consulting Inc L6 $ 264,870,375

10 |[Strategy & Development Consulting Inc L7 $ 264,870,375

10 (Strategy & Development Consulting Inc L8 $ 264,870,375

10 (Strategy & Development Consulting Inc L9 $ 255,145,327

10 |Strategy & Development Consulting Inc L10 | $ 255,145,327

10 |Strategy & Development Consulting Inc L11 | § 255,145,327

10 |Strategy & Development Consulting Inc L12 | § 255,145,327

10 |Strategy & Development Consulting Inc L13 | § 303,007,188

11 |K&A Constrcating Services L1 $ 257,310,375 | $ 3,983,293 Caricom
11 |K&A Constrcating Services L2 $ 257,310,375 | $ 3,983,293
11 |K&A Constrcating Services L3 $ 257,310,375 | $ 3,983,293
11 |K&A Constrcating Services L4 $ 257,310,375 | $ 3,983,293
11 |K&A Constrcating Services L5 $ 257,310,375 | $ 3,983,293
11 |K&A Constrcating Services L6 $ 257,310,375 | $ 3,983,293
11 |K&A Constrcating Services L7 $ 257,310,375 | $ 3,983,293
11 |K&A Constrcating Services L8 $ 257,310,375 | $ 3,983,293
11 |K&A Constrcating Services L9 $ 248,110,328 | $ 3,837,417




11 |K&A Constrcating Services L10 $ 248,110,328 | $ 3,837,417
11 |K&A Constrcating Services L11 $ 248,110,328 | $ 3,837,417
11 |K&A Constrcating Services 112 $ 248,110,328 | $ 3,837,417
11 |K&A Constrcating Services 13 $ 295,014,484 | $ 4,545,208
12 |Akbar Construction Inc L1 $ 255,145,983 No Blges;curlty Letter
12 |Akbar Construction Inc L2 $ 255,145,983

12 |Akbar Construction Inc L3 $ 255,145,983

12 |Akbar Construction Inc L4 $ 255,145,983

12 |Akbar Construction Inc L5 $ 255,145,983

12 |Akbar Construction Inc L6 $ 255,145,983

12 |Akbar Construction Inc L7 $ 255,145,983

12 |Akbar Construction Inc L8 $ 255,145,983

12 |Akbar Construction Inc L9 $ 246,412,552

12 |Akbar Construction Inc L10 $ 246,412,552

12 |Akbar Construction Inc L11 $ 246,412,552

12 |Akbar Construction Inc L12 $ 246,412,552

12 |Akbar Construction Inc L.13 $ 292,013,883

13 |Abrams General Contracting Inc. L1 $ 248,177,737 | $ 3,989,293 Premier v
13 |Abrams General Contracting Inc. L2 $ 248,177,737 | $ 3,989,293
13 |Abrams General Contracting Inc. L3 $ 248,177,737 | $ 3,989,293
13 |Abrams General Contracting Inc. L4 $ 248,177,737 | $ 3,989,293
13 |Abrams General Contracting Inc. L5 $ 248,177,737 | $ 3,989,293
13 |Abrams General Contracting Inc. L6 $ 248,177,737 | $ 3,989,293
13 |Abrams General Contracting Inc. L7 $ 248,177,737 | $ 3,989,293
13 |Abrams General Contracting Inc. L8 $ 248,177,737 | $ 3,989,293
13 |Abrams General Contracting Inc. L9 $ 239,106,577 | $ 3,837,417




13 |Abrams General Contracting Inc. L10 $ 239,106,577 | $ 3,837,417
13 |Abrams General Contracting Inc. L11 $ 239,106,577 | $ 3,837,417
13 |Abrams General Contracting Inc. L12 $ 239,106,577 | $ 3,837,417
13 |Abrams General Contracting Inc. L13 $ 272,742,094 | $ 4,545,208
14 |Roopan Ramotar Investment L1 $ 276,718,243 | $ 4,150,773 Assuria
14 |Roopan Ramotar Investment L2 $ 276,718,260 | $ 4,150,776
14 |Roopan Ramotar Investment L3 $ 276,718,554 | $ 4,150,778
14 |Roopan Ramotar Investment L4 $ 276,718,555 | $ 4,150,778
14 |Roopan Ramotar Investment L5 $ 276,718,398 | $ 4,150,775
14 |Roopan Ramotar Investment L6 $ 305,796,888 | $ 4,586,953
14 |Roopan Ramotar Investment L7 $ 336,409,585 | $ 5,046,143
14 |Roopan Ramotar Investment L8 $ 324,068,804 | $ 4,861,032
14 |Roopan Ramotar Investment .12 $ 302,443,050 | $ 4,536,645
14 |Roopan Ramotar Investment L.13 $ 306,946,570 | $ 4,604,198
15 |KNS Peetum Construction L1 $ 250,243,586 | $ 3,983,239 Premier
15 |KNS Peetum Construction L2 $ 250,243,586 | $ 3,983,239
15 |KNS Peetum Construction L3 $ 250,243,586 | $ 3,983,239
15 |KNS Peetum Construction L4 $ 239,054,366 | $ 3,983,239
15 |KNS Peetum Construction L5 $ 237,164,366 | $ 3,983,239
15 |KNS Peetum Construction L6 $ 237,164,366 | $ 3,983,239
15 |KNS Peetum Construction L7 $ 237,164,366 | $ 3,983,239
15 |KNS Peetum Construction L8 $ 237,164,366 | $ 3,983,239
15 |KNS Peetum Construction L9 $ 230,026,676 | $ 3,983,239
15 |KNS Peetum Construction L10 $ 230,226,676 | $ 3,983,239
15 |KNS Peetum Construction L11 $ 227,926,676 | $ 3,983,239
15 |KNS Peetum Construction L12 $ 227,926,676 | $ 3,983,239
15 |KNS Peetum Construction L13 $ 282,231,684 | $ 3,983,239




16 |JS Engineering Services & Supplies L1 $ 259,410,375 | $ 3,983,293 Caricom
16 |JS Engineering Services & Supplies L2 $ 259,410,375 | $ 3,983,293
16 |JS Engineering Services & Supplies L3 $ 259,410,375 | $ 3,983,293
16 |JS Engineering Services & Supplies L4 $ 259,410,375 | $ 3,983,293
16 |JS Engineering Services & Supplies L5 $ 259,410,375 | $ 3,983,293
16 |JS Engineering Services & Supplies L6 $ 259,410,375 | $ 3,983,293
16 |JS Engineering Services & Supplies L7 $ 259,410,375 | $ 3,983,293
16 |JS Engineering Services & Supplies L8 $ 259,410,375 | $ 3,983,293
16 |JS Engineering Services & Supplies L9 $ 250,735,325 | $ 3,837,417
16 |JS Engineering Services & Supplies L10 $ 250,735,325 | $ 3,837,417
16 |JS Engineering Services & Supplies L11 $ 250,735,325 | $ 3,837,417
16 |JS Engineering Services & Supplies L12 $ 250,735,325 | $ 3,837,417
16 |JS Engineering Services & Supplies L13 $ 296,181,558.75 | $ 4,545,208
17 |Box Construction & Supplies L1 $ 258,727,237 | $ 3,938,294 Caricom
17 |Box Construction & Supplies L2 $ 258,727,237 | $ 3,938,294
17 |Box Construction & Supplies L3 $ 258,727,237 | $ 3,938,294
17 |Box Construction & Supplies L4 $ 258,727,237 | $ 3,938,294
17 |Box Construction & Supplies L5 $ 258,727,237 | $ 3,938,294
17 |Box Construction & Supplies L6 $ 258,727,237 | $ 3,938,294
17 |Box Construction & Supplies L7 $ 258,727,237 | $ 3,938,294
17 |Box Construction & Supplies L8 $ 258,727,237 | $ 3,938,294
17 |Box Construction & Supplies L9 $ 248,973,902 | $ 3,837,418
17 |Box Construction & Supplies L10 $ 248,973,902 | $ 3,837,418
17 |Box Construction & Supplies L11 $ 248,973,902 | $ 3,837,418
17 |Box Construction & Supplies L12 $ 248,973,902 | $ 3,837,418
17 |Box Construction & Supplies L13 $ 287,517,219 | $ 3,837,418




Quantas Construction Services & Supplies Inc

18 L1 $ 265,084,125 | $ 3,983,293 Caricom
18 I(ilantas Construction Services & Supplies Inc $ 265,084,125 (L1-8)

18 I(?;lantas Construction Services & Supplies Inc $ 265,084,125

18 I(ilantas Construction Services & Supplies Inc $ 265,084,125

18 I(3;121ntas Construction Services & Supplies Inc $ 265,084,125

18 I(316lantas Construction Services & Supplies Inc $ 265,084,125

18 I(?;lantas Construction Services & Supplies Inc $ 265,084,125

18 I(?élantas Construction Services & Supplies Inc $ 265,084,125

19 |MK Hoosein Contracting L1 $ 240,197,764 | $ 3,983,294 Caricom
19 |MK Hoosein Contracting 1.2 $ 250,907,764 | $ 3,983,294

19 |MK Hoosein Contracting L3 $ 243,032,764 | $ 3,983,294

19 |MK Hoosein Contracting 1.4 $ 250,907,764 | $ 3,983,294

19 |MK Hoosein Contracting L5 $ 234,087,642 | $ 3,983,294

19 |MK Hoosein Contracting L6 $ 250,907,764 | $ 3,983,294

19 |MK Hoosein Contracting L7 $ 241,457,764 | $ 3,983,294

19 |MK Hoosein Contracting L8 $ 243,410,869 | $ 3,983,294

19 |MK Hoosein Contracting 1.9 $ 242,015,681 | $ 3,837,418

19 |MK Hoosein Contracting L10 $ 233,615,681 | $ 3,837,418

19 |MK Hoosein Contracting 11 $ 229,205,681 | $ 3,837,418




19 |MK Hoosein Contracting L.12 $ 226,895,681 | $ 3,837,418

19 |MK Hoosein Contracting L13 $ 257,247,795 | $ 3,837,418

20 |HRS Investment & Logistics Inc L1 $ 263,599,875 | $ 3,983,293 Caricom
20 |HRS Investment & Logistics Inc L2 $ 263,599,875 | $ 3,983,293

20 |HRS Investment & Logistics Inc L3 $ 263,599,875 | $ 3,983,293

20 |HRS Investment & Logistics Inc 1.4 $ 263,599,875 | $ 3,983,293

20 |HRS Investment & Logistics Inc L5 $ 263,599,875 | $ 3,983,293

20 |HRS Investment & Logistics Inc L6 $ 263,599,875 | $ 3,983,293

20 |HRS Investment & Logistics Inc L7 $ 263,599,875 | $ 3,983,293

20 |HRS Investment & Logistics Inc L8 $ 263,599,875 | $ 3,983,293

21 |AJM Enterprise L1 $ 259,264,892 | $ 3,983,293 Premier
21 |AJM Enterprise L2 $ 259,264,892 | $ 3,983,293

21 |AJM Enterprise L3 $ 259,264,892 | $ 3,983,293

21 |AJM Enterprise L4 $ 259,264,892 | $ 3,983,293

21 |AJM Enterprise L5 $ 259,264,892 | $ 3,983,293

21 |AJM Enterprise L6 $ 259,264,892 | $ 3,983,293

21 |AJM Enterprise L7 $ 259,264,892 | $ 3,983,293

21 |AJM Enterprise L8 $ 259,264,892 | $ 3,983,293

21 |AJM Enterprise L9 $ 249,330,716 | $ 2,837,418

21 |AJM Enterprise L10 $ 249,330,716 | $ 2,837,418

21 |AJM Enterprise L11 $ 249,330,716 | $ 2,837,418

21 |AJM Enterprise L12 $ 249,330,716 | $ 2,837,418

21 |AJM Enterprise L13 $ 293,868,068 | $ 4,545,208

22 |Fyuse Hoosain Construction Inc L1 $ 246,245,659 | $ 5,761,222.87 Assuria
22 |Fyuse Hoosain Construction Inc L2 $ 247,295,659 (L1-13)

22 |Fyuse Hoosain Construction Inc L3 $ 248,345,659




22 |Fyuse Hoosain Construction Inc L4 $ 248,813,250
22 |Fyuse Hoosain Construction Inc L5 $ 250,755,750
22 |Fyuse Hoosain Construction Inc L6 $ 251,805,750
22 |Fyuse Hoosain Construction Inc L7 $ 251,805,750
22 |Fyuse Hoosain Construction Inc L8 $ 251,850,750
22 |Fyuse Hoosain Construction Inc L9 $ 242,080,703
22 |Fyuse Hoosain Construction Inc L10 $ 244,180,703
22 |Fyuse Hoosain Construction Inc L11 $ 250,540,474
22 |Fyuse Hoosain Construction Inc L12 $ 250,540,474
22 |Fyuse Hoosain Construction Inc L13 $ 287,950,031
23 |Star Imports & Trading L1 $ 248,941,798.00 | $ 3,752,018 Premier
23 |Star Imports & Trading L2 $ 248,256,798.04 | $ 3,752,018
23 |Star Imports & Trading L3 $ 248,256,798.04 | $ 3,752,018
23 |[Star Imports & Trading L4 $ 260,504,286.00 | $ 3,752,018
23 |Star Imports & Trading L5 $ 249,256,798.40 | $ 3,752,018
23 |Star Imports & Trading L6 $ 249,256,798.40 | $ 3,752,018
23 |Star Imports & Trading L7 $ 249,556,798.40 | $ 3,752,018
23 |Star Imports & Trading L8 $ 249,556,798.40 | $ 3,752,018
23 |Star Imports & Trading L9 $ 240,065,757.80 | $ 3,902,018
23 |Star Imports & Trading L10 $ 240,065,757.80 | $ 3,902,018
23 |Star Imports & Trading L11 $ 240,065,757.80 | $ 3,902,018
23 |Star Imports & Trading L12 $ 240,170,757.80 | $ 3,902,018
23 |Star Imports & Trading L13 $ 248,270,266.50 | $ 3,902,018
Engineer's Estimate L1 $ 265,552,875
Engineer's Estimate 1.2 $ 265,552,875
Engineer's Estimate L3 $ 265,552,875
Engineer's Estimate L4 $ 265,552,875




Engineer's Estimate L5 $ 265,552,875
Engineer's Estimate L6 $ 265,552,875
Engineer's Estimate L7 $ 265,552,875
Engineer's Estimate L8 $ 265,552,875
Engineer's Estimate L9 $ 255,827,827
Engineer's Estimate 110 $ 255,827,827
Engineer's Estimate L11 $ 255,827,827
Engineer's Estimate 112 $ 255,827,827
Engineer's Estimate L.13 $ 303,013,883




Date of Tender Opening: February 18, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Health (10/2025/47) - Supply & Delivery of Office Furniture & Office Equipment

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & ]fiiﬁf}fff’;fy Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS FTOernnc;eOrf Hard | Flash
No. Currency Currency signed Copy | drive
1 |Laparkan Trading Guyana Company Limited $ 1,580,800 | $ 100,000 GTM v v v 1
2 | Atlas Business Solutions Inc $ 2,273,600 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 1 1
3 |Netcom $ 5,802,600 | $ 100,000 Diamond v v v 1 1
4 |MAEC Enterprises $ 3,594,842 | $ 71,987 Assuria v v v 1
5 |Al Print & Supplies $ 6,436,130 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 1 1
6 |AS Woodworking Establishment $ 3,154,516 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 1 1
7 |Digital Technology Inc $ 3,666,570 | $ 73,331 Assuria v v v 2
8 |Kojac $ 1,934,400 No Bid Security Seen | v v v 1
9 |SKM Pharmaceuticals $ 5,312,000 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 1 1




Date of Tender Opening: February 18, 2025

File Number: Guyana Livestock Development Authority (16/2025/21) - Construction of Building to House Feed Pelletizer

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency Currency signed Copy | drive
1 I;ﬁ;i‘f;?hwar Singh Construction Company & ¢ 99 155208 | § 583,244 Premier Vv v 2
2 |Teon Peters Construction Service $ 29,490,484 | $ 600,000 Nafico v v v 1
3 |Construct It Inc $ 34212,875 | $ 684,258 Nafico v v v 2
4 |Atlantic General Investment $ 22,204,052 | $ 444,081 Premier v v v 2
5 |RZB Construction & General Supplies $ 33,948,960 | $ 678,979 Caricom v v v 2
6 |Ash Civil Engineering Works $ 24,025,459 | $ 500,000 Nafico v v v 2
7 |D&S General Contracting Services $ 22,513,709 | $ 1,000,000 Caricom v v v 2
8 |J&A Lumberyard & Contracting Services $ 26,996,742 | $ 539,935 Assuria v v v 2
.. . . : : Caricom (Form of
9 |K&S Civil Engineering & Contracting Services $ 787,490 Tender Page Not Seen) v v X 2
10 |V. Narine Central Lumberyard $ 34,088,434 | $ 682,000 Caricom v v v 2
11 |KNPS Contracting & Supplies $ 25,200,860 | $ 704,017 Caricom v v v 2
12 |Acon Services $ 36,611,49450 | $ 740,000 Premier v v v 1
13 |DM Engineering $ 40,901,820 | $ 400,000 Caricom v v v 2
14 |Ryan Mohamed & Son General Construction, | ¢ 56 479056 | 5 568401 Caricom v v 2
Fabrication & Welding
15 |Gopie Investments Inc $ 34,264,236 | $ 685,285 Premier v v v 2
16 |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 24,584,964 No Bid Security Seen | v v 2
17 |Emerald General Construction & Distributor $ 31,046,992 | $ 620,940 Caricom v v v 2
18 [R&B Services $ 26,640,560.40 | $ 532,811 Premier v v v 1
19 |Digttal Design, Construction, Logistics & S 31422102 |8 628,442 Caricom v | v | v 2
Supplies
Engineer's Estimate $ 25,111,059.60




Date of Tender Opening: February 18, 2025

File Number: Guyana Livestock Development Authority (17/2025/21) - Rehabiliation Works at the Livestock Farm

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency Currency signed Copy | drive
1 EI(\:IS Civil Engineering Contracting Services $ 39.374.475| $ 682,436 Caricom v v v 5
2 |D&S General Contracting Services $ 33,804,115/ $ 1,000,000 Caricom v v v 2
3 |J&A Lumberyard & Contracting Services $ 30,322,005 $ 606,440 Assuria v v v 2
4 |KNPS Contracting & Supplies $  41,200,110] $ 824,002 Caricom v v v 2
5 | Ryan Mohamed & Son General Construction, | ¢ 7 75815 § 552516 Caricom v v 2
Fabrication & Welding
6 |Atlantic General Investment $ 27,730,710 $ 554,614 Premier v v v 2
. . : Caricom (Form of
7 |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 1,200,000 Tender Page Not Seen) v v X 2
8 |KNV Designs, Construction & Supplies $ 39,773,895 | $ 600,000 Nafico v v v 2
9 |V. Narine Central Lumberyard $ 34,476,435 | $ 690,000 Caricom v v v 2
10 |D. Kanhai General Construction & Supplies $ 31,756,515 | $ 635,130 Assuria v v v 2
11 [S);ﬁgi‘ile?e“g“’ Construction, Logistics & S 39941048 | S 798,838 Caricom v v v 2
12 | Ash Civil Engineering Works $ 24,548,600 | $ 400,000 Nafico v v v 1 2
13 |Emerald General Contracting & Distributor $ 32,411,883 | $ 650,000 Caricom v v v 2
14 |Gopie Investments Inc $ 41,464,973 | $ 829,300 Premier v v v 2
15 I;pRpr;:Shwar Singh Construction Company & | ¢ 30635 35 |5 616,701 Premier v v | v 2
16 |Construct It Inc $ 33,384,120 | $ 667,682 Nafico v v v 2
17 |R&B Services $ 31,002,426 | $ 620,049 Premier v v v 1
18 |Global Builders Engineering Inc $ 37,357,815 | $ 682,436 Caricom v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 32,502,162




Date of Tender Opening: February 18, 2025

File Number: National Agricultural Research & Extension Institute (29/2025/21) - Supply, Delivery & Installation of Seed Handling Equipment

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder . Bid Amount & . ) Hard | Flash
No. Name of Bidder Currency Acn:l(:.::; c8; Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS rl;i:;ll(ll::(ll‘ Copy| drive
1 [New GPC Inc $ 8,450,373 $ 200,000 Premier v v v 2
2 |Health Sales Global Inc $ 47440,335.12| $ 948,807 Nafico v v v 2
3 |Ash Civil Engineering Works $ 13,200,000 $ 500,000 Nafico v v v 1 2
4 |Western Scientific Company Limited $ 5,115,890 $ 124,828 Premier N/A | N/A v 2




Date of Tender Opening: February 18, 2025

File Number: National Agricultural Research & Extension Institute (30/2025/21) - Supply & Delivery of Shade Nets & UV Plastics

. . Bid Security . . Form of |Hard
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS | Tender Fla.sh
No. Currency Agency ) drive
Currency signed | Copy
1 |Modern Agri $ 27,450,000 $§ 600,000 Assuria v v v 2
2 |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 140,700,000 $ 4,000,000 Caricom v v v 2
3 |IMS Construction & Logistics Services $ 20,887,500 $§ 440,000 Caricom v v v 2
4 |Alliance Investments $ 32,775,000 $§ 655,500 Premier v v v 2
Meditron Inc (Vat Exclusive) $ 9,194,298 :
S [Meditron Inc 5 1287202] > 209630 Diamond | v V| ¥ 2




Date of Tender Opening: February 18, 2025

File Number: National Agricultural Research & Extension Institute (31/2025/21) - Supply & Delivery of Culture Vessels

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder . Bid Amount & . . Hard | Flash
No. Name of Bidder Currency A(:n:l(:.::; c&; Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS "l;i:;ll(ll:(ll‘ Copy| drive
Meditron Inc (VAT Exclusive) $ 21,585,104 :
2 492,140 D d v v v 2
1 [Meditron Inc (VAT Inclusive) S 24.607.018 > ’ famor
2 |New GPC Inc $ 34,312,038 $ 700,000 Premier v v v 2
3 |Western Scientifc Company Limited $ 30,662,718.16| $ 631,652 Premier N/A | N/A v 2




Date of Tender Opening: February 18, 2025

File Number: National Agricultural Research & Extension Institute (32/2025/21) - Supply & Delivery of One Autoclave & One Spectrophotmete

. . Bid Security . . Form of |Hard
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS | Tender Fla.sh
No. Currency Agency ) drive
Currency signed | Copy
1 |New GPC Inc $ 11,239,152] $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
2 |Western Scientific Company Limited $ 3,159,576| $ 82,149 Premier N/A | N/A v 2




Date of Tender Opening: February 18, 2025

File Number: National Agricultural Research & Extension Institute (33/2025/21) - Supply & Delivery of Desktop & Laptop Computers

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & ]Ziﬂlile::;r;:y Bid Security GRA | NIS FToernlgeorf e FlztSh
No. Currency Currency Agency siened | Copy drive
1 |C-Mobile $ 10,564,980 [$ 300,000 Nafico v v v 2
2 | The Hardware Depot $ 15,800,000 NO. Bid v v 2

Security Seen
3 |PromoTech Inc $ 4910,129 [$ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
4 |Micro Design Technology $ 8,228,920 | $ 161,656 Nafico v v v 2
5 |Nationwide Imports $ 5,986,000 | $ 119,720 Caricom v v v 2
6 |Ash Civil Engineering Works $ 8,800,000 |$ 300,000 Nafico v v v 2
7 |Starr Computer Inc $ 7,358,000 | $ 220,000 Premier v v v 2
8 |Synetech Inc $ 8,184,000 |$ 175,000 Premier v v v 2
9 |Cellphone Shack $ 20947830 (% 418,957 Premier v v v 2
10 |Alliance Investments $ 8,791,200 |$ 175,824 Premier v v v 2
11 |Yamin Investments $ 7,438,000 | $ 148,760 Premier v v v 2
12 |Keyboard Kiosk $ 18,400,000 [ $ 368,000 Assuria v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: February 18, 2025

File Number: National Agricultural Research & Extension Institute (34/2025/21) - Supply & Delivery of Furnishing for New AIEP Field Office

. . Bid Security . . Form of |Hard
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS | Tender Fla.sh
No. Currency Agency ) drive
Currency signed | Copy
1 |Ash Civil Engineering Works $ 4,970,000 $ 500,000 Nafico v v v 2
2 |DM Engineering $ 2,805,000f $ 1,000,000 Caricom v v v 2
3 | Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 5,039,000 $ 4,000,000 Caricom v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: February 18, 2025

File Number: National Agricultural Research & Extension Institute (35/2025/21) - Construction to RC Foundation & Floor Slabs to Accommodate Tunnel Houses at Hosororo,

Mabaruma
. . Bid Security Form of
Blgder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.sh

0. Currency Currency signed Copy | drive
1 |Global Builders Engineering Inc $ 33,227,788 | $ 664,556 Caricom v v v |
2 |See Solutions $ 36,259,969 | $ 740,000 Caricom v v v 2
3 |MAEC Enterprise $ 44,981,925.60 | $ 920,000 Assuria v v v 2
4 Efcs Civil Engineering, Contracting Services $ 33.227.788 | § 664.556 Caricom v v v 1
5 |J&A Lumberyard & Contracting Services $ 36,305,864 | $ 726,118 Assuria v v v 2
6 |Ash Civil Engineering Works $ 24,771,462 | $ 500,000 Nafico v v v 2
7 |Terraform Solutions $ 44,881,329.60 | $ 900,000 Assuria v v v 2
8 |D. Kanhai Construction & General Supplies $ 34,602,600 | $ 69,052 Assuria v v v 2
9 |DNS General Contracting Service $ 24,378,774 | $ 1,000,000 Caricom v v v 2

10 [Sharukh's General Contracting & Supplies $ 30,796,920 No B“Sies;cumy v | v v 0

11 |AAV Raghubir General Construction $ 83,097,952 | $ 1,661,959 Assuria v v v 2

12 |RAPS Investments $ 34,202,640 | $ 500,000 Assuria v v v 2

13 |Urban Engineering & Energy Solutions Inc $ 22,753,966 | $ 455,079 Premier v v v 2

14 |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 23,873,774 | $ 1,000,000 Caricom v v v 2

15 |ARK Trading $ 42,339,604 | $ 500,000 Nafico v v v 2

16 |Swift Pay S 31,968,520 No B“Sies;cumy J | v | v 0

17 |Gopie Investments Inc $ 25,165,200 | $ 503,350 Premier v v v 2

Engineer's Estimate $ 24,862,079.20




Date of Tender Opening: February 18, 2025

File Number: National Agricultural Research & Extension Institute (36/2025/21) - Construction of Section of Perimeter Fence NAREI Main Office Mon Repos

Bigder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency l?sl?nifl;ltlgy Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Froernlgeorf Hard | Flash
0 Currency signed Copy | drive
1 |D. Kanhai Construction & General Supplies $ 33,058,620, $ 661,172 Assuria v v v 2
2 |LS Contracting Services $ 28,559,865| $ 571,194 Caricom v v v 2
3 |Gopie Investments Inc $ 33,871,110 $ 677,425 Premier v v v 2
4 |RZB Construction & General Supplies $ 32,104,800| $ 642,096 Caricom v v v 2
5 |June Ann Robinson Contracting $ 28,552,125 $ 680,000 Nafico v v v 1 2
6 |R. Persid Construction $ 32,319.934| $ 700,000 Nafico v v v 1
7 |Dynamics Infrastructure $ 23,175,201 No B1<Sies;cur1ty v v v 1 2
8 |NK General Construction $ 30,564,555 | $ 611,291 Caricom v v v 2
9 [Metal & Fabrication Ink $ 29,976,555 | $ 700,000 Assuria v v v 2

10 [NSA Enterprise $ 34,610,121 | $ 800,000 Premier v v v 2
11 |United Building Solutions $ 24,428,481 | $ 272,000 Caricom Rec | Rec v 2
12 |[RP Construction Agency $ 33,880,022 | $ 677,600 Caricom v v v 2
13 |D&S General Contracting Services $ 32,815,797 | $ 1,000,000 Caricom v v v 2
14 |KNV Designs, Construction & Supplies $ 30,243,192 | $ 600,000 Nafico v v v 2
15 |ACL Construction Guyana $ 33,537,265 | $ 782,624 Nafico v v v 2
16 |A. Alli Construction $ 33,525,765 | $ 670,515 Premier v v v 2
17 |KNPS Contracting & Supplies $ 33,797,085 | $ 675,942 Caricom v v v 2
18 [J&A Lumberyard & Contracting Services $ 31,179,330 | $ 623,587 Assuria v v v 2
19 |[MC Realty & Construction $ 34,899,480 | $ 697,990 Caricom v v v 2
20 |Terraform Solutions $ 35,972,170.50 | $ 800,000 Assuria v v v 2
21 |V&D Enterprise $ 32,225,844 | $ 700,000 Premier v v v 2
22 |Aleema's General Construction $ 22,440,201 | $ 220,000 Caricom v v v 2
23 |[M&b Contracting Services $ 34,105,222.50 | $ 700,000 Assuria v v v 2




KNS Civil Engineering & Contracting Services

24 Inc $ 36,623,225 | $ 732,465 Caricom v v v 2
25 |Paragon Property Management Solutions Inc $ 36,999,763 | $ 700,000 Caricom v v v 1
26 |Emerald General Contracting & Distributors $ 34,099,621 | $ 681,993 Caricom v v v 2
27 |Harry Chowtie Enterprise $ 30,001,755 | $ 700,000 Caricom v v v 2
28 [See Solutions $ 33,063,242 | $ 680,000 Caricom v v v 2
29 |Atlantic General Investment $ 29,486,415 | $ 589,728 Premier v v v 2
30 Is)ﬁgﬁle?e“gn’ Construction, Logistics & S 34,152,762 |$  683,055| Caricom v | v | v 2
31 |Neira Enterprise $ 31,516,485 | $ 630,319 Diamond v v v 2
32 |RAPS Investment $ 31,625,100 | $ 700,000 Assuria v v v 2
33 |IMS Construction & Logistics Services $ 33,136,425 | $ 700,000 Caricom v v v 2
34 |ARK Trading $ 44,974,230 | $ 700,000 Nafico v v v 2
35 |MAEC Enterprise $ 36,105,250 | $ 840,000 Assuria v v v 2
36 |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 32,605,797 | $ 1,000,000 Caricom v v v 2
37 |Blacko Trading & Construction $ 34,999,797 | $ 700,000 Caricom v v v 2
38 |[VAS Global $ 31,489,605 | $ 740,000 Premier v v v 2
39 |Triple A General Contracting Services $ 33,683,265 | $ 673,665 Premier v v v 2
40 |R.M Rashdhar $ 38,371,284 | $ 700,000 Premier v v v 2
41 |VN Contracting Services $ 30,443,229 | $ 608,685 Diamond v v v 2
42 |Global Builders Engineering Inc $ 31,222,128 | $ 732,465 Caricom v v v 2
43 |Phoenix Industries $ 34,618,605 | $ 692,372 Caricom v v v 2
44 gﬁ];ﬁ:?hwar Singh Construction Company & | ¢ 5929 195 | § 597,784 |  Premier v |l v | v 2
45 |DM Engineering $ 33,518,000 | $ 700,000 Caricom v v v 2
46 |Teon Peters Construction Service $ 30,022,776 | $ 600,000 Nafico v v v 2
47 |Construct It Inc $ 34,816,824 | $ 784,486 Nafico v v v 1

Engineer's Estimate

&

34,349,679




Date of Tender Opening: February 18, 2025

File Number: Guyana Livestock Development Authority (38/2025/21)- Supply and Deliverey of 11,000 tons Rock ARMOUR

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Bid Security Amount |  Bid Security | o0 | o FT‘:I';:: Hard | Flash
No. Currency & Currency Agency signed Copy drive
1 |Mahase Construction $ 159,500,000 | $ 3,190,000 |Premier v v v 2
2 |AAQIB Consultancy $ 121,000,000 | $ 420,000 |Caricom v v v 1
3 |J.S.B Investments Inc $ 132,000,000 | $ 2,640,000 |Caricom X v v 2
4  |Impeccable Construction| $ 116,600,000 | $ 2,332,000 |Caricom v v v 1
5 |BK International Inc $ 88,000,000 | $ 1,800,000 |Caricom v v v 2
6 |R&N Construction Servid $ 99,000,000 | $ 2,420,000 |Assuria v v v 2
7 |Gopie Investments Inc $ 150,000,000 | $ 3,000,000 |Premier v v v 2
No Bid Security
8 |Dave West Indian Inc $ 108,900,000 Seen X v v 2
9 |Toolsie Persaud Quarries| $ 99,880,000 | $ 2,000,000 |Caricom v v v 1
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