Date of Tender Opening: February 20, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Health (41/2025/47) - Electrical Works at National AIDS Programme Secretariat, Georgetown-Region 4

Bid Security

Form of

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Flz}sh
No. Currency Currency Agency signed Copy| drive
1 |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 28,861,750 | $ 3,000,000 Caricom v v v 2
) Digital Des1gns, Construction, Logistics § 21676750 | $  433.535 Caricom v v v )
& Supplies
3 |R&P Engineering & General $ 20,203,500 | $ 404,070 |  Assuria v |Rec| v 2
Construction
4 Megg Power Electrical & Construction § 15821750 |S 316435 Assuria P P P )
Services
5 (RW Electrical Company & Building | ¢ 1 ¢40 900 | § 296978 | HandinHand | v | v | v 1
Contractors
6 |RAPS Investments $ 20453,500|% 409,070 Assuria v v v 2
7 |Randolph Taylor Construction $ 15,760,150 | $ 315,203 Caricom v v v 2
8 |AKYE General Contracting $ 20,153,500 % 403,070 Assuria v v v 2
9 VldI‘%Ck Construction & Electrical S 32.921.100 | $ 658.422 Premier P P P )
Services
1o |Guyana Gypsum Innovations & S 28726425|$ 574528|  Nafico viv| v 2
Construction Company
11 |Dalton's Construction $ 14,073,020 $ 280,000 Premier v v 4 1
12 |Cummings Electrical Company Limited | § 14,780,898 | § 400,000 Nafico v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 16,671,702




Date of Tender Opening: February 20, 2025

File Number: Board of Industrial Training (27/2025/38) - Procurement of Security Services

Bid Security

Form of

B;ider Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Flz}sh

0. Currency Currency Agency signed Copy| drive
1 |Panther Security Service Inc $ 79,891,200 | $ 798,912 Premier v v v 2
2 |NM Trucking Security Services $ 40,492,800 | $ 404,928 Premier v | Rec v 2
3 |RK's Guyana Security Services $ 54,864,680 9% 600,000 Premier v v v 1
4 |Elite Protection Services Inc $ 47913,600| % 546,215 Premier v v v 2
5 |Strategic Action Security Limited $ 44542080 |8 445,421 Nafico v v v 1
6 |Atlas Security Services Inc $ 47,716,497 | $ 477,165 Nafico v v v 2
7 |Nel Global Security Company Inc $ 46,195200|$ 461,952 Assuria v v v 2
8 |Hoosein's Security Services Inc $ 46,222,860 | % 462,228 Caricom v v v 1
9 |Brothers Security Firm Inc $ 50,616,000 $ 506,160 Caricom v v v 2
10 |Amalgamated Security Services Guyanalng $ 59921280 |$ 519,293 Assuria v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: February 20, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Labour (28/2025/38) - Procurement of Heavy Duty Vehicles Lots 1-3

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & lil:ln:le::l;ty Bid Security GRA | NIS lr}(::l;ln(;;f Hard Flz}sh
No. Currency Agency . Copy| drive
Currency signed

1 |Gupta Distribution L1 $ 26,000,000 | $ 1,540,000 Caricom v v v 2

1 |Gupta Distribution L2 $ 32,000,000 (L1-3)

1 |Gupta Distribution L3 $ 19,000,000

) S.J agrpohan Construction & General S 6.900,000 600.000 Premier v P v )
Supplies Inc L1

5 S. Jagrpohan Construction & General §  27.800,000 600.000
Supplies Inc L.2

) S.J agrpohan Construction & General §  8.900,000 600.000
Supplies Inc L3

3 |Ansa Motors Guyana Inc L1 $ 15,400,000 740,000 Premier v | Rec v |

3 |Ansa Motors Guyana Inc L2 $ 21,600,000 (L1-2)

4 |Guyana Tractor & Equipment L1 $ 16,500,000 330,000 Caricom v v v 2

4 |Guyana Tractor & Equipment L2 $ 29,000,000 680,000

4 |Guyana Tractor & Equipment L3 $ 14,500,000 290,000

5 IBIS Construction, Equipment, Sales & § 16,000,000 560,000 Diamond X P P )
Rentals Inc L2

5 IBIS Construction, Equipment, Sales & $ 12,000,000 (L1-2)

Rentals Inc L3




6 |Farm Supplies Limited L2 $ 23,460,000 9% 745,200 Assuria
6 |Farm Supplies Limited L3 $ 13,800,000 (L1-2)
7 |IMS Construction Logistics Services L2 | $§ 19,900,000 | $ 420,000 Caricom
7 |IMS Construction Logistics Services L3 | $ 12,000,000 | $ 260,000
g |\M Trucking, Auto Sales & Agri $ 15,000,000 | $ 1,200,000 |  Premier
Machinery L1
NM Trucking, Auto Sales & Agri
8 Machinery L2 $ 13,000,000 (L1-3)
NM Trucking, Auto Sales & Agri
8 Machinery L3 $ 15,000,000
9 Impecpable Construction & General §  11,000000|S 220,000 Caricom
Supplies Inc L1
9 Impec.cable Construction & General §  13200000|S$ 264,000
Supplies Inc 1.2
9 Impecpable Construction & General §  7.600,000|$ 152,000
Supplies Inc L3
10 |BM Soat Auto Sales L1 $ 12,000,000 $ 480,000 Caricom
10 |BM Soat Auto Sales L3 $ 12,000,000 (L1-2)
11 |Alliance Investments L3 $ 12,500,000 $ 250,000 Premier
12 |General Equipment Guyana Limited L2 | § 21,820,000 | $ 771,400 GTM




12 |General Equipment Guyana Limited L3 | $ 16,750,000 (L2-3)

13 |RRT Enterprise & Auto Sales L1 $ 13,900,000| $ 1,352,000 Premier
13 |RRT Enterprise & Auto Sales 1.2 $ 37,800,000 (L1-3)

13 |RRT Enterprise & Auto Sales L3 $ 15,900,000

14 |Ideal Auto Inc L1 $ 13,200,000 | $§ 4,000,712 Nafico
15 |AAQIB Consultancy L1 $ 8,000,000 | $ 600,000 Caricom
15 |AAQIB Consultancy L2 $ 1,400,000

15 |AAQIB Consultancy L3 $ 8,000,000

16 |Massy Motors Guyana Limited L1 $ 17,000,000 | $ 350,000 CG United




Date of Tender Opening: February 20, 2025

File Number: Guyana Energy Agency (16/2025/02) - Design, Supply, Installation, Upgrade & Commissioning of Solar Photovoltaic System at Six Agro-Processing
Facilities for GEA Lots 1-2

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & ]ffms)zfl':ity Bid Security | o | N FT"ern“;e"rf Hard| Flash
No. Currency Currency Agency signed Copy| drive
ImpecF:able Construction & General §  68.502.000 | $ 1.370,040
Supplies Inc L1 ,
1 Impeccable Construction & General Caricom v v v 0
pes $ 68,502,000 | $ 1,370,040
Supplies Inc 1.2
2 |MEP Engineering Services Inc L1 $ 70,077,408 | $ 1,400,000 Premier v v v 2
Green Energy Electrical Services L1 $ 49,998,905 :
v v v
3 Green Energy Electrical Services 1.2 $ 23,354,376 $ 1,600,000 Premier 2 :
2020 FMCG Inc L1 $ 40947425
2 2 v v v
4 2021 FMCG Inc L1 $ 22212,607 $ 1,600,000 RBGL ! :
5 Standby Power Engineering Company § 51.810.000 | $ 1.300,000 Assuria v P v )

(SPECOM) L1




Date of Tender Opening: February 20, 2025

File Number: Guyana Energy Agency (17/2025/02) - Supply & Delivery of Solar PV Equipment & Freezers for GEA in 8 Lots 2025

Bid Security

Form of

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Flz}sh
No. Currency Currency Agency signed Copy| drive
1 |Western Scientific Company Limited L8 HitH R § 4,397,625 Premier v v v 1 2
2 |MEP Engineering Services Inc L1 $ 7,919,005.75| $ 1,400,000 Premier v v v 2

2 |MEP Engineering Services Inc L2 $ 2,283,394.29 (L1-8)

2 |MEP Engineering Services Inc L3 $ 9,372,442.86

2 |MEP Engineering Services Inc L4 $ 981,373.71

2 |MEP Engineering Services Inc L5 $ 2,739,263.43

2 |MEP Engineering Services Inc L6 $ 287,775.00

2 |MEP Engineering Services Inc L7 $ 2,132,500.00

2 |MEP Engineering Services Inc L8 $ 12,971,622.86

3 |Gafsons Industries Limited L1 $ 2,950,000 | § 790,000 RBGL v v v 1 1
3 |Gafsons Industries Limited L2 $ 4,140,000 (L1-8)

3 |Gafsons Industries Limited L3 $ 4,500,000

3 |Gafsons Industries Limited L4 $ 875,320

3 |Gafsons Industries Limited L5 $ 8,247,885

3 |Gafsons Industries Limited L6 $ 269,610

3 |Gafsons Industries Limited L7 $ 1,904,030

3 |Gafsons Industries Limited L8 $ 16,320,000

4 |Tels Engineering Service L1 $ 3,540,000 | $ 750,000 Assuria v v v 2




4 |Tels Engineering Service .2 $ 5,100,000 (L1-7)

4 |Tels Engineering Service L3 $ 12,960,000

4 |Tels Engineering Service L4 $ 1,227,400

4 |Tels Engineering Service L5 $ 12,527,025

4 |Tels Engineering Service L6 $ 405,025

4 |Tels Engineering Service L7 $ 2,905,925

5 |Keyboard Kiosk 1.2 $ 20,000,000 $ 400,000 Assuria
5 |Keyboard Kiosk L3 $ 100,000,000 (L2-3)

6 |Green Energy Electrical Services L1 $ 3,080,000 | $ 400,000 Premier
6 |Green Energy Electrical Services L2 $ 1,464,000 (L1-7)

6 |Green Energy Electrical Services L3 $ 6,690,000

6 |Green Energy Electrical Services L4 $ 621,300

6 |Green Energy Electrical Services L5 $ 2,157,450

6 |Green Energy Electrical Services L6 $ 868,752

6 |Green Energy Electrical Services L7 $ 3,622,863

7 |VMS Business Enterprise .2 $ 3,300,000 | $ 66,000 Assuria
7 |VMS Business Enterprise L4 $ 1,889,900 | $ 37,798

7 |VMS Business Enterprise L6 $ 553,150 | $ 11,063

7 |VMS Business Enterprise L7 $ 2,851,950 | $ 57,039

8 [2020 FMCG Inc L1 $ 2,175,000 | $ 900,000 Assuria
8 (2020 FMCG Inc L2 $ 1,680,000 (L1-6)

8 (2020 FMCG Inc L3 $ 7,473,600




8 (2020 FMCG Inc L4 $ 1,284,000

8 (2020 FMCG IncL5 $ 10,718,905

8 (2020 FMCG Inc L6 $ 7,853,630

9 |Green Power Solutions Inc L1 $ 2,475,000 | $ 1,371,196 Assuria
9 |Green Power Solutions Inc L2 $ 1,740,000 (L1-8)

9 |Green Power Solutions Inc L3 $ 7,624,000

9 |Green Power Solutions Inc L4 $ 700,000

9 |Green Power Solutions Inc L5 $ 7,852,660

9 |Green Power Solutions Inc L8 $ 49,168,140




Date of Tender Opening: February 20, 2025

File Number: Guyana Energy Agency (18/2025/02) - Supply & Delivery of Solar PV Equipment for 58 Sites Lots 1-8

Bid Security

Form of

B;i(()l.er Name of Bidder Blg Iﬁ.i.:(::;t & éﬁl:rl::ltc ;& Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS :ieglL‘lzr 22;(;, ﬁi:‘s:
Assuria (Form of
1 |Barker Systems L1 $ 1,832,274 Tender Page Not v v X 2
Completed & Signed)
2 |KNG Engineering Inc L1 $ 27,335,000 | $ 546,700 Caricom v v v 2
2 |KNG Engineering Inc L2 $ 12,323,500 | $ 246,470
2 |KNG Engineering Inc L3 $ 29280000 % 585,600
3 |Green Energy Electrical Services L1 $ 38,148,000 | $ 3,400,000 Premier v v v 2
3 |Green Energy Electrical Services L2 $ 12,273,200 (L1-8)
3 |Green Energy Electrical Services L3 $ 36,356,000
3 |Green Energy Electrical Services L4 $ 13,380,000
3 |Green Energy Electrical Services L5 $ 4,721,880
3 |Green Energy Electrical Services L6 $ 19,886,160
3 |Green Energy Electrical Services L7 $ 6,233,520
3 |Green Energy Electrical Services L8 $ 24,747,462
4 |Toolsie Persaud Limited L1 $ 30,546,347 |$ 700,000 Caricom v v v 2
4 |Toolsie Persaud Limited L2 $ 9,693816|% 240,000
4 |Toolsie Persaud Limited L3 $ 24451,728 |$ 540,000
4 |Toolsie Persaud Limited L4 $ 65930,112| § 1,400,000
4 |Toolsie Persaud Limited L5 $ 3,176,512 | $ 80,000




4 |Toolsie Persaud Limited L6 $ 5,838,651 9% 14,000

4 |Toolsie Persaud Limited L7 $ 1,548,155 | $ 50,000

4 |Toolsie Persaud Limited L8 $ 10,590,286 | % 240,000

5 |VMS Business Enterprise L2 $ 17,605,000 $ 352,100 Assuria
5 |VMS Business Enterprise L3 $ 26,840,000 $ 536,800

5 |VMS Business Enterprise L5 $ 6,187,150 | $ 123,743

5 |VMS Business Enterprise L7 $ 3,414,200 $ 68,284

5 |VMS Business Enterprise L8 $ 17,773,200 | $ 355,464

6 |Green Power Solutions Inc L1 $ 30,595,000 $ 2,363,128 Assuria
6 |Green Power Solutions Inc L2 $ 14,587,000 (L1-6)

6 |Green Power Solutions Inc L3 $ 37,088,000

6 |Green Power Solutions Inc L4 $ 13,248,000

6 |Green Power Solutions Inc L5 $ 5,297,000

6 |Green Power Solutions Inc L6 $ 17,341,423

7 12020 FMCG Inc L1 $ 26,975,000 $ 3,000,000 RBGL
7 (2020 FMCG Inc L2 $ 14,084,000 (L1-6)

7 (2020 FMCG Inc L3 $ 41,480,000

7 12020 FMCG Inc L4 $ 14,947,200

7 12020 FMCG Inc L5 $ 9,707,000

7 12020 FMCG Inc L6 $ 19,692,481

g Impeccable Construction & General §  32.100000 | S 642,000 Caricom

Supplies Inc L1




Impeccable Construction & General

Supplies Inc L2 22,635,000 452,700
Impec.cable Construction & General 24,200,000 484,000
Supplies Inc L3
Impec.cable Construction & General 12,480,000 249,600
Supplies Inc L4
Impec.cable Construction & General 4216200 84.324
Supplies Inc L5
ImpecF:able Construction & General $.317.000 166,340
Supplies Inc L6
ImpecF:able Construction & General 1.818.450 36.369
Supplies Inc L7
Impeccable Construction & General 15,278,000 305.560

Supplies Inc L8




Date of Tender Opening: February 20, 2025

File Number: Guyana Energy Agency (18/2025/02) - Design, Supply, Installation, Upgrade & Commissioning of Solar Photovoltaic System at the Building in the Hinterland 2025

. . Bid Security . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Flz}sh
No. Currency Agency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
Standby Power Engineering Company :
v v v
1 (SPECOM) $ 14,028,000 | $ 400,000 Assuria 2
2 12020 FMCG Inc $ 25,633,313 600,000 RBGL v v v 1 2




Date of Tender Opening: February 20, 2025

File Number: Guyana Defence Force (04/2025/53) - Provision of Works for Rehabilitation to Medical Corps-Base Camp Ayanganna

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & lilgslel::ity Bid Security GRA | NIS F,;,Oel;ln(;e(;_f Hard Flz}sh
No. Currency Currency Agency signed Copy| drive
1 |Navin's Construction $ 75,765,700 No Bid v | v 2

Security Seen
2 |BM Property Investments Inc $ 79,000,000 $ 1,580,000 Caricom v v v 2
3 |Surajpaul Balkaran & Sons Construction |$ 70,446,090 | $ 1,450,000 Premier v v v 2
4 |Diversity Investments Inc $ 81,289,625| § 1,625,792 Caricom v v v 2
5 |Mobile Construction Company $ 78,098900| $ 1,561,978 Caricom v v v 2
6 |Hoosein's Logistics & Supplies Inc $ 83,693400| $ 1,673,868 Caricom v v v 1
7 |Memorex Enterprise $ 102,046,760 | $ 2,045,000 Caricom 4 v v 2
8 |JAF Enterprise $ 4415600 $ 88,312 Caricom v v v 2
9 |RS & Associates $ 74,931,950 $§ 1,498,639 Caricom v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 78,368,740




Date of Tender Opening: February 20, 2025

File Number: Guyana Defence Force (05/2025/53) - Construction of Sanitary Block-Small Bore Range, Base Camp Stephenson

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & lildmfﬁfn:l;ty Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS FT(L:Eeif Hard) Flash
No. Currency Currency signed Copy| drive
1 |BM Property Investment Inc $ 8,000,000 % 160,000 Caricom v v v 2

Bid Secure
2 |VAS Global $ 8,747,500 Declaration Page v v v 2
Completed & Signed
3 |Surajpaul Balkaran & Sons Construction | $ 11,023450|$ 240,000 Premier v v v 2
.. : . . Bid Secure
4 ]é);f}i&f}!?%lgﬂ, Construction, Logistics & $ 8,093,843 Declaration Page P v v )
Completed & Signed
Bid Secure
5 |FNS Investments $ 11,482,700 Declaration Page v v v 2
Completed & Signed
6 |JAF Enterprise $ 10,805,600 % 291,540 Caricom v v v 1
Bid Secure
7 |Valiant Industrial Service $ 8,673,800 Declaration Page v v v 2
Completed & Signed
8 |RS & Associates $ 11,360,385 | $ 199,305 Caricom 4 v v 1
Engineer's Estimate $ 8,980,090




Date of Tender Opening: February 20, 2025

File Number: Guyana Defence Force (06/2025/53) - Extension & Rehabiliation of GNR Headquarter Building

Bid Security

Form of

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla}sh
No. Currency Currency Agency signed Copy| drive
1 |Valiant Industrial Service $ 24352480 9% 487,050 Caricom v v v 2
2 |VAS Global $ 21,936,900 % 600,000 Premier v v 2
3 |Construct It Inc $ 23,430,800 No Bid v | v | v 2

Security Seen
4 |BM Property Investment Inc $ 25,000,000 $ 500,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |Navin's Construction $ 22,140,800 No Bid X | X | v 2
Security Seen
6 |Guybiz Establishment $ 20218400 |8 404,368 Assuria v v v 2
7 |K. Whyte Construction $ 23,737,310 $ 500,000 Assuria v v v 2
8 |JAF Enterprise $ 3,916,000 | $ 78,230 Caricom v v v 2
9 |Surajpaul Balkaran & Sons Construction | $ 15,441,960 | $ 320,000 Premier v v v 2
10 [RS & Associates $ 26,842,340 |8% 536,847 Caricom v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 24,833,110




Date of Tender Opening: February 20, 2025

File Number: Guyana Defence Force (07/2025/53) - Rehabiliation to A13 Building

. . Bid Security . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla}sh
No. Currency Currency Agency signed Copy| drive
1 |[Construct It Inc $ 23,640,500 | % 472,810 Nafico v v v 2
2 |BM Property Investments Inc $ 24,000,000 | $ 480,000 Caricom v v v 2
3 |ART Supplies & General Construction $ 21,609,160 432,184 Assuria v v v 2
4 |Surajpaul Balkaran & Sons Construction | $ 18,960,100 | $§ 400,000 Premier v v v 2
5 |Memorex Enterprise $ 28,506,125|% 571,000 Caricom v v v 2
¢ |OuyanaGypsum Innovations & $ 26,493,800 % 529,876|  Nafico v | v | v 2
Construction Company
- Seengrme s Construction & Landscaping § 29.679.800|$ 600,000 Assuria v v v )
Services
8 |Navin's Construction $ 26,792,500 NQ Bid v v v 2
Security Seen
9 |Hoosein's Logistics & Supplies Inc $ 28,382,750 | % 567,655 Caricom v v v 1
10 |[VAS Global $ 23,340,000 | $ 600,000 Premier v v v 2
11 |RAPS Investments $ 18,015250|% 400,000 Assuria v v v 2
12 |Pacific Service System $ 23,260,800 9% 465,336 Caricom v v v 2
13 [RS & Associates $ 18,817,020 $ 376,340 Caricom v v v 2
14 |Mobile Construction Company $ 23994800|% 479,896 Caricom v v v 2
15 |Diversity Investments Inc $ 239223009 478,446 Caricom v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 24,059,600




Date of Tender Opening: February 20, 2025

File Number: Guyana Defence Force (08/2025/53) - Construction of RC Pavilion for Non-Commissioned Officers at Small Bore Range

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & lil:lnilelfll:l;ty Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS lff(:a:llge(;'f Hard Flz}sh
No. Currency Currency signed Copy| drive
1 |VAS Global $ 16,013200($ 400,000 Premier v v v 2
2 |Surajpaul Balkaran & Sons Construction | $§ 17,900,550 | $ 360,000 Premier v v v 2
3 |BM Property Investment Inc $ 18,000,000 | $ 360,000 Caricom v v v 2

§ 309,328 Caricom (Form of
4 |RS & Associates $ 15,466,400 S 193.091 Tender Page Not 4 v X 2
’ Signed But Completed)
5 |JAF Enterprise $ 13,036,160 | $ 260,723 Caricom v v v 2
6 |Navin's Construction $ 18,091,500 No Bid Security Seen | X X v 2
7 |M&D Investments $ 17,181,500 3% 343,630 Assuria v v v 2
Assuria (Form of
8 |Resolute Engineering $ 332,000 Tender Page Not v v v 2
Completed But Signed)
9 |K. Whyte Construction $ 16,541,050 |% 360,000 Assuria v v v 2
10 Digita} Design, Construction, Logistics & § 11.606.550 | S 232,131 Caricom v P P )
Supplies
11 |Pacific Service System $ 17,825,700 | $ 356,574 Caricom v v v 1
12 |Faizal Ali Contracting $ 24923450 % 498,469 Premier v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 18,565,900




Date of Tender Opening: February 20, 2025

File Number: Guyana Defence Force (09/2025/53) - Rehabilitation of Head Quarters Training Corps - Camp Stephenson

Bid Security

Form of

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Flz}sh
No. Currency Currency Agency signed Copy| drive
1 |JAF Enterprise $ 14,577,000 |$ 216,112 Caricom v v v 1
2 |Vas Global $ 44,285,365| $ 1,000,000 | Premier Ins. v v v 2
3 |Surujpaul Balkarran and Sons Construction | $ 61,964,250 | $ 1,300,000 | Premier Ins. v v v 2
4 |Valiant Industrial Service $ 45,520,605 | % 910,413 Caricom v v v 2
5 |RS & Associates $ 55,593,838 | $ 1,111,876 Caricom v v v 2
6 |M&D Investments Inc. $ 45357865|% 907,157 Assuria v v v 2
7 |Diversity Investments Inc. $ 65531425 % 1,310,629 Caricom v v v 2
8 |Pacific Service System $ 59,259,565 $§ 1,185,791 Caricom v v v 0
9 |Faizal Ali Contracting $ 35,485,405 |9 709,708 | Premier Ins. 4 v 4 2
10 Digita.1 Design, Construction, Logistics and § 56.110355| $ 1.122.207 Caricom v P v )

Supplies
11 |Construct It Inc. $ 469778508 937,557 Nafico v v v 2
12 |BM Property Investments Inc. $ 47,000,000 | $ 940,000 Caricom v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 46,985,130




Date of Tender Opening: February 20, 2025

File Number: Guyana Defence Force (10/2025/53) - Provision for Weeding, Pruning of Trees & Cleaning of Drains-Various Bases

Bid Security

Form of

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Flz}sh
No. Currency Currency Agency signed Copy| drive
1 |Tanner's Investment L1 $ 4,900,000 NO.Bld v | Vv v 2

Secrurity Seen

1 |Tanner's Investment L2 $ 7,800,000

1 |Tanner's Investment L3 $ 15,900,000

1 |Tanner's Investment L4 $ 16,800,000

1 |Tanner's Investment L5 $ 18,700,000

1 |Tanner's Investment L6 $ 3,100,000

2 |VMS Business Enterprise L1 $ 55,729,056 | $ 1,114,581 Assuria v v v 2
2 |VMS Business Enterprise L2 $ 16,832,680 | $ 336,653

2 |VMS Business Enterprise 1.3 $ 6,460,000 | $ 129,200

2 |VMS Business Enterprise L4 $ 2,756,592 | § 610,000

2 |VMS Business Enterprise L5 $ 30,500,000

2 |VMS Business Enterprise L6 $ 2,096,128

2 |VMS Business Enterprise L7 $ 3,152,000 | $ 63,040

2 |VMS Business Enterprise L10 $ 9,337,192 | $ 186,743

2 |VMS Business Enterprise L11 $ 47,954,000 | $ 959,080

2 |VMS Business Enterprise L12 $ 25,488,000 | $§ 509,760

2 |VMS Business Enterprise .13 $ 32,000,000 | $ 640,000

3 |JAF Enterprise L1 $ 3,500,000 | $ 487,050 Caricom v v v 0




3 |JAF Enterprise L2 $ 2,500,000 (L1-13)

3 |JAF Enterprise L3 $ 3,000,000

3 |JAF Enterprise L4 $ 2,500,000

3 |JAF Enterprise L5 $ 3,000,000

3 |JAF Enterprise L6 $ 1,500,000

3 |JAF Enterprise L7 $ 2,500,000

3 |JAF Enterprise L8 $ 2,500,000

3 |JAF Enterprise L9 $ 2,500,000

3 |JAF Enterprise L10 $ 2,000,000

3 |JAF Enterprise L11 $ 4,000,000

3 |JAF Enterprise L12 $ 4,000,000

3 |JAF Enterprise L13 $ 3,500,000
Dey & Sons Reliable Trucking Service

4 Cleaning & Weeding Company L1 $ 1,300,000 | $ 201,300 Nafico
Dey & Sons Reliable Trucking Service

4 Cleaning & Weeding Company L2 5 300,000 (L1-13)
Dey & Sons Reliable Trucking Service

4 Cleaning & Weeding Company L3 $ 300,000
Dey & Sons Reliable Trucking Service

4 Cleaning & Weeding Company L4 5 945,000
Dey & Sons Reliable Trucking Service

4 Cleaning & Weeding Company L5 $ 330,000

4 Dey & Sons Reliable Trucking Service S 45,000

Cleaning & Weeding Company L6




Dey & Sons Reliable Trucking Service
Cleaning & Weeding Company L7

160,000

Dey & Sons Reliable Trucking Service
Cleaning & Weeding Company L8

895,000

Dey & Sons Reliable Trucking Service
Cleaning & Weeding Company L9

495,000

Dey & Sons Reliable Trucking Service
Cleaning & Weeding Company L10

600,000

Dey & Sons Reliable Trucking Service
Cleaning & Weeding Company L11

1,500,000

Dey & Sons Reliable Trucking Service
Cleaning & Weeding Company L12

1,800,000

Dey & Sons Reliable Trucking Service
Cleaning & Weeding Company L13

895,000

Lightning MC Queen Construction &
Contracting Service L1

431,250

No Bid
Security Seen

Lightning MC Queen Construction &
Contracting Service L2

130,000,746

Lightning MC Queen Construction &
Contracting Service L3

168,712,500

Lightning MC Queen Construction &
Contracting Service L4

37,017,400

Lightning MC Queen Construction &
Contracting Service L6

65,504,000




Lightning MC Queen Construction &

3 Contracting Service L7 5 0,850,000
5 L1ghtn1ng MC Qgeen Construction & §  1.200,000,440
Contracting Service L8
5 L1ghtn1ng MC Qgeen Construction & S 274,000
Contracting Service L9
Lightning MC Queen Construction &
> Contracting Service L10 $ 25,038,200
5 L1ghtn1ng MC Qgeen Construction & §  308.900,000
Contracting Service L11
Lightning MC Queen Construction &
> Contracting Service L12 b 141,600,000
Lightning MC Queen Construction &
3 Contracting Service L13 $ 128,000,000
6 |ART Supplies & General Construction L1 | $ 3,316,440 | $ 510,639 Assuria
6 |ART Supplies & General Construction L3 | § 12,920,000
6 |ART Supplies & General Construction L4 | $ 1,722,870
6 |ART Supplies & General Construction L5 | $ 2,700,000
6 |ART Supplies & General Construction L6 | § 160,008
6 |ART Supplies & General Construction L7 | $ 1,970,000
6 |ART Supplies & General Construction L10 | $ 2,742,560
7 |Shenade Akasai Logistics L1 $ 1,300,000 | $ 156,300 Premier
7 |Shenade Akasai Logistics L2 $ 420,000 (L1-13)
7 |Shenade Akasai Logistics L3 $ 300,000




7 |Shenade Akasai Logistics L4 $ 715,000

7 |Shenade Akasai Logistics L5 $ 305,000

7 |Shenade Akasai Logistics L6 $ 70,000

7 |Shenade Akasai Logistics L7 $ 90,000

7 |Shenade Akasai Logistics L8 $ 750,000

7 |Shenade Akasai Logistics L9 $ 405,000

7 |Shenade Akasai Logistics L10 $ 300,000

7 |Shenade Akasai Logistics L11 $ 1,350,000

7 |Shenade Akasai Logistics 112 $ 1,500,000

7 |Shenade Akasai Logistics 113 $ 310,000

8 |[S.C Logistics L1 $ 1,205,000 | $ 139,928 Premier
8 |S.C Logistics L2 $ 390,900 | (L1-13)
8 |S.C Logistics L3 $ 237,320

8 |S.C Logistics L4 $ 663,270

8 |S.C Logistics L5 $ 253,500

8 |[S.C Logistics L6 $ 51,930

8 |[S.C Logistics L7 $ 76,830

8 |[S.C Logistics L8 $ 680,194

8 |S.C Logistics L9 $ 356,200

8 |S.C Logistics L10 $ 200,620

8 |S.C Logistics L11 $ 1,203,800

8 |S.C Logistics .12 $ 1,380,600

8 |S.C Logistics L13 $ 266,240

9 |QA Civil Works L1 $ 899,598 | $ 600,000 Caricom




9 |QA Civil Works L2 $ 442192  (L1-13)
9 |QA Civil Works L3 $ 180,950

9 |QA Civil Works L4 $ 564,928

9 |QA Civil Works L5 $ 400,000

9 |QA Civil Works L6 $ 80,040

9 |QA Civil Works L7 $ 197,500

9 |QA Civil Works L8 $ 823,088

9 |QA Civil Works L9 $ 790,000

9 |QA Civil Works L10 $ 150,638

9 |QA Civil Works L11 $ 1,193,600

9 |QA Civil Works L12 $ 1,416,000

9 |QA Civil Works L13 $ 192,000

10 [MVP Trading L1 $ 1,370,000 | $ 172,400 Premier
10 |MVP Trading L2 $ 500,000 | (L1-13)
10 [MVP Trading L3 $ 350,000

10 [MVP Trading L4 $ 800,000

10 [MVP Trading L5 $ 370,000

10 |MVP Trading L6 $ 100,000

10 [MVP Trading L7 $ 120,000

10 [MVP Trading L8 $ 800,000

10 [MVP Trading L9 $ 460,000

10 [MVP Trading L10 $ 350,000

10 [MVP Trading L11 $ 1,400,000

10 [MVP Trading L12 $ 1,600,000

10 [MVP Trading L13 $ 400,000




11 |Resolute Engineering L1 $ 959,551 | § 123,460 Assuria
11 |Resolute Engineering .2 $ 497,466 (L1-13)
11 |Resolute Engineering 1.3 $ 193,800

11 |Resolute Engineering 1.4 $ 663,305

11 |[Resolute Engineering L5 $ 500,000

11 |Resolute Engineering L6 $ 45,853

11 |Resolute Engineering L7 $ 74,860

11 |[Resolute Engineering 1.8 $ 469,501

11 [Resolute Engineering L9 $ 260,300

11 |Resolute Engineering L10 $ 252,943

11 |Resolute Engineering LL11 $ 1,081,150

11 |Resolute Engineering L12 $ 988,710

11 |Resolute Engineering L.13 $ 185,600




