Date of Tender Opening: July 17, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education (461/2025/40) - Construction of St. Joseph High School Annex

. . Bid Security Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed

1 BK In'ternatlonal Inc (Technical & Financial Proposal 3 7,589.400 Nafico v v v )
Submitted)

5 Khem'raj Nauth Inc (Technical & Financial Proposal 3 7,589,400 Assuria v v v )
Submitted)

3 |Advance Engineering (Technical Proposal Submitted) $ 7,589,400 Assuria v v X 2
Shandong High-Speed Dejian Group Limited .

4 (Technical & Financial Proposal Submitted) $ 7,589,400 Premier NA | NA v 2

5 Q.lanjla'n Group Compan}{ Guyana Inc (Technical & S 7,589.400 Premier N/A | N/A v )
Financial Proposal Submitted)

6 Ilyas Legacy Firms (Technical & Financial Proposal 3 6,300,000 Premier v v v )
Submitted)

- JD Im'/estments Inc (Technical & Financial Proposal 3 7,589.400 Premier v v v )
Submitted)

3 Nabi Construc‘uon Inc (Technical & Financial Proposal 3 7,589.400 Assuria v v v )
Submitted)

9 Pacific Rim Cor.ltractors (Technical & Financial 3 7,589.400 Assuria v v v )
Proposal Submitted)




Date of Tender Opening: July 17, 2025

File Number: Guyana Water Inc (106/2025/45) - Installation of Water Supply System in Wailang

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z::; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéill;(; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |Blue Print Builders Inc $ 41,734,900 | $ 1,190,000 Assuria v v v 2
2 [Sheriff Construction Inc $ 39,097,200 | $ 720,000 Assuria v v v 2
3  |Dijiris Engineering & Construction $ 58,237,000 | $ 1,164,740 Nafico v v v 2
4 |Urban Edge Builders Inc $ 40,047,000 | $ 645,000 Assuria v v v 2
5 |Expert Builders & Supplies Contractors $ 33,658,000 | $ 680,000 Premier v v v 1 2
6 |Kanuku Builders & Suppliers Contractors $ 33,657,000 | $ 680,000 Premier v v v 1 2
7  |Precision Construction General Services & Supplies Inc $ 39,097,200 | $ 680,000 Premier v v v 2
3 L.G:S Ba'rnes General Building Construction & Civil 3 37.918,000 | $ 860,000 Caricom v v v )
Engineering
9  |TrinGuy Importers & Exporters Inc $ 39,936,000 | $ 860,000 Caricom v v v 2
10 [Super Graphics $ 42,587,000 | $ 867,740 Caricom v v v 2
11 |Joshi Construction & Transportation Establishment $ 49,000,000 | $ 980,000 Caricom v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 43,387,000




Date of Tender Opening: July 17, 2025

File Number: Georgetown Public Hospital Corporation (184/2025/46) - Procurement of Retrofitting Works for the Human Resource Department

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |William's General Construction $ 12,853,775 BSD C/S v v v 2
2 |Centaur Investments Inc $ 19,734,665 BSD C/S v v v 2
3 |Office Pro Enterprise & Contracting Services $ 13,405,885 BSD C/S v v v 2
4 |AKP Contracting $ 14,895,315 BSD C/S v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 13,900,250




Date of Tender Opening: July 17, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Home Affairs (369/2025/51) - Procurement & Installation of an Automatic Airflow System

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |MEP Engineering Services Inc L1 $ 8,542,988 | $ 1,040,000 Premier v v v 2
MEP Engineering Services Inc L2 $ 5,687,088
MEP Engineering Services Inc L3 $ 8,542,988
MEP Engineering Services Inc L4 $ 5,687,088
MEP Engineering Services Inc L5 $ 8,542,988
MEP Engineering Services Inc L6 $ 8,542,988




Date of Tender Opening: July 17, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Home Affairs (370/2025/51) - Procurement of Oxygen Refilling Machine

. . Bid Security Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
K tructi It i 1
1 S& Cons ruction, Consultancy Services & Genera 3 25,550,000 | $ 511,000 Premier v v v )
Supplies Inc
. .. . Republic Bank
2 |AA Laquise Trinidad Limited $ 51,880,160.42 | US $6500 (T&T) N/A | N/A v 2




Date of Tender Opening: July 17, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Home Affairs (371/2025/51) - Procurement of Rescue & Mechanical Tools

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency ) Copy | drive
Currency signed
Form of Tender
) Page Not .
1 |Westzyde Marine Inc Completed But $ 1,490,000 Assuria v v v 2
Signed
2 |Gopie Investments Inc $ 24,055,000 | $ 481,100 Caricom v v v 2
3 S&K Construcﬂon, Consultancy Services & General $ 33,138,033 | 662.761 Premier v v v 1 5
Supplies Inc




Date of Tender Opening: July 17, 2025

File Number: Supreme Court of Judicature (15/2025/55 FIN) - Design & Supervision Services for the Construction of Mediation Legal Resource & Conference Centre at Maria's Lodge Phase 1

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency ) Copy | drive
Currency signed
1  |Kalitech Inc (79.69) $ 7,700,000 v 0
2 [Sizwe Jackson Consultancy Service (81.33) $ 14,934,750 v 0
3 Survey & Project Management Inc (80.67) Design $ 7,131,000 v ) 0
Survey & Project Management Inc (80.67) Supervision $ 30,295,000
4 MEP Engineering Services Inc (80.33) Design $ 6,077,500 v )
MEP Engineering Services Inc (80.33) Design $ 15,084,500
5 |E&A Consultants Inc (81.67) $ 32,267,250 v 1 1
6 |RVS Structural Engineering (92) $ 15,562,105 v 2 0
- Al Architects (82) Design $ 8,928,480 v ) |
Al Architects (82) Supervision $ 16,680,480
Carlhbbean Engineering Management Consultants Inc (93.67) $ 4,788,000
8 Design v 2 0
Caribbean Engineering Management Consultants Inc (93.67)
. $ 11,387,460
Supervision




Date of Tender Opening: July 17, 2025

File Number: Supreme Court of Judicature (16/2025/55 FIN) - Design & Supervision Services for the Construction of a Two Storied (4) Apartment Living Quarters for Judicial Officers at
the New Amsterdam High Court Compound

. . Bid Security Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%ﬁgg::}t} & Amount & Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS T?nder Iéill;(; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 Cornerstone Consulting Group (78.67) Design $ 12,330,000 v ) 0
Cornerstone Consulting Group (78.67) Supervision $ 8,220,000
Caribbean Englneerlng Management Consultants Inc 3 3,890,250
) (79.67) Design v ) 0
Caribbean Engineering Management Consultants Inc
. $ 5,705,700
(79.67) Supervision
3 |RVS Structural Engineering (81.33) $ 10,457,789 v 1 0
4 |Sizwe Jackson Consultancy Service (80.67) $ 13,624,875 v 0
Survey & Project Management Inc (80.33) Design $ 7,131,000
S Survey & Project Management Inc (80.33) Supervision $ 16,357,000 v 2 0
6 MEP Engineering Services Inc (81.67) Design $ 6,077,500 Y )
MEP Engineering Services Inc (81.67) Supervision $ 11,612,500
7 |E&A Consultants Inc (92.00) $ 17,834,750 v 1 1
8 |Al Architects (82.00) $ 18,025,452 v 2 1
9 |Kalitech Inc (93.67) $ 4,875,000 v 0




Date of Tender Opening: July 17, 2025

File Number: Supreme Court of Judicature (17/2025/55 FIN) - Design & Supervision Services for the Construction of New Wing at the New Amsterdam Sub-Registry Berbice Family &
Land Court Building

. . Bid Security Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%ﬁgg::}t} & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéill;(; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed

1 Al Architects (82) Design $ 9,052,398 Y ) 1
Al Architects (82) Supervision $ 14,425,104

5 MEP Engineering Services Inc (80.33) Design $ 6,077,500 v )
MEP Engineering Services Inc (81.67) Design $ 15,084,500

3 PME Consulting Engineers Inc (82.33) Design $ 5,000,000 v 1
PME Consulting Engineers Inc (82.33) Supervision $ 9,000,000

4 |Sizwe Jackson Consultancy Service (81.33) $ 13,624,875 v 0

5 |E&A Consultants Inc (81.67) $ 26,514,000 v 1 1
Caribbean Epgmeermg Management Consultants Inc 3 4,731,000

6 (93.67) Design v ) 0
Caribbean Engineering Management Consultants Inc

. $ 10,185,900

(93.67) Supervision

7 |RVS Structural Engineering (92.00) $ 16,377,263 1 0
Survey & Project Management Inc (80.67) Design $ 7,131,000 v 2 0

8 Survey & Project Management Inc (80.67) Supervision $ 30,295,000

9 |Kalitech Inc (79.67) $ 7,000,000 v 0




Date of Tender Opening: July 17, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Culture, Youth & Sports (188/2025/44) - Construction of Southern & Eastern Fence-Football Field at the Guyana National Stadium

Bid Security

Form of

Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%ﬁgg::}t} & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéill;(; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |JLEEE Enterprise $ 8,013,652 BSD Signed v v v 1
2 |Abika Entrprise $ 7,396,063 BSD Signed v v v 0
3 |Ajan Construction & Services $ 6,380,587 BSD Signed v v v 2
4 |Legacy Logistics Maintenance & Supplies $ 10,162,013 BSD Signed v v v 0




Date of Tender Opening: July 17, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Culture, Youth & Sports (189/2025/44) - Construction of Buffer Zone at the Basketball Court-Guyana National Stadium

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z::; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéill;(; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |Legacy Logistics Maintenance & Supplies $ 6,608,658 BSD Signed v v v 0
2 |KDL Construction $ 6,671,700 BSD Not Signed v v v 0
3 |Ajan Construction & Services $ 10,044,825 BSD Signed v v v 1




Date of Tender Opening: July 17, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Culture, Youth & Sports (190/2025/44) - Completion of Southern Fence

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder . Bid Amount & . . Hard | Flash
No. Name of Bidder Currency Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Copy | drive
Currency signed
1  |Legacy Logistics Maintenance & Supplies $ 5,604,004 BSD Signed v v v 0




Date of Tender Opening: July 17, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Culture, Youth & Sports (191/2025/44) - Upgrading of Electrical System-Kuru Kuru Training Centre

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency . Copy | drive
Currency signed
1 |Bowrocks Mini Mart $ 9,812,565 BSD Signed v v v 0




Date of Tender Opening: July 17, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Culture, Youth & Sports (192/2025/44) - Upgrading of Auditorium Training Building Kuru Kuru Training Centre

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency ) Copy | drive
Currency signed
1 N&A Qeneral Constrction Maintenance, Supplies & $ 4,024,860 BSD Signed v v v 0
Janitorial
Form of Tender
2 |MR Supplies,General Construction & Maintenance Page Not Completed BSD Signed v v X 0
& Signed
3 |E.J & N General Construction & Maintenance $ 3,794,963 BSD Signed v v v 0




Date of Tender Opening: July 17, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Culture, Youth & Sports (193/2025/44) - Upgrading of Sanitary Facilities in Orange Stand at Guyana National Stadium

. . Bid Security Form of
Blgder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.sh
0. Currency . Copy | drive
Currency signed
1 |E.J & N General Construction & Maintenance 3,310,650 BSD Signed v v v 0
2 |Kefa Naughton Contracting Services 4,199,160 BSD Not Signed v v v 0




Date of Tender Opening: July 17, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Culture, Youth & Sports (194/2025/44) - Resurfacing of Roads Kuru Kuru Training Centre

. . Bid Security Form of
Blgder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.sh
0. Currency . Copy | drive
Currency signed
1 |J. Hussain's Construction & Supplies 5,299,140 BSD Signed v v v 2
2 |Hana's Construction Cleaning Services & Supplies 6,673,000 BSD Signed v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: July 17, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Culture, Youth & Sports (195/2025/44) - Reconstruct Roof of the Old Squash Court Building at the National Racquet Centre

. . Bid Security Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z::; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéill;(; l;l:}iil;

Currency signed

1 N&A Qeneral Constmctlon Maintenance, Supplies & 3 7,290,056 BSD Signed v v v 0

Janitorial Services

2 |E.J & N General Construction & Maintenance $ 7,525,676 BSD Signed v v v 0

3 |L&L Cosntruction $ 8,157,895 BSD Signed v v v 0

4 |D'S Ground Work Solutions $ 7,416,056 BSD Signed v v v 0




Date of Tender Opening: July 17, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education (451/2025/40) - Supply, Delivery, Installation & Testing of Tools & Equipment for Government Technical Institute

Bidder
No.

Name of Bidder

Bid Amount &
Currency

Bid Security
Amount &
Currency

Bid Security Agency

GRA

NIS

Form of
Tender
signed

Hard
Copy

Flash
drive

NO BIDS RECEIVED




Date of Tender Opening: July 17, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education (452/2025/40) - Rehabilitation Works to St. Francis Nursery School

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%ﬁgg::}t} & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéill;(; l;l:}iil;

Currency signed
1 |Ceraturium $ 13,127,000 BSD Signed v v v 2
2 |ILM Surujpaul Construction $ 14,900,000 BSD Not Signed v v v 1
3 |Global Builders Engineering Inc. $ 14,243,500 | $ 298,000 | Caricom v v v 2
4 |Rahaman's Investment $ 13,512,000 BSD Signed v v v 1
5 |Lefty's Enterprise $ 11,653,250 BSD Signed v v v 2
6 |S&E Persaud Construction Service $ 12,570,000 BSD Signed v v v 1
7 |Fast Signs Guyana $ 13,812,000 BSD Signed v v v X
8 |Deonarine Jaikaran Cleaning & Construction Services $ 12,945,750 BSD Signed v v v 1
9 |Holistic Approch General Contracting & Supplies Service | $ 16,370,600 BSD Signed v v v 1

Engineer's Estimate $ 10,600,000




Date of Tender Opening: July 17, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education (453/2025/40) - Electrical Rehabilitation to St. Joseph High

. . Bid Securi Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount &ty Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency ) Copy | drive
Currency signed
1 |Digital Design Construction, Logistics & Supplies $ 35,234,850 | $ 704,697 Caricom v v v 2
Form of Tender
2 |Emeralds General Contracting & Distributors Page Not No Bid Security Seen v v X 2
Completed & Signed
3 |Jaigobin Investments $ 37,700,000 | $ 754,000 Caricom v v v 2
4 |Pooran Ram Boodhaley General Contracting $ 34,555,500 | $ 691,110 Premier v v v 2
5 |Holistic Approach General Contracting & Supplies $ 36,144,150 | $ 760,000 Premier v v v 2
6 |R's Modern Construction & Supplies $ 41,315,400 | $ 760,000 Premier v v v 2
7 |Ceraturium $ 353,347,200 | $ 760,000 Caricom v v v 1
8 |STS Investment $ 35,400,540 | $ 708,011 Premier v v v 1
9 |R Persid Construction $ 35,748,720 | $ 760,000 Nafico v v v 1
10 |Mega Power Electrical & Construction Services $ 35,261,100 | $ 705,222 Assuria v v v 1
11 |B.M Property Investments Inc $ 40,000,000 | $ 800,000 Caricom v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 38,070,900




Date of Tender Opening: July 17, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education (454/2025/40) - Electrical Rehabilitation to St. Stephen Primary

. . Bid Securi Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount &ty Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency ) Copy | drive
Currency signed
1 |[STS Investments $ 13,330,275 BSD C/S v v v |
2 |R. Persid Construction $ 13,188,210 BSD C/S v v v 1
3 |Holistic Approach General Contracting & Supplies $ 14,756,925 BSD C/S v v v 1
Form of Tender
4 |Innovative Development Solution Guyana (IDSGY) Page Not BSD C/S v v X 1
Completed & Signed
5 |The Property Experts Supplies & Services $ 13,952,400 BSD C/S v v v 2
6 |B.M Property Investments Inc $ 16,900,000 BSD C/S v v v 1
7 |Ceraturium $ 13,973,400 BSD C/S v v v 1
8 |R's Modern Construction & Supplies $ 14,280,525 BSD C/S v v v 2
9 | Wick's Enterprise $ 14,696,850 BSD C/S v v v 2
10 |Mega Power Electrical & Construction Services $ 13,775,900 BSD C/S v v v |
11 |CivilEC Engineering Solutions $ 12,655,650 BSD C/S v v v 1
12 |Jaigobind Investments $ 14,600,000 | $ 290,000 | Vv | v 1
13 |[Star Executive Services $ 12,067,125 BSD C/S v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 14,568,225




Date of Tender Opening: July 17, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education (455/2025/40) - Electrical Rehabilitation to Bishop High L. Wing

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%ﬁgg::}t} & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéill;(; l;l:}iil;

Currency signed
1 |Mega Power Electrical & Construction Services $ 21,180,600 | $ 423,612 Assuria v v v 2
2 |STS Investment $ 22,952,580 | $ 459,052 Premier v v X 1
3  |R Persid Construction $ 21,548,100 | $ 460,000 Nafico v v v 1
4 |BM Property Investment Inc. $ 25,000,000 | $ 500,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |Fugenz Business Solutions $ 22,999,515 | $ 549,990 Caricom v v v 2
6 |Digital Design Construction, Logistics & Supplies $ 21,154,350 | $ 423,087 Caricom v v v 2
7  |Smart Builders Construction & Supplies $ 22,165,500 | $ 4,600,000 Premier v v v 2
8 |Star Executive Services $ 19,897,500 | $ 397,950 Premier v v v 1
9 |Jaigobind Investements $ 22,000,000 | $ 454,000 Caricom v v v 1
10 |Ceraturium $ 224,235,800 | $ 460,000 Caricom v v v 2

Engineer's Estimate $ 24,267,600




Date of Tender Opening: July 17, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education (456/2025/40) - Construction of Shed East Street Nursery

. . . . Form of
s [ s Tascons s o | s [ o ]
1 |Rajesh Woodworking & Construction Services $ 10,293,150 BSD C/S v v v 1
2 |Innovation Development Solution Guyana $ 7,765,800 BSD C/S v v v 1
3 |Rahaman's Investment $ 7,503,300 BSD C/S v v v 2
4  |Lefty's Enterprise $ 10,890,075 BSD C/S v v v 2
5 |R L Construction $ 6,565,257 BSD C/S v v v 1
6 |Holistic Approach General Contracting & Supplies $ 8,006,250 BSD C/S v v v 1
7 |Emeralds General Contracting & Distributors $ 9,579,360 BSD C/S v v v 1
8 |KW & C Enterprise $ 61,191,400 BSD C/S v v v 1
Form of Tender
9 |Fletchmman Contracting Services Page Not Completed BSD Not C/S v v X 1
& Signed
10 | VI Enterprise $ 12,875,625 BSD C/S v v v 1
11 |Ceraturium $ 11,295,900 BSD C/S v v v 1
12 |Professional Build Experts $ 8,066,625 BSD C/S v v v 1
13 |S&E Persaud Construction Services $ 6,688,500 BSD C/S v v v 1
14 |Fast Signs Guyana $ 8,238,300 BSD C/S v v v 0
15 Zegr;)rﬁe Jaikaran Cleaning & Construction Services (DJS $ 7.454.790 BSD C/S v v v 1
16 |The Property Experts & Supplies & Services $ 8,036,700 BSD C/S v v v 2
17 |B.M Property Investments Inc $ 16,900,000 BSD C/S v v v 1
18 |MAEC Enterprises $ 14,408,100 | $ 288,162 | Assuria v v v 2
19 |Mega Power Electrical & Construction Services $ 9,981,300 BSD C/S v v v 1
20 |MSB Investment $ 7,938,000 BSD C/S v v v 1
21 |KNV Designs, Construction & Supplies $ 12,324,900 BSD C/S v v v 1
22 |ILM Surujpaul Construction $ 13,770,960 BSD C/S v v v 1
23  |J&A Lumberyard & Contracting Services $ 8,302,350 BS? C/S v v v 1
Engineer's Estimate $ 8,475,600




Date of Tender Opening: July 17, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education (457/2025/40) - Construction of Parking Lot at New Amsterdam Branch Library

. . Bid Securi Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount &ty Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency ) Copy | drive
Currency signed
1 |Neria Enterprise $ 12,403,230 BSD C/S v v v 2
2 |ILM Surujpaul Construction $ 14,900,000 BSD C/S v v v 1
Form of Tender
3 |Feroz Construction Corrlla]lpgl: tI:c;);Sut BSD C/S v v v 2
Signed

4 |Angelique Enterprise $ 11,967,900 BSD C/S v v v 1

5 |Outar Construction $ 13,251,525 BSD C/S v v v |

6 |A Grade Contracting Services $ 8,766,917 BSD C/S v v v |

7 | Alpha Construction Services $ 9,108,225 BSD C/S v v v |

8 |Blue Horizon Construction $ 14,228,288 BSD C/S v v v |

9 |R.A & J.P Contracting Services $ 13,033,650 BSD C/S v v v |
10 |Dalton's Construction $ 11,101,125 BSD C/S v v v |
11 |Fast Signs Guyana $ 13,967,625 BSD C/S v v v 1
12 |Innovative Development Solution Guyana (IDSGY) $ 11,196,885 BSD C/S v v v 1
13 |K&S Civil Engineering Contracting Services Inc $ 14,482,125 | $ 298,000 | Caricom v v v 1
14 |Fugenz Business Solutions $ 13,995,555 BSD C/S v v v |
15 |Ceraturium $ 13,108,725 BSD C/S v v v 1
16 |P&S General Supplies & Contracting Services $ 12,750,570 BSD C/S v v v 1
17 |VI Enterprise $ 12,494,212 BSD C/S v v v |
18 |Avi Construction & Supply $ 12,658,800 BSD C/S v v v 1
19 [Rahaman's Investment $ 13,416,375 BSD C/S v v v |
20 |R&J construction $ 9,808,050 BSD C/S v v v 2
21 |Terrafrom Solutions $ 14,187,600 | $ 283,752 Assuria v v v 2

Engineer's Estimate $ 14,983,500




Date of Tender Opening: July 17, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education (458/2025/40) - Rehabilitation Works to Flooring at Linden Library Branch

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%ﬁgg::}t} & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéill;(; l;l:}iil;

Currency signed
1 |SOC Construction $ 14,844,755 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 1
2 |AAA Contracting Service Solutions $ 12,024,600 No Bid Security Seen v v v 1
3 |Mr. Kelmon Enterprise $ 12,701,220 | $ 300,000 | Caricom v v v 1
4 |ILM Surujpaul Construction $ 15,000,000 No Bid Security Seen v v v 1
5 |Royalty Trucking $ 12,182,000 No Bid Security Seen v v v 1
6 |K&S Civil Engineering $ 14,013,300 | $ 298,000 \ Caricom v v v 2
7  |Fugenz Business Solutions $ 13,923,620 No Bid Security Seen v v v 1
8 |Withwick's Enterprise $ 14,766,655 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 1
9 |Ceraturium $ 12,575,810 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 1
10 |Dalton's Construction $ 11,850,468 No Bid Security Seen v v v 1

Engineer's Estimate $ 14,952,000




Date of Tender Opening: July 17, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education (459/2025/40) - Construction of Harudiah Primary

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%ﬁgg::}t} & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéill;(; l;l:}iil;

Currency signed
1  |Holistic Contracting & Procurement Inc $ 583,690,000 | $ 8,730,000 Caricom v v v 2
2 |Basheir & Sons Cosntruction Inc $ 814,992,450 | $ 8,998,500 Nafico v v v 2
3  |Sheik Hussein Contracting Service $ 1,054,891,698 | $ 17,625,000 Premier v v v 2
4 |Ceraturium $ 575,117,000 | $ 3,985,500 Caricom v v v 2
5 |K&K Boat Building, Construction & General Supplies $ 593,527,400 | $ 8,902,911 Caricom v v v 2
6 |KBEE Enterprise Inc. $ 598,155,900 | $ 8,972,339 Caricom v v v 2
7 |Mohamed Excacting Construction Inc $ 830,068,000 | $ 12,006,649 Nafico v v v 2
8 |ARK Trading $ 800,445,000 | $ 12,006,649 Nafico v v v 2
9 |D. Chowkai & Sons Construction $ 564,725,000 | $ 8,460,000 Caricom v v v 2
10 |Global Building Engineering Inc. $ 83,000,000 | $ 3,500,000 Caricom v v v 2
11 |Trevon David Construction Service $ 498,200,000 | $ 8,925,000 Assuria v v v 2
12 |Aruca Investement $ 597,587,000 | $ 11,250,000 Caricom v v v 2

Engineer's Estimate $ 599,973,900




Date of Tender Opening: July 17, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education (460/2025/40) - Construction of Information Technology Lab One Mile Primary School

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%ﬁgg::}t} & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéill;(; l;l:}iil;

Currency signed
1  |Wick's Enterprise $ 14,368,935 BSD C/S v v v 2
2 |SCC Construction $ 14,275,643 BSD C/S v v v 2
3 |Ceraturium $ 14,137,935 BSD C/S v v v 1
4 |Global Builders Engineering Inc $ 15,677,025 | $ 298,000 | Caricom v v v 2
5 |ILM Surujpaul $ 14,900,000 BSD C/S v v v 1
6 |Mr. Kelmon Enterprise $ 13,954,920 BSD C/S v v v 1
7 |V&K Construction Service $ 14,830,695 BSD C/S v v v 1
8 |Dalton Construction $ 11,178,027 BSD C/S v v v 1
9 |KW&C Enterprise $ 12,408,469 BSD C/S v v v 1
10 |Adon Construction $ 14,494,515 BSD C/S v v v 2

Engineer's Estimate $ 14,693,315
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