Date of Tender Opening: July 29, 2025

File Number: Guyana Office for Investment (228/2025/01) - Electrical Works for the Main Office Building

. . Bid Security Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |MA-Legacy Engineering $ 15,753,826 No Bid Security Seen v v v 1 0
2 [R. Persid Construction $ 23,403,632 No Bid Security Seen v v v 1




Date of Tender Opening: July 29, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Human Services & Social Security (110/2025/39) - Supply & Delivery of Furniture & Equipment for Child Care Protection

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |Hoyte's Logistics and Trading $ 2,553,500 BSD completed and Signed v v v 0
2 |A.S Woodworking Establishment $ 2,430,000 | $ 48,600 Premier v v v 2
3  [Meditron Inc $ 4,490,200 | $ 89,804 Diamond v v v 2
4 |Giftland Officemax $ 3,708,499 | $ 74,170 Nafico v v v 1




Date of Tender Opening: July 29, 2025

File Number: Guyana National Bureau of Standards (97/2025/23) - Annual Maintenance-Chilled Water AC System GNBS

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |Auto Supplies Company $ 40,344,920 | $ 900,000 Premier v v v 2
2 |Hookmally (Guyana) Inc $ 25,640,700 | $ 512,814 Premier v v v 2
3 |TAQ Solutions (Guyana) Inc $ 8,904,038 | § 200,000 Assuria v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: July 29, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Public Works (101/2025/31 FIN) - Consultancy Services for Construction Supervision of the Secondary Connections to the New Mackenzie-Wismar Bridge

Bid Security Form of

Bidder . Bid Amount & . . Hard | Flash
No. Name of Bidder Currency Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Copy | drive
Currency signed
SRKN'gineering & Associates Limited (97.33) Includin
1 gineering (97.33) € s 143,820,000 v 2 |1

all Indirect Local Taxes

Surveying & Project Management Inc (78.67) Excluding
all Indirect Local Taxes $ 88,400,000 v ) 1

2 . .
Suryeymg & Project Management Inc (78.67) Local $ 12,376,000
Indirect Local Taxes
%.ieczc Associates Inc (98.33) Excluding all Indirect Local S 122,570,000
3 v 2 1
C.B & Associates Inc (98.33) Local Indirect Local Taxes | $ 17,159,800
Carlbbe'an Englne.erlng Management Consultant Inc (94) S 56,620,000
4 Excluding all Indirect Local Taxes v ) 1

Caribbean Engineering Management Consultant Inc (94)

Local Indirect Local Taxes $ 7,926,300




Date of Tender Opening: July 29, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Home Affairs (429/2025/51) - Completion of Lecturer Hall at Dora Academy Campus

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed

1 |D. Chowkai & Sons Construction $ 110,831,333 | $ 2,126,627 Caricom v v v 2
2 |Holistic Contracting & Procurement Inc $ 117,104,348 | $ 2,342,087 Caricom v v v 2
3  |Professional Build Experts $ 95,140,574 | $ 2,000,000 Premier v v v 2
4 |Construct It Inc $ 110,588,048 | $ 2,211,761 Nafico v v v 2
5 |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 95,312,879 | $ 1,600,000 Caricom v v v 2
6 |C.I Construction Supplies $ 89,879,990 | $ 1,797,600 Assuria v v v 2
7  |Westbrook Caribbean Inc $ 74,239,932 | $ 1,600,000 Caricom v v v 2
8 |Navin & Sons Construction $ 84,791,774 | $ 1,695,835 Assuria v v v 2
9 |GD's Construction & Supplies $ 87,101,774 | $ 1,742,035 Assuria v v v 2
10 |Truck Smart $ 110,080,793 | $ 2,400,000 Premier v v v 2
11 |Naven's Construction $ 92,171,993 | $ 1,843,440 Caricom v v v 2
12 |A.H&J Construction Services $ 54,795,520 No Bid Security Seen X X v 2
13 |Metal & Fabrication Ink $ 84,000,000 | $ 1,680,000 \ Assuria v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: July 29, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Home Affairs (430/2025/51) - Construction of Watch Tower & Dredging at Ruimveldt Wharf

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1  |Holistic Contracting & Procurement Inc $ 55,881,720 | $ 1,117,634 Caricom v v v 2
2 |D. Chowkai & Sons Construction $ 52,803,360 | $ 1,056,067 Caricom v v v 2
3 |Gopie Investments Inc $ 50,136,468 | $ 1,002,730 Caricom v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: July 29, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Home Affairs (431/2025/51) - Construction of Fence & Drains at New Amsterdam Prison

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |D. Chowkai & Sons Construction $ 263,461,128 | $ 5,269,223 Caricom v v v 2
2 |Holistic Contracting & Procurement Inc $ 288,466,878 | $ 5,769,338 Caricom v v v 2
3 |A&K Construction and Maintenance Services $ 281,091,090 | $ 5,621,822 Premier v v v 2
4 |Singh & Son Construction $ 308,945,123 | $ 6,178,903 Premier v v v 2
5 |GD's Construction $ 243,265,276 | $ 4,865,305 Assuria v v v 2
6 ;?lxifle;:fs;;lty Investments Construction Services (SICS S 269.832.780 | § 5,600,000 Assuria v v v )
7 |Icon Construction and Maintenance Service $ 227,539,200 | $ 4,550,784 Premier v v v 2
8 [Metal & Fabrication Ink $ 215,226,433 | $ 4,340,000 Assuria v v v 2
9 |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 220,478,937 | $ 150,000 Caricom v v v 2
10 |Angelique Enterprise $ 251,864,130 | $ 4,550,784 Premier v v v 2
11 |Ajay Welding Shop $ 228,752,659 | $ 4,575,053 Premier v v v 2
12 |Navin & Son's Construction $ 227,513,701 | $ 4,550,274 Assuria v v v 2
13 |K. Mahabir Construction Firm $ 227,914,200 | $ 4,540,284 Caricom v v v 2
14 |Pacific Service System $ 220,731,878 | $ 4,714,638 Caricom v v v 1
15 |A.A Construction $ 274,304,625 | $ 5,500,000 Premier v v v 2
16 |Naven's Construction $ 251,400,030 | $ 5,028,000 Caricom v v v 2
17 |Andrea J. Mc Rae Construction $ 184,936,290 No Bid Security Seen v v v 0
18 |Rockey & Son Construction $ 479,435,985 | $ 9,713,740 Premier v v v 2
19 |Premier Contracting Services $ 284,683,403 | $ 5,700,000 Premier v v v 2
20 |Ultimate Vision $ 227,276,700 | $ 4,545,534 Premier v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: July 29, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Home Affairs (432/2025/51) - Procurement of Dry & Fresh Ration for Inmates & Officers Lots 1-5 GPS

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |Beephoria Enterprise L1A $ 2,784,780 BSD C/S v v v 1
2 |Office Pro Enterprise & Contracting Services L1B $ 6,116,990 | $ 3,269,329 Assuria v v v 1
2 |Office Pro Enterprise & Contracting Services L2B $ 74,376,650
2 |Office Pro Enterprise & Contracting Services L3D $ 31,313,040
2 |Office Pro Enterprise & Contracting Services L4B $ 4,915,500
2 |Office Pro Enterprise & Contracting Services L5B $ 36,868,000
2 |Office Pro Enterprise & Contracting Services L5D $ 9,876,250
3 |Yellowthree 1B $ 4,871,062 | $ 1,105,561 Nafico v v v 2
3 |Yellowthree 2B $ 55,278,040
3 |Yellowthree 2D $ 10,409,330
3 |Yellowthree 4B $ 4,128,460
3 |Yellowthree 4D $ 3,066,970
3 |Yellowthree 5B $ 32,913,000
3 |Yellowthree 5D $ 7,637,090
4 |A&Z Halaal Butchery L1A $ 1,271,559 | $ 3,870,516 Caricom v v v 1
4 |A&Z Halaal Butchery L1B $ 2,977,439
4 |A&Z Halaal Butchery L2A $ 32,063,690
4 |A&Z Halaal Butchery L2B $ 29,415,755
4 |A&Z Halaal Butchery L2C $ 11,189,724
4 |A&Z Halaal Butchery L2D $ 6,183,144
4 |A&Z Halaal Butchery L3A $ 3,240,640
4 |A&Z Halaal Butchery L3B $ 6,122,364
4 |A&Z Halaal Butchery L3C $ 26,881,970




4 |A&Z Halaal Butchery L3D $ 13,671,920

4 |A&Z Halaal Butchery L4A $ 4,469,993

4 |A&Z Halaal Butchery L4B $ 2,547,160

4 |A&Z Halaal Butchery L4C $ 2,273,790

4 |A&Z Halaal Butchery L4D $ 2,089,090

4 |A&Z Halaal Butchery L5A $ 18,460,595

4 |A&Z Halaal Butchery L5B $ 16,810,000

4 |A&Z Halaal Butchery L5C $ 9,575,381

4 |A&Z Halaal Butchery L5D $ 3,774,620

5 |P. Ramroop & Sons L1A $ 1,061,236 | $ 1,384,656 Caricom
5 |P. Ramroop & Sons L2A $ 28,316,000

5 |P. Ramroop & Sons L2C $ 9,164,700

5 |P. Ramroop & Sons L4A $ 3,898,746

5 |P. Ramroop & Sons L4C $ 1,890,227

5 |P. Ramroop & Sons L5A $ 17,535,713

5 |P. Ramroop & Sons L5C $ 7,366,210

6 |NAB Establishment L1A $ 2,716,160 BSD C/S
7 |MS Investments L1A $ 15,092,640 Premier
7 |MS Investments L1B $ 28,248,000

7 |MS Investments L2A $ 129,756,000

7 |MS Investments L2B $ 345,427,200

7  |IMS Investments L2C $ 30,396,000

7 |MS Investments L2D $ 62,404,560

7 |MS Investments L4A $ 52,637,760

7 |MS Investments L4B $ 27,711,600

7  |IMS Investments L4C $ 13,320,000

7 |MS Investments L4D $ 25,587,600

7 |MS Investments L5A $ 74,229,360




7 |MS Investments L5B $ 197,136,000

7 |MS Investments L5C $ 42,445,056

7 |MS Investments L5D $ 47,827,200

8 |Andrew's Enterprise L1A $ 1,609,890 Assuria
8 |Andrew's Enterprise L1B $ 3,939,437

8 |Andrew's Enterprise L2C $ 11,406,156

8 |Andrew's Enterprise L2D $ 8,402,885

9 |Guybiz Establishment L1A $ 252,410 | $ 3,359,523 Assuria
9 |Guybiz Establishment L1B $ 384,725

9 |Guybiz Establishment L2A $ 10,564,770

9 |Guybiz Establishment L.2B $ 890,379

9 |Guybiz Establishment L.2C $ 2,394,878

9 |Guybiz Establishment L.2D $ 115,392

9 |Guybiz Establishment L3A $ 1,220,636

9 |Guybiz Establishment L3B $ 115,392

9 |Guybiz Establishment L.3C $ 7,154,784

9  |Guybiz Establishment L3D $ 11,377,200

9 |Guybiz Establishment L4A $ 954,750

9 |Guybiz Establishment 1. 4B $ 1,940,975

9 |Guybiz Establishment L.4C $ 704,109

9 |Guybiz Establishment L.4D $ 1,679,950

9 |Guybiz Establishment L5A $ 9,114,230

9 |Guybiz Establishment L5B $ 15,369,600

9 |Guybiz Establishment L5C $ 15,517,547

9 |Guybiz Establishment L5D $ 3,604,100

10 |Southwind Health & Defence L1A $ 2,412,433 BSD Not C/S
10 |Southwind Health & Defence L1B $ 5,686,817

10 |Southwind Health & Defence L2A $ 20,501,630




10 |Southwind Health & Defence L2B $ 63,966,968
10 |Southwind Health & Defence L2C $ 6,744,561
10 |Southwind Health & Defence L2D $ 12,481,166
10 |Southwind Health & Defence L4B $ 4,227,930
10 |Southwind Health & Defence L4D $ 4,168,094
11 |N.T Ventures L1A $ 1,637,790 Assuria
11 |N.T Ventures L1B $ 4,053,350
11 |N.T Ventures L2A $ 29,872,100
11 |N.T Ventures L2B $ 27,821,100
11 |N.T Ventures L2C $ 10,464,795
11 |N.T Ventures L2D $ 6,535,020
11 |N.T Ventures L4A $ 4,573,015
11 |N.T Ventures L4B $ 2,499,700
11 |N.T Ventures L4C $ 2,708,945
11 |N.T Ventures L4D $ 2,618,700
11 |N.T Ventures L5A $ 16,788,780
11 |N.T Ventures L5B $ 17,192,500
11 |N.T Ventures L5C $ 8,711,495
11 |N.T Ventures L5C $ 4,855,000
12 |HR Distributors L1A $ 1,621,940 | $ 3,000,000 Assuria
12 |HR Distributors L1B $ 3,929,360
12 |HR Distributors L2A $ 27,571,250
12 |HR Distributors L2B $ 30,638,460
12 |HR Distributors L2C $ 10,309,720
12 |HR Distributors L2D $ 6,599,235
12 |HR Distributors L4A $ 4,545,830
12 |HR Distributors L4B $ 2,529,350
12 |HR Distributors L4C $ 2,615,805
12 |HR Distributors L4D $ 2,687,395




12 |HR Distributors L5A $ 17,190,665

12 |HR Distributors L5B $ 16,872,400

12 |HR Distributors L5C $ 8,580,755

12 |HR Distributors L5D $ 4,898,700

13 S&K Constmctlon, Consultancy Services & General $ 120,135,960 Premier
Supplies L2A

13 S&K Constmctlon, Consultancy Services & General $ 386,194,800
Supplies L2B

13 S&K Constmctlon, Consultancy Services & General $ 32,023,872
Supplies L2C

13 S&K Constmctlon, Consultancy Services & General $ 80,486,520
Supplies L2D

13 S&K Constmctlon, Consultancy Services & General $ 25,865,280
Supplies L3A

13 S&K Constmctlon, Consultancy Services & General $ 78,423,600
Supplies L3B

13 S&K Constmctlon, Consultancy Services & General $ 146,420,400
Supplies L3C

13 S&K Constmctlon, Consultancy Services & General $ 173,378,400
Supplies L3D

13 S&K Constmctlon, Consultancy Services & General $ 74,248,728
Supplies LSA

13 S&K Constmctlon, Consultancy Services & General $ 195,339,600
Supplies L5B

13 S&K Constmctlon, Consultancy Services & General $ 40,551,456
Supplies L5C

13 S&K Constmctlon, Consultancy Services & General $ 45,063,600
Supplies L5D

14 |Paradise Food Products L1A $ 12,285,468 | § 39,729,000 Diamond




14 |Paradise Food Products L1A $ 31,676,940
14 |Paradise Food Products L2A $ 326,256,180
14 |Paradise Food Products L2B $ 373,166,340
14 |Paradise Food Products L2C $ 78,502,692
14 |Paradise Food Products L2D $ 76,014,756
14 |Paradise Food Products L3A $ 27,926,712
14 |Paradise Food Products L3B $ 76,659,000
14 |Paradise Food Products L3C $ 186,254,232
14 |Paradise Food Products L3D $ 164,180,640
14 |Paradise Food Products L4A $ 43,828,020
14 |Paradise Food Products L4B $ 27,163,620
14 |Paradise Food Products L4C $ 20,616,600
14 |Paradise Food Products L4D $ 25,582,200
14 |Paradise Food Products L5A $ 188,131,212
14 |Paradise Food Products L5B $ 225,910,800
14 |Paradise Food Products L5C $ 59,987,040
14 |Paradise Food Products L5D $ 52,545,000
15 |Gupta Distribution L1A $ 1,982,144 | $ 8,574,103 Caricom
15 |Gupta Distribution L1B $ 5,328,880
15 |Gupta Distribution L2A $ 2,469,000
15 |Gupta Distribution L2B $ 57,656,160
15 |Gupta Distribution L2C $ 17,954,220
15 |Gupta Distribution L2D $ 9,812,940
15 |Gupta Distribution L4A $ 6,149,660
15 |Gupta Distribution L4B $ 3,986,250
15 |Gupta Distribution L4C $ 4,916,830
15 |Gupta Distribution L4D $ 2,902,150
15 |Gupta Distribution L5A $ 39,630,000
15 |Gupta Distribution L5B $ 30,547,500
15 |Gupta Distribution L5C $ 16,324,600




15 |Gupta Distribution L5D $ 7,918,000
16 |Memorex Enterprise L1A $ 1,314,855 Assuria
16 |Memorex Enterprise L1B $ 3,375,390
16 |Memorex Enterprise L2A $ 31,794,050
16 |Memorex Enterprise L2B $ 40,364,900
16 |Memorex Enterprise L2C $ 9,919,825
16 |Memorex Enterprise L2D $ 6,912,355
16 |Memorex Enterprise L4A $ 4,389,385
16 |Memorex Enterprise L4B $ 2,945,400
16 |Memorex Enterprise L4C $ 2,291,845
16 |Memorex Enterprise L4D $ 2,423,525
16 |Memorex Enterprise L5SA $ 15,398,960
16 |Memorex Enterprise L5B $ 16,093,000
16 |Memorex Enterprise L5C $ 6,835,110
16 |Memorex Enterprise L5D $ 3,755,700
17 |Satesh Naraine L2A $ 120,796,200 Caricom
17 |Satesh Naraine L2B $ 352,372,380
17 |Satesh Naraine L2C $ 33,376,272
17 |Satesh Naraine L2D $ 78,578,520
17 |Satesh Naraine L3C $ 147,740,400
17 |Satesh Naraine L3D $ 171,458,400
18 |1&S Sankar's Importers & Distributors L1A $ 18,021,804 Assuria
18 |1&S Sankar's Importers & Distributors L1B $ 53,752,104
18 |1&S Sankar's Importers & Distributors L2A $ 427,763,880
18 |1&S Sankar's Importers & Distributors L2B $ 603,538,680
18 |1&S Sankar's Importers & Distributors L2C $ 147,493,296
18 |1&S Sankar's Importers & Distributors L2D $ 122,335,848
18 |1&S Sankar's Importers & Distributors L3A $ 40,385,376




18 |I&S Sankar's Importers & Distributors L3B $ 127,458,000
18 |1&S Sankar's Importers & Distributors L3C $ 250,501,104
18 |1&S Sankar's Importers & Distributors L3D $ 293,615,040
18 |1&S Sankar's Importers & Distributors L4A $ 54,993,708
18 |1&S Sankar's Importers & Distributors L4B $ 45,752,640
18 |1&S Sankar's Importers & Distributors L4C $ 36,591,480
18 |1&S Sankar's Importers & Distributors L4D $ 40,383,600
18 |I&S Sankar's Importers & Distributors L5A $ 253,342,032
18 |I&S Sankar's Importers & Distributors L5B $ 382,507,200
18 |1&S Sankar's Importers & Distributors L5C $ 123,030,612
18 |I&S Sankar's Importers & Distributors L5D $ 92,974,800




Date of Tender Opening: July 29, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Home Affairs (433/2025/51) - Procurement of Office Materials & Supplies

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |MS Investments $ 64,496,700 | $ 1,289,934 Premier v v v 2
2 |Meditron Inc $ 75,939,100 | $ 1,518,782 Diamond v v v 2
3  |Office Pro Enterprise & Contracting Services $ 125,711,180 | $ 2,514,224 Assuria v v v 1
4 |RRT Enterprie & Auto Sales FTP not completed | $ 4,757,200 Premier v v X 2
5 |Arcs Regium Logistics & Solutions Inc $ 87,885,000 | $ 1,757,700 Caricom v v v 2
6 |Optimum Supplies $ 224,223,060 | $ 4,484,461 Premier v v v 2
7 |PBS Technologies (Guyana) Inc $ 142,565,778 | $ 3,099,265 Premier v v v 2
8 |United Trading & Business Services $ 5,170,520 | $ 90,710 Assuria v v v 2
9 |Reliance Services $ 80,411,600 | $ 1,608,232 Premier v v v 2
10 |Paradise Food Products $ 67,616,600 | $ 1,352,332 Diamond v v v 2
11 |Yellowthree $ 93,687,600 | $ 18,737,520 Nafico v v v 2
12 |Andrews's Enterprise $ 45,932,140 | $ 918,643 Assuria v v v 2
13 |Quality Service & Supply $ 26,943,000 | $ 538,860 Assuria v v v 2
14 |Evolution Contractors Inc $ 267,113,000 | $ 5,400,000 Caricom v v v 2
15 |1&S Sankar's Importers & Distributors $ 138,414,200 | $ 2,768,284 Premier v v v 2
16 |P. Ramroop & Sons $ 104,397,460 | $ 2,087,549 Caricom v v v 2
17 |Guybiz Establishment $ 205,543,020 | $ 3,427,422 Assuria v v v 2
18 S&K Constmctlon, Consultancy Services & General 3 72,178,220 | $ 1,480,000 Premier v v v )
Supplies Inc
19 |S&S Services $ 226,323,000 | $ 4,180,000 Caricom v v v 2
20 |Kojac $ 105,880,020 | $ 2,139,744 Nafico v v v 2
21 |A.S Woodworking Establishment $ 118,730,500 | $ 2,400,000 Premier v v v 2
22 |Image and Design Trading Enterprise $ 18,934,300 | $ 378,686 Assuria v v v 2
23 |Regal Stationery & Computer Centre $ 85,041,900 | $ 1,700,838 Premier v v v 2
24 |Imperial Trading $ 138,474,100 | $ 2,769,482 Caricom v v v 1




25

NAB Establishment

2,885,000

BSD completed and Signed

26

Soverignty Investments Construction Services (SICS
Builders)

$

134,319,400

$

2,700,000 Assuria




Date of Tender Opening: July 29, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Home Affairs (434/2025/51) - Procurement of Field Materials & Supplies

Bid Security

Form of

Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::g::; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéill;(; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |MS Investments $ 139,664,440| $ 2,793,289 Premier v v v 2
2 [Southwind Health & Defence $ 522,709,845| $ 10,454,196 Caricom v v v 1
3 |P. Ramroop & Sons $ 161,674,250| $ 3,233,485 Caricom v v v 2
4 |Andrew's Enterprise $ 152,749,897| $ 3,054,998 Assuria v v v 2
5 |Regal Stationery & Computer Centre $ 144,161,600| $ 2,883,232 Premier v v v 2
6 S&K Construction, Consultancy Services & General S 135.017.000| § 2,700,340 Premier v v v )
Supplies Inc.
7 |Memorex Enterprise $ 133,855,000 | $ 2,800,000 Assuria v v v 2
8 |United Trading & Business Services $ 4,810,700 | $ 84,398 Assuria v v v 2
9 |Image & Design Trading Enterprise $ 33,632,750 | $ 672,655 Assuria v v v 2
10 |Quality Service and Supply $ 40,474,940 | $ 809,498 Assuria v v v 2
11 |Guybiz Establishment FTP Not Completed | $ 3,942,842 Assuria v v X 2
12 |S&S Services $ 376,955,500 | $ 13,000,789 Caricom v v v 2
13 |Paradise Food Products $ 151,064,250 | $ 3,141,785 diamond v v v 2
14 |HR Distributors $ 255,270,500 | $ 5,200,000 Assuria v v v 2
15 |Yellothree $ 243,278,500 | $ 4,865,570 nafico v v v 2
16 |MB Enterprise $ 273,414,000 | $ 5,468,280 Caricom v v v 1
17 |Reliance Services $ 265,587,500 | $ 5,311,750 Premier v v v 2
18 |1&S Sankar's Importers & Distributors $ 190,406,000 | $ 4,800,000 Premier v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: July 29, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Home Affairs (435/2025/51) - Procurement of Uniform Materials

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |Andrew's Enterprise $ 92,074,100 | $ 1,841,482 Assuria v v v 2
5 gi)l;iceznstructlon, Consultancy Services & General S 149,174,400 | $ 2,983,488 Premier v v v )
3 |Yellowthree $ 189,840,000 | $ 3,796,800 Nafico v v v 2
4 |Memorex Enterprise $ 304,290,000 | $ 6,200,000 Assuria v v v 2
5 |S.P Worldwide Import & Export $ 145,874,000 | $ 2,917,480 Caricom v v v 1
6 |Quality Service & Supply $ 130,009,650 | $ 2,600,193 Assuria v v v 2
7 |Image & Design Trading Enterprise $ 53,369,710 | $ 1,067,394 Assuria v v v 2
8 |MS Investments $ 149,831,750 | $ 2,996,635 Premier v v v 2
9 |Southwind Health & Defence $ 387,011,620 | $ 7,740,232 Premier v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: July 29, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Home Affairs (436/2025/51) - Procurement of Drugs & Medical Supplies

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |ABD Medicare Investment Inc $ 23,347,300 | $ 466,946 Nafico v v v 1
2 |Caribbean Medical Supplies Inc $ 32,831,200 | $ 656,624 Nafico v v v 2
3 |Image and Design Trading Enterprise $ 5,833,201 | $ 116,664 Assuria v v v 2
4 |New GPC Inc $ 42,483,979 | $ 1,000,000 Premier v v v 2
5 |P. Ramroop & Sons $ 30,073,877| $ 685,684 Caricom v v v 2
6 S&K Construction Consultancy Services & General S 45.697.360| S 913,947 Premier v v v )
Supplies Inc
7  |Qualilty Service & Supply $ 2,682,937 | $ 53,619 Assuria v v v 2
8 |Andrews Enterprise $ 17,542,188 | $ 330,844 Assuria v v v 2
9 |Mike's Pharmacy $ 18,753,670 $ 375,073 Premier v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: July 29, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Home Affairs (437/2025/51) - Procurement of Janitorial & Cleaning Supplies

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |Regal Stationery and Computer Centre $ 33,117,000 $ 662,340 Premier v v v 2
2 |P. Ramroop & Sons $ 43,276,000| $ 865,520 Caricom v v v 2
3 |Memorex Enterprises $ 51,372,000| $ 1,200,000 Assuria v v v 2
4 |Wayne's Enterprise Inc. $ 77,066,600| $ 1,541,332 Assuria v v v 2
5 |Quality Service and Supply $ 27,956,940 $ 559,139 Assuria v v v 2
6 |Andrew's Enterprise $ 27,566,820| $ 551,336 Assuria v v v 2
7 |MS Trading $ 50,839,000 | $ 1,016,780 Premier v v v 2
8 |Guybiz Establishment $ 65,578,000 | $ 1,328,822 Assuria v v v 2
9  |Supreme Distributors $ 20,366,000 | $ 302,320 Premier v v v 2
10 |Gupta Distribution $ 175,892,760 | $ 3,517,855 Caricom v v v 2
11 |NT Ventures $ 69,657,500 | $ 1,400,000 Assuria v v v 2
12 |Paradise Food Product $ 40,201,700 | $ 827,224 Diamond v v v 2
13 |I1&S Sankar's Importers & Distributors $ 46,693,500 | $ 600,000 Premier v v v 2
14 |MB Enterpise $ 50,772,000 | $ 1,015,440 Caricom v v v 1
15 S&K Constmctlon, Consultancy Services and General 3 50,528,700 | $ 1,010,574 Premier v v v )
Supplies Inc.
16 |United Trading & Business Services $ 9,859,500 | $ 197,190 Assuria v v v 2
17 |NAB Establishment $ 2,999,000 BSD C/S v v v 1
18 |Reliance Services $ 48,572,500 | $ 971,450 Premier v v v 2
19 |Mike's Pharmacy $ 66,224,000 | $ 1,324,480 Premier v v v 2
20 |[S&S Services $ 261,881,000 | $ 104,760 Caricom v v v 2
21 |New GPC Inc. $ 85,979,000 | $ 2,000,000 Premier v v v 2
22 |Southwind Health and Defence $ 117,013,500 | $ 2,340,270 Caricom v v v 1
23 |Imperial Trading $ 56,719,000 | $ 1,134,380 Caricom v v v 1
24 |Image and Design Trading Enterprise $ 16,347,480 | $ 326,949 Assuria v v v 2
25 |Office Pro Enterprise & Contracting Services $ 77,389,000 | $ 1,547,780 Assuria v v v 1




‘ 26 ‘Grace Enterprise Guyana Inc.

E

280,780,000 | $

5,615,600 |

Nafico




Date of Tender Opening: July 29, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Home Affairs (438/2025/51) - Procurement of Ambulance, Medical Supplies

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |New GPC Inc $ 104,257,764 | $ 2,100,000 Premier v v v 2
2 |ABD Medicare Investment Inc $ 25,798,000 | $ 515,960 Nafico v v v 1
3  |Caribbean Medical Supplies Inc $ 108,605,728 | $ 2,172,115 Nafico v v v 2
4 |Meditron Inc $ 40,829,650 | $ 1,518,782 Diamond v v v 2
s S&K Constmctlon Consultancy Services & General S 223,120,660 $ 4,462,413 Premier Y Y Y )
Supplies Inc
6 |The New Doctors Clinic $ 155,335,100 | $ 3,106,702 Caricom v v v 2
7  |Western Scientific Company Limited US$318,031.11 $ 3,150,000 Premier v v v 2
8 |Clever Solutions (Guyana) Inc $ 897,149 BSD Completed and Signed v v v 1




Date of Tender Opening: July 29, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Home Affairs (439/2025/51) - Emergency Medical Services Equipment

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 S&K Constmctlon Consultancy Services & General 3 19.276.450 | $ 385.529 Premier Y Y Y )
Supplies Inc
2  |ABD Medicare Investment Inc $ 3,880,000 | $ 77,600 Nafico v v v 1
3 |Caribbean Medical Supplies Inc $ 8,517,000 | $ 170,340 Nafico v v v 2
4 |(New GPC Inc $ 15,420,000 | $ 320,000 Premier v v v 2
5 |Meditron Inc $ 1,516,679| $ 247,000 diamond v v v 2
6 |The New Doctors Clinic $ 11,900,000 | $ 238,000 Caricom v v v 2
7  |Western Scientific Company Limited US$16,128.10 $ 136,500 Premier v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: July 29, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Home Affairs (440/2025/51) - Procurement of Mattress for the GPS

. . Bid Security Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |A&F Foam Factory $ 9,600,000 | $ 192,000 Premier v v v 2
2 |Comfort Sleep Inc $ 11,400,000 | $ 259,920 Premier v v v 1
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