Date of Tender Opening: June 19, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education GESIP - Construction of the New Industrial Block at Annandale Secondary School (86/2025/40) Financial

. . Bid Security . . Form of |Hard
B . Bid A t B Flash
idder Name of Bidder id Amount & Amount & 1d Security GRA | NIS | Tender a.s
No. Currency Agency ) drive
Currency signed | Copy
3 |Shandong Hi-Speed Dejian Group Co Ltd $ 751,093,143 v 2




Date of Tender Opening: June 19, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Culture, Youth and Sports - Procurement of Meal for Georgetown Training Centre (170/2025/44)

. . Bid Security . . Form of |Hard
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS | Tender FlztSh
No. Currency Agency ) drive
Currency signed | Copy
1 |Hot & Spicy Creole Corner $ 15,000,000 | $ 300,000 Scotia Bank v v v 1
2 [GKInc. $ 18,000,000 | $ 360,000 Republic Bank v v v 1




Date of Tender Opening: June 19, 2025

File Number: Guyana Marketing Corporation - Construction of Cold Storage Facility for the GMC at Sophia, Region No 4 (370/2025/21)

. . Bid Security Form of

Bl;llder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.sh

0. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |Guybiz Establishment No FTP Seen $ 3,300,000 Assuria v v X 2
2 |Emeralds General Contracting & Distributors $ 226,971,019 | $ 3,300,000 Premier Ins v v v 2
3 |A.M.R Engineering & General Services $ 214,151,493 | $ 3,300,000 Caricom v v v 2
4 |Anil Lalsa Construction $ 215,223,008 | $ 3,300,000 Assuria v v v 2
5 |Gopie Investments Inc. $ 249,628,775 | $ 3,300,000 Caricom v v v 2
6 |Monarch Investments $ 315,273,058 | $ 3,300,000 Premier Ins v v v 2
7 |Andrect Engineering Construction $ 217,259,900 | $ 3,300,000 Caricom v v v 2
8 |IMS Construction & Logistics $ 211,188,395 | $ 3,300,000 Caricom v v v 1
9 |N. Gobin & Son Hardware & Garden Supplies $ 199,000,835 | $ 3,300,000 Caricom v v v 1
Engineer's Estimate $ 220,936,155




Date of Tender Opening: June 19, 2025

File Number: Bureau of Statistics - Supply and Delivery of Tablet Computers GPS-Navigation and Radio Communication Devices Lots 1-3 (97/2025/03)

. . Bid Security . . Form of |Hard
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS | Tender Fla.sh
No. Currency Agency ) drive
Currency signed | Copy
1 |Keyboard Kiosk $ 4,260,000 $ 85,200 Assuria v Rec v 2
2 |PBS Technologies (Guyana) Inc $ 624,554| BSD Form Completed & Signed v v v 2
3 S&K Construc.tlon, Consultancy Services & $ 3.732.366| $ 74,647 Premier v v v )
General Supplies
4 |Promotech Inc $ 3,703,605 $ 74,072 Premier v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: June 19, 2025

File Number: Bureau of Statistics - Supply and Delivery of Three New Heavy Duty Floor Model Printers (98/2025/03)

. . Bid Security . . Form of |Hard
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS | Tender Fla.sh
No. Currency Agency ) drive
Currency signed | Copy
1 |MAEC Enterprises $ 9,953,700 $ 199,072 Assuria v v v 2
2 |Laparkan Trading Guyana Company Limited $ 10,200,000 $ 204,000 GTM v v v 2
3 |Digital Technology $ 9,969,000 $ 199,380 Assuria v v v 2
g4 |D&K Construction Consultancy Services & $ 544,500 BSD Form Completed & Signed | « | v 2
General Supplies Inc
5 |PBS Technologies Guyana Inc $ 10,440,600 $ 259,489 Premier v v v 2
6 |Promotech Inc $ 6,001,660 $ 120,033 Premier v v v 2
7 |DynamlQ Inc $ 2,661,000 | BSD Form Completed & Signed v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: June 19, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education - Electrical Rehabilitation at David Rose Special Needs School (340/2025/40)

. . Bid Securi . . Form of |Hard
Bl;g.er Name of Bidder Bldcﬁl{l:::::; & Amount &ty Blizee:lcl;ty GRA | NIS T.ender ljll;il;

Currency signed | Copy
1 |FN Electrical & General Contracting $ 32,571,000 | $ 651,420 Premier Ins. v v v 1
2 [Mohabir's Construction $ 20,811,000 | $ 500,000 Nafico v v v 1
3 |BM Property Investment Inc. $ 25,595,850 | $ 511,917 Caricom v v v 2
4  |Smart Builders Construction & Supplies Inc. $ 23,823,450 | $ 512,000 Premier Ins. v v v 2
5 |N. Balgobin & Sons Contracting $ 24,113,565 | $ 510,240 Assuria v v v 2
6 |R. Persid Construction $ 22,948,800 | $ 532,000 Nafico v v v 2
7 |Mega Power Electrical & Construction Services| $ 28,736,400 | $ 574,728 Assuria v v v 2
8 |Supergraphics $ 28,584,300 | $ 560,000 Caricom v v v 1
9 | A Plus Consulting and General Services Inc. $ 28,053,900 | $ 561,078 Diamond v v v 1
10 |Star Exceutive Services $ 22,785,000 | $ 455,700 Premier Ins. v v v 1
11 |STS Investments $ 24,867,570 | $ 497,351 Premier Ins. v v v 1
12 |Eternity $ 25,135,950 | $ 512,000 Assuria v v v 1
13 [Mac Morris Enterprise $ 23,578,800 | $ 512,000 Caricom v v v 1




Date of Tender Opening: June 19, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education - Electrical Rehabilitation at Feebury Secondary School (341/2025/40)

. . Bid Securi . . Form of |Hard
Bl;g.er Name of Bidder Bldcﬁl{l:::::; & Amount &ty Blizee:lcl;ty GRA | NIS T.ender ljll;il;

Currency signed | Copy
1 |Ceraturtum $ 15,708,000 | $ 340,000 Caricom v v v 2
2 |BM Property Investments Inc. $ 17,592,750 | $ 351,855 Caricom v v v 2
3 |N. Balgobin & Sons Contracting Service $ 15,286,110 | $ 350,300 Assuria v v v 1
4 |Pooran Ram Boodhaley General Contracting $ 13,453,650 | $ 268,673 Premier Ins v v v 1
5 |Mega Power Electrical & Construction Services | $ 16,579,500 | $ 33,195 Assuria v v v 1
6 [Smart Innovative Solutions $ 15,971,550 No Bid Security Seen v v v 1
7 |R. Persid Construction $ 16,214,000 | $ 352,000 Nafico v v v 2
8 |Supergraphics $ 17,552,850 | $ 380,000 Caricom v v v 1




Date of Tender Opening: June 19, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education - Carpentry Works to Smyth Street Nursery School (342/2025/40)

. . Bid Security . . Form of |Hard
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS | Tender Fla.sh
No. Currency Agency ) drive
Currency signed | Copy
1 |Jemcorp Engineering and Imports $ 12,583,000 BSD completed & Signed v v v 2
2 |Ruyaa Solutions $ 12,516,000 BSD completed & Signed v v v 1
3 |Emeralds General Contracting & Distributors $ 12,250,400 BSD completed & Signed v v v 1
4 |Rajesh Woodworking & Construction Services | $ 10,721,800 BSD completed & Signed v v v 1
5 |J.J Construction & General Services $ 13,866,000 BSD completed & Signed v v v 1
6 |Fast Signs Guyana $ 13,554,500 BSD completed & Signed v v v 1
7 |Ewaaz Rahman Construction & Hardware $ 9,405,000 BSD completed & Signed v v v 1
8 |PMW Construction & General Services $ 9,855,500 BSD completed & Signed v v v 1
g [|Harte’s General Construction, Supplies and S  13427.000|  BSD completed & Signed v | v v I
Services
Innovative Development Solution :
BSD let
10 Guyana(IDSGY) $ 13,298,200 SD completed & Signed v v v 2
11 |O.B General Construction & Supplies Inc $ 7,920,000 BSD completed & Signed v v v 1
12 |Caribbean Solutions Inc $ 11,278,000 298,000 |Nafico v v v 2
13 [Diversity Investments Inc $ 11,106,500 BSD completed & Signed v v v 1
14 |Oneika & Sons Development $ 9,506,500 BSD completed & Signed v v v 1
15 |B.M Property Investments Inc $ 14,895,000 BSD completed & Signed v v v 2
16 |Tanner's Investment $ 14,065,200 BSD completed & Signed v v v 1
17 |Ceraturim $ 13,138,000 BSD completed & Signed v v v 0
18 Kaiveri Procurement Logistics and Investments $ 11,833,300 BSD completed & Signed v v v 1

Inc




19 |[S.A General Services $ 12,013,025 BSD completed & Signed v v v 1
20 |Bulletwood Construction $ 12,890,100 BSD completed & Signed v v v 1
21 |Eternity Investment Inc $ 14,500,000 298,000 | Assuria v v v 0
22 |Supergraphics $ 14,866,500 BSD completed & Signed v v v 1
23 |Delph Construction Inc $ 14,316,000 BSD completed & Signed v v v 1
24 |Rahaman's Investment $ 12,464,000 BSD completed & Signed v v v 1




Date of Tender Opening: June 19, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education - Construction of Information Technology Lab (AUCHYLNE Primary Region # 6) (343/2025/40)

. . Bid Security . . Form of |Hard
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS | Tender Fla.sh
No. Currency Agency ) drive
Currency signed | Copy
1 [Ceraturium $ 23,538,900 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 1
2 |A. Alli Construction $ 25,664,940 | $ 600,000 Premier Ins. v v v 1
3 |AAA Contracting Solutions $ 22769295 | $ 600,000 | DemeraraFire & -\ v 1
General Ins
4 [Westbrook Caribbean Inc. $ 18,062,174 | $ 600,000 Caricom v v v 1




Date of Tender Opening: June 19, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education - Electrical Rehabilitation at-Happy Heart Nursery School (344/2025/40)

. . Bid Security . . Form of |Hard
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS | Tender Fla.sh
No. Currency Agency ) drive
Currency signed | Copy
1 |Ceraturium $ 13,615,350 BSD C/S v v v 0
2 |Smart Builders Construction & Supplies Inc $ 8,372,700 BSD C/S v v v 2
3 [R. Persid Construction $ 11,701,200 BSD C/S v v v 2
4 |Superior General Services $ 10,496,850 BSD C/S v v v 1




Date of Tender Opening: June 19, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education - Physics lab-Construction of Furniture,St.Mary's Secondary School (345/2025/40)

. . Bid Security . . Form of |Hard
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS | Tender Fla.sh
No. Currency Agency ) drive
Currency signed | Copy
1 |Ceraturium $ 13,144,000 BSD C/S v v v 1
2 [R. Persid Construction $ 7,901,000 BSD C/S v v v 2
3 |Rajesh Woodworking & Construction Services | $ 13,114,000 BSD C/S v v v 1
4 |Eternity Investment Inc $ 14,700,000 BSD C/S v v v 0




Date of Tender Opening: June 19, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education - Supply and Delivery of Dry Goods-Essequibo Technical Institute (346/2025/40)

. . Bid Security . . Form of |Hard
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS | Tender FlztSh
No. Currency Agency ) drive
Currency signed | Copy
1 |Eternity Investment Inc $ 71,175,680 $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 0
2 |Ceraturium $ 29,146,800 $ 600,000 Caricom v v v 0




Date of Tender Opening: June 19, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education - Supply, Delivery, Installation & Testing of TVET Equipment-Secondary Schools (347/2025/40)

. . Bid Securi . . Form of |Hard
Bl;g.er Name of Bidder Bldcﬁl{l:::::; & Amount &ty Blizee:lcl;ty GRA | NIS T.ender ljll;il;

Currency signed | Copy
1 [Meditron Inc. $ 62,110,000 | $ 1,842,200 Diamond v v v 1
2 [Millennium Supplies & Distribution Inc $ 63,883,062 | $ 2,780,000 Premier Ins v v v 1
3 |Western Scientific Company Limited US$529,414.97 $ 4,200,000 Premier Ins N/A | N/A v 1
4 |General Distributors $ 110,112.458 | $ 2,560,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |A. S Woodworing Establishment $ 81,706,313 | $ 1,616,384 Premier Ins v v v 2
6 |Yellothree $ 80,737,000 | $ 1,614,740 Nafico v v v 2
7 |Two Brothers Construction $ 125,950,000 | $ 3,000,000 Nafico v v v 2
8 |A. Orgasein & Sons $ 103,790,000 | $ 3,000,000 Premier Ins v v v 2
9 |Supergraphics $ 38,339,110 | $ 800,000 Caricom v v v 1
10 |R's Modern Construction & Supplies $ 109,060,000 | $ 3,200,000 Premier Ins v v v 1
11 |A&M Procuring & Construction Services $ 15,425,000 | $ 308,500 Premier Ins v v v 1
12 |[Armo's Construction & Supplies $ 14,575,000 | $ 291,500 Premier Ins v v v 1




Date of Tender Opening: June 19, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education - Construction of Drop Off Zone-Parfait Harmony Primary School (349/2025/40)

. . Bid Securit Form of
Bl;\lld:r Name of Bidder Bl(:jﬁ:(e)::; & Ztin:l?'::; f;y Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS ’l;i:;ll(ll:s I({:?);(; lle:'liizl;
1 |Westbrook Caribbean Inc. $ 17,369,174 | $ 386,000 Caricom v v v 2
2 |R&R General Construction & Supplies $ 17,899,844 | $ 357,997 Caricom v v v 1
3 |Delta Construction Services $ 17,268,615 | $ 345,372 Premier Ins v v v 1
4 |MUSE Holding Inc. $ 20,230,665 | $ 386,000 Caricom v v v 1
5 |[Ceraturium $ 17,467,485 | $ 380,000 Caricom v v v 1
6 |Dev Contracting $ 18,084,675 | $ 386,000 Caricom v v v 2
7  |Builders Supplies $ 18,868,000 | $ 377,370 Premier Ins v v v 2
8 |Fugenz Solutions $ 18,503,100 | $ 370,062 Caricom v v v 2
9 |Bulletwood Construction $ 18,416,895 | $ 380,000 Assuria v v v 2
10 |Barker's Contracting Services $ 17,842,461 | $ 386,000 Premier Ins X X v 1
11 |Green State Oil & Gas Services Inc. $ 18,336,570 | $ 386,000 Premier Ins v v v 2
12 |Mahamad Haseeb Bacchus Enterprise $ 18,431,595 | $ 380,000 Assuria v | v X 2
Construction
13 |P.P Building Contracting $ 16,554,090 | $ 386,000 Caricom v v v 1
14 |Greenhaul Industries $ 17,950,275 | $ 359,005 Nafico v v v 2
15 |Rahaman's Investment $ 18,530,295 | $ 380,000 Assuria v v v 1
16 [Phoenix Engineering Enterprise $ 19,190,115 | $ 386,000 Caricom v v v 1
17 |XP Enterprise $ 17,258,010 | $ 480,000 Caricom v v v 1
18 |Exclusive Engineering $ 19,179,615 | $ 386,000 Caricom v v v 1
19 |Fast Signs Guyana $ 18,678,345 | $ 380,000 Assuria v v v 1
20 |4 A Engineering Enterprise $ 19,279,470 | $ 386,000 Caricom v v v 2
21 |[KNV Designs, Construction & Supplies $ 16,900,590 | $ 500,000 Nafico v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: June 19, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education - Construction of Drop Off Zone-Roxanne Burnham Nursery School (350/2025/40)

Bil(\llder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & lilﬂlizil:l‘gy Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS l;“(::l;ll:lleif Hard Fla.Sh
0. Currency Currency signed Copy| drive
1 |Ceraturium $ 17,103,900| $ 320,000 Caricom v v v 1
2  |Firma General Contracting Service $ 14,837,900| $ 326,000 | Premier Insurance | v v v 2
3 |Energy Empire $ 16,336,375| $ 326,000 | Premier Insurance| v v 2
4  |Supergraphics $ 16,259,540| $ 360,000 Caricom v v v 1
5 |Eternity Investment Inc $ 15,076,050| $ 326,000 Assuria v v v 1
6 |Delta Construction Services $ 14,510,650 No Bid Security seen v v v 2
7 |Caribbean Solutions Inc $ 15,103,550| $ 326,000 Nafico v v v 2
8 |H & ON General Construction Company $ 21,801,450| $ 326,000 Caricom v v v 2
9 [|Jardine Construction $ 27,733,200| $ 554,664 Caricom v v v 2
10 |Synergy Supplies & Services $ 16,109,500 $ 322,190 Caricom v v v 2
11 |Delph Construction Inc $ 16,250,300| $ 325,006 | Premier Insurance| v v 2
12 |JJ Construction & General Services $ 16,195,300| $ 326,906 | Premier Insurance| v v 2
13 |The Property Experts Supplies & Services $ 15,319,150 $ 306,383 Diamond v v v 2
14 |Triple K Consultancy and Construction Services | $ 16,595,986| $ 331,920 Assuria v v v 2
15 |Kaiveri Procurement Logistics & Investments Inc| $ 15,085,950( $ 301,720 | Premier Insurance 2
16 |Dicon Construction & Surveying Services $ 14,634,400 No Bid Security seen 2




Date of Tender Opening: June 19, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education - Electrical Rehabilitation at-Winefred's Secondary School (351/2025/40)

. . Bid Security Form of
B1§der Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.sh
0. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed

1 |Mega Power Electrical & Construction Services | $ 23,538,900 | $ 470,778 Assuria v v v 2

2 |Ceraturium $ 22.497.300| $ 480,000 Caricom v v v 1

3 |Eternity Investment Inc. $ 24,000,000 | $ 490,000 Assuria v v v 2

4 |B. M. Property Investments Inc. $ 24494400 | $ 489,888 Caricom v v v 2

5  |Unity Build's Contracting $ 24411282 $ 470,000 Caricom v v v 2

6 |AEA Enterprise $ 22285200 $ 445,704 Premier v v v 2

7 |Pooran Ram Boodhaley General Contracting $ 21,333,375 | $ 426,668 Premier v v v 2

8 |R. Persid Construction $ 22,664,250 | $ 490,000 Nafico v v v 2

9 |Cornerstone Innovations $ 24222975 $ 490,000 Premier v X v 2

. Bal 1 tracti 1 .
10 |N: Balgobin & Sons Contracting Service & $ 23,834,265 | $ 485,200 Assuria v | v v 2

Electrical Supplies




Date of Tender Opening: June 19, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education - Electrical Rehabilitation at-Georgetown Technical Institute (352/2025/40)

. . Bid Securit Form of
Bl;\lld:r Name of Bidder Bl(:jﬁ:(e)::; & Ztin:l?'::; f;y Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS ’l;i:;ll(ll:s I({:?);(; lle:'liizl;
j |Digital Design Construction, Logistics & $ 146,321,700 | § 2,194,826 Caricom v | v v 2
Supplies
2 |[Anaz Construction Inc. $ 175,950,075 | $ 2,400,000 Premier Ins v v v 1
3 [Cornerstone Innovations $ 209,141,205 | $ 2,374,500 Premier Ins v v v 1
4 |Eternity Investment Inc. $ 158,000,000 | $ 3,166,000 Assuria v v v 2
5 |JD's Construction Company $ 109,816,875 | $ 2,374,500 Premier Ins v v v 1
6 |Ceraturium $ 143,476,200 | $ 2,152,143 Caricom v v v 2
7 |N. Balgobin & Sons Contracting $ 156,119,250 | $ 2,373,306 Assuria v v v 2
8 |BM Property Management Inc. $ 158,294,850 | $ 2,374,422 Caricom v v v 2
9 [Builders Supplies $ 156,462,915 | $ 2,346,944 Premier Ins v v v 2
10 |Mega Power Electrical & Construction $ 148,107,700 | $ 221,916 Assuria v v v 2
11 |AEA Enterprise $ 154,772,415 | $ 2,321,586 Premier Ins v v v 1
12 |Smart Builders $ 192,696,000 | $ 2,400,000 Premier Ins v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: June 19, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education - Construction of Fence & Bridge at-Hague Library (353/2025/40)

Bil(\llder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & lilﬂlizil:l‘gy Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS l;“(::l;ll:lleif Hard Fla.Sh
0. Currency Currency signed Copy| drive
1 | Velocity Bridge Group $ 9,018,975 BSDP C/S v v v 1
2 |Muse Holding Inc. $ 10,684,485 BSDP C/S v v v 1
3 |Ewaaz Rahman Constructing & Hardware $ 11,922,750 BSDP C/S v v v 1
4 |NP Contracting & Transportation Services $ 13,642,650 BSDP C/S v v v 2
5 |Dicon Construction & Surveying Services $ 13,979,805 BSDP C/S v v v 1
6 |XP Enterprise $ 13,005,300 BSDP C/S v v v 2
7  |Synergy Supplies & Services $ 14,723,100 BSDP C/S v v v 2
8 |[Triple K Aggregrates & Trucking $ 28,225,155 BSDP C/S v v v 2
9 [Simon Contracting Services $ 11,922,750 BSDP C/S v v v 2

10 |Ceraturium FIP I;?gtlf;m nor BSDP C/S not com nor signed v v X 1
11 |RDP Building Construction $ 12,166,825 BSDP C/S not com nor signed v v v 2
12 |JD's Construction Company FIP I;?gtlf;m 1ot BSDP C/S v v X 2
13 |V&D Enterprise $ 13,830,600 BSDP C/S v v v 1
14 |Jemcorp Engineering & Imports $ 12,122,000 BSDP C/S v v v 2
15 |Tgriple A General Contracting Services $ 13,543,215 BSDP C/S v v v 2
16 |AAA Contracting Service Solutions $ 11,548,845 BSDP C/S v v v 1
17 SupeT Advance Construction & Procurement S 14,537,983 BSDP C/S v v v 1
Services
18 |Teon Peters Construction Service $ 12,894,630 BSDP C/S v v v 2
19 |Harry Chowtie Enterprise $ 12,685,050 BSDP C/S v v v 2




20 |Energy Empire $ 11,590,372 BSDP C/S
21 |Lakabu Enterprise $ 13,483,050 BSDP C/S
29 Sovereignty Investments Construction Services 3 12,990,075 BSDP C/S

(SICS Builders)




Date of Tender Opening: June 19, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education - Electrical Upgrade at-Queenstown Secondary School (354/2025/40)

Bid Security

Form of

Bl;lld:r Name of Bidder Bliﬁ:ﬁ::; & A(jn:x::; c&; Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS ’l;i:;ll(ll;:g I({:i;(; l;l:iil;
1 |ANAZ Construction Inc $ 17,251,500| $ 400,000 | Premier Insurance | v v 1
2 |Eternity Investment Inc $ 16,817,850| $ 346,000 Assuria v v v 1
3 |B.M Property Investments Inc $ 17,295,600( $ 345912 Caricom v v v 2
4 |[Ceraturium $ 15,857,100( $ 340,000 Caricom v v v 1
5 N. Bal.gobin & Sons Contracting Service & S 15.906.030| 344,097 Assuria v v v )

Electrical Supplies
6 |Supergraphics $ 17,659,475 $ 400,000 Caricom v v v 1
7  |Smart Builders Construction & Supplies $ 14,344,050| $ 346,000 | Premier Insurance| v v 2
8 |R. Persid Construction $ 16,537,500( $ 346,000 nafico v v v 2
9 [Vision Engineering Solutions $ 17,229,660| $ 330,000 Assuria v v v 2
10 |Mega Power Electrical & Construction Services | $ 17,104,500| $ 342,090 Assuria v v v 2
11 |Star Executive Services $ 16,048,200| $ 320,964 | Premier Insurance| v v 2
12 |Two Brothers Construction $ 16,653,000 $ 340,000 nafico v v v 1
13 |Cornerstone Innovations $ 17,028,900| $ 346,000 | Premier Insurance| v v 2
14 |FN Electrical & General Contracting $ 18,146,100| $ 362,922 | Premier Insurance| v v 2
15 |Ace of Trades $ 17,142,300| $ 346,000 | Premier Insurance| v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: June 19, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education - Electrical Rehabilitation at-South Ruimveldt Park Primary School (355/2025/40)

. . Bid Securi . . Form of |Hard
Bl;g.er Name of Bidder Bldcﬁl{l:::::; & Amount &ty Blizee:lcl;ty GRA | NIS T.ender ljll;il;
Currency signed | Copy
1 |Builders Supplies $ 23,472,750| $ 469,455 Premier v v v 2
2 |Mega Power Electrical & Construction Services| $ 21,922,980 $ 438,469 Assuria v v v 2
3 | Vision Engineering Solutions $ 23,773,680 $ 480,000 Assuria v v v 1
4 A Anc_lerson & Son General Construction and 3 17.285.100| 474,000 Premier v v v )
Supplies
5 |BM Property Investments Inc $ 23,695,350 $ 473,907 Caricom v v v 2
6 |Supergraphics $ 22,352,085 $ 500,000 Caricom v v v 1
7 |R Persid Construction $ 23,305,000 | $ 474,000 Nafico v v v 2
8 |Ceraturium $ 21,720,300 | $ 460,000 Caricom v v v 1
g |N Balgobin & Sons Contracting Service & S 2202274|$ 470416 Assuria v | v | v 2
Electrical Supplies
10 |Eternity Investments Inc $ 23,500,000 | $ 474,000 Assuria v v v 0
11 |FN Electrical & General Contracting $ 21,139,650 | $ 422,793 Premier v v v 1
12 [Smart Builders Construction & Supplies Inc $ 21,967,575 | $ 474,000 Premier v v v 2
13 |Mohabir's Construction $ 23,147,250 | $ 460,000 Nafico v v v 1
14 |STS Investments $ 22.214,010 | $ 444,280 Premier v v v 2
15 |Star Executive Services $ 21,275,625 | $ 425,513 Premier v v v 2
16 |A Plus Consulting and General Services Inc $ 22,708,875 | $ 454,177 Diamond v v v 1




Date of Tender Opening: June 19, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education - Rehabilitation of Flooring-Alexander Village Nursery (356/2025/40)

. . Bid Security Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z::; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéill;(; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |Rajesh Woodworing & Construction Services $ 10,830,000 BSDP C/S v v v 1
2 |GT Facilitartors $ 13,534,000 BSDP C/S v v v 1
3 |0. B General Construction & Supplies Inc $ 13,307,000 BSDP C/S v v v 1
4  |Eternity Investment $ 14,200,000 | $ 298,000 Assuria v v v 1
5 |Supergraphics $ 14,855,000 BSDP C/S v v v 1
6 |Summit Solutions $ 14,560,000 BSDP C/S v v v 1
7 |Oneika & Son's Development $ 13,145,000 BSDP C/S v v v 1
8 |Diversity Investments Inc. $ 12,735,000 BSDP C/S v v v 1
9 |S.A General Services $ 7,189,300 BSDP C/S v v v 1
10 |Triple K Consultancy & Construction Services $ 14,118,000 BSDP C/S v v v 1
11 |KW & C Enterprise $ 9,888,400 BSDP C/S v v v 2
12 |PMM Construction & General Services $ 11,550,000 BSDP C/S v v v 2
13 |Tanner's Investment $ 12,000,500 BSDP C/S v v v 1
14 |H&ON General Construction Company $ 13,240,000 BSDP C/S v v v 2
15 |Delph Construction Inc. $ 14,470,000 BSDP C/S v v v 1
16 |Harte's General Construction & Services $ 7,420,000 BSDP C/S v v v 1
17 |JJ Construction & General Services $ 14,800,000 BSDP C/S v v v 1
18 |Kaiveri Procurement Logistics & Investments Inc. | $ 11,950,000 BSDP C/S v v v 1
19 |Ruyaa Solutions $ 12,516,000 BSDP C/S v v v 1
20 |MTECH Contracting Solutions FTP signed not BSDP Not C/S v | v X 1

completed




Date of Tender Opening: June 19, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education - Construction of-Tuschen Primary School (357/2025/40)

. . Bid Securit Form of
Bl;\lld:r Name of Bidder Bl(:jﬁ:(e)::; & Ztin:l?'::; f;y Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS ’l;i:;ll(ll:s I({:?);(; lle:'liizl;
1 |Trevon David Construction Service $ 1,040,600,000 | $ 18,000,000 Assuria v v v 2
2 |Westbrook Caribbean Inc. $ 1,192,116,411 | $ 18,000,000 Caricom v v v 1
3 |Supergraphics $ 1,132,738,800 | $ 18,000,000 Caricom v v v 1
4 |Dev Contracting $ 1,138,558,850 | $ 18,000,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |P. P Building Contracting $ 1,138,558,850 | $ 18,000,000 Caricom v v v 1
6 |Terraform Solutions $ 980,000,000 | $ 32,000,000 Assuria v v v 2
7 |MAEC Enterprises $ 1,000,000,000 | $§ 32,000,000 Assuria v v v 2
8 |Lakabu Enterprise $ 1,352,906,500 No Bid Sec. Seen v v v 1
9 |BM Property Investments Inc. $ 1,199,995,500 | $ 17,999,935 Caricom v v v 1
1o |Digtall Design Construction, Logistics & $  1,176,912,880 | $ 17,653,693 Caricom v | v v 1
Supplies
11 |NP Contracting & Transportation Services $ 1,314,514,069 | $ 18,744,889 Premier Ins. v v v 1
12 |Harry Chowtie Enterprise $ 1,087,447,900 | $ 16,311,719 Caricom v v v 2
13 |Ceraturium $ 1,141,747,200 | $ 18,000,000 Caricom v v v 1
14 |A. Ally Construction $ 1,187,709,600 | $ 18,000,000 Premier Ins. v v v 2
15 |JK Enterprise Inc. $ 1,167,443,090 | § 16,500,000 Nafico v v v 2
16 |Singh & Son Construction $ 1,330,727,640 | $ 17,377,800 Premier Ins. v v v 2
17 |Prored Resources $ 1,339,296,000 | § 20,408,121 Premier Ins. v v v 2
18 |R&R General Construction & Supplies $ 1,185,995,720 | $ 17,834,936 Caricom v v v 2
19 |Vanguard Constructs $ 1,201,328,509 | § 24,026,570 Assuria v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: June 19, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education - Electrical Rehabilitation at Cummings Lodge Secondary School (358/2025/40)

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & liiiz;l:ré:y Bid Security Agency| GRA [ NIS I’Tl“(::l;ll:lle(:‘f Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency Currency signed Copy| drive
1 |A Plus Consulting and General Services Inc $ 46,602,675 $ 932,053 Diamond v v v 1
5 N. Bal.gobin & Sons Contracting Services & S 42428715 | $ 942.100 Assuria v v v )

Electrical Supplies
3 |Cornerstone Innovations $ 46,984,350| $ 944,000 | Premier Insurance| v v 2
4 |Two Brothers Construction $ 40,708,500| $ 940,000 Nafico v v v 1
5 A. An§erson & Son General Construction and S 41,358,450 No Bid Security Seen v v v )
Supplies
6 [STS Investments $ 44,135,910( $ 882,718 | Premier Insurance| v v 2
7  |Superior Supplies & General Construction $ 41,867,060| $ 1,000,000 Nafico v v v 1
8 [Pooran Ram Boodhaley General Contracting $ 44,624,475 $ 892,490 | Premier Insurance| v v 2
9 Undérwood's Civil Work and Contracted S 44.946.300| $ 898.926 Nafico v Y v 5
Services
10 |Mega Power Electrical & Construction Services | $ 45,913,380( $ 918,267 Assuria v v v 2
11 |R. Persid Construction $ 45,745,350 $ 944,000 Assuria v v v 2
12 |Supergraphics $ 47,169,425| $ 1,000,000 Caricom v v v 1
13 |BM Property Investments Inc $ 47,195,400| $ 943,908 Caricom v v v 2
14 |Ceraturium $ 42,908,250| $ 940,000 Caricom v v v 2
15 |Builders Supplies $ 46,722,900 | $ 934,458 | Premier Insurance| v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: June 19, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education - Construction of-Wisroc Primary School (359/2025/40)

. . Bid Securit Form of
Bl;\lld:r Name of Bidder Bl(:jﬁ:(e)::; & Ztin:l?'::; f;y Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS ’l;i:;ll(ll:s I({:?);(; lle:'liizl;
1 |BM Property Investments Inc. $ 36,799,245 | $ 17,999,932 Caricom v v v 2
5 Sovereign.ity Investments Construction Services S 1.199.911.322 | $ 18,000,000 Assuria v v v )
(SICS Builders)

3 |Energy Empire $ 110,433,800 $ 18,000,000 Premier v v v 2
4 |Westbrook Caribbean Inc. $ 1,192,054,657 | $ 18,000,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |Prored Resources $ 1,193,594,000 $§ 20,408,121 Premier v v v 2
6 |[Singh and Son Construction $ 1,365,501,940 | $ 17,377,800 Premier v v v 2
7 |Trevon David Construction $ 1,040,600,000 [ $ 18,000,000 Assuria v v v 2
8 |KBEE Enterprise Inc. $ 1,033,250,621 | $ 15,498,759 Caricom v v v 2
9 |A. Alli Construction $ 1,187,709,600 | $ 18,000,000 Premier v v v 2
10 |KV Contracting Service $ 1,345294,650 | $ 20,179,420 Nafico v v v 2
11 |SOC Construction $ 1,172,150,700 [ $ 18,000,000 Premier v v v 2
12 |Ceraturium $ 1,075,964,399 | $§ 18,000,000 Caricom v v v

13 |Pigtial Design Construction Logistics and $  1,144,683,908 | $ 17,170,259 Caricom v | v v 2

Supplies

14 |SOHA Construction Services and SuppliesInc. | $§  1,221,786,170 v v v 2
15 |NP Contracting & Transportation Services $ 1,245,958,025 | $ 18,744,889 Premier v v v 2
16 |JK Enterprise Inc $ 1,111,017,495 | $ 16,500,000 Caricom v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: June 19, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education - Construction of I'T Lab-La-Grange Primary School (360/2025/40)

. . Bid Securi . . Form of |Hard
Bl;g.er Name of Bidder Bldcﬁl{l:::::; & Amount &ty Blizee:lcl;ty GRA | NIS T.ender ljll;il;
Currency signed | Copy
1  [Synergy Supplies & Services $ 19,247,550 $ 384,951 Caricom v v v 2
2 [Green State Oil & Gas Services Inc $ 18,203,430 $ 386,000 Premier v v v 1
3 [Ceraturium $ 18,178,335 $ 380,000 Caricom v X v 1
4 |KNV Designs, Construction & Supplies $ 16,940,385 $ 500,000 Nafico v v v 2
5 |Westbrook Caribbean Inc $ 17,369,174| $ 386,000 Caricom v v v 2
6 |Harry Chowtie Enterprise $ 16,353,750 $ 327,075 Caricom v v v 2
7 |DNJJ Construction Services $ 17,268,615 | $ 345,372 Premier v v v 2
8 |Exclusive Engineering $ 19,150,845 | $ 386,000 Caricom v v v 1
9 |R&R General Construction & Supplies $ 17,534,444 | $ 346,227 Caricom v v v 2
10 |The Property Experts Supplies and Services $ 18,447,660 | $ 368,953 Diamond v v v 2
11 |[XP Enterprise $ 17,258,010 | $ 480,000 Caricom v v v 1
12 |P.P Building Contracting $ 16,554,090 | $ 386,000 Caricom v v v 2
13 |Yhadram & Sons Construction Establishment | $ 17,360,385 | $ 347,208 Caricom v v v 2
14 |Phoenix Engineering Enterprise $ 19,047,945 | $ 386,000 Caricom v v v 2
15 |Dev Contracting $ 14,262,465 | $ 386,000 Caricom v v v 2
16 |4A Engineering Enterprise $ 19,073,355 | $ 386,000 Caricom v v v 1
17 |Muse Holding Inc $ 20,230,694 | $ 386,000 Caricom v v v 1
18 D& A Contracting Services General Supplies & 3 16.463.475 | $ 386,000 Premier v v v )
Consultancy




Date of Tender Opening: June 19, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education - Electrical Rehabilitation at-Thomas Moore Primary School (361/2025/40)

Bil(\llder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & lilﬂlizil:l‘gy Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS l;“(::l;ll:lleif Hard Fla.Sh
0. Currency Currency signed Copy| drive
1 |Ceraturium $ 13,902,000 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
2 |B. M. Property Investments Inc. $ 15,491,700 | $ 309,834 Caricom v v v 2
3 |Anaz Construction Inc. $ 18,424,350 | $ 400,000 [Premier v v v 1
4  [Smart Innovative Solutions $ 14,721,000 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
5 |Supergraphics $ 15,450,750 | $ 340,000 Caricom v v v 1
6 |Khameraj Narine General Contractor $ 13,927,725 | $ 278,555 Premier v v v 2
7 |Mega Power Electrical & Construction Services | $ 14,509,950 | $ 290,199 Assuria v v v 2
8 |AKM Investment & Supplies $ 12,875,000 No Bid Security Seen v v v 1
9 |R. Persid Construction $ 15,368,850 | $ 310,000 Nafico v X v 2

1o [N Balgobin & Sons Contracting Service & $ 14,296,254 | $ 303,200 Nafico v | v v 2
Electrical Supplies




Date of Tender Opening: June 19, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education - Electrical Rehabilitation at-Turkeyen Nursery School (362/2025/40)

. . Bi rit Form of
Bl;lld:r Name of Bidder Bl(::ﬁ::z::; & Admiflill: &y Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS ’l;(:i:;l(ll:((:l' Iéi;(; l:llfiil;
1 |Supergraphics $ 14,840,700 BSD C/S v v v 1
2 |Fugenz Business Solutions $ 11,178,195 BSD C/S v v v 1
3 |Ceraturium $ 13,101,900 BSD C/S v v v 0
4 N. Bal.gobin & Sons Contracting Service & S 11,145,015 BSD C/S Y Y Y |
Electrical Supplies
5 |Star Executive Services $ 10,595,550 BSD C/S v v v 2
6 |Smart Builders Construction & Supplies Inc $ 9,471,000 BSD C/S v v v 1
7 |AKM Investment & Supplies $ 12,048,750 BSD C/S v v v 1
8 |[Smart Innovative Solutions $ 10,748,850 BSD C/S v v v 2
9 |B.M Property Investments Inc $ 14,894,250 BSD C/S v v v 1
10 |Ramal Resources Inc $ 14,880,779 BSD C/S v v v 1
11 |R. Persid Construction $ 13,448,000 BSD C/S v v v 1




Date of Tender Opening: June 19, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education - Electrical Rehabilitation at-Kingston Secondary School (363/2025/40)

. . Bid Security Form of
Bl;\lld:r Name of Bidder Bl(:ﬁ::::; & Amount & Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS Te.:nder I({:?);(; lle:'liizl;
Currency signed

1 Dlglta} Design Construction, Logistics and g 16,743,300 | $ 334.866 Caricom v v v )
Supplies

2 [R. Persid Construction $ 16,455,600 | $ 356,000 Nafico v v v 2

3 |B.M Property Investments Inc $ 17,794,350 | $ 355,887 Caricom v v v 2

4 |Greenhaul Industries $ 17,500,000 | $ 348,000 Nafico v v v 1

5 |Mohabir's Construction $ 16,810,500 | $ 360,000 Nafico v v v 1

6 [Superior Supplies & General Construction $ 15,045,165| $ 400,000 Nafico v v v 1

7  |Smart Innovative Solutions $ 16,481,850 No Bid Security Seen v v v 4

3 D&A Contracting Services, General Supplies S 16.123.800 | § 356,000 Premier Y Y Y )
and Consultancy

9 [Mega Power Electrical & Consturction Services | $ 16,599,450 | $ 331,989 Assuria v v v 2

10 |Supergraphics $ 19,269,600 | $ 380,000 Caricom v v v 1

Di
11 |The Property Expert FTP not completed | $ 338,310 iamond v v X 0
Insurance

12 |Smart Builders Construction & Supplies Inc $ 14,567,070 | $ 356,000 Premier v v v 2

13 |Ace of Trades $ 17,217,900 | $ 356,000 Premier v v v 2

14 |Ceraturium $ 15,363,600 | $ 340,000 Caricom v v v 1

15 |Pooran Ram Boodhaley General Contracting $ 13,216,350 | $ 264,327 Premier v v v 1

16 |Cornerstone Innovations $ 17,665,200 | $ 356,000 Premier v v v 1

17 N. Bal.gobm & Sons Contracting Service & S 16,201,500 | $ 352,000 Assuria v v v )
Electrical Supplies

18 |Eternity Investment Inc $ 17,106,600 | $ 356,000 Assuria v v v 1




19 |Anaz Construction Inc $ 21,301,350 | $ 400,000 Premier v v v
20 |Builders Supplies $ 17,389,050 | $ 347,781 Premier v v v
21 [Mac Morris Enterprise $ 16,392,600 | $ 356,000 Caricom v v v




Date of Tender Opening: June 19, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education - Electrical Rehabilitation at-New Campbellville Secondary School (364/2025/40)

. . Bid Securit Form of
Bl;\lld:r Name of Bidder Bl(:jﬁ:(e)::; & Ztin:l?'::; f;y Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS ’l;i:;ll(ll:s I({:?);(; lle:'liizl;
1 |R. Persid Construction $ 25,498,200 | $ 532,000 Nafico v v v 2
2 |STS Investments $ 24,192,630 | $ 483,853 Premier v v v 2
3 [Cornerstone Innovations $ 26,426,925 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
4 |Two Brothers Construction $ 23,667,000 | $ 540,000 Nafico v v v 1
5 |Mega Power Electrical & Construction Services | $ 24,885,000 | $ 497,700 Assuria v v v 2
6 |B.M Property Investments Inc $ 26,575,450 | $ 531,909 Caricom v v v 2
7  |Supergraphics $ 26,484,675| $ 600,000 Caricom v v v 1
8 [Ceraturium $ 23,980,950 | $ 520,000 Caricom v v v 1
9 |Jemcorp Engineering and Imports $ 25,371,000 | $ 532,000 Assuria v v v 2
10 |Eternity Investment Inc $ 26,449,500 | $ 520,000 Assuria v v v 0
11 |A. Plus Consulting and General Services Inc $ 25,508,175 $ 510,163 Diamond v v v 1
12 Undérwood's Civil Work and Contracting S 25.970.700 | $ 519,414 Nafico v Y Y )
Services
13 |ACE of Trades $ 25,587,450 | $ 532,000 Premier v v v 2
14 |Khemraj Narine General Contractor $ 24,484,425 | $ 489,689 Premier v v v 2
15 Digita} Design Construction, Logistics and S 24,900,750 | $ 498,015 Caricom v v v )
Supplies
16 |Mac Morris Enterprise $ 24,900,750 | $ 532,000 Caricom v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: June 19, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education - Electrical Rehabilitation at-Carmelita Nursery School (365/2025/40)

. . Bid Securi . . Form of |Hard
Bl;g.er Name of Bidder Bldcﬁl{l:::::; & Amount &ty Blizee:lcl;ty GRA | NIS T.ender ljll;il;
Currency signed | Copy
1 |Anaz Construction Inc $ 13,535,550 BSD Form Completed & Signed v v v 1
2 |BM Property Investments Inc $ 14,985,300 BSD Form Completed & Signed v v v 2
3 g;‘ii‘:s"(’d's Civil Work and Contracted $ 8.825250| BSD Form Completed & Signed | v | v 1
4 |Ceraturium $ 12,826,800 BSD Form Completed & Signed v v v 0
5 |Supergraphics $ 14,879,025 BSD Form Completed & Signed v v v 1
6 |R Persid Construction $ 10,377,150 BSD Form Completed & Signed v v v 2
7 |Mega Power Electrical Construction Services $ 10,326,750 | BSD Form Completed & Signed v v v 2
8 |Vision Engineering Solutions $ 9,128,805 | BSD Form Completed & Signed v v v 1
9 |Pooran Ram Boodhaley General Contracting $ 8,181,075 | BSD Form Completed & Signed v v v 2
10 |The Property Experts Supplies & Services $ 8,501,325 | BSD Form Completed & Signed v v v 2
11 |AKM Investment $ 9,775,500 | BSD Form Completed & Signed v v v 1
12 |Ramal Resources Inc. $ 11,771,571 BSD Form Completed & Signed v v v 1
13 |Smart Innovation Solutions $ 8,789,550 | BSD Form Completed & Signed v v v 1
14 |A Plus Consulting & General Services Inc. $ 9,081,975 | BSD Form Completed & Signed v v v 1
15 |\ Balgobin & Sons Contracting Service & | ¢ 8,696,100 | BSD Form Completed & Signed | ¢ | v | I
Electrical Supplies
16 |[MTECH Contracting Solutions $ 9,148,020 | BSD Form Completed & Signed v v v 1




Date of Tender Opening: June 19, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education - Construction of IT Lab-Lusignan Primary School (366/2025/40)

. . Bid Security Form of
Bl;\lld:r Name of Bidder Bl(:ﬁ::::; & Amount & Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS Te.:nder I({:?);(; lle:'liizl;
Currency signed
1 |4A Engineering Enterprise $ 18,904,190 | $ 386,000 Caricom v v v 1
2 |A. Alli Construction $ 17,268,615 | $ 345,372 Premier iNs. v v v 2
3 |Diversity Investments Inc. $ 19,093,624 | $ 381,872 Caricom v v v 2
4 |Westbrook Caribbean Inc. $ 17,781,193 | $ 386,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |BM Property Investments Inc. $ 19,297,110 | $ 385,942 Caricom v v v 2
6 Malachi Mahk & Mateo General Construction 3 16,506,441 No Bid Security seen x x v )
& Supplies
7 |Yhadram & Sons Construction Establishment $ 17,377,185 | $ 347,544 Caricom v v v 2
8 |Supergraphics $ 19,578,825 $ 400,000 Caricom v v v 1
9 |Ace of Trades $ 18,831,698 | $ 386,000 Premier iNs. v v v 2
10 |H&ON General Construction Company $ 17,722,110 | $ 386,000 Caricom v v v 2
11 |Emeralds General Contracting & Distributors $ 18,635,726 | $ 386,000 Premier iNs. v v v 1
12 |ICON Construction & Maintenance Service $ 16,232,895 | $ 324,658 Premier iNs. v v v 2
13 |R. Persid Construction $ 18,299,085 | $ 386,000 Nafico v v v 2
14 |Vishal's Contrcating $ 18,479,895 | $ 369,598 Assuria v v v 2
15 |Ceraturium $ 17,191,335 | $ 380,000 Caricom v v v 1
16 |8 Ball General Contractor $ 18,867,450 | $ 386,000 Premier Ins. v v v 1
17 |Phoenix Engineering $ 18,835,845 | $ 386,000 Caricom v v v 1
18 [Jemcorp Engineering & Imports $ 16,110,500 | $ 380,000 Assuria v v v 1




Date of Tender Opening: June 19, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education - Extension of Houston Nursery School (367/2025/40)

. . Bid Securit Form of
Bl;\lld:r Name of Bidder Bl(:jﬁ:(e)::; & Ztin:l?'::; f;y Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS ’l;i:;ll(ll:s I({:?);(; lle:'liizl;
1 |Vishal Contracting Co. $ 34,863,623 | $ 697,272 Assuria X X v 2
2 |P.P Building Contracting $ 33,803,280 | $ 736,000 Caricom v v v 2
3 [Pantheon Construction Inc. $ 35,859,338 | $ 717,187 Premier Ins. v v v 1
4 |Caribbean Soultions Inc. $ 33,829,950 | $ 720,000 Nafico v v v 2
5 |Eternity Investment Inc. $ 35,161,508 | $ 736,000 Assuria v v v 1
6 |Supergraphics $ 39,095,123 | $ 800,000 Caricom v v v 2
7 |BM Property Investments Inc. $ 36,799,245 | $ 735,984 Caricom v v v 2
8 |AEA Enterprise $ 36,398,460 | $ 727,969 Premier Ins. v v v 2
9 |Barker's Contracting Services $ 3,546,885 No bid security seen v v v 2
10 |4 A Engineering Enterprise $ 34,321,245 | $ 736,000 Caricom v v v 1
11 |Westbrook Caribbean Inc. $ 32,667,680 | $ 736,000 Caricom v v v 1
12 |Innovative Development Guyana (IDSGY) $ 32,812,500 | $ 736,000 Premier Ins. v v v 2
13 |Vanguard Constructs $ 33,460,338 | $ 709,210 Assuria v v v 2
14 |Delph Contrution Inc. $ 33,552,225 | $ 671,045 Premier Ins. v v v 2
15 |JJ Construction & General Services $ 32,374,230 | $ 647,485 Premier Ins. v v v 2
16 |Emeralds General Contracting & Distributors $ 34,977,731 | $ 736,000 Premier Ins. v v v 2
17 |Phoenix Engineering Enterprise $ 34,319,250 | $ 736,000 Caricom v v v 1
18 |Kaiveri Procurement Logistics & Investments Inc | $ 32,553,360 | $ 651,067 Premier Ins. v v v 2
19 |H&ON General Construction Company $ 32,715,165 | $ 736,000 Caricom v v v 2
20 [Raising Transportation & Construction $ 56,483,385 | $ 1,129,667 Caricom v v v 2
21 [NP Contracting & Transportation Services $ 35,726,513 | $ 714,530 Premier Ins. v v v 2




22 |Jemcorp Engineering & Imports $ 31,977,000 | $ 740,000 Assuria v v v 2
23 |Builders Supplies $ 35,957,145 | $ 719,143 Premier Ins. v v v 2
24 |Ceraturium $ 30,988,493 | $ 720,000 Caricom v v v 1
25 |FYFFE Building & Contracting Works $ 29,791,388 | $ 736,000 Caricom v v v 1
26 |Dev Contracting $ 33,803,280 | $ 736,000 Caricom v v v 2
27 Digital Design Construction Logistics & S 20.260.455 | $ 585,200 Caricom v v v )

Supplies




Date of Tender Opening: June 19, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education - Construction of IT Lab-Leonora Primary School (368/2025/40)

. . Bid Securit Form of
Bl;\lld:r Name of Bidder Bl(:jﬁ:(e)::; & Ztin:l?'::; f;y Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS ’l;i:;ll(ll:s I({:?);(; lle:'liizl;
1 |Exclusive Engineering $ 19,469,699 | $ 392,000 Caricom v v v 1
2 |Westbrook Caribbean Inc. $ 17,693,084 | $ 392,000 Caricom v v v 1
3 |Harry Chowtie Enterprise $ 16,593,780 | $ 331,876 Caricom v v v 1
4 |Yhadram & Sons Construction Establishment $ 17,565,135 | $ 351,303 Caricom v v v 2
5 |KNV Designs, Construction & Supplies $ 17,013,360 | $ 500,000 Nafico v v v 2
6 |Phoenix Engineering Enterprise $ 19,353,495 | $ 392,000 Caricom v v v 2
7 |KW Construction Enterprise $ 19,120,395 | $ 382,408 Caricom v v v 2
8 [Ceraturium $ 8,026,610 | $ 380,000 Caricom v v v 2
9 |ACE Trades Construction & Logistics Company | $ 18,609,780 | $ 392,000 Premier Ins v v v 1
10 |Green State Oil & Gas Services Inc. $ 18,150,930 | $ 392,000 Premier Ins v v v 1
11 |[Synergy $ 19,247,550 | $ 384,951 Caricom v v v 1
12 |Fast Signs Guyana $ 18,541,845 | $ 380,000 Assuria v v v 1
13 |Ewaaz Construction & Hardware $ 17,126,550 | $ 344,000 Caricom v v v 1
14 |Mahamad Haseeb Bacchus Enterprise $ 18,295,095 | $ 380,000 Assuria v | v v |
Construction
15 |Greenhaul Industries $ 17,950,275 | $ 359,005 Nafico v v v 1
16 |IMS Construction & Logistics Services $ 17,669,190 | $ 400,000 Caricom v v v 2
17 |Rahaman's Investment $ 18,353,895 | $ 380,000 Assuria v v v 1
18 |4A Engineering Enterprise $ 19,529,864 | $ 392,000 Caricom v v v 1
19 |RDP Building Construction $ 15,742,965 | $ 392,000 Caricom v v v 2
20 |Nexwave Infrastructure $ 17,268,615 | $ 345,372 Premier v v v 2




21 |8 Ball General Contractor $ 19,366,914 | $ 392,000 Premier v v v 1
22 |Dev Contracting $ 15,742,965 | $ 392,000 Caricom v v v 2
23 |R&R General Construction & Supplies $ 17,993,409 | $ 359,868 Caricom v v v 2
24 |Bulletwood Construction $ 18,280,395 | $ 380,000 Assuria v v v 1
25 |P.P Building Contracting $ 15,742,965 | $ 392,000 Caricom v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: June 19, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education - Construction of IT Lab-Parika Salem Primary School (369/2025/40)

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & | Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS | Tender | 2rd | Flash
No. Currency ) Copy | drive
Currency signed
1 |Triple A General Contracting Services $ 17,268,615| $ 345,372 | Premier Insurance | v v 1
2 |4A Engineering Enterprise $ 19,436,651| $ 392,000 Caricom v v v 1
3 |Yhadram and Sons Construction Establishment $ 18,229,680 $ 354,768 Caricom v v v 1
4 |Green State Oil & Gas Services Inc. $ 18,229,680| $ 392,000 | Premier Insurance | v v 1
5 |Fast Signs Guyana $ 18,211,200 $ 380,000 Assuria v v v 1
6 |Rahaman's Investment $ 18,035,850 $ 380,000 Assuria v v v 1
7 |DDA Enterprise $ 21,774,585 $ 435,492 Nafico v X v 1
8 |RDP Building Construction $ 15,642,965 $ 392,000 Caricom v v v 2
9 |Phoenix Engineering Enterprise $ 19,331,445| $ 392,000 Caricom v v v 1
10 |Dev Contracting $ 15,742,965 $ 392,000 Caricom v v v 2
11 |Lakabu Enterprise $ 16,985,955 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
12 |Bulletwood Construction $ 17,962,350| $ 380,000 Assuria v v v 0
13 |Mahamad Haseeb Bacchus Enterprise $ 17,977,050| $ 380,000 Assuria v | Vv v 1
Construction

14 |R & R General Construction and Supplies $ 17,311,844| $ 350,689 Caricom v v v 2

15 Supe?r Advance Construction & Procurement $ 19,037,970 $ 392,000 Caricom v v v )
Services

16 |Exclusive Engineering $ 19,399,695 $ 392,000 Caricom v v v 1
17 |Westbrook Caribbean Inc. $ 17,311,424 $ 392,000 Caricom v v v 2
18 |S & J General Services $ 17,137,470| $ 392,000 | Premier Insurance | X v 2
19 |Harry Chowtie Enterprise $ 17,441,130| $ 348,823 Caricom v v v 2
20 |Ceraturium $ 18,802,035| $ 380,000 Caricom v v v 1
21 |P.P Building Contracting $ 15,742,965| $ 392,000 Caricom v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: June 19, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education - Construction of IT Lab-Greenwich Park Primary School (370/2025/40)

. . Bid Securit Form of
Bl;\lld:r Name of Bidder Bl(:jﬁ:(e)::; & Ztin:l?'::; f;y Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS ’l;i:;ll(ll:s I({:?);(; lle:'liizl;
1 |KNV Designs, Construction & Supplies $ 14,358,435 | $ 500,000 Nalico v v v 2
2 |DEV Contracting $ 15,742,965 | $ 386,000 Caricom v v v 2
3 |RDP Building Construction $ 15,742,965 | $ 386,000 Caricom v v v 2
4 |Green State Oil & Gas Services Inc. $ 17,852,730 | $ 386,000 Premier v v v 1
5 D&A Contracting Services, General Supplies S 16216.725 | s 386,000 Premier Y Y Y )
and Consultancy
6 |Greenhaul Industries $ 17,706,150 | $ 354,123 Nafico v v v 1
7 |R&R General Construction and Supplies $ 17,756,834 | $ 355,137 Caricom v v v 2
8 |Nexwave Infrastructure $ 17,268,615 | $ 345,372 Premier v v v 2
9 Mahamad.Haseeb Bacchus Enterprise S 18475170 | § 380,000 Assuria v v v )
Construction
10 |Exclusive Engineering $ 19,079,235 | $ 386,000 Caricom v v v 1
11 [Phoenix Engineering Enterprise $ 19,036,395 | $ 386,000 Caricom v v v 1
12 |Westbrook Caribbean Inc. $ 17,684,173 | $ 386,000 Caricom v v v 2
13 |Harry Chowtie Enterprise $ 17,563,455 | $ 351,269 Caricom v v v 2
14 |Ceraturium $ 17,673,285 | $ 380,000 Caricom v v v 1
15 |PP Building Contracting $ 15,729,840 | $ 386,000 Caricom v v v 2
16 |4A Engineering $ 19,279,239 | $ 386,000 Caricom v v v 1




Date of Tender Opening: June 19, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education - Electrical Rehabilitation at-Stella Marris Nursery School (371/2025/40)

Bil(\llder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & lilﬂlizil:l‘gy Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS l;“(::l;ll:lleif Hard Fla.Sh
0. Currency Currency signed Copy| drive
1 |Fugenz Business Solutions $ 9,256,275 BSD completed and signed v v v 1
2 |Pooran Ram Boodhaley General Contracting $ 9,010,575 BSD completed and signed v v v 2
3 |Supergraphics $ 14,843,325 BSD completed and signed v v v 2
4 [Anaz Construction Inc $ 13,514,550 BSD completed and signed v v v 1
5 |Eternity Investment Inc $ 14,358,750 298,000 [Assuria v v v 0
6 |B.M Property Investment Inc $ 14,897,400 BSD completed and signed v v v 2
7 |Ceraturium $ 12,915,000 BSD completed and signed v v v 0
8 |Vision Engineering Solution $ 9,923,655 BSD completed and signed v v v 1
9 |Mega Power Electrical & Construction Services | $ 10,905,300 BSD completed and signed v v v 1
10 |R. Persid Construction $ 11,695,950 BSD completed and signed v v v 2
11 |Smart Builders Construction & Supplies Inc $ 8,059,275 BSD completed and signed v v v 2
12 Eiiveri Procurement Logistics and Investments 3 13.358.100 BSD completed and signed v v v |
13 |AKM Investment & Supplies $ 10,185,000 BSD completed and signed v v v 1
14 N. Bal.gobm & S.OHS Contracting Service & $ 9,658,635 BSD completed and signed v v v 1

Electrical Supplies
15 |Ramal Resources Inc $ 12,296,571 BSD completed and signed v v v 1
16 |FN Electrical & General Contracting $ 13,171,200 BSD completed and signed v v v 1
17 |Cornerstone Innovations $ 14,805,000 BSD completed and signed v v v 2
18 |[Mtech Contracting Solutions $ 9,826,425 BSD completed and signed v v v 1




Date of Tender Opening: June 19, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education - Rehabilitation Works at-Graham's Hall Primary School (372/2025/40)

. . Bid Securit Form of
Bl;\lld:r Name of Bidder Bl(:jﬁ:(e)::; & Ztin:l?'::; f;y Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS ’l;i:;ll(ll:s I({:?);(; lle:'liizl;
1 |Emeralds General Contracting & Distributors $ 32,730,545| $ 760,000 | premier Insurance | v v v 2
2 |D.D.A Enterprise $ 2,446,991| $ 489,388 Nafico v v v 1
3 |H& ON General Construction Company $ 34,488,115 $ 760,000 Caricom v v v 2
4 |Delph Construction Inc $ 36,619,815| $ 732,396 | premier Insurance | v v v 1
5 |JJ Construction & General Services $ 37,319,815| $ 746,396 | premier Insurance | v v v 2
6 |8 Ball General Contractor $ 33,741,875| $ 760,000 | premier Insurance | v v 1
Sovereignty Investments Construction Services .
7 | sces anuiyl dors) $ 35,845,215/ $ 760,000 Assuria v | v v 2
8 |Westbrook Caribbean Inc $ 35,406,615 $ 760,000 Caricom v v v 2
9 [Dicon Construction & Surveying Services $ 34,367,125 $ 687,343 Caricom v v v 2
10 |Kaiveri Procurement Logistics & Investments Inc| $ 31,637,915 $ 632,758 | premier Insurance | v v v 2
11 |Superior Supplies & General Construction $ 34,675,000| $ 800,000 Nafico v v v 1
12 |AEA Enterprise $ 27,851,815 $ 557,036 | premier Insurance | v v v 2
13 |Ceraturium $ 31,421,615 $ 760,000 Caricom v v v 1
14 |Global Builders Engineering Inc $ 35,920,215 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
15 |FNS Investments $ 33,789,715| $ 579,137 Caricom v v v 2
16 |Treon Peters Construction Service $ 33,005,415 $ 880,000 Nafico v v v 2
17 |4A Engineering Enterprise $ 33,852,635 | $ 760,000 Caricom v v v 1
18 |[Phoenix Engineering Enterprise $ 33,618,715 | $ 760,000 Caricom v v v 1
S. Hussain Building & Civil Engineering ,
19 $ 32,866,615 | $ 657,332 | premier Insurance | v v v 2
Consultant




20 |Eternity Investment Inc $ 37,619,565 760,000 Assuria
21 |BM Property Investments Inc $ 37,995,000 759,900 Caricom
Contractor's Bid
22 |PABLO Garnite Installation Page not completed 760,000 | premier Insurance
nor signed
23 |Diversity Invetments inc $ 34,048,015 680,960 Caricom
tractor's Bi )
24 |Builders Supplies Contractor's Bid 745,360 | premier Insurance
Page not completed
25 [PMW Construction & General Services $ 31,754,265 760,000 | premier Insurance




Date of Tender Opening: June 19, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education - General Rehabilitation at-Carmel Secondary School (373/2025/40)

. . Bid Securit Form of
Bl;\lld:r Name of Bidder Bl(:jﬁ:(e)::; & Ztin:l?'::; f;y Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS ’l;i:;ll(ll:s I({:?);(; lle:'liizl;

1 Eiiveri Procurement Logistics and Investments 3 27.709.710| 554,194 Premier v v v )
2 |Westbrook Caribbean Inc $ 32,321,079 | $ 600,000 Caricom v v v 2
3 |8 Ball General Construction $ 28,453,792 | $ 600,000 Premier v v v 1
4 |A. Plus Consulting and General Services Inc $ 28,939,102 | $ 578,780 Diamond v v v 1
5 |Phoenix Engineering Enterprise $ 28,436,047 | $ 600,000 Caricom v v v 1
6 |FNS Investments $ 29,163,739 | $ 675,794 Caricom v v v 2
7 |Barker's Contracting Services $ 26,605,719 | $ 600,000 Premier v v v 1
8 |H&ON General Construction Company $ 28,163,992 | $ 600,000 Caricom v v v 2
9 [Builders Supplies $ 29,428,287 | $ 588,566 Premier v v v 2
10 |PMW Construction & General Services $ 40,058,464 | $ 600,000 Premier v v v 1
11 |Caribbean Solutions Inc $ 27,700,470 | $ 600,000 NAFICO v v v 2
12 |K&S Civil Engineering Contracting Services Inc | $ 28,423,815 $ 568,476 Caricom v X v 2
13 |DNIJJ Construction Services $ 26,088,353 | $ 521,767 Premier v v v 2
14 |4A Engineering Enterprise $ 28,384,356 | $ 600,000 Caricom v v v 1
15 |Firma General Contracting Service $ 27,488,265 | $ 600,000 Premier v v v 2
16 |Ceraturium $ 24,889,095 No Bid Security seen v X v

17 |S&J General Services $ 27,431,010 | $ 600,000 Premier v v v 1
18 |Fyffe Building and Contracting Works $ 28,945,140 | $ 600,000 Caricom v v v 2
19 |Emeralds General Contracting & Distributors $ 28,329,708 | $ 600,000 Premier v v v 1




Sovereignty Investments Construction Services

2 . , , A 1 v v 2
0 (SICS Builders) $ 33,777,607 | $ 700,000 ssuria v

21 |AEA Enterprise $ 28,333,200 | $ 566,664 Premier v v v 2

22 |Dicon Construction & Surveying Services $ 27,245950| $ 544,919 Caricom v v v 2

23 |Teon Peters Construction Service FTP not completed | $ 880,000 Nafico v v X 2

24 |Eternity Investment Inc $ 29,476,965 | $ 600,000 Assuria v v v 1

25 |Diversity Investments Inc $ 28,956,889 | $ 583,274 Caricom v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: June 19, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education - Construction of I'T Lab- Skeldon Primary School (374/2025/40)

. . Bid Securi . . Form of |Hard
Bl;g.er Name of Bidder Bldcﬁl{l:::::; & Amount &ty Blizee:lcl;ty GRA | NIS T.ender ljll;il;
Currency signed | Copy
1 |Unity Build's Contracting $ 22.859,655| $ 457,193 Premier v v v 2
2 |Xxpress Enterprise $ 22,465,170| $ 496,000 Premier X X v 1
3 [Rahaman's Investment $ 22.665,720| $ 480,000 Assuria v v v 1
4 [Pixie Construction $ 22.964,655| $ 459,293 Caricom v v v 2
5 |Bulletwood Construction $ 22.245.720| $ 480,000 Assuria v v v 1
6 |4A Engineering Enterprise $ 23,951,193| $ 496,000 Caricom v v v 1
7 |Yhadram & Sons Construction Est. $ 22,602,405 | $ 452,048 Caricom v v v 2
8 |Triple A General Contracting Service $ 21,113,400 | $ 422,268 Premier v v v 2
9 |Phoenix Engineering Ent $ 23,879,310 | $ 496,000 Caricom v v v 1
10 |KNV Designs, Construction & Supplies $ 21,057,330 | $ 500,000 Nafico v v v 2
11 |MGB Construction $ 22812405 | $ 456,248 Premier v v v 2
12 |Asheik and Son Enterprise $ 19,770,870 | $ 395,417 Assuria v v v 2
13 |Y. Tahal and Sons Enterprise $ 22,360,170 | $ 496,000 Premier v v v 2
14 |DDA Enterprise $ 24,054,670 | $ 481,093 Nafico v v v 1
15 |Ceraturium $ 20,917,230 | $ 480,000 Caricom v v v 1
16 [Armo's Construction and Supplies $ 22.980,405 | $ 459,608 Premier v v v 2
17 |Fast Signs Guyana $ 23,348,220 | $ 480,000 Assuria v v v 2
18 |Icon Constuction and Maintenance Service $ 21,772,905 | $ 435,458 Premier v v v 2
19 |8 Ball General Contractor $ 23.951,193 | $ 496,000 Premier v v v 1
20 |Angelique Enterprise $ 21,391,755 | $ 496,000 Premier v v v 1
21 [N. Ramnarine Construction $ 21,930,195 | $ 496,000 Premier v v v 1
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