Date of Tender Opening: March 13, 2025

File Number: Guyana Marketing Corportation (108/2025/21) - Construction of Concrete Drains and Fence for the Guyana Marketing Corporation at Sophia,Region 4

Bid Security

Form of

Hard

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS | Tender Fla.sh
No. Currency Agency ) drive
Currency signed | Copy
1 Eics Civil Engineering Contracting Services $ 38,022,565 | $ 1,000,000 Caricom v v v )
2 |J&A Lumber Yard & Contracting Services $ 34,586,895 | $ 800,000 Caricom v v v 2
3 |HCM Construction Services $ 38,530,784.50 | $ 800,000 Caricom v v - 2
4 |Anil Lalsa Construction $ 33,766,967 | $ 800,000 Assuria v v v 2
5 |MC Realty & Construction $ 56,605,702 | $ 800,000 Caricom v v v 2
6 |G. Ramlall General Construction Services $ 37,946,550 | $ 800,000 Caricom v v v 2
7 |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 33,355,769 | $ 800,000 Caricom v v v 1
g |Deaitial Design Construction, Logistics & S 37,626218|$ 800,000|  Caricom v | v | v 2
Supplies
9 |Nicozy General Construction $ 35,841,797 | $ 716,835 Casricom v v v 1
10 |Jettoo's Construction $ 37264415 $ 800,000 Caricom v v v 2
11 |IMS Construction & Logistics Services $ 33,148,520 | $ 800,000 Caricom v v v 2
12 |Emerald's General Contracting & Distributors | $ 33,464,689 | $ 800,000 Caricom v v v 2
13 |VI Enterprise $ 44.481,368 | $ 800,000 Premier v v v 2
14 |DREngineering $ 33,595,007 | $ 800,000 Nafico v v v 2
15 |Energy Empire $ 42,704,618 | $ 800,000 Caricom v v v 2
16 |Global Builders Engineering Inc. $ 39,982,163 | $ 1,000,000 Caricom v v v 2
17 |Kraft Masters Inc. $ 32,724,009 | $ 280,000 Caricom v v v 2
18 Global Busines Enterprise & Consultancy g 51.412.636 | $ 800,000 Assuria v v v )

Servivces




19 |B& J Civil Works $ 68,152,496 | $ 80,000 Caricom
Form of tender
20 |M&D Investments page not signed nor | $ 800,000 Assuria
completed
21 |VN Constructing Services $ 11,755,300 | $ 570,000( Diamond Inc
Engineer's Estimate $ 38,953,030




Date of Tender Opening: March 13, 2025

'File Number: Guyana Marketing Corportation (1U9/202572T) - Renabiltation of Concrete FIoor Tor the Guyana VMarketing Corporation at Sophia, Kegion 4
. . Bid Security Form of
B1§der Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.sh
0. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |Nicozy General Construction $ 26,588,920 $ 474,278 Caricom v v v 1
2 |Energy Empire $ 21,551,000| $ 570,000 Caricom v v v 2
3 |IMS Construction and Logistics Services $ 22,931,000 $ 570,000 Caricom v v v 2
4 [B&J Civil Works $ 58,271,650 $ 570,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |Clobal Business Enterprise & Consultancy $ 26,578,800 No Bid Security Seen v | v 2
Services
6 |Anil Lalsa Construction $ 23,952,200 $ 570,000 Assuria v v v 2
7 |Emeralds General Contracting & Distributors $ 28,802,900| $ 570,000 Caricom v v v 2
8 |NSA Enterprise $ 27,360,800 $ 570,000 Premier v v v 2
g |Digital Design Construction Logistics & $ 18,136,650| $ 570,000  Caricom v | L v 2
Supplies
10 |K&S Civil Engineering Contracting Services Inc | $ 25,949,750 $ 1,000,000 Caricom v v v 2
11 |J&A Lumber Yard and Contracting Services $ 22,344,500 $ 570,000 Assuria v v v 2
12 |G. Ramlall Construction Services $ 22,425,000 $ 570,000 Caricom v v v 2
13 |Jeetoo's Construction $ 25,133,250 $ 570,000 Caricom v v v 2
14 |VIEnterprise $ 22,045,500| $ 570,000 Premier v v v 2
15 |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 23,506,000 $ 570,000 Caricom v v v 2
16 |MC Realty & Construction $ 17,715,750 $ 570,000 Caricom v v v 2
17 |Kraft Masters Inc $ 14,119,700 $ 660,000 Assuria v v v 2




Form of Tender

18 |Global Builders Engineering Incorporated Page Not Completed | $ 1,000,000 Caricom
& Signed
19 |HCM Construction Services $ 25,971,600| $ 570,000 Premier
Engineer's Estimate $ 28,362,450




Date of Tender Opening: March 13, 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council Region #2 (18/2025/72) - Supply & Installation of Automatic Sprinkler System at RAU Building

. . Bid Security . . Form of |Hard
B . Bid A t B Flash
idder Name of Bidder id Amount & Amount & 1d Security GRA | NIS | Tender EES
No. Currency Agency ) drive
Currency signed | Copy
1 |Supreme Distributors $ 11,012,250 $ 150,000 Premier v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 13, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Local Government & Regional Development (03/2025/13) - Construction of Charity-Urasara NDC Building

. . Bid Securit Form of
Bl;\lld:r Name of Bidder Bl(:jﬁ:(e)::; & ACnlll‘l"::Itl f;y Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS ’l;i:;ll(ll:s I({:?);(; lle:'liizl;
1 |HKBL Construction $ 18,545,400| $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
2 |Money Tree Trading $ 22,041,620 $ 100,000 Premier v Rec v 2
3 |Skyline Construction $ 24,717,352 $ 100,000 Nafico v v v 2
4 |IMS Construction & Logistics Services $ 21,902,622| $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |[M-Mohameds Logistics & Construction $ 32,145.271| $ 100,000]  Assuria v || v 2
Services
6 |Igbal Ally Contracting Service $ 29,625,638 $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
7 |Ceraturium $ 24,322,688 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 0
8 |STP Investments Inc $ 26,466,746.25 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
9 |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 25,074,956 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
10 |Blue Print Builders Inc $ 26,719,875 | $ 100,000 Assuria v Rec v 1
11 |FS Construction $ 24,704,612 | $ 100,000 Caricom v Ltr v 2
12 |SAAM General Contracting $ 23,007,720 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
13 |Gurdev Mahadeo Contracting Services $ 21,118,881 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
14 |See-Solutions $ 19,719,196 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
15 |Metal & Fabrication Ink $ 22,777,777 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
16 |Rishma & Sisters Enterprise $ 27,567,230 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 1
17 |Sheriff Construction Inc $ 27,564,705 | $ 100,000 Assuria v Rec v 1
18 |Amin's Construction $ 23,740,911 No Bid Security Seen v v v 0
19 |Triple F Variety Store $ 23,536,758 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
20 |Talish Hollow Blocks & Construction Services | $ 22,080,860 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
21 |Mohamed Rafi Yusoof Construction $ 25,613,112 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2




22

Urban Edge Builders Inc

$

25,308,150

$

100,000

Assuria

Rec

23

Infinity Contracting & General Services

$

22,949,834

$

100,000

Assuria




Date of Tender Opening: March 13, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Local Government & Regional Development (04/2025/13) - Construction of Industry-Plaisance NDC Building

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency . Copy | drive
Currency signed

1 [J.J Construction & General Services $ 28,666,024 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2

2 |Security Plus $ 25,793,745 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 1

3 |Deluxe Contracting and Supplies $ 34,468,300 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2

4 |Global Builders Engineering Inc $ 23,496,145 | $ 1,000,000 Caricom v v v 2

5 |L.S Contracting Services $ 20,774,748 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2

6 K. Primo General Building & Contracting S 28.701,924 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v )
Works

7 |RW Electrical Company and Building $ 29,843,156 | $ 100,000| HandinHand | v | v v 1
Contractors

8 |Applied Services $ 28,039,583 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 0

9 |K&S Civil Engineering Contracting Services Inc| $ 23,878978 | $ 1,000,000 Caricom v v v 2

10 [STP Investments Inc $ 26,571,746 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2

11 |R. Persid Construction $ 22222074 $ 100,000 Nafico v v v 2

12 |ACL Construction Guyana $ 29,182,057 | $ 100,000 Nafico v v v 1

13 |D. David International $ 30,237,700 | $ 620,000 Caricom v v v 2

14 |4S Security & Building Enterprise $ 26,334,536 | $ 100,000 Nafico v v v 2

15 |[4A Engineering Enterprise $ 23,814,179 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 1

16 M. Mohamed Logistics and Construction g 30312,023 | § 100,000 Assuria v v v )
Services

17 Destiny General Construction and Maintenance $ 23.199.355 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2

Services




18 [Rishma and Sisters Enterprise $ 22,373,769 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
19 |Money Tree Trading $ 20,835,801 No Bid Security Seen v Rec v 2
20 |JOP SP Construction Services Inc $ 27,882,083 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
21 |B.M Property Investments Inc $ 34,519,800 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
22 |Hansi Engineering Services $ 37,948,607 | $ 100,000 Nafico v v v 2
23 |New Castle Enterprise $ 28,495,099 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
24 |Mobile Express $ 24,345279 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
25 |Sheriff Construction Inc $ 27,617,205 | $ 100,000 Assuria v Rec v 1
26 |Westbrook Caribbean Inc $ 27,958,300 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
27 |Onyx Engineering Inc $ 42,377,380 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
28 |Metal & Fabrication Ink $ 22,777,777 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
29 |Delph Construction Inc $ 26,852,495 $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
30 |Mohamed Rafi Yusoof Construction $ 25,471,289 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
Form of Tender
31 |S.A General Services Page Not Completed | $ 100,000 Premier v v X 1
Nor Signed
1 Eaciveri Procurement Logistics and Investments S 31.960.877 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v )
33 |Ceraturium $ 24,322,688 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 1
34 |Novar Industries $ 15,000,000 | $ 100,000 Nafico v v v 2
35 Four.Brothers Trucking & general Construction 3 410602211 § 100,000 Nafico v v v )
Services
36 |R&P Engineering and General Construction $ 22,432,074 | $ 100,000 Assuria v Rec v 2
37 Sovereigqty Investments Construction Services 3 30,141,081 | § 100,000 Assuria v v v )
(SICS Builders)




38 |Blue Print Builders Inc $ 26,772,375 $ 100,000 Assuria v Rec v 1
39 |Ramesh Persaud & Son General Construction $ 17,525,550 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
40 |Pivot Construction and General Services $ 24,387,819 $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
41 |HKBL Construction Inc $ 18,814,595 $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
42 |Urban Edge Builders Inc $ 25,360,650 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 1
43 |A. Alli Construction $ 23,380,404 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 13, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Local Government & Regional Development (05/2025/13) - Construction of Kiloy-Hampshire NDC Building

Bid Security

Form of

Hard

Bl;g.er Name of Bidder Bldcﬁl{l:::::; & Amount & Blizee:lcl;ty GRA | NIS T.ender ljll;il;
Currency signed | Copy
1 |C.Sohan Construction Services $ 23,905,996| $ 100,000 Premier v X v 2
2 |A. K Supplies and Sanitation $ 23,904,856 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
3 |HKBL Construction Inc $ 19,324,509| $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
4 |KCDS Construction & Supplies $ 27,134,137| $ 100,000 Caricom v Ltr v 2
5 |M & B Contracting Services $ 21,115,285 $ 100,000 Assuria v Ltr v 2
6 |A.Alli Construction $ 23,380,404 $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
- Nardeo Chaitram Welding & Fabrication & 3 19.023.127| 100,000 Caricom v v v )
General Constr
8 |[Ramesh Persaud & Son General Contruction $ 17,934,420 $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
9 |Blue Print Builders Inc $ 26,772,375 $ 100,000 Assuria v Rec v 1
10 |[RDSM Enterprise $ 20,902,707| $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
11 |Gregory Business Enterprise $ 27,069,143| $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
12 |Icon Construction and Maintenance Service $ 22.982,753| $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
13 |K Mahabir Construction Firm $ 23,116,105| $ 100,000 Caricom v Ltr v 2
14 |N Ramnarine Construction $ 21,640,232 $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
15 |DelonJ Bagot Construction & Drainage S 22459,689| $ 100,000  Premier v | v | v 2
Development
16 |Money Tree Trading $ 22,729,620 No Bid Security Seen v | Rec v 2
17 |4S Security & Building Enterprise $ 26,334,536| $ 100,000 Nafico v v v 2
18 |HE & Sai Investment $ 18,658,919 $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
19 |Kingsman General Contracting Services $ 22,503,574 $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2




20 |Zane Construction $ 22.478,710| $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
21 |Kevin & Sons Construction and Maintenance $ 24,504,117 $ 100,000 Premier v Ltr v 2
22 |Birdman Construction Services $ 23,026,852 $ 100,000 Premier v Rec v 1
23 |Urban Edge Builders Inc $ 25,360,650 $ 100,000 Assuria v Rec v 1
24 |R&P Engineering and General Construction $ 22,484,574 No Bid Security Seen v | Rec v 2
25 |AVI Construction and Supply $ 23,012,787| $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
26 |Rishal's Construction & Maintenance Service $ 20,465,277| $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
27 |AE&N General Contracting $ 21,354,207 $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
28 |Dimitri Construction Services & Supplies $ 24,652,782 $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
29 |Mohamed Rafi Yusoof Construction $ 25,381,420 $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
30 |Archangel Construction $ 23,370,581| $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
31 |Pooran Building & Road Construction $ 23,441,603 $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
32 |4A Engineering Enterprise $ 25,603,169| $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
33 |Armco Construction Company $ 23,050,777| $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
34 |Angad Ganesh Building & General $  23921,623| $ 100,000  Caricom v | v X 2
Construction
35 |Ceraturium $ 24.322.688| $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
36 |Vickram's Contracting Services $ 18,100,744| $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
37 |Hema Construction $ 22.,087,102| $ 100,000 Premier v v X 2
38 [Sheriff Construction Inc $ 27,617,205| $ 100,000 Assuria v Rec v 1
39 |Enfield Contracting Company $ 23,506,703 $ 100,000 Premier v Ltr v 2
40 |Ashiek and Son Enterprise $ 25,263,856| $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 1
41 |S.J General Contracting $ 23,243,677 $ 100,000 Premier v Ltr v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 13, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Local Government & Regional Development (06/2025/13) - Construction of Lamaha-Yarrowkabra NDC Building

Bil(\llder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & lilﬂlizil:l‘gy Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS l;“(::l;ll:lleif Hard Fla.Sh
0. Currency Currency signed Copy| drive
1 |K & P Project Management Inc. $ 24,646,613 | $ 100,000 Caricom X v v 1
2 |Amin's Construction $ 23,740,911 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
3 |HKBL Construction Inc. $ 18,505,458 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 1
4 [Mohamed Rafi Yusoof Construction $ 25,471,289 $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 1
5 |STP Investments Inc. $ 26,466,746.25| $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
6 |Sheriff Construction Inc $ 27,617,205| $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 1
7 |Jop SP Construction Services Inc. $ 25,557,414 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
8 |Onyx Engineering Inc. $ 42,377,380 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
9 |SC Construction & Landscaping Services $ 32,932,568 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
10 |R&P Engineering and General Construction $ 22,747,074 | $ 100,000 Assuria v Rec v 2
11 |Blue Print Builders Inc. $ 26,772,375 | $ 100,000 Assuria v Rec v 1
12 |Urban Edge Builders Inc $ 25,360,650 | $ 100,000 Assuria v Rec v 1
13 |D. David International $ 29,417,040 | $ 620,000 Caricom v v v 2
14 [Skyline Construction $ 22,779,614 | $ 100,000 Nafico v v v 1
15 [Money Tree Trading $ 21,932,617 No Bid Security Seen v Rec v 2
16 |L.S Contracting Services $ 22,131,138 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2

Form of Tender Page
17 |[S.A General Services Not Completed & | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
Signed
18 |[Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 25,352,366 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2




19 |FS Construction $ 24,704,612 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
20 |Security Plus $ 25,022,401 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 1
21 |Ceraturium $ 24,322,688 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 1
22 |Mobile Express $ 24345279 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
23 |Pacific Service System $ 21,259,872 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v X
24 |A. Alli Constructin $ 23,380,404 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
25 |4 A Engineering Enterprise $ 23,814,179 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 1
26 |Global Builders Engineering Incorporated $ 21,091,225 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
27 E fc S Civil Engineering Contracting Services 3 23.878.975 | § 100,000 Caricom Y Y Y )
28 |Applied Services $ 25,555414 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 1
29 |4 S Security and Building Enterprise $ 26,334,536 | $ 100,000 Nafico v v v 2
30 Sovereignty Investments Construction Services 3 30,141,081.60 | $ 100,000 Assuria J J J )

(SICS Builders)




Date of Tender Opening: March 13, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Local Government & Regional Development (07/2025/13) - Construction of Port Mourant-John NDC Building

Bid Security

Form of

Hard

Bl;g.er Name of Bidder Bldcﬁl{l:::::; & Amount & Blizee:lcl;ty GRA | NIS T.ender ljll;il;
Currency signed | Copy
1 |Kevin & Sons Construction & Maintenance $ 24233217 $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
2 |Puran Building & Road Construction $ 23,410,102 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
3 |Archangle Construction Firm $ 23,695,080 | $ 100,000 Premier v v - 2
4 [Shiek & Son Enterprise $ 23,510,366.25| $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
5 | Avi Construction & Supply $ 22942853 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
6 Delron J bagot Construction & Drainage & 3 22,818,579 | $ 100,000 Premier v x v )
Development
7 |Money Tree Trading $ 22,000,320 | $ 100,000 Premier v X v 2
8 |4S Security & Building Enterprise $ 26,334,536 | $ 100,000 Nafico v v v 2
9 |K. Mahabir Construction Firm $ 23,131,853 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 1
10 |ICON Construction & Maintenance Service $ 23,011,105 $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
11 |Zane Construction $ 25,544,084 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
12 |Rishal's Construction & Maintenance Service $ 18,665,560 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
13 |S.J General Contracting $ 23,434,878 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
14 |Hema Construction $ 23,761,053 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
15 |HE & SAI Investment $ 19,267,458 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
16 |A&C Construction & Service $ 32,869,568 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
17 |M. Rashdhari Enterprise $ 30,984,023.18 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
18 |Kingsman General Contracting Services $ 22487677 $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
19 | SC Construction & Landscaping Services $ 32,869,568 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
20 |AE&N General Contracting $ 19,019,143 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v - 2




21 |[iLyas' Legacy Farms $ 23,506,703 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
22 |C. Sohan Construction Services $ 23,905,996 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
23 |Dimitri Construction Services & Supplies $ 24,652,782 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
24 |Ceraturium $ 24,322,688 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
25 |HKBL Construction Inc. $ 19,557,558 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
26 |Armco Construction Company $ 21,948,550 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
27 |Sheriff Construction Inc. $ 27,617,205 | $ 100,000 Assuria v Rec v 2
28 |Urban Edge Builders $ 25,360,650 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
29 |Angad Ganesh Building & General Construction| $ 23,921,623 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
30 |Kumar & Daughters Construction Services $ 22,236,660 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
31 |Mohamed Rafi Yusoof Construction $ 25,381,420 $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
32 |Vickram's Contracting Services $ 18,085,120 $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
33 |M and B Contracting Services $ 21,115,284| $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
34 |A&C Construction and Service $ 32,869,568| $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
35 |Blue Print Builders Inc. $ 26,772,375 $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 1
36 |S.Hussain Ideal Engineering Solutions $ 22.028,827| $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
37 |Birdman Construction Services $ 23,051,002 $ 100,000 Premier v v v 3
38 [Ramesh Persaud & Son General Construction $ 17,934,420 $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
39 S.Hussain Building & Civil Engineering $ 23.246.304 No Bid Security Seen v v v )
Consultant
40 |Sysplex $ 30,045,246| $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
41 |RDSM Enterprise $ 18,935,679 $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
42 |A.Alli Construction $ 23,380,404 $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
43 |Gregory Business Enterprise $ 27,069,143| $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 13, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Local Government & Regional Development (08/2025/13) - Construction of Mahaicony-Abary NDC Building

Bil(\llder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & lilﬂlizil:l‘gy Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS l;“(::l;ll:lleif Hard Fla.Sh
0. Currency Currency signed Copy| drive
1 |SC Construction & Landscaping Services $ 32,880,068| $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
2 |Anviah's General Construction $ 25,693,616| $ 100,000 Caricom X v v 2
3 |D.David International $ 29,079,350 $ 620,000 Caricom v v v 2
4 |A&C Construction and Service $ 32,869,568| $ 620,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |RHR Enterprise $ 21,450,883 $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
6 |G'No Urban Designs & Engineering Services $ 22,652,789 $ 100,000 Nafico v v v 2
7 |Innovate Company $ 18,004,471 $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
8 [NV Engineering $ 18,043,553| $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
9 |4A Engineering Enterprise Inc $ 23,814,179 $ 100,000 Premier v Rec v 1
1o [RW Electrical Company and Building $ 35,805,599| $ 100,000 HandinHand | « | V v 1

Contractors
11 |Urban Edge Builders Inc $ 25,360,650 $ 100,000 Assuria v Rec v 2
12 |Blue Print Builders Inc $ 26,772,375| $ 100,000 Assuria v Rec v 2
13 |WestBrook Caribbean Inc $ 27,958,300 $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
14 |Randolph Taylor Construction $ 22,373,769| $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
15 |Pivot Construction and General Services $ 25,449,012 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
16 |K&S Civil Engineering Contracting Services Inc | $ 23,905,225| $ 1,000,000 Caricom v v v 2
17 |Sheriff Construction Inc $ 27,617,205| $ 100,000 Assuria v Rec v 1
18 ]S)ee:\tilzlgs General Construction and Maintenance S 23.199.355| $ 100,000 Premier Y v Y )




Form of Tender

19 |SA General Services Page Not Completed | $ 100,000 Premier v v X 2
& Signed
20 |DBL Group Inc $ 21,428,563 $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
21 |Metal & Fabrication Ink $ 22,777,777 $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
22 |M Mohamed Logistics & Construction Services | $ 30,312,023 $ 100,000 Assuria v Ltr v 2
23 |SICS Builders $ 31,191,081.60| $ 100,000 Assuria v Rec v 1
24 [Nicozy General Construction $ 32,869,056| $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 1
25 Four. Brothers Trucking & General Construction 3 41,060.221| $ 100,000 Nafico v v v )
Services
26 |DS Construction Services and Supplies $ 17,724,346| $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
27 |Ceraturium $ 24,322,688 $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 1
28 |BM Property Investments Inc $ 37,354,800 $ 100,000 Caricom v Ltr v 2
29 |Ramesh Persaud & Son General Construction $ 18,520,226| $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
30 |FS Construction $ 24,704,612 $ 100,000 Caricom v Ltr v 2
31 [Angad Ganesh Building & General Construction | $ 23,527,747 $ 100,000 Caricom v X v 2
32 |HKBL Construction Inc $ 20,025,090 $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
33 |Money Tree Trading $ 22,712,420| $ 100,000| No Bid Security v Rec v 2
34 |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 24,774,866| $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
35 |Dimitri Construction Services & Supplies $ 24,717,005| $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
36 |Mohamed Rafi Yusoof Construction $ 25,471,289| $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
37 |Deluxe Contracting and Supplies $ 29,428,300 $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
38 |JOP SP Construction Services Inc $ 28,323,944| $ 100,000 Premier v Rec v 2




39 |[4S Security & Building Enterprise $ 26,334,536 $ 100,000 Nafico v v v 2
40 |LS Contracting Services $ 23,818,698| $ 100,000 Caricom v Ltr v 2
41 |A Alli Construction $ 23,380,404 $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
42 |Global Builders Engineering Incorporated $ 24,008,895| $ 1,000,000 Caricom v Ltr v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 13, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Local Government & Regional Development (09/2025/13) - Construction of Maida-Tarlogie NDC Building

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & ]ilr(:lssflltnzy Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS I”Tl"oel;llge(;f Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency ) Copy | drive
Currency signed
1 |Vickram's Contracting Services $ 18,032,620| $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
2 |Armco Construction Company $ 21,948,592| $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
3 |4A Engineering Enterprise Inc $ 25,603,169| $ 100,000 Premier v v v 1
4 |M.K Contracting Enterprise $ 34,430,844 $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |Gregory Business Enterprise $ 26,019,143| $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
6 |O&R Singh Contractor & Trucking Service $ 23,578,103| $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
7 |AVI Construction & Supply $ 22,942,853 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
8 |Rishal's Construction & Maintenance Service $ 20,353,515 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
9 |S.J General Contracting $ 23,119,778 | $ 100,000 Premier v Ltr v 2
10 |He & Sai Investment $ 21,070,707 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
11 |AE&N General Contracting $ 18,494,095 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
12 |Money Tree Trading $ 21,335,520 | $ 100,000 Premier v Rec v 2
13 |Zane Construction $ 22,504,926 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
14 |Kumar & Daughters Construction Services $ 22,153,095 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
15 |Ashiek & Son Enterprise $ 26,074,004.25 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
16 Delon J. Bagot Construction & Drainage $ 22,029,507 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v )
Development
17 |L&C Contracting Services $ 24.348,060.45 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
18 |Blue Print Builders Inc $ 26,772,375 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 1
19 |Urban Edge Builders Inc $ 25,360,650 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 1
20 |A&L-I Construction Company $ 23,189,078 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
21 |[Sheriff Construction Inc $ 27,604,448 | $ 100,000 Assuria v Rec v 1
22 |Ceraturium $ 24,322,688 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
23 | C. Sohan Construction Services $ 23,905,996 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
24 |Mohamed Rafi Yoosuf Construction $ 25,395,563 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
25 |4S Security & Building Enterprise $ 26,345,362 | $ 100,000 Nafico v v v 2
26 |Kevin & Sons Construction & Maintenance $ 25,156,165 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2




27 |Kingsman General Contracting Services $ 22,498,702 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
28 |RDSM Enterprise $ 18,200,133 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
29 |Icon Construction & Maintenance Service $ 22,948,103 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
30 |Birdman Construction Services $ 23,085,653 | $ 100,000 Premier v Rec v 2
31 |HKBL Construction $ 21,365,085 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 13, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Local Government & Regional Development (10/2025/13) - Construction of Stewartville-Corneila Ida NDC Building

. . Bid Security Form of
B1§der Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.sh
0. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |A.M.LC General Contracting Services $ 23,272,074 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
2 |Jop SP Construction Services Inc. $ 28,323,944 $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
3 |DR Engineering $ 21,052,295( $ 100,000 Nafico v v v 2
4 Dlglta} Design Construction,Logistics and $ 24.695.430| $ 100,000 Caricom Y Y Y )
Supplies
5 |WestBrook Caribbean Inc. $ 27,958,300| $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
6 |SC Construction & LandScaping Services $ 32,869,568| $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
7 |Urban Edge Builders Inc. $ 25,360,650| $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 1
8 |Sheriff Construction Inc. $ 27,617,205| $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 1
Form of Tender
A tructi P t .
9 SupeT dvance Construction & Procuremen Page Not Completed | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
Services )
& Signed
10 |L.S Contracting Services $ 23,818,698 $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
11 |FS Construction $ 24,704,612 $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
12 [Onyx Engineering Inc. $ 42,377,380 $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
3 J PM.s General Construction and Engineering 3 25.047.933 100,000 Caricom Y Y Y )
Services
14 |HAE Services Inc. $ 23,466,634 $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
15 |HKBL Construction Inc. $ 18,934,791| $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
16 | Mohamed Rafi Yusoof Construction $ 25,603,169 $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
17 |A&C Construction And Service $ 32,869,568| $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2




18 |Money Tree Trading $ 30,239,737 $ 100,000 NBS v v v 2
19 | B.M. Property Investments Inc. $ 35,044,800 $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
20 |Pacific Service System $ 22,907,511 $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 0
21 |Blue Print Builders Inc. $ 26,772,375| $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 1
22 |Ceraturium $ 24,322,688 $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 1
23 Four. Brothers Trucking & General Construction 3 41,060.221| 100,000 Nafico Y Y Y )
Services
24 |Deluxe Contracting and Supplies $ 29,428,300 $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
25 |Igbal Ally Contracting Service $ 29,625,638 $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
26 Soverelgnjcy Investments Construction Services 3 30,141,081| 100,000 Caricom Y Y Y )
(SICS Builders)
Form of Tender
27 |S.A General Services Page Not Completed | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
& Signed
28 |Pivot Construction and General Services $ 24,730,371 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
29 |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 24,459,866 $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 13, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Local Government & Regional Development (11/2025/13) - Construction of Hamlet-Chance NDC Building

Form of

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency | D19 SCCUrity Amount | po o curity Agency | GRA | NIS | Tender |12rd | Flash
No. & Currency signed Copy | drive
1 |Destiny General Construction and Maintenance $ 23,199,355| $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
2 |Sheriff Construction Inc $ 27,617,205 | $ 100,000 Assuria v X v 1
3 [DBL Group Inc $ 21,439,063| $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
4 |Anviah's General Construction $ 25,603,169 $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |Blue Print Builders Inc $ 26,772,375| $ 100,000 Assuria v X v 1
6 |Nicozy General Construction $ 31,657,416| $ 633,148 Caricom v v v 1
7 |RHR Enterprise $ 21,072,882| $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
8 |Global Builders Engineering Inc $ 23,903,895 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
9 |K&S Civil Engineering Contracting Services Inc $ 23,905,225| $ 1,000,000 Caricom v v v 2
10 Delon J Bagot Construction and drainage $ 25.231.854| $ 100,000 Premier v v v >
Development
11 |Money Tree Trading $ 22,328,801 No Bid Security Seen v X v 2
12 |[B&P Rise Again Enterprise $ 17,606,274| $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
13 |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 24,774,866 $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
14 |Innovate Company $ 18,004,471| $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
15 |AC Construction and Service $ 32,869,568 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
16 |Ceraturium $ 24,322,688 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
17 |4S Security and Building Enterprise $ 26,334,536 | $ 100,000 Nafico v v v 2
Form of Tender Page
18 |SA General Services Not Completed & | $ 100,000 Premier v v X 2
Signed
19 |HKBL Construction Inc $ 22,898,820 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
20 |SC Construction & Landscaping Services $ 32,974,568 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
21 |Urban Edge Builders Inc $ 25,360,650 | $ 100,000 Assuria v X v 2
22 |DS Construction Services and Supplies $ 17,724,346 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 13, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Local Government & Regional Development (12/2025/13) - Construction of Macedonia-Joppa NDC Building

Bid Security

Form of

Hard

Bl;g.er Name of Bidder Bldcﬁl{l:::::; & Amount & Blizee:lcl;ty GRA | NIS T.ender ljll;il;
Currency signed | Copy
1 |Green Acres Organic Farm $ 23,189,078 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
2 |4S Security & Building Enterprise $ 26,334,536 | $ 100,000 Nafico v v v 2
3 [C. Sohan Construction Services $ 23,905,996 | $ 100,000 Premier v v - 2
4 |Kingsman General Contracting Services $ 22,502,840 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
5 |S.J General Contracting $ 22,873,553 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
6 |Money Tree Trading $ 21,594,108 | $ 100,000 Premier v X v 2
7 |Gregory Business Enteprise $ 27,069,143 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 1
8 [Mohamed Rafi Yusoof $ 26,461,580 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
9 |[Kevin & Sons Construction & Maintenace $ 25272,602 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 1
10 |HKBL Construction Inc. $ 23,850,397 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
11 |RDSM Enterprise $ 18,389,133 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
12 Delron J bagot Construction & Drainage & g 22,030,483 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v )
Development
13 |4A Engineering Enterprise $ 26,443,169 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
14 |ICON Construction & Maintenance Service $ 22.938,548 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
15 Dest_iny Genreal Construction & Maintenance g 23.250,070 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v )
Services
16 |AE&N General Contracting $ 18,706,233 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
17 |Blue Print Builders Inc $ 26,772,375 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
18 |L&C Contracting Services $ 24,348,060 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
19 | B& R Enterprise $ 26,397,563 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
20 |Ceraturim $ 24322688 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v 2




21 |Uraban Edge Builders Inc. $ 25,360,650 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
22 |Kumar & Daughters Construction Services $ 22.241,042 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
23 |HE & SAI Investment $ 18,796,743 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
24 |ZANE Construction $ 22,504,603 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
25 |Rishal's Construction & Maintenance Service $ 19,613,958 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
26 |Ashiek & Son Enteprise $ 25,263,855.75 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
27 |O&R Singh Contractor & Trucking Service $ 22,564,853 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
28 |Armco Construction Company $ 21,933,220 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
29 (Sherrif Construction Inc. $ 27,617,205 | $ 100,000 Assuria v Rec v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 13, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Local Government & Regional Development (13/2025/13) - Construction of Better Hope-LBI Building

Bid Security

Form of

Bigdo?r Name of Bidder Bi%ﬁ:z::; & ACmount & Bid Security Agency| GRA NIS Te.:nder I({:?);(; l;lfiil;
urrency signed
1 |Mobile Express $ 24,345,279 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
2 |Kaiveri Procurement Logistics & Investment Inc | $ 31,960,877| $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
3 |4S Security & Building Enterprise $ 26,334,536 $ 100,000 Nafico v v v 2
4  |Dimitri Construction Services & Supplies $ 24,652,782| $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 [Novar Industries $ 34,204,800 $ 100,000 Nafico v v v 2
6 |STP Investments Inc $ 26,571,746.25| $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
7 |Ramesh Persaud & Son General Construction $ 17,227,035 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
8 |Delph Construction Inc $ 26,852,495 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
9 |R.W Electrical Co. & Building Contractors $ 30,880,584 | $ 100,000| Hand in Hand v v v 1
19 |M-Mohameds Logistics & Construction $ 32,145271 | S 100,000  Assuria v | Lir v 2
Services
11 |SC Construction & Landscaping Services $ 32,969,568 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
12 |Deluxe Contracting & Supplies $ 29,428,300 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
13 |Mohamed Rafi Yoosuf Construction $ 25,603,169 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
14 |Blue Print Builders Inc $ 26,772,375 | $ 100,000 Assuria v Rec v 2
15 |A&C Construction & Service $ 32,869,565 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
16 |Security Plus $ 27,543,458 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
17 SoverelgnFy Investments Construction Services $ 30,141,081.60 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 1
(SICS Builders)
18 |Onyx Engineering Inc $ 42,377,380 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2




Form of Tender
19 |Ceraturium Page Not Completed | $ 100,000 Caricom v v X 2
& Signed
20 Dest}ny General Construction & Maintenance $ 23.199.355 | $ 100,000 Premier v Lir v )
Services
21 |Westbrook Caribbean Inc $ 27,958,300 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
22 |R. Persid Construction $ 22,432,074 100,000 Nafico v v v 2
23 |Amin's Construction $ 23,740,911 No Bid Security Seen v v v 0
24 |D. David International $ 27,984,125 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
25 |New Castle Enterprise $ 27,529,099.50 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
26 |Four Brothers Trucking & General Construction | $ 41,060,221 | $ 100,000 Nafico v v v 2
27 |Urban Edge Builders Inc $ 25,360,650 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 1
28 |Metal & Fabrication Ink $ 22,777,777 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
29 |K. Primo General Building & Contracting Works| $ 28,701,924 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
30 |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 24,774,866 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
31 |Sheriff Construction Inc. $ 27,617,205 | $ 100,000 Assuria v Rec v 1
32 |R&P Engineering & General Construction $ 22,222,074 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
33 |BM Property Investments Inc. $ 34,519,800 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
34 |HKBL Construction Inc. $ 18,801,527 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
35 |Randolph Taylor Construction $ 22,373,769 | $ 100,000| Premier Ins. v v v 2
Form of Tender
36 |S.A General Services Page Not Completed | $ 100,000/  Premier Ins. v v X 2
& Signed
37 |Money Tree Trading $ 20,838,001 No Bid Security Seen v Rec v 2
38 |JJ Construction & General Services $ 28,666,024 | $ 100,000| Premier Ins. v v v 2




39 |Alli Construction $ 23,380,404 | $ 100,000  Premier Ins. v v v 2
40 |K&S Civil Engineering Contracting Services Inc.| $ 23,878975 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
41 |Global Builders Engineering Inc. $ 23,865,225 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
42 |Applied Services $ 27,987,083 | $ 100,000| Premier Ins. v v v 2
43 |Singh's Brother Contracting Services $ 23,904,856 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
44 |JOP SP Construction Services Inc. $ 27,795,458 | $ 100,000| Premier Ins. v v v 2
45 |LS Contracting Services $ 24,407,498 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
46 |Pivot Construction & General Services $ 24,508,571 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
47 |SAAM General Contracting $ 23,587,830 | $ 100,000| Premier Ins. v v v 2
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