Date of Tender Opening: March 19, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Public Works (23/2025/31) - Construction of Parika to Goshen Road Link Project, Region 3 Lots 3-13

. . Bid Securi . . Form of |Hard
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount &ty Bid Security GRA | NIS | Tender Fla.sh
No. Currency Agency ) drive
Currency signed | Copy
1 |Triple A General Contracting Services L3 $ 334,475,820 v v v 2
1 |[Triple A General Contracting Services L4 $ 330,318,660
1 |Triple A General Contracting Services L5 $ 154,834,680
1 |Triple A General Contracting Services L9 $ 334,475,820 No Bid Security Seen
1 |Triple A General Contracting Services L10 $ 314,472,480
1 |[Triple A General Contracting Services L12 $ 318,972,360
1 |Triple A General Contracting Services L13 $ 37,706,550
2 |BK International Inc L3 $ 425,721,500 | $ 5,725,000 Caricom v v v 2
2 |BK International Inc L4 $ 353,171,290 | $ 5,651,000
2 |BK International Inc L5 $ 166,585,178 | $ 2,694,000
2 |BK International Inc L6 $ 1,068,158,127 | $ 17,749,000
2 |BK International Inc L7 $ 1,113,551,174 | $ 18,323,000
2 |BK International Inc L8 $ 625,419,538 | $ 10,204,000
2 |BK International Inc L9 $ 363,202,664 | $ 5,725,000
2 |BK International Inc L10 $ 359,852,812 | $ 5,328,000
2 |BK International Inc L11 $ 633,869,738 | $ 10,204,000
2 |BK International Inc L12 $ 369,810,682 | $ 5,389,000
3  |Powerchina International Group Limited L3 $ 313,123,133 Assuria v v v 2
3 [Powerchina International Group Limited L4 $ 298,807,682
3 [Powerchina International Group Limited L5 $ 156,612,853
3 [Powerchina International Group Limited L6 $ 1,498,288,102
3 [Powerchina International Group Limited L7 $ 1,531,630,667




3 [Powerchina International Group Limited L8 $ 553,002,056
3 [Powerchina International Group Limited L9 $ 302,706,140
3 [Powerchina International Group Limited L10 $ 300,861,768
3 [Powerchina International Group Limited 11 $ 548,054,737
3 [Powerchina International Group Limited 12 $ 296,307,183
3 [Powerchina International Group Limited L13 $ 48,809,321
4 |AR Total Logistics Solutions Inc L3 $ 357,876,060 Caricom
4 |AR Total Logistics Solutions Inc L4 $ 351,126,500
4 |AR Total Logistics Solutions Inc L5 $ 155,459,348
4 |AR Total Logistics Solutions Inc .9 $ 344,863,500
4 |AR Total Logistics Solutions Inc L10 $ 333,799,160
4 |AR Total Logistics Solutions Inc L11 $ 672,948,280
4 | AR Total Logistics Solutions Inc .12 $ 313,062,280
4 |AR Total Logistics Solutions Inc L13 $ 38,709,426
5 |Cedar Engineering L3 $ 380,220,400 Caricom
5 |Cedar Engineering L4 $ 375,939,930
5 |Cedar Engineering L5 $ 179,489,735
5 |Cedar Engineering L6 $ 1,179,582,053
5 |Cedar Engineering L7 $ 1,218,892,716
5 |Cedar Engineering L8 $ 679,030,260
5 |Cedar Engineering L9 $ 380,116,400
5 |Cedar Engineering L10 $ 353,610,710
5 |Cedar Engineering L11 $ 677,677,360
5 |Cedar Engineering L12 $ 356,535,850
5 |Cedar Engineering 13 $ 42,691,958
6 |A&S General Contractors Inc L6 $ 1,143,286,935 Assuria




6 |A&S General Contractors Inc L7 $ 1,161,191,461

7 |Morris Jeffrey Enterprise L3 $ 377,490,400 Caricom

7  |Morris Jeffrey Enterprise 14 $ 373,209,930

7  |Morris Jeffrey Enterprise L5 $ 178,437,735

7  |Morris Jeffrey Enterprise L6 $ 1,177,377,053

7 |Morris Jeffrey Enterprise L7 $ 1,215,637,716

7  |Morris Jeffrey Enterprise L8 $ 676,300,260

7  |Morris Jeffrey Enterprise L9 $ 377,281,400

7  |Morris Jeffrey Enterprise L10 $ 350,880,710

7  |Morris Jeffrey Enterprise L11 $ 674,947,360

7  |Morris Jeffrey Enterprise L12 $ 353,805,850

7  |Morris Jeffrey Enterprise L13 $ 41,326,950

8 J.S.B Investments Inc and AME Development S 376,428.800 Caricom
Inc L3

8 J.S.B Investments Inc and AME Development $ 360,543,750
Inc L4

8 J.S.B Investments Inc and AME Development $ 172.875.948
Inc L5

8 J.S.B Investments Inc and AME Development S 1,168.580.786
Inc L6

8 J.S.B Investments and AME Development Inc S 1.211,110.840
Inc L7

8 J.S.B Investments and AME Development Inc $ 673.973.000
Inc L8

8 J.S.B Investments and AME Development Inc $ 374,035.810

Inc L9




J.S.B Investments and AME Development Inc

g o 348,802,550

g J.S.B Investments and AME Development Inc 672,675,550
IncL11

g J.S.B Investments and AME Development Inc 353,346,850
IncL12

g J.S.B Investments and AME Development Inc 39,935,228
Inc L13

9 Eagle Transportation & General Construction 406,487,020 Caricom
Inc L3

9 Eagle Transportation & General Construction 1.251,654,435
Inc L6

9 Eagle Transportation & General Construction 1.266,185,056
Inc L7

10 Impeccable Construction & General Supplies 341,437,400 Caricom
Inc L3

10 Impeccable Construction & General Supplies 334.433.200
Inc L4

10 Impeccable Construction & General Supplies 147,427,980
Inc L5

10 Impeccable Construction & General Supplies 1,143,666.,586
Inc L6

10 Impeccable Construction & General Supplies 1,180,881,548
Inc L7

10 Impeccable Construction & General Supplies 626,861,300

Inc L8




Impeccable Construction & General Supplies

10 Inc L9 $ 330,999,400
10 Impeccable Construction & General Supplies 3 307.992.600
Inc L10
10 Impeccable Construction & General Supplies 3 583,152,100
IncL11
10 Impeccable Construction & General Supplies 3 308.947.400
Inc L12
10 Impeccable Construction & General Supplies 3 37.213.050
Inc L13
11 |[Boyscott.Co L4 $ 360,627,800 Caricom
11 |Boyscott.Co L5 $ 2,966,645,955
11 |Boyscott.Co L9 $ 359,146,300
11 |Boyscott.Co L10 $ 347,004,500
11 |Boyscott.Co L.13 $ 104,765,850
12 |Gurdev Mahadeo Contracting Services L6 $ 162,253,295 Assuria
12 |Gurdev Mahadeo Contracting Services L7 $ 1,199,417,671
Technocon Investments, Procurement & )
13 General Contracting Solution L6 5 997,722,264 Assuria
Technocon Investments, Procurement &
13 General Contracting Solution L7 5 1040,659,318
14 |Femininity Contracting L3 $ 346,192,200 Caricom
14 |Femininity Contracting L4 $ 349,152,200
14 |Femininity Contracting L5 $ 155,792,912
14 |Femininity Contracting L9 $ 346,197,200




14 |Femininity Contracting L10 $ 320,762,360
14 |Femininity Contracting L11 $ 675,402,940
14 |Femininity Contracting L12 $ 323,587,440
14 |Femininity Contracting L13 $ 38,962,256
15 Best Builders Engineering and General S 1,159.103.295 Assuria
Supplies L 6
15 Best Builders Engineering and General S 1,196267.671
Supplies L 7
16 |Puran Bros. Disposal Inc L3 $ 380,227,450 Premier
16 |Puran Bros. Disposal Inc L4 $ 375,945,100
16 |Puran Bros. Disposal Inc L5 $ 177,255,015
16 |Puran Bros. Disposal Inc L6 $ 1,116,398,757
16 |Puran Bros. Disposal Inc L7 $ 1,152,169,463
16 |Puran Bros. Disposal Inc L8 $ 677,225,150
16 |Puran Bros. Disposal Inc L9 $ 375,360,950
16 |Puran Bros. Disposal Inc L10 $ 359,809,550
16 |Puran Bros. Disposal Inc L11 $ 676,495,150
16 |Puran Bros. Disposal Inc L12 $ 355,555,550
17 |lvor Allen L3 $ 379,026,200 Assuria
17 |Ivor Allen L4 $ 373,971,300
17 |Ivor Allen L6 $ 1,178,798,848
17 |Ivor Allen L7 $ 1,217,196,594
17 |Ivor Allen L8 $ 678,616,400
17 |Ivor Allen L9 $ 379,026,200
17 |Ivor Allen L10 $ 357,468,300
17 |Ivor Allen L11 $ 678,091,400




17 |Ivor Allen L12 $ 357,497,500

18 [AM Concepts Inc L3 $ 286,283,500 Caricom v
18 |[AM Concepts Inc L4 $ 273,086,100

18 |AM Concepts Inc L9 $ 286,283,500

18 |AM Concepts Inc L10 $ 237,637,500

19 |AAQIB Consultancy L3 $ 361,036,400 Caricom v
19 |AAQIB Consultancy L4 $ 350,782,300

19 |AAQIB Consultancy L5 $ 156,385,290

19 |AAQIB Consultancy L9 $ 346,792,550

19 |AAQIB Consultancy L10 $ 321,150,980

19 |AAQIB Consultancy L11 $ 674,210,770

19 |AAQIB Consultancy L12 $ 328,535,520

19 |AAQIB Consultancy L13 $ 39,088,670

20 |Khan's Enterprise L6 $ 1,169,512,679 Assuria v
20 |Khan's Enterprise L7 $ 1,207,421,388

21 (Blue Print Builders Inc L3 $ 330,208,200 Assuria Rec
21 |Blue Print Builders Inc L4 $ 327,259,640

21 |Blue Print Builders Inc L5 $ 128,295,615

21 |Blue Print Builders Inc L6 $ 1,044,914,194

21 |Blue Print Builders Inc L7 $ 1,082,426,797

21 |Blue Print Builders Inc L8 $ 595,530,180

21 |Blue Print Builders Inc L9 $ 333,972,000

21 |Blue Print Builders Inc L10 $ 312,244,580

21 |Blue Print Builders Inc L11 $ 591,531,959

21 (Blue Print Builders Inc L12 $ 315,394,800




21 (Blue Print Builders Inc L13 $ 34,446,038

22 |AJM Enterprise L 3 $ 381,453,500 Premier

22 |AJM Enterprise L 4 $ 376,320,400

22 |AJM Enterprise L 5 $ 178,784,025

22 |AJM Enterprise L 6 $ 1,143,923,613

22 |AJM Enterprise L 7 $ 1,199,121,282

22 |AJM Enterprise L 8 $ 678,062,100

22 |AJM Enterprise L 9 $ 380,340,500

22 |AJM Enterprise L 10 $ 354,296,800

22 |AJM Enterprise L 11 $ 679,109,100

22 |AJM Enterprise L 12 $ 358,901,000

22 |AJM Enterprise L 13 $ 42.249.375

23 Yuna_ls Civil and Building Construction S 359,015,000 Caricom
Services L3

23 Yuna_ls Civil and Building Construction $ 369,753,000
Services L4

23 Yuna_ls Civil and Building Construction $ 175.882.770
Services L5

23 Yuna_ls Civil and Building Construction S 1.128,748.867
Services L6

23 Yuna_ls Civil and Building Construction S 1,173.884.651
Services L7

23 Yuna_ls Civil and Building Construction $ 644,945,000
Services L8

23 Yunas Civil and Building Construction $ 365,836,000

Services L9




Yunas Civil and Building Construction

23 Services L10 $ 342,564,600
23 Yuna_ls Civil and Building Construction S 647.886,000

Services L11
23 Yuna_ls Civil and Building Construction S 347,632,000

Services L12
23 Yuna_ls Civil and Building Construction S 47.704.650

Services L13
24 Satar Mohamed _& Son Construction & S 1.166,847.875 Assuria

Hardware Supplies L6

Satar Mohamed & Son Construction &
24 Hardware Supplies L7 5 1204,012,036

Premier
25 |J. Hussain's Construction & Supplies L3 $ 376,538,380
25 |J. Hussain's Construction & Supplies L5 $ 162,199,223
25 |J. Hussain's Construction & Supplies L6 $ 1,152,454,459
25 |J. Hussain's Construction & Supplies L7 $ 1,155,602,471
25 |J. Hussain's Construction & Supplies L13 $ 37,373,648
FTP not
26 |Esther Maintenance and Cleaning Services completed nor No Bid Security Seen
signed

27 |Adamantium Holdings L6 $ 1,181,204,100 Premier
27 |Adamantium Holdings L7 $ 1,220,851,362
28 |K. Whyte Construction L3 $ 348,325,400 Assuria
28 |K. Whyte Construction L4 $ 341,797,700




28 |K. Whyte Construction L5 $ 168,989,394
28 |K. Whyte Construction L6 $ 1,148,326,633
28 |K. Whyte Construction L7 $ 1,117,664,196
28 |K. Whyte Construction L8 $ 606,764,850
28 |K. Whyte Construction L9 $ 353,312,400
28 |K. Whyte Construction L10 $ 374,576,300
28 |K. Whyte Construction L11 $ 608,326,150
28 |K. Whyte Construction [.12 $ 338,914,300
28 |K. Whyte Construction L13 $ 38,541,458
29 |Total Construction Inc L3 $ 377,032,950 Premier
29 |Total Construction Inc L4 $ 367,511,335
29 ([Total Construction Inc L5 $ 142,028,229
29 |Total Construction Inc L6 $ 1,174,873,830
29 |Total Construction Inc L7 $ 1,213,192,079
29 |Total Construction Inc L8 $ 676,452,510
29 |Total Construction Inc L9 $ 377,032,950
29 |Total Construction Inc L10 $ 346,431,895
29 |Total Construction Inc L11 $ 676,391,090
29 |Total Construction Inc L12 $ 354,148,125
29 |Total Construction Inc L13 $ 35,938,088
30 Surrey Paving and Aggregate Company 3 168,140,595 Assuria
(Guyana) Inc L5
30 Surrey Paving and Aggregate Company S 1303731731
(Guyana) Inc L6
30 Surrey Paving and Aggregate Company S 1.297.890.318

(Guyana) Inc L7




Surrey Paving and Aggregate Company

30 (Guyana) Inc L13 $ 43,305,675
31 |Onyx Engineering Inc L5 $ 179,269,545 Premier
31 |Onyx Engineering Inc L13 $ 43,608,600
32 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L3 $ 317,146,000 Assuria
32 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L4 $ 311,703,440
32 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L5 $ 121,141,495
32 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L6 $ 1,013,843,566
32 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L7 $ 1,053,103,371
32 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L8 $ 574,952,180
32 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L9 $ 326,040,000
32 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L10 $ 307,687,580
32 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L11 $ 575,154,059
32 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L12 $ 308,380,800
32 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L13 $ 30,212,963
33 |Archie's & Son Stone & Sand Supply L6 $ 1,146,748,254 Assuria
33 |Archie's & Son Stone & Sand Supply L7 $ 1,190,310,663
34 EECS (Empire Electrical Contracting S 1,007.465.892 Premier
Services) L6
34 EECS (Empire Electrical Contracting S 1,039.813.630
Services) L7
35 |C&L Construction Inc L6 $ 1,182,239,708 Premier
35 |C&L Construction Inc L7 $ 1,208,304,213




36 |Zoom Contracting & Transport Service L3 $ 322,067,024 Caricom
36 |Zoom Contracting & Transport Service L4 $ 318,070,624
36 |Zoom Contracting & Transport Service L5 $ 184,017,110
36 |Zoom Contracting & Transport Service L6 $ 992,224,117
36 |Zoom Contracting & Transport Service L7 $ 995,769,413
36 |Zoom Contracting & Transport Service L8 $ 592,633,714
36 |Zoom Contracting & Transport Service L9 $ 319,193,576
36 |Zoom Contracting & Transport Service L10 $ 310,615,470
36 |Zoom Contracting & Transport Service L11 $ 583,430,884
36 |Zoom Contracting & Transport Service L12 $ 314,407,579
36 |Zoom Contracting & Transport Service L13 $ 47,425,718
37 [L'Heureuse Construction and Services Inc L5 $ 171,866,100 Premier
37 [L'Heureuse Construction and Services Inc L6 $ 1,126,189,444
37 [L'Heureuse Construction and Services Inc L7 $ 1,209,927,484
38 |Chrome Construction Inc L6 $ 1,173,234,749 Premier
38 |Chrome Construction Inc L7 $ 1,219,945,327
39 |Platinum Investments Inc L3 $ 357,629,000 Premier
39 |Platinum Investments Inc L4 $ 349,734,900
39 |Platinum Investments Inc L6 $ 1,010,711,714
39 |Platinum Investments Inc L7 $ 1,106,644,624
39 |Platinum Investments Inc L8 $ 635,305,300
39 |Platinum Investments Inc L9 $ 352,953,500
39 [Platinum Investments Inc L10 $ 327,371,300




39 |Platinum Investments Inc L11 $ 630,769,510

39 |Platinum Investments Inc L12 $ 331,358,300

40 [R. Razack Business Enterprise L3 $ 373,808,850 Premier
40 |R. Razack Business Enterprise L4 $ 363,096,637

40 |R. Razack Business Enterprise L5 $ 171,956,366

40 [R. Razack Business Enterprise L6 $ 1,139,686,237

40 |R. Razack Business Enterprise L7 $ 1,176,629,936

40 |R. Razack Business Enterprise L8 $ 657,178,085

40 |R. Razack Business Enterprise L9 $ 373,808,850

40 |R. Razack Business Enterprise L10 $ 346,881,360

40 |R. Razack Business Enterprise L12 $ 341,807,860

40 |R. Razack Business Enterprise L13 $ 40,248,259

41 |I. Khan Contracting Service L13 $ 41,425,440 No Bid Security Seen
42 |Crown Road and Drainage Contractors L3 $ 364,996,350 Premier
42 |Crown Road and Drainage Contractors L4 $ 357,358,150

42 |Crown Road and Drainage Contractors L5 $ 161,915,670

42 |Crown Road and Drainage Contractors L6 $ 1,101,235,215

42 |Crown Road and Drainage Contractors L7 $ 1,135,802,385

42 |Crown Road and Drainage Contractors L8 $ 650,084,400

42 |Crown Road and Drainage Contractors 1.9 $ 366,046,350

42 |Crown Road and Drainage Contractors L10 $ 337,287,550

42 |Crown Road and Drainage Contractors L11 $ 651,575,400

42 |Crown Road and Drainage Contractors L.12 $ 339,992,950

42 |Crown Road and Drainage Contractors L.13 $ 39,596,813

43 |1.B Contracting & Machinery Rental L6 $ 1,188,754,350 Assuria




43 |I.B Contracting & Machinery Rental L7 $ 1,070,199,375
44 |International Import & Supplies L3 $ 356,220,873 Premier
44 |International Import & Supplies L4 $ 355,144,534
44 |International Import & Supplies L5 $ 158,510,895
44 |International Import & Supplies L6 $ 1,155,237,144
44 |International Import & Supplies L7 $ 1,195,829,709
44 |International Import & Supplies L8 $ 668,332,733
44 |International Import & Supplies L9 $ 351,392,447
44 |International Import & Supplies L10 $ 405,116,982
44 |International Import & Supplies .11 $ 620,478,754
44 |International Import & Supplies .12 $ 342,007,749
44 |International Import & Supplies L.13 $ 38,941,389
45 |Sawh Construction Inc L3 $ 381,191,500 Premier
45 |Sawh Construction Inc L4 $ 375,900,400
45 |Sawh Construction Inc L5 $ 178,637,025
45 |Sawh Construction Inc L6 $ 1,143,818,613
45 |Sawh Construction Inc L7 $ 1,199,016,282
45 [Sawh Construction Inc L8 $ 677,852,100
45 |Sawh Construction Inc L9 $ 380,078,500
45 |Sawh Construction Inc L10 $ 354,086,800
45 |Sawh Construction Inc L11 $ 678,584,100
45 |Sawh Construction Inc L12 $ 358,743,000
45 |Sawh Construction Inc L13 $ 42,102,375
46 |Sean's Construction Services L4 $ 375,464,300 Diamond
46 [Sean's Construction Services L5 $ 176,650,950
46 |Sean's Construction Services L6 $ 1,181,472,515




46 |[Sean's Construction Services L10 $ 353,460,900

46 |[Sean's Construction Services L13 $ 42,346,500

47 |Prime Infra Inc L6 $ 1,168,270,640 Nafico
47 |Prime Infra Inc L7 $ 1,159,956,508

48 |Naran Construction L3 $ 343,952,000 Caricom
48 |Naran Construction L4 $ 338,051,600

48 |Naran Construction L5 $ 156,248,610

48 |[Naran Construction L6 $ 1,001,729,175

48 |Naran Construction L7 $ 1,032,921,344

48 |Naran Construction L8 $ 619,777,200

48 |Naran Construction L9 $ 348,677,000

48 |[Naran Construction L10 $ 357,846,200

48 |Naran Construction L11 $ 633,673,200

48 |Naran Construction L12 $ 322.242.000

48 |Naran Construction L13 $ 386,673,600

49 |K&S General Contractors Inc L3 $ 347,024,000 Caricom
49 [K&S General Contractors Inc L4 $ 358,993,700

49 [K&S General Contractors Inc L6 $ 1,051,000,000

49 [K&S General Contractors Inc L7 $ 1,102,175,500

50 |Surujpaul Balkaran & Sons Construction L3 $ 351,198,500 Premier
50 |Surujpaul Balkaran & Sons Construction L4 $ 339,491,900

50 |Surujpaul Balkaran & Sons Construction L7 $ 1,110,186,270

50 |Surujpaul Balkaran & Sons Construction .8 $ 631,499,800

50 |Surujpaul Balkaran & Sons Construction L9 $ 344,976,400




50 |Surujpaul Balkaran & Sons Construction L.10 $ 321,666,300
50 |Surujpaul Balkaran & Sons Construction LL11 $ 621,396,510
50 |Surujpaul Balkaran & Sons Construction [.12 $ 328,087,300
51 |K&K Construction and Hardware Supplies L7 |$ 1,170,120,954 Caricom
51 |K&K Construction and Hardware Supplies L11 | $ 621,035,900
52 |Kanhai's Engineering L.6 $ 1,057,535,210 Caricom
52 |Kanhai's Engineering L8 $ 622,339,500
53 |Sheriff Construction Inc L3 $ 340,620,200 Assuria
53 |Sheriff Construction Inc L4 $ 337,806,640
53 |[Sheriff Construction Inc L5 $ 134,800,890
53 |[Sheriff Construction Inc L6 $ 1,062,563,644
53 |Sheriff Construction Inc L7 $ 1,096,740,397
53 |[Sheriff Construction Inc L8 $ 612,182,080
53 |Sheriff Construction Inc L9 $ 343,046,200
53 |Sheriff Construction Inc L10 $ 320,165,580
53 |Sheriff Construction Inc L11 $ 611,930,414
53 |Sheriff Construction Inc L12 $ 323,253,800
53 |Sheriff Construction Inc L13 $ 39,946,200
54 |A and E Construction, Supplies and Services L3| $ 381,060,400 Caricom
54 |A and E Construction, Supplies and Services L4| $ 372,264,930




54 |A and E Construction, Supplies and Services L5| $ 178,017,735
54 |A and E Construction, Supplies and Services L6| $§  1,176,432,053
54 |A and E Construction, Supplies and Services L7| $  1,215,217,716
54 |A and E Construction, Supplies and Services L8| $ 675,880,260
54 |A and E Construction, Supplies and Services L9| $ 376,966,400
54 ﬁaz)nd E Construction, Supplies and Services 3 350,460,710
54 ﬁalnd E Construction, Supplies and Services 3 674.527.360
54 ﬁa;nd E Construction, Supplies and Services 3 353.385.850
54 A and E Construction, Supplies and Services 3 41,110,950
L13
55 |R&N Construction Services L6 $ 1,073,384,930 Assuria
55 |R&N Construction Services L7 $ 1,106,644,624
56 |D&R Construction and Machinery Rental L3 $ 378,120,400 Caricom
56 |D&R Construction and Machinery Rental L4 $ 373,839,930
56 |D&R Construction and Machinery Rental L5 $ 178,962,735
56 |D&R Construction and Machinery Rental L6 $ 1,178,007,053
56 |D&R Construction and Machinery Rental L7 $ 1,216,267,716
56 |D&R Construction and Machinery Rental L8 $ 676,930,260
56 |D&R Construction and Machinery Rental L9 $ 378,616,400
56 |[D&R Construction and Machinery Rental L10 | $ 351,510,710
56 |[D&R Construction and Machinery Rental L11 | $ 675,577,360




56 |D&R Construction and Machinery Rental L12 | $ 354,435,800
56 |D&R Construction and Machinery Rental L13 | $ 41,851,950
57 |Prestige General Supplies and Contracting L3 | $ 322,228,544 Caricom
57 |Prestige General Supplies and Contracting L4 | $ 318,963,024
57 |Prestige General Supplies and Contracting L5 | $ 184,647,110
57 |Prestige General Supplies and Contracting L6 | $ 993,289,867
57 |Prestige General Supplies and Contracting L7 | $ 995,663,363
57 |Prestige General Supplies and Contracting L8 | $ 592,948,714
57 |Prestige General Supplies and Contracting L9 | $ 319,606,576
57 |Prestige General Supplies and Contracting L10 | $ 311,518,470
57 |Prestige General Supplies and Contracting L11 | $ 584,197,884
57 |Prestige General Supplies and Contracting L12 | $ 314,978,579
57 |Prestige General Supplies and Contracting L13 | $ 46,373,618




A.G Mining and Construction (Andy Gangadin)

58 L6 $ 1,055,381,669 Nafico
58 €7G Mining and Construction (Andy Gangadin) S 1,080,831.495

59 |Avinash Scrap Metal Inc L3 $ 382,988,400 Premier
59 |[Avinash Scrap Metal Inc L4 $ 379,230,200

59 |[Avinash Scrap Metal Inc L6 $ 1,179,787,538

59 |Avinash Scrap Metal Inc L7 $ 1,217,807,536

59 |Avinash Scrap Metal Inc L8 $ 673,243,400

59 |Avinash Scrap Metal Inc L9 $ 382,988,400

59 |Avinash Scrap Metal Inc L10 $ 372,485,900

59 |[Avinash Scrap Metal Inc L11 $ 673,138,400

59 |[Avinash Scrap Metal Inc L12 $ 375,122,300

60 |H. Nauth & Sons L6 $ 1,227,508,410 Premier
60 |H. Nauth & Sons L7 $ 1,265,913,366

60 |H. Nauth & Sons L8 $ 699,684,475

60 |H. Nauth & Sons L11 $ 699,621,475

61 |Gopie Investments Inc L3 $ 381,369,800 Premier
61 |Gopie Investments Inc L4 $ 374,351,500

61 |Gopie Investments Inc L5 $ 163,028,093

61 |Gopie Investments Inc L9 $ 381,369,800

61 |[Gopie Investments Inc L10 $ 368,113,400

61 |Gopie Investments Inc L11 $ 688,375,400

61 |Gopie Investments Inc L12 $ 370,494,000

61 |Gopie Investments Inc L13 $ 42,071,663




62 |Aronco Services Inc L3 $ 379,814,950 Premier
62 |Aronco Services Inc L4 $ 370,293,335
62 |Aronco Services Inc L5 $ 145,450,389
62 |Aronco Services Inc L6 $ 1,177,057,830
62 |Aronco Services Inc L7 $ 1,215,376,079
62 |Aronco Services Inc L8 $ 679,235,570
62 |Aronco Services Inc L9 $ 379,814,950
62 |Aronco Services Inc L10 $ 349,213,895
62 |Aronco Services Inc L11 $ 679,174,070
62 |Aronco Services Inc L12 $ 356,931,125
62 |Aronco Services Inc L13 $ 36,072,488
63 |Kzee Investments L6 $ 1,076,926,618 Premier
63 |Kzee Investments L7 $ 1,099,887,150
64 |Vulcan Group Inc L3 $ 481,996,580 Caricom
64 |[Vulcan Group Inc L5 $ 178,836,630
64 |[Vulcan Group Inc L6 $ 1,224217,573
64 |Vulcan Group Inc L7 $ 1,262,598,189
64 |[Vulcan Group Inc L11 $ 787,537,530
64 |[Vulcan Group Inc L13 $ 47,583,900
65 Dass & Son's Construction and Machinery S 162,194,025 Caricom
Rental L5
Dass & Son's Construction and Machinery
65 Rental L13 $ 37,264,369
66 |K.P Thomas and Sons (Contracting) Inc L3 $ 1,405,278,300 Assuria
66 |K.P Thomas and Sons (Contracting) Inc L4 $ 1,392,396,350




66 |K.P Thomas and Sons (Contracting) Inc L8 $ 2,011,183,650

66 |K.P Thomas and Sons (Contracting) Inc L9 $ 1,405,278,300

66 |K.P Thomas and Sons (Contracting) Inc L10 $ 1,385,849,400

66 |K.P Thomas and Sons (Contracting) Inc L11 $ 2,011,072,650

66 |K.P Thomas and Sons (Contracting) Inc L12 $ 1,370,514,800

67 |Toolsie Persaud Quarries L3 $ 352,639,200 Caricom
67 |Toolsie Persaud Quarries L4 $ 346,655,100

67 |Toolsie Persaud Quarries L5 $ 186,362,610

67 |Toolsie Persaud Quarries L6 $ 957,924,558

67 |Toolsie Persaud Quarries L7 $ 914,902,635

67 |Toolsie Persaud Quarries L8 $ 580,633,300

67 |Toolsie Persaud Quarries L9 $ 316,950,400

67 |Toolsie Persaud Quarries L10 $ 323,303,300

67 |Toolsie Persaud Quarries L11 $ 532,235,800

67 |Toolsie Persaud Quarries L12 $ 291,888,500

67 |Toolsie Persaud Quarries L13 $ 33,604,200

68 |Well Built Construction Service L6 $ 1,107,945,140 Nafico
68 |Well Built Construction Service L7 $ 1,159,631,008

69 [Wahid Construction L3 $ 348,599,600 Caricom
69 |Wahid Construction L4 $ 341,524,680

69 |Wahid Construction L5 $ 154,000,552

69 |Wahid Construction L9 $ 348,579,088

69 |Wahid Construction L10 $ 319,985,400




69 |Wahid Construction L11 $ 677,694,488
69 |Wahid Construction L12 $ 348,888,760
69 |Wahid Construction L13 $ 38,565,440




Date of Tender Opening: March 19, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Public Works (24/2025/31) - Construction of Parika to Bonasika Project, Region 3 Lots 1-2

. . Bid Security Form of
Bl;\lld:r Name of Bidder Bl(::ﬁ:z::; & Amount & Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS Te.:nder I({:?);(; lle:'liizl;
Currency signed

1 [Zoom Contracting & Transport Service L1A 382,210,973 | $ 7,365,000 Caricom v Ltr v 2
1 |Zoom Contracting & Transport Service L1B 383,170,095 | $ 7,365,000
1 |Zoom Contracting & Transport Service [.2 794,982,993 | $ 14,745,000
2 |Khan's Enterprise L1A 468,685,009 | $ 7,365,000 Assuria v v v 2
2 |Khan's Enterprise L1B 470,076,049 | $ 7,365,000
3 |Archie & Son Stone & Sand Supply L1A 420,346,206 | $ 7,365,000 Assuria v v v 2
3 |Archie & Son Stone & Sand Supply L1B 440,340,805 | $ 7,365,000
4 |Nabi Construction Inc L1A 556,527,788 | $ 7,365,000 Assuria v v v 2
4 [Nabi Construction Inc L2 1,253,996,650 | $ 7,365,000
5 |JK Enterprise Inc L1A 486,780,698 | $ 7,374,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |JK Enterprise Inc L1B 485,854,855 | $ 7,374,000
5 |JK Enterprise Inc .2 970,278,700 | $ 9,835,000
6 |AJM Enterprise L1A 488,964,551 | $ 7,365,000 Premier v v v 2
6 |AJM Enterprise L1B 489,137,006 | $ 7,365,000
6 |AJM Enterprise L2 983,014,550 | $ 14,745,000
7 |Kbee Enterprise Inc L1A 484,250,228 | $ 7,365,000 Caricom v v v 2




8 [Naran Construction L1A $ 413,042,903 | $ 7,365,000 Caricom v
8 [Naran Construction L1B $ 487,637,719 | $ 7,365,000
8 [Naran Construction 1.2 $ 938,130,200 | $ 14,745,000
9 [Avionics Engineering Inc L1A $ 449,896,440 | $ 7,365,000 Nafico Ltr
9 |Avionics Engineering Inc L1A $ 449,948,940 | $ 7,365,000
10 |Chrome Construction L1A $ 491,379,629 | $ 7,365,000 Premier v
10 |Chrome Construction L1B $ 491,358,629 | $ 7,365,000
11 |International Import & Supplies L1A $ 479,828,510 | $ 7,365,000 Premier v
11 |International Import & Supplies L1B $ 459,314,179 | $ 7,365,000
11 |International Import & Supplies L2 $ 484,874,685 | $ 14,745,000
12 | Aronco Services Inc L1A $ 799,137,539 | $ 7,365,000 Premier v
12 |Aronco Services Inc L1B $ 804,817,695 | $ 7,365,000
12 |Aronco Services Inc 1.2 $ 863,563,495 | $ 14,745,000
13 |durrey Paving & Aggregate Company (Guyana) | ¢ 482,757293 | $ 7,365,000 Assuria v
Inc L1A
13 Surrey Paving & Aggregate Company (Guyana) S 470,079.593 | § 7.365.000
Inc L1B
13 Surrey Paving & Aggregate Company (Guyana) S 979.041.800 | § 14,745,000
Inc L2
14 | Avinash Contracting & Scrapmetal Inc L1A $ 678,833,138 | $ 7,365,000 Premier v
14 |Avinash Contracting & Scrapmetal Inc L1A $ 678,833,138 | $ 7,365,000
14 | Avinash Contracting & Scrapmetal Inc 1.2 $ 982,334,000 | $ 14,745,000




15 |Sawh Construction Inc L1A 489,501,771 7,365,000 Premier
15 |Sawh Construction Inc L1B 490,053,945 7,365,000

15 |Sawh Construction Inc L2 983,014,550 14,745,000

16 |Triple A General Contracting Services L1A 449,030,295 7,365,000 Premier
16 |Triple A General Contracting Services L1A 449,030,295 7,365,000

17 |KGM Construction & Supply Inc L1A 693,577,763 7,365,000 Nafico
17 |KGM Construction & Supply Inc L1B 693,577,763 7,365,000

18 [Prime Infra Inc L1A 693,307,763 7,365,000 Nafico
18 [Prime Infra Inc L1B 694,995,263 7,365,000

19 |Hoosein Logistics & Supplies Inc L1A 481,093,043 7,365,000 Premier
19 |Hoosein Logistics & Supplies Inc L1B 482,817,221 7,365,000

19 |Hoosein Logistics & Supplies Inc L2 976,282,200 14,745,000

20 |LB Contracting & Machinery Rental L1A 552,900,600 7,365,000 Assuria
20 |LB Contracting & Machinery Rental L1B 420,003,150 7,365,000

21 |Guycanada Infrastructure Inc L1A 585,685,958 7,365,000 Caricom
21 |Guycanada Infrastructure Inc L1B 601,958,228 7,365,000

21 |Guycanada Infrastructure Inc L2 945,676,200 14,745,000

22 (Reliance Inc L1A 637,064,978 7,365,000 Assuria
22 (Reliance Inc L1B 637,064,978 7,365,000




23 |PowerChina International Group Limited L1A | $ 636,534,283 7,365,000 Assuria
23 |PowerChina International Group Limited L1B | § 627,125,854 7,365,000
23 |PowerChina International Group Limited [.2 $ 863,872,661 14,745,000
24 |R&M Mining Investments Project Inc L1A $ 489,575,625 7,365,000 Caricom
24 |R&M Mining Investments Project Inc L1B $ 489,575,625 7,365,000
24 |R&M Mining Investments Project Inc .2 $ 857,965,450 14,745,000
)5 E]igs Empire Electrical Contracting Services 3 431,799,270 7,365,000 Premier
25 EECS Empire Electrical Contracting Services 3 431,799,270 7,365,000
L1B
26 |[C&L Construction Inc L1A $ 491,543,535 7,365,000 Premier
26 |C&L Construction Inc L1A $ 491,543,535 7,365,000
27 ﬁzn s Construction & Transportation Service Form of Tender 7,365,000 Nafico
Khan's Construction & Transortation Servi Page Not Completed
27 an's Construction ansportation Service But Signed 7.365.000
L1B
28 |Country Side Recycling L1A $ 463,883,438 7,365,000 Assuria
28 |Country Side Recycling L1B $ 463,894,988 7,365,000
28 |Country Side Recycling 1.2 $ 978,268,650 14,745,000
29 Eagle Transportation & General Construction 3 536,645.550 7,365,000 Caricom

Inc L1A




29 Eagle Transportation & General Construction 536,645,550 | $ 7.365.000

Inc L1A
30 |Sheriff Construction Inc L1A 489,137,387 | $ 7,365,000 Assuria
30 ([Sheriff Construction Inc L1A 489,137,387 | $ 7,365,000
30 ([Sheriff Construction Inc L1A 855,406,760 | $ 14,745,000
31 |Onyx Engineering Inc L1A 696,824,205 | $ 7,365,000 Premier
31 |Onyx Engineering Inc L1A 696,824,205 | $ 7,365,000
32 |Puran Bros Disposal Inc L1A 490,801,474 | $ 7,365,000 Premier
32 |Puran Bros Disposal Inc L1B 490,801,474 | $ 7,365,000
32 |Puran Bros Disposal Inc 1.2 982,868,400 | $ 14,745,000
33 |Wahid Construction L1A 483,985,199 | $ 7,365,000 Caricom
33 |Wahid Construction L1B 484,751,699 | $ 7,365,000
33 |Wahid Construction L2 973,198,780 | $ 14,745,000
34 |Prestige General Supplies & Contracting L1A 383,575,973 | § 7,365,000 Caricom
34 |Prestige General Supplies & Contracting L1B 383,868,345 | $ 7,365,000
34 |Prestige General Supplies & Contracting 1.2 795,717,993 | $ 14,745,000
35 |T.Gaynauth & Sons Contracting Services L1A 482,269,935
35 |T.Gaynauth & Sons Contracting Services L1B 479,962,140 No Bid Security Seen
35 |T.Gaynauth & Sons Contracting Services L2 966,342,900




36 [Platinum Investments Inc L1A 446,319,132 7,365,000 Premier
36 [Platinum Investments Inc L1B 446,319,132 7,365,000
36 [Platinum Investments Inc L2 911,734,200 14,745,000
37 |Kzee Investments L1A 447,525,671 7,365,000 Premier
37 |Kzee Investments L1B 447,499,631 7,365,000
Satar Mohamed & Son Construction & )
41 1 P
38 Hardware Supplies L1A 491,419,33 7,365,000 remier
Satar Mohamed & Son Construction &
491,4 1
38 Hardware Supplies L1A 91,450,83 7,365,000
39 |Samaroo's Investment L1A 535,418,147 7,365,000 Premier
39 |Samaroo's Investment L1B 531,836,204 7,365,000
40 |Aaqib Consultancy L1A 473,920,160 7,365,000 Caricom
40 |Aaqib Consultancy L1B 487,222,542 7,365,000
40 |Aaqib Consultancy L2 973,479,290 14,745,000
41 |Qingjian Group Company Guyana Inc L1A 561,451,926 7,365,000 Premier
41 |Qingjian Group Company Guyana Inc L1B 561,451,926 7,365,000
41 |Qingjian Group Company Guyana Inc 1.2 14,745,000
42 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L1A 483,887,387 7,365,000 Assuria
42 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L1B 483,887,387 7,365,000
42 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L2 845,759,920 14,745,000
43 |Eron Lall Civil Engineering Works L1A 487,539,140 7,365,000 Assuria




43 |Eron Lall Civil Engineering Works L1B 485,203,388 | $ 7,365,000
44 | AR Total Logistics Solutions Inc L1A 480,874,640 | $ 7,365,000 Caricom
44 |AR Total Logistics Solutions Inc L1B 480,777,712 | $ 7,365,000
44 | AR Total Logistics Solutions Inc L2 971,964,340 | $ 14,745,000
45 |J. Hussain's Construction & Supplies L1A 486,764,854 | $ 7,365,000 Premier
45 |J. Hussain's Construction & Supplies L1B 482,495,774 | $ 7,365,000
45 |J. Hussain's Construction & Supplies L2 933,834,330 | $ 14,745,000
46 |Crown Road and Drainage Contractors L1A 442,592,325( $ 7,365,000 Caricom
46 |Crown Road and Drainage Contractors L1B 446,267,325( $ 7,365,000
46 |Crown Road and Drainage Contractors L2 885,612,200 $ 14,745,000
47 |Z&J Enterprise Inc L1A 489,554,271| $ 7,365,000 Premier
47 |Z&]J Enterprise Inc L1B 490,263,945( $ 7,365,000
47 |Z&J Enterprise Inc 1.2 983,119,550 | $ 14,745,000
48 |[Blue Print Builders Inc L1A 486,512,387 | $ 7,365,000 Assuria
48 |[Blue Print Builders Inc L1B 486,512,387 | $ 7,365,000
48 |(Blue Print Builders Inc 1.2 836,144,950 | $ 14,745,000
49 |Sino Estates & Management Inc L1A 489,734,516 | $ 7,365,000 Caricom
50 |S. Maraj Contracting Services [.2 949,204,400 | § 14,745,000 Caricom
51 |R&N Construction Services L1A 991,632,181 | $ 7,365,000 Assuria




51 |R&N Construction Services L1B $ 991,632,181 7,365,000

52 |Formidable Investments L1A $ 438,774,488 7,365,000 Assuria
52 |Formidable Investments L1B $ 438,774,488 7,365,000

53 |Femininity Contracting L1A $ 488,322,831 7,365,000 Caricom
53 |Femininity Contracting L1B $ 485,075,903 7,365,000

53 |Femininity Contracting L2 $ 975,358,420

54 |H. Ramballi General Construction L1A $ 485,604,772 7,365,000 Assuria
54 |H. Ramballi General Construction L1B $ 487,367,596 7,365,000

55 |D&R Construction and Machinery Rental L1A | $ 489,278,433 7,365,000 Caricom
55 |D&R Construction and Machinery Rental L1B | $ 489,803,433 7,365,000

55 |D&R Construction and Machinery Rental 1.2 $ 978,313,160 14,745,000

56 |Vulcan Group Inc L1A $ 462,278,198 7,365,000 Caricom
56 |Vulcan Group Inc L1B $ 465,800,948 7,365,000

56 |Vulcan Group Inc L2 $ 1,110,808,330 14,745,000

57 |Morris Jeffrey Enterprise L1A $ 490,013,433 7,365,000 Caricom
57 |Morris Jeffrey Enterprise L1B $ 489,015,933 7,365,000

57 |Morris Jeffrey Enterprise 1.2 $ 976,213,160 14,745,000

58 |Sean's Construction Services L1A $ 489,173,291 7,365,000 Diamond
58 [Sean's Construction Services L1B $ 489,173,291 7,365,000




Impeccable Construction & General Supplies

59 e LIA 471,141,405 | $ 7,365,000 Caricom
59 Impeccable Construction & General Supplies 467.894.477 | § 7,365,000

IncL1B
59 Impeccable Construction & General Supplies 962.237.100 | § 14,745,000

Inc L2
60 fjlild E Construction, Supplies and Services 488.028.433 | $ 7.365.000 Caricom
60 fjﬁ;d E Construction, Supplies and Services 488.028.433 | $ 7.365.000
60 szand E Construction, Supplies and Services 979363160 | $  14.745.000
61 |V. Latiff Contracting & Cleaning Service L1A 441,542,325 | $ 7,365,000 Premier
61 |V. Latiff Contracting & Cleaning Service L1B 464,221,958 | $ 7,365,000
61 |V. Latiff Contracting & Cleaning Service [.2 928,631,200 | $ 14,745,000
62 |BK International Inc L1A 546,844,664 | $ 7,365,000 Caricom
62 |BK International Inc L1A 546,844,664 | $ 7,365,000
62 |BK International Inc L1A 967,360,591 | $ 14,745,000
63 |R. Kissoon Contracting Service L1A 784,870,485 | $ 7,365,000 Premier
63 |R. Kissoon Contracting Service L1B 784,870,485 | $ 7,365,000
64 |Imam Bacchus & Sons Limted L1A 485,594,351 | $ 7,365,000 Assuria
64 [Imam Bacchus & Sons Limted L1B 483,643,671 | $ 7,365,000




65 |Surujpaul Balkaran & Sons Construction L1A 474,212,183 7,365,000 Premier
65 |Surujpaul Balkaran & Sons Construction L1B 419,383,414 7,365,000
66 |Hard Runnings Investments Inc L1A 489,659,271 7,365,000 Premier
66 |Hard Runnings Investments Inc L1B 490,316,445 7,365,000
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