Date of Tender Opening: March 20, 2025

File Number: Guyana Power & Light Inc (49/2025/02) - Supply, Installation & Configuration of Specialized Networking Equipment

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.ISh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |One Communications (Guyana) Inc Letter of Proposal $ 3,596,197 Nafico v v X 2
Not Seen
2 |Excel Guyana Inc Letter of Proposal $ 30,139,479 Premier v v X 1
Not Seen
3 gr:pso Zambrano S.A.S-Compucables Nuger | \jg g1 q05 68157 |$ 5,250,000 Premier NA | NA | v 2
4  |Salco Electric Company Inc US $1,646,235.26 | US $32,924.71 Seguros Sura N/A | N/A v 2
5 Integrated Telecommunications Services & $ 219,629,740 | $ 4,150 001 Assuria v v v )
Solutions Inc
g |China National Machinery Import & Export US $1,907,427.00 |$ 126,000,627 Caricom NA | NA | v 2
Corporation
File Number: Guyana Power & Light Inc (55/2025/02) - Supply & Delivery of Male & Female Clerical Uniforms
. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla}sh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed

NO BIDS RECEIVED




Date of Tender Opening: March 20, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education-HSP (86/2025/40) - Tthe Construction of the New Industrial Block at Annadale Secondary School

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.lSh
No. Currency ) Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 S_herlff_Constructlon Inc (Technlcal & 8 415,324 Assuria v Rec v 5
Financial Proposal Submitted)
5 Blue Print Bwlglers Inc (Technical & Financial 8,415,324 Assuria v Rec v 2
Proposal Submitted)
Shandong High-Speed Dijian Group Co. Ltd
3 |(Technical & Financial Proposal Submitted 8,415,324 Premier N/A | N/A v 2
But Merged)
4 U_rban _Edge Builders Inc_(TechnlcaI & 8 415,324 Assuria v Rec v 5
Financial Proposal Submitted)
5 P_ermaql Trading & Dlstrl_butlon (Technical & 8 415,324 Premier Y v v 5
Financial Proposal Submitted)
Allicock’s Construction & Supplies
6 [(Technical Proposal Submitted Via Flashdrive No Bid Security Seen v v v 1

& Financial Proposal Submitted)




Date of Tender Opening: March 20, 2025

File Number: Deeds & Commercial Registry (32/2025/52) - Supply & Delivery of 40 Desktop Computers

Bid Security

Form of

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.ISh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed

1 |Imon Wireless Solution Inc $ 14,995,200 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
2 |Promotech Inc $ 8,596,980 | $ 171,940 Premier v v v 2
3 |Starr Computer Inc $ 11,361,200 | $ 227,224 Premier v v v 2
4  |Nextech Inc $ 9,000,000 | $ 180,000 Premier v v v 2
5 |Keyboard Kiosk $ 15,000,000 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
6 |Zenith Services Inc $ 8,973,840 | $ 200,000 Assuria v v v 2
7  |Nationwide Imports $ 9,796,000 | $ 195,920 Caricom v v v 2
8 |KM Technology $ 7,960,000 | $ 159,200 Diamond v v v 2
9 |Cellphone Shack $ 14,829,000 | $ 296,580 Premier v v v 2
10 |(Digital Technology Group of Companies Inc $ 8,636,000 | $ 172,720 Assuria v v v 2
11 |Bits & Bites Computer Store $ 9,040,000 | $ 180,800 Premier v v v 2
12 |MAEC Enterprises $ 8,598,000 | $ 171,960 Assuria v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 20, 2025

File Number: Hinterland Electrification Co. Inc (100/2025/02) - Supply and Delivery of Two Solar PV Systems to Lethem and Kato

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.ISh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |Chase's Energy Engineering L2 $ 5,462,500 170,000 Caricom v v v 1
2 |Tels Engineering Services L1 $ 8,240,000 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
2 |Tels Engineering Services L2 $ 1,300,000
3 |Excel Guyana Inc L1 $ 19,996,018.82 399,920 Premier v v v 1 1
3 |Excel Guyana Inc L2 $ 12,105,032.19 242,101
g |Standby Power Engineering Company $ 13,216,200 780,000 Assuria v | v v 2

(SPECOM) L1




Date of Tender Opening: March 20, 2025
File Number: Guyana Energy Agency (95/2025/02) - Supply and Delivery of Fourteen Electric Vehicle Charging Stations for the GEA

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.ISh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |Excel Guyana Inc $ 156,847,927.82 |$ 3,136,959 Premier v v v 1 1
2 |UB Precision ENG $ 24,000,000 | $ 480,000 Caricom v v v 2
3 |Elgawa (Guyana) Inc $ 107,114,470.89 |$ 2,142,289 Assuria v v v 1 2

File Number: Guyana Energy Agency (96/2025/02) - Prequalification of Contractors for Provision of Transportation Services to Regional and Hinterland Communities across

Guyana for the Solar Home Energy Program
) . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fle.‘Sh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |Real Time Logistics & Transportation Service v v 1




Date of Tender Opening: March 20, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Legal Affairs (26/2025/52) - Recapping Southern Driveway

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.ISh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |Natasha and Son's Enterprise 3,447,675 Bid Security Deglizrr?é:jon Completed & v v v 1
2 |Andrect Engineering & Construction 4,989,600 Bid Security De;liz;r:é:jon Completed & v v v 1
3 |Rohit Persaud Construction Services & plumbing 5,129,250 Bid Security De;liz;r:é:jon Completed & v v v 1
4 11D Investments Inc. 4810575 Bid Security Decl_aratlon Completed & Y Y Y 1
Signed
: : : Bid Security Declaration Completed &
5 |Romain Construction General Services & Supply 4,439,400 10 Securtty egiz;rr?e:jon ompIete v v v 1
6 Innovative Development Solution Guyana 4,595.325 Bid Security Decl_aratlon Completed & v v v 1
(IDSGY) Signed
Engineer' Estimate 5,421,675




Date of Tender Opening: March 20, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Legal Affairs (27/2025/52) - Minor Repairs and Replacing Doors on First and Ground

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.ISh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |Andrect Engineering & Construction 2,774,750 Bid Security Deglizrr?é:jon Completed & v v v 1
2 |Natasha and Son's Enterprise 4,498,450 Bid Security De;liz;r:é:jon Completed & v v v 1
3 Innovative Development Solution Guyana 2500410 Bid Security Decl_aratlon Completed & Y Y Y 1
(IDSGY) Signed
4 |Romain Construction General Services & Supply 2,495,350 Bid Security De;liz;r:é:jon Completed & v v v 1
5 |JD Investments Inc. 3,735,600 |20 Securty De;'iagr:;:jon Completed &, | v 1
6 |Rohit Persaud Construction Services & plumbing 3,111,075 Bid Security De;liagr:;:jon Completed & v v v 1
Engineer's Estimate 3,276,350




Date of Tender Opening: March 20, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Legal Affairs (28/2025/52) - Minor Repairs and Painting to Hall way & Offices

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.ISh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
: Bi ity Declarati I
1 |Natasha and Son's Enterprise 4,738,650 Id Security egizrr?;hon Completed & v v v 1
. : Bi ity Declarati I
2  |Andrect Engineering & Construction 3,525,900 Id Security egizrr?:don Completed & v v v 1
3 Innovative Development Solution Guyana 4,170,600 Bid Security Decl_aratlon Completed & v v v 1
(IDSGY) Signed
: . : Bi ity Declarati I
4  |Romain Construction General Services & Supply 4,438,350 Id Security egizrr?:don Completed & v v v 1
5 |30 Investments Inc. 5,010,600 Bid Security Decl.aratlon Completed & v v v 1
Signed
: . . . Bi ity Declarati I
6 |Rohit Persaud Construction Services & plumbing 4,735,500 Id Security egiagrr?:don Completed & v v v 1
Engineer's Estimate 5,124,000




Date of Tender Opening: March 20, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Health (70/2025/47) - Supply and Delivery of Radiology Supplies

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.ISh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
NO BIDS RECEIVED
File Number: Ministry of Health (71/2025/47) - Supply and Delivery of Office Furniture for HSE
) . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency [ GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fle.‘Sh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |General Distributors $ 78,647,535 | $ 1,580,000 Caricom v v v
File Number: Ministry of Health (72/2025/47) - Pre-Qualification for Medical Equipment, Reagents & Consumables
. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla}sh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed

NO BIDS RECEIVED




Date of Tender Opening: March 20, 2025

File Number: Protected Areas Commission (31/2025/01) - Supply and Delivery of Two Multi-Functional Printer/Photocopy Machines

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.ISh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |Atlas Business Solutions Inc. $ 2,173,000 Bid Security zeé:ilgﬁltéon Completed v v v 2
2 |Nationwide Imports $ 2,766,720 | $ 55,334 Caricom v v v 2
3 |Promotech Inc $ 1632.461 Bid Security Dec_laratlon Completed Y Y Y )
& Signed
: . Bid Security Declaration C leted
4 |Laparkan Trading Guyana Company Limited $ 2,960,000 10 SeCUrity Bieearation Lomplete v v v 2

& Signed




Date of Tender Opening: March 20, 2025

File Number: Protected Areas Commission (31/2025/01) - Supply and Delivery of Two 200hp Outboards

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.ISh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |Ming's Products & Services Limited $ 6,885,600 |$ 138,000 | Republic Bank v v v 2
2  |General Equipment Guyana Limited $ 10,704,828 | $ 812,100 Assuria v v v 2
3 |Farm Supplies Limited $ 10,850,000 | $ 217,000 Assuria v v v 2
4 SKJ?;I;iIz:at Building, Construction & General $ 8.262.720 | $ 165,254 Caricom v v v 5
5 |RRT Enterprise & Auto Sales $ 8,790,000 | $ 175,800 Premier v v v 2
6 |GUYMAC $ 9,000,000 | $ 180,000 Caricom v v v 1




Date of Tender Opening: March 20, 2025

File Number: National Parks Commission (26/2025/01) - Supply and Delivery of Lot 1 One Excavator Lot 2 Tree Spade

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FIa}sh
No. Currency . Copy | drive
Currency signhed
1 |Farm Supplies Limited L1 $ 25,000,000 | $ 500,000 Assuria v v v 2
2 |Yellow Steel Inc L1 $ 22,000,000 | $ 590,000 Assuria v v v 2
2 |Yellow Steel Inc L2 $ 7,500,000 (L1-2)
3 |Guyana Tractor & Equipment L1 $ 28,000,000 |$ 31,500,000 Caricom v v v 2
3 |Guyana Tractor & Equipment L2 $ 3,500,000 (L1-2)
4  |Diversity Investments Inc L1 $ 32,200,000 | $ 644,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 :2::slf310nstruct|on Equipment, Sales & Rentals $ 27600708 | $ 553,000 Diamond Y v Y 9
6 [General Equipment Guyana Limited L1 $ 30,710,000 . . v v v 2
- — No Bid Security Seen
6 |General Equipment Guyana Limited L2 $ 9,895,001 ! urty
7 Dlglta_l Design Construction, Logistics & $ 25254.270 | $ 672.973 Caricom v v v 5
Supplies L1
Digital Design Construction, Logistics &
7 Supplies L2 $ 8,394,390 (L1-2)
8 |IMS Construction & Logistics Services L1 $ 23,637,150 | $ 700,000 Caricom v v v 2
8 |IMS Construction & Logistics Services L2 $ 6,064,470 (L1-2)
9 |Alliance Investments L1 $ 25,000,000 | $ 500,000 Premier v v v 2
10 |Machinery Corporation of Guyana Limited L1 $ 21,800,000 | $ 436,000 Nafico v v v 1




Date of Tender Opening: March 20, 2025

File Number: National Parks Commission (27/2025/01) - Supply and Delivery of One Double Cab Canter

Bid Security

Form of

Bﬁg.er Name of Bidder B"éﬁ‘rr:::cr;t & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T_ender 22;3 I;L?\S;:
Currency signed
1 |Ansa Motors Guyana Inc $ 13,700,000 | $ 274,000 Premier v v v 1
2 |GUYMAC $ 12,400,000 | $ 248,000 Caricom v v v 1
3 |Cevon's Waste Management Inc $ 12,597,000 | $ 251,940 Assuria v v v 2
4 |Jumbo Jet Auto Sales $ 14,000,000 | $ 280,000 Premier v v v 2
5 |NM Trucking Auto Sales & Agri Machinery $ 14,500,000 | $ 290,000 Premier v v v 2
6 |IMS Construction & Logistics Services $ 12,500,000 | $ 260,000 Caricom v v v 2
7 |ldeal Autos Inc $ 9,800,000 | $ 196,000 Nafico v v v 1
Form of Tender Page
8 |Total Construction Inc Not Completed & | $ 500,000 Premier v v X 2
Signed
9 |Car Clean Enterprise $ 8,350,000 | $ 200,000 | Hand In Hand v v v 2
10 |RRT Enterprise & Auto Sales $ 11,695,000 | $ 233,900 Premier v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 20, 2025

File Number: National Parks Commission (28/2025/01) - Supply and Delivery of One Compact Track Loader

. . Bid Securit Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.lSh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |General Equipment Guyana Limited $ 17,558,820 | $ 351,176 GTM v v v 2
2 |[NM Trucking Auto Sales & Agri Machinery $ 17,350,000 | $ 347,000 Premier v v v 2
3 |Farm Supplies Limited $ 15,000,000 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 1 1
Form of Tender Page
4  [Total Construction Inc Not Completed & | $ 360,000 Premier v v X 2
Signed
5 |RRT Enterprise & Auto Sales $ 15,695,000 | $ 313,900 Premier v v v 2
6 |GUYMAC $ 10,500,000 | $ 210,000 Caricom v v v 2
7 |Guyana Tractor & Equipment $ 14,000,000 | $ 14,000,000 Caricom v v v 2
8 |Digital Design, Construction Logistics & Supplies | $ 9,773,100 | $ 195,462 Caricom v v v 2
9 |Cevon's Waste Management Inc $ 14,341,200 | $ 312,360 Assuria v v v 2
10 |IMS Construction & Logistics Services $ 14,995,000 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
11 |lbis Construction Equipment, Sales & RentalsInc | $ 16,221,880 | $ 325,000 Diamond v v v 2
12 |Jumbo Jet Auto Sales $ 17,000,000 | $ 340,000 Premier v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 20, 2025

File Number: National Parks Commission (29/2025/01) - Supply and Delivery of One Cherry Picker

. . Bid Securit Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard Flgsh
No. Currency . Copy | drive
Currency signed
1 |GUYMAC $ 12,500,000 | $ 250,000 Caricom v v v 1
2 |[NM Trucking Auto Sales & Agri Machinery $ 14,250,000 | $ 285,000 Premier v v v 2
3 |[Jumbo Jet Auto Sales $ 14,000,000 | $ 280,000 Premier v v v 2
Form of Tender Page
4  [Total Construction Inc Not Completed & | $ 480,000 Premier v v X 2
Signed
5 |Car Clean Enterprise $ 19,850,000 | $ 500,000 | Hand in Hand v v v 2
6 |RRT Enterprise & Auto Sales $ 13,995,000 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
7 |Guyana Tractor & Equipment $ 28,000,000 [ $ 28,000,000 Caricom v v v 2
8 |Cevon's Waste Management Inc $ 15,618,000 | $ 286,824 Assuria v v v 2
9 |Digital Design Construction, Logistics & Supplies | $ 25,703,100 | $ 514,062 Caricom v v v 2
10 |Meditron Inc $ 22,981,173 | $ 459,634 Diamond v v v 2
11 |IMS Construction & Logistics Services $ 14,000,000 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 20, 2025

File Number: National Parks Commission (30/2025/01) - Construction of Zoological Park Administration Building

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FIE}Sh
No. Currency ) Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |VAS Global 3 18,641,850 No Bid Security Seen v v v 0
5 Soverelgn_ty Investments Construction Services $ 16.633.200 | $ 400,000 Assuria v v v 5
(SICS Builders)
3 |Office Pro Enterprise & Contracting Services $ 18,075,104 | $ 361,502 Assuria v v v 2
4 |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 19,129,900 | $ 200,000 Assuria v v v 2
5 |Digital Design Construction, Logistics & Supplies | $ 17,563,900 | $ 351,278 Caricom v v v 2
6 JPM_s General Construction & Engineering $ 17,288,505 | $ 400000 Caricom v v v 5
Services
7  |K. Whyte Construction $ 18,992,520 | $ 400,000 Assuria v v v 1
8 |PME Consulting Engineers Inc $ 23,657,200 | $ 483,144 Premier v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 19,999,400




Date of Tender Opening: March 20, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education (71/2025/40) - Electrical Rehabilitation Infrastructure- North Georgetown Primary School

. . Bid Securit Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.lSh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
Form of Tender Page
1 |Rush Engineering & Service Not Completed & | $ 936,180 Premier v Rec X 2
Signed
2 |Randolph Taylor Construction $ 13,767,600 | $ 275,352 Premier v v v 2
3 |Digital Design, Construction, Logistics & Supplies | $ 34,506,150 | $ 690,123 Caricom v v v 2
4  |R&P Engineering & General Construction $ 33,227,250 | $ 700,000 Assuria v Rec v 2
5 |Cummings Electrical Company Limited $ 36,368,459 | $ 800,000 Nafico v v v 2
6 |Mohabir's Construction $ 41,548,500 | $ 700,000 Nafico v v v 1
7 |Star Executive Services $ 30,937,200 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
8 |AEA Enterprise $ 34,902,840 | $ 698,041 Premier v v v 1
9 |Mega Power Electrical & Construction Services $ 47,466,930 | $ 949,339 Assuria v v v 2
10 [R. Persid Construction $ 29,872,500 | $ 700,000 Nafico v v v 2
11 |PMW Construction & General Services $ 48,639,150 | $ 700,000 Premier v v v 2
12 |BM Property Investments Inc $ 34,997,550 | $ 699,951 Caricom v v v 2
13 [Smart Builders Construction & Supplies Inc $ 34,526,100 | $ 700,000 Premier v v v 2
14 |J.M.J.B General Contracting $ 27,783,900 | $ 555,678 Assuria v v v 2
15 |Modern Urban Investments $ 34,706,700 | $ 694,134 Premier v v v 2
16 N. Bal_gobin & S_.ons Contracting Service & $ 32980080 | $ 700,000 Assuria v v v )
Electrical Supplies
Engineer's Estimate $ 32,366,250




Date of Tender Opening: March 20, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education (72/2025/40) - Electrical Rehabilitation Infrastructure- Tutorial High School

. . Bid Securit Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FIE}Sh
No. Currency ) Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |AEA Enterprise $ 34,994,400 | $ 699,888 Premier v v v 1
2 |Pooran Ram Boodhaley General Contracting $ 39,079,450 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
3 |R. Persid Construction $ 31,568,000 | $ 700,000 Nafico v v v 2
4  |Mitchell's Electrical $ 44,406,025 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
5 N. Bal_gobln & S_ons Contracting Service & $ 37.971.360 | $ 800,000 Assuria v v v 5
Electrical Supplies
6 |Mohabir's Construction $ 49,738,500 | $ 700,000 Nafico v v v 2
7 |Oneika & Son's Development $ 48,461,175 | $ 700,000 Premier v v v 2
8 |Modern Urban Investments $ 43,733,550 | $ 874,671 Premier v v v 2
9 |Randolph Taylor Construction $ 31,363,500 | $ 627,270 Premier v v v 2
10 |R's Modern Construction & Supplies $ 42,562,000 | $ 400,000 Premier v v v 2
Form of Tender Page
11 |Rush Engineering & Service Not Completed & | $ 1,079,715 Premier X Rec X 2
Signed
12 |A Plus Consulting & General Services Inc $ 38,039,400 | $ 760,000 Diamond v v v 1
13 |M.E.P Engineering Services Inc $ 38,663,633 | $ 500,000 Premier v v v 2
14 |Mega Power Electrical & Construction Services | $ 57,142,050 | $ 1,142,841 Assuria v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 38,631,600




Date of Tender Opening: March 20, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education (73/2025/40) - Electrical Rehabilitation Infrastructure- St. Christopher Nursery School

. . Bid Security . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & AMount & Bid Security GRA | NIs Tender Hard Fla_lsh
No. Currency Agency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |Mohabir's Construction 11,182,500 | $ 240,000 Nafico v v v 2
2 |L. Munro Electrical Services 14,036,400 No Bid Security Seen v v v 1
3 |P.M.W Construction & General Services 12,243,000 Bid Security Dec_laratlon v v v 2
Completed & Signed
. : Bid Security Declaration
4 |Twins Enterprise 8,116,500 Completed & Signed v v v 1
: . Bid Security Declaration
5 |Fugenz Business Solutions 8,404,200 Completed & Signed v v v 2
6 |S.A General Services 12,261,375 Bid Security Dec_laratlon v v v 1
Completed & Signed
7 |Smart Builders Construction & Supplies 8,480,850 Bid Security Declaration v v v 2
PP S Completed & Signed
N. Balgobin & Sons Contracting Service & Bid Security Declaration
8 Electrical Supplies 8,797,950 Completed & Signed v v v 1
9 [S&S Construction & General Services 12,443,571 Bid Security Dec_laratlon v v v 2
Completed & Signed
10 [Mega Power Electrical & Construction Services 12,480,510 Bid Security Dec_l aration v v v 2
Completed & Signed
11 |Queens Construction & Maintenance 8,695,050 Bid Security Declaration v v v 2

Completed & Signed




Bid Security Declaration

12 [R. Persid Construction 12,904,500 Completed & Signed v v v
: Bid Security Declaration
13 [Randolph Taylor Construction 10,817,100 Completed & Signed v v v
14 |BM Property Investments Inc 14,894,250 | $ 297,885 Caricom v v v
: . Bid Security Declaration
15 [Evocative Services 8,514,545 Completed & Signed v v v
16 |Vidrick Construction & Electrical Services 12,917,100 Bid Security Dec_laratlon v v v
Completed & Signed
17 [Trevor & Son General Construction Services 11,350,500 | $ 235,620 Assuria v v v
18 |R &P Engineering & General Construction 12,736,500 Bid Security Dec_l aration v Rec v
Completed & Signed
. Bid Security Declaration
19 |Pooran Ram Boodhaley General Contracting 7,801,500 Completed & Signed v v v
. Bid Security Declaration
20 |S&J Enteprise 12,666,295 Completed & Signed v v v
21 |Excel Guyana Inc 14,851,886.19 | $ 297,037 Premier v v v
: . Bid Security Declaration
22 |Grand Sourcing & Services 8,771,700 Completed & Signed v v v
. , Bid Security Declaration
23 |Oneika & Son's Development 12,110,450 Completed & Signed v v v
24 [Multifix General Services 11,704,350 Bid Security Dec_l aration v v v
Completed & Signed
25 [Cummings Electrical Company Limited 11,090,969 | $ 400,000 | Nafico v v v




Engineer's Estimate

$

8,868,300




Date of Tender Opening: March 20, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education (74/2025/40) - Electrical Rehabilitation Infrastructure- South Ruimveldt Secondary School

. . Bid Securit Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.ISh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |AKM Investment & Supplies $ 32,208,750 | $ 680,000 Nafico v v v 1
2 |S.A General Services $ 35,609,490 | $ 700,000 Premier v v v 1
3 |R. Persid Construction $ 27,241,410 | $ 700,000 Nafico v v v 2
4  |M.E.P Engineering Services Inc $ 27,168,679 | $ 500,000 Premier v v v 2
5 |S&J Enterprise $ 41,477,612 | $ 700,000 Premier v v v 1
6 |MUSE Holding Inc $ 28,637,702 | $ 700,000 Caricom v v v 1
7 |Mega Power Electrical & Construction Services $ 37,693,950 | $ 753,879 Assuria v v v 2
8 |AEA Enterprise $ 34,994,400 | $ 699,888 Premier v v v 1
9 |Star Executive Services 3 26,800,200 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
10 [BM Property Investments Inc $ 34,994,400 | $ 699,888 Caricom v v v 2
11 N. Bal_gobln & S_ons Contracting Service & $ 29879850 | $ 600,000 Assuria v v Y 5
Electrical Supplies
12 |Smart Builders Construction & Supplies Inc $ 24,156,300 | $ 700,000 Premier v v v 2
13 |Digital Design, Construction, Logistics & Supplies | $ 32,054,400 | $ 641,088 Caricom v v v 2
14 |Cummings Electrical Company Limited $ 32,398,905 | $ 800,000 Nafico v v v 2
15 |R&P Engineering & General Construction 3 34,550,250 No Bid Security Seen v Rec v 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 28,245,000




Date of Tender Opening: March 20, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education (76/2025/40) - Electrical Rehabilitation Infrastructure- Symth Street Nursery School

. . Bid Securit Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.ISh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 [Two Brothers Construction $ 22,837,500 | $ 500,000 Nafico v v v 2
2 |AKYE & Sons General Contracitng $ 20,886,600 | $ 700,000 Assuria v v v 2
3 [R. Persid Construction $ 20,886,600 | $ 700,000 Nafico v v v 2
4  |The Property Experts, Supplies & Services $ 18,004,350 | $ 360,087 Diamond v v v 2
5 |Mega Power Electrical & Construction Services | $ 23,185,166 | $ 463,704 Assuria v v v 2
Form of Tender
6 |SA General Services Page Not Completed | $ 700,000 Premier v v v 2
But Signed
7 |P.M.W Construction & General Services $ 23,552,025 | $ 700,000 Premier v v v 2
8 |Trevor & Son General Construction Services $ 28,701,750 | $ 574,035 Assuria v v v 2
9  |Cummings Electrical Company Limited $ 22,088,932 | $ 800,000 Nafico v v v 2
10 |A Plus Consulting & General Services Inc $ 17,961,300 | $ 358,000 Diamond v v v 1
11 |S&J Enterprise $ 27,860,780 | $ 700,000 Premier v v v 1
12 |Evocative Services $ 17,713,500 | $ 354,270 Assuria v v v 1
13 |Queens Construction & Maintenance $ 17,862,600 | $ 357,252 Assuria v v v 2
14 | Twins Enteprise $ 17,832,780 | $ 560,000 Assuria v v v 2
Form of Tender
15 |L. Munro Electrical Services Page Not Completed No Bid Security Seen v v X 1
& Signed
16 |Vidrick Construction & Electrical Services $ 23,404,500 | $ 472,000 Premier v v v 2
17 |Pooran Ram Boodhaley General Contracting $ 16,603,650 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2




N. Balgobin & Sons Contracting Service &

18 ) : $ 20,304,900 | $ 600,000 Assuria v v v 2
Electrical Supplies
19 |Modern Urban Investments $ 17,232,600 | $ 344,652 Premier v v v 2
20 |AEA Enterprise $ 34,757,205 | $ 695,144 Premier v v v 1
21 |MUSE Holding Inc $ 18,300,977 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
22 |Oneika & Sons Development $ 23,635,500 | $ 700,000 Premier v v v 2
23 |BM Property Investments Inc $ 34,986,000 | $ 699,720 Caricom v v v 2
24 |A. Ograsein & Sons $ 17,302,950 | $ 700,000 Premier v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 18,509,400




Date of Tender Opening: March 20, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education (77/2025/40) - Electrical Rehabilitation Infrastructure- Enterprise Primary School

Bid Security

Form of

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.ISh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |Smart Builders Construction & Supplies Inc $ 20,511,750 | $ 700,000 Premier v v v 2
2 |R&P Engineering & General Construction $ 23,847,600 | $ 700,000 Assuria v Rec v 2
3 |BM Property Investments Inc $ 34,981,800 | $ 699,636 Caricom v v v 2
4  |Govinda Investment Investment $ 33,414,360 No Bid Security Seen v v v 1
5 N. Bal_gobm & S_ons Contracting Service & $ 27721560 | $ 600,000 Assuria v v v 5
Electrical Supplies
6 |[Mega Power Electrical & Construction Services | $ 29,517,600 | $ 590,252 Assuria v v v 2
7 |P.M.W Construction & General Services $ 32,051,775 | $ 700,000 Premier v v v 2
8 |The Property Experts, Supplies & Services $ 22,116,150 | $ 442,323 Diamond v v v 2
9 |SA General Services $ 25,586,190 | $ 700,000 Premier v v v 1
10 |MTech Contracting Solutions $ 22,054,200 | $ 441,084 Assuria v v v 2
11 [Cummings Electrical Company Limited $ 23,435,819 | $ 800,000 Nafico v v v 2
12 |AKM Investment & Supplies $ 27,772,500 | $ 560,000 Nafico v v v 1
13 |R. Persi Construction $ 24,454,500 | $ 700,000 Nafico v v v 2
14 |S&J Enteprise $ 32,144,595 | $ 700,000 Premier v v v 1
15 [Pooran Ram Boodhaley General Contracting $ 21,008,400 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
16 |Vidrick Construction & Electrical Services $ 30,809,100 | $ 617,500 Premier v v v 2
17 |Randolph Taylor Construction $ 29,341,200 | $ 586,824 Premier v v v 2
18 |Oneika & Sons Development $ 29,968,529 | $ 700,000 Premier v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 22,781,850




Date of Tender Opening: March 20, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education (78/2025/40) - Electrical Rehabilitation Infrastructure- Enterprise Nursery School

Bid Security

Form of

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.ISh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |Vidrick Construction & Electrical Services $ 13,971,300 Bid Security (I;)Le;:ilg;a;éon Completed v v v 2
2 |AYKE & Sons General Contracting $ 13,485,675 Bid Security zeé:ilggéon Completed v v v 1
3 |Twins Enterprise $ 10,860,600 | Did Security Declaration Completed | - 1, v 2
& Signed
4  |S&S Construction & General Services $ 13,452,600 Bid Security Dec_laratlon Completed v v v 2
& Signed
5 (NO SUPPORTING DOCUMENTYS) X X X 0
6 [Pooran Ram Boodhaley General Contracting $ 10,089,450 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
7 |Grand Sourcing & Services $ 11,139,450 Bid Security geg:g:]féon Completed v v v 2
8 |Goodluck Electrical $ 24100000 | D'dSecurity Declaration Completed | | v 1
& Signed
9 [Queens Construction & Maintenance $ 11,381,790 Bid Security geg:g:]féon Completed v v v 2
10 |P.M.W Construction & General Services $ 13,902,000 Bid Security Dec_laratlon Completed v v v 2
& Signed
11 |Cummings Electrical Company Limited $ 12,104,324 | $ 400,000 Nafico v v v 2
12 |s&J Enterprise Form of Tender Bid Security Declaration Completed v v % )

Page Not Seen

& Signed




Bid Security Declaration Completed

13 |Oneika & Sons Development 11,841,500 : v v v
& Signed
14 |BM Property Investments Inc 11,891,000 Bid Security zeé::g:]e:etéon Completed v v v
15 |[SA General Services 13,886,250 Bid Security Dec_larat|on Completed v v v
& Signed
16 |Trevor & Sons General Construction Services 11,781,000 | $ 227,010 Assuria v v v
17 |The Property Experts, Supplies & Services 10,861,200 Bid Security geé:ilgg(ljon Completed v v v
18 N. Bal_gobln & S_ons Contracting Service & 12,931,275 Bid Security Dec_laratlon Completed Y Y Y
Electrical Supplies & Signed
19 [Mega Power Electrical & Construction Services 14,395,710 Bid Security geé:ilgg(ljon Completed v v v
20 |Govinda Investment Investment 13,828,500 Bid Security Dec_laratlon Completed v v v
& Signed
21 |Two Brothers Construction 11,733,750 | $ 260,000 Nafico v v v
22 |R. Persid Construction 13,485,675 Bid Security Dec_larat|on Completed v v v
& Signed
22 |Evocative Services 11,031,090 Bid Security Dec_larat|on Completed v v v
& Signed
Engineer's Estimate 11,346,300




Date of Tender Opening: March 20, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education (79/2025/40) - Electrical Rehabilitation Infrastructure- Carmel Secondary School

Bid Security

Form of

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.ISh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |Mega Power Electrical & Construction Services | $ 32,677,796 | $ 653,556 Assuria v v v 2
2 |M.E.P Engineering Services Inc $ 25,262,721 | $ 500,000 Premier v v 2
3 N. Bal_gobm & S_ons Contracting Service & $ 28155750 | $ 600,000 Assuria v v v 5
Electrical Supplies
4  |Cummings Electrical Company Limited $ 27,927,900 | $ 600,000 Nafico v v v 2
5 |S&A General Services $ 29,877,540 | $ 700,000 Premier v v v 1
6 |S&J Enteprise $ 35,562,597 | $ 700,000 Premier v v v 1
7 |R&P Engineering & General Construction $ 25,363,800 | $ 700,000 Assuria v v v 2
8 |R. Persid Construction $ 24,284,400 | $ 700,000 Nafico v v v 2
9 |Pooran Ram Boodhaley General Contracting $ 22,432,200 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
10 |MUSE Holding Inc $ 24,824,105 | $ 700,000 Caricom v v v 2
11 |BM Property Investments Inc $ 34,981,800 | $ 699,636 Caricom v v v 2
12 |Oneika & Sons Development $ 31,736,355 | $ 700,000 Premier v v v 2
13 | Two Brothers Construction $ 31,095,750 | $ 640,000 Nafico v v v 1
14 |A. Ograsein & Sons $ 23,877,000 | $ 700,000 Premier v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 25,605,300




Date of Tender Opening: March 20, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education (84/2025/40) - Supply and Delivery of Vehicles Lots 1-6

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.ISh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |Jumbo Jet Auto Sales L1 $ 27,000,000 | $ 2,240,000 Premier v v v 2
1 |Jumbo Jet Auto Sales L2 $ 27,000,000 (L1-6)
1 |Jumbo Jet Auto Sales L3 $ 8,000,000
1 |Jumbo Jet Auto Sales L4 $ 11,500,000
1 |Jumbo Jet Auto Sales L5 $ 14,000,000
1 |Jumbo Jet Auto Sales L6 $ 24,500,000
5 S&K Construc_tlon, Consultancy Services & $ 13.627.500 | $ 272,550 Premier v v v 5
General Supplies L1
5 S&K Construc_tlon, Consultancy Services & $ 13.627.500 | $ 272,550
General Supplies L2
5 S&K Construc_tlon, Consultancy Services & $ 6.882.000 | $ 137,640
General Supplies L3
5 S&K Construc_tlon, Consultancy Services & $ 9.500,000 | $ 190,000
General Supplies L4
5 S&K Construc_tlon, Consultancy Services & $ 10701600 | $ 214032
General Supplies L5
5 S&K Construc_tlon, Consultancy Services & $ 20380,000 | $ 407,600
General Supplies L6
3 |Ansa Motors Guyana Inc L6 $ 16,000,000 | $ 320,000 Premier v v v 1 1




Digital Design Construction, Logistics &

4 ) $ 18,254,700 | $ 1,061,300 Caricom
Supplies L1
4 D|g|ta_l Design Construction, Logistics & $ 18.254.700 (L1-3,5)
Supplies L2
4 Dlglta_l Design Construction, Logistics & $ 7,206,000
Supplies L3
4 D|g|ta_l Design Construction, Logistics & $ 9.349 600
Supplies L5
5 |Car Care Enterprise L4 $ 6,200,000 No Bid Security Seen
5 |Car Care Enterprise L5 $ 6,400,000
5 |Car Care Enterprise L6 $ 18,000,000
6 |D'sFarmL1l $ 46,740,000 | $ 3,659,400 Caricom
6 |D'sFarmL2 $ 46,740,000 (L1-6)
6 |D'sFarmL3 $ 19,950,000
6 |[D'sFarm L4 $ 22,230,000
6 |D'sFarmL5 $ 17,670,000
6 |[D'sFarmL6 $ 29,640,000
7 |ldeal Auto Inc L5 $ 9,800,000 | $ 196,000 Nafico
8 |BM Soat Auto Sale L4 $ 8,500,000 No Bid Security Seen
8 |BM Soat Auto Sale L5 $ 8,500,000
8 |BM Soat Auto Sale L6 $ 18,500,000
9 [Car Clean Enteprise L1 $ 43,275,000 | $ 2,900,000 Hand in Hand
9 [Car Clean Enteprise L2 $ 42,275,000 (L1-6)




9 |Car Clean Enteprise L3 $ 13,975,000
9 |Car Clean Enteprise L4 $ 7,000,000
9 |Car Clean Enteprise L5 $ 7,150,000
9 |Car Clean Enteprise L6 $ 13,900,000




Date of Tender Opening: March 20, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education (29/2025/40) - Printing & Delivery of Books & Literacy Materials Lots 1-10 Nursery, Lots 11-14 Primary

Bid Security

Form of

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.ISh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |Kriti L1 $ 25,642,000 | $ 512,840 Assuria v v v 2
1 |Kriti L2 $ 34,668,500 | $ 693,370
1 |Kriti L3 $ 22,599,000 | $ 451,980
1 |Kriti L4 $ 22,599,000 | $ 451,980
1 |Kriti L5 $ 41,238,000 | $ 824,760
1 |Kriti L6 $ 9,408,000 |$ 188,160
1 |Kriti L7 $ 36,300,000 | $ 726,000
1 |Kriti L8 $ 36,300,000 | $ 726,000
1 |Kriti L9 $ 43,560,000 | $ 871,200
1 |Kriti L10 $ 41,300,500 | $ 826,010
1 |Kriti L11 $ 43,898,000 | $ 877,960
1 |Kriti L12 $ 68,709,000 | $ 1,374,180
1 |Kriti L13 $ 68,230,200 | $ 1,364,604
1 |Kriti L14 $ 48,761,700 | $ 975,234
2 |Matt's Printing Enterprise L1 $ 229,300,000 No Bid Security Seen N/A | N/A v 2
2 |Matt's Printing Enterprise L2 $ 153,210,000
2 |Matt's Printing Enterprise L3 $ 95,040,000
2 |Matt's Printing Enterprise L4 $ 106,920,000
2 |Matt's Printing Enterprise L5 $ 261,000,000
2 |Matt's Printing Enterprise L6 $ 24,640,000
2 |Matt's Printing Enterprise L7 $ 465,600,000
2 |Matt's Printing Enterprise L8 $ 294,000,000




2 |Matt's Printing Enterprise L9 $ 352,800,000

2 |Matt's Printing Enterprise L10 $ 173,545,000

2 |Matt's Printing Enterprise L11 $ 229,300,000

2 |Matt's Printing Enterprise L12 $ 420,210,000

2 |Matt's Printing Enterprise L13 $ 410,967,200

2 |Matt's Printing Enterprise L14 $ 317,046,000

3 |Office Authority L1 $ 25,881.36 | $ 2,992,500 Assuria
3 |Office Authority L2 $ 113,351.47 (L1-10)

3 |Office Authority L3 $ 38,006.73 | $ 4,373,040
3 |Office Authority L4 $ 38,006.73 (L11-14)

3 |Office Authority L5 $ 86,773.86

3  |Office Authority L6 $ 11,514.35

3 |Office Authority L7 $ 86,250.00

3 |Office Authority L8 $ 86,250.00

3 |Office Authority L9 $ 103,500.00

3 |Office Authority L10 $ 122,976.63

3  |Office Authority L11 $ 185,583.40

3 |Office Authority L12 $ 319,140.38

3 |Office Authority L13 $ 300,563.58

3 |Office Authority L14 $ 235,936.61

4 |ARCS Regium Logistics & Solutions Inc L1 $ 26,576,000 | $ 10,243,802 Nafico
4  |ARCS Regium Logistics & Solutions Inc L2 $ 33,588,775 (L1-14)

4 |ARCS Regium Logistics & Solutions Inc L3 $ 22,814,055

4  |ARCS Regium Logistics & Solutions Inc L4 $ 20,918,655

4 |ARCS Regium Logistics & Solutions Inc L5 $ 42,524,730

4 |ARCS Regium Logistics & Solutions Inc L6 $ 21,000,000




4  |ARCS Regium Logistics & Solutions Inc L7 $ 33,947,250
4 |ARCS Regium Logistics & Solutions Inc L8 $ 33,947,250
4  |ARCS Regium Logistics & Solutions Inc L9 $ 40,736,700
4 |ARCS Regium Logistics & Solutions Inc L10 $ 42,153,580
4  |ARCS Regium Logistics & Solutions Inc L11 $ 40,847,670
4 |ARCS Regium Logistics & Solutions Inc L12 $ 66,914,730
4  |ARCS Regium Logistics & Solutions Inc L13 $ 62,585,854
4 |ARCS Regium Logistics & Solutions Inc L14 $ 50,958,628
o . Republic Bank
5 |Eniath's Printing Company Limited L1 $ 17,805,775.40 | US $37,585.33 (T&T) N/A | N/A
5 |Eniath's Printing Company Limited L2 $ 37,780,822.00
5 |Eniath's Printing Company Limited L3 $ 11,187,720.00
5 |Eniath's Printing Company Limited L4 $ 11,187,720.00
5 |Eniath's Printing Company Limited L5 $ 29,091,060.00
5 |Eniath's Printing Company Limited L6 $ 3,148,040.00
5 |Eniath's Printing Company Limited L7 $ 29,076,750.00
5 |Eniath's Printing Company Limited L8 $ 29,076,750.00
5 |Eniath's Printing Company Limited L9 $ 34,892,100.00
5 |Eniath's Printing Company Limited L10 $ 30,146,995.00
5 |Eniath's Printing Company Limited L11 $ 30,631,400.00
5 [Eniath's Printing Company Limited L12 $  48,459,060.00
5 |Eniath's Printing Company Limited L13 $ 45,391,694.80
5 |Eniath's Printing Company Limited L14 $ 34,890,848.00
6 |AlPrint & Supplies L1 $ 11,220,000 | $ 224,400 Assuria v v
6 |AlPrint & Supplies L2 $ 31,855,000 | $ 637,100
6 |AlPrint & Supplies L3 $ 12,150,000 | $ 243,000




6 |AlPrint & Supplies L4 $ 12,150,000 | $ 243,000
6 |AlPrint & Supplies L5 $ 26,100,000 | $ 522,000
6 |AlPrint & Supplies L6 $ 3,500,000 | $ 70,000
6 |AlPrint & Supplies L7 $ 23,625,000 | $ 427,500
6 |AlPrint & Supplies L8 $ 23,625,000 | $ 427,500
6 |AlPrint & Supplies L9 $ 28,350,000 | $ 567,000
6 |AlPrint & Supplies L10 $ 38,280,000 | $ 645,600
6 |AlPrint & Supplies L11 $ 51,220,000 | $ 1,024,400
6 |AlPrint & Supplies L12 $ 88,205,000 | $ 1,764,094
6 |AlPrint & Supplies L13 $ 82,054,700 | $ 1,641,094
6 |Al Print & Supplies L14 $ 65,745,000 | $ 1,314,900
7 |City Printery L1 $ 979,618,500 | $ 19,592,370 Assuria
7 |City Printery L2 $ 547,545,560 | $ 10,950,911
8 |Hari's Printing Establishment L2 $ 56,600,000 No Bid Security Seen
8 [Hari's Printing Establishment L3 $ 21,870,000

8 |Hari's Printing Establishment L4 $ 21,870,000

8 [Hari's Printing Establishment L5 $ 52,200,000

8 |Hari's Printing Establishment L6 $ 4,200,000

8 [Hari's Printing Establishment L10 $ 65,075,000

8 |Hari's Printing Establishment L11 $ 73,100,000

8 [Hari's Printing Establishment L12 $ 138,900,000

8 [Hari's Printing Establishment L13 $ 130,960,000

8 [Hari's Printing Establishment L14 $ 93,340,000




Date of Tender Opening: March 20, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education (30/2025/40) - Printing & Delivery of Exercise Books

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.ISh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed

HR Distrubitors $ 318,450,921 | $ 6,400,000 Assuria v v v 2

Guyana National Printers Limited $ 452,711,020 | $ 9,054,251 Assuria v v v 1 2

Al Print and Supplies $ 447,565,699 | $ 8,951,314 Assuria v v v 2

. . Republic Bank

4 |Eniath's Printing Company Limited (T&T) $ 344,419,346 | US $32,801.24 (T&T) N/A | N/A v 2

5 [Kriti $ 387,044,871 | $ 7,740,898 Assuria v v v 2

6 |ARCS Regium Logistics & Solutions Inc $ 390,044,606 | $ 7,800,892 Nafico v v v 2

7 |NT Ventures $ 328,342,966 | $ 6,600,000 Assuria v v v 2




