Date of Tender Opening: March 24, 2026

File Number: National Data Management Authority (90/2026/02) - Procurement of Materials and Equipment for NDMA, Lots 1 - 6

Form of
Bidder . Bid Amount & Bid Security . . Hard | Flash
No. Name of Bidder Currency Amount & Currency Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS ::;13 Copy | drive
1 |S&K Construction, Consultancy Services & General Supplies L1 | $ 6,543,100 | $ 469,026 Premier Ins. v v v 2
S&K Construction, Consultancy Services & General Supplies L2 | $ 6,543,000
S&K Construction, Consultancy Services & General Supplies L3 | $ 5,666,375
S&K Construction, Consultancy Services & General Supplies L4 | $ 1,552,200
S&K Construction, Consultancy Services & General Supplies L5 | $ 9,689,625
S&K Construction, Consultancy Services & General Supplies L6 | $ -
2 |KM Technology L1 $ -3 285,040 Diamond Ins. v v v 2
KM Technology L2 $ -
KM Technology L3 $ 5,087,022
KM Technology L4 $ -
KM Technology L5 $ 9,165,000
KM Technology L6 $ -
3  |Meditron Inc. L1 $ 28,660,790 | $ 1,530,596 Diamond Ins v v v 2
Meditron Inc. L2 $ 5,873,620
Meditron Inc. L3 $ 8,242,900
Meditron Inc. L4 $ 19,637,260
Meditron Inc. L5 $ 10,885,485
Meditron Inc. L6 $ 3,229,750
4 |General Distributors L1 $ 21,306,129 | $ 1,500,000 Caricom v v v 2




General Distributors L2 $ 619,062

General Distributors L3 $ 8,021,750

General Distributors L4 $ 4,100,000

General Distributors L5 $ 2,238,795

General Distributors L6 $ 2,591,135

Imon Wireless Solutions Inc. L1 $ - Assuria
Imon Wireless Solutions Inc. L2 $ -

Imon Wireless Solutions Inc. L3 $ 5,347,430 107,000

Imon Wireless Solutions Inc. L4 $ -

Imon Wireless Solutions Inc. L5 $ 27,371,520 548,000

Imon Wireless Solutions Inc. L6 $ -

Synergy Business Solutions Inc. L1 $ - 170,506 Premier Ins.
Synergy Business Solutions Inc. L2 $ 4,159,724

Synergy Business Solutions Inc. L3 $ -

Synergy Business Solutions Inc. L4 $ -

Synergy Business Solutions Inc. L5 $ -

Synergy Business Solutions Inc. L6 $ -

Shop Modern Guyana L1 $ - 365,000 Caricom
Shop Modern Guyana L2 $ 5,143,000

Shop Modern Guyana L3 $ 4,912,690

Shop Modern Guyana L4 $ -

Shop Modern Guyana L5 $ -

Shop Modern Guyana L6 $ 3,910,250

MC Global Logistics Group Inc. L1 $ -

MC Global Logistics Group Inc. L2 $ 5,176,510

MC Global Logistics Group Inc. L3 $ 5,789,010

MC Global Logistics Group Inc. L4 $ -

MC Global Logistics Group Inc. L5 $ 10,050,000




MC Global Logistics Group Inc. L6 $ 4,673,680
UPSG Services Guyana L1 $ 20,862,228 | $ 1,127,726 Assuria
UPSG Services Guyana L2 $ 9,166,900
UPSG Services Guyana L3 $ 4,050,000
UPSG Services Guyana L4 $ 6,780,000
UPSG Services Guyana L5 $ 10,500,000
UPSG Services Guyana L6 $ 5,027,147




Date of Tender Opening: March 24, 2026

File Number: Ministry of Human Services & Social Security (08/2026/39) - Supply & Delivery of Diapers-Residents of Homes Lots 1-5

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fli.mh
No. Currency ) Copy | drive
Currency signed

1 |Joseph Weatherspoon Construction & Contracting Service L1 | $ 6,120,000 | $ 122,400 Caricom v v v 1 4
Joseph Weatherspoon Construction & Contracting Service L2 | $ 2,550,000 | $ 51,000
Joseph Weatherspoon Construction & Contracting Service L3 | $ 2,625,000 | $ 28,000
Joseph Weatherspoon Construction & Contracting Service 14 | $ 1,424,000 | $ 28,840
Joseph Weatherspoon Construction & Contracting Service L5 | $ 14,327,400 | $ 286,548

2 |MB Enterprise L1 $ 6,840,000 | $ 702,508 Caricom v v v 2
MB Enterprise 1.2 $ 2,850,000
MB Enterprise L3 $ 2,850,000
MB Enterprise 14 $ 1,520,000
MB Enterprise L5 $ 21,065,400

3 |UK Goods & Consultancy Services L1 $ 10,885,632 | $ 1,396,649 Assuria v v v 2
UK Goods & Consultancy Services 1.2 $ 5,220,288
UK Goods & Consultancy Services L3 $ 5,220,288
UK Goods & Consultancy Services 14 $ 3,330,624
UK Goods & Consultancy Services L5 $ 45,175,575

4 |Robust Supplies & Services L1 $ 8,208,000 | $ 164,160 Nafico v v v 2
Robust Supplies & Services L2 $ 3,420,000 | $ 68,400
Robust Supplies & Services L3 $ 3,192,000 | $ 63,840
Robust Supplies & Services 14 $ 1,824,000 | $ 36,480
Robust Supplies & Services LS $ 19,045,980 | $ 380,920




5  |Pro-Built Construction & Supply Services L1 $ 5,940,000 | § 118,800 Caricom
Pro-Built Construction & Supply Services L2 $ 2,475,000 | $ 49,500
Pro-Built Construction & Supply Services L3 $ 2,587,500 | $ 27,600
Pro-Built Construction & Supply Services L4 $ 1,380,000 | $ 27,600
Pro-Built Construction & Supply Services L5 $ 14,154,600 | § 283,092
6 |New GPC Inc L1 $ 1,669,140 | $ 900,000 Assuria
New GPC Inc L2 $ 647,850
New GPC Inc L3 $ 647,850
New GPC Inc L4 $ 344,140
New GPC Inc L5 $ 40,362,594
7 |SM Services L1 $ - No Bid Security Seen
SM Services L2 $ 2,700,000
SM Services L3 $ 1,440,000
SM Services L4 $ 1,440,000
SM Services L5 $ -
8 |Memorex Enterprise L1 $ 5,850,000 | $ 420,000 Caricom
Memorex Enterprise L2 $ 2,437,500
Memorex Enterprise L3 $ 2,437,500
Memorex Enterprise L4 $ 1,300,000
Memorex Enterprise L5 $ 8,438,070
9 |K&T Consulting L1 $ 5,400,000 | $ 487,113 Premier
K&T Consulting 1.2 $ 2,250,000
K&T Consulting L3 $ 1,200,000
K&T Consulting .4 $ 1,200,000
K&T Consulting L5 $ 11,314,584
10 |Total Healthcare Solutions Inc L1 $ 5,994,000 | $ 560,000 Premier
Total Healthcare Solutions Inc L2 $ 2,504,655




Total Healthcare Solutions Inc L3 $ 2,504,655
Total Healthcare Solutions Inc L4 $ 1,338,525
Total Healthcare Solutions Inc L5 $ 15,140,760
11 |J&G Supermarket L1 $ 6,476,400 559,618 Premier
J&G Supermarket 1.2 $ 2,698,500
J&G Supermarket L3 $ 2,698,500
J&G Supermarket 14 $ 1,439,200
J&G Supermarket L5 $ 14,668,284
12 |ARP Enterprise L1 $ 7,956,000 693,387 Caricom
ARP Enterprise 1.2 $ 3,315,000
ARP Enterprise L3 $ 3,315,000
ARP Enterprise 14 $ 1,768,000
ARP Enterprise L5 $ 18,315,360
13 |Garnet Logistics & Contracting L1 $ 5,865,480 500,000 Premier
Garnet Logistics & Contracting L.2 $ 2,443,950
Garnet Logistics & Contracting L3 $ 1,303,440
Garnet Logistics & Contracting 14 $ 1,303,440
Garnet Logistics & Contracting L5 $ 7,150,045
14 |Elite Establishments L1 $ 9,360,000 570,417 Premier
Elite Establishments L2 $ 3,700,000
Elite Establishments 1.3 $ 1,980,000
Elite Establishments 1.4 $ 1,980,000
Elite Establishments L5 $ 11,500,860
15 |King Shiv General Supplies & Enterprise L1 $ 3,412,800 289,368 Caricom
King Shiv General Supplies & Enterprise L2 $ 1,422,000
King Shiv General Supplies & Enterprise L3 $ 1,422,000
King Shiv General Supplies & Enterprise 1.4 $ 758,400
King Shiv General Supplies & Enterprise L5 $ 7,453,200




16 |R.S.R Beauty Salon L1 $ 6,156,000 536,206 Premier
R.S.R Beauty Salon 1.2 $ 2,565,000
R.S.R Beauty Salon L3 $ 2,565,000
R.S.R Beauty Salon L4 $ 1,368,000
R.S.R Beauty Salon L5 $ 14,156,310
17 |Reliance Services L1 $ 6,120,000 493,647 Premier
Reliance Services L2 $ 2,550,000
Reliance Services L3 $ 2,550,000
Reliance Services L4 $ 1,360,000
Reliance Services L5 $ 12,102,360
18 |Guybiz Establishment L1 $ 565,020 180,781 Assuria
Guybiz Establishment 1.2 $ 219,050
Guybiz Establishment L3 $ 219,050
Guybiz Establishment 1.4 $ 120,360
Guybiz Establishment L5 $ 7,915,596
19 |Green Hearth Catering Services & Imports L1 $ 792,000 469,341 Cltl?é?{s(gank
Green Hearth Catering Services & Imports L2 $ 330,000
Green Hearth Catering Services & Imports L3 $ 345,000
Green Hearth Catering Services & Imports L4 $ 188,000
Green Hearth Catering Services & Imports L5 $ 21,796,980
20 |Suri Trading L1 $ 4,346,982 370,091 Premier
Suri Trading 1.2 $ 1,811,243
Suri Trading L3 $ 1,671,875
Suri Trading L4 $ 965,996
Suri Trading L5 $ 9,708,450
21 |MS Investments L1 $ 5,720,000 479,514 Premier




MS Investments L2 $ 2,367,000
MS Investments L3 $ 2,374,500
MS Investments L4 $ 1,259,200
MS Investments L5 $ 12,017,340
22 |MARC Enterprises L1 $ 5,400,000 472,470 Nafico
MARC Enterprises 1.2 $ 2,250,000
MARC Enterprises L3 $ 2,250,000
MARC Enterprises L4 $ 1,200,000
MARC Enterprises L5 $ 12,523,500
23 |HR Distributors L1 $ 7,110,000 700,000 Assuria
HR Distributors L2 $ 2,925,000
HR Distributors L3 $ 2,925,000
HR Distributors L4 $ 1,560,000
HR Distributors L5 $ 15,929,700
24 |Clinicans Supplies & Medical Centre L1 $ 7,290,000 632,571 Assuria
Clinicans Supplies & Medical Centre 1.2 $ 3,037,500
Clinicans Supplies & Medical Centre L3 $ 3,037,500
Clinicans Supplies & Medical Centre L4 $ 1,620,000
Clinicans Supplies & Medical Centre L5 $ 16,643,550
25 |Tropic Enterprise L1 $ - Caricom
Tropic Enterprise L2 $ -
Tropic Enterprise L3 $ 4,449,200 88,984
Tropic Enterprise [ .4 $ 4,449,200 88,984
Tropic Enterprise L5 $ -
26 |S&S Services L1 $ 7,129,800 506,728 Caricom
S&S Services L2 $ 2,970,000
S&S Services L3 $ 2,970,000
S&S Services L4 $ 1,584,000




S&S Services L5 $ 10,684,380
27 |Jasper Trading Enterprise L1 $ 8,460,000 | $ 767,842 Assuria
Jasper Trading Enterprise L2 $ 3,325,000
Jasper Trading Enterprise L3 $ 3,525,000
Jasper Trading Enterprise 1.4 $ 1,880,000
Jasper Trading Enterprise L5 $ 21,002,000
28 |Meditron Inc L1 $ 5,292,000 | $ 435,360 Diamond
Meditron Inc L2 $ 2,205,000
Meditron Inc L3 $ 1,176,000
Meditron Inc L4 $ 1,176,000
Meditron Inc L5 $ 11,918,970
29 |AkamaiInc L1 $ 5,745,600 | $ 1,000,000 Caricom
Akamai Inc L2 $ 2,382,600 | $ 1,000,000
Akamai Inc L3 $ 2,382,600 | $ 1,000,000
Akamai Inc [4 $ 1,272,240 | $ 1,000,000
Akamai Inc L5 $ 7,413,397 | $ 1,000,000
30 |[Satesh Naraine L1 $ 5,724,000 | $ 520,000 Assuria
Satesh Naraine L2 $ 2,369,000
Satesh Naraine L3 $ 2,375,000
Satesh Naraine 14 $ 1,262,300
Satesh Naraine L5 $ 13,517,700
31 Isféli 1Constructlon, Consultancy Services & General Supplies $ 5.716.800 | $ 2.505.258 Premier
S&K Construction, Consultancy Services & General Supplies $ 2,372,000
Inc L2
S&K Construction, Consultancy Services & General Supplies $ 2,372,000

Inc L3




S&K Construction, Consultancy Services & General Supplies

Inc L4 $ 1,264,400
S&K Construction, Consultancy Services & General Supplies $ 25,052,580
Inc L5
32 |Paradise Food Products L1 $ 5,580,000 | $ 375,017 Diamond

Paradise Food Products L2 $ 2,325,000
Paradise Food Products L3 $ 2,340,000
Paradise Food Products L4 $ 1,252,000
Paradise Food Products L5 $ 7,253,850




Date of Tender Opening: March 24, 2026

File Number: Ministry of Human Services & Social Security (25/2026/39) - Supply & Delivery of Janitorial Supplies Lots 1-9

. . Bid Security Form of
B;lg.er Name of Bidder Bl(éi?;::::; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Iél(z:;(}l’ flif:‘s,:
Currency signed
1  |Imperial Everything L1 $ 2,408,280 | $ 1,646,884 Caricom v v v 2
1  |Imperial Everything L.2 $ 15,146,200
1 |Imperial Everything L3 $ -
1  |Imperial Everything L4 $ 8,142,700
1 |Imperial Everything L5 $ -
1 |Imperial Everything L6 $ 32,784,700
1 |Imperial Everything L7 $ 26,270,600
1 |Imperial Everything L8 $ -
1  |Imperial Everything L9 $ -
2 |Girs Enterprise L1 $ 2,536,560 v v v 2
3 SoYerelgrlty Investments Construction Services (SICS 3 1,746,346 | $ 2,782.935 Assuria v v v )
Builders) L1
3 SoYerelgrlty Investments Construction Services (SICS 3 111,270,200
Builders) L2
3 SoYerelgrlty Investments Construction Services (SICS 3 15,561,304
Builders) L3
3 SoYerelgrlty Investments Construction Services (SICS 3 10,568,905
Builders) L4
3 Sovereignty Investments Construction Services (SICS 3 i
Builders) L5
3 Sovereignty Investments Construction Services (SICS 3 i

Builders) L6




Sovereignty Investments Construction Services (SICS

3 Builders) L7 $ i
3 Sovereignty Investments Construction Services (SICS 3 ]
Builders) L8
3 Sovereignty Investments Construction Services (SICS 3 ]
Builders) L9
4 |Guybiz Establishment L1 $ 2,614,570 | $ 4,576,155 Assuria
4 |Guybiz Establishment L2 $ 68,795,898
4 |Guybiz Establishment L3 $ 16,278,300
4 |Guybiz Establishment [.4 $ 10,871,266
4 |Guybiz Establishment L5 $ 3,971,041
4 |Guybiz Establishment L6 $ 52,806,207
4 |Guybiz Establishment L7 $ 42,175,923
4 |Guybiz Establishment L8 $ 6,959,170
4 |Guybiz Establishment L9 $ 243,335,413
5 |J&G Supermarket L1 $ 1,714,238 | $ 3,764,972 Premier Ins
5 |J&G Supermarket L2 $ 63,135,902
5 |J&G Supermarket L3 $ 16,532,881
5 |J&G Supermarket L4 $ 13,773,197
5 |J&G Supermarket L5 $ 4,819,144
5 |J&G Supermarket L6 $ 39,486,523
5 |J&G Supermarket L7 $ 30,192,018
5 |J&G Supermarket L8 $ 3,897,099
5 |J&G Supermarket L9 $ 14,697,609
6 |Jasper Trading Enterprise L1 $ 4,943,450 | $ 6,996,677 Assuria
6 |Jasper Trading Enterprise L2 $ 127,651,800




6 |Jasper Trading Enterprise L3 $ 28,670,740

6 |Jasper Trading Enterprise L4 $ 20,422,130

6 |Jasper Trading Enterprise L5 $ 10,730,660

6 |Jasper Trading Enterprise L6 $ 66,831,600

6 |Jasper Trading Enterprise L7 $ 51,189,650

6 |Jasper Trading Enterprise L8 $ 11,326,590

6 |Jasper Trading Enterprise L9 $ 28,067,190

7 |MB Enterprise L1 $ 4,411,200 | $ 5,792,163 Caricom
7 |MB Enterprise L2 $ 138,703,640

7 |MB Enterprise L3 $ -

7 |MB Enterprise L4 $ 19,215,220

7 |MB Enterprise L5 -

7 |MB Enterprise L6 $ 70,766,920

7 |MB Enterprise L7 $ 56,511,180

7 |MB Enterprise L8 -

7 |MB Enterprise L9 -

8 |Regal Stationery & Computer Centre L1 $ 1,681,326 | $ 763,732 Premier Ins.
8 |Regal Stationery & Computer Centre L2 $ 17,127,346

8 [Regal Stationery & Computer Centre L3 $ -

8 |Regal Stationery & Computer Centre L4 $ 4,055,383

8 [Regal Stationery & Computer Centre L5 $ -

8 [Regal Stationery & Computer Centre L6 $ 14,884,140

8 [Regal Stationery & Computer Centre L7 $ -

8 [Regal Stationery & Computer Centre L8 $ -

8 [Regal Stationery & Computer Centre L9 $ 438,382

9 |Millennium Supplies & Distribution Inc. L1 $ 1,872,400 | $ 2,480,000 Premier Ins




9 [Millennium Supplies & Distribution Inc. L2 $ 56,539,800
9 [(Millennium Supplies & Distribution Inc. L3 $ 8,435,200
9 |Millennium Supplies & Distribution Inc. L4 $ 4,938,600
9 [Millennium Supplies & Distribution Inc. L5 $ 1,288,000
9 (Millennium Supplies & Distribution Inc. L6 $ 5,383,500
9  [Millennium Supplies & Distribution Inc. L7 $ 7,190,000
9 [Millennium Supplies & Distribution Inc. L8 $ 5,310,000
9  [Millennium Supplies & Distribution Inc. L9 $ 1,018,480
10 |Spar - Trives Enterprise L1 $ 394,680 | $ 1,280,000 Premier Ins
10 |Spar - Trives Enterprise L2 $ 14,116,040
10 |Spar - Trives Enterprise L3 $ -
10 |Spar - Trives Enterprise L4 $ 4,267,120
10 |Spar - Trives Enterprise L5 $ -
10 |Spar - Trives Enterprise L6 $ 14,420,450
10 |Spar - Trives Enterprise L7 $ -
10 |Spar - Trives Enterprise L8 $ -
10 |Spar - Trives Enterprise L9 $ 6,403,716
11 |Khalama'At Chemicals Company Inc. L1 $ 252,760 | $ 924,782 Assuria
11 |Khalama'At Chemicals Company Inc. L2 $ 15,345,200
11 |Khalama'At Chemicals Company Inc. L3 $ 6,235,456
11 |Khalama'At Chemicals Company Inc. L4 $ 2,975,056
11 |Khalama'At Chemicals Company Inc. L5 $ 2,639,056
11 |Khalama'At Chemicals Company Inc. L6 $ 5,552,000
11 |Khalama'At Chemicals Company Inc. L7 $ 4,027,520
11 |Khalama'At Chemicals Company Inc. L8 $ 2,302,318
11 |Khalama'At Chemicals Company Inc. L9 $ 6,909,744




12 |P. Ramroop & Sons L1 $ 2,386,530 | $ 2,352,822 Caricom
12 |P. Ramroop & Sons L2 $ 54,416,156

12 |P. Ramroop & Sons L3 $ 9,172,970

12 |P. Ramroop & Sons L4 $ 5,717,599

12 |P. Ramroop & Sons L5 $ 2,374,326

12 |P. Ramroop & Sons L6 $ 24,253,170

12 |P. Ramroop & Sons L7 $ 5,416,100

12 |P. Ramroop & Sons L8 $ 3,232,271

12 |P. Ramroop & Sons L9 $ 10,671,996

13 |Paradise Food Products L1 $ 2,211,730 Diamond Ins.
13 |Paradise Food Products L2 $ 61,565,360

13 |Paradise Food Products L3 $ 10,063,906

13 |Paradise Food Products L4 $ 6,640,820

13 |Paradise Food Products L5 $ 3,127,830

13 |Paradise Food Products L6 $ 24,281,255

13 |Paradise Food Products L7 $ -

13 |Paradise Food Products L8 $ -

13 |Paradise Food Products L9 $ -

14 |Memorex Enterprise L1 $ 2,804,580 | $ 4,900,000 Caricom
14 |Memorex Enterprise L2 $ 120,964,150

14 |Memorex Enterprise L3 $ 12,176,560

14 |Memorex Enterprise L4 $ 9,045,535

14 |Memorex Enterprise L5 $ 3,872,055

14 |Memorex Enterprise L6 $ 33,171,500

14 |Memorex Enterprise L7 $ 25,236,700

14 |Memorex Enterprise L8 $ 4,188,875

14 |Memorex Enterprise L9 $ 11,367,200




15 |SAJ Investments L1 $ 3,080,000 | $ 4,719,618 Assuria
15 |SAJ Investments L2 $ 78,047,400
15 |SAJ Investments L3 $ 23,668,800
15 |SAJ Investments L4 $ 15,123,100
15 |SAJ Investments L5 $ 7,937,900
15 |SAJ Investments L6 $ 46,747,100
15 |SAJ Investments L7 $ 32,957,000
15 |SAJ Investments L8 $ 5,942,440
15 |SAJ Investments L9 $ 22,477,300




Date of Tender Opening: March 24, 2026

File Number: Ministry of Health (62/2026/47) - Supply & Delivery of Long Lasting Insecticide Nets

. . Bid Security Form of
B;lg.er Name of Bidder Bl(éi?;::::; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Igzll;(; flif:‘s,:
Currency signed
1 S&K Constmctlon, Consultancy Services & General 138,076,800 2.761.536 | Premier Insurance v v v )
Supplies Inc.
2 |Crystal Lam Designs Lot 1 90,299,058 2,944,735 | DemeraraFire & o, v 1| 2
fystal La esigns Lo o o General Insurance

2 |Crystal Lam Designs Lot 2 184,052,863 5,487,038

3  [Meditron Inc 106,476,000 2,129,520 |Diamond Insurance| v v 2
4 |MS Investments 130,720,000 2,614,400 | Premier Insurance v v v 2
5 |RSR Beauty Salon 45,600,000 912,000 | Premier Insurance v v v 2
6 |Millennium Supplies and Distribution Inc. 101,080,000 2,817,320 | Premier Insurance | v v v 2
7 |Guybiz Establishment 231,040,000 4,620,800 Assuria v v v 2
8 |New GPC Inc. 107,068,800 2,200,000 Assuria v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 24, 2026

File Number: Ministry of Health (63/2026/47) - Supply & Delivery of Vehicles

. . Bid Security Form of
B;lg.er Name of Bidder Bl(éi?;::::; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Iél(z:;(}l’ flif:‘s,:
Currency signed
1  |Marics and Company Ltd $ 5,180,000 | $ 103,600 Assuria v v v 2
2 |Alliance Investments $ 38,000,000 | $ 760,000 Premier v v v 2
3 |Beharry Automotive Ltd $ 75,400,000 | $ 1,508,000 Nafico v v v 2
4 |BM Soat Auto Sale $ 78,900,000 | $ 1,578,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |Jumbo Jet Auto Sales $ 32,000,000 | $ 640,000 Premier v v v 2
6 |Car Clean Enterprise $ 53,100,000 $ 1,500,000 Ha“dTr‘lIl‘stHand v |V v 2
7 |MD Auto Imports $ 81,900,000 | $ 1,640,000 Premier v v v 2
8 S&K Construc.tlon and Consultancy Services and S 87.010,000 | $ 1,740,200 Premier v v v )
General Supplies

9 |Massy Motors (Guyana) Ltd $ 9,100,000 | $ 182,000 CG United v v v 2
10 |MS Investments $ 82,600,000 | $ 1,652,000 Premier v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 24, 2026

File Number: Environmental Protection Agency (63/2026/01) - Supply & Delivery of Computer Equipment

Bid Security

Form of

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Flz.lsh
No. Currency Agency . Copy| drive
Currency signed

1 |KM Technology $ 14,957,756 | $ 299,155 Diamond Ins v v v 2
2 |SKM Pharmaceuticals $ 11,350,000 | $ 230,000 Assuria v v v 2
3 |ZoonInc. $ 14,942,930 | $ 287,004 | RBL (Cheque) v v v 2
4 |Promotech Inc. $ 10,216,541 | $ 300,000 Premier Ins. X v v 1
5 |MAEC Enterprises $ 19,341,700 | $ 386,834 Assuria v v v 2
6 |Digital Technology Inc. $ 19,407,600 | $ 388,152 Assuria v v v 2
7 |Nationwide Imports $ 20,729,621 | $ 20,729,621 Caricom v v v 2
8 |PBS Technologies (Guyana) Inc. $ 25,319,444 | $ 506,389 Premier Ins. v v v 2
9 |Western Scientific Co. Ltd US$83,827.76 | $ 735,000 Premier Ins. v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 24, 2026

File Number: Environmental Protection Agency (64/2026/01) - Supply & Delivery of One (1) Wagon Car

Bidder Name of Bidder S Cumeney licfnsg B Security Ageney | GRA | NIS 2@‘2: Hard | Flash
1 |BM Soat Auto Sales $ 2,400,000 | $ 48,000 Caricom v v v 1
2 |Beharry Automotive Limited $ 6,900,000 | $ 138,000 Nafico v v v 2
3 |Adventra Transportation $ 4,000,000 | $ 80,000 RBL Cheque v v v 2
4 |RM Servicing Centre $ 3,000,000 | $ 60,000 Caricom X X v 2
5 |Massy Motors (Guyana) Ltd $ 4,000,000 | $ 100,000 CG United v v v 2
6 |Ideal Autos Inc. $ 6,580,000 | $ 131,600 Nafico v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 24, 2026

File Number: National Agricultural Research & Extension Institute (92/2026/21) - Supply & Delivery of 8000 Tons of Rock Armour to Riverstown

. . Bid Security Form of
B;lg.er Name of Bidder Bl(éi?;::::; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Igzll;(; flif:‘s,:
Currency signed
1 |Deed Ventures Inc. $ 56,800,000 | $ 1,136,000 Assuria v v v 2
2 |L.B Contracting & Machinery Rental $ 63,600,000 | $ 1,440,000 Assuria v v v 2
3 |Toolsie Persaud Quarries Incorporated $ 64,000,000 | $ 1,500,000 Caricom v v v 2
4 |I&M Shipping Inc $ 56,000,000 | § 1,120,000 | DemeraraFire & v 2
General
5 |Atlantic Construction and Engineering Service $ 100,000,000 | $ 2,000,000 Assuria v v v 0
6 |K. Ramdial Construction and Services $ 148,000,000 | $ 2,960,000 Caricom v v v 2
7  |Midnight Trucking & Heavy Services & Construction $ 160,000,000 | $ 3,200,000 Premier v v v 1
8 |BK International Inc. $ 60,000,000 | $ 1,200,000 Nafico v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 24, 2026

File Number: National Agricultural Research & Extension Institute (93/2026/21) - Construction of 195 Rubble Mound Groyne along the Foreshores of Aberdeen/Three Friends

. . Bid Securit Form of
B;lg.er Name of Bidder Bl(éi?;::::; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Igzll;(; flif:‘s,:
Currency signed
1 |BK International Inc. $ 234,381,240 | $ 1,900,000 Nafico v v v 2
2 | Atlantic Construction & Engineering Service $ 186,900,000 | $ 1,900,000 Assuria v v v 2
3 |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 94,980,000 | $ 1,900,000 Caricom v v v 2
4 |IB Contracting & Machinery Rental $ 83,100,000 | $ 1,900,000 Assuria v v v 2
5 |Karnassa Investment Inc. $ 94,755,000 | $ 1,900,000 Caricom v v v 2
6 |R&N Construction Services $ 82,100,000 | $ 1,900,000 Assuria v v v 2
7  |Kraft Innovation Momentum Inc. $ 186,100,000 | $ 1,900,000 Nafico v v v 2
8 |S. Maraj Contracting Services $ 158,175,000 | $ 1,900,000 Caricom v v v 2
9 |Midnight Trucking & Heavy Services & Construction $ 202,325,000 | $ 1,900,000 Premier Ins v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 24, 2026

File Number: Ministry of Agriculture (94/2026/21) - Procurement of Fencing Materials Lot 1: Barbed Wires Lot 2: Smooth Wires

Bid Security

Form of

Bil;lg.er Name of Bidder Bi(éi?;::::; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Iél(z:;(}l’ flif:‘s,:
Currency signed

1 |Alliance Investments L1 6,906,427 | $ 138,129 Premier Ins v v v 2
Alliance Investments L2 2,969,804 | $ 59,396

5 S&K Constmctlon, Consultancy Services & General 9,044,000 | $ 180,880 Premier Ins v v v )
Supplies L1
S&K Constmctlon, Consultancy Services & General 4,448,000 | $ $8.960
Supplies L2

3 |Prospectra Solutions L1 10,203,000 | $ 179,000 | DemeraraFire& 1 |, v 2

General

Prospectra Solutions L2 9,986,400 | $ 175,200

4 |Guybiz Establishment L1 9,576,000 | $ 191,520 Assuria v v v 2
Guybiz Establishment .2 4,800,000 | $ 96,000

5 |MB Enterprise L1 14,560,000 | $ 166,400 Caricom v v v 1
MB Enterprise L2 8,320,000 | $ 291,200

6 |General Supplies (Guyana) (GENSUP) L1 9,350,000 | $ 187,000 Assuria v v v 2
General Supplies (Guyana) (GENSUP) L2 9,150,000 | $ 183,000

7 |Jasper Trading Enterprise L1 21,280,000 | $ 668,800 Assuria v v v 2




‘Jasper Trading Enterprise L2 ‘ $ 12,160,000




Date of Tender Opening: March 24, 2026

File Number: Ministry of Agriculture (95/2026/21) - Supply & Delivery of Equipment Lots 1-3

Bid Security

Form of

Bil;lg.er Name of Bidder Bi(éi?;::::; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Iél(z:;(}l’ gf:‘slg
Currency signed

1 |Marics & Company L1 $ 4,365,250 | $ 210,372 Assuria v v v 2
Marics & Company L2 $ -
Marics & Company L3 $ 6,153,340

5 S&K Constmctlon, Consultancy Services & General 3 8,433,400 | $ 480,612 Premier Ins v v v )
Supplies Inc. L1
S&K Constmctlon, Consultancy Services & General 3 9.187.200
Supplies Inc. L2
S&K Constmctlon, Consultancy Services & General 3 6,410,000
Supplies Inc. L3

3 |Fit- It Depot L1 $ 6,030,000 | $ 300,000 Premier Ins. v v v 2
Fit - It Depot L2 $ 6,027,000
Fit - It Depot L3 $ 5,080,000

4 |Meditron Inc. L1 $ 1,461,480 | $ 114,969 Diamond v v v 2
Meditron Inc. L2 $ 1,789,344
Meditron Inc. L3 $ 2,190,900

5 |MB Enterprise L1 $ 7,000,000 | $ 140,000 Caricom v v v 2
MB Enterprise 1.2 $ 9,360,000 | $ 187,200
MB Enterprise L3 $ 6,900,000 | $ 138,000




Nationwide Imports L1 2,146,800 | $ 2,146,800 Caricom
Nationwide Imports L2 2,321,610 | $ 2,321,610

Nationwide Imports L3 2,827,680 | $ 2,827,680

Guybiz Establishment L1 6,600,000 | $ 132,000 Assuria
Guybiz Establishment L2 7,650,000 | $ 153,000

Guybiz Establishment L3 3,820,000 | $ 76,400

2020 FMCG Inc L1 4,591,710 | $ 102,400 RBL
2020 FMCG Inc L2 5,454,865 | $ 121,600

2020 FMCG Inc L3 4,664,430 | $ 104,000




Date of Tender Opening: March 24, 2026

File Number: Ministry of Agriculture (96/2026/21) - Supply & Delivery of New Equipment Lot 1-Aluminum Boat Lot 2-Outboard Engines

Bid Security

Form of

Bil;lg.er Name of Bidder Bi(éi?;::::; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Iél(z:;(}l’ flif:‘s,:
Currency signed

1 S&K Construc.tlon and Consultancy Services and 5,300,000 393,710 Premier v v v )
General Supplies Lot 1
S&K Construc.tlon and Consultancy Services and 19,685,475
General Supplies Lot 2

2 |Ecologix Solutions Inc. Lot 2 13,900,000 v v v 2

3 |Marics & Company Ltd Lot 2 9,260,000 185,212 Assuria v v v 2

4 |General Equipment Guyana Ltd Lot 1 2,942,000 204,598 Assuria v v v 2
General Equipment Guyana Ltd Lot 2 6,876,000

5 |General Marine Company Lot 1 4,810,000 150,000 Premier v v v 2
General Marine Company Lot 2 9,114,504 200,000

6 |Vick's Services and Supply Lot 1 4,959,000 100,000 Diamond v v v 2
Vick's Services and Supply Lot 2 11,125,400 220,000

- E;?il? Boat Building, Construction and General Supplies 2,100,000 v v v )
K&K Boat Building, Construction and General Supplies 11,443,000 228.860
Lot 2

8 |Farm Supplies Lot 1 2,500,000 50,000 Assuria v v v 2
Farm Supplies Lot 2 6,900,000 138,000




9 |Westzde Marine Inc. Lot 1 $ 10,000,000 | $ 200,000 Assuria
Westzde Marine Inc. Lot 2 $ 10,000,000

10 |Guybiz Establishment Lot 1 $ 3,200,000 | $ 640,000 Assuria
Guybiz Establishment Lot 2 $ 10,415,000 | $ 272,300




Date of Tender Opening: March 24, 2026

File Number: Regional Democratic Council Region #8 (01/2026/78) - Supply & Delivery of One (1) New Dump Truck, Region #8

. . Bid Security Form of
B;lg.er Name of Bidder Bl(éi?;::::; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Iél(z:;(}l’ flif:‘s,:
Currency signed
1 |FH Computer & General Merchandise $ 14,990,000 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
2 |Car Clean Enterprise $ 9,600,000 | $ 100,000 Hand In Hand v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 24, 2026

File Number: Regional Democratic Council Region #8 (02/2026/78) - Supply & Delivery of One (1) New Mini Excavator

. . Bid Security Form of
B;lg.er Name of Bidder Bl(éi?;::::; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Iél(z:;(}l’ flif:‘s,:
Currency signed
1 |Car clean Enterprise $ 7,700,000 | $ 100,000 | Hand In Hand v v v 2
2 |FH Computer & General Merchandise $ 10,999,000 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 24, 2026

File Number: Regional Democratic Council Region #8 (03/2026/78) - Supply & Delivery of One (1) New All-Terrain Ambulance, Region #8

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount &  |Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS | Tender |H2rd| Flash
No. Currency ) Copy | drive
Currency signed
1 |FH Computer & General Merchandise No Su;)fé;er s bid $ 100,000.00 Assuria v v v 2
2 |Car clean Enterprise $ 16,100,000.00| $ 100,000.00 | Hand In Hand v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 24, 2026

File Number: Guyana Water Inc (14/2026/34) - Installation of Water Supply System at Monkey Mountain Secondary School

Bid Security

Form of

Bil;lg.er Name of Bidder Bi(éi?;::::; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Igzll;(; flif:‘s,:
Currency signed
1  |Eco Build Development $ 26,309,000 | $ 526,180 Nafico v v v 2
2 |Built Right Construction Services $ 28,990,000 | $ 579,800 Nafico v v v 2
3  |Fazam Future Builders $ 38,860,000 | $ 720,000 Caricom v v v 2
4 |Fabra Enterprise Inc. $ 35,000,000 | $ 700,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |Urban Road Builders $ 32,376,000 | $ 647,520 Nafico v v v 2
6 |Expert Builders & Supplies Contractors $ 35,560,000 | $ 711,200 Premier v v v 2
7 |Monarch Investments $ 33,990,000 | $ 800,000 Premier Ins. v v v 2
8 |Kanuku Builders & Suppliers Contractors $ 35,810,000 | $ 716,200 Caricom v v v 2
9 |C. Jorree Farming & Contracting Services $ 32,585,000 | $ 720,000 Premier Ins. v v v 2
10 |Proconstruct Solutions $ 25,410,000 | $ 508,200 Nafico v v v 2
11 |Manohar Services $ 35,976,000 | $ 719,520 Assuria v v v 2
12 |Faldhari Singh & Son Construction $ 28,999,000 | $ 700,000 Assuria v v v 2
13 |CK Construction & Transportation Services Inc. $ 35,380,000 | $ 720,000 Assuria v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 24, 2026

File Number: Guyana Water Inc (15/2026/34) - Installation of Water Supply System at Jawalla Secondary School

. . Bid Securit Form of
B;lg.er Name of Bidder Bl(éi?;::::; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Igzll;(; flif:‘s,:
Currency signed

1  |Kanuku Builders & Suppliers Contractors $ 39,710,000 | $ 794,200 Premier v v v 2
2 |OG's General Service $ 33,640,000 | $ 672,800 Caricom v v v 2
3 |Expert Builders & Supplies Contractors $ 39,810,000 | $ 796,200 Premier v v v 2
4 |Fazam Future Builders $ 33,690,000 | $ 700,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |Monarch Investments $ 33,990,000 | $ 800,000 Premier v v v 1
6 |Built Right Construction Services $ 28,990,000 | $ 579,800 Nafico v v v 2
7 |Kallco Guyana Inc $ 203,987,080 | $ 4,079,681 Caricom v v v 2
8 |C. Jorree Farming & Contracting Services $ 31,585,000 | $ 700,000 Premier v v v 2
9 |Fabra Enterprise Inc $ 35,000,000 | $ 700,000 Caricom v v v 2
10 |Manohar Services $ 35,076,000 | $ 701,520 Assuria v v v 2
11 |Eco Build Development $ 27,394,000 | $ 547,880 Nafico v v v 2
12 |Proconstruct Solutions $ 25,410,000 | $ 508,200 Nafico v v v 2
13 |Urban Road Builders $ 32,376,000 | $ 647,520 Nafico v v v 2
14 |Vintage Express GY $ 29,750,000 | $ 595,000 Nafico v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 24, 2026

File Number: Guyana Water Inc (16/2026/34) - Drilling of Potable Water Well & Rehabilitation of Fences at Lethem

. . Bid Securit Form of
B;lg.er Name of Bidder Bl(éi?;::::; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Igzll;(; flif:‘s,:
Currency signed
1 |K. Tularam Construction $ 74,000,000 | $ 1,480,000 Premier v v v 2
2 |Supreme Construction & Transportation $ 86,270,000 | $ 1,500,000 Premier v v v 2
3  |Pro Construct Solutions $ 60,710,000 | $ 1,214,200 Nafico v v v 2
4  |Built Right Construction Services $ 56,170,000 | $ 1,213,400 Nafico v v v 2
5 |Eco Build Development $ 60,500,000 | $ 1,210,000 Nafico v v v 2
6 |Urban Road Builders $ 62,220,000 | $ 1,244,400 Nafico v v v 2
7 |Fazam Future Builders $ 74,390,000 | $ 1,560,000 Caricom v v v 2
8 |NK Engineering Services $ 68,060,000 | $ 1,560,000 Caricom v v v 2
9 |Kanuku Builders & Suppliers Contractors $ 79,000,000 | $ 1,580,000 Premier v v v 2
10 |Kallco Guyana Inc $ 88,650,000 | $ 1,173,000 Caricom v v v 2
11 |Raising Transportation & Construction $ 70,890,000 | $ 1,147,809 Nafico v v v 2
12 |Faldhari Singh & Son Contracting Services $ 69,900,000 | $ 1,500,000 Assuria v v v 2
13 |Monarch Investment $ 76,920,000 | $ 1,600,000 Premier v v v 2
14 |Zeebo & Sons Construction Inc $ 69,815,000 | $ 1,560,000 Premier v v v 1
15 |Expert Builders & Supplies Contractkrs $ 79,120,000 | $ 1,582,400 Premier v v v 2
16 |C. Jorree Farming & Contracting Services $ 72,340,000 | $ 1,560,000 Premier v v v 2
17 |CK Construction & Transportation Services $ 76,365,000 | $ 1,560,000 Assuria v v v 0
18 |Manohar Services $ 87,060,000 | $ 1,157,800 Assuria v v v 1
19 |SAAM General Contracting $ 75,630,000 | $ 1,600,000 Premier v v v 1




Date of Tender Opening: March 24, 2026

File Number: Guyana Water Inc (17/2026/34) - Installation of Water Supply System at Kopinang Secondary School

Form of

Bidder . Bid Amount & Bid Security . . Hard | Flash

No. Name of Bidder Currency Amount & Currency Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Iiegl:l(::? Copy | drive
1 |0.G's General Service $ 33,740,000 | $ 674,800 Caricom v v v 2
2 [Monarch Investments $ 34,990,000 | $ 760,000 Premier Ins. v v v 1
3  |Expert Builders & Supplies Contractors $ 35,810,000 | $ 716,200 Premier Ins. v v v 2
4  |Kanuku Builders & Suppliers Contractors $ 35,560,000 | $ 711,200 Premier Ins. v v v 2
5 |Expertedge Consultancy $ 30,630,000 | $ 612,600 Caricom v v v 2
6 |Manohar Services $ 36,076,000 | $ 721,500 Assuria v v v 2
7 |C.Jorree Farming & Contracting Services $ 32,585,000 $ 720,000 Premier Ins. v v v 2
8 |Rynia's Water Depo $ 30,786,000 | $ 615,720 Nafico v v v 2
9 |Urban Road Builders $ 32,376,000 | $ 647,520 Nafico v v v 2
10 |Eco Build Development $ 25,686,000 | $ 513,720 Nafico v v v 2
11 |Fazam Future Builders $ 39,940,000 | $ 720,000 Caricom v v v 2
12 |Proconstruct Solutions $ 25,410,000 | $ 521,150 Nafico v v v 2
13 |Built Right Construction Services $ 28,990,000 | $ 579,800 Nafico v v v 2
14 |CK Construction & Transportation Services Inc. $ 35,380,000 | $ 720,000 Assuria v v v 2
15 |Kallco Guyana Inc. $ 188,760,000 | $ 3,775,200 Caricom v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 24, 2026

File Number: Guyana Water Inc (18/2026/34) - Drilling of Potable Water Well & Rehabilitation Works at Salbora Catchment in Mahdia

Bid Security

Form of

B;lg.er Name of Bidder Bl(éi?;::::; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Igzll;(; flif:‘s,:
Currency signed

1 |Fazam Furture Builders $ 47,090,000 | $ 1,040,000 Caricom v v v 2
2 |Eco Build Development $ 38,686,000 | $ 773,720 Nafico v v v

3 |Built Right Construction Services $ 44,911,000 | $ 898,220 Nafico v v v 2
4  |Proconstruct Solutions $ 40,590,000 | $ 811,800 Nafico v v v 2
5 |Urban Road Builders $ 47,603,620 | $ 952,072 Nafico v v v 2
6 |Expert Builders & Supplies Contractors $ 49,730,000 | $ 994,600 Premier v v v

7 |Sawakram Construction $ 44,710,000 v v v 2
8 |Kallco Guyana Inc. $ 127,250,000 | $ 2,545,000 Caricom v v v 2
9 |Faldhari Singh & Son Contracting Services $ 49,500,000 | $ 1,000,000 Assuria v v v 2
10 |Kanuku Builders & Suppliers Contractors $ 49,630,000 | $ 992,600 Premier v v v 2
11 |C. Jorree Farming & Contracting Services $ 46,720,000 | $ 1,040,000 Premier v v v 2
12 |King Kong Constructions $ 48,128,000 | $ 962,560 Premier v v v

13 |Expertedge Consultancy $ 44,370,000 v v v 2
14 |Manohar Services $ 57,890,000 | $ 1,741,200 Assuria v v v

15 |Supreme Construction an Transportation $ 52,190,000 | $ 1,600,000 Premier v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 24, 2026

File Number: Guyana Water Inc (19/2026/34)- Installation of Water Supply System at Infrastructure Development in Mabaruma

Bisg.er Name of Bidder Bi((ifl?l:‘l::cn; & l?g%;;;::gy Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS E‘EI:E{? Igf:;‘; 'S'j:ji‘
1 |Kanuku Builders & Suppliers Contractors $ 33,740,000 | $ 3,042,600 Premier Ins v v v 2
2 |DJ General Construction & Supplies $ 88,268,988 | $ 1,765,380 Premier Ins. v v v 2
3  |Supreme Construction & Transportation $ 74,546,000 | $ 1,600,000 Premier Ins v v v 2
4 |Kallco Guyana Inc. $ 200,950,000 | $ 4,019,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |HUB Construction $ 68,402,280 No Bid Security Seen v X v 2
6 |Manohar Services $ 117,270,000 | $ 2,500,000 Assuria v v v 2
7 |Expert Builders & Supplies Contractors $ 152,380,000 | $ 3,047,600 Premier Ins v v v 2
8 |Urban Road Builders $ 67,450,000 | $ 1,349,000 Nafico v v v 2
9 |Proconstruct Solutions $ 62,249,000 | $ 1,244,980 Nafico v v v 2
10 |C. Jorree Farming & Contracting Services $ 91,185,000 | $ 1,500,000 Premier Ins v v v 2
11 |Fazam Future Builders $ 64,311,000 | $ 1,500,000 Caricom v v v 2
12 |Monarch Investments $ 85,580,000 | $ 1,100,000 Premier Ins v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 24, 2026

File Number: Guyana Defence Force (48/2026/53) - Construction of Southern Perimeter Fence, Base Camp Ayanganna

. . Bid Securit Form of
B;lg.er Name of Bidder Bl(éi?;::::; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Iél(z:;(}l’ flif:‘s,:
Currency signed
1 |Alliance Investments $ 93,169,245 | $ 1,816,385 Premier v v v 2
2 |VG's Construction Services $ 23,728,200 | $ 474,564 Caricom v v v 2
3 |R.P Construction Agency $ 39,533,590 | $ 786,972 Caricom v v v 2
4 |B.M Property Investments Inc $ 38,300,000 | $ 776,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |Innovative Development Solutions Guyana $ 35,243,900 | $ 704,878 Premier v v v 2
6 |VAS Global $ 39,387,800 | $ 1,000,000 Premier v v v 2
7 |Emeralds General Contracting & Distributors $ 32,416,500 | $ 660,000 Premier v v v 2
8 |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 34,325,300 | $ 1,500,000 Caricom v v v 2
9 |Green Plains Enterprise $ 39,649,200 | $ 1,200,000 Caricom v v v 2
10 |D. DeSouza Contracting Services $ 42,714,820 | $ 854,296 Assuria v v v 2
11 |Westbrook Caribbean Inc $ 34,951,900 | $ 1,500,000 Caricom v v v 2
12 |Blue Print Builders Inc $ 41,554,000 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
13 |JAF Enterprise $ 39,693,900 | $ 793,878 Assuria v v v 2
14 |Rishma & Sisters Enterprise $ 27,165,400 | $ 543,308 Premier v v v 2
15 |L. Pool Civil Works $ 32,329,000 | $ 646,580 Premier v v v 2
16 |D. Chowkai & Sons Construction $ 64,950,000 | $ 12,999,000 Caricom v v v 2
17 |P&N International $ 35,338,000 | $ 766,000 Premier v v v 2
18 |Urban Edge Builders $ 40,737,500 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
19 |Ayeno Hatton Construction Company $ 43,799,590 | $ 876,000 Caricom v v v 2
20 |STP Investments Inc $ 71,513,900 | $ 1,430,278 Premier v v v 2
21 |Memorex Enterprise $ 33,734,250 | $ 800,000 Caricom v v v 2
22 |Grace Enterprise Guyana Inc $ 37,226,400 | $ 744,528 Nafico v v v 2
23 |Metal & Fabrication Ink $ 33,210,560 | $ 700,000 Caricom v v v 2
24 |Mobile Construction Company $ 37,812,000 | $ 571,408 Caricom v v v 2
25 |Lisa Benn Contracting Services $ 26,596,500 | $ 531,930 Assuria v v v 1
26 |ACL Construction Guyana $ 38,004,000 | $ 760,000 Nafico v v v 2




27 |Holistic Contracting & Procurement Inc $ 67,835,500 | $ 1,356,710 Caricom v v v 2
28 |M&D Investments $ 49,763,600 | $ 995,272 Assuria v v v 2
29 |Surujpaul Balkaran & Sons Construction Not Completed | $ 851,553 Premier v v X 2
30 |Dundas Construction Inc $ 37,403,400 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
31 |Garnet Logistics & Contracting $ 32,110,500 | $ 680,000 | Premier v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 24, 2026

File Number: Guyana Defence Force (49/2026/53) - Rehabilitation of Troop Accomodation & Offices-31 SF Squadron, Base Camp Stephenson

Bid Security

Form of

Bil;lg.er Name of Bidder Bi(éi?;::::; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Igzll;(; flif:‘s,:
Currency signed
1 |Diversity Investments Inc. $ 47,803,700 | $ 956,074 Caricom v v v 2
2 |Vas Global $ 46,534,720 | $ 1,200,000 Premier Ins. v v v 2
3 |BM Property Investments Inc. $ 52,800,000 | $ 1,056,000 Caricom v v v 2
4 |P&N International $ 51,100,000 | $ 1,056,000 Premier Ins. v v v 2
5 |Innovative Development Solution Guyana ( IDSGY) $ 47,606,150 | $ 952,123 Premier Ins. v v v 2
6 |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 48,573,150 | $ 3,000,000 Assuria v v v 2
7 |D. De Souza Contracting Services $ 49,441,800 | $ 988,836 Assuria v v v 2
8 |R. P Construction Agency $ 48,999,200 | $ 979,965 Caricom v v v 2
9 |FNS Investments $ 47,148,520 | $ 942,970 Caricom v v v 2
10 |Valiant Industrial Service $ 48,191,700 | $ 963,334 Caricom v v v 2
11 |Metal & Fabrication Ink $ 46,060,550 | $ 2,400,000 Caricom v v v 2
12 |D. Chowkai & Sons Construction $ 56,222,500 | $ 1,124,450 Caricom v v v 2
13 |Grace Enterprise Guyana Inc $ 54,486,200 | $ 700,000 Nafico v v v 2
14 |STP Investments Inc. $ 48,768,600 | $ 975,372 Premier Ins. v v v 2
15 |[Seenarine's Construction & Landscaping Services $ 50,920,700 | $ 1,040,000 Caricom v v v 2
16 |M&D Investments $ 57,408,240 | $ 1,148,164 Assuria v v v 1
17 |Emeralds General Contracting & Distributors $ 45,989,400 | $ 940,000 Premier Ins. v v v 2
18 |L. Pool Civil Works $ 127,664,220 | $ 553,284 Premier Ins. v v v 2
19 |Holistic Contracting & Procurement Inc. $ 58,368,300 | $ 1,167,366 Caricom v v v 2
20 |Garnet Logistics & Contracting $ 45,502,200 | $ 940,000 Premier Ins. v v v 2
21 |Westbrook Caribbean Inc. $ 41,878,620 | $ 1,700,000 Caricom v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 24, 2026

File Number: Guyana Defence Force (50/2026/53) - Construction of Wos & SNCOs Accomodation-Base Camp Seweyo

Bid Security

Form of

Bil;lg.er Name of Bidder Bi(éi?;::::; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Igzll;(; flif:‘s,:
Currency signed
1 |Andrect Engineering & Construction Signed but not $ 4,000,000 Caricom v v v 2
completed
2 |Green Plains Enterprise $ 180,309,600 | $ 3,700,000 Caricom v v v 2
3 |D. De Souza Contracting Services $ 252,000,000 | $ 5,040,000 Assuria v v v 2
4  |Jaf Enterprise $ 248,640,700 | $ 4,972,814 Assuria v v v 1
5 |Blue Print Builders Inc. $ 204,775,550 No Bid Security seen v v v 2
6 |BM Property Investments Inc. $ 235,000,000 | $ 4,700,000 Caricom v v v 2
7 |R. P Construction Agency $ 216,295,900 | $ 4,325,918 Caricom v v v 2
8 |Urban Edge Builders $ 198,391,900 | $ 4,075,511 Assuria v v v 2
9 |Vas Global $ 224,608,400 | $ 5,200,000 Premier Ins. v v v 2
10 |Metal and Fabrication Ink $ 209,410,050 | $ 4,260,000 Caricom v v v 2
11 |Valiant Industrial Service $ 227,953,900 | $ 4,559,078 Caricom v v v 2
12 |ACL Construction Guyana $ 234,865,400 | $ 4,697,308 Nafico v v v 2
13 |Dundas Construction Inc. $ 232,218,450 | $ 4,700,000 Caricom v v v 2
14 |Grace Enterprise (Guyana) Inc $ 239,851,800 | $ 4,797,036 Nafico v v v 2
15 |STP Investments Inc. $ 223,935,100 | $ 4,478,702 Premier Ins. v v v 2
16 |Emeralds General Contracting & Distributors $ 214,138,950 | $ 4,700,000 Premier Ins. v v v 1
17 |D. Chowkai & Sons Construction $ 269,690,550 | $ 5,393,811 Caricom v v v 2
18 |M&D Investments $ 248,440,360 | $ 4,968,807 Assuria v v v 2
19 |Vertex Ventures $ 215,035,950 | $ 4,800,000 Premier Ins v v v 2
20 |L. Pool Civil Works $ 231,960,500 | $ 4,633,810 Premier Ins. v v v 2
21 |Westbrook Caribbean Inc $ 183,183,950 | $ 4,600,000 Caricom v v v 2




‘ 22 ‘Holistic Contracting & Procurement Inc.

B

273,320,550 | $

5,466,411

Caricom




Date of Tender Opening: March 24, 2026

File Number: Guyana Defence Force (51/2026/53) - Construction of Outdoor GYM-1 Infantry Battalion, Base Camp Stephenson

. . i i Form of
B;’der Name of Bidder Bid Amount & l?;?nifx;ltlgy Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender |Hard Flash
0. Currency . Copy | drive
Currency signed
1  |Diversity Investments Inc $ 24,845,600 | $ 496,912 Caricom v v v 2
2 |Emeralds General Contracting & Distributors $ 27,991,900 | $ 580,000 Caricom v v v 2
3  |FNS Investments $ 24,584,500 | $ 491,691 Caricom v v v 2
4  |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 34,542,650 | $ 1,500,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |Urban Edge Builders Inc $ 30,824,625 | $ 618,412 Assuria v v v 2
6 |Blue Print Builders Inc $ 31,920,600 | $ 638,412 Assuria v v v 2
7 |D. DeSouza Contracting Services $ 26,486,750 | $ 529,735 Assuria v v v 2
8 |Fugenz Business Solutions $ 54,255,500 | $ 1,085,110 Caricom v v v 1
9 |P&N International $ 29,187,500 | $ 598,000 Premier v v v 2
10 |R.P Construction Agency $ 28,673,250 | $ 573,465 Caricom v v v 2
11 |B.M Property Investments Inc $ 29,900,000 | $ 598,000 Caricom v v v 2
12 |Innovative Development Solutions Guyana $ 27,380,500 | $ 547,610 Premier v v v 2
13 |DG Enterprise $ 28,965,000 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
14 |Seenarine's Construction $ 28,500,625 | $ 600,000 Caricom v v v 2
15 |Westbrook Caribbean Inc $ 30,965,250 | $ 1,100,000 Caricom v v v 2
16 |STP Investments Inc $ 42,152,500 | $ 843,450 Premier v v v 2
17 |D. Chowkai & Sons Construction $ 51,479,000 | $ 1,029,580 Caricom v v v 2
18 |M&D Investments $ 52,649,400 | $ 1,052,988 Assuria v v v 2
19 |Valiant Industrial Service $ 23,301,250 | $ 586,025 Caricom v v v 2
20 |Vertex Ventures $ 27,460,750 | $ 580,000 Premier v v v 1
21 |Grace Enterprise Guyana Inc $ 29,740,000 | $ 549,800 Nafico v v v 2
22 |VAS Global $ 28,031,750 | $ 600,000 Premier v v v 2
23  |Garnet Logistics & Contracting $ 28,617,550 | $ 580,000 Premier v v v 2
24 |Holistic Contracting & Procurement Inc $ 52,569,000 | $ 1,051,380 Caricom v v v 2
25 |L. Pool Civil Works $ 26,617,500 | $ 532,350 Premier v v v 2
26 |Metal & Fabrication Ink $ 37,183,300 | $ 800,000 Caricom v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 24, 2026

File Number: Guyana Defence Force (52/2026/53) - Rehabilitation of Medical Centre, Base Camp Stephenson

Bid Security

Form of

Bil;lg.er Name of Bidder Bi(éi?;::::; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Iél(z:;(}l’ flif:‘s,:
Currency signed
1  |Diversity Investments Inc. $ 29,519,300 | $ 590,386 Caricom v v v 2
2  |FNS Investments $ 28,734,000 | $ 574,680 Caricom v v v 2
3 |BM Property Investments Inc. $ 30,100,000 | $ 602,000 Caricom v v v 2
4  |Fugenz Business Solution $ 35,521,800 | $ 787,338 Caricom v v v 1
5 |Garnet Logistics & Contracting $ 25,558,100 | $ 560,000 Premier Ins. v v v 2
6 |L. Pool Civil Works $ 112,987,900 | $ 2,259,758 Premier Ins. v v v 2
7 |P&N International $ 30,100,000 | $ 602,000 Premier Ins. v v v 2
8 |R. P Construction Agency $ 27,223,150 | $ 544,663 Caricom v v v 2
9 |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 27,683,200 | $ 1,500,000 Assuria v v v 2
10 |Westbrook Caribbean Inc. $ 23,891,000 | $ 1,100,000 Caricom v v v 2
11 |Metal & Fabrication Ink $ 28,652,200 | $ 600,000 Caricom v v v 2
12 |D. Chowkai & Sons Construction $ 65,679,800 | $ 1,313,596 Caricom v v v 2
13 |Valiant Industrial Service $ 27,175,800 | $ 543,516 Caricom v v v 2
14 |STP Investments Inc. $ 30,671,500 | $ 613,430 Premier Ins. v v v 2
15 |Grace Enterprise (Guyana) Inc $ 30,026,450 | $ 600,529 Nafico v v v 2
16 |[Seenarine's Construction & Landscaping Services $ 28,898,850 No bid security v v v 1
17 |Holistic Contracting & Procurement Inc. $ 66,499,800 | $ 1,329,996 Caricom v v v 2
18 |M&D Investments $ 33,603,640 | $ 672,072 Assuria v v v 2
19 |Vas Global $ 28,782,000 | $ 640,000 Premier Ins. v v v 2
20 |Innovative Development Solution Guyana (IDSGY) $ 27,021,850 | $ 40,437 Premier Ins. v v v 2
21 |Vertex Ventures $ 26,544,860 | $ 560,000 Premier Ins. v v v 2




‘ 22 ‘Emeralds General Contracting & Distributors

B

25,997,890 | $

540,000

Premier ilns




Date of Tender Opening: March 24, 2026

File Number: Guyana Defence Force (53/2026/53) - Rehabilitation of ORs MESS Hall & Kitchen, Base Camp Ayanganna

. . Bid Securit Form of
B;lg.er Name of Bidder Bl(éi?;::::; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Igzll;(; flif:‘s,:
Currency signed
1 |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 107,433,650 | $ 3,000,000 Assuria v v v 2
2 |Grace Enterprise Guyana Inc $ 100,207,800 | $ 2,300,000 Nafico v v v 1
3 |P&N International $ 107,000,000 | $ 2,140,000 Premier v v v 2
4 |ACL Construction Guyana Not Completed | $ 1,990,346 Nafico v v v 1
5 |Holistic Contracting & Procurement Inc $ 142,560,000 | $ 2,851,200 Caricom v v v 2
6 |M&D Investments $ 125,024,440 | $ 2,500,488 Assuria v v v 2
7  |Surujpaul Balkaran & Sons Construction Not Completed $ 2,065,826 Premier v v X 2
8 |L. Pool Civil Works $ 93,483,230 | $ 1,869,665 Premier v v v 2
9 |Innovative Developent Solutions Guyana $ 99,015,400 | $ 1,980,308 Premier v v v 1
10 |Metal & Fabrication Ink $ 101,854,100 | $ 640,000 Caricom v v v 2
11 |JAF Enterprise $ 95,439,400 | $ 1,908,788 Assuria v v v 1
12 |D. DeSouza Contracting Services $ 105,058,500 | $ 2,101,170 Assuria v v v 2
13 |D. Chowkai & Sons Construction $ 137,464,000 | $ 2,749,280 Caricom v v v 2
14 |Ayeni Hatton Construction Company $ 95,000,200 | $ 1,900,000 Caricom v v v 2
15 |Emeralds General Contracting & Distributors $ 98,460,630 | $ 2,000,000 Premier v v v 1
16 |B.M Property Investment Inc $ 107,000,000 | $ 2,140,000 Caricom v v v 2
17 |Westbrook Caribbean Inc $ 99,337,210 | $ 3,240,000 Caricom v v v 2
18 |DG Enterprise $ 105,828,650 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
19 |R.P Construction Agency $ 102,185,475 | $ 2,043,809 Caricom v v v 2
20 |Mobile Construction Company $ 105,963,750 | $ 2,119,275 Caricom v v v 2
21 |STP Investments Inc $ 109,036,600 | $ 2,180,732 Premier v v v 2
22 |Diversity Investments Inc $ 102,451,500 | $ 2,049,030 Caricom v v v 2
23 |Randolph Taylor Construction $ 108,395,840 | $ 2,180,000 Premier v v v 2
24 |FNS Investments $ 100,193,320 | $ 2,003,866 Caricom v v v 2
25 |VAS Global $ 102,118,700 | $ 2,300,000 Premier v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 24, 2026

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (97/2026/21) - Supply & Delivery of Four (4) 1S0HP Tractors

Bid Security

Form of

Bisg.er Name of Bidder Bi‘éfr"r‘::c“; & Acrzzrer;tc‘;; Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS :iegr:izr Igf:;‘; 'S'j:ji‘
1 |Fix - It Depot (Game Equipment LLC) US$610,260 $ 13,870 | Synergy Bank v v v 2
2 |General Equipment Guyana Limited $ 22,000,000 | $ 444,000 Assuria v v v 2
3 |Yellow Steel Inc. $ 52,000,000 | $ 1,040,000 Assuria v v v 2
4  |Full Service Enterprise $ 297,468,580 | $ 5,949,371 Premier Ins v v v 1
5 |Massy Motors Guyana Ltd $ 110,000,000 | $ 2,200,000 CG United v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 24, 2026

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (98/2026/21) - Supply & Delivery of Lumber Required for Sluice Door

Bidder Name of Bidder S Cumeney licfnsg B Security Ageney | GRA | NIS 2@‘2: Hard | Flash

1 |Caribbean Shioyard (Guyana) Inc. $ 11,317,780 | $ 226,356 Premier Ins v v v 2
2 |Alliance Investments $ 10,343,235 | $ 206,345 Premier Ins. v v v 2
3  |Prospectra Solutions $ 12,524,620 | $ 300,034 Nafico v v v 2
4  |Supreme Wood Products $ 9,979,294 | $ 199,586 Assuria v v v 1
5 |Memorex Enterprise $ 10,504,520 | $ 240,000 Caricom v v v 2
6 |Statement Investment $ 10,010,500 | $ 1,000,000 Assuria v v v 2
7 |BD General Supplies $ 10,013,650 | $ 260,273 Assuria v v v




Date of Tender Opening: March 24, 2026

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (99/2026/21) - Acquisition of One (1) 700KW Diesel Generator

Bisg.er Name of Bidder Bi‘éfr"r‘::c“; & l%%;fﬁtlgy Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS E(:e;%{rf Igf:;‘; 'S'j:ji‘
1 |SPR Enterprises $ 24,458,132 | $ 600,000 Assuria v v v 2
2 |General Marine Company $ 66,837,719 | $ 1,500,000 Premier Ins. v v v 2
3 |UPSG Services (Guyana) Inc. $ 105,185,000 | $ 2,103,700 Assuria v v v 2
4 |RSR Beauty Salon $ 38,961,500 | $ 779,230 Premier Ins. v v v 1
5 |Akamai Inc. $ 42,657,050 | $ 1,600,000 Caricom v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 24, 2026

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (100/2026/21) - Major Overhaul of the C9 #1 Drainage Pump Caterpillar Engine

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fk}Sh
No. Currency . Copy | drive
Currency signed
1  |Machinery Corporation of Guyana Ltd $ 17,999.917.14 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 24, 2026

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (101/2026/21) - Supply & Delivery of New Stoker Links & Bars

. . Bid Security Form of
B;lg.er Name of Bidder Bl(éi?;::::; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Iél(z:;(}l’ flif:‘s,:
Currency signed
1 |Garnet Engineers US$24,888 $ 4,977 Ontario Inc. N/A | N/A v 2
2 |Electrofix Electrical Services $ 5,294976 | $ 123,000 | RBL (Cheque) v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 24, 2026

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (102/2026/21) - Supply & Delivery of Juice & Process Pumps, Motors & Starters

Bisg.er Name of Bidder Bi‘éfr"r‘g:c“; & l?g%;fngtlgy Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Egr:li{rf Igf:;‘; 'S'j:ji‘
1 |Nationwide Imports $ 27,764,920 | $ 27,764,920 Caricom v v v 2
2 |Garnet Engineers (Without option) US$98,888 $ 1,977 Ontario Inc v v v 2
Garnet Engineers (With option) US$104,888 $ 2,097




Date of Tender Opening: March 24, 2026

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (103/2026/21) - Supply & Delivery of Materials to Replace Low Grade Crystalliser & Structure

. . Bid Securit Form of
B;lg.er Name of Bidder Bl(éi?;::::; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T.ender Igzll;(; flif:‘s,:
Currency signed
1 |Garnet Engineers US$71,888 USS$1577.76 Ontario Inc. N/A | N/A v 2
2 |Caribbean Shipyard Guyana Inc. $ 15,950,000 | $ 341,040 Premier Ins. v v v 2
3 |Alliance Investments $ 15,931,700 | $ 318,634 Premier Ins. v v v 1
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