Date of Tender Opening: March 25th 2025

File Number: Ministry of Labour - Extension of Occuptional Safety & Health Department (31/2025/38)

. . Bid Security . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency Agency . Copy drive
Currency signed
1 BM Property Investments Inc. $ 31,742,200( $ 613,731 Caricom v v v 2
2 |Hoosein Logistics & Supplies Inc. $ 28,603,350| $ 572,073 Caricom v v v 1
3 Phoenix Industries $ 21,759,600 | $ 500,000 Assuria v v v 2
4 R&P Engineering & General Construction $ 20,647,800| $ 404,456 Assuria v rec v 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 14,746,340




Date of Tender Opening: March 25th 2025

File Number: Ministry of Labour - Construction of Revetment at the Ministry of Labour (30/2025/38)

. . Bid Security . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency Agency . Copy drive
Currency signed
1  |JPM's General Construction & Engineering Service $ 3,959,230 BSDP Completed & Signed v v v 2
2 |BM Property Investments Inc. $ 10,567,360 BSDP Completed & Signed v v v 2
3  |KHE Engineering Not cc;rir;[;l:(;ed nor BSDP not Completed & Signed v v X 2
4 MDSG General Services $ 4,637,750 BSDP Completed & Signed v v v 2
5 |AKP Contracting $ 3,931,280 BSDP Completed & Signed v v v 2
6 Phoenix Industries $ 5,321,000 BSDP Completed & Signed v v v 2
7  |Sovereignty Investments Construction Services $ 3,684,520 BSDP Completed & Signed v v v 2
8 ACL Construction Guyana $ 5,510,560 BSDP Completed & Signed v v v 1
9  |NSA Enterprise $ 9,962,400 BSDP Completed & Signed v v v 2
Premier 200000
Engineer's Estimate $ 4,699,240




Date of Tender Opening: March 25th 2025

File Number: Guyana Revenue Authority - Procurement of Security Service Lots 1-11 (48/2025/03)

. . Bid Security . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency Agency . Copy | drive
Currency signed

1 RK's Guyana Security Services L1 $ 17,384,571 $ 6,200,000 Premier v v v 1
1 RK's Guyana Security Services L2 $ 44,130,394

1 RK's Guyana Security Services L3 $ 20,514,583

1  |RK's Guyana Security Services L4 $ 171,613,931

1 RK's Guyana Security Services L5 $ 32,540,206

1 RK's Guyana Security Services L6 $ 95,840,028

1 RK's Guyana Security Services L7 $ 20,514,583

1 RK's Guyana Security Services L8 $ 8,915,748

1 RK's Guyana Security Services L9 $ 24,071,383

1  |RK's Guyana Security Services L10 $ 29,420,263

1 RK's Guyana Security Services L11 $ 141,928,860

1 RK's Guyana Security Services Total Lots 1-11 $ 606,874,549

2 Hoosain's Security Services Inc. L1 $ 14,702,069 | $ 3,941,050 |Caricom v v v 1
2 |Hoosain's Security Services Inc. L2 $ 37,316,359

2 Hoosain's Security Services Inc. L3 $ 31,665,105

2 |Hoosain's Security Services Inc. L4 $ 145,317,068

2 Hoosain's Security Services Inc. L5 $ 27,521,160

2 |Hoosain's Security Services Inc. L6 $ 82,544,938

2 Hoosain's Security Services Inc. L7 $ 16,963,036




2 Hoosain's Security Services Inc. L8 $ 7,548,845
2 |Hoosain's Security Services Inc. L9 $ 20,351,006
2 Hoosain's Security Services Inc. L10 $ 24,877,572
2 |Hoosain's Security Services Inc. Total 1-10 $ 394,105,089
3 |Accu Safe Security Service Inc. L1 $ 19,395,504 | $ 5,233,954 |Assuria
3 Accu Safe Security Service Inc. L2 $ 46,814,328
3 |Accu Safe Security Service Inc. L3 $ 20,355,840
3 Accu Safe Security Service Inc. L4 $ 171,897,408
3 |Accu Safe Security Service Inc. L5 $ 32,706,144
3 Accu Safe Security Service Inc. L6 $ 96,977,520
3 |Accu Safe Security Service Inc. L7 $ 23,113,728
3 Accu Safe Security Service Inc. L8 $ 10,648,512
3 |Accu Safe Security Service Inc. L9 $ 27,381,888
3 Accu Safe Security Service Inc. L10 $ 29,663,712
3 |Accu Safe Security Service Inc. L11 $ 43,440,840
3 Accu Safe Security Service Inc.- Total Lots 1-11 $ 522,395,424
4 Panther Security Service Inc. L1 $ 21,304,320 | $ 8,924,866 |Premier
4  |Panther Security Service Inc. L2 $ 53,260,800
4 Panther Security Service Inc. L3 $ 25,499,520
4  |Panther Security Service Inc. L4 $ 146,327,664
4 Panther Security Service Inc. L5 $ 39,945,600
4  |Panther Security Service Inc. L6 $ 116,508,000
4 Panther Security Service Inc. L7 $ 29,401,056
4  |Panther Security Service Inc. L8 $ 12,014,460
4 Panther Security Service Inc. L9 $ 33,953,760
4  |Panther Security Service Inc. L10 $ 35,951,040
4 Panther Security Service Inc. L11 $ 378,320,400
4 Panther Security Service Inc. Total Lots 1-11 $ 892,486,620




S [Nel Global Security Company Inc L1 $ 15,170,800 | $ 4,404,060 Assuria
5 |Nel Global Security Company Inc L2 $ 38,005,200
S [Nel Global Security Company Inc L3 $ 17,004,000
5 |Nel Global Security Company Inc L4 $ 154,366,800
S [Nel Global Security Company Inc L5 $ 28,621,200
5 |Nel Global Security Company Inc L6 $ 80,546,000
S [Nel Global Security Company Inc L7 $ 17,004,000
5 |Nel Global Security Company Inc L8 $ 6,881,800
S [Nel Global Security Company Inc L9 $ 20,332,000
5 |Nel Global Security Company Inc L10 $ 10,322,400
S [Nel Global Security Company Inc L11 $ 52,152,000
5 |Nel Global Security Company Inc - Total Lots 1-11 | $ 440,406,000
6 Strategic Action SecurityLimited L1 $ 14,581,512 | $ 4,321,035 Nafico
Strategic Action SecurityLimited L2 $ 36,899,064
Strategic Action SecurityLimited L3 $ 16,621,200
Strategic Action SecurityLimited L4 $ 144,998,424
Strategic Action SecurityLimited L5 $ 27,344,952
Strategic Action SecurityLimited L6 $ 79,544,160
Strategic Action SecurityLimited L7 $ 16,621,200
Strategic Action SecurityLimited L8 $ 7,272,288
Strategic Action SecurityLimited L9 $ 20,035,728
Strategic Action SecurityLimited L.10 $ 24,599,376
Strategic Action SecurityLimited .11 $ 43,585,620
Strategic Action SecurityLimited - Total Lots $ 432,103,524
7  |Amalgamated Security Services Guyana Inc L11 $ 42,101,283 | $ 421,013 Assuria
8 Elite Protection Services Inc L1 $ 23,892,120 | $ 6,583,924 Premier
Elite Protection Services Inc L2 $ 58,839,048
Elite Protection Services Inc L3 $ 23,978,304




Elite Protection Services Inc L4 $ 249,521,376
Elite Protection Services Inc L5 $ 44,693,472
Elite Protection Services Inc L6 $ 116,489,760
Elite Protection Services Inc L7 $ 24,692,400
Elite Protection Services Inc L8 $ 8,844,576
Elite Protection Services Inc L9 $ 30,383,280
Elite Protection Services Inc L10 $ 39,226,032
Elite Protection Services Inc L11 $ 37,832,040
Elite Protection Services Inc -Total Lots $ 658,392,408
9 Sheriff Security Inc L1 $ 16,162,920 | $ 4,350,373 Assuria
Sheriff Security Inc L2 $ 38,791,008
Sheriff Security Inc L3 $ 17,121,888
Sheriff Security Inc L4 $ 146,417,040
Sheriff Security Inc L5 $ 27,762,192
Sheriff Security Inc L6 $ 81,765,360
Sheriff Security Inc L7 $ 18,738,864
Sheriff Security Inc L8 $ 9,127,296
Sheriff Security Inc L9 $ 22,437,936
Sheriff Security Inc L10 $ 25,100,064
Sheriff Security Inc L11 $ 31,612,770
Sheriff Security Inc - Total Lots $ 435,037,338
10  [Atlas Security Services Inc L1 $ 13,911,803 | $ 6,275,747 Nafico
Atlas Security Services Inc L2 $ 35,675,169
Atlas Security Services Inc L3 $ 19,743,286
Atlas Security Services Inc L4 $ 134,049,071
Atlas Security Services Inc L5 $ 25,879,778
Atlas Security Services Inc L6 $ 78,896,892
Atlas Security Services Inc L7 $ 16,423,606
Atlas Security Services Inc L8 $ 7,775,311




Atlas Security Services Inc L9 $ 19,743,286
Atlas Security Services Inc L10 $ 23,783,446
Atlas Security Services Inc L11 $ 247,374,300
Atlas Security Services Inc - Total Lots $ 623,255,948
11  |Queensway Security Service Inc L1 $ 25,784,885 | $ 5,975,000 Premier
Queensway Security Service Inc L2 $ 65,370,974
Queensway Security Service Inc L3 $ 23,912,367
Queensway Security Service Inc L4 $ 210,004,003
Queensway Security Service Inc L5 $ 38,996,891
Queensway Security Service Inc L6 $ 110,100,065
Queensway Security Service Inc L7 $ 31,038,825
Queensway Security Service Inc L8 $ 13,075,527
Queensway Security Service Inc L9 $ 35,591,529
Queensway Security Service Inc L10 $ 43,580,649
Queensway Security Service Inc - Total Lots $ 597,455,715




Date of Tender Opening: March 25th 2025

File Number: Guyana Defence Force - Rehabilitation of Pirai Company Office, First Infantry Battalion (40/2025/53)

. . Bid Security . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency Agency . Copy | drive
Currency signed
1 RS & Associates 5,503,000 BSD Page Completed & Signed v v v 1
2 Valiant Industrial Service 7,160,400 BSD Page Completed & Signed v v v 2
Engineers Estimate 6,921,700




Date of Tender Opening: March 25th 2025

File Number: Office of the President - Procurement of Vehicles Lots 1-3 (48/2025/01)

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS | Tender Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency . Copy | drive
Currency signed
1 Ideal Autos Inc $ 74,000,000| $ 1,480,000 Nafico v v v 1
2 BM Soat Auto Sale $ 73,000,000| $ 50,000 Caricom L1 X X v 2
2 BM Soat Auto Sale $ 210,000 Caricom L2
2 BM Soat Auto Sale $ 1,200,000 Caricom L3
3 General Equipment Guyana Ltd $ 5,905,200 $ 118,104 GTM v v v 2
4 RRT Enterprise & Auto Sales $ 64,195,000| $ 1,283,900 Premier v v v 2
5 Beharry Automotive Ltd $ 68,359,305 v v v 2
Beharry Automotive Ltd - Vat $ 77,929,608 | $ 1,367,156 Nafico
6 Massy Motors Guyana Ltd $ 47,000,000 | $ 2,340,000 |CG United v v v 2
7 Rose Randehol Auto Sales $ 44,500,000 $ 40.000 |Diamond Insurance L1 v v v 2
7 Rose Randehol Auto Sales $ 150,000 |Diamond Insurance L2
7 Rose Randehol Auto Sales $ 700,000 |Diamond Insurance L3
8 Car Clean $ 46,400,000 | $ 800,000 |Hand in Hand v v v 2
9 Marics & Company Limited $ 38,835,000 | $ 776,700 |Assuria v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 25th 2025

File Number: Environmental Protection Agency - Construction of PAC Multipurpose Building Located in Lethem (47/2025/01)

. . Bid Security . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency Agency . Copy | drive
Currency signed
1 NP Contracting & Transportation Services $ 176,671,748 $ 2,677,500 Premier v v v 2
2 FS Construction $ 171,797,790| $ 2,570,202 Caricom v v v 2
Engineers Estimate $ 179,915,737.33




Date of Tender Opening: March 25th 2025

File Number: Guyana Water Inc - Supply and Delivery of HDPE, PVC, & DI Pipes and Fittings and Valves Lots 1-3 (63/2025/45)

. . Bid Security . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency Agency . Copy | drive
Currency signed
1 Global Industrial Procurement Services Inc L1 $ 93,373,613 1,480,500 Caricom v v v 2
2 |David Persaud Investments Ltd L1 $ 90,270,000.00 1,875,000 Diamond v v v 2
2 David Persaud Investments Ltd L3 $ 11,447,000
3 Dax Contracting Services L1 $ 137,018,000 5,000,000 Caricom v v v 1
3 Dax Contracting Services L2 $ 18,820,000 5,000,000
3 Dax Contracting Services L3 $ 21,302,000 5,000,000
4 Arrowhead Construction Inc L1 $ 71,861,613 1,350,000 Premier v v v 2
4 Arrowhead Construction Inc L2 $ 9,403,555 150,000
4 Arrowhead Construction Inc L3 $ 8,529,809 150,000
5 Arka Imports & Hardware Supplies L1 $ 86,034,400 1,290,516 Premier v v v 2
5 Arka Imports & Hardware Supplies L2 $ 11,245,000 168,675
S |Arka Imports & Hardware Supplies L3 $ 13,091,760 196,377
6 |Vertex Engineering Solutions L1 US$263,970.57 US$4,620 or Premier N/A | N/A v 2
6  |Vertex Engineering Solutions L2 US$6,6623.85 G$970,200
6  |Vertex Engineering Solutions L3 US$8,832
7 Toolsie Persaud Limited L1 $ 95,753,836 2,500,000 Caricom v v v 2




7  |Toolsie Persaud Limited L2 $ 2,968,971

7  |Toolsie Persaud Limited L3 $ 8,844,786

8 |C&L Construction Inc L1 $ 97,284,308 | $ 1,495,265 Premier
9 Sizwe Jackson Consultancy Service L1 $ 133,067,208.44 | $ 1,996,008 Premier
10 S Jagmohan Construction & General Supplies Inc L1 §35.654.526| $ 750,000 Premier
10 S Jagmohan Construction & General Supplies Inc L2 §4.479.840| $ 750,000

10 S Jagmohan Construction & General Supplies Inc L3 §14,446,080| $ 750,000

11 |R Kissoon Contracting Service L1 $ 135,961,098 | $ 2,700,000 |Premier

11 |R Kissoon Contracting Service L2 $ 18,735,000

11 [R Kissoon Contracting Service L3 $ 19,980,000

12 [K&N Solutions Inc. L1 $ 221,620,000 | $ 3,324,300 |Premier

12 |K&N Solutions Inc. L2 $ 42,050,000 | $ 630,750

12 [K&N Solutions Inc. L3 $ 45,100,000 | $ 676,500




Date of Tender Opening: March 25th 2025

File Number: Guyana Water Inc - Supply and Delivery of HDPE, PVC, & DI Pipes and Fittings and Valves and Appurtenances for Installation of Transmission
Network from Cove & John to Cane Grove Lots 1-3 (64/2025/45)

. . Bid Security . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency Agency . Copy | drive
Currency signed
1 |David Persaud Investments Ltd L1 $ 938,752,000( $ 18,000,000 Diamond v v v 2
1 David Persaud Investments Ltd L2 $ 123,303,400
1 David Persaud Investments Ltd L3 $ 996,000.00
2  |C&L Construction Inc L1 $ 1,246,797,580| $ 18,701,764 Premier v v v 2
3 Sizwe Jackson Consultancy Service L1 $ 1,351,638,136.93| $ 20,274,572 Premier v v v 2
4 Arka Imports & Hardware Supplies L1 $ 914,090,000 | $ 13,711,350 Premier v v v 2
4  |Arka Imports & Hardware Supplies L2 $ 158,400,140 | $ 2,376,003
4  |Arka Imports & Hardware Supplies L3 $ 90,811,260 | $ 1,362,169
5 |Vertex Engineering Solutions L1 US$3,664,964.91 US$68,882 Premier N/A v v 2
S | Vertex Engineering Solutions L2 US$1,139,205.33
5  |Vertex Engineering Solutions L3 US$151,309.54
6 Toolsie Persaud Ltd L1 $ 1,003,606,894 | $ 18,000,000 Caricom v v v 2
6 |Toolsie Persaud Ltd L2 $ 107,792,848
6 |Toolsie Persaud Ltd L3 $ 30,077,462
7 S Jagmohan Construction & General Supplies L1 $ 1,539,956,513 | $ 27,000,000 Premier v v v 2




7 S Jagmohan Construction & General Supplies L2 $ 179,682,902 | $ 4,500,000

7 |S Jagmohan Construction & General Supplies L3 $ 24,180,260 | $ 1,500,000

8 |Dax Contracting Services L1 $ 1,297,444,000 | $ 25,000,000 Caricom
8 |Dax Contracting Services L2 $ 212,303,000 | $ 5,000,000

8 |Dax Contracting Services L3 $ 52,702,000 | $ 5,000,000

9 |R Kissoon Contracting Service L1 $ 1,688,999,000 | $ 27,000,000 Premier
9 R Kissoon Contracting Service L3 $78,808,626

10 |K&N Solutions Inc. L1 $ 826,660,000 | $ 12,399,900 Premier
10 [K&N Solutions Inc. L2 $ 388,237,000 | $ 5,823,555

10 |K&N Solutions Inc. L3 $ 73,340,000 | $ 5,600,100




Date of Tender Opening: March 25th 2025

File Number: Guyana National Bureau of Standards - Procurement of Legal Metrology Equipment (28/2025/23)

. . Bid Security . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency Agency . Copy | drive
Currency signed
1  [Meditron Inc $ 21,426,278| $ 249,544 Diamond v v v 2
2 |Western Scientific Company Ltd US$333,466.74 US$15,000 Premier N/A | N/A v 2
3 |Analogic Solutions $ 8,007,795.29 BSD Page Completed & Signed N/A | N/A v 2
4 Clever Solutions Ltd $ 95,564,416.50| $ 1,995,000 Assuria v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 25th 2025

File Number: Guyana National Bureau of Standards - Procurement of Product Compliance Equipment (29/2025/23)

. . Bid Security . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency Agency . Copy drive
Currency signed
1 |Analogic Solutions $ 9,082,313.68 BSD Page Completed & Signed N/A | N/A v 2
2 |Meditron Inc $ 7,684,328| $ 87,588 Diamond v v v 2
3  |[Clever Solutions $ 10,263,783.60 BSD Page Completed & Signed v v v 2
4  |Western Scientific Company Ltd US$38,044.37| $ 378,000 Premier N/A | N/A v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 25th 2025

File Number: Guyana National Bureau of Standards - Procurement of Industrial Metrology Equipment (30/2025/23)

. . Bid Security . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency Agency . Copy | drive
Currency signed
1 Meditron Inc $ 48,725,940| $ 487,259 Diamond v v v 2
2 Analogic Solutions $ 16,840,650.59 BSD Page Completed & Signed N/A | N/A v 2
US$1,700 RBGL (Chq)
3 Western Scientific Company Ltd US$251,642.50 US$12,000 Premier N/A | N/A v 2
4 Clever Solutions Ltd $ 44,154,267.99| $ 945,000 Assuria v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 25th 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council Region No. 3 - Construction of Reinforced Concrete Heavy Duty Bridge at Maryville Leguan (01/2025/73)

. . Bid Security . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS | Tender Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency Agency . Copy drive
Currency signed
1 Blacko Trading & Construction $ 17,041,650( $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 0
2 Ash Civil Engineering Works $ 16,000,695( $ 100,000 Nafico v v v 2
3 Metal & Fabrication Inc. $ 18,999,999 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
4 Mia General Construction & Supplies $ 17,920,550( $ 100,000 Nafico v v v 2
5 S. Singh Construction Service $ 21,036,550( $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
6 Barber & Sons Construction $ 19,929,700 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
7  |AMIC General Contracting Services $ 17,420,550 | $ 100,000 Nafico v v v 2
8 S. Maraj Contracting Services $ 15,356,500 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
9 |V.L Excavator Rental $ 17,228940 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
10 (Lallchands Construction & Graphic Service $ 17,846,100 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
11  |[Dev Contracting $ 17,245,850 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
12 |Mahace Construction $ 16,954,462 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
Engineers Estimate $ 12,370,200




Date of Tender Opening: March 25th 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council Region No. 3 - Construction of Reinforced Concrete Heavy Duty Bridge at Chetloham (02/2025/73)

. . Bid Security . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency Agency . Copy drive
Currency signed
1 S. Singh Construction Service $ 20,886,550| $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
2 S. Maraj Contracting Services $ 15,356,500( $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
3 Ash Civil Engineering Works $ 15,893,500 | $ 100,000 Nafico v v v 1 2
4 MIA General Construction & Supplies $ 17,235,550( $ 100,000 Nafico v v v 2
5 Barber & Sons Construction $ 18,702,400 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
6 AMIC General Contracting Services $ 17,235,550| $ 100,000 Nafico v v v 2
7 |Lalchands Construction & Graphics Service $ 17,846,100 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
8 Blacko Trading & Construction $ 17,041,650 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 0
9 Mahace Construction $ 16,160,822 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
10 |VK Excavator Rental $ 17,103,260 | $ 100,000 |Assuria v v v 2
11  |Dev Contracting $ 17,812,950 $ 100,000 |Caricom v v v 2
12 [Metal & Fabrication Inc. $ 18,999,999 | $ 100,000 |Assuria v v v 2
Engineers Estimate $ 12,370,200




Date of Tender Opening: March 25th 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council Region No.3 - Construction of Timber Bridge Leading to Zeeburg Secondary School (03/2025/73)

. . Bid Security . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency Agency . Copy drive
Currency signed
1 RDHK Dharry Construction $ 16,739,625( $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
2 S Singh Construction Service $ 17,617,635 $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
3 Mahase Construction $ 21,946,754 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
4 Evolution Contractors Inc $ 19,452,636 $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 Sino Estates & Management Inc $ 20,766,900 $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 1
6 MK Contracting $ 18,349,170 $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
7  |Ram Construction $ 19,580,925 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
Form of Tender Page . .
8 (No name) not Completed No Bid Security X X X 0
9  |C Persaud and Son Construction & Supply Services | $ 18,316,725 | $ 100,000 : v v v

Caricom 2

10 |Jane Ann Robinson Contracting $ 15,427,650 | $ 100,000 Nafico v v v 2
11  |JPM's General Construction & Engineering Services | $ 19,657,995 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v )
12 |[H Tribhowan Contracting & Equipment Rentals $ 17,847,848 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 1
13  |Khan's Construction & Transportation Services Inc $ 18,973,815 | $ 100,000 Nafico v v v 2
14  |Super Advance Construction & Procurement Services S 18.578.647 | S 100,000 Caricom v v v )
15 |Fazam Future Builders $ 19,689,915 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
16 |AMIC General Contracting Services $ 19,998,038 | $ 100,000 Nafico v v v 2
17 |HAE Services Inc $ 19,200,195 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
18 |Lil Ken Contracting $ 18,992,715 No Bid Security v v v 0




19 |Mahamad Haseeb Bacchus Enterprise $ 18,653,817 No Bid Security v v v 0
20 |A Nazir & Son Contracting & General Supplies $ 18,823,350 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
11 Rahaman & Sons Construction & Maintenance v v v

Company $ 18,093915 | $ 100,000 Caricom 2
22 |Simon Contracting Services $ 18,349,170 No Bid Security v v v 2
23|I Khan Contracting Service $ 19,755,592 | $ 100,000 | Assuria v v v 2
24 Top Notch Transportation Supplies & Construction X v v

Services $ 24,471,720 No Bid Security 0
25 |DN&D Civil Engineering Services $ 29,441,715 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
26 |Road Master Construction $ 16,752,078 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
27 |Elite High Tech Construction $ 18,879,315 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
28 |KA Business Enterprise $ 26,899,005 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
29 [RA Construction & Company $ 17,533,373 | $ 100,000 Nafico v v v 0
30 |VK Excavator Rental $ 17,255,360 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
31 |Paramdai's Construction $ 17,201,625 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
32 |Dev Construction $ 16,309,923 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
33 |Tony's Construction $ 18,569,670 | $ 100,000 Assuria X v v 2
34 |Metal & Fabrication Ink $ 19,999,875 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
35 |Lallchan's Construction & Graphics Service $ 18,057,847.05 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
36 |LS Contracting Services $ 16,723,140 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
37 |Blacko Trading & Construction $ 17,428,530 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 0
38 |PP Building Contracting $ 16,289,647.05 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
39 |Selena's Construction $ 18,579,225 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
40 Triple D Investment Construction Supply and v v v

Weeding Services $ 19,305,195 | $ 100,000 Assuria 2

Engineers Estimate $ 20,002,479




Date of Tender Opening: March 25th 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council Region No. 3 - Construction of Timber Bridge at Side Dam Cornelia Ida (04/2025/73)

) ) Bid Security ) ) Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency Agency . Copy drive
Currency signed
1 [H Tribhowan Contracting & Equipment Rentals $ 17,491,858 $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 1
2 |A Nazir & Son Contracting & General Supplies $ 18,454,800 $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
3 |Lil Ken Contracting $ 18,999,666 No Bid Security v v v 0
4 Mahamad Haseeb Bacchus Enterprise Construction $ 18,216,177 No Bid Security v v v 0
5 |Elite High Tech Construction $ 18,994,122 $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
6 |Rahaman & Son's Construction & $ 18,040,995| $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
7  |Fazam Future Builders $ 18,820,515 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
8 Trlple' D Inves‘tment Construction Supply and 3 18.485.355 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v )
Weeding Services
9 |PP Building Contracting $ 16,505,370 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
10 |[Sino Estates & Management Inc $ 19,563,600 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
11 |Lallchan's Construction & Graphics Service $ 17,447,797 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
12 |RoadMaster Construction $ 16,897,818 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
13 |C Persaud & Son Construction & Supply Services $ 18,369,750 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
14 |l Khan Contracting Services $ 18,866,242 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
15 |Tony's Construction $ 18,445,770 | $ 100,000 Assuria X v v 2
16 |AMIC General Contracting Services $ 19,121,288 | $ 100,000 Nafico v v v 2
17 |A&N Enterprise $ 17,960,670 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
18 |VK Excavator Rental $ 16,951,560 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
19 [Simon Contracting Services $ 18,561,270 No Bid Security v v v 2
20 |[Selena's Construction $ 18,481,400 | $ 100,000 | Assuria v v v 2




21 |Dev Contracting $ 16,079,763 | $ 100,000 | Caricom v v v 2
22 |Z&H Investment Inc $ 20,183,100 No Bid Security X v v 2
23 |RDHK Dharry Construction $ 16,592,625 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
24 |Blacko Trading & Construction $ 17,186,243 | $ 100,000 Caricom X v v 0
25 |LS Contracting Services $ 17,764,740 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
26 |Paramdai's Construction Form of Tender Page $ 100,000 . 4 4 4 2
not Completed Assuria
27 Top Notch Transportation Supplies & Construction X v v )
Services $ 23,292,780 No Bid Security
28 |DN&D Civil Engineering Services $ 19,790,840 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
29 |MK Contracting $ 17,737,125 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
Form of Tender Page
30 |(No Name) not Completed No Bid Security X X X 2
31 |Metal & Fabrication Ink $ 19,777,775 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
32 |Ram Construction $ 18,339,825 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
33 |S Singh Construction Service $ 15,003,660 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
34 |Evolution Contractors Inc $ 18,486,216 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
35 |Khan's Construction & Transportation Services Inc $ 18,434,535 | $ 100,000 Nafico v v v 2
36 |JPM's General Construction & Engineering Services 18,665,745 $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
Engineers Estimate 20,002,343




Date of Tender Opening: March 25th 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council Region No. 3 - Construction of Timber Bridge Linking Groenveldt to Edinburg (05/2025/73)

. . Bid Security . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency Agency . Copy drive
Currency signed
1 Top Notch Transportation Supplies & Construction g 28.829.220 No Bid Security « v v 0
Services
2 |Road Master Construction $ 22.882,776| $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
3  |G&P Construction $ 26,156,760 No Bid Security v v v 0
4 |KA Business Enterprise $ 19,008,938( $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
5 |Dev Contracting $ 21,604,923| $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
6 |Blacko Trading & Construction $ 35,000,479( $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 0
7  |Metal & Fabrication Ink $ 26,000,000 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
8 |S Singh Construction Service $ 22,125,180 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
9 |Tony's Construction $ 25,223,625 | $ 100,000 Assuria X v v 2
10 |[MK Contracting $ 24,436,125 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
11 (Selena's Construction $ 25,502,925 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
12 |RDHK Dharry Construction $ 25,244,625 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
13 |Amazon Supply Construction & Services $ 27,000,000 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 0
Rahaman & Son's Construction & Maintenance
14 Company $ 25,419,660 $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
15 |Fazam Future Builders $ 24295215 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
16 |Khan's Construction & Transportation Services Inc $ 23,724,855 | $ 100,000 Nafico v v v 2
17 [Mahamad Haseeb Bacchus Enterprise Construction $ 24,972,864 No Bid Security v v v 0
18 |H Tribhowan Contracting & Equipment Rental $ 24,935,378 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
19 [Eze Way Construction Inc $ 27,875,350 100,000 Caricom v v v 2




20 |I Khan Contracting Service $ 24,315,592 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
21 |VK Excavator Rental $ 23,424,400 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
22 |C Persaud & Son Construction & Supply Services $ 22,779,225 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
23  [Simon Contracting Services $ 25,663,415 No Bid Security v v v 2
24 |PP Building Contracting $ 21,044,047.05 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
25 |RF Innovative Construction & Engineering Services S 21,242,130 $ 100,000 Nafico v v v 2
26 |D&D Civil Engineering Services $ 27,825,315 $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
27 |LS Contracting Services $ 22,512,000 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
28 |Evolution Contractors Inc $ 24,824,835 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
29 |[Sino Estates & Management Inc $ 24,880,800 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 1
30 |A&N Enterprise $ 22,341,900 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
31 |AMIC General Contracting Services $ 26,455,538 | $ 100,000 Nafico v v v 2
32 |Super Advance Construction & Procurement Services $ 19.999.950 $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
33 |A Nazier Contracting & General Supplies $ 24,341,625 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
34 |Paramdai's Construction $ 25,657,065 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
35 |JPM's General Construction & Engineering Services S 24,125,745 $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
Engineers Estimate $ 25,000,479




Date of Tender Opening: March 25th 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council Region No. 3 - Construction of RC Heavy Duty Bridge at Phoenix (06/2025/73)

. . Bid Security . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency Agency . Copy drive
Currency signed
1 |Barber & Sons Construction $ 18,702,400 No Bid Security v v v 1
5 Top Notch Transportation Supplies & Construction g 24.467.200 No Bid Security « v v 0
Services
3  |MIA General Construction & Supplies $ 16,635,550 | $ 100,000 Nafico v v v 2
4 |Lallchan's Construction & Graphics Service $ 17,846,100( $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
5 |Dev Contracting $ 17,898.,850( $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
6 |Metal & Fabrication Ink $ 17,927,999 $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
7 |S Singh Construction Service $ 21,281,550 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
8 |Blacko Trading & Construction $ 17,241,650 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 0
9 |VK Excavator Rental $ 17,174,060 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
10 [S Maraj Contracting Services $ 14,956,500 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
11 |(Mahase Construction $ 16,954,462 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
12 |Ash Civil Engineering Works $ 14,878,800 | $ 100,000 Nafico v v v 2
Engineers Estimate $ 20,001,650




Date of Tender Opening: March 25th 2025

File Number: Regional Democratic Council Region No. 3 - Construction of Revetment at Reuby Koker, Ruby (07/2025/73)

. . Bid Security . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security GRA | NIS | Tender Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency Agency . Copy | drive
Currency signed
1 HAE Services Inc. $ 29,006,560 $ 100,000 | Assuria v v v 2
2 H. Tribhowan Contracting & bEquipment Rentals $ 26,727,800| $ 100,000 | Caricom v v v 1
3 Trlple' D Inves'tment Construction Supply & $ 28.676.560 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 5
Weeding Services
4 Tony's Construction $ 27,624,960 $ 100,000 Assuria X v v 2
5 JPM's General Construction & Engineering Services | $ 29,669.420| $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
6 Dev Contracting $ 23,717,100| $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
7 Mahamad Haseeb Bacchus Enterprise Construction | $ 29,104,636 No Bid security seen v v v 0
8 Amazon Supply, Construction & Services $ 29,000,000 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 0
9 RA Construction & Company $ 30,057,170 | $ 100,000 Nafico v v v 2
10  |Khan's Construction & Transportation Services Inc. | $ 31,734,670 | $ 100,000 Nafico v v v 2
11  |Rahaman's & Son Construction & Maintenance $ 26,733,640 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
12  |Metal and Fabrication Ink $ 32,220,012 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 1
13 AMIC General Constracting Services $ 29,799,220 | $ 100,000 Nafico v v v 2
14 Evalution Contractors Inc. $ 28,606,050 | $ 100,000 caricom v v v 0
15 Blacko Trading & Construction $ 25,068,100 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 0
16 SEZD Energry Support Services $ 28,455,000 No Bid security seen v v v 2
17 DN&D Civil Engineering Services $ 42,185,220 | $ 100,000 | Caricom v v v 2
18 ASH Civil Engineering Works $ 25,579,510 | $§ 100,000 Nafico v v v 0
19 S. Singh Construction Service $ 26,615,460 | $ 100,000 | Premier Insurance v v v 2




20 |PP Building Contracting $ 25,634,730 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
21  |C Persaud & Son Construction &Supply Services $ 24,945,085 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
22 Lallchan's Construction & Graphics Service $ 26,479,530 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
23 |VK Excavator Rental $ 25,403,500 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
24 Gurdev Mahadeo Contracting Services $ 25,501,300.00 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
25 |A. Nazier & Son Contracting & General Supplies $ 29,513,220 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
26  |Mahase Construction $ 34,161,853 Premier Insurance v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 29,999,937
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