Date of Tender Opening: March 27, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education (75/2025/40) - Electrical Rehabiliation Infrastructure-South Ruimveldt Nursery School

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FIE}Sh
No. Currency ) Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |Vidrick Construction & Electrical Services $ 9,703,050 Bid Security De;lif;rr?;:jon Completed & v v v 1
2 |Mitchell's Electrical $ 10,870,184 | DldSecurity Dg‘;?r:at'on PageNot 1/ | v v 1
3  |Prime Construction & Supplies $ 10,925,250 Bid Security Deglizrr?;:jon Completed & v v v 1
4  [Queens Construction & Maintenance $ 9,301,740 Bid Security Degliagrr?é:jon Completed & v Ltr v 2
5 |PMW Construction & General Services $ 13,513,500 Bid Security Deglizrr?;:jon Completed & v v v 1
6 |Hillsyde Electrical Services $ 14,886,900 Bid Security Deglizrr?;:jon Completed & v Ltr v 2
7 |Twins Enterprise $ 9.373.980 Bid Security Decl_aratlon Completed & v v v 1
Signed
8 |Grand Sourcing & Services $ 9,098,040 Bid Security Deglizrr?;:jon Completed & v v v 2
: . Bi ity Declarati I
9 |Fugenz Business Solutions $ 8,788,500 \d Security e;iagrr?élcjon Completed & v Ltr v 1
10 |R. Persid Construction $ 12,543,300 |29 Seeurity Deg'izrr?;:jon Completed &\, 1 v 1
11 |Star Executive Services $ 8,934,450 Bid Security Declaration Completed & v Ltr v 2

Signed




12 [Cummings Electrical Company Limited 14,698,530 | $ 400,000 Nafico v v
13 |KJ Grimmond Electrical 14,799,750 Bid Security Deglizr:é:jon Completed & v Rec
14 |Randolph Taylor Construction 13,767,600 Bid Security De;lif;rr?;:jon Completed & v v
15 |Digital Design Construction, Logistics & Supplies 11,998,350 Bid Security Deglizrr?é:jon Completed & v Ltr
16 [M. Tech Contracting Solutions 2,290,000 Bid Security Deglizrr?;:jon Completed & Rec v
17 |Mega Power Electrical & Construction Services 11,814,600 Bid Security Degliagrr?é:jon Completed & v v
18 |[S&S Construction & General Services 9,410,069 Bid Security Deglizrr?;:jon Completed & v Ltr
19 |Oneika & Sons Development 10,458,630 Bid Security Degliagrr?;:jon Completed & v v
20 N. Ba!gobln & S_ons Contracting Service & 9.527.700 Bid Security Decl_aratlon Completed & v v
Electrical Supplies Signed
21 |Evocative Services 9 161,040 Bid Security Decl_aratlon Completed & v v
Signed
22 |R's Modern Construction & Supplies 8,481,900 Bid Security De;liagrr?;:jon Completed & v v
23 |Akye & Sons General Contracting 14,618,100 Bid Security De;liz;rrz]i;:jon Completed & v v
24  |Platinum Enterprises Inc 9,019,160 Bid Security Deglizr:;:jon Completed & v v
25 |Hillsyde Electrical Services 14,533,050 Bid Security Declaration Completed & v v

Signed




Engineer's Estimate

$

9,724,050




Date of Tender Opening: March 27, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Agriculture-Fisheries Department (106/2025/21) - Supply and Delivery of PVC Pressure Pipes and Fittings

. . Bid Securit Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.ISh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |David Persaud Investments Limited $ 3,461,279 | $ 80,000 Diamond v v v 2
2 |True Value Trading $ 5,929,885 | $ 118,598 Caricom v v v 2
3 |Guybiz Establishment $ 10,718,890 | $ 214,378 Assuria v v v 2
4 |Alliance Investments $ 7,017,480 | $ 140,350 Premier v v v 2
5 [Toolsie Persaud Limited $ 4,286,967 | $ 120,000 Caricom v v v 2
6 |Jeetendra Enterprise $ 27,502,000 | $ 550,040 Premier v v v 1
7 |Gafsons Industries Limited $ 4,553,887 | $ 91,080 Republic v v v 2
8 |R. Kisson Contracting Service (Excluding VAT) | $ 27,398,500 | $ 1,416,000 Premier v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 27, 2025

File Number: Guyana Power & Light Inc (70/2025/02) - Supply and Installation of Fuel Transfer System at Garden of Eden

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.ISh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |Quality Industrial Services Inc $ 36,745,380 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
5 Balram Seeram Construction & Consultation $ 39312.742 | $ 786,255 Nafico v v v 5

Services




Date of Tender Opening: March 27, 2025

File Number: Guyana Power & Light Inc (71/2025/02) - Rehabilitation of Access Road From Main Road to Power Station at Wakenaam

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.ISh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |Rush Engineering & Service $ 65,462,650 | $ 1,309,253 Premier v Ltr v 0
Engineer's Estimate $ 17,365,304




Date of Tender Opening: March 27, 2025

File Number: Georgetown Public Hospital Corporation (102/2025/46) - Supply Installation and Commissioning of 600KVA Generator for Festival City Polyclinic

. . Bid Securit Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.ISh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |Tels Engineering Services $ 35,850,000 | $ 750,000 Assuria v v v 2
2 |Engineering & Construction Inc $ 37,007,421 | $ 691,007 GTM v v v 2
3 |Akamai Inc $ 25,675,000 | $ 1,000,000 Caricom v v v 2
4 |Farm Supplies Limited $ 20,900,000 | $ 418,000 Assuria v v v 1 2
5 |Elgawa Inc $ 38,574,060 | $ 771,481 Assuria v v v 2
6 [Alliance Investments $ 24,000,000 | $ 480,000 Premier v v v 2
7  |Standby Power Engineering Company (SPECOM) | $ 30,800,000 | $ 800,000 Assuria v v v 2
8 |General Marine Company $ 46,672,839 | $ 1,040,000 Premier v v v 2
9 |Machinery Corportation of Guyana $ 38,375,523 | $ 1,125,144 Nafico v v v 1
10 |MEP Engineering Services Inc $ 37,054,084 | $ 741,082 Premier v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 27, 2025

File Number: Georgetown Public Hospital Corporation (103/2025/46) - Supply and Delivery of IT Equipment for 2025

Bid Security

Form of

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.ISh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed

1 |Sinetech Inc $ 35,885,000 |$ 1,000,000 Premier v v v 2
2  |Promotech Inc $ 89,613,464 | $ 1,627,553 Premier v v v 2
3 |Keyboard Kiosk $ 64,200,000 | $ 1,284,000 Assuria v v v 2
4  |Compudel Business & IT Solution $ 50,107,775 | $ 943,471 Premier v v v 2
5 |DyamlQ $ 11,078,872 | $ 330,000 Demerara v v v 2
6 [Starr Computer Inc $ 15,605,188 | $ 330,000 Premier v v v 2
7 |KM Technology $ 83,856,800 | $ 1,661,400 Diamond v v v 2
8 |Laparkan Trading Guyana Limited $ 14,000,000 | $ 280,000 GTM v v v 2
9 |Nextech Inc $ 13,454,840 | $ 280,000 Premier v v v 1
10 |Resconex Investment & Management Inc $ 44,385,000 | $ 19,600,000 Caricom v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 27, 2025

File Number: Hinterland Electrification Co. Inc (111/2025/02) - Supply of Cables for the Substation at Linden

. . Bid Securit Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FIa}Sh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |Tels Engineering Services $ 48,186,000 | $ 500,000 Assuria v v v 2
2 |Akamai Inc $ 62,691,240 | $ 3,000,000 Caricom v v v 2
3 |VMS Business Enterprise $ 64,480,000 | $ 1,289,600 Assuria v Ltr v 2
4  |Cummings Electrical Company Limited $ 39,778,417 | $ 800,000 Nafico v v v 2
5 |MS Trading $ 29,983,000 | $ 600,000 Premier v v v 2
Form of Tender
6 |Eastbank Electrical & Industrial Supplies Inc Page Not Completed | $ 970,854 Assuria v Rec v 2
But Signed
7  |SPR Enterprises $ 41,676,002 | $ 835,000 Assuria v v v 2
8 |Excel Guyana Inc $ 89,429,72553 | $ 1,788,595 Premier v v v 1 0
9 |Fixit Depot $ 28,682,343.90 | $ 2,500,000 Caricom v v v 1




Date of Tender Opening: March 27, 2025

File Number: Hinterland Electrification Co. Inc (112/2025/02) - Supply and Delivery of Long Bed Truck for Transporting Concrete Poles

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.ISh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |MS Trading $ 49,800,000 | $ 1,000,000 Premier v v v 2
2 |IMS Construction & Logistics Services $ 40,890,300 | $ 1,440,000 Caricom v v v 2
3 |Digital Design Construction, Logistics & Supplies | $ 57,778,100 | $ 1,155,762 Caricom v Ltr v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 27, 2025

File Number: Hinterland Electrification Co. Inc (113/2025/02) - Extension of Distribution Network to Supply Electricity to New Housing Scheme in Mahdia

. . Bid Securit Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.ISh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |Tels Engineering Services $ 45,622,886 | $ 900,000 Assuria v v v 2
2 |Akamai Inc $ 52,876,100 | $ 1,210,000 Caricom v v v 2
3 |SPR Enteprises $ 37,785,064 | $ 975,000 Assuria v v v 2
4  |MS Trading $ 59,484,320 | $ 1,200,000 Premier v v v 2
5 |Excel Guyana Inc $ 87,637,980.75 | $ 1,752,760 Premier v v v 1 0
6 |Fixit Depot $ 37,427,909.16 | $ 2,000,000 Caricom v v v 1




Date of Tender Opening: March 27, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Home Affairs (40/2025/51) - Procurement of Firefighting Kits

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.ISh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |Industrial Safety Supplies Inc $ 85,364,000 | $ 1,707,280 Hand in Hand v v v 2
2 |MC Dasilva & Company Limited $ 101,131,850 No Bid Security Seen X X v 1
3 |Meridian 60 Offshore Inc $ 91,938,100 | $ 1,838,762 Hand in Hand v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 27, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Home Affairs (45/2025/51) - Procurement of Hydrant Fittings

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.ISh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |Gafsons Industries Limited $ 24,873,518 | $ 497,470 Republic v v v 1
2  |Arka Imports & Hardware Supplies $ 20,007,000 | $ 400,140 Premier v v v 1
3 [Toolsie Persaud Limited $ 17,334,289 | $ 560,000 Caricom v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 27, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Home Affairs (52/2025/51) - Procurement of Firefighting Hose

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla}Sh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 'BF:S;"e & Safety Guyana Inc (Option -1 ¢ 15114505 | g 362,200 |  Assuria X | x| v | 1] o
1 IRP Fire & Safety Guyana Inc (Option 2: $ 17,205,038
Light Aloy)
2 |Industrial Safety Supplies Inc $ 16,762,500 | $ 335,250 | Hand in Hand v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 27, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Amerindian Affairs (316/2025/16) - Repainting Exterior of Building at Teriary Dormitory Liliendaal

Bid Security

Form of

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.ISh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
. . Bi ity Declarati I
1 |KNPS Contracting & Supplies 8383485 | C'd Security Declaration Completed | -, |, v 2
& Signed
2 |VRP Investment 5,865,214 | $ 117,304 Assuria v v v 1 1
3 |Neria Enterprise 5 262,730 Bid Security Dec_laratlon Completed v v v )
& Signed
4 |D. Chowkai & Sons Construction 7,008,705 | $ 140,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |Centaur Investments Inc 6,488,966 | $ 129,780 Premier v v v 2
6 |Building Tech Construction 11,945,740 Bid Security Dec_laratlon Completed v v v 1 2
& Signed
7 |IMS Construction & Logistics Services 6,820,770 | $ 900,000 Caricom v v v 2
8 |AH General Services 7,121,969 Bid Security Dec_laratlon Completed v Ltr v 2
& Signed
9 |C&J Contracting & Consultancy Services Inc 9,705,735 | $ 194,115 Nafico v v v 1
10 |Terraform Solutions 11,816,420 | $ 250,000 Assuria v v v 2
11 |Diversity Investments Inc 6,907,065 | $ 138,142 Caricom v v v 2




12 |MAEC Enterprises 12,161,050 | $ 260,000 Assuria v
13 [Mobile Construction Company 7,714,960 | $ 154,300 Caricom v
14 |Triple K Consultancy & Construction Services 9,855,794 | $ 197,116 Assuria Ltr
15 |Andrect Engineering & Construction 5,124,020 | $ 200,000 Assuria v
16 [JR Civil Works 5,824,940 | $ 116,499 Caricom v
17 |Kevin Lyte Contracting Service 6,245,521 Bid Security Dec_larat|on Completed Ltr
& Signed
Sovereignty Investments Construction Services Bid Security Declaration Completed
18 (SICS Builders) 4,357,628 & Signed v
19 |Mobile Express 6.816.964 Bid Security Dec_laratlon Completed v
& Signed
20 [Surujpaul Balkaran & Sons Construction 6,801,102 | $ 120,000 Premier v
21 [JMJB General Contracting 11,824,940 | $ 236,499 Assuria Ltr
22 |BM Property Investments Inc 9,042,704 | $ 180,854 Caricom Ltr
Engineer's Estimate 7,998,870




Date of Tender Opening: March 27, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Amerindian Affairs (316/2025/16) - Repainting Exterior of Building at Teriary Dormitory Liliendaal

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.ISh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |The Property Experts Supplies & Services $ 4,530,000 | $ 90,600 Diamond v v v 1
2 |R. Persid Construction $ 4,430,000 Bid Security Dec_larat|on Completed v v v 0
& Signed
3 |LC Investments & General Supplies $ 6,400,000 |$ 128,000 Premier v v v 1 1
. . Bi ity Declarati I
4  |B'Anns General Construction & Supplies $ 4,184,000 Id Security &eé:ig;féon Completed v v v 0
5 |KJS General Services $ 3,934,000 | $ 78,688 Assuria v v v 1 1
6 |Building Tech Construction $ 4,607,000 Bid Security Dec_laratlon Completed v v v 1 2
& Signed
. : Bi ity Declarati I
7  |KNPS Contracting & Supplies $ 3,872,500 Id Security ec_aratlon Completed v v v 1 0
& Signed
8 [Centaur Investments Inc. $ 2,488,000 | $ 49,760 Premier v v v 2
9 |M&B Contracting Services $ 3,872,500 Bid Security Dec_laratlon Completed v v v 1
& Signed
10 |AH General Services $ 4,694,560 Bid Security Dec_larat|on Completed v v v 1
& Signed
11 |VMS Business Enterprise $ 2.997,500 | B'd Security Declaration Completed | |, v 1| o
& Signed
12 |Mobile Construction Company $ 4,107,000 | $ 82,140 | Caricom v v v 1
13 |Triple K Consultancy & Construction Services $ 3,131,700 | $ 62,634 | Assuria v v v 1
14 |BLVCK Stone Enterprise $ 6,860,000 | $ 137,200 | Premier v v v 1 0
15 |BM Property Investments Inc. $ 3,215,000 | $ 64,300 | Caricom v v v 1 0




16 |GY Procurement & Engineering Services Inc. $ 5,020,800 | $ 100,416 | Assuria v v v 0
Innovative Development Solution Guyana Bid Security Declaration Completed
17 (IDSGY) $ 3,622,500 & Signed v v v 1
18 |JHP Construction & General Services $ 4,853,000 | $ 97,060 Premier v v v 0
Souvernity Invstments Construction Services Bid Security Declaration Completed
19 (SICS Builders) 3 1,909,250 & Signed v v v 1
. . . Bi ity Declarati I
20 [Kevin Lyte Contracting Service $ 3,626,500 Id Security &e;:ig;a;éon Completed v v v 0
21 [J.R Civil Works 2,538,000 | $ 50,760 Caricom v v v 2
22 |C&J Contracting & Consultancy Services Inc. $ 3,138,000 Bid Security geé:ilggéon Completed v v v 1
23 |Mobile Express $ 2 688,000 Bid Security Dec_laratlon Completed Y Y Y 0
& Signed
24 [Neria Enterprise $ 2,722,500 Bid Security Dec_laratlon Completed v v v 1
& Signed
25 [VRP Investment $ 1,207,500 | $ 24,150 Assuria v v v 1
Engineer's Estimate $ 4,999,600




Date of Tender Opening: March 27, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Amerindian Affairs (317/2025/16) - Construction of Shed at Hinterland Scholarship Student Dormitory Liliedaal

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder i Bid Amount & . . Hard| Flash
No. Name of Bidder Currency Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Copy| drive
Currency signed
: : Bi ity Declarati I
1 |[JHP Construction & General Services 8,831,235 Id Security &e;:ig;a;éon Completed v v v 1 1
Innovative Development Solution Guyana Bid Security Declaration Completed
2 (IDSGY) 8,026,998 & Signed v v v 1
3 |Mobile Express 9.217,803 | Eld Security geé:ilgg(ljon Completed |, 1, v 1] 1
: [ [ ion Completed
4 |IM JB General Contracting 5770,800 | C'd Security geé:ilgg(ljon ompieted | v v 1] 1
Souvernity Invstments Construction Services Bid Security Declaration Completed
® |(sICS Builders) 2,127,423 & Signed VoY v ol
: : [ ity Declarati I
6 |\VMS Business Enterprise 7,359,150 Bid Security &eé:ig:]féon Completed v v v 1 1
Bi ity Declarati I
7 |BM Property Investments Inc. 8,887,893 Id Security &eé:ig:]féon Completed v v v 1 1
- : : Bid Security Declaration Completed
8 |A&P Logistics & Transportation Service 6,615,038 10 Securtty &escig;aeéon ompIete v v v 1 0
: Bi ity Declarati I
9 |MAEC Enterprises 6.780,470 | D'd Security &egig:]a;o” Completed | =, | 4 v 1] 2
: - : Bi ity Declarati mpl
10 |IMS Construction & Logistics Services 6,035,820 Id Security ec_aratlon Completed v v v 1
& Signed
11 |[R. Persid Construction 6,440,123 Bid Security Declaration Completed v v v 0

& Signed




Bid Security Declaration Completed

12 |Randolph Taylor Construction 11,835,999 & Signed

13 |AH General Services 7.138.908 Bid Security zeé::g:]e:et(ijon Completed
14 |D. Chowkai & Sons Construction 7,472,273 Bid Security zegilg:i;on Completed
15 |VRP Investment 7.233.846 Bid Security geé:ilgfg(ijon Completed
16 |KNPS Contracting & Supplies 6,508,110 | C'd Security gegi';‘;a;;"” Completed
17 |M&B Contracting Services 5,325,915 Bid Security geé:ilg:]f(ijon Completed
18 |Fugenz Business Solutions 4,989,884 Bid Security gegi'g:gon Completed
19 |Mobile Construction Company 6,337,013 Bid Security ?Lescilg;aet(ijon Completed
20 |NSA Enterprise 10 243,340 Bid Security zescilg;aet(;on Completed
21 |Andrect Engineering & Construction 6,669,920 Bid Security zesci'g:]a;éon Completed

Engineer's Estimate 4,999 313




Date of Tender Opening: March 27, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Health (63/2025/47) - Supply & Delivery of Dental Supplies

) . Bid Securit Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.tSh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed

1 [Meditron Inc L1 $ 40,913,104 3,912,462 Diamond v v v 2
1 |Meditron Inc L2 $ 4,433,798 (L1-6)

1 |Meditron Inc L3 $ 56,939,310

1 |Meditron Inc L4 $ 67,019,699

1 [Meditron Inc L5 $ 20,217,565

1 |Meditron Inc L6 $ 6,099,646

2 |Dental Imports Guyana Inc L1 $ 90,566,672 11,296,467 Premier v v v 2
2 |Dental Imports Guyana Inc L2 $ 41,115,523 (L1-6)

2 |Dental Imports Guyana Inc L3 $ 270,996,390

2 |Dental Imports Guyana Inc L4 $ 84,194,372

2 |Dental Imports Guyana Inc L5 $ 26,896,174

2 |Dental Imports Guyana Inc L6 $ 24,469,592

3 |NewGPCInc L1 $ 61,557,831 15,000,000 Premier v v v 2
3 [NewGPCInc L2 $ 66,239,478 (L1-6)

3 [New GPC Inc L3 $ 189,215,015

3 [New GPCInc L4 $ 156,578,695

3 [New GPC Inc L5 $ 23,752,112

3 [New GPC Inc L6 $ 428,255

4 |Millenium Supplies & Distribution Inc L1 $ 31,681,330 4,304,315 Premier v v v 2
4 |Millenium Supplies & Distribution Inc L2 $ 15,759,180 (L1-4)




4 |Millenium Supplies & Distribution Inc L3 $ 114,301,750

4 |Millenium Supplies & Distribution Inc L4 $ 53,473,495

5 |Western Scientific Company Limited L1 US $615,531.44 US $85,000 Premier N/A | N/A
5 |Western Scientific Company Limited L2 US $369,970.47 (L1-6)

5 |Western Scientific Company Limited L3 US $1,865,338.82

5 |Western Scientific Company Limited L4 US $477,678.72

5 |Western Scientific Company Limited L5 US $442,236.39

5 |Western Scientific Company Limited L6 US $224,395.07




Date of Tender Opening: March 27, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Health (84/2025/47) - Supply & Delivery of Field Materials for HSE

Bid Security

Form of

Bﬁg_er Name of Bidder B'guArT::cr;t & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T_ender Igg;?, ';:_?\5/2
Currency signed
1 |Clever Solutions Guyana Inc $ 267,813,524.48 | $ 5,400,000 Assuria v v v 2
2 |Western Scientific Company Limited US $662,052.89 US $24,000 Premier N/A | N/A v 2
3 |Caribbean Medical Supplies Inc $ 219,222,500 | $ 4,384,450 Nafico v v v 2
4 |New GPC Inc $ 189,522,841 | $ 5,200,000 Premier v v v 2
5 [MS Trading $ 54,165,500 | $ 1,100,000 Premier v v v 2
6 [Meditron Inc $ 176,997,255 | $ 3,539,945 Diamond v v v 2
7  |Southwind Health & Defence $ 213,252,084 | $ 4,265,042 Caricom v v v 1




Date of Tender Opening: March 27, 2025

File Number: Ministry of Health (85/2025/47) - Supply & Delivery of Indent Supplies

) . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.tSh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |Meditron Inc $ 28,251,154 | $ 565,023 Diamond v v v 2
2 |ABD Medicare Investments Inc $ 21,133,640 | $ 422,673 Nafico v v v 2
3 |Caribbean Medical Supplies Inc $ 20,127,276 | $ 402,546 Nafico v v v 2
4 |New GPC Inc $ 29,192,014 | $ 1,000,000 Premier v v v 2
5 |Western Scientific Company Limited US $91,907.69 US $9500 Premier N/A | N/A v 2




Date of Tender Opening: March 27, 2025

File Number: National Irrigation Development Authority (165/2025/21) - Rehabilitation of Drainage Structure at Charity Riverdam

) . Bid Securit Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.tSh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |BM Property Investments Inc $ 34,310,010 | $ 686,200 Caricom v v v 2
2 |Victorine Mentore Construction $ 34,270,950 No Bid Security Seen X X v 1
3 |M. Sukhai Contracting Services $ 89,994,765 | $ 1,800,000 Caricom v v v 2
4  [MVR Construction $ 31,544,750 | $ 65,895 Premier v v v 2
5 [Wild Oats Civil & Mechanical Engineering $ 73,945,358 | $ 1,500,000 Caricom v v v 2
6 |Jane Ann Robinson Contracting $ 21,439,530 | $ 686,599 Nafico v Ltr v 1 2
7 |RIVA Investment $ 34,300,000 | $ 686,000 Assuria v v v 2
8 |CAJ Contracting Services $ 33,315,083 | $ 686,599 Caricom v v v 2
9 |Fazam Future Builders $ 34,214,880 | $ 684,298 Caricom v v v 2
10 |Triple A General Contracting Services $ 31,996,125 | $ 639,923 Premier v v v 2
11 |Vijay Persaud & Sons Contracting Services $ 31,356,990 | $ 627,140 Assuria v v v 2
12 |ERM Lall Civil Engineering Works $ 55,661,025 | $ 1,113,221 Assuria v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 75,271,035




Date of Tender Opening: March 27, 2025

File Number: National Irrigation Development Authority (166/2025/21) - Construction of Outfall Timber Revetment and Chain Link Fence at Pine Ground Pump Station
Mabhaicony Creek

i . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.‘Sh
No. Currency . Copy | drive
Currency signed
1 |Singh's Construction, Welding & Fabrication $ 52,335,150 | $ 1,210,824 Caricom v v v 2
2 |Zeebo & Sons Construction Inc $ 55,305,275 | $ 1,106,185 Premier v v v 2
3 |K&A Contracting Services $ 50,092,140 | $ 1,210,823 Caricom v v v 2
4 g:r?/riaczsee”era' Construction & Contracting | 22460340 |$ 1,587,375 Caricom v | Rec| v 2
5 |Truck Smart $ 53,293,590 | $ 1,200,000 Premier v v v 2
6 |R. Razak Business Enteprise $ 56,163,765 | $ 1,210,823 Premier v v v 2
7 |Alvin Chowramootoo Construction Services $ 50,119,850 | $ 1,610,024 Caricom v v v 1 1
8 |Daks Engineering Guyana $ 57,091,020 | $ 1,141,820 Caricom v v v 2
9 |C&M Construction & General Supplies $ 42,873,600 | $ 1,078,159 Caricom v v v 2
10 |Ramlochan Construction & Trucking Inc $ 55,309,275 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
11 |S. Caimraj Construction Services $ 58,191,000 | $ 1,210,823 Premier Ltr Ltr v 2
12 |F&A Mohamed Construction Firm $ 52,278,450 | $ 1,210,823 Premier v v v 2
13 [High Definition Engineering & Cooling $ 54,619,163 | $ 1,092,383 Assuria v v v 2
14 RF Irmovatlve Construction & Engineering $ 46,559.100 | $ 1,210,823 Nafico v v v 5
Services
15 |BM Property Investments Inc $ 60,501,084 | $ 1,210,021 Caricom v v v 2
16 g'érsii‘;pa”' & Son Trucking & Construction $ 58,512,300 | $ 1,170,246 Premier v | v v 2
17 |Hoosein Logistics & Supplies Inc $ 60,355,995 | $ 1,207,119 Caricom v v v 1
18 |Debbie's Construction & General Supplies $ 45,846,675 | $ 996,934 Caricom v Rec v 2




19 |Proline Guyana Inc $ 58,479,750 | $ 1,170,000 Assuria v v v 2
20 |Legalize Trucking & Contracting Service $ 52,314,150 | $ 1,210,824 Caricom v v v 2
21 |JD's Construction & Supplies $ 50,480,745 | $ 1,009,615 Assuria v v v 2
22 |Rahaman Construction & Transportation Services| $ 55,016,850 | $ 1,100,337 Caricom v v v 2
23 |Triple J's Enterprise $ 58,138,500 | $ 1,210,823 Premier X X v 2
24 [Modern Construction & Trucking Service $ 51,367,260 | $ 1,027,345 Assuria v v v 2
25 |Fazam Future Builders $ 51,940,350 | $ 1,038,807 Caricom v v v 2
26 |STP Investments Inc $ 59,921,400 | $ 1,198,440 Premier v v v 2
27 |DS Construction Service & Supplies $ 54,617,640 | $ 1,100,000 Assuria v v v 2
28 |Ramesh Persaud & Son General Construction $ 50,017,800 | $ 1,000,256 Caricom v v v 2
29 |RP Construction Services $ 51,537,150 | $ 1,030,743 Caricom v v v 2
30 |Memorex Enterprise $ 57,944,880 | $ 1,159,000 Caricom v v v 2
31 |J.S Engineering Services & Supplies $ 84,932,610 | $ 1,210,823 Caricom v v v 2
32 |Z&J Enterprise Inc $ 58,112,250 | $ 1,210,823 Premier X X v 2
33 |D. Chowkai & Sons Construction $ 48,293,963 | $ 965,879 Caricom v v v 2
34 |Atlantic General Investments $ 51,936,518 | $ 1,038,730 Premier v v v 2
35 |Triple A General Contracting Services $ 53,929,680 | $ 1,078,594 Premier v v v 2
36 |Kascon Engineering Service $ 51,037,350 | $ 1,210,823 Premier v v v 2
37 |K. Ramdial Construction & Services $ 52,289,475 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
38 |Carter's Construction $ 55,925,888 | $ 1,210,823 Premier v v v 2
39 |Gopie Investments Inc $ 55,300,455 | $ 1,106,010 Premier v v v 2
40 |VS Construction & Rice Industries $ 49,594,440 | $ 1,210,825 Assuria v v v 2
41 |Crown Road & Drainage Contractors $ 52,067,715 | $ 1,210,824 Caricom v v v 1
42 |Jane Ann Robinson Contracting $ 49,971,600 | $ 1,200,000 Nafico v v v 2
43 |Divian International Inc $ 46,344,490 | $ 1,220,000 Nafico v v v 2
44 |CAJ Contracting Services $ 58,788,975 | $ 1,210,823 Caricom v v v 2




45 [Country Side Recycling $ 55,534,290 | $ 1,210,823 Assuria
Form of Tender Page
46 |Maximum Prestige General Contracting Services | Not Completed & No Bid Security Seen
Signed
47 |Tesseract Construction Guyana $ 56,230,020 | $ 1,124,600 Caricom

$ 60,541,163




Date of Tender Opening: March 27, 2025

File Number: National Irrigation Development Authority (167/2025/21) - Rehabilitation of All Weather Farm to Market Road in West Coast Berbice Lots 1-2

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.lSh
No. Currency . Copy | drive
Currency signed

1 |Sawa Investments Inc L1 $ 638,762,775 | $ 6,387,627 Premier v v v 2
1 |Sawa Investments Inc L2 $ 367,140,060 | $ 5,507,100
2 |Tesseract Cinstruction Guyana L1 $ 486,936,450 | $ 4,869,364 Caricom v v v 2
2 |Tesseract Cinstruction Guyana L2 $ 268,796,661 | $ 4,031,949
3 |Legalize Trucking & Contracting Service L1 $ 489,433,035 | $ 5,396,418 Caricom v v v 2
3 |Legalize Trucking & Contracting Service L2 $ 277,063,500 | $ 4,500,823
4 |NK Engineering Services L1 $ 530,376,735 | $ 5,400,000 Nafico v v v 1
5 |Eagle Eye Construction Company L1 $ 524,943,563 | $ 5,396,417 Premier v v v 2
5 |Eagle Eye Construction Company L2 $ 293,239,275 | $ 4,500,822
6 |AJM Enterprise L1 $ 537,391,838 | $ 5,396,417 Premier v v v 2
6 |AJM Enterprise L2 $ 299,023,410 | $ 4,500,822
7 |DS Construction Services & Supplies L1 $ 473,975,250 | $ 4,700,000 Assuria v v v 2
7 |DS Construction Services & Supplies L2 $ 271,321,680 | $ 4,275,000
8 |Daks Engineering Guyana L1 $ 481,082,070 | $ 4,810,820 Caricom v v v 2
8 |Daks Engineering Guyana L2 $ 279,059,970 | $ 4,185,899




9 |Triple A General Contracting Services L1 $ 476,718,690 | $ 4,767,187 Premier
9 |Triple A General Contracting Services L2 $ 265,757,310 | $ 3,986,360
10 [Permaul Trading & Distribution L1 $ 539,218,785 | $ 5,393,000 Premier
10 [Permaul Trading & Distribution L2 $ 295,671,768 | $ 4,436,000
11 |Alvin Chowramootoo Construction Services L1 | $ 439,200,725 | $ 5,596,418 Caricom
11 |Alvin Chowramootoo Construction Services L2 | $ 259,867,715 | $ 4,800,823
12 [Hoosein Logistics & Supplies Inc L1 $ 539,629,650 | $ 5,396,296 Caricom
12 [Hoosein Logistics & Supplies Inc L2 $ 299,721,345 | $ 4,495,820
13 [Well Built Construction Service L1 $ 585,237,870 | $ 5,852,379 Nafico
13 |Well Built Construction Service L2 $ 325,155,600 | $ 4,877,334
14 |STP Investments Inc L1 $ 536,811,975 | $ 5,368,120 Premier
14 |STP Investments Inc L2 $ 298,087,650 | $ 4,471,320
15 |K&A Contracting Services L1 $ 461,884,500 | $ 4,618,845 Assuria
15 |K&A Contracting Services L2 $ 268,826,775 | $ 4,032,402
16 [Navin & Sons Construction L1 $ 286,632,360 | $ 4,299,485 Assuria
16 [Navin & Sons Construction L2 $ 509,272,575 | $ 5,092,725
17 EECS (Empire Electrical Contracitng Services) $ 467011650 | $ 4,670,117 Premier

L1




EECS (Empire Electrical Contracitng Services)

17 Lo $ 266,025,585 | $ 3,990,384

18 [RZB Construction & General Supplies L1 $ 519,038,100 | $ 5,190,381 Caricom
18 [RZB Construction & General Supplies L2 $ 284,700,150 | $ 4,270,502

19 [Vulcan Group Inc L1 $ 515,276,213 | $ 5,396,417 Caricom
19 [Vulcan Group Inc L2 $ 292,479,023 | $ 4,500,822

20 |Adamantium Holdings L1 $ 537,879,095 | $ 5,380,000 Premier
21 |BK International Inc L1 $ 302,711,689 | $ 5,300,000 Nafico
21 |BK International Inc L2 $ 529,419,113 | $ 4,600,000

22 |Modern Construction & Trucking Service L1 $ 262,514,070 | $ 4,850,001 Assuria
22 |Modern Construction & Trucking Service L2 $ 485,000,145 | $ 3,937,711

23 |TSR Investments L1 $ 564,986,363 | $ 5,660,000 Nafico
23 |TSR Investments L2 $ 333,368,411 | $ 5,025,000

24 |Strategy & Development Consulting Inc L1 $ 533,739,150 No Bid Security Seen
24 |Strategy & Development Consulting Inc L2 $ 295,781,115

o5 Satar Mohamed & Son Construction & Hardware $ 536.747.610 | $ 5,400,000 Assuria

Supplies L1




Form of Tender Page

26 |B&J Civil Works L1 $ 5,500,000 Caricom
Not Seen
26 |B&J Civil Works L2 $ 6,200,000
27 |R. Razak Business Enterprise L1 $ 511,947,314 | $ 5,396,417 Premier
27 |R. Razak Business Enterprise L2 $ 282,882,459 | $ 4,500,822
28 |SINO Estates & Management Inc L1 $ 529,393,200 | $ 5,300,000 Caricom
29 |Romel Jagroop General Construction Service L1 | $ 556,517,850 | $ 5,396,418 Caricom
29 |Romel Jagroop General Construction Service L2 | $ 310,179,450 | $ 4,500,823
30 |Country Side Recycling L1 $ 524,641,425 | $ 5,396,417 Assuria
30 |Country Side Recycling L2 $ 290,034,780 | $ 4,500,822
31 |KNPS Contracting & Supplies L1 $ 525,353,325 | $ 5,253,533 Premier
31 |KNPS Contracting & Supplies L2 $ 290,776,500 | $ 4,361,647
32 |JS Engineering Services & Supplies L1 $ 462,323,400 | $ 4,623,234 Assuria
32 |JS Engineering Services & Supplies L2 $ 270,760,035 | $ 4,061,400
33 |Crown Road & Drainage Contractors L1 $ 477,696,450 | $ 5,396,418 Caricom
33 |Crown Road & Drainage Contractors L2 $ 265,112,925 | $ 4,500,823
34 A. Nazier & Son Contracting & General Supplies $ 572399 100 | $ 5,723,991 Assuria

L1




A. Nazier & Son Contracting & General Supplies

34 L2 $ 313,775,648 | $ 4,706,635
35 |Gopie Investments Inc L1 $ 511,928,550 | $ 5,396,418 Premier
35 |Gopie Investments Inc L2 $ 285,999,840 | $ 4,500,824
36 Masorj s Innovative Construction & General $ 520 693.425 | $ 5,206,934 Caricom
Supplies L1
36 Masor_1 s Innovative Construction & General $ 284334120 | $ 4,265011
Supplies L2
37 |Z&J Enterprise Inc L1 $ 537,706,838 | $ 5,396,417 Premier
37 |Z&J Enterprise Inc L2 $ 299,023,410 | $ 4,500,822
38 |VS Construction & Rice Industries L1 $ 461,416,200 | $ 4,614,162 Assuria
38 |VS Construction & Rice Industries L2 $ 267,754,515 | $ 4,016,318
39 |D. Chowkai & Sons Construction L1 $ 470,680,350 | $ 4,706,803 Caricom
39 |D. Chowkai & Sons Construction L2 $ 259,688,100 | $ 3,895,321
40 |Advance Engineering L1 $ 522,358,523 | $ 5,500,000 Assuria
40 |Advance Engineering L2 $ 289,206,971 | $ 4,650,000
41 [M&B Construction L1 $ 513,851,100 | $ 5,396,418 Premier
41 [M&B Construction L2 $ 288,755,450 | $ 4,500,823
49 N. Bhopaul & Son Trucking & Construction $ 527 715.825 | $ 5277158 Premier

Service L1




N. Bhopaul & Son Trucking & Construction

42 Service L2 $ 299,099,850 4,486,498
43 [JJ Mining & Construction $ 490,122,478 4,059,300 Premier
44 |Rahaman Construction & Transportation Service | $ 490,122,478 4,901,225 Caricom
45 |Vals Construction $ 823,987,815 8,239,878 Premier
46 |Best Builders Engineering & Genral Supplies $ 628,972,575 6,289,726 Assuria
47 |Jardin Construction $ 275,694,085 No Bid Security Seen
Form of Tender Page
48 |F&A Mohamed Construction Firm Not Completed & 6,485,384 Premier
Signed
49 |BM Property Investments Inc $ 648,524,900 12,970,482 Caricom
50 |Fazam Future Builders $ 628,468,050 6,284,681 Caricom
Engineer's Estimate L1 $ 539,641,725
Engineer's Estimate L2 $ 300,054,825




Date of Tender Opening: March 27, 2025

File Number: National Irrigation Development Authority (168/2025/21) - Construction of Revetment Works at Cove & John North Facade- walk

Bidder . . Bid Security . . Form of Hard| Flash
No. Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T_ender Copy | drive
Currency signed
1 [N&K General Construction $ 82,197,360 | $ 1,850,870 Caricom v v v 2
2 gérsir:;paul & Son Trucking & Construction $ 88,380,600 |$ 1,767,612 Premier v | v v 2
3 |You Nailed It Contracting Services $ 89,303,487 | $ 1,800,000 Nafico v v v 2
4 |Gopie Investments Inc $ 91,283,535 | $ 1,825,671 Premier v v v 2
5 |Proline Guyana Inc $ 91,248,360 | $ 1,826,000 Assuria v v v 2
6 |Imran Panel Door & Construction $ 82,295,220 | $ 1,851,000 Caricom v v v 2
7 |RA Construction & Company $ 90,072,780 | $ 1,850,871 Nafico v v v 2
8 |Fyuse Hoosein Construction Inc $ 81,674,880 | $ 1,900,000 Assuria v v v 2
9 |Fazam Future Builders $ 121,809,870 | $ 2,436,197 Caricom v v v 2
10 [Memorex Enterprise $ 101,400,621 | $ 2,029,000 Caricom v v v 2
11 |King Kong Construction $ 90,190,590 | $ 1,850,871 Caricom v v v 2
12 |Carter's Construction $ 83,608,382 | $ 1,850,871 Premier v v v 2
13 [Truck Smart $ 89,410,230 | $ 1,860,000 Premier v v v 2
14 |Harish Welding & General Construction $ 83,916,000 | $ 1,850,870 Caricom v v v 2
15 |L&M Engineering & Computer Services $ 82,932,360 | $ 1,850,870 Caricom v v v 2
16 [NK Engineering Service $ 84,296,100 | $ 1,860,000 Nafico v v v 1
17 |Rahaman Construction & Transportation Services| $ 78,201,165 | $ 1,564,023 Caricom v v v 2
18 |JS Engineering Services & Supplies $ 50,459,640 | $ 1,850,870 Caricom v v v 2
19 |K&A Contracting Services $ 84,502,950 | $ 1,850,870 Caricom v v v 2
20 |Daks Engineering Guyana $ 91,223,811 | $ 1,820,276 Caricom v v v 2
21 |TSR Investments $ 100,425,308 | $ 2,100,000 Nafico v v v 2




22 |S. Caimraj Construction Services $ 91,530,023 | $ 1,850,871 Premier X X v 2
23 |ACL Construction Guyana $ 91,751,310 | $ 1,860,000 Nafico v v v 2
24 |S Triple J's Enterprise $ 91,132,073 | $ 1,850,871 Premier X X v 2
25 |NP Contracting & Transportation Services $ 92,524,352 | $ 1,850,487 Premier v v v 2
26 [STP Investments Inc $ 91,491,540 | $ 1,829,840 Premier v v v 2
27 |F&A Mohamed Construction Firm $ 83,232,135 [ $ 1,850,871 Premier v v v 2
28 |Sawa Investments Inc $ 96,838,140 | $ 1,936,762 Premier v v v 2
29 [Maximum Prestige General Contracting Services Form of Tender P_age No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
Not Completed & Signed
30 |Sawh Construction Inc $ 91,320,023 | $ 1,850,870 Premier v v v 2
31 |JD's Construction & Supplies $ 84,132,720 | $ 1,682,654 Assuria v v v 2
32 |K. Ramdial Construction & Services $ 80,313,660 | $ 1,850,871 Caricom v v v 2
33 |Probuild Construction Service $ 90,681,360 | $ 1,813,627 Premier v v v 2
34 |RP Construction Services $ 75,531,620 | $ 1,590,632 Caricom v v v 2
35 |Ramesh Persaud & Son General Construction $ 78,598,065 | $ 1,571,961 Caricom v v v 2
36 |Anthony's Visionary Projects $ 83,056,680 | $ 1,850,870 Caricom v v v 2
37 |R. Razak Business Enterprise $ 85,870,890 | $ 1,850,871 Premier v v v 2
38 |CAJ Contracting Services Form of TenderPage | o ) g5 871 Caricom v | v X 2
Not Seen
39 |Debbie's Construction & General Supplies $ 75,086,550 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
40 |Black's & Son Construction $ 91,801,815 | $ 1,850,871 Nafico v v v 2
41 |Tesseract Construction Guyana $ 91,013,811 | $ 1,820,276 Caricom v v v 2
42 |Zeebo & Sons Construction Inc $ 86,507,715 [ $ 1,730,154 Premier v v v 2
43 |Ramlochan Construction & Trucking Inc $ 86,507,715 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
44 |C&M Construction & General Supplies $ 20,380,290 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
45 |Ash Civil Engineering Works $ 76,809,390 | $ 1,850,870 Nafico v v v 2




46 |Divyan International Inc $ 91,013,632 | $ 1,850,000 Nafico v v v 2
47 |Hoosein Logistics & Supplies Inc $ 92,542,380 | $ 1,850,847 Caricom v v v 1
48 |NA Construction Services $ 24,309,285 | $ 492,099 Nafico v X v 2
49 |Z&J Enterprise Inc $ 91,477,523 | $ 1,850,871 Premier Ltr Ltr v 2
50 |Charles Engineering Establishment $ 89,590,872 | $ 1,850,871 Caricom v v v 2
51 |[Triple A General Contracting Services $ 89,979,120 | $ 1,799,582 Premier v v v 1
52 |Multitech Engineering Services Inc $ 90,418,860 | $ 1,808,377 Premier v v v 2
53 |VS Construction & Rice Industries $ 84,073,290 | $ 1,850,880 Assuria v v v 2
54 |KNPS Contracting & Supplies $ 88,673,025 [ $ 1,773,460 Premier v v v 2
55 Eme_rald Pro Maintenance & Construction $ 84966000 | 1,699,320 Premier Y v v 5
Services
56 |Extermax Pest Control $ 78,651,552 | $ 1,573,031 Assuria v v v 2
57 |Eze way Construction Inc $ 92,539,860 | $ 1,850,797 Caricom v v v 2
58 |Raj Civil Engineering Construction $ 118,216,245 | $ 2,364,324 Diamond v v v 2
59 |BM Property Investments Inc. $ 92,542,800 | $ 1,850,856 Caricom v v v 2
60 [Colin Talbot Contracting Services $ 97,067,565 | $ 1,881,325 Assuria v v v 2
61 |Permaul Trading & Distribution $ 108,859,013 | $ 2,178,000 Premier v v v 2
62 |D. Chowkai & Sons Construction $ 81,845,400 | $ 1,636,908 Caricom v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 92,543,535




Date of Tender Opening: March 27, 2025

File Number: National Irrigation Development Authority (169/2025/21) - Timber Revetment Works in Clonbrook Middle Walk

i . Bid Securit Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.tSh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |NP Contracting & Transportation Services $ 24,544,769 | $ 490,895 Premier v v v 2
2 |NA Construction Services $ 89,768,175 | $ 1,856,871 Nafico v X v 2
3 |S. Caimraj Construction Services $ 24,421,478 | $ 492,099 Premier Letter |Letter v 2
4  |Ramesh Persaud & Son General Construction $ 20,742,435 | $ 414,846 Caricom v v v 2
5 RF Ipnovatlve Construction & Engineering $ 17.986.920 | $ 492,099 Nafico v v v 5
Services
6 |STP Investments Inc. $ 24,333,960 | $ 507,000 Premier v v v 2
7 |Ramlowchan Construction & Trucking Inc $ 22,601,355 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
8 |D's Farm $ 19,934,420 | $ 398,688 Caricom v v v 2
9 |Proline Guyana Inc $ 24,167,640 | $ 484,000 Assuria v v v 2
10 [F&A Mohamed Construction Firm $ 22,607,865 | $ 492,099 Premier v v v 2
11 |K. Whyte Construction $ 21,572,418 | $ 492,100 Assuria v v v 2
12 [RN Construction $ 31,188,255 | $ 623,765 Caricom v v v 2
13 |NSA Enterprise $ 23,672,670 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
14 |D Chowkai & Sons Construction $ 22,451,835 | $ 449,036 Caricom v v v 2
15 |Imran Panal Door & Construction $ 20,856,255 | $ 492,100 Caricom v v v 2
16 |Colin Talbot Contracting Services $ 25,166,820 | $ 503,337 Assuria v v v 2
17 |ERM Lall Civil Engineering Works $ 30,691,710 | $ 613,835 Assuria v v v 2
18 |Black's & Son Construction $ 24,202,605 | $ 492,099 Nafico v v v 2
19 |[Truck Smart $ 23,857,470 | $ 480,000 Premier v v v 2
20 [RA Construction & Company $ 24,307,605 | $ 492,099 Nafico v v v 2
21 |ACL Construction Guyana $ 23,907,450 | $ 478,149 Nafico v v v 2




Maximum Prestage General Construction

Form of Tender Not

: ) No Bi i
22 Services Completed or Signed 0 Bid Security Seen v v X !
23 |King Kong Constructions $ 23,162,160 | $ 492,099 Caricom v v v 2
24 |RP Construction Services $ 21,492,450 | $ 429,849 Caricom v v v 2
25 |C&M Construction & General Supplies $ 42,873,600 | $ 449,207 Caricom v | Receipt v 2
26 Egsﬂ‘i Pro Maintenance & Cosntruction $ 21,997,500 | $ 439,950 Caricom v | v v 2
27 |Ash Civil Engineering Works $ 18,707,430 | $ 281,593 Nafico v v v 2
28 |CAJ Contracting Services Form of Tender $ 492,099 Caricom v v X 2
Page Not Seen
29 |Z&J Enterprise Enterprise Inc $ 24,368,978 | $ 493,299 Premier Letter | Letter v 2
30 [Victorine Mentore Construction $ 24,190,420 No Bid Security Seen X X 2
31 |Divyan International Inc $ 24,467,467 | $ 500,000 Nafico v v v 2
32 |You Nailed Contracting Services $ 28,213,610 | $ 480,000 Nafico v v v 2
33 [N. Bhopaul & Son Trucking Services $ 21,671,370 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
34 g):rl?/riaczSGeneral Construction & Contracting $ 76,661,550 No Bid Security Seen v Letter v 2
35 [Debbies Construction & General Supplies $ 21,263,340 No Bid Security Seen v Letter v 2
36 |Sawh Construction Inc. $ 24,263,978 | $ 492,099 Premier v v v 2
37 [DNJJ Construction Services $ 22,370,040 | $ 447,401 Premier v v v 2
38 |K. Ramdial Construction & Services $ 19,858,125 | $ 492,099 Caricom v v v 2
39 |Ravin Boodram Contracting & Logistics $ 24,402,000 | $ 488,040 Assuria v v v 2
40 |Carters Construction $ 22,532,948 | $ 492,099 Premier v v v 2
41 |Fazam Future Builders $ 25,922,610 | $ 518,452 Caricom v v v 2
42 |Zaiboon Nesha Investments $ 23,883,300 | $ 472,099 Caricom v v v 2
43 |Eze Way Construction Inc $ 26,604,480 | $ 532,090 Caricom v v v 2
44 TSR Investments $ 26,265,068 | $ 560,000 Nafico v v v 2




45 [Hoosein Logistics & Supplies Inc $ 24,574,620 | $ 491,492 Caricom v v v 2

46 |Products & Services Hub Guyana (PASH) $ 23,615,865 | $ 472,317 Assuria v v v 2

47 |BM Property Investments Inc $ 24,517,605 | $ 490,352 Caricom v v v 2

48 |Four Brothers Construction & Hardware Supply | $ 22,601,355 | $ 452,028 v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 24,604,965




