
Bidder 

No.
Name of Bidder 

 Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 

Amount & 

Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 

Tender 

signed 

 Hard 

Copy 

Flash 

drive

1 Salus Diagnostic Inc  $            192,195,300  $          3,843,906 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

2 New GPC Inc  $            349,073,396  $          8,500,000 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

3 Caribbean Medical Supplies Inc  $              92,000,000  $          1,840,000 Nafico ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

Date of Tender Opening: May 02, 2025

File Number: Georgetown Public Hospital Corporation (141/2025/46) - Procurement Installation and Commissioning of Two Mammography Units 



Bidder 

No.
Name of Bidder 

 Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 

Amount & 

Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 

Tender 

signed 

 Hard 

Copy 

Flash 

drive

1 Engineering & Construction Inc  $            218,583,600  $          4,371,672 GTM ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

2 Tels Engineering Services  $            196,545,000  $          5,500,000 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

3 Machinery Corporation of Guyana Limited  $            296,092,058 ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

4 General Marine Company  $            199,480,577  $          4,180,000 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

5 Cummings Electrical Company Limted 168,462,744$             $          4,000,000 Nafico ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

Date of Tender Opening: May 02, 2025

File Number: Georgetown Public Hospital Corporation  (142/2025/46) - Procurement Installation and Commissioning of Electrical Equipment (Generator Load Center etc Within 

New ACDC Electrical Switchgear 

 No Bid Security Seen  



Bidder 

No.
Name of Bidder 

 Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 

Amount & 

Currency 

Bid Security 

Agency
GRA NIS 

Form of 

Tender 

signed 

 Hard 

Copy 

Flash 

drive

1 Electrofix Electrical Services L1  $                3,420,000  $             530,000 RBGL (Cheque) ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

1 Electrofix Electrical Services L2  $              20,007,000 

1 Electrofix Electrical Services L4  $                3,192,000 

Date of Tender Opening: May 02, 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (265/2025/21) - Supply and Delivery of Equipment for Process (Boiler House) Instrumentation Upgrade at Albion Estate Lots 1-4 



Bidder 

No.
Name of Bidder 

 Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 

Amount & 

Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 

Tender 

signed 

 Hard 

Copy 

Flash 

drive

1 Massy Motors Guyana Limited  $              25,500,000  $             510,000 CG United ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

2 Jumbo Jet Auto Sales  $              24,000,000  $             480,000 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

3 Marics & Company Limited  $              39,641,562  $             792,831 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

Date of Tender Opening: May 02, 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (266/2025/21) - Supply and Delivery of Three (3) 4WD Double Cab Pickup



Bidder 

No.
Name of Bidder 

 Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 

Amount & 

Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 

Tender 

signed 

 Hard 

Copy 

Flash 

drive

1 Arrowhead Construction Inc L1  $                6,734,545  $             200,000 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

1 Arrowhead Construction Inc L2  $                6,292,600  $             200,000 

2 Garnet Engineers L1  US$26,888  US$537.76 NA NA ✔ 2

2 Garnet Engineers L1 US$28,888  US$576.76 

3 Electrofix Electrical Services L1 15,470,000$               $             515,000 RBGL (chq) ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

3 Electrofix Electrical Services L2 7,100,000$                

Date of Tender Opening: May 02, 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (267/2025/21) - Supply and Delivery of Gear Drive, Gear Boxes and Motor for Bagasse Carriers at Albion Estate Lots 1-2 

Royal Bank of 

Canada 



Bidder 

No.
Name of Bidder 

 Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 

Amount & 

Currency 

Bid Security 

Agency
GRA NIS 

Form of 

Tender 

signed 

 Hard 

Copy 

Flash 

drive

NO BIDS RECEIVED

Date of Tender Opening: May 02, 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (269/2025/21) -  Supply and Delivery of Stoker Links and Accessories for Badcock & Wilcock Boiler at Blairmont Estate Lot 1-2  



Bidder 

No.
Name of Bidder 

 Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 

Amount & 

Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 

Tender 

signed 

 Hard 

Copy 

Flash 

drive

1 Electrofix Electrical Services  $              14,820,000  $             297,000 RBGL (chq) ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

2 Garnet Engineers  US$91888  US$1,837 
Royal Bank of 

Canada
NA NA ✔ 2

3 Arrowhead Construction Inc  $              14,375,000  $             600,000 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

Date of Tender Opening: May 02, 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (270/2025/21) - Supply and Delivery of 100 Teeth Gear & Pinion for Blairmont Estate



Bidder 

No.
Name of Bidder 

 Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 

Amount & 

Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 

Tender 

signed 

 Hard 

Copy 

Flash 

drive

1 Impeccable Construction & General Supplies Inc  $              22,040,000  $             440,800 BNS (Chq) ✔ ✔ ✔ 0

2 Alliance Investments  $              18,090,400  $             361,808 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

Date of Tender Opening: May 02, 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (271/2025/21) - Procurement of Lumber for Rehabilitation for Bridges at Rosehall Estate



Bidder 

No.
Name of Bidder 

 Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 

Amount & 

Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 

Tender 

signed 

 Hard 

Copy 

Flash 

drive

1 Yellow Steel Inc  $              15,390,000  $             307,800 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

Date of Tender Opening: May 02, 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (272/2025/21) - Supply & Delivery of High Tower Tractor for Boom Sprayer



Bidder 

No.
Name of Bidder 

 Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 

Amount & 

Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 

Tender 

signed 

 Hard 

Copy 

Flash 

drive

1 BD General Supplies  $                7,364,400  $             147,288 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

Date of Tender Opening: May 02, 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (273/2025/21) - Supply & Delivery of Steel Materials for Albion Building Structures



Bidder 

No.
Name of Bidder 

 Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 

Amount & 

Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 

Tender 

signed 

 Hard 

Copy 

Flash 

drive

1 TPLB Inc L1  US$18,050  $             178,882 Assuria NA NA ✔ 2

1 TPLB Inc L2  US$24,450 

2 Garnett Engineers L1  US$16,888  US$337.76 
Royal Bank of 

Canada
NA NA ✔ 2

2 Garnett Engineers L2 US$22,888  US$457.76 

2 Garnett Engineers L3 US$14,888  US$297.76 

3 Alliance Investments L1 4,363,600$                 $             100,000 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

Date of Tender Opening: May 02, 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (274/2025/21) - Supply and Delivery of Materials to Manufacture No. 03 Juice Heater for Albion Estate Lots 1-3



Bidder 

No.
Name of Bidder 

 Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 

Amount & 

Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 

Tender 

signed 

 Hard 

Copy 

Flash 

drive

1 AYN Construction & General Services  $              72,531,600  $          1,700,000 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

Date of Tender Opening: May 02, 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (275/2025/21) - Extension of Auxiliary Cane Carrier to Accept Billet Canes at Rose Hall Estate 



Bidder 

No.
Name of Bidder 

 Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 

Amount & 

Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 

Tender 

signed 

 Hard 

Copy 

Flash 

drive

1 Arrowhead Construction  $              21,833,317  $             600,000 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

2 Electrofix Electrical Services  $              14,820,000 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

3 Impeccable Construction & General Supplies Inc  $                9,234,000  $             184,680 BNS Chq ✔ ✔ ✔ 0

4 Garnett Engineers  US$31,888  US$637.76 
Royal Bank of 

Canada 
NA NA ✔ 2

Date of Tender Opening: May 02, 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (276/2025/21) - Supply and Delivery of Air Circuit Breakers for Upgrading Power House Switch Board Blairmont Estate 

 No Bid Security Seen  



Bidder 

No.
Name of Bidder 

 Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 

Amount & 

Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 

Tender 

signed 

 Hard 

Copy 

Flash 

drive

1 Garnet Engineers  US$59,888  US$1,197.76 
Royal Bank of 

Canada 
NA NA ✔ 2

2 Electrofix Electrical Services  $              17,100,000  $             342,000  RBGL Chq ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

Date of Tender Opening: May 02, 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (277/2025/21) -  Supply and Delivery of No. 1 Boiler ID Fan Complete with Drive Blairmont Estate



Bidder 

No.
Name of Bidder 

 Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 

Amount & 

Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 

Tender 

signed 

 Hard 

Copy 

Flash 

drive

1 Cremms Limited  US$45,933  $             273,585 Assuria NA NA ✔ 2

2 Garnet Engineers  US$44,888  US$897.76 
 Royal Bank of 

Canada 
NA NA ✔ 2

Date of Tender Opening: May 02, 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (278/2025/21) - Supply and Delivery of Crusher Bottom Roll Blairmont Estate 



Bidder 

No.
Name of Bidder 

 Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 

Amount & 

Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 

Tender 

signed 

 Hard 

Copy 

Flash 

drive

1 TPLB Inc  US$130,192  US$2,604 Assuria NA NA ✔ 2

2 Garnet Engineers  US$118,888  US$2,377.76  Royal  NA NA ✔ 2

3 Arrowhead Construction  $              19,648,928  $             600,000 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

4 Alliance Investments  $              26,426,760  $             523,780 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

Date of Tender Opening: May 02, 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (279/2025/21) - Supply and Delivery of Air Heater Tubes Albion Estate 



Bidder 

No.
Name of Bidder 

 Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 

Amount & 

Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 

Tender 

signed 

 Hard 

Copy 

Flash 

drive

1 Garnet Engineers L1  US$58,888  US$1,177.76 
Royal Bank of 

Canada 
NA NA ✔ 2

1 Garnet Engineers L2  US$28,888  US$577.76 

1 Garnet Engineers L3  US$58,888  US$1,177.76 

2 Arrowhead Construction L1 10,536,180$               $             600,000 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

2 Arrowhead Construction L2 5,219,500$                 $             200,000 

2 Arrowhead Construction L3 7,978,908$                 $             200,000 

3 TPLB Inc L1 US$52,000  US$3,024 Assuria NA NA ✔ 2

3 TPLB Inc L2 US$21,200

3 TPLB Inc L3 US$78,000

4 Alliance Investments L1 12,255,000$               $             665,760 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

4 Alliance Investments L2 5,643,000$                

4 Alliance Investments L3 15,390,000$              

Date of Tender Opening: May 02, 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (280/2025/21) - Supply and Delivery of Various Tubes for Uitvlugt Estate   



Bidder 

No.
Name of Bidder 

 Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 

Amount & 

Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 

Tender 

signed 

 Hard 

Copy 

Flash 

drive

1 Garnet Engineers L1  US$34,888  US$317.76 
Royal Bank of 

Canada 
NA NA ✔ 2

1 Garnet Engineers L2  US$15,888  US$697.76 

Date of Tender Opening: May 02, 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (281/2025/21) - Supply and Delivery of Cane Gantry Railand Wheel at Albion Estate Lots 1-2 



Bidder 

No.
Name of Bidder 

 Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 

Amount & 

Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 

Tender 

signed 

 Hard 

Copy 

Flash 

drive

1 Arrowhead Construction Inc L1  $                3,786,000  $             100,000 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

1 Arrowhead Construction Inc L2  $              18,136,989  $             600,000 

2 Garnet Engineers L1  US$15,888  US$317.76 
Royal Bank of 

Canada
NA NA ✔ 2

2 Garnet Engineers L2 US$176,888  US$3,537.76 

Date of Tender Opening: May 02, 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (282/2025/21 - Supply and Delivery of Feeder Head Shaft and Bearing at Albion Estate Lots 1-2 



Bidder 

No.
Name of Bidder 

 Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 

Amount & 

Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 

Tender 

signed 

 Hard 

Copy 

Flash 

drive

1 Electrofix Electrical Services  $                6,042,000  $             121,000 RBGL (chq) ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

Date of Tender Opening: May 02, 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (283/2025/21) - Supply and Delivery of Cane Gantry Hoist and Travel Resistant Bank Albion Estate 



Bidder 

No.
Name of Bidder 

 Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 

Amount & 

Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 

Tender 

signed 

 Hard 

Copy 

Flash 

drive

1 Garnet Engineers  US$118,888  US$2,377.76 
Royal Bank of 

Canada 
NA NA ✔ 2

Date of Tender Opening: May 02, 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (284/2025/21) - Supply and Delivery of Boiler ID Fans for Albion Estate   



Bidder 

No.
Name of Bidder 

 Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 

Amount & 

Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 

Tender 

signed 

 Hard 

Copy 

Flash 

drive

1 AYN Construction & General Services  $              17,000,000  $             400,000 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

2 Shop Modern Guyana  $                6,985,600  $             575,000  Assuria  ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

3 Garnet Engineers  US$99,888  US$619.76 
Royal Bank of 

Canada 
NA NA ✔ 2

Date of Tender Opening: May 02, 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (285/2025/21) - Supply and Delivery of 60 Ton Platform Weigh Bridge Rose Hall Estate 



Bidder 

No.
Name of Bidder 

 Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 

Amount & 

Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 

Tender 

signed 

 Hard 

Copy 

Flash 

drive

NO BIDS RECEIVED

Date of Tender Opening: May 02, 2025

File Number: Guyana Sugar Corporation (286/2025/21) - Supply and Delivery of Gears for Mill Double Reduction Gear Box-Albion Estate



Bidder 

No.
Name of Bidder 

 Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 

Amount & 

Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 

Tender 

signed 

 Hard 

Copy 

Flash 

drive

1 R Kissoon Contracting  $            390,626,250  $          5,665,000 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

2 D Sawh Mechanical Workshop  $            345,344,989  $          6,600,000  Premier  ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

3 Persaud Engineering &  $            409,693,200  $          6,000,000 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

4 Crown Road and Drainage Contractors  $            354,565,050  $          5,400,000 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 0

5 General Engineering Services C Inc 379,107,750$             $          7,500,000 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

Engineer's Estimate 420,115,500$            

Date of Tender Opening: May 02, 2025

File Number: National Drainage & Irrigation Authority (251/2025/21) - Maintenance and Servicing to NDIA Drainage and Irrigation Pumps within Region No. 06 



Bidder 

No.
Name of Bidder 

 Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 

Amount & 

Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 

Tender 

signed 

 Hard 

Copy 

Flash 

drive

1 R&M Mining Investment Project Inc  $              36,298,100  $             786,819 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

2 Dave Singh & Sons Contracting Services  $              39,733,020  $             795,460  Premier  ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

3 Keystone Industries  $              37,026,240  $             740,525 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

4 STP Investments Inc  $              37,779,400  $             755,588 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

5 BM Property Investment Inc 41,154,800$               $             823,096 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

6 Mahase Construction 31,511,600$               $             786,820 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

7 Triple A General Contracting 33,842,600$               $             767,852 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

8 Gopie Investments Inc 43,804,400$               $             780,000 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

9 Raj Civil Engineering Construction 34,125,800$               $             682,516 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

10 Nexxgen Investments 39,153,600$               $             790,000 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

11 Padmore's Contracting Services 
 Form of Tender not 

Completed & Signed  
 $             674,100 Caricom X X X 0

12 Focus Logistics & Contracting Services 38,048,100$               $             786,819 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

13 AOUD Kumar Construction 35,214,700$               $             786,820 Caricom X ✔ ✔ 1

14 M Sukhai Contracting Services 39,303,600$               $             790,000 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 0

15 Persaud Engineering & Hydraulic Services 35,685,540$               $             786,820 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

16 Prosperity Investment Inc 37,094,200$               $             786,819 Demerara Fire ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

Engineer's Estimate 37,467,600$              

Date of Tender Opening: May 02, 2025

File Number: National Drainage & Irrigation Authority (252/2025/21) - Rehabilitation of Brickery South Sluice EBD 



Bidder 

No.
Name of Bidder 

 Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 

Amount & 

Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 

Tender 

signed 

 Hard 

Copy 

Flash 

drive

1 Triple A General Contracting Services  $            135,933,420  $          2,039,001 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

2 Persaud Engineering & Hydraulic Services  $            151,668,510  $          2,458,108  Caricom  ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

3 Permaul Trading & Distribution  $            162,392,370  $          2,433,000 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

4 R&M Mining Investment Project Inc  $            161,166,285  $          3,277,278 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

5 Prosperity Investment Inc 157,788,960$             $          2,458,109 Demerara Fire ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

6 Dave Singh & Sons Contracting Services 61,728,209$               $          3,185,185 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

7 Memorex Enterprise 241,145,835$             $          3,750,000 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

8 Kascon Engineering 155,300,880$             $          2,460,000 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

9 D Sawh Mechanical Workshop 155,879,745$             $          2,458,109 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

10 JR Engineering Solutions 156,706,260$             $          2,445,000 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

11 BM Property Investments Inc  $            165,184,740  $          3,303,694 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

12 Jaiand Commodities Inc 153,126,068$             $          2,458,109 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

13 Focus Logistics & Contracting Services Inc 162,578,692$             $          3,277,278 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

14 D David International 126,696,020$             $          2,458,109 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

Engineer's Estimate 163,873,920$            

Date of Tender Opening: May 02, 2025

File Number: National Drainage & Irrigation Authority (253/2025/21) - Construction of Drainage Sluice & Outfall at Buses Lust, EBB



Bidder 

No.
Name of Bidder 

 Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 

Amount & 

Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 

Tender 

signed 

 Hard 

Copy 

Flash 

drive

1 Nexxgen Investments  $              17,577,000  $             360,000 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

2 Mahase Construction  $              13,179,000  $             330,960  Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

3 SAAS Procurement & Contracting Services  $              16,260,300 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

4 M. Sukhai Contracting Services  $              17,734,500  $             360,000 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

5 Aoud Kumar Construction 16,020,900$               $             330,960 Caricom X ✔ ✔ 1

6 Next Wave Infrastructure 13,743,450$               $             274,869 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

7 Dave Singh & Sons Contracting Services 16,384,000$               $             327,680 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

8 Prestigious Electrical General Construction & 15,863,400$               $             330,960 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

9 Key Stone Industries 16,445,625$               $             328,913 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

10 Prosperity Investment Inc 14,185,500$               $             330,960 Demerara Fire ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

11 BM Property Investments Inc 19,817,975$               $             356,359 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

12 R&M Mining Investments Inc 15,765,750$               $             330,960 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

13 RN Construction 14,311,500$              286,230$             Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

14 Focus Logistics & Contracting Services Inc 15,636,600$              330,960$             Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

15 Gopie Investments Inc 22,044,750$              440,895$             Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

Engineer's Estimate 16,548,000$              

Date of Tender Opening: May 02, 2025

File Number: National Drainage & Irrigation Authority (254/2025/21) - Rehabilitation of Drainage Channel at Brickery North Sluice EBD 

 No Bid Security Seen 



Bidder 

No.
Name of Bidder 

 Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 

Amount & 

Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 

Tender 

signed 

 Hard 

Copy 

Flash 

drive

1 Triple A General Contracting Services  $            132,207,128  $          1,983,107 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

2 Dass Construction  $            153,745,830  $          3,105,184  Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

3 Gopie Investments Inc  $            150,016,335  $          2,250,000 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

4 D. David International  $            121,332,700  $          2,328,888 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

5 Focus Logistics & Contracting Services Inc 154,338,660$             $          2,105,184 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

6 R&M Mining Investments Project Inc 152,599,000$             $          3,105,184 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

Engineer's Estimate 155,259,195$            

Date of Tender Opening: May 02, 2025

File Number: National Drainage & Irrigation Authority (255/2025/21) - Construction of Drainage Structure at Good Successm Wakenaam Island 



Bidder 

No.
Name of Bidder 

 Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 

Amount & 

Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 

Tender 

signed 

 Hard 

Copy 

Flash 

drive

1 Delta Construction Services  $              16,438,275  $             328,766 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

2
JPM's General Construction & Engineering 

Services
 $              16,779,788  $             386,000  Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

3 BM Property Investments Inc  $              20,383,125  $             407,662 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

4 Raj Civil Engineering Construction  $              17,184,074  $             343,681 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

5 D&R Construction 18,449,393$               $             388,000 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

6 Vulcan Group Inc 21,096,075$               $             386,547 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

7 Khan's Construction & Transportation Services Inc 18,366,863$               $             500,000 Nafico ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

8 Dave Singh & Son Contracting Services 18,393,517$               $             367,870 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

9 Prestigous General Contruction & Fabrication 18,580,275$               $             386,546 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

Engineer's Estimate  $              19,327,350 

Date of Tender Opening: May 02, 2025

File Number: National Drainage & Irrigation Authority (256/2025/21) - Construction of Drainage Structure at Good Successm Wakenaam Island



Bidder 

No.
Name of Bidder 

 Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 

Amount & 

Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 

Tender 

signed 

 Hard 

Copy 

Flash 

drive

1 Vulcan Group Inc  $              31,735,200  $             674,100 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

2 Focus Logistics & Contracting Services Inc  $              31,711,050  $             674,100  Caricom  ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

3 BM Property Investments Inc  $              34,938,750  $             698,775 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

4 Forlene and Sons Logistics Inc  $              28,496,895  $             569,938 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

5 Superior Construction & Contracting Service 29,956,500$               $             600,000 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

6 Dass Construction 32,280,255$               $             674,100 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

7 Gopie Investment Inc 33,358,500$               $             670,000 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

8 Khan's Construction & Transportation Services Inc 29,439,375$               $             760,000 Nafico ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

9 Kaydar Persaud Contracting 30,712,500$              ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

10 STP Investments 29,977,500$               $             599,550 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

11 Mahase Construction  $              25,394,600  $             674,100 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

12 NP Investment 30,502,500$              ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

13 Prestigous General Construction & Fabrication 32,050,200$               $          2,251,141 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

14 SP Engineering & Construction Services 30,187,500$               $             603,750 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

15 R&M Mining Investment Project Inc 30,556,050$               $             674,100 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

16 Dave Singh & Sons Contracting Services 33,359,445$               $             667,189 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

17 Nexxgen Investments 31,798,200$              650,000$             Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

18 M Sukhai Contracting Services 32,113,200$              650,000$             Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

19 Triple A General Contracting Services 28,624,050$              572,481$             Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

20 Prosperity Investment Inc 29,668,800$              674,100$             Demerara Fire ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

Engineer's Estimate 33,705,000$              

Date of Tender Opening: May 02, 2025

File Number: National Drainage & Irrigation Authority (257/2025/21) - Construction of 150 Feet of Timber Revetment along Lamaha Canal, Meadow Brook Gardens

 No Bid Security Seen  

 No Bid Security Seen  



Bidder 

No.
Name of Bidder 

 Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 

Amount & 

Currency 

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 

Tender 

signed 

 Hard 

Copy 

Flash 

drive

1 Mahase Construction  $              15,399,700  $             375,018 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

2 DNJJ Construction Services  $              15,472,275  $             309,446  Premier  ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

3 Khan's Construction & Transportation Services Inc  $              17,790,150  $             500,000 Nafico ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

4 Forlene & Sons Logistics Inc  $              16,180,447  $             323,609 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

5
JPM's General Construction & Engineering 

Services 
16,374,461$               $             374,000 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

6 RN Construction 17,022,443$               $             340,449 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

7 BM Property Investments Inc 20,599,950$               $             411,999 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

8 Prestigious Electrical General Construction & Fab 18,039,525$               $             375,018 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

9 Vulcan Group Inc 19,952,100$               $             375,018  Caricom  ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

10 Dave Singh & Son Contracting Services 18,017,265$               $               22,000 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

Engineer's Estimate 18,750,900$              

Date of Tender Opening: May 02, 2025

File Number: National Drainage & Irrigation Authority (258/2025/21) - Rehabilitation of Access Bridges at Den Amstel East Sideline
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1 Morris Jeffrey Enterprise  $            108,637,200  $          1,187,000 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

2 Cedar Engineering  $            105,809,550  $          1,875,000  Caricom  ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

3 D&R Construction & Machinery Rental  $            107,112,600  $          1,875,000 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

4 Focus Logistics & Contracting Services Inc  $            125,585,250  $          1,875,000 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

5 Crown Road and Drainage Contractors 247,380,000$             $          3,750,000 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 0

6 R Kissoon Contracting Service 103,698,000$             $          1,567,500 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

7 R&M Mining Investment Project Inc 124,299,000$             $          1,875,000 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

8 SP Engineering & Construction Services 128,005,500$             $          2,560,110 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

9 STP Investments Inc 127,769,250$             $          2,555,385  Premier  ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

10 A&E Construction Supplies & Services 110,443,200$             $          1,875,000 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

11 Prosperity Investment Inc  $              69,573,000  $          1,035,000 Demerara Mutual ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

Engineer's Estimate 128,319,167$            

Date of Tender Opening: May 02, 2025

File Number: National Drainage & Irrigation Authority (259/2025/21) - Operation, Servicing & Monitoring of NDIA Dydraulic Excavators & Pontoon to Dredge Channels within 

Georgetown, Region 4
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1 Triple A General Contracting Services  $            140,316,750  $          2,104,751 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

2 BS Narine & Sons Investment  $            154,566,300  $          2,318,594  Caricom  ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

3 Ican Engineering & Construction  $            138,320,200  $          2,074,811 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

4 Prosperity Investment Inc  $            150,469,200  $          2,458,109 Demerara Mutual ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

5 IMS Construction & Logistics Services 139,901,790$             $          2,100,000 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

6 Evolution Contractors Inc 130,583,460$             $          2,107,840 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

7 Deowdat Singh Construction Firm 124,255,425$             $          1,890,000 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

8 Focus Logistics & Contracting Services Inc 161,298,000$             $          3,277,478 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

9 Gurdev Mahadeo Contracting Services 138,434,100$             $          1,500,000  Assuria  ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

10 United Builder Engineering General Supply 137,893,800$             $          1,500,000 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

11 R&M Investments Project Inc  $            160,287,750  $          3,277,478 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

12 Beshaun Construction Service 130,637,850$             $          1,959,567  Caricom  ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

13 Dave Singh & Sons Contracting Service 139,523,432$             $          2,790,469 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

Engineer's Estimate 140,522,634$            

Date of Tender Opening: May 02, 2025

File Number: National Drainage & Irrigation Authority (260/2025/21) - Construction of Revetment for Relief Structure, Itiribusi Conservancy


