Date of Tender Opening: May 19, 2026

File Number: Guyana Civil Aviation Authority (83/2026/34) - Construction of New Air Traffic Control Tower at Timehri

. . Bid Security Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed

1 ];Iil(r}tifr)natlonal Inc, GECI Espnola Navigation Systems S 3.900,000,000 | $ 21,700,000 Nafico v v v ) )
Shandong High-Speed Dejian Group Company Limited,

2 |Beijing Institute of Architectural Design Company US $21,648,270.00 | US $100,000 Premier N/A | N/A v 2 2
Limited (J.V)

3 |China CAMCE Engineering Company Limited US $89,082,635.86 | i Securing Declaration Page N/A | N/A v 2 | 2

Completed & Signed




Date of Tender Opening: May 19, 2026

File Number: Ethnic Relations Commission (82/2026/03) - Provision of Security Services

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |Vision International Security & Bodyguard Inc $ 10,984,128 | § 109,841 Premier v v v 2
2 |Sheriff Security Inc $ 6,845,472 | $ 62,750 Assuria X v v 2
3 |Accusafe Security Service Inc $ 6,275,016 | $ 68,455 Assuria X X v 2
4 |RK's Guyana Security Services $ 8,177,220 | $ 100,000 Premier v v v 2
5 |Elite Protection Services Inc $ 9,321,600 | $ 106,266 Premier X Rec v 2




Date of Tender Opening: May 19, 2026

File Number: Ministry of Health (266/2026/47) - Supply, Delivery & Installation of Medical Equipment Lots 1-6

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::g::; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |R's Modern Construction & Supplies $ 1,632,201,500 | $ 32,644,030 Premier v v v 2
2 |Optique Vision Care $ 1,004,914,219 | $ 22,000,000 Assuria v v v 2
3 S&K Construction, Consultancy Services & General S 479.337.610 | $ 9,586,752 Premier v v v )
Supplies Inc
4 |A. Ograsein & Sons $ 1,553,116,100 | $ 31,062,322 Premier v v v 2
5 |Meditron Inc $ 902,957,572 | $ 18,059,152 Diamond v v v 1
6 |Millennium Supplies & Distribution Inc $ 201,834,500 | $ 5,940,000 Premier v v v 2
7 |Caribbean Medical Supplies Inc $ 561,818,330 | $§ 112,236,367 Nafico v v v 2
8 |Don Taylor Enterprise $ 621,827,525 | $ 12,436,551 Caricom v v v 2
9 |Alpha Diagnostic & Biomedical Services $ 117,120,200 | $ 2,342,404 Premier v v v 2
10 |BPI Guyana Inc $ 235,838,290 | $ 4,716,765 Assuria v v v 2
11 |General Engineering Supplies & Services Inc $ 768,496,818 | $ 17,000,000 Assuria v v v 2
12 |New GPC Inc $ 659,709,001 | $§ 21,000,000 Assuria v v v 2
13 |Clever Solutions $ 1,195,625,198 | $ 25,000,000 Assuria v v v 2
14 |K.D Enterprise $ 341,869,000 | $ 7,000,000 | Bank of Baroda v v v 2
15 |Western Scientific Company Limited US $3,865,362.05 | $ 27,300,000 Premier N/A | N/A v 2




Date of Tender Opening: May 19, 2026

File Number: Georgetown Public Hospital Corporation (73/2026/47) - Supply, Delivery & Commissioning of a Fixed Fluoroscopy Unit

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.sh
No. Currency . Copy | drive
Currency signed
1 |New GPC Inc $ 111,043,655 v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: May 19, 2026

File Number: Guyana Energy Agency (157/2026/02) - Consultancy Services for Training in Shoreline Cleanup & Assessment Technique

Bidder
No.

Name of Bidder

Bid Amount &
Currency

Bid Security
Amount &
Currency

Bid Security Agency

GRA

NIS

Form of
Tender
signed

Hard
Copy

Flash
drive

NO BIDS RECEIVED




Date of Tender Opening: May 19, 2026

File Number: Guyana Energy Agency (158/2026/02) - Design, Supply, Installation & Commissioning of Solar Photovoltaic Systems at 11 Locations in the Hinterland

. . Bid Security Form of
Blgder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.sh
0. Currency . Copy | drive
Currency signed
1 |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 149,595,600 | $ 3,000,000 Caricom v v v 2
2 |Green Energy Electrical Services $ 47,992,500 | $ 1,600,000 Premier v v v 1 2




Date of Tender Opening: May 19, 2026

File Number: Guyana Energy Agency (159/2026/02) - Supply & Delivery of Electrical Materials for Lots 1-2

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |S.P.R Enterprises L1 $ 1,779,595 | $ 850,000 Assuria v v v 2
S.P.R Enterprises 1.2 $ 36,587,395
2 |Tels Engineering Services L1 $ 1,648,100 | $ 100,000 Assuria v v v 2
Tels Engineering Services L2 $ 28,317,200 | $ 700,000




Date of Tender Opening: May 19, 2026

File Number: National Parks Commission (123/2026/01) - Supply & Delivery of Dietary Supplies-Beef for the Zoological Park

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |N.T Ventures $ 14,400,000 | $ 360,000 Assuria v v v 2
2 |HR Distibutors $ 13,500,000 | $ 400,000 Assuria v v v 2
3 |GAB Logistics $ 22,000,000 | $ 440,000 Premier v v v 2
4 |M&D Investments $ 17,637,000 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
5 |R1 Consultancy $ 14,000,000 | $ 281,000 Demerara Fire v v v 2
6 |Paradise Food Products $ 18,850,000 | $ 377,000 Diamond v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: May 19, 2026

File Number: National Parks Commission (124/2026/01) - Provision of Baton Security Services for the Zoological Park

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;

Currency signed
1  |Centaur Security Service $ 24,637,133 | $ 246,371 Premier v v v 2
2 |Norek Safety & Security $ 9,964,512 | $ 199,290 Nafico v v v 2
3 |Sleepin Hotel Security $ 12,398,400 | $ 123,984 Assuria v v v 2
4  |Accusafe Security Service Inc $ 10,434,420 | $ 115,938 Assuria v v v 2
5 |Vision International Security & Bodyguard Inc $ 16,087,680 | $ 160,876 Premier v v v 2
6 |L.A Security Solutions Inc $ 3,238,467 | $ 32,385 Nafico v v v 2
7 |RK's Guyana Security Services $ 13,647,524 | $ 160,000 Premier v v v 2
8 |Elite Protection Services $ 12,006,000 | $ 136,868 Premier v v v 2
9  |Sheriff Security Inc $ 11,593,800 | $ 104,344 Assuria v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: May 19, 2026

File Number: National Parks Commission (125/2026/01) - Construction of Stage & Dressing Room, National Park Tarmac

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1  |Buju Maintenance Services $ 44,616,410 | $ 900,000 Caricom v v v 2
2 |Prime Axis Construction/Logistics $ 43,909,700 No Bid Security Seen v v v
3 |Rishma & Sisters Enterprise $ 48,143,288 | $ 962,866 Premier v v v 2
4  |Office Pro Enterprise & Contracting Services $ 48,975,720 | $ 979,514 Assuria v v v 2
5 |R. Pooran Bobcat Rental Service $ 41,134,100 | $ 822,682 Caricom v v v 2
6 |Fullworks Construction $ 37,878,200 | $ 757,564 Premier v v v 2
7  |Kaizen Industries $ 43,827,860 | $ 1,000,000 Premier v v v 1
8 |R&W Construction Plus $ 23,127,680 | $ 886,445 Premier v v v 2
9 |Norek Construction $ 52,117,334 | $ 1,042,347 Assuria v v v 1
10 |Major Construction & Supplier $ 44,204,400 | $ 884,088 Assuria v v v 2
11 |Emeralds General Contracting & Distributors $ 48,521,660 | $ 1,100,000 Premier v v v 2
12 |B&N Construction Inc $ 47,503,300 | $ 980,000 Premier v v v 2
13 |The Builders $ 41,942,560 | $ 745,851 Caricom v v v 2
14 |JPM's General Construction & Engineering $ 43,293,145 | $ 910,000 Caricom v v v 2
15 |KV Contracting Services $ 24,972,840 | $ 902,642 Caricom v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: May 19, 2026

File Number: Ministry of Home Affairs (212/2026/51) - Procurement of Information Technology & Communication Equipment-Guyana Police Force

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |FDT Solutions $ 5,109,050 | $ 102,181 Demerara Fire v v v 1
2 |KM Technology $ 14,517,236 | $ 292,615 Diamond v v v 2
3 |MS Investments $ 30,908,300 | $ 618,166 Premier v v v 2
4 |General Distributors $ 17,578,748 | $ 360,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |Digital Technology Group of Companies Inc $ 28,354,500 | $ 567,090 Assuria v v v 2
6 |Promotech Guyana Inc $ 30,278,067 | $ 605,561 Premier v v v 1
7  |Petran Corporation Inc $ 19,672,470 | $ 450,000 Assuria v v v 2
8 |PBS Technologies Guyana Inc $ 38,308,858 | $ 766,177 Premier v v v 2
9 S&K Constmctlon, Consultancy Services & General 3 30.742.886 | $ 614.858 Premier v v v )
Supplies Inc
10 |MAEC Enterprises $ 27,684,470 | $ 553,689 Assuria v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: May 19, 2026

File Number: Ministry of Home Affairs (213/2026/51) - Procurement of Assorted Mechanical Tools-Guyana Fire Service

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |Jasper Trading Enterprise $ 24,778,840 | $ 495,577 Assuria v v v 1
5 S&K Construction, Consultancy Services & General S 13.856,024 | 297,653 Premier v v v )
Supplies Inc
3 |Full Service Enterprise $ 48,172,753 | $ 963,454 Premier v v v 2
4 |MS Investments $ 14,396,400 | $ 287,928 Premier v v v 2
5 |AZ-SAV Investment $ 4,300,000 | $ 100,000 Caricom v v v 2
6 |Meditron Inc $ 15,121,705 | $ 302,434 Diamond v v v 2
7 |J.AM Logistics & Construction $ 17,834,798 No Bid Security Seen v v v 1




Date of Tender Opening: May 19, 2026

File Number: Ministry of Home Affairs (214/2026/51) - Procurement of Tires-Guyana Fire Service

. . Bid Security Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |2020 FMCG Inc $ 42,904,745 | $ 922,090 RGBL v v v 2
5 gi)l;iceznstructlon, Consultancy Services & General S 64.374,000 | § 1,287,480 Premier v v v )
3 |MS Investments $ 64,430,500 | $ 1,288,610 Premier v v v 2
4  |Jasper Trading Enterprise $ 69,141,000 | $ 1,382,820 Assuria v v v 1
5 |JR Engineering Solutions $ 33,790,400 | $ 675,800 Assuria v v v 1




Date of Tender Opening: May 19, 2026

File Number: Ministry of Home Affairs (215/2026/51) - Procurement of Complete Water Filtration System with Installation-Guyana Fire Service

. . Bid Security Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |GuyBiz Establishment $ 12,900,000 | $ 258,000 Assuria v v v 2
5 S&K Constmctlon, Consultancy Services & General S 24.279.800 | $ 124,757 Premier v v v )
Supplies
3 |MS Investments $ 24,300,000 | $ 486,000 Premier v v v 2
4 (2020 FMCG Inc $ 4,993,120 | $ 100,000 RBGL v v v 1
5 |J.AM Logistics & Construction $ 7,046,850 No Bid Security Seen v v v 1




Date of Tender Opening: May 19, 2026

File Number: Ministry of Home Affairs (216/2026/51) - Procurement of Information Equipment-Guyana Fire Service

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1  |Digital Technology Group of Companies Inc $ 20,427,000 | $ 408,340 Assuria v v v 2
2 |DyamlQ Inc $ 6,358,067 | $ 125,000 Premier v v v 2
3 |MAEC Enterprises $ 20,353,530 | $ 387,071 Assuria v v v 2
4 |Meditron Inc $ 8,652,695 | $ 173,053 Diamond v v v 2
5 |MS Investments $ 27,091,000 | $ 541,820 Premier v v v 2
6 |Laparkan Trading Guyana Limited $ 390,000 BSD C/S v v v 1
7 |Modern Engineering Supplies & Services $ 9,695,000 | $ 500,000 Assuria v v v 1
8 |FDT Solutions $ 4,373,600 | $ 87,472 Demerara Fire v v v 2
9 S&K Constmctlon, Consultancy Services & General 3 27.105,000 | § 542,100 Premier v v v )
Supplies Inc

10 |GuyBiz Establishment $ 13,000,000 | $ 260,000 Assuria v v v 2
11 |Promotech Guyana Inc $ 12,116,414 | $ 242,328 Premier v v v 1
12 |General Distributors $ 9,706,487 | $ 360,000 Caricom v v v 2
13 |KM Technology $ 11,780,000 | $ 235,600 Diamond v v v 2
14 |PBS Technologies Guyana Inc $ 21,804,063 | $ 436,081 Premier v v v 1
15 |Petran Corporation Inc $ 15,113,323 | $ 350,000 Assuria v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: May 19, 2026

File Number: Regional Democratic Council Region #3 (03/2026/73) - Construction of Ball Field Road Parika

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1  |Sheik Hussein Contracting Services $ 29,618,150 | $ 550,000 Premier v v v 2
2 |Western Scientific Company Limited $ 29,040,100 | $ 550,000 Caricom v v v 2
3 [R. Persaud Excavation Services $ 25,154,400 | $ 550,000 Assuria v v v 2
4 |H. Tribhowan Contracting & Equipment Rentals $ 26,420,000 | $ 550,000 Assuria v v v 2
5 |V.K Excavator Rental $ 23,145,600 | $ 550,000 Caricom v v v 2
6 |KRD Contractors & General Services $ 25,135,500 | $ 550,000 Assuria v v v 2
7 |Mobile Construction Company $ 25,065,400 | $ 550,000 Caricom v v v 2
8 |Golden Goose Construction Services $ 28,208,600 | $ 550,000 Premier v v v 2
9 |A.M.LC General Contracting Services $ 23,719,400 | $ 550,000 Caricom v v v 2
10 |Roadmaster Construction $ 23,257,200 | $ 550,000 Assuria v v v 2
11 |Abdool Shaw Construction $ 25,992,800 | $ 550,000 Caricom v v v 2
12 |Mohamed Saiyad Enterprise $ 28,225,600 | $ 550,000 Premier v v v 2
13 |Mahamad Haseeb Bacchus Enterprise Construction $ 28,290,600 | $ 550,000 Premier v v v 2
14 |Infinite Investments $ 22,837,900 | $ 550,000 Caricom v v v 2
15 |Rambarran's Construction Service $ 23,234,200 | $ 550,000 Assuria v v v 2
16 |K.H Construction & General Merchandise $ 29,708,400 | $ 550,000 Caricom v v v 2
17 |SVN & Son Investments $ 25,884,480 | $ 550,000 Caricom v v v 2
18 |S. Singh Construction Service $ 25,792,400 | $ 550,000 Premier v v v 2
19 |P.P Building Contracting $ 25,993,000 | $ 550,000 Assuria v v v 2
20 |I.Khan Contracting Service $ 23,867,200 | $ 550,000 Assuria v v v 2
21 |K&R Construction Services $ 25,712,600 | $ 550,000 Assuria v v v 2
22 |Van's 4D $ 28,001,800 | $ 550,000 Premier v v v 2
23 |Munro's Construction $ 22,942,600 | $ 550,000 Caricom v v v 2
24 |B.M Property Investments Inc $ 25,996,600 | $ 550,000 Caricom v v v 2
25 |S. Sugrim Enterprise $ 35,622,400 | $ 550,000 Premier v v v 1




26 |Global Holdings Inc $ 28,143,600 | $ 550,000 Premier v v v 2
27 |C. Persaud & Son Construction & Supplies Services $ 26,449,500 | $ 550,000 Caricom v v v

28 |Khan's Construction & Transportation Services Inc $ 31,545,800 | $ 550,000 Nafico v v v 2
29 |Ameer's Enterprise $ 28,389,300 | $ 550,000 Premier v v v 2
30 ;‘;)12/ iI;I:stch Transportation, Supplies & Construction 3 27.107.400 | $ 550,000 Premier v v v )
31 |A. Ramnarain Construction & Trucking Service $ 25,654,400 | $ 550,000 Assuria v v v 2
32 |Mangroo General Contractor Form of Tender $ 550,000 Premier v v X 2

Page Not Seen
33 |M.K Hanif Construction Service $ 28,093,600 | $ 550,000 Premier v v v 2
34 |R.Pooran Bobcat Rental Service $ 21,459,000 | $ 550,000 Caricom v v v 2
35 |Simon Contracting Services $ 25,319,500 | $ 550,000 Caricom v v v 2
36 |Brown Bottle Construction $ 25,609,840 | $ 550,000 Assuria v v v 0
37 |B&N Construction Inc $ 25,994,400 | $ 550,000 Premier v v v 2
38 |Paramdai's Construction $ 25,601,500 | $ 550,000 Assuria v v v 2
39 |Harry Chowtie Enterprise $ 23,973,000 | $ 550,000 Caricom v v v 2
40 |Extreme General Construction & Supplies $ 25,269,600 | $ 550,000 Caricom v v v 1
41 |Javir's Construction & Supplies General $ 27,943,800 | $ 550,000 Caricom v v v 1
42 |Tony's Construction $ 24,667,500 | $ 550,000 Assuria v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 26,009,400




Date of Tender Opening: May 19, 2026

File Number: Regional Democratic Council Region #3 (04/2026/73) - Construction of RC Heavy Duty Bridge at School Street Goed Fortuin

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |Roadmaster Construction $ 15,653,280 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
2 |Khan's Construction & Transportation Services Inc $ 16,142,300 | $ 300,000 Nafico v v v 2
3  |MIA General Construction & Supplies $ 14,630,800 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
4 |Mohamed Sayaid Enterprise $ 17,135,000 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
5 |AKP Contracting $ 15,901,800 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
6 Rahaman & Son's Construction & Maintenance S 14,809.300 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v )
Company

7 |S. Singh Construction Service $ 16,437,350 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
8 |Forwardframe Construction & Civil Works $ 16,912,100 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
9 |D.N&D Civil Engineering Service $ 15,352,450 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
10 |P.P Building Contracting $ 15,074,200 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
11 |Ameer's Enterprises $ 17,024,000 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
12 |A.M.I.C General Contracting Services $ 14,650,800 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
13 |Sheik Hussein Contracting Services $ 16,705,751 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
14 |B.M Property Investments Inc $ 18,000,000 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
15 |SVN & Son Investments $ 17,653,650 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
16 |Mahamed Haseeb Bacchus Enterprise Construction $ 17,359,000 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
17 |M.K Hanif Construction Service $ 17,133,000 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
18 |Extreme General Construction & Supplies $ 16,713,200 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
19 |Javir's Construction & Supplies General $ 15,400,500 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
20 |RW Construction $ 15,752,750 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
21 |Tony's Construction $ 16,297,700 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
22 |Smartron $ 15,967,600 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
23 |B&N Construction Inc $ 17,150,700 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2




24 |Van's 4D $ 15,568,560 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
25 |H. Tribhowan Contracting & Equipment Rentals $ 17,984,800 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
26 |Royal General Supplies & Contracting Service $ 14,531,500 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
27 |Munro's Construction $ 14,693,450 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
28 |Brown Bottle Construction $ 17,825,100 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 0
29 |K&R Construction Services $ 17,892,600 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
30 |MAT Investments $ 16,825,900 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
31 |C. Persaud & Son Construction & Supplies Services $ 15,687,350 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
32 |A. Ramnarain Construction & Trucking Service $ 17,972,750 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
33 |Golden Goose Construction Service $ 17,259,000 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
34 |I.Khan Contracting Service $ 15,817,000 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
35 |Abdool Shaw Construction $ 17,986,350 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
36 |Harry Chowtie Enterprise $ 16,096,200 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
37 |Paramdai's Construction $ 16,390,500 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
38 |R. Persaud Excavation Services $ 18,472,750 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
39 |V.K Excavator Rental $ 16,742,200 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
40 |JPM's General Construction & Engineering Services $ 16,032,875 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
41 |KRD Contractors & General Services $ 16,232,600 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
42 |TMK 2020 Inc $ 16,069,050 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
43 |S. Maraj Contracting Services $ 16,812,000 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
44 |Simon Contracting Services $ 15,554,500 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2

Engineer's Estimate

&L

12,702,750




Date of Tender Opening: May 19, 2026

File Number: Regional Democratic Council Region #3 (05/2026/73) - Construction of REDO Living Quarters La Grange

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |Roje Singh General Contractors Inc $ 26,166,875 | $ 500,000 Assuria v v v 2
2 |C. Persaud & Son Construction & Supplies Services $ 22,672,737 | $ 500,000 Caricom v v v 2
3 |B&N Construction Inc $ 26,406,800 | $ 500,000 Premier v v v 2
4  |Harry Chowtie Enterprise $ 25,652,375 | $ 500,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |Sheik Hussein Contracting Services $ 25,906,433 | $ 500,000 Premier v v v 2
6 |S. Sugrim Enterprise $ 26,263,485 | $ 500,000 Premier v v v 1
7 |P.P Building Contracting $ 24,092,390 | $ 500,000 Assuria v v v 2
8 |Extreme General Construction & Supplies $ 24,546,095 | $ 500,000 Caricom v v v 2
9 |K.H Construction & General Merchandise $ 18,679,915 | $ 500,000 Caricom v v v 2
10 |Tony's Construction $ 25,011,350 | $ 500,000 Assuria v v v 2
11 |Mangroo General Contractor Form of Tender $ 500,000 Premier v v X 2
Page Not Seen
12 |S. Singh Construction Service $ 22,767,657 | $ 500,000 Premier v v v 2
13 |AKP Contracting $ 23,429,420 | $ 500,000 Assuria v v v 2
14 |Mahamed Haseeb Bacchus Enterprise Construction $ 22,161,860 | $ 500,000 Premier v v v 2
15 |Javir's Construction & Supplies General $ 23,712,185 | $ 500,000 Caricom v v v 1
16 |Westbrook Caribbean Inc $ 24,143,210 | $ 500,000 Caricom v v v 2
17 |Mobile Construction Company $ 24,519,320 | $ 500,000 Caricom v v v 2
18 |B.M Property Investments Inc $ 27,626,165 | $ 500,000 Caricom v v v 2
19 |Simon Contracting Services $ 23,654,750 | $ 500,000 Caricom v v v 2
20 |V.K Excavator Rental $ 24,996,965 | $ 500,000 Caricom v v v 2
21 |Paramdai's Construction $ 23,843,750 | $ 500,000 Assuria v v v 2
22 |Golden Goose Construction Service $ 22,424,360 | $ 500,000 Premier v v v 2
23 |TMK 2020 Inc $ 25,821,320 | $ 500,000 Assuria v v v 2




24 |TVS Construction Service $ 25,007,045 | $ 500,000 Assuria v v v 2

25 |Royal General Supplies & Contracting Service $ 20,380,787 | $ 500,000 Premier v v v 2

26 |S.R Buildwise Solution & Supplies $ 23,657,165 | $ 500,000 Caricom v v v 2

27 |I.Khan Contracting Service $ 25,803,050 | $ 500,000 Assuria v v v 2

28 |KRD Contractors & General Services $ 24,429,650 | $ 500,000 Assuria v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 27,629,000




Date of Tender Opening: May 19, 2026

File Number: Regional Democratic Council Region #3 (06/2026/73) - Construction of RC Heavy Duty Bridge at Back Street Windsor Forest

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |MAT Enterprise $ 16,825,900 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
2 |Sheik Hussein Contracting Services $ 16,705,751 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
3 |Van'4D $ 14,964,060 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
4 |Core Logistics Enterprise $ 16,813,550 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
5 |B.M Property Investments Inc $ 18,000,000 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
6 |B&N Construction Inc $ 17,150,000 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
7 |R. Persaud Excavation Services $ 16,972,750 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
8 |Tony's Construction $ 16,297,700 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
9 |Royal General Supplies & Contracting Services $ 13,657,900 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
10 |C. Persaud & Son Construction & Supplies Services $ 15,962,350 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
11 |Paramdai's Construction $ 16,390,500 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
12 |H. Tribhowan Contracting & Equipment Rentals $ 17,764,800 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
13 |KRD Contractors & General Services $ 16,232,600 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
14 |MJW Construction $ 14,989,400 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
15 |TMK 2020 Inc $ 16,080,050 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
16 |Munro's Construction $ 14,693,450 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
17 |Mohamed Saiyad Enterprise $ 17,135,000 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
18 |Abdool Shaw Construction $ 17,986,350 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
19 |Mahamad Haseeb Bacchus Enterprise Construction $ 17,359,000 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
20 |Forwardframe Construction & Civil Works $ 16,911,100 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
21 |JPM's General Construction $ 16,025,175 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
22 |Extreme General Construction & Supplies $ 16,713,200 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
23 |Golden Goose Construction Service $ 17,259,000 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
24 |S. Singh Construction Service $ 15,732,650 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2




25 |S. Maraj Contracting Services $ 16,812,000 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
26 |K&R Construction Services $ 17,962,600 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
27 |Simon Contracting Services $ 15,554,500 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
28 |Javir's Construction & Supplies General $ 15,796,000 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 1
29 |D.N&D Civil Engineering Service $ 15,352,450 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
30 Rahaman & Sons Construction & Maintenance 3 14,509,300 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v )
Company
31 |Ameer's Enterprises $ 17,024,000 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
32 |Roadmaster Construction $ 15,833,280 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
33 |M.K Hanif Construction Service $ 16,129,000 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
14 ;‘;)12/ iI;I:stch Transportation Supplies & Construction 3 22.679.800 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 0
35 |P.P Building Contracting $ 14,804,200 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
36 |Khan's Construction & Transportation Services $ 16,142,300 | $ 300,000 Nafico v v v 2
37 |I.Khan Contracting Service $ 15,817,000 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
38 |RDP Building Construction $ 14,884,200 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
39 |A. Ramnarain Construction & Trucking Service $ 17,472,750 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 12,702,750




Date of Tender Opening: May 19, 2026

File Number: Regional Democratic Council Region #3 (07/2026/73) - Construction of RC Heavy Duty Bridge Linking Windsor Forest to La Jalousie

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blgi?r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::g::; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iilé
Currency signed
1  |MIA General Construction & Supplies $ 14,775,800 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
2 |Tony's Construction $ 16,357,000 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
3 |Van's4D $ 15,843,410 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
4 |A. Ramnarain Construction & Trucking Service $ 18,537,750 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
5 |TMK 2020 Inc $ 16,050,050 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
6 |AAT Construction Services $ 17,039,225 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
7 |Forwardframe Construction & Civil Works $ 16,984,100 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
8 |Sheik Hussein Contracting Services $ 16,807,614 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
9 |Rambarran's Construction $ 17,724,300 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
10 |Paramdai's Construction $ 16,450,500 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
11 |P.P Building Contracting $ 14,954,200 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
12 |Golden Goose Construction Service $ 17,289,000 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
13 |Rahaman & Sons Construction & Maintenance Company | $ 14,544,300 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
14 |Ameer's Enterprises $ 17,054,000 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
15 |M.K Hanif Construction Service $ 17,162,000 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
16 |Mohamed Sayaid Enterprise $ 17,168,000 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
17 |S Singh Construction Service $ 15,477,900 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
18 |B.M Property Investments Inc $ 18,000,000 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
19 |RDP Building Construction $ 14,934,200 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
20 |S. Maraj Contracting Services $ 16,877,000 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
21 |Core Logistics Enterprise $ 16,034,150 | $ 300,000 Assuira v v v 2
22 |Munro's Construction $ 14,765,450 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
23 |Mohamad Haseeb Bacchus Enterprise Construction $ 17,389,000 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
24 |JPM's General Construction and Engineering Services $ 16,481,575 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2




25 |Roadmaster Construction $ 15,878,280 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
26 |A.M.LC General Contracting Services $ 14,825,800 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
27 |Khan's Construction and Transportation Services Inc $ 16,194,300 | $ 300,000 Nafico v v v 2
28 |Simon Contracting Services $ 15,604,500 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
29 |Roje Singh General Contractors Inc $ 17,802,800 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
30 R. Persaud Excavation Services $ 18,037,750 $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
31 |NK Engineering Services $ 15,243,300 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
32 |H. Tribhowan Contracting & Equipment Rentals $ 17,764,800 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
33 |Top Notch Transportation $ 22,679,800 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 0
34 |Harry Chowtie Enterprise $ 15,561,200 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
35 |V.K Excavator Rental $ 16,767,200 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
36 |MJW Construction $ 14,993,400 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
37 |Javir's Construction and Supplies General $ 15,359,500 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 1
38 |Rishma and Sisters Enterprise $ 13,557,900 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
39 |MAT Investment $ 16,885,900 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
40 |KRD Contractors and General Services $ 16,302,600 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
41 |Extreme General Construction & Supplies $ 16,793,200 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
42 |D.N&D Civil Engineering Services $ 15,407,450 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
43 |R.W Construction $ 15,821,250 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
44 |B&N Construciton Services Inc $ 17,220,700 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
45 |C. Persaud & Son Construction & Supply Service $ 16,012,350 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
46 |I Khan Construction Service $ 15,842,000 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2

Engineer's Estimate

&L

12,702,750




Date of Tender Opening: May 19, 2026

File Number: Regional Democratic Council Region #3 (08/2026/73) - Construction of RC Heavy Duty Bridge at Temple Street Windsor Forest

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéil;; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 |NK Engineering Services $ 15,476,800 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
2 |AMIC General Contracting Service $ 14,673,800 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
3 |Forwardframe Construction & Civil Works $ 16,523,600 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
4 |JPM's General Construction $ 15,569,200 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |Ameer's Enterprise $ 16,877,500 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
6 ;‘212/ iI;I:stch Transportation, Supplies & Construction 3 15,226,300 No Bid Security Seen v v v )
7 |B.M Property Investments Inc $ 18,000,000 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
8 |P.P Building Construction $ 14,689,200 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
9 |D.N&D Civil Engineering Service $ 15,132,450 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
10 |Roadmaster Construction $ 15,009,780 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
11 |Extreme General Construction & Supplies $ 16,239,700 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
12 |Mat Investment $ 17,142,400 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
13 |Sheik Hussein Contracting Services $ 16,804,884 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
14 |Paramdai's Construction $ 16,078,000 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
15 |B&N Construction Inc $ 17,210,700 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
16 |L.Khan Contracting Services $ 15,739,500 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
17 |KRD Contractors & General Services $ 16,092,600 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
18 |Rambarran's Construction Service $ 17,547,460 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
19 |R. Persaud Excavation Services $ 18,358,250 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
20 Rahaman & Son's Construction & Maintenance 3 14,341,800 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v )
Company
21 |Harry Chowtie Enterprise $ 15,808,700 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
22 |S. Singh Construction Service $ 16,135,350 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
23 |Tony's Construction $ 16,102,700 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
24 |Smartron $ 15,767,600 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2




25 |C. Persaud & Son Construction & Supplies Services $ 14,488,950 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
26 |H. Tribhowan Contracting & Equipment Rentals $ 17,764,800 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
27 |Rishma & Sisters Enterprise $ 13,751,600 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
28 |S. Maraj Contracting Services $ 16,539,500 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
29 |Mahamed Haseeb Bacchus Enterprise Construction $ 17,215,000 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
30 |M.K Hanif Construction Service $ 16,963,000 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
31 |Mohamed Saiyad Enterprise $ 16,969,000 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
32 |RDP Building Construction $ 14,619,200 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
33 |Simon Contracting Services $ 15,428,000 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
34 |MI General Construction & Supplies $ 14,623,800 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
35 |Roje Singh General Contractors Inc $ 17,057,800 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
36 |Golden Goose $ 17,115,000 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
37 |Khan's Construction & Transportation Services Inc $ 15,884,300 | $ 300,000 Nafico v v v 2
38 |Javir's Construction & Supplies General $ 15,387,000 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 1
39 |Van's4D $ 15,406,810 | $ 300,000 Premier v v v 2
40 |AAT Construction Service $ 17,105,100 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
41 |Core Logistics Enterprise $ 17,893,300 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
42 |A. Ramnarine Construction & Trucking Service $ 17,958,250 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
43 |V.K Excavator Rental $ 16,327,200 | $ 300,000 Caricom v v v 2
44 |TMK 2020 Inc $ 16,060,550 | $ 300,000 Assuria v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 12,550,250




Date of Tender Opening: May 19, 2026

File Number: Regional Democratic Council Region #3 (09/2026/73) - Extension of West Demerara Secondary

. . Bid Securit Form of
Blg((i:r Name of Bidder Bl%‘:::z:z; & Amount &y Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS T?nder Iéill;(; l;l:}iil;
Currency signed
1 Rahaman & Sons Construction & Maintenaance 3 45.661273 | S 500,000 Caricom v v v )
Company

2 |Simon Contracting Services $ 44,773,131 | $ 500,000 Caricom v v v 2

3 |JPM's General Construction & Engineering Services $ 46,496,417 | $ 500,000 Caricom v v v

4 |Mangroo General Contractor Form of Tender Page $ 500,000 Premier v v X 2

Not Seen

5 |Mobile Construction Company $ 46,366,359 | $ 500,000 Caricom v v v 2

6 |Roje Singh General Contractors Inc. $ 47,021,877 | $ 500,000 Assuria v v v 2

7 |S.Singh Construction Service $ 44,033,905 | $ 500,000 Premier v v v 2

8 |B.M. Property Investments Inc. $ 48,622,536 | $ 500,000 Caricom v v v 2

9 |Sheik Hussein Contracting Services $ 44,816,470 | $ 500,000 Premier v v v 2
10 |S.Sugrim Enterprise $ 33,507,413 | $ 500,000 Premier v v v 1
11 |Javir's Construction & Supplies General $ 43,874,068 | $ 500,000 Caricom v v v 1
12 |Tony's Construction $ 45,595,806 | $ 500,000 Assuria v v v 2
13 |Golden Goose Construction Service $ 47,383,105 | $ 500,000 Premier v v v 2
14 |Mohamed Haseeb Bacchus Enterprise Construction $ 46,584,727 | $ 500,000 Premier v v v 2
15 |Westbrook Caribbean Inc. $ 43,433,002 | $ 500,000 Caricom v v v 2
16 |Extreme General Construction & Supplies $ 43,832,961 | $ 500,000 Caricom v v v 2
17 |Harry Chowtie Enterprise $ 44,694,118 | $ 500,000 Caricom v v v 2
18 |C.Persaud & Son Construction & Supply Services $ 45,269,545 | $ 500,000 Caricom v v v 2
19 |S.R Buildwise Solutions & Supplies $ 45,732,820 | $ 500,000 Caricom v v v 2
20 |AKP Contracting $ 44,856,102 | $ 500,000 Assuria v v v 2
21 |P.P Building Contracting $ 43,630,363 | $ 500,000 Assuria v v v 2
22 |TVS Construction Service $ 45,187,366 | $ 500,000 Assuria v v v 2




23 |Paramdai's Construction $ 44,092,468 | $ 500,000 Assuria v v v 2
24 |K.H Construction & General Merchandise $ 39,666,403 | $ 500,000 Caricom v v v 2
25 |I.Khan Contracting Service $ 46,498,102 | $ 500,000 Assuria v v v 2
26 |KRD Contractors & General Services $ 43,844,931 | $ 500,000 Assuria v | Letter v 2
27 |B&N Construction Services Inc. $ 45,014,631 | $ 500,000 Premier v v v 2
28 |TMK 2020 Inc. $ 46,888,151 | $ 500,000 Assuria v v v 2
29 |Rishma & Sisters Enterprise $ 43,308,843 | $ 500,000 Premier v v v 2
30 |Lispen Enterprises $ 42,085,309 | $ 500,000 Nafico v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 48,639,000
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