
Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 
 Bid Security 

Amount & Currency 
Bid Security 

Agency GRA NIS 
Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy

Flash 
drive

1 Cummings Electrical Company Limited  $               74,961,249.00  $            1,500,000.00 Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

2 Astra Services 137,380,011.00$             1,433,807.00$            Assuria L1 ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

1,313,792.00$            Assuria L2

Engineer Estimate 102,334,478.00$           

Date of Tender Opening: November 27 2025

File Number: Guyana Power & Light (566/2025/02) - Construction of a 13.8 KV Primary Distribution Network from Seweyo to Mablissa along the Linden Sosedyke Highway  



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 
 Bid Security 

Amount & Currency 
Bid Security 

Agency GRA NIS 
Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy

Flash 
drive

1 2K's Enterprise  $               89,127,342.00  $            1,782,547.00 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

2 H&L Construction 84,991,017.00$               1,699,820.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

Engineer Estimate 57,685,996.00$             

Date of Tender Opening: November 27 2025

File Number: Mnistry of Labour & man Power Planning (117/2025/38) - Construction of Training Building 



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 
 Bid Security 

Amount & Currency 
Bid Security 

Agency GRA NIS 
Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy

Flash 
drive

1 Massy Motors Guyana Limited  $               16,700,000.00  $               191,000.00 CG United ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

2 Marics and Company Limited 10,123,148.00$               101,231.00$               Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

3 Car Clean Enterprise 83,146,975.00$               1,000,000.00$            Hand in Hand ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

4 Alliance Investments 8,000,000.00$                 80,000.00$                 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

5 BM Soat Auto Sale 17,700,000.00$               177,000.00$               Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

6 Yabz Enterprises Inc. 30,450,000.00$               304,500.00$               Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

7 Rose Ramdial Autosales 65,900,000.00$               659,000.00$               Diamond ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

Date of Tender Opening: November 27 2025

File Number: Guyana Elections Commission (387/2025/11) - Supply and Delivery of New Vehicles



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 

 Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency 

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy

Flash 
drive

1 Terraform Solutions  $            81,127,700.00  $          1,682,434.00 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
2 ARK Trading  $            80,836,000.00  $          1,616,720.00 Nafico ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
3 Construct It Inc  $            87,786,200.00  $          1,754,004.00 Nafico ✔ ✔ ✔ 1 2
4 KK Techcom Rentals & Suppliers  $            90,326,540.00  $          1,806,531.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 1$    2
5 Colin Talbot Contracting Services  $            95,963,800.00  $          1,919,276.00 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

6 Treon Peters Construction Services  Form of Tender Not 
completed but signed  $          1,800,000.00 Nafico ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

7 Pacific Service System  $            84,597,500.00  $          1,700,000.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
8 Delph Construction Inc  $            87,426,600.00  $          1,868,532.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
9 Naven's Construction  $            89,833,000.00  $          1,796,660.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
10 M. Sukhai Contracting Services  $            85,728,500.00  $          1,714,570.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 1$    2
11 A. Anderson & Son General Construction and Supplies  $            84,424,600.00  $          1,800,000.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
12 Romano Builders  $            84,990,950.00  $          1,700,000.00 Nafico ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
13 Shafina Construction & General Services  $            79,114,900.00  $          1,700,000.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
14 GuyBuild Construction & Logistics Services  $            84,241,510.00  $          1,684,830.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
15 AG Enterprise  $            74,032,000.00  $          1,480,640.00 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 1 2
16 Emeralds General Contracting & Distributors  $            87,334,890.00  $          2,200,000.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
17 C&A General Supplies and Services  $            78,510,600.00  $          1,570,212.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
18 DG Enterprise  $            88,059,100.00  $          1,800,000.00 Caricom x x ✔ 2
19 LF Global Inc  $            89,151,000.00  $          1,783,020.00 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 0
20 JJ Construction & General Services  $            97,378,400.00  $          1,947,568.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
21 Seenarine's Transportation Service  $            89,349,150.00  $          1,800,000.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

22 NK Enterprise Inc  $            89,079,600.00 No Bid Security 
Seen ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

23 JSA Engineering & Construction Inc  $            87,692,400.00  $          1,800,000.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 0
24 C.I Construction Supplies  $            91,083,700.00  $          1,821,674.00 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 1 2

Date of Tender Opening: November 27 2025

File Number: National Parks Commission (380/2025/01) - Construction of Two Access Bridge to Botanical Gardens



25 Hana's Construction Cleaning Service and Supplies  $            78,202,700.00  $          1,564,054.00 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
26 M&D Investments  $            78,355,200.00  $          1,800,000.00 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
27 Trevor & Son General Construction Services  $            77,291,040.00  $          1,545,820.80 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 1 2
28 BM Property Investments Inc  $            94,500,000.00  $          1,890,000.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 1 2
29 Rockey & Son Construction  $            67,192,000.00  $          1,343,840.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

30 Sovereignty Investments Construction Services (SICS 
BUILDERS)  $            42,480,200.00  $          1,900,000.00 Assuria ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

31 Truck Smart  $            77,097,000.00  $          1,560,000.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
32 Gopie Investments Inc  $            85,472,500.00  $          1,709,450.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 1 2

33 Phoenix Oilfield Service and Engineering Inc.  Form of Tender Not 
Seen  $             200,000.00  Premier  ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

34 Nova Vita Enterprises 76,200,400.00$              $          1,524,008.00  Premier  ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

35 J.R Civil Works 81,600,750.00$              $          1,800,000.00  Premier  ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

36 Grace Enterprise (Guyana) Inc. 80,988,360.00$              $          1,619,707.00  Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

37 Delta Trucking and Logistics Inc. 81,712,000.00$             1,634,240.00$          Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

38 Prestigious Electrical, General Construction and 
Fabrication 85,242,600.00$             1,704,852.00$          Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

39 AD Construction, Procurement and General Contracting 88,367,700.00$             1,800,000.00$          Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 1 2

40 J. Hussain's Construction & Supplies 78,647,300.00$             1,572,946.00$          Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

41 K&S Civil Engineering Contracting Services Inc 86,247,000.00$             1,800,000.00$          Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

42 JR Engineering Solutions 8,403,954.00$               1,700,000.00$          Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

43 JP Contractin Services 81,778,000.00$             1,800,000.00$          Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

44 Dundas Construction Inc 88,971,550.00$             1,800,000.00$          Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
45 Chung's Global Inc. 85,886,850.00$             1,800,000.00$          Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
46 B&N Construction Services Inc. 84,760,400.00$             1,800,000.00$          Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2



47 King of Hardware 80,263,800.00$             1,605,276.00$          Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
48 Aurora Contracting Inc 85,296,440.00$             1,800,000.00$          Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
49 Onyx Engineering Inc. 89,713,000.00$             1,800,000.00$          Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
50 Andrect Engineering & Construction 87,551,700.00$             1,800,000.00$          Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
51 Devcon Inc 79,985,684.00$             1,800,000.00$          Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
52 IMS Construction and Logistics 80,064,000.00$             1,800,000.00$          Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
53 Green Guyana Construction 77,238,100.00$             1,800,000.00$          Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
54 Country Side Recycling $76,304,100.00 $1,800,000.00 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
55 General Procurement and Construction Inc $89,943,105.00 $1,798,862.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
56 Aronco Services Inc. $98,754,050.00 $1,975,081.00 Premier x ✓ ✓ 2

57 V. Narine Central Lumber  $            76,822,800.00  $          1,800,000.00  Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

58 Vulcan Group Inc. 98,272,800.00$              $          1,800,000.00  Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

59 R.P Construction Agency 79,844,700.00$              $          1,596,394.00  Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

60 JPM's General Construction and Engineering 82,854,122.00$              $          1,800,000.00  Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 
 Bid Security 

Amount & Currency 
Bid Security 

Agency GRA NIS 
Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy

Flash 
drive

1 SSC Electrical and Construction Services  Form of Tender not 
Complted or Signed  ✓ ✓ X 1 0

2 Cummings Electrical Company Limited 76,167,981.00$               2,000,000.00$            Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

3 Qualis Engineering and General Supplies 59,189,753.00$               1,183,795.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

4 JR Engineering Solutions 82,861,680.00$               1,660,000.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

5 Southwind Health and Defence 78,547,140.00$               1,570,925.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

Date of Tender Opening: November 27 2025

File Number: Supreme Court of Judicature (27/2025/55 Retender) - Rewiring of New Amsterdam High Court

 Bid Security not Seen 



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 
 Bid Security 

Amount & Currency 
Bid Security 

Agency GRA NIS 
Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy

Flash 
drive

1 D. Chowkai & Sons Construction  $               60,279,450.00  $            1,205,589.00 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

2 Builders Engineering and Architectural Consultacy 55,828,740.00$               1,116,575.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

3 Holastic Contracting & Procurement Inc. 59,157,450.00$               1,183,149.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

4 AEA Enterprise 56,721,967.00$               1,134,439.00$            Pemier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

5 Rakaya Construction 51,420,160.00$               1,028,403.00$            Pemier ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

6 Country Side Recycling 57,995,300.00$               1,160,000.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

7 R&R General Construction and Supplies 56,890,710.00$               1,137,975.00$            Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

8 Vijay Persaud & Sons Contracting Services 64,956,097.00$               1,299,122.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

9 Marshall Contracting & Landscaping Services 50,400,000.00$               1,148,000.00$            Pemier ✓ Letter ✓ 2

10
Technocon Investments Procurement and General 
Contracting Solutions 56,244,595.00$               1,200,000.00$            Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

Date of Tender Opening: November 27 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education  (859/2025/40) - Repurposing of Existing Building for Dinning Hall/Study Hall at ETI Region 2



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency

Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy

Flash 
drive

1 Harte's General Construction, Supplies and Services $12,189,000.00 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1
2 M. Johnson Lawn Care Maintenance Services $14,814,660.00 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1 1
3 S.A.M Civil Works $14,863,800.00 ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
4 Dundas Construction Inc. $14,574,315.00 ✓ Receipt ✓ 1
5 R. Persid Construction $14,486,850.00 ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
6 IMS Construction and Logistics Services $14,519,400.00 ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
7 Emeralds General Contracting & Distributors $14,686,980.00 ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

8 Kaiveri Procurement Logistics and Investments Inc. Form of Tender Not 
Completed not Singed ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

9 Marshall Contracting & Landscaping Services $13,417,950.00 ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
10 AEA Enterprise $14,507,955.00 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1
11 C & A General Supplies and Services $14,698,950.00 ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
12 Quality Construction and Maintenance Services $12,920,250.00 ✓ ✓ ✓ x
13 Dwain Babb's Enterprise $11,990,000.00 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1
14 MDSG General Services $14,192,430.00 ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
15 Yhadram and Sons Construction Establishment $13,715,310.00 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1
16 KCOL Contracting Sevices $14,863,800.00 ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
17 Robert Andrews Construction Services $14,715,225.00 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1
18 R & R General Construction & Supplies $14,385,000.00 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1
19 King of Hardware $13,641,810.00 ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
20 S. Prakash Construction $12,729,780.00 ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

21 Sovereignty Investments Construction Services 
(SICS Builders) $14,705,250.00 ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

22 Trevor & Son General Construction Services $13,654,200.00 ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

23 T&R Daniels Construction Landscaping & Logistics 
Company $13,965,000.00 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

24 Grace Enterprise (Guyana) Inc. $21,511,350.00 ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

BSD Completed and Signed

Date of Tender Opening: 27 November, 2025

File Number: Minitsry of Education (860/2025/40) - Reconstruction of Fence at St John's Secondary School

BSD Completed and Signed
BSD Completed and Signed
BSD Completed and Signed

BSD Completed and Signed

BSD Completed and Signed
BSD Completed and Signed
BSD Completed and Signed

BSD Completed and Signed

BSD Completed and Signed
BSD Completed and Signed
BSD Completed and Signed
BSD Completed and Signed
BSD Completed and Signed
BSD Completed and Signed
BSD Completed and Signed

BSD Completed and Signed

BSD Completed and Signed

BSD Completed and Signed

BSD Completed and Signed
BSD Completed and Signed
BSD Completed and Signed
BSD Completed and Signed

BSD Completed and Signed



25 D. Chowkai & Sons Construction $18,180,750.00 ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
26 Guybuild Construction & Logistics Services $14,495,250.00 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1
27 LJ General Construction $16,041,350.00 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

28 Rishma and Sisters Enterprise $10,158,750.00 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

29 Barron's Exclusive $13,638,450.00 ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
30 MUSE Holding Inc. $14,157,255.00 ✓ ✓ x 2
31 Teon Peters Construction Service $14,345,730.00 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1
32 R.A & J.P Contracting Services $13,375,950.00 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1
33 Holistic Contracting & Procurement Inc. $20,063,400.00 ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
34 Dicon Construction & Surveying Services $12,345,500.00 ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
35 Green Guyana Consttuction $14,898,975.00 ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
36 Warner Bros Investments $14,645,400.00 ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

37
Malachi, Malik & Mateo General Construction and 
Supplies $10,749,000.00 ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

38 Kishan Engineering and Construction Inc. $14,657,570.00 ✓ ✓ ✓ 2BSD Completed and Signed

BSD Completed and Signed
BSD Completed and Signed
BSD Completed and Signed
BSD Completed and Signed

BSD Completed and Signed

BSD Completed and Signed

BSD Completed and Signed
BSD Completed and Signed

BSD Completed and Signed
BSD Completed and Signed
BSD Completed and Signed
BSD Completed and Signed

BSD Completed and Signed



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 
 Bid Security 

Amount & Currency 
Bid Security 

Agency GRA NIS 
Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy

Flash 
drive

1 Nevelle Drakes  $                      50,000.00 X X ✓ 0

2 Marshall Contracting & Landscaping Services 13,462,500.00$               ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

3 Seenarine's Transportation Service 14,070,000.00$               ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

4 Dundas Construction Inc. 14,332,500.00$               ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

5 Emeralds General Contracting & Distributors 13,996,500.00$               ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

6 Cummings Electrical Company Limited 11,708,582.00$               ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

7 Machinery Corporation of Guyana 11,717,000.00$                $               300,000.00  Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 0

8 Ganesh's Hardware Construction aand Imports 14,857,500.00$               ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

9 Tiana, Tia and Tamara General Construction and Supplies 10,500,000.00$               ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

10 Fugenz Business Solutions 10,494,750.00$               ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

11 Nova Vita Enterprises 12,421,500.00$               ✓ ✓ ✓ 1
 Bid Secure and Declaration Completed 

and Signed 

 Bid Secure and Declaration Completed 
and Signed 

 Bid Secure and Declaration Completed 
and Signed 

 Bid Secure and Declaration Completed 
and Signed 

 Bid Secure and Declaration Completed 
and Signed 

 Bid Secure and Declaration Completed 
and Signed 

 Bid Secure and Declaration Completed 
and Signed 

Date of Tender Opening: November 27 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education  (861/2025/40) - Generator System at Christ Church Secondary School

 Bid Secure and Declaration Completed 
and Signed 

 Bid Secure and Declaration Completed 
and Signed 

 Bid Secure and Declaration Completed 
and Signed 



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder  Bid Amount & 

Currency 
 Bid Security 

Amount & Currency 
Bid Security 

Agency GRA NIS 
Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy

Flash 
drive

1 Seenarine's Transportation Service  $               14,175,000.00 ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

2 Marshall Contracting & Landscaping Services 13,515,000.00$               ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

3 Machinery Corporation of Guyana 13,325,000.00$                $               300,000.00  Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 0

4 Ganesh's Hardware Construction aand Imports 14,120,000.00$               ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

5 J's Building & Construction 11,200,000.00$               ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

6 Dundas Construction Inc 13,828,500.00$               ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

7 Nova Vita Enteprise 12,600,000.00$               ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

8 Cummings Electrical Company Limited 12,679,930.00$               ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

 Bid Secure and Declaration Completed 
and Signed 

 Bid Secure and Declaration Completed 
and Signed 

 Bid Secure and Declaration Completed 
and Signed 

 Bid Secure and Declaration Completed 
and Signed 

Date of Tender Opening: November 27 2025

File Number: Ministry of Education  (862/2025/40) - Generator System at Kwakwani Secondary School

 Bid Secure and Declaration Completed 
and Signed 

 Bid Secure and Declaration Completed 
and Signed 

 Bid Secure and Declaration Completed 
and Signed 



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency

Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy

Flash 
drive

1 Teon Peters Construction Service $42,205,275.00 $940,000.00 Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 1
2 Kcol Contracting Services $47,280,450.00 ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
3 S.A.M Civil Works $47,280,450.00 ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
4 Robert Andrews General Construction Services $44,265,585.00 $946,000.00 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
5 S. Prakash Construction $40,242,300.00 $946,000.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
6 Simcon Engineering Inc. $39,108,457.00 $850,000.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ x
7 C & A Genersl Supplies and Services $37,981,650.00 $759,633.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
8 Didcon Construction & Surveying Services $42,760,000.00 $946,000.00 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
9 Grace Enterprise (Guyana) Inc. $54,263,107.50 $1,085,262.00 Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

10 Holistic Contracting & Procurement Inc. $47,428,920.00 $948,578.00 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
11 Randolph Taylor Construction $43,059,975.00 $861,200.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
12 D. Chowkai & Sons Construction $45,827,670.00 $916,553.00 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

13 MUSE Holding Inc $46,779,600.00 $946,000.00 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

14 R & R General Construction & Supplies $45,146,850.00 $902,937.00 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
15 Vishal's Contracting Co $44,347,275.00 $886,946.00 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 1
16 R. Persid Construction $38,195,850.00 $946,000.00 Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
17 Kaiveri Procurement Logistics and Investments Inc. $45,108,840.00 $916,873.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

18 Sovereignty Investments Construction Services (SICS 
Builders) $46,431,840.00 $1,046,000.00 Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

19 A. Anderson & Son General Construction and Supplies $38,008,000.00 ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

20 AEA Enterprise $45,992,100.00 $919,842.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 0
21 R.A & J.P Contracting Services $41,279,280.00 $940,000.00 Nafico ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
22 Marshall Contracting & Landscaping Services $41,717,272.00 $946,000.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
23 Norek Construction $39,136,860.00 $782,737.00 Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 1
24 Emeralds General Contracting & Distributors $43,221,570.00 $880,000.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
25 Jemcorp Engineering & Imports $45,620,400.00 $946,000.00 Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

Date of Tender Opening: 27 November, 2025

File Number:Ministry of Education (863/2025/40) - General Rehabilitation at Lodge Secondary School

No Bid Security Seen
No Bid Security Seen

No Bid Security Seen



26 Guybuild Construction & Logistics Services $44,418,570.00 $888,371.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
27 JD'S Construction Company $39,422,250.00 $946,000.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

28 King of Hardware $42,415,800.00 $848,316.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency

Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency

Bid Security 
Agency GRA NIS 

Form of 
Tender 
signed 

Hard 
Copy

Flash 
drive

1 Green Guyana Construction $21,905,558.00 $3,300,000.00 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
2 Grace Enterprise (Guyana) Inc. $264,205,200.00 ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
3 MSR International Enterprise $215,820,990.00 $3,796,500.00 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
4 AB Solutions $209,483,780.00 $3,735,000.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
5 D. Chowkai & Sons Construction $259,769,475.00 $3,896,542.00 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
6 Barron's Exclusive $248,781,750.00 $3,796,500.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 1
7 Prored Resources $282,216,690.00 $3,795,000.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
8 D. David International $224,289,473.00 $3,796,500.00 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
9 C.A.J Construction Firm $200,860,860.00 $4,900,000.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 1
10 Emeralds General Contracting & Distributors $244,973,400.00 $3,975,000.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
11 JK Enterprise Inc. $246,720,075.00 $3,840,000.00 Caricom ✓ receipt ✓ 2
12 Trevor & Son General Construction Services $234,134,250.00 $3,512,014.00 Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

13 Sovereignty Investments Construction Services (SICS Builders) $253,085,490.00 $3,871,500.00 Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

14 JD'S Construction Company $224,073,912.30 $3,796,500.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
15 A. Anderson & Son General Construction and Supplies $220,153,000.00 $3,796,500.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 1
16 Fugenz Business $241,788,488.00 $3,626,828.00 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
17 K & K Boat Building, Construction & General Supplies $208,007,245.00 $3,120,000.00 Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
18 R & R General Construction and Supplies $204,899,425.00 $3,073,461.00 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
19 Ele's Trading and Hardware $230,000,000.00 $4,600,000.00 Assuria ✓ ✓ ✓ 1
20 Vishal's Contracting $237,863,850.00 $4,732,917.00 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 1

21 J.S.B. Investments Inc. Form of Tender not 
completed but signed $3,691,076.00 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

22 Rishma and Sisters Enterprise $238,401,975.00 $3,576,030.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
23 Holistic Contracting & Procurement Inc. $263,820,375.00 $3,957,306.00 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
24 Digital Design Construction, Logistics and Supplies $228,048,870.00 $3,420,733.00 Caricom ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
25 Marshall Contracting & Landscaping Services $225,218,450.00 $3,796,500.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
26 AEA Enterprise $231,084,210.00 $3,466,263.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2
27 Simcon Engineering Inc. $238,929,075.00 $4,050,000.00 Premier ✓ ✓ ✓ 2

Date of Tender Opening: 27 November, 2025

File Number:Ministry of Education (864/2025/40) - Extension of Kuru Kururu Primary School

No Bid Security Seen



Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency

Bid Security 
Amount & 
Currency

Bid Security Agency GRA NIS Form of 
Tender 
signed 

 
Hard 
Copy 

Flash 
drive

1 R&R General Construction and Supplies $14,405,600.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
2 C&A General Supplies and Services $13,100,175.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
3 G.S Hollow Blocks $13,618,770.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
4 Icon Construction and Maintenance Services $13,600,970.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
5 Armo's Construction and Supplies $13,517,372.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
6 Rakaya Construction $12,972,300.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
7 Country Side Recycling $14,892,240.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
8 D. Chowkai & Sons Construction $16,899,080.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
9 P&S General Supplies & Contracting Services $13,572,394.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

10 S&S Engineering $12,366,750.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
11 L and T Build and Renovation Services $14,697,581.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
12 Yhadram and Sons Construction Establishment $13,737,130.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
13 Holistic Contracting & Procurement Inc $17,636,080.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
14 Dima General Contracting Services $14,489,420.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
15 King of Hardware $13,440,130.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
16 Trevor & Son General Construction Services $13,180,750.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
17 JD's Construction Company FTP not completed ✔ ✔ X 2
18 Angelique Enterprise $12,615,350.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

19 Tiana, Tia & Tamara General Constructio and Supplies $10,489,400.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
20 Marshall Contracting & Landscaping Services $13,406,800.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

BSD C/S

Date of Tender Opening 

File Number: Ministry o Education (865/2025/40) - Construction of Shed & Upgrading to Carpentry Shop at New Amsterdam Technical Institute
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Bidder 
No. Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency Bid Security Amount & 

Currency Bid Security Agency GRA NIS 
Form of 
Tender 
signed 

 
Hard 
Copy 

Flash 
drive

1 Marshall Contracting & Landscaping Services $43,137,430.00 $978,000.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
2 Grace Enterprise (Guyana) Inc $51,955,827.00 $1,039,117.00 Nafico ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
3 Emeralds General Contracting & Distributors $49,321,859.00 $1,000,000.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
4 King of Hardware $44,938,900.00 $898,778.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
5 AEA Enterprise $47,861,371.00 $957,227.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
6 Yhadram and Sons Construction Establishment $45,016,356.00 $900,327.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
7 R&R General Construction and Supplies $47,111,685.00 $942,234.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
8 C&A General Supplies and Services $40,932,303.00 $818,646.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
9 Kaiveri Procurement Logistics and Investments Inc $42,367,720.00 $847,154.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

10 Randolph Taylor Construction $45,325,356.00 $906,507.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
11 Holistic Contracting & Procurement Inc $55,294,520.00 $1,105,890.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
12 D. Chowkai & Sons Construction $51,567,980.00 $1,031,360.00 Caricom ✔ ✔ ✔ 2
13 Barron's Exclusive $48,430,394.00 $978,000.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
14 Allicock's Construction and Supplies $42,903,105.00 ✔ ✔ ✔ 1
15 Teon Peters Construction Service $43,427,325.00 $960,000.00 Nafico ✔ ✔ ✔ 1

16 Malachi, Malik & Mateo General Construction and 
Supplies $40,045,600.00 $978,000.00 Premier ✔ ✔ ✔ 2

Date of Tender Opening 
File Number: Ministry of Education  (866/2025/40) - Construction of AutoCad Lab at Guyana Industrial Training Centre

No Bid Security Seen
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