Date of Tender Opening: October 24, 2024

File Number: Guyana Power & Light (326/2024/02) - Engineering Procurement & Construction &/or Financing of Infrastructural Development Projects

. . . Form of
Bﬁder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency Bid Security Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla.lSh
0. Currency signed Copy | drive
Premol Industrial Construction & Services Guyana
Inc, Element Holdings International, Integrated .
L Offshore Services Inc, Eletrowoltes Ltda, Elektron $26,236,332.27 USD| 126,000,000 Premier v v v 2
Construcoes Eletricas Ltda (Consortium) L2
Premol Industrial Construction & Services Guyana
1 Inc, Element Holdings International, Integrated $15.908 000.00 USD| $ 113.400.000
Offshore Services Inc, Eletrowoltes Ltda, Elektron DR R
Construcoes Eletricas Ltda (Consortium) L5
Premol Industrial Construction & Services Guyana
Inc, Element Holdings International, Integrated
1 Offshore Services Inc, Eletrowoltes Ltda, Elektron $12,330,191.81 USD) § 54,600,000
Construcoes Eletricas Ltda (Consortium) L7
2 |Fixit Depot L3 $3,000,334.00 USD $70,000 USD Caricom v v v 2
2 |Fixit Depot L4 $2,278,018.00 USD $50,000 USD
2 |Fixit Depot L7 $6,674,700.00 USD $150,000 USD
3 |ltron (USA) L7 $4,025,356.45 USD No Bid Security Seen | N/A | N/A v 2
China National Machinery Import & Export $2,600,000 USD .
4 Corporation (China) L2 $15,628,738.71 USD (L2.3,5.8) Caricom N/A | N/A v 2
4 China National Machinery Import & Export $3.250,000.00 USD

Corporation (China) L3




China National Machinery Import & Export

4 Corporation (China) L5 $50,321,862.28 USD
China National Machinery Import & Export

4 Corporation (China) L8 $7,630,500.00 USD

5 |Kalpataru Projects International Ltd (India) L2 $58,686,774.00 USD $2’800’0?82U388 Assuria N/A | N/A
5 |Kalpataru Projects International Ltd (India) L3 $5,342,350.00 USD

5 |Kalpataru Projects International Ltd (India) L5A $157,203,113.00 USD| $4,200,000 USD (L5)

5 |Kalpataru Projects International Ltd (India) L5B $158,597,342.00 USD

5 |Kalpataru Projects International Ltd (India) L8 $25,112,048.00 USD

Engineer's Estimate Total Lots

$200,000,000.00 USD




Date of Tender Opening: October 24, 2024

File Number: Telecommunications Agency (314/2024/02) - Supply & Delivery of One New Sports Utility Vehicle

Bﬁder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & I?Alfniﬁi::rgy Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS IfFoernn(:Ieorf Hard FI&.ISh
0. Currency Currency signed Copy| drive
1 |Beharry Automotive Limited $ 14,250,000 $ 285,000 Nafico v v v 2
2 |Car Clean Enterprise $ 9,200,000 $ 800,000 HandinHand | Vv v v 2
3 |Ansa Motors Guyana Inc $ 1,510,526| $ 246,000 Premier v v v 2
4 |Marics & Company Limited $ 12242377 $ 244,848 Assuria v v v 2
5 |ldeal Autos Inc $ 9,500,000 $ 190,000 Nafico v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: October 24, 2024

File Number: Central Housing & Planning Authority (225/2024/45) - Procurement of Electrical Line Hardware Materials Lots 1-8

. . . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Bid Security Amount Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fle_tsh
No. Currency & Currency signed Copy | drive
1 S&K Construc_tlon, Consultancy Services & $  350517.604 $ 5,392,754 Caricom v v v 5
General Supplies Inc L1
S&K Construction, Consultancy Services &
L |General Supplies Inc L2 $ 359,517,604 (L1-8)
1 S&K Construc_tlon, Consultancy Services & $ 350517604
General Supplies Inc L3
S&K Construction, Consultancy Services &
L General Supplies Inc L4 $ 359,517,604
1 S&K Construc_tlon, Consultancy Services & $ 350517604
General Supplies Inc L5
1 S&K Construc_tlon, Consultancy Services & $ 350517604
General Supplies Inc L6
1 S&K Construc_tlon, Consultancy Services & $ 350517604
General Supplies Inc L7
1 S&K Construc_tlon, Consultancy Services & $ 350517604
General Supplies Inc L8
2 |SPR Enterprises L1 $ 89,866,140 | $ 7,200,000 Assuria v v v 1 0
2 |SPR Enterprises L2 $ 89,866,140 (L1-8)
2 |SPR Enterprises L3 $ 89,866,140
2 |SPR Enterprises L4 $ 89,866,140
2 |SPR Enterprises L5 $ 89,866,140




2 |SPR Enterprises L6 $ 89,866,140

2 |SPR Enterprises L7 $ 89,866,140

2 |SPR Enterprises L8 $ 89,866,140

3 |Astra Services L1 $ 53,989,000 | $ 1,079,780 Assuria
3 |Astra Services L2 $ 53,989,000 | $ 1,079,780

3 |Astra Services L3 $ 53,989,000 | $ 1,079,780

3 |Astra Services L4 $ 53,989,000 | $ 1,079,780

3 |Astra Services L5 $ 53,989,000 | $ 1,079,780

3 |Astra Services L6 $ 53,989,000 | $ 1,079,780

3 |Astra Services L7 $ 53,989,000 | $ 1,079,780

3 |Astra Services L8 $ 53,989,000 | $ 1,079,780

4 |Sheriff Construction Inc L1 $ 343,975,500 | $ 14,240,000 Assuria
4 |Sheriff Construction Inc L2 $ 343,925,000 (L1-8)

4 |Sheriff Construction Inc L3 $ 343,925,000

4 |Sheriff Construction Inc L4 $ 343,925,000

4 |Sheriff Construction Inc L5 $ 343,925,000

4 |Sheriff Construction Inc L6 $ 343,925,000

4 |Sheriff Construction Inc L7 $ 343,925,000

4 |Sheriff Construction Inc L8 $ 343,925,000

5 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L1 $ 326,725,000 No B'geif]c““ty
5 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L2 $ 326,725,000

5 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L3 $ 326,725,000

5 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L4 $ 326,725,000




5 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L5 $ 326,725,000

5 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L6 $ 326,725,000

5 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L7 $ 326,725,000

5 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L8 $ 326,725,000

6 |Blue Print Builders Inc L1 $ 341,925,000 | $ 14,000,000 Assuria

6 |Blue Print Builders Inc L2 $ 341,925,000 (L1-8)

6 |Blue Print Builders Inc L3 $ 341,925,000

6 |Blue Print Builders Inc L4 $ 341,925,000

6 |Blue Print Builders Inc L5 $ 341,925,000

6 |Blue Print Builders Inc L6 $ 341,925,000

6 |Blue Print Builders Inc L7 $ 341,925,000

6 |Blue Print Builders Inc L8 $ 341,925,000

7 |Tels Engineering Services L1 $ 66,898,570 | $ 6,000,000 Assuria

7 |Tels Engineering Services L2 $ 66,898,570 (L1-8)

7 |Tels Engineering Services L3 $ 66,898,570

7 |Tels Engineering Services L4 $ 66,898,570

7 |Tels Engineering Services L5 $ 66,898,570

7 |Tels Engineering Services L6 $ 66,898,570

7 |Tels Engineering Services L7 $ 66,898,570

7 |Tels Engineering Services L8 $ 66,898,570

3 N Balgobln & Spns Contracting Service & $ 63.150.000 | $ 1.323.000 Assuria
Electrical Supplies 1

3 N Balgobin & Sons Contracting Service & $ 63.150.000 | $ 1,323,000

Electrical Supplies 2




N Balgobin & Sons Contracting Service &

8 . . $ 63,150,000 | $ 1,323,000
Electrical Supplies 3

3 N Balgobln & S_ons Contracting Service & $ 63.150,000 | $ 1,323,000
Electrical Supplies 4

3 N Bal_gobln & S_ons Contracting Service & $ 63.150,000 | $ 1,323,000
Electrical Supplies 5

3 N Balgobln & S_ons Contracting Service & $ 63.150,000 | $ 1,323,000
Electrical Supplies 6

3 N Balgobln & Spns Contracting Service & $ 63.150,000 | $ 1,323,000
Electrical Supplies 7

3 N Balgobln & S_ons Contracting Service & $ 63.150,000 | $ 1,323,000
Electrical Supplies 8

9 |MS Trading L1 $ 59,638,000 | $ 8,500,000 Premier

9 [MS Trading L2 $ 59,638,000 (L1-8)

9 |MS Trading L3 $ 59,638,000

9 |MS Trading L4 $ 59,638,000

9 |MS Trading L5 $ 59,638,000

9 |MS Trading L6 $ 59,638,000

9 |MS Trading L7 $ 59,638,000

9 |MS Trading L8 $ 59,638,000

10 |Fixit Depot L1 $ 64,168,321 | $ 16,000,000 Caricom

10 |Fixit Depot L2 $ 64,168,321 (L1-8)

10 |Fixit Depot L3 $ 64,168,321

10 |Fixit Depot L4 $ 64,168,321

10 |Fixit Depot L5 $ 64,168,321




10 |Fixit Depot L6 $ 64,168,321

10 |Fixit Depot L7 $ 64,168,321

10 |Fixit Depot L8 $ 64,168,321

11 |Twin's Enterprise L1 $ 57,200,000 | $ 1,204,000 Assuria
11 |Twin's Enterprise L2 $ 57,200,000 | $ 1,204,000
11 |Twin's Enterprise L3 $ 57,200,000 | $ 1,204,000
11 |Twin's Enterprise L4 $ 57,200,000 | $ 1,204,000
11 |Twin's Enterprise L5 $ 57,200,000 | $ 1,204,000
11 |Twin's Enterprise L6 $ 57,200,000 | $ 1,204,000
11 |Twin's Enterprise L7 $ 57,200,000 | $ 1,204,000
11 |Twin's Enterprise L8 $ 57,200,000 | $ 1,204,000




Date of Tender Opening: October 24, 2024

File Number: Central Housing & Planning Authority (226/2024/45) - Procurement of Single-Phase Transformer Lots 1-8

Form of

Bﬁg.er Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency Bid SgLe%JJLtr):enAcr;ount Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS 'Is'ie;nntizr CH;;S er?\s/z
1 |Tels Engineering Services L1 $ 126,606,300 $ 10,000,000 Assuria v v v 2
1 |Tels Engineering Services L2 $ 126,606,300 (L1-8)

1 |Tels Engineering Services L3 $ 126,606,300

1 |Tels Engineering Services L4 $ 126,606,300

1 |Tels Engineering Services L5 $ 126,606,300

1 |Tels Engineering Services L6 $ 126,606,300

1 |Tels Engineering Services L7 $ 126,606,300

1 |Tels Engineering Services L8 $ 126,606,300

2 |HR Distributors L1 $ 81,060,000 | $ 6,500,000 Assuria v v v 2
2 |HR Distributors L2 $ 81,060,000 (L1-8)

2 |HR Distributors L3 $ 81,000,000

2 |HR Distributors L4 $ 81,000,000

2 |HR Distributors L5 $ 81,000,000

2 |HR Distributors L6 $ 81,000,000

2 |HR Distributors L7 $ 81,000,000

2 |HR Distributors L8 $ 81,000,000

3 |Yeh weh Conglomorate L1 $ 82,250,520 | $ 1,656,950 Caricom v v v 2
3 |Yeh weh Conglomorate L2 $ 82,250,520 (L1-8)

3 |Yeh weh Conglomorate L3 $ 82,550,520

3 |Yeh weh Conglomorate L4 $ 82,550,520




3 |Yeh weh Conglomorate L5 $ 82,550,520

3 |Yeh weh Conglomorate L6 $ 82,550,520

3 |Yeh weh Conglomorate L7 $ 82,550,520

3 |Yeh weh Conglomorate L8 $ 82,550,520

4 [NT Ventures L1 $ 85,100,000 | $ 7,000,000 Assuria

4 |INT Ventures L2 $ 85,100,000 (L1-8)

4 [NT Ventures L3 $ 85,100,000

4 |NT Ventures L4 $ 85,100,000

4 [NT Ventures L5 $ 85,100,000

4 [NT Ventures L6 $ 85,100,000

4 |NT Ventures L7 $ 85,100,000

4 [NT Ventures L8 $ 85,100,000

5 N Bal_gobln & S_ons Contracting Service & $ 98,910,000 | $ 1,573,650 Assuria
Electrical Supplies L1

5 N Balgobln & S_ons Contracting Service & $ 98.910,000 | $ 1,573,650
Electrical Supplies L2

5 N Bal_gobln & S_ons Contracting Service & $ 98.910,000 | $ 1,573,650
Electrical Supplies L3

5 N Balgobln & S_ons Contracting Service & $ 98.910,000 | $ 1,573,650
Electrical Supplies L4

5 N Balgobln & S_ons Contracting Service & $ 98,910,000 | $ 1.573.650
Electrical Supplies L5

5 N Balgobin & Sons Contracting Service & $ 98.910.000 | $ 1.573.650

Electrical Supplies L6




N Balgobin & Sons Contracting Service &

5 Electrical Supplies L7 $ 08,910,000 | $ 1,573,650
5 N Balgobln & S_ons Contracting Service & $ 98.910,000 | $ 1,573,650
Electrical Supplies L8
6 |Twins Enterprise L1 $ 100,925,000 | $ 1,603,875 Assuria
6 |Twins Enterprise L2 $ 100,925,000 | $ 1,603,875
6 |Twins Enterprise L3 $ 100,925,000 | $ 1,603,875
6 |Twins Enterprise L4 $ 100,925,000 | $ 1,603,875
6 |Twins Enterprise L5 $ 100,925,000 | $ 1,603,875
6 |Twins Enterprise L6 $ 100,925,000 | $ 1,603,875
6 |Twins Enterprise L7 $ 100,925,000 | $ 1,603,875
6 |Twins Enterprise L8 $ 100,925,000 | $ 1,603,875
7 |Sheriff Construction Inc L1 $ 175,300,000 | $ 15,400,000 Assuria
7 |Sheriff Construction Inc L2 $ 175,300,000 (L1-8)
7  |Sheriff Construction Inc L3 $ 175,000,600
7  |Sheriff Construction Inc L4 $ 175,000,600
7  |Sheriff Construction Inc L5 $ 175,000,600
7  |Sheriff Construction Inc L6 $ 175,000,600
7  |Sheriff Construction Inc L7 $ 175,000,600
7 |Sheriff Construction Inc L8 $ 175,000,600
8 |Aronco Services Inc L1 $ 151,018,250 | $ 2,265,274 Premier
8 |Aronco Services Inc L2 $ 151,018,250 (L1-8)
8 |Aronco Services Inc L3 $ 151,018,250
8 |Aronco Services Inc L4 $ 151,018,250




8 |Aronco Services Inc L5 $ 151,018,250

8 |Aronco Services Inc L6 $ 151,018,250

8 |Aronco Services Inc L7 $ 151,018,250

8 |Aronco Services Inc L8 $ 151,018,250

9 |FS Trading L1 $ 138,500,000 | $ 11,500,000 Premier

9 |FS Trading L2 $ 138,500,000 (L1-8)

9 |FS Trading L3 $ 138,700,000

9 |FS Trading L4 $ 138,700,000

9 |FS Trading L5 $ 138,700,000

9 |FS Trading L6 $ 138,700,000

9 |FS Trading L7 $ 138,700,000

9 |FS Trading L8 $ 138,700,000

10 |Akamai Inc L1 $ 103,160,730 | $ 2,000,000 Caricom

10 [Akamai Inc L2 $ 103,160,730 | $ 2,000,000

10 [Akamai Inc L3 $ 103,160,730 | $ 2,000,000

10 [Akamai Inc L4 $ 103,160,730 | $ 2,000,000

10 [Akamai Inc L5 $ 103,160,730 | $ 2,000,000

10 [Akamai Inc L6 $ 103,160,730 | $ 2,000,000

10 |[Akamai Inc L7 $ 103,160,730 | $ 2,000,000

10 [Akamai Inc L8 $ 103,160,730 | $ 2,000,000

11 S&K Construc.tlon Consultancy Services & $ 246 495,000 | $ 3.697 425 Caricom
General Supplies Inc L1

11 S&K Construction Consultancy Services & $ 246 495,000 (L1-8)

General Supplies Inc L2




S&K Construction Consultancy Services &

1 General Supplies Inc L3 3 246,495,000
11 S&K Construc_tlon Consultancy Services & $ 246 495,000

General Supplies Inc L4
11 S&K Construc_tlon Consultancy Services & $ 246 495,000

General Supplies Inc L5
11 S&K Construc_tlon Consultancy Services & $ 246 495,000

General Supplies Inc L6
11 S&K Construgtlon Consultancy Services & $ 246 495,000

General Supplies Inc L7
11 S&K Construc_tlon Consultancy Services & $ 246 495,000

General Supplies Inc L8
12 |Astra Services L1 $ 87,105,000 | $ 142,100 Assuria
12 |Astra Services L2 $ 87,105,000 | $ 142,100
12 |Astra Services L3 $ 87,105,000 | $ 142,100
12 |Astra Services L4 $ 87,105,000 | $ 142,100
12 |Astra Services L5 $ 87,105,000 | $ 142,100
12 |Astra Services L6 $ 87,105,000 | $ 142,100
12 |Astra Services L7 $ 87,105,000 | $ 142,100
12 |Astra Services L8 $ 87,105,000 | $ 142,100
13 |SPR Enterprises L1 $ 121,493,220 | $ 9,719,458 Assuria
13 |SPR Enterprises L2 $ 121,493,220 (L1-8)
13 |SPR Enterprises L3 $ 121,493,220
13 |SPR Enterprises L4 $ 121,493,220
13 |SPR Enterprises L5 $ 121,493,220




13 |SPR Enterprises L6 $ 121,493,220

13 |SPR Enterprises L7 $ 121,493,220

13 |SPR Enterprises L8 $ 121,493,220

14 |Sizwe Jackson Consultancy Service L1 $ 105,013,720 | $ 3,150,412 Caricom v v
14 |Sizwe Jackson Consultancy Service L2 $ 105,013,720 (L1-2)

14 |Sizwe Jackson Consultancy Service L3 $ 105,313,720 | $ 9,451,236

14 |Sizwe Jackson Consultancy Service L4 $ 105,313,720 (L3-8)

14 |Sizwe Jackson Consultancy Service L5 $ 105,313,720

14 |Sizwe Jackson Consultancy Service L6 $ 105,313,720

14 |Sizwe Jackson Consultancy Service L7 $ 105,313,720

14 |Sizwe Jackson Consultancy Service L8 $ 105,313,720

15 |Fixit Depot L1 $ 104,303,531 | $ 16,000,000 Caricom v v
15 |Fixit Depot L2 $ 104,303,531 (L1-8)

15 |Fixit Depot L3 $ 104,303,531

15 |Fixit Depot L4 $ 104,303,531

15 |Fixit Depot L5 $ 104,303,531

15 |Fixit Depot L6 $ 104,303,531

15 |Fixit Depot L7 $ 104,303,531

15 |Fixit Depot L8 $ 104,303,531

16 |Power-lite Products Limited (T&T) L1 $455,670 USD $37,000 USD CG United N/A | N/A
16 |Power-lite Products Limited (T&T) L2 $455,670 USD (L1-8)

16 |Power-lite Products Limited (T&T) L3 $455,670 USD

16 [Power-lite Products Limited (T&T) L4 $455,670 USD

16

Power-lite Products Limited (T&T) L5

$455,670 USD




16

Power-lite Products Limited (T&T) L6

$455,670 USD

16 |Power-lite Products Limited (T&T) L7 $455,670 USD

16 |Power-lite Products Limited (T&T) L8 $455,670 USD

17 |Daks Contracting Services L1 $ 147,880,000 | $ 30,000,000 Caricom
17 |Daks Contracting Services L2 $ 147,880,000 (L1-8)

17 |Daks Contracting Services L3 $ 148,180,000

17 |Daks Contracting Services L4 $ 148,180,000

17 |Daks Contracting Services L5 $ 148,180,000

17 |Daks Contracting Services L6 $ 148,180,000

17 |Daks Contracting Services L7 $ 148,180,000

17 |Daks Contracting Services L8 $ 148,180,000

18 ISnialggrlnohan Construction & General Supplies $ 109.026.720 | $ 2 400,000 Premier
18 Isniaﬁgwohan Construction & General Supplies $ 109,026,720 | $ 2 400,000

18 ISniaE;nohan Construction & General Supplies $ 109.326.720 | $ 2 400,000

18 Isniaﬁzwohan Construction & General Supplies $ 109,326,720 | $ 2 400,000

18 ISniaEgnohan Construction & General Supplies $ 109.326.720 | $ 2 400,000

18 ?nJCaE?ohan Construction & General Supplies $ 109,326,720 | $ 2 400,000

18 S Jagmohan Construction & General Supplies $ 109.326.720 | $ 2 400,000

Inc L7




S Jagmohan Construction & General Supplies

18 $ 109,326,720 | $ 2,400,000
Inc L8
19 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L1 $ 170,500,000 | $ 14,900,000 Assuria
19 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L2 $ 170,500,000 (L1-8)
19 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L3 $ 170,800,000
19 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L4 $ 170,800,000
19 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L5 $ 170,800,000
19 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L6 $ 170,800,000
19 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L7 $ 170,800,000
19 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L8 $ 170,800,000
20 [Blue Print Builders Inc L1 $ 168,500,000 | $ 14,500,000 Assuria
20 |Blue Print Builders Inc L2 $ 168,500,000 (L1-8)
20 |Blue Print Builders Inc L3 $ 168,800,000
20 [Blue Print Builders Inc L4 $ 168,800,000
20 |Blue Print Builders Inc L5 $ 168,800,000
20 |Blue Print Builders Inc L6 $ 168,800,000
20 |Blue Print Builders Inc L7 $ 168,800,000
20 |Blue Print Builders Inc L8 $ 168,800,000




Date of Tender Opening: October 24, 2024

File Number: Central Housing & Planning Authority (226/2024/45) - Procurement of Conductors Lots 1-8

Form of

Bﬁg.er Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency Bid Ze(éj::,tl};nAcn;oum Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS ';egnntizr CH(?S er?\slz
1 |AkamailInc L1 $ 121,910,500 $ 2,550,000 Caricom v v v 2
1 |Akamai Inc L2 $ 121,910,500 $ 2,550,000
1 |Akamai Inc L3 $ 121,910,500 $ 2,550,000
1 |Akamai Inc L4 $ 121,910,500 $ 2,550,000
1 |Akamai Inc L5 $ 121,910,500 $ 2,550,000
1 |Akamai Inc L6 $ 121,910,500 $ 2,550,000
1 |Akamai Inc L7 $ 121,910,500 $ 2,550,000
1 |Akamai Inc L8 $ 121,910,500 $ 2,550,000
2 |Daks Contracting Services L1 $ 114,355,000 | $ 24,000,000 Caricom v v v 2
2 |Daks Contracting Services L2 $ 114,355,000 (L1-8)

2 |Daks Contracting Services L3 $ 114,355,000

2 |Daks Contracting Services L4 $ 114,355,000

2 |Daks Contracting Services L5 $ 114,355,000

2 |Daks Contracting Services L6 $ 114,355,000

2 |Daks Contracting Services L7 $ 114,355,000

2 |Daks Contracting Services L8 $ 114,355,000
Aronco Services Inc L1 102,155,254.80 | $ 1,532,329 Premier v v v 2
Aronco Services Inc L2 102,155,254.80 (L1-8)

Aronco Services Inc L3

102,155,254.80

Aronco Services Inc L4

102,155,254.80

WWww|w

Aronco Services Inc L5

AR AR AR R s

102,155,254.80




3 |Aronco Services Inc L6 $ 102,155,254.80

3 |Aronco Services Inc L7 $ 102,155,254.80

3 |Aronco Services Inc L8 $ 102,155,254.80

4 |Tels Engineering Services L1 $ 79,715,500 | $ 7,000,000 Assuria
4 |Tels Engineering Services L2 $ 79,715,500 (L1-8)

4 |Tels Engineering Services L3 $ 79,715,500

4 |Tels Engineering Services L4 $ 79,715,500

4 |Tels Engineering Services L5 $ 79,715,500

4 |Tels Engineering Services L6 $ 79,715,500

4 |Tels Engineering Services L7 $ 79,715,500

4 |Tels Engineering Services L8 $ 79,715,500

5 |Astra Services L1 $ 72,891,000 | $ 1,457,820 Assuria
5 |Astra Services L2 $ 72,891,000 | $ 1,457,820

5 |Astra Services L3 $ 72,891,000 | $ 1,457,820

5 |Astra Services L4 $ 72,891,000 | $ 1,457,820

5 |Astra Services L5 $ 72,891,000 | $ 1,457,820

5 |Astra Services L6 $ 72,891,000 | $ 1,457,820

5 |Astra Services L7 $ 72,891,000 | $ 1,457,820

5 |Astra Services L8 $ 72,891,000 | $ 1,457,820

6 |SPR Enterprises L1 $ 87,468,000 | $ 7,000,000 Assuria
6 |SPR Enterprises L2 $ 87,468,000 (L1-8)

6 |SPR Enterprises L3 $ 87,468,000

6 |SPR Enterprises L4 $ 87,468,000

6 |SPR Enterprises L5 $ 87,468,000




6 |SPR Enterprises L6 $ 87,468,000

6 |SPR Enterprises L7 $ 87,468,000

6 |SPR Enterprises L8 $ 87,468,000

7 |MS Trading L1 $ 101,930,000 | $ 18,000,000 Premier

7 |MS Trading L2 $ 101,930,000 (L1-8)

7 |MS Trading L3 $ 101,930,000

7 |MS Trading L4 $ 101,930,000

7 |MS Trading L5 $ 101,930,000

7 |MS Trading L6 $ 101,930,000

7 |MS Trading L7 $ 101,930,000

7 |MS Trading L8 $ 101,930,000

8 |Twins Enterprise L1 $ 71,990,000 | $ 1,517,800 Assuria

8 |Twins Enterprise L2 $ 71,990,000 | $ 1,517,800

8 |Twins Enterprise L3 $ 71,990,000 | $ 1,517,800

8 |Twins Enterprise L4 $ 71,990,000 | $ 1,517,800

8 |Twins Enterprise L5 $ 71,990,000 | $ 1,517,800

8 |Twins Enterprise L6 $ 71,990,000 | $ 1,517,800

8 |Twins Enterprise L7 $ 71,990,000 | $ 1,517,800

8 |Twins Enterprise L8 $ 71,990,000 | $ 1,517,800

9 N Balgobm & S_ons Contracting Service & $ 76.770.000 | $ 1,599,400 Assuria
Electrical Supplies L1

9 N Balgobin & Sons Contracting Service & $ 76.770.000 | $ 1,599,400

Electrical Supplies L2




N Balgobin & Sons Contracting Service &

9 Electrical Supplies L3 $ 76,770,000 | $ 1,599,400

9 N Balgobln & S_ons Contracting Service & $ 76.770,000 | $ 1,599 400
Electrical Supplies L4

9 N Balgobln & S_ons Contracting Service & $ 76.770,000 | $ 1,599 400
Electrical Supplies L5

9 N Balgobln & S_ons Contracting Service & $ 76.770,000 | $ 1,599 400
Electrical Supplies L6

9 N Balgobln & S_ons Contracting Service & $ 76.770,000 | $ 1,599 400
Electrical Supplies L7

9 N Balgobln & S_ons Contracting Service & $ 76.770,000 | $ 1,599 400
Electrical Supplies L8

10 |Fixit Depot L1 $ 75,250,000 | $ 16,000,000 Caricom

10 |Fixit Depot L2 $ 75,250,000 (L1-8)

10 |Fixit Depot L3 $ 75,250,000

10 |Fixit Depot L4 $ 75,250,000

10 |Fixit Depot L5 $ 75,250,000

10 |Fixit Depot L6 $ 75,250,000

10 |Fixit Depot L7 $ 75,250,000

10 |Fixit Depot L8 $ 75,250,000

11 |Sheriff Construction Inc L1 $ 458,000,000 | $ 15,500,000 Assuria

11 |Sheriff Construction Inc L2 $ 458,000,000 (L1-8)

11 |Sheriff Construction Inc L3 $ 458,000,000

11 |Sheriff Construction Inc L4 $ 458,000,000

11 |Sheriff Construction Inc L5 $ 458,000,000




11 [Sheriff Construction Inc L6 $ 458,000,000

11 [Sheriff Construction Inc L7 $ 458,000,000

11 [Sheriff Construction Inc L8 $ 458,000,000

12 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L1 $ 456,000,000 | $ 15,400,000 Assuria
12 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L2 $ 456,000,000 (L1-8)

12 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L3 $ 456,000,000

12 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L4 $ 456,000,000

12 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L5 $ 456,000,000

12 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L6 $ 456,000,000

12 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L7 $ 456,000,000

12 |Urban Edge Builders Inc L8 $ 456,000,000

13 [Blue Print Builders Inc L1 $ 454,400,000 | $ 15,000,000 Assuria
13 [Blue Print Builders Inc L2 $ 454,400,000 (L1-8)

13 [Blue Print Builders Inc L3 $ 454,400,000

13 |Blue Print Builders Inc L4 $ 454,400,000

13 [Blue Print Builders Inc L5 $ 454,400,000

13 [Blue Print Builders Inc L6 $ 454,400,000

13 [Blue Print Builders Inc L7 $ 454,400,000

13 [Blue Print Builders Inc L8 $ 454,400,000

14 ISn\(]:alg%rlnohan Construction & General Supplies $ 78,675,000 | 2 000,000 Premier
14 S Jagmohan Construction & General Supplies $ 78,675,000 | 2 000,000

Inc L2




S Jagmohan Construction & General Supplies

14 78,675,000 2,000,000
Inc L3

14 ISn\(]:aEleohan Construction & General Supplies 78,675,000 2.000.000

14 ISn\(]:a&_)mohan Construction & General Supplies 78,675,000 2.000.000

14 ISniaEESmohan Construction & General Supplies 78,675,000 2.000.000

14 ISniaE;nohan Construction & General Supplies 78,675,000 2 000.000

14 S Jagmohan Construction & General Supplies 78,675,000 2 000.000

Inc L8




Date of Tender Opening: October 24, 2024

File Number: National Drainage & Irrigation Authority (249/2024/21 Fin) - Provision of Consultancy Services for the Supervision of Retendered Construction of Pump Station to Irrigate
Black Bush Polder Front Lands

Bid Security

Form of

Bidder . Bid Amount & Bid Securit Hard| Flash
No. Name of Bidder Currency A(‘:T?;Jenntcf‘ Agency Y| eRa | nis -Is-fgnnizr Copy| drive
1 |VG Group Guyana Inc (95) $ 78,325,000 v v v 0
2 |Innovative Engineering Consultancy Services (88) $ 15,372,000 v v v 2
3 |Structural Engineering & Design Services (84) $ 29,600,000 v v v 1
4 |E&A Consultants Inc (84) $ 46,596,100 v v v 1 1
4 |E&A Consultants Inc (VAT) $ 5,074,300
5 |Sizwe Jackson Consultancy Service (94) $ 27,390,000 v v v 0
6 |CB & Associates Inc (87) $ 34,311,720 v v v 1
7 |Civil Engineering Lab Guyana (95) $ 29,645,000 v v v 0
8 |RVS Structural Engineering (95) $ 27,982,960 v v v 0
File Number: National Drainage & Irrigation Authority (250/2024/21 Fin) - Design Review & Supervision Services for the Construction of Pump Station at Chesney Corentyne
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & aﬁ]izﬁtgy Bid Security GRA | NIS i%:g;f Hard Fla_lsh
No. Currency Currency Agency signed Copy| drive
1 |VG Group Guyana Inc (95) $ 76,300,000 v v v 0
2 |Sizwe Jackson Consultancy Service (94) $ 23,655,000 v v v 0
3 |Civil Engineering Lab Guyana (95) $ 24,695,000 v v v 0
4 |RVS Structural Engineering (95) $ 25,890,800 v v v 0
5 |E&A Consultants Inc (84) $ 40,298,000 v v v 1 1
5 |E&A Consultants Inc (VAT) $ 5,056,800
6 |Structural Engineering & Design Services (84) $ 26,535,000 v v v 1
7 |Innovative Engineering Consultancy Services (88) $ 19,772,000 v v v 2
8 |CB & Associates Inc (87) $ 42,624,600 v v v 1




Date of Tender Opening: October 24, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (905/2024/40) - Lot 2:Construction of Students’ Dormitory (Boys) at Waramadong

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.ISh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |Triple A General Contracting Services $ 571,465,667 $ 8,571,985 Premier v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 289,927,196
File Number: Ministry of Education (906/2024/40) - Lot 3:Construction of Multi Purpose Hall & Kitchen for Waramadong's Students Dorms
. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla}Sh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |A. Alli Construction $ 360,249,200 $ 5,403,738 Premier v v v 2

Engineer's Estimate

$ 177,070,719




Date of Tender Opening: October 24, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (907/2024/40) - Rehabilitation of Annai Secondary School Dorimitory Lots 1-4

. . Bid Security Form of
Blﬂder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fl{flSh
0. Currency Currency signed Copy| drive
1 |Construct It Inc. L1 $ 222,260,913] $ 3,333,914 Nafico v v v 2
1 |Construct It Inc. L2 $ 171486,013] $ 2,572,290
1 [Construct It Inc. L3 $ 209,169,813] $ 3,137,547
1 |Construct It Inc. L4 $ 240,361,963] $ 3,605,429
2 |Radon Construction L1 $ 210,169,850 $ 3,152,548 Assuria v v v 2
2 |Radon Construction L2 $ 163,356,050 | $ 2,450,341
2 |Radon Construction. L3 $ 195,820,350 | $ 2,937,305
2 |Radon Construction L4 $ 219,800,350 | $ 3,297,005
3 S&K Construc_tlon Consultancy Services & $ 264412870 | $ 10144731 Caricom v v v 5
General Supplies Inc L1
3 S&K Construc_tlon Consultancy Services & $ 170,979,380 (L 1-4)
General Supplies Inc L2
3 S&K Construc_tlon Consultancy Services & $ 240923100
General Supplies Inc L3
4 CLailmmond s Electrical & Transportation Services $ 215887100 | $  3.345.000 Assuria v v v 1
4 (E;lmmond s Electrical & Transportation Services $ 165325050 | $ 2.580.000
4 Grimmond's Electrical & Transportation Services $ 199405910 | $ 3,150,000

L3




Grimmond's Electrical & Transportation Services

4 L4 - $ 3,510,000

5 [Singh & Son Construction L1 $ 219,819,160 | $ 3,297,288 Caricom Ltr
5 |[Singh & Son Construction L2 $ 171,032510|$ 2,565,488

5 [Singh & Son Construction L3 $ 209,250,360 | $ 3,138,756

5 |[Singh & Son Construction L4 $ 230,803,760 | $ 3,462,049

6 |Ramesh Barket Construction L1 $ 212822500 | % 3,192,338 Premier v
6 |Ramesh Barket Construction L2 $ 161,363,730 | $ 2,420,456

6 |Ramesh Barket Construction L3 $ 198,881,650 | % 2,983,217

6 |Ramesh Barket Construction L4 $ 222,150,280 | $ 3,332,254

7 |Ele's Trading & Hardware L1 $ 213,950,000 No Bid Security Seen v
7 |Ele's Trading & Hardware L2 $ 162,455,900

7 |Ele's Trading & Hardware L3 $ 205,130,500

7 |Ele's Trading & Hardware L4 $ 227,006,000

8 |Legalised Trucking & Contracting Service L1 $ 211522438 | $ 3,345,000 Caricom v
8 |Legalised Trucking & Contracting Service L2 $ 158,703,518 | $ 2,580,000

8 |Legalised Trucking & Contracting Service L3 $ 188,278,888 | $ 3,150,000

8 |Legalised Trucking & Contracting Service L4 $ 211,739,423 |$ 3,510,000

9 |Vijay Persaud & Sons Contracting Services L1 $ 217,105,020 | $ 3,265,576 Caricom v
9 |Vijay Persaud & Sons Contracting Services L2 $ 146,347,410 | $ 2,212,124

9 |Vijay Persaud & Sons Contracting Services L3 $ 195,036,490 | $ 2,925,548

9 |Vijay Persaud & Sons Contracting Services L4 $ 225,732,716 | $ 3,283,097

10 |Mohamed Rafi Yusoof Construction L1 $ 220,919,160 | $ 2,313,788 Caricom v




10 |Mohamed Rafi Yusoof Construction L2 $ 170,262,510 | $ 2,553,938
10 |Mohamed Rafi Yusoof Construction L3 $ 208,150,360 | $ 3,123,706
10 |Mohamed Rafi Yusoof Construction L4 $ 231,903,750 | $ 3,478,557
11 |G&F Construction & Furniture Supplies L1 $ 199,821,250 | $ 3,345,000 Caricom
11 |G&F Construction & Furniture Supplies L2 $ 152,789,670 | % 2,580,000
11 |G&F Construction & Furniture Supplies L3 $ 166,641,684 | $ 3,150,000
11 |G&F Construction & Furniture Supplies L4 $ 175,119,060 | $ 3,510,000
12 |K&D Contracting Services L1 $ 213,000,000 | $ 3,195,000 Nafico
13 |NP Contracting & Transportation Services L1 $ 204954640 % 3,070,756 Premier
13 |NP Contracting & Transportation Services L2 $ 164,904,850 | $ 2,473,573
13 |NP Contracting & Transportation Services L3 $ 192192440 | % 2,882,887
14 |Crown Road & Drainage Contractors L1 $ 199,168,860 | $ 3,345,000 Caricom
14 |Crown Road & Drainage Contractors L2 $ 159,488,780 | $ 2,580,000
14 |Crown Road & Drainage Contractors L3 $ 173,092,150 | $ 3,150,000
14 |Crown Road & Drainage Contractors L4 $ 209,197,120 | $ 3,510,000
15 E?Iders Engineering & Architectural Consultancy $ 199529220 | $ 2992938 Assuria
15 E;llders Engineering & Architectural Consultancy $ 150971240 | $  2.399.569
15 Egllders Engineering & Architectural Consultancy $ 104569210 |$ 2918538
15 Builders Engineering & Architectural Consultancy $ 211439910 | $ 3.171.599

L4




16 [Skylines Architecture Inc L1 $ 220,061,721 | $ 3,345,000 Caricom
16 |Skylines Architecture Inc L2 $ 170,115,071 ]|% 2,580,000
16 |[Skylines Architecture Inc L3 $ 207,438,719 |$ 3,150,000
16 |Skylines Architecture Inc L4 $ 233,364,791 | % 3,510,000
17 |Carter's Construction L1 $ 210,908,638 | $ 3,345,000 Premier
17 |Carter's Construction L2 $ 156,477,013 | $ 2,580,000
17 |Carter's Construction L3 $ 201,955,094 |% 3,150,000
17 |Carter's Construction L4 $ 219,176,122 | $ 3,510,000
Engineer's Estimate L1 $ 222,455,926
Engineer's Estimate L2 $ 171,393,420
Engineer's Estimate L3 $ 209,625,702
Engineer's Estimate L4 $ 234,020,182




Date of Tender Opening: October 24, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (908/2024/40) - Rehabilitation of Springlands School Dorimitory Lots 1-3

. . Bid Security Form of
Blﬂder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI"’.ISh
0. Currency Currency signed Copy| drive
1 |LMM Construction & General Services L1 $ 104,699,320 $ 1,570,490 Caricom v v v 2
1 |LMM Construction & General Services L2 $ 90,012,230 $ 1,350,184
1 |LMM Construction & General Services L3 $ 119,695,730] $ 1,795,436
2 |4A Engineering Enterprise L1 $ 89,755,886 $ 1,950,000 Premier v v v 2
2 |4A Engineering Enterprise L2 $ 88,355,355 $ 1,695,000
2 |4A Engineering Enterprise L3 $ 99,282,205 |$% 2,190,000
3 |S.A.W Construction & Supplies L1 $ 110,683,760 | $ 1,160,257 Caricom v v v 2
3 [S.A.W Construction & Supplies L2 $ 90,174,480 |$ 1,352,618
3 |S.A.W Construction & Supplies L3 $ 115991920 | % 1,739,879
Caricom (Form of Tender
4 |KNS Peetum Construction L3 $ 144,746,085 | $ 2,171,191 |Page Completed But Not| v X 2
Signed
5 |You Nailed It Contracting Services L1 $ 126,000,000 [ $ 1,020,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |You Nailed It Contracting Services L2 $ 109,000,000 (L1-3)
5 |You Nailed It Contracting Services L3 $ 138,000,000
6 [Singh & Son Construction L1 $ 115191220 |$ 2,098,362 Caricom v v v 2
6 |Singh & Son Construction L2 $ 97,810,292 |$ 1,467,155
6 [Singh & Son Construction L3 $ 132,629,450 | $ 1,980,532




Impeccable Construction & General Supplies Inc

7 L1 $ 131,322,257 | $ 2,345,000 Caricom
7 II_rgpeccable Construction & General Supplies Inc $ 105576350 | $ 2.580.000
7 Ier?:peccabIe Construction & General Supplies Inc $ 139579550 | $  2.190.000
8 |Phoenix Engineering Enterprise L1 $ 89,819,898 | $ 1,950,000 Premier
8 |Phoenix Engineering Enterprise L2 $ 88,348,178 | $ 1,695,000
8 |Phoenix Engineering Enterprise L3 $ 98,726,760 | $ 2,190,000
9 |Mohamed Rafi Yusoof Construction L1 $ 115,237,267 | $ 2,065,362 Caricom
9 [Mohamed Rafi Yusoof Construction L2 $ 96,710,297 | $ 1,450,600
9 |Mohamed Rafi Yusoof Construction L3 $ 130,429,450 | $ 1,947,532
10 |NP Contracting & Transportation Services L1 $ 120,749,090 | $ 1,811,236 Premier
10 |NP Contracting & Transportation Services L2 $ 103,297,590 | $ 1,549,464
10 |NP Contracting & Transportation Services L3 $ 118,233,390 [ $ 1,773,501
11 |N Abdulla Construction Service L1 $ 120,480,481 |$ 1,950,000 Premier
11 |N Abdulla Construction Service L2 $ 100,152,426 | $ 1,695,000
12 Eigltal Design Construction, Logistics & Supplies $ 117.063953 | $ 1.755.950 Caricom
12 E;gltal Design Construction, Logistics & Supplies $ 104936788 | $ 1574051
12 Digital Design Construction, Logistics & Supplies $ 121839663 | $ 1829004

L3




13 [Wazeer Khan & Sons Construction L1 $ 119,536,918 | $ 1,950,000 Caricom
13 |Wazeer Khan & Sons Construction L2 $ 113595246 |$ 1,695,000
13 [Wazeer Khan & Sons Construction L3 $ 132,970,348 | $ 2,390,000
14 |4S Security & Building Enterprise L1 $ 123,922,480 |$ 1,950,000 Nafico
14 |4S Security & Building Enterprise L2 $ 106,431,490 | $ 1,695,000
14 |4S Security & Building Enterprise L3 $ 138,599,160 | $ 2,190,000
15 |Cornerstone Aggregates Inc L1 $ 119,637,100 | $ 2,250,000 Caricom
15 |[Cornerstone Aggregates Inc L2 $ 104,654,000 (L1-3)
15 |Cornerstone Aggregates Inc L3 $ 136,727,800

S&K Construction, Consultancy Services & Caricom (No Form of
16 General Supplies Inc L1-3 $ 5842801 Tender Page Seen)

(L1-3)

17 [Sharif Construction L1 $ 127,459,770 | $ 1,905,000 Premier
17 |Sharif Construction L2 $ 109,000,000 |$ 1,650,000
17 [Sharif Construction L3 $ 140,500,000 | $ 2,145,000
18 |Faizul Ali Contracting L1 $ 128,500,000 | $ 1,950,000 Premier
18 |Faizul Ali Contracting L2 $ 111,000,300 [ $ 1,695,000
18 |Faizul Ali Contracting L3 $ 140,000,100 | $ 2,190,000

Engineer's Estimate L1 $ 92,420,504

Engineer's Estimate L2 $ 91,032,359

Engineer's Estimate L3 $ 99,238,491




Date of Tender Opening: October 24, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (909/2024/40) - Construction of Students' Dormitory Multi-Purpose Hall a& Kitchen at Monkey Mountain Region#8 Lots 1-2

Bid Security

Form of

Bidder . Bid Amount & . . Hard| Flash
No. Name of Bidder Currency Acx:thr);Jenntcic Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS :iegnnizr Copy| drive
1 |K&D Contracting Service L1 $ 178,000,000( $ 2,670,000 Nafico v v v 2
2 |Serena's Services & Supplies L1 $ 186,613,270 | $ 4,470,000 Assuria Rec | Vv v 2

2 |Serena's Services & Supplies L2 $ 108,225,475
3 |Jaz Establishment L1 $ 185,439,500 | $ 2,820,000 Caricom v v v 2
3 |Jaz Establishment L2 $ 108,937,448 | $ 1,650,000
4 |Ele's Trading & Hardware L1 $ 178,895,500 | $ 4,061,801 Assuria v v v 2
4 |Ele's Trading & Hardware L2 $ 101,995,900 (L1-2)
5 |K's Trucking & Construction Services L1 $ 179,394,560 | $ 2,820,000 Premier v v v 2
5 |K's Trucking & Construction Services L2 $ 102,603,450 | $ 1,650,000
6 |[Steve's Construction Services L1 $ 187,135365 | $ 4,470,000 Assuria X v v 2
6 |[Steve's Construction Services L2 $ 108,583,564 (L1-2)
7 |Radon Construction L1 $ 313,836,500 | $ 4,707,548 Assuria v v v 0
7 |Radon Construction L2 $ 157,949,900 | $ 2,269,249
8 |Triple A General Contradcting Services L1 $ 198,336,030 | $ 2,975,040 Premier v v v 2
8 |Triple A General Contradcting Services L2 $ 120,607,202 | $ 1,809,108

Engineer's Estimate L1 $ 167,345,497

Engineer's Estimate L2 $ 109,888,393




Date of Tender Opening: October 24, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (910/2024/40) - Construction of May 26 Nursery School

Biﬁder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & il\iiiizrgy Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS IfI%rrzgeorf Hard Fla.lSh
0. Currency Currency signed Copy| drive
1 |Fyffe Building & Contracting Works $ 68,357,982 $ 1,400,000 Caricom v v v 1
2 |Eron Lall Civil Engineering Works $ 67,909,979 | $ 1,400,000 Assuria v v v 2
3 |You Nailed It Contracting Services $ 66,400,000 | $ 1,360,000 Caricom v v v 2
4 |K's Trucking & Construction Services $ 79,810,868 | $ 1,400,000 Premier v v v 2
5 |NP Contracting & Transportation Services $ 60,802,151 | $ 1,216,043 Premier v v v 2
6 |Cornerstone Aggregates Inc $ 65,000,000 | $ 1,360,000 Caricom v v v 2
7 |Phoenix Engineering Enterprise $ 59214540 | $ 1,400,000 Premier v v v 1
8 |Innovative Development Solution Guyana $ 65,729,664 | $ 1,400,000 Premier v v v 2
9 |Lallchan's Construction & Graphics Service $ 63,276,255 | $ 1,265,525 Assuria v v v 2

10 |4A Engineering Enterprise $ 59325924 | $ 1,400,000 Premier v v v 1

11 |Angad Ganesh Building & General Construction $ 68,200,000 | $ 1,400,000 Caricom v v v 2

12 |A Alli Construction $ 64,397,603 | % 1,287,952 Premier v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 60,727,065




Date of Tender Opening: October 24, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (911/2024/40) - Construction of Recreational Shed-Northwest Secondary School

Bﬁder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & ii?nii?:rgy Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Ifl'oernmdeor]c Hard Fla.‘Sh
0. Currency Currency signed Copy| drive
1 |Mohamed Rafi Yusoof Construction $ 69,602,000] $ 1,392,040 Caricom v v v 2
2 | Troy Dainty Construction $ 62,922,700 | $ 1,400,000 Premier v v v 2
3 |Lallchan's Construction & Graphics Service $ 63,896,900 | $ 1,277,938 Assuria v v v 2
4 |Angad Ganesh Building & General Construction $ 67,177,700 | $ 1,400,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |Supreme Contracting & Supplies $ 48,596,000 | $ 971,920 Caricom v v v 2
6 |Prored Resources $ 59,000,000 | $ 1,400,000 Premier v v v 2
7 |NP Contracting & Transportation Services $ 67,324,200 | $ 1,346,484 Premier v v v 2
8 |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 67,283,300 | $ 1,500,000 Caricom v v v 2

Engineer's Estimate $ 63,793,350




Date of Tender Opening: October 24, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (912/2024/40) - Construction of Recreational Shed-Cummings Lodge Secondary School

Bid Security

Form of

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fle.lSh
No. Currency Currency signed Copy| drive
1 [L&V's General Services $ 12,420,156 Bid Security Declara}tlon Page v v v 1 2

Completed & Signed
2 |Mohamed Rafi Yusoof Construction $ 13,639,500 Bid Security Declaratlgn Page v v v 2
Not Completed & Signed
- : Bid Security Declaration Page
3 |Angad Ganesh Building & General Construction $ 12,600,000 Not Completed & Signed v v v 1
. : Bid Security Declaration Page
4 |Shebac Cleaning Enterprise $ 12,219,165 Completed & Signed v v v 1
5 |Amin's Construction $ 18,491,340 Bid Security Declaration Page |, |, | 2
Completed & Signed
6 |NP Contracting & Transportation Services $ 15,130,920 Bid Security Declargtlon Page v v v 1
Completed & Signed
- Bid Security Declaration Page
7 |RGG Luxery Finishes Inc $ 13,294,785 Completed & Signed v v v 0
3 S&K _Constructlon, Consultancy Services & General $ 18573765 | $ 371,476 Caricom v v v 2
Supplies Inc
. : Bid Security Declaration Page
9 |JJ Strategic Services $ 12,476,089 Completed & Signed v v v 1
10 |[Global Builders Engineering Inc $ 14265510 $ 400,000 Caricom v v v 2
11 |K&S Civil Engineering Contracting Services Inc $ 18,552,628 | $ 400,000 Caricom v v v 2
12 |MDSG General Services $ 13,561,485 Bid Security Declara}tlon Page v v v 1
Completed & Signed
13 |Exclusive Engineering $ 13,751,787 Bid Security Declaration Page v v v 1

Completed & Signed




Bid Security Declaration Page

14 |R Persid Construction 13,233,675 Completed & Signed v v v
L Bid Security Declaration Page
15 |DR Engineering 13,978,913 Completed & Signed v v v
N . . — Bid Security Declaration Page
16 |Singh's Construction, Welding & Fabricating 13,092,660 Completed & Signed v v v
17 |Rajesh Woodworking & Construction Services 13,969,725 Bid Security Declara}tlon Page v v v
Completed & Signed
. : Bid Security Declaration Page
18 [RD Construction, Consultancy & Supply Services 18,209,255 Completed & Signed v v v
: . : : Bid Security Declaration Page
19 |Phoenix Engineering Enterprise 13,745,550 Completed & Signed v v v
20 |Andrect Engineering & Construction 13,509,300 Bid Security Declargtlon Page v v v
Completed & Signed
: Bid Security Declaration Page
21 |OB General Construction & Supply 9,975,000 Completed & Signed v v v
22 |Office Pro Enterprise & Contracting Services 17,352,552 Bid Security Declargtlon Page v v v
Completed & Signed
, : . : Bid Security Declaration Page
23 |Lallchan's Construction & Graphics Service 12,543,300 Not Completed & Signed v v v
24 |8Ball General Contractor 13,755,777 Bid Security Declargtlon Page v v v
Completed & Signed
25 |D Chowkai & Sons Construction 11,572,596 Bid Security Declara_ltlon Page v v v
Completed & Signed
26 |S&R Tech Solutions 12,500,000 $ 250,000 Caricom X X v
27 |Etrace Payle Business Establishment 12,599,861 Bid Security Declare_ltlon Page v Rec v
Completed & Signed
Engineer's Estimate 14,002,000




Date of Tender Opening: October 24, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (913/2024/40) - Construction of Roof Linden Library

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fle.lSh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
. . Bid Security Declaration Page
1 |RD Construction, Consultancy & Supply Services $ 11,676,840 Completed & Signed v v v 1
N : : .. Bid Security Declaration Page
2 |Singh's Construction, Welding & Fabricating $ 9,932,790 Completed & Signed v v v 1
3 |Bacchus Construction $ 10,482,625 Bid Security Declara}tlon Page v v v 0
Completed & Signed
: Bid Security Declaration Page
4 |OB General Construction & Supply $ 9,612,925 Completed & Signed v v v 1
: : : Bid Security Declaration Page
5 |Exclusive Engineering $ 10,718,306 Completed & Signed v v v 1
6 |Lallchan's Construction & Graphics Service $ 9,890,265 Bid Security Declargtlon Page v v v 2
Completed & Signed
: Bid Security Declaration Page
7 |Mr. Kelman Enterprise $ 11,964,897 Completed & Signed v v v 1
. . . . Bid Security Declaration Page
8 |Phoenix Engineering Enterprise $ 10,583,370 Completed & Signed v v v 1
9 S&K Qonstructlon Consultancy Service & General $ 11481986 Bid Security Declara_ltlon Page v v Y 5
Supplies Inc Completed & Signed
. Bid Security Declaration Page
10 |[MUSE Holdings Inc $ 9,902,816 Completed & Signed v v v 1
11 |L&V's General Services $ 10,653,300 Bid Security Declaration Page v v v 1 2

Completed & Signed




Form of Tender Page Not
Completed But Signed (Bid

12 |Thayo's Construction Security Declaration Page Rec
Completed & Signed)
13 |D&S General Contracting Services $ 10,451,122 Bid Security Declargtlon Page v
Completed & Signed
Engineer's Estimate $ 10,000,000




Date of Tender Opening: October 24, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (914/2024/40) - Rehabilitation Works to Charlestown Secondary School

Bid Security

Form of

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fle.lSh
No. Currency Currency signed Copy| drive
. : : Bid Security Declaration Page
1 |Exclusive Engineering $ 29,451,219 Completed & Signed v v v 1
2 |DNS Construction $ 18,900,000 | $ 378,000 Caricom v v v 0
: Bid Security Declaration Page
3 |OB General Construction & Supply $ 10,500,000 Completed & Signed v v v 1
4 |D Chowkai & Sons Construction $ 37,776,700 Bid Security Declargtlon Page v v v 2
Completed & Signed
: . : Bid Security Declaration Page
5 |Phoenix Engineering $ 29,449,350 Completed & Signed v v v 1
: : Bid Security Declaration Page
6 |Mohamed Rafi Yusoof Construction $ 32,529,000 Not Completed & Signed v v v 2
7 |K&S Civil Engineering Contracting Services Inc $ 59,393,775 % 400,000 Caricom v v v 2
8 |Global Builders Engineering Inc $ 49,221,900 | $ 400,000 Caricom v v v 2
9 [Modern Urban Investments $ 30,865800|% 617,316 Caricom v v v 2
10 |RGG Luxery Finishes Inc $ 29,570,100 Bid Security Declaration Page | , |, |, 0
Completed & Signed
11 |Amin's Construction $ 27,027,950 Bid Security Declara_ltlon Page v v v 1 2
Completed & Signed
12 S&K _Constructlon Consultancy Services & General $ 18.360,352 | $ 367,207 Caricom v v v 9
Supplies Inc
Engineer's Estimate $ 14,931,000




Date of Tender Opening: October 24, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (915/2024/40) - Rehabilitation Works to ORMP Personnel & Churches Building

Form of

B'Sgler Name of Bidder B"éuArTeo:C';t & Bid ieg:'rténAcn;oum Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS I%nnclzr 'C";“;S I;lr?\s/re]
1 |Singh's Construction, Welding & Fabricating $ 29,979,560 | $ 600,000 Caricom v v v 2
2 |EC Modern Design $ 51,286,640 | $ 1,025,733 Caricom v v v 2
3 |STS Investments $ 28,998,500 | $ 579,970 Premier v v v 2
4 |D Chowkai & Sons Construction $ 57,585,958 | $ 600,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |You Nailed It Contracting Services $ 26,250,000 | $ 520,000 Caricom v v v 2
6 |KNS General Contractors Inc $ 25,950,000 | $ 519,000 Caricom v v v 0
7 |R Persid Construction $ 29,896,417 | $ 600,000 Nafico v v v 1
8 |[Construct It Inc $ 47,339,080 | $ 946,782 Nafico v v v 1
9 [Modern Urban Investment $ 30,925,034 | $ 616,500 Caricom v v v 0
10 |RGG Luxery Finishes Inc $ 31,837,120 No Bid Security Seen | v v v 0
11 |K'S Trucking & Contracting Services $ 28142560 | $ 600,000 Premier v v v 2
12 |Angad Ganesh Building & General Construction $ 28,000,000 | $ 600,000 Caricom v v v 2
13 |Amin's Construction $ 39,868,089 | $ 797,362 Assuria v v v 1
14 |Cornerstone Aggregates Inc $ 25,000,000 | $ 520,000 Caricom v v v 2

Engineer's Estimate $ 14,792,107




Date of Tender Opening: October 24, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (916/2024/40) - Construction of Secondary School & Teachers Living Quarters & Karau Lower Mazaruni Region No.7 Lots 1-2

Bid Security

Form of

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.ISh
No. Currency Currency signed Copy| drive
1 |Mahase Construction L1 $ 238,526,202 $ 3,615,000 Premier v v v 2

1 |Mahase Construction L2 $ 99,041,297 | $ 1,515,000

2 |Gryphon Engineering Inc L1 $ 229,764,569 | $ 3,750,000 Caricom v v v 2
2 |Gryphon Engineering Inc L2 $ 94,368,764 | $ 1,650,000

3 |Impeccable Construction & General Supplies Inc L1 $ 200,642,622 | $ 3,615,000 Caricom v v v 2
3 |Impeccable Construction & General Supplies Inc L2 $ 73,832,760 | $ 1,515,000

4 |Ele's Trading & Hardware L1 $ 236,026,170 | $ 7,441,782 Assuria v v v 1
4 |Ele's Trading & Hardware L2 $ 96,062,950 (L1-2)

5 [Faizul Ali Contracting L1 $ 239,600,000 | $ 3,615,000 Premier v v v 1
5 |Faizul Ali Contracting L2 $ 99,800,000 | $ 1,515,000

6 |R. Moe Construction, General Services & Supply L1 $ 1,324,843 Assuria v v v 1
6 |R. Moe Construction, General Services & Supply L2 $ 87,275,941 | $ 2,248,155

7 |G&F Construction & Furniture Supplies L1 $ 198,944,651 | $ 3,615,000 Caricom v v v 2
7 |G&F Construction & Furniture Supplies L2 $ 75,290,981 | $ 1,515,000

8 |KLM Construction L1 $ 209,680,694 | $ 3,615,000 Assuria v v v 2
8 |KLM Construction L2 $ 65,210,741 | $ 1,100,000

9 |Troy Dainty Construction L1 $ 206,101,651 | $ 3,615,000 Premier v v v 2




9 |Troy Dainty Construction L2 $ 85,639,794
10 |Carter's Construction L1 $ 231,703,594 | $ 3,615,000 Premier
10 |Carter's Construction L2 $ 83,874,030 | $ 1,515,000
11 |K's Trucking & Construction Services L1 $ 247,201,191 | $ 3,615,000 Premier
11 |K's Trucking & Construction Services L2 $ 100,000,000 | $ 1,515,000
12 |Builders Engineering & Architectural Consultancy L1 $ 220,828995| $ 3,312,434 Assuria
12 [Builders Engineering & Architectural Consultancy L2 $ 92,027,468 | $ 1,380,212
13 ISr:Q(;KI_l(Jons,tructlon, Consultancy Services & General Supplies $ 270192145 | $ 4052883 Caricom (L1-2)
14 |Elliot's Construction & Supplies L1 $ 200,287,740 | $ 3,004,316 Assuria
14 |Elliot's Construction & Supplies L2 $ 63841879 | % 957,628
15 |[Prored Resources L1 $ 226,000,000 | $ 3,615,000 Premier
15 |Prored Resources L2 $ 75,900,000 | $ 1,515,000
16 |KV Contracting Services L1 $ 232,122,434 | $ 3,713,959 Nafico
16 |KV Contracting Services L2 $ 95933921 | $ 1,439,009
17 |Dayclean Shop-Supply & Service L1 $ 223,673,260 | $ 3,615,000 Caricom
17 |Dayclean Shop-Supply & Service L2 $ 93566,790 | $ 1,515,000

Engineer's Estimate L1 $ 240,908,603

Engineer's Estimate L2 $ 252,660,744




Date of Tender Opening: October 24, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (167/2024/40 Ret) - Renovation & Extension to Student's Residence at Three Miles Secondary School Bartica Region#7

Bid Security

Form of

Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fla_1$h
No. Currency Currency signed Copy | drive
1 |Dayclean Shop-Supply & Service $ 220,233,502 No Bid Security Seen v v v 2
2 |Crown Road Drainage & Contractors $ 252,764,525 | $ 4,095,000 Caricom v v v 2
3 |Cornerstone Aggregates Inc $ 245,000,000 | $ 4,500,000 Caricom v v v 2
4 |You Nailed It Contracting Services $ 246,000,000 | $ 3,750,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 |Satesh Narine $ 326,526,650 | $ 5,500,000 Caricom v v v 2
5 gf;)l;ligr:itéuctlon, Consultancy Services & General $ 380762350 | $ 5711.436 Caricom v v v 9
7 |Forde's Construction & Business Enterprise $ 261044550 | $ 3,915,668 Assuria v v v 2
8 |RGG Luxery Finishes Inc $ 274,654,198 No Bid Security Seen v v v 1

. . Assuria (Form of Tender Page
9 |R. Moe Construction, General Services & Supply $ 4,228,360 Not Completed But Signed) v v v 0
10 |Construct It Inc $ 351,625,600 | $ 5,274,384 Nafico v v v 2
11 |DIGIRIS Engineering & Construction $ 337,601,011 | $ 6,750,000 Nafico v v v 2
12 |Builders Hardware General Supplies & Construction $ 329,891,650 | $ 4,948,375 Assuria v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 248,121,150




Date of Tender Opening: October 24, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (943/2024/40) - Rehabilitation of Electrical Infrastructure - St. Ignatius Primary PIC

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fle.lSh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
, . Bid Security Declaration Page
1 [Nelson's & Son General Construction $ 12,625,200 y : g v v v 1
Completed & Signed
Engineer's Estimate $ 14,568,750
File Number: Ministry of Education (944/2024/40) - Rehabilitation of Electrical Infrastructure - Fellowship PIC
. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI‘?‘Sh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
. : : : Bid Security Declaration Page
1 |Vidrick Construction & Electrical Services $ 19,969,950 y : g v v v 1 0
Completed & Signed
Engineer's Estimate $ 7,215,600




Date of Tender Opening: October 24, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (945/2024/40) - Rehabilitation of Electrical Infrastructure - Beterverwagting PIC

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender Hard Fle.lSh
No. Currency . Copy| drive
Currency signed
1 |A Ograsein & Sons $ 14,406,000 Bid Security Declara}tlon Page v v v 1
Completed & Signed
. : Assuria (Form of Tender Page
2 . 1
2 |R&P Engineering & General Construction $ 80,000 Not Completed But Signed v v v
3 |Anaz Construction Inc $ 15,315,615 Bid Security Declara}tlon Page v v v 1
Completed & Signed
Engineer's Estimate $ 13,907,250
File Number: Ministry of Education (946/2024/40) - Rehabilitation of Electrical Infrastructure - Hopetown PIC
. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency GRA | NIS Tender Hard FI&.ISh
No. Currency . Copy | drive
Currency signhed
. . . Bid Security Declaration Page
. 2
1 |JR Engineering Solutions $ 15,212,400 Completed & Signed v v v
Engineer's Estimate $ 14,458,500




Date of Tender Opening: October 24, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Education (966/2024/40) - Construction of Secondary School & Teacher's Living Quarters at Issano Village Middle Mazaruni Region No.7 Lots 1-2

. . . . Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Bid Security Amount Bid Security Agency GRA NIS Tender Hard Fla_lsh

No. Currency & Currency signed Copy | drive
1 |Forde's Construction & Business Enterprise L1 $ 208,699,967 | $ 3,130,500 Assuria v v v 2
1 |Forde's Construction & Business Enterprise L2 $ 84,259,925 | $ 1,253,823
2 |Troy Dainty Construction L1 $ 232,607,107 | $ 3,795,000 Premier v v v 2
2 |Troy Dainty Construction L2 $ 84,822,626
3 |Apex Engineering L1 $ 271,700,692 | $ 3,795,000 Caricom v v v 1
3 |Apex Engineering L2 $ 115,324,080 | $ 1,515,000

4 |Eron Lall Civil Engineering Works L1 $ 250,104,844 | $ 3,751,573 Assuria v v v 2
4  |Eron Lall Civil Engineering Works L2 $ 94,906,097 | $ 1,423,591
5 |Mahase Construction L1 $ 252,209,324 | $ 3,795,000 Premier v v v 2
5 |Mahase Construction L2 $ 99,041,297 | $ 1,515,000
6 |KV Contracting Services L1 $ 248,704,098 | $ 3,730,561 Nafico v v v 2
6 |KV Contracting Services L2 $ 96,533,921 | $ 1,448,009
7 |Andrect Engineering & Construction L1 $ 246,274,674 | $ 5,000,000 Caricom v v v 2
7 |Andrect Engineering & Construction L2 $ 96,072,334 (L1-2)
8 |Carter's Construction L1 $ 231,719,456 | $ 3,795,000 Premier v v v 2
8 |Carter's Construction L2 $ 85,586,530 | $ 1,515,000




9 |Eon's Construction & Supply Services L1 $ 224,000,716 | $ 3,795,000 Caricom
9 |Eon's Construction & Supply Services L2 $ 96,829,339 | $ 1,515,000
10 |Prored Resources L1 $ 80,700,000 | $ 3,795,000 Premier
10 |Prored Resources L2 $ 80,700,000 | $ 1,515,000
11 |Dayclean Shop-Supply & Service L1 $ 232573925 | % 3,795,000 Caricom
11 |Dayclean Shop-Supply & Service L2 $ 93,566,790 | $ 1,515,000
12 |KNV Contracting Services L1 $ 243,000,000 | $ 3,645,000 Nafico
12 |KNV Contracting Services L2 $ 91,000,000 | $ 1,365,000
13 |R.Moe Construction, General Services & Supply L1 $ 235327,791 | $ 3,533,647 Assuria
13 |R.Moe Construction, General Services & Supply L2 $ 88322871 | % 1,324,843
14 |Jaz Establishment L1 $ 251,202,397 | $ 3,795,000 Caricom
14 |Jaz Establishment L2 $ 99,107,555 | $ 1,515,000
15 |Ele's Trading & Hardware L1 $ 245,001,040 | $ 7,681,281 Assuria
15 |Ele's Trading & Hardware L2 $ 96,062,950 (L1-2)
16 |John Enterprise L2 $ 267,884,595 | $ 4,018,269 Assuria
Engineer's Estimate L1 $ 252,660,744
Engineer's Estimate L2 $ 80,596,375




