Date of Tender Opening: September 03, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Natural Resources (28/2024/26 Fin) - Procurement of Data Management Services for Guyana's Exploration and Production Data

Bidder Bid Security Form of Hard | Flash
Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender ar :
No. . Copy [ drive
Currency signed
1 [Halliburton (87.67) $1,887,189.09 USD v 1 1
File Number: Guyana Water Inc (116/2024/45) - Drilling of Potable Water Well at Mabaruma
Bidder Bid Security Form of Hard | Flash
Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender ar i
No. . Copy | drive
Currency signed
1 |DN Construction & Machinery Rental $ 24,326,000| $ 375,000 Caricom v v v 2
2 |R Kissoon Contracting Service $ 32,510,000| $ 500,000 Premier v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 24,990,000




Date of Tender Opening: September 03, 2024

File Number: Deeds and Commercial Registry (106/2024/52) - Design and Supervision Services Construction of Berbice Sub-Registry Building, New Amsterdam

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder . Bid Amount & . . Hard | Flash

No. Name of Bidder Currency AC\:rE(r)Eenr;tccjc Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS 'sl'iegnn(izr Copy | drive
Innovative Engineering Consultancy

L Services (Tech & Fin Prop Sub) v v v 2

5 Beston Consulting Inc (Tech & Fin Prop v v v 5
Sub)

: Bid Security

3 |CEC Inc (Tech & Fin Prop Sub) Declaration C/S v v v 2
Sizwe Jackson Consultancy Service (Tech

4 & Fin Prop Sub) v v v 2

5 VIKAB (Guyana) Limited (Tech & Fin v Y v 5
Prop Sub)

6 RBS Structural Engineering (Tech & Fin v v v 5
Prop Sub)

7 |Kalitech Inc (Tech & Fin Prop Sub) v v v 2
Engineering & Agricultural Consultants

8 Inc (Tech & Fin Prop Sub) v v v 2

9 PME Consulting Engineers Inc (Tech & Bid Security v v v 5
Fin Prop Sub) Declaration C/S

10 |HMV Ingenieros (Tech & Fin Prop Sub) Bid Security | \ya Inal v | 1] o

Declaration C/S




Date of Tender Opening: September 03, 2024

File Number: Guyana Elections Commission (73/2024/11) - Procurement of One New Double Cab Pick-up

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender | 12rd FIQSh
No. Currency . Copy | drive
Currency signed
1 |Massy Motors Guyana Ltd $ 8,550,000 $ 750,000/ CG United v v v 2
2 |Beharry Automotive Ltd $ 12,540,000 $ 125,400 Nafico v v v 2
3 |ldeal Autos Inc $ 13,000,000 $ 130,000 Nafico v v v 2
4 |Car Clean Enterprise $ 8,150,000 $ 300,000 HandinHand | Vv v v 2
File Number: Ministry of Home Affairs (307/2024/51) - Procurement and Installation of Exhaust Fan
) . Bid Security Form of
Bllf:der Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender | 1ard Flgsh
0. Currency . Copy | drive
Currency signed
NO BIDS RECEIVED
File Number: Ministry of Home Affairs (301/2024/51) - Procurement of Fire-Fighting Hose Guyana Fire Service
Bidder Bid Amount & Bid Security Form of Hard | Flash
Name of Bidder Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender ]
No. Currency . Copy | drive
Currency signed
1 |Industrial Safety Supplies Inc $ 26,780,400 $ 535,608/ HandinHand | V v v 2
2 |Supergraphics $ 19,200,000| $ 400,000 Caricom v v v 2




Date of Tender Opening: September 03, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Health (236/2024/47) - Supply and Delivery of Reagents & Consumables

Bidder Bid Security Form of Hard | Flash
Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS | Tender :
No. . Copy | drive
Currency signhed
1 |Western Scientific Company Ltd $2,157,067.12 USD| $ 22,050,000 Premier N/A |N/A v 2
2 |Meditron Inc $ 632,552,387| $ 19,000,000 Diamond/ v |V v 2
3 |Caribbean Medical Supplies Inc $ 454,262,206 $ 9,085,245 Nafico v |V v 2
4 [New GPC INC $ 1,717,453,018 | $ 50,000,000 Premier v | V v 2
File Number: Ministry of Health (241/2024/47) - Design, Supply and Installation of an Electronic Health Record System for the MOH
Bidder Bid Security Form of Hard | Flash
N Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Currency Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS | Tender .
0. . Copy | drive
Currency signed
Telecommunications Services of Trinidad & Scotia Bank
1 Tobago (Tech & Fin Prop Sub) $10,000 USD (Cheque) N/A TNIA v 1 1
: . : Republic Bank of
o |RioMed Limited (T&T) (Tech & Fin Prop $10,000USD| Trinidad & |N/A|NJA| v | 1| 2
Sub)
Tobago
The Phoenix Partnership (Leeds) Limited No Bid Security
3 (TPP) (Tech & Fin Prop Sub) Seen N/A INIA v L 2




Date of Tender Opening: September 03, 2024

File Number: Ministry of Health (240/2024/47) - Supervision Services for the Design and Construction of Lethem Hospital Region 9

i . Bid Security . . Form of
Bidder . Bid Amount & Bid Security Hard | Flash
No. Name of Bidder Currency @T?Eenﬁcj‘ Agency GRA | NIS :iegnntizr Copy | drive
CB & Associates Inc, ColesgA Associates
L Ltd (Tech & Fin Prop Sub) v v v L L
Concremat Engenharia E Tecnologia S.A.,
2 |Vielca Ingenieros S.A, GR Engineering N/A | N/A v 1 2
Company (Tech & Fin Prop Sub)
Project Planning & Management Ltd,
AMPC International Health Consultants,
3 Marcel Gaskin & Associates Ltd (Tech & v v v 1 1
Fin Prop Sub)
Ingenieros Civiles Especialiastas, Ingenieria
4 De Proyectos S.A.S (Tech & Fin Prop Sub) /A | NIA v 1 1
5 VIKAB Engineering Consultants Ltd (Tech v v v 1 1

& Fin Prop Sub)




Date of Tender Opening: September 03, 2024

File Number: Ministry Culture, Youth & Sports (133/2024/44) - Construction of Open Concrete Drain- Anna Regina

Bid Security

Form of

Bidder . Bid Amount & . . Hard | Flash

No. Name of Bidder Currency Amount & Bid Security Agency| GRA | NIS T_ender Copy | drive
Currency signed
1 |Narine's Construction & General Supplies $16,804,725 $336,095 Assuria v v v 2
2 |Wild Oats Civil & Mechanical Engineering $16,302,037 $342,321 Caricom v v v 2
3 |Talish Hallow Blocks $16,987,950 $341,216 Assuria v v v 1
4 |Ceraturium $51,177,775 $342,321 Caricom v v v 0
5 |Harry Chowtie Enterprise $25,424,700 $400,000 Caricom v v v 1
6 |Saam General Contracting $19,266,352 $360,000| Premier Ins v v v 1
2 Lallghan s Construction & Graphics $20 294,925 No Bid Security v v v 5
Service Seen

8 |MJ's Contracting & General Supplies $15,606,675 $342,321 Caricom v v v 2
9 |Maxart $14,992,950 $299,859 Assuria v v v 2
10 |Infinity Contracting & General Services $16,301,250 $342,321 Assuria v v v 2
11 |Vijay Persaud & Sons Contracting Services $15,850,275 $317,006 Assuria v v v 2
12 |T.P Construction $15,334,025 $342,321 Caricom v v v 2
13 |P.Persaud Investment $15,596,280 $342,321 Caricom v v v 2
14 |VS Engineering & Investment $16,686,600 $296,879 nafico v v v 2
15 |Golden Key Construction & Supply $16,684,500 $342,321 Caricom v v v 2




E.J & N General Construction &

16 ) $16,223,445 $324,469 Assuria v v v 2
Maintenance

17 [Visho's Hallow Blocks & Trucking Service $15,895,950 $342,321 Caricom v v v 2

18 ?efif}zgh“s Contracting & Trucking $17,017,875 $352,410| Caricom | v | v | 2

19 |AG Enterprise $14,442,750 $288,855 Assuria v v v 2

20 |lcan Engineering & Construction $16,705,500 $334,110 Assuria v v v 2
Sovereignty Investments Construction .

21 Services (SICS Builders) $14,638,155 $292,763 Assuria v v v 1

gp |Technocon Investments Procurement & $18,490,500 $500,000 Caricom | v | v | 1
General Contracting Solutions

23 ggV?;ZStr“Ct'O”’ Consultancy & Supply $17,008,425 $340,168|  Assuria v | v | v 2

24 |Beshaun Construction Service $16,824,465 $336,489 Caricom v v v 2

25 |R&N Contracting & Supplies Services $16,702,875 $342,321| Caricom v v v 2

26 |Matty General Construction $16,409,400 $328,188 nafico v v v 2

27 |Jay Apartment Rental $16,081,800 $321,636] Caricom v v v 1

28 |GY Contracting $17,048,094 $340,962 Assuria v v v 2

29 Jaav_le_r & V|d|ana_s General Construction $16.954,875 $338.258 Caricom Y v v 5
Desilting & Supplies

30 |[F&A Mohamed Construction Firm $15,641,325 $312,826 Caricom v v v 2

31 Builders Engineering & Architectural $16.279.725 $325 595 Assuria v Y Y 5
Consultancy

32 |A.M.1.C General Contracting Services $16,937,288 $342,000 Nafico v v v 2




33 |Andrect Engineering & Construction $16,868,188 $342,321 Assuria v v v 2
34 | Prasaud Consrutruction & $19,867,050 $342,321| caricom | v | v | 2
Transportation Services
35 [Bhowan Trucking & Construction Services $15,396,465 $272,465 Caricom v v v 2
36 |D&S General Contracting Services $17,103,187 $342,321 Assuria v v v 2
37 |IMS Construction & Logistics Services $15,876,315 $320,000 Caricom v v v 2
38 |Guycan Investment $18,514,125 $352,650|  Caricom v v v 1
39 |A.K Premier Investments $14,709,450 $294,189 Caricom v v v 1
40 |R79 Mining & Construction $16,798,950 $342,321| Caricom v v v 2
41 |Paramlall Goberdhan Contracting $16,196,000 $342,321 Caricom v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate $17,116,050




Date of Tender Opening: September 03, 2024

File Number: Ministry Culture, Youth & Sports (134/2024/44) - Construction of Covered Concrete Drain & Bridge

: . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender | Hard FIa.ISh
No. Currency Currency signed Copy | drive
1 'S‘:::f;zzn s Construction & Graphics $ 40,821,000 $  816438|  Assuria v |v| v 2
2 |A.K Premier Investments $ 28,815,150 $ 576,303 Caricom v v 1
Sovereignty Investments Construction :
3 Services (SICS Builders) $ 29,030,400 $ 580,608 Assuria v v v 2
4 |Paramlall Goberdhan Contracting $ 30,883,650 $ 645,309 Caricom v v v 2
5 |VG Group Guyana Inc $ 49,585,200 $ 991,704 Caricom v v v 2
6 |R&N Contracting & Supplies Services $ 31,430,175| $ 645,309 Caricom v v v 2
7 Technocon In_vestment_s Procuremetn & $ 32242350 | $ 760,000 Caricom v v v 1
Gen Contracting Solutions
8 |Visho's Hollow Blocks & Trucking Service| $ 29,856,750 | $ 645,309 Caricom v v v 2
9 |Wild Oats Civil & Mechanical Engineering| $ 31,705,800 | $ 645,309 Caricom v v v 2
10 |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 31,382,925 | $ 645,309 Assuria v v v 2
11 [lcan Engineering & Construction $ 31,809,750 | $ 636,195 Assuria v v v 1
12 |MJ's Contracting & General Supplies $ 30,279,375 | $ 645,309 Caricom v v v 2
13 |D&S General Contracting Services $ 31,067,925 | $ 645,309 Assuria v v v 2
14 |Bhowan Trucking & Construction Services| $ 28,509,600 | $ 570,192 Caricom v v v 2




K&S Civil Engineering Contracting

15 : $ 37,597,875 | $ 400,000 Caricom v X v 1
Services Inc
16 |A Alli Construction $ 28,826,700 | $ 576,534 Premier v v v 2
17 |Ceraturium $ 31,681,125 | $ 645,309 Caricom v v v 0
18 [IMS Construction & Logistics Services $ 29,556,450 | $ 600,000 Caricom v v v 2
19 |Vijay Persaud & Sons Contracting Service | $ 29,689,065 | $ 593,781 Assuria v v v 2
20 |[Golden Key Construction & Supply $ 31,406,550 | $ 645,309 Caricom v v v 2
21 |GY Contracting $ 37,896,600 | $ 757,932 Assuria v v v 2
22 |Beshaun Construction Service $ 32,086,950 | $ 641,739 Caricom v v v 2
23 |Jay Apartment Rental $ 29,027,250 | $ 580,545 Caricom v v v 1
24 |Orin's Supreme Enteprise $ 32,607,745 | $ 644,000 Assuria v v v 2
25 |Harry Chowtie Enterprise $ 45,918,075 | $ 880,000 Caricom v v v 2
26 [B.S Narine & Sons Investment $ 47,033,700 | $ 94,674 Caricom v v v 2
27 |Infinity Contracting & General Services $ 30,600,675 | $ 645,309 Assuria v v v 2
28 [R79 Mining & Construction $ 31,037,475 | $ 645,309 Caricom v v v 2
29 |[Talish Hallow Blocks $ 30,986,445 | $ 644,112 Assuria v v v 1
30 |4S Security & Building Enterprise $ 30,423,750 | $ 645,309 Nafico v v v 2
31 Jaav_ie_r & Vidiana'_s General Construction $ 31.506.300 | $ 487924 Caricom v v Y 5
Desilting & Supplies
32 |T.P Construction $ 31,131,18750 | $ 645,309 Caricom v v v 2
33 |Matty General Construction $ 29,741,280 | $ 594,825 Nafico v v v 2
34 |A.G Enteprise $ 29,167,950 | $ 583,359 Assuria v v v 2
35 |Narine's Construction & General Supplies | $ 31,595,025 | $ 631,900 Assuria v v v 2




A Bacchus Contracting & Trucking

36 Service $ 31,500,000 | $ 630,000 Caricom v v v 2

37 |A.M.1.C. General Contracting Service $ 30,661,050 | $ 644,000 Nafico v v v 2

38 |F&A Mohamed Construction Firm $ 30,376,500 | $ 607,530 Caricom v v v 2

39 |Maxart $ 29,482,950 | $ 589,659 Assuria v v v 2

g0 |EI&N General Construction & $ 31,111,395 |$ 622,228 Assuria viiv| v 2
Maintenance

41 |Satesh Naraine $ 31,497,900 | $ 629,940 Assuria v v v 2
Builders Hardware, General Supplies & Assuria (Bid Pg

42 Construction $ 638,353 N/C but Signed) v v v 2

43 |Gavko Construction & Supplies Inc $ 31,488,975 | $ 645,309 Caricom v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 32,265,450




Date of Tender Opening: September 03, 2024

File Number: Ministry Culture, Youth & Sports (135/2024/44) - Construction of Timber Revetment

. . Bid Security Form of
Bidder . Bid Amount & . . Hard | Flash
No. Name of Bidder Currency A(\ZTS:’Jenr;[cic Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS :iegnntizr Copy | drive
1 |Triple A General Contracting Services $ 30,014,250 | $ 600,285 Premier v v v 2
2 |Narine's Construction & General Supplies $ 30,576,000 | $ 611,520 Assuria v v v 2
3 |A.K Premier Investments $ 29,933,400 No Blgeiﬁcurlty v v v 1
4 |D&S General Contracting Services $ 32,880,750 | $ 750,000 Assuria v v v 2
5 |N&S Contracting & Supply Services $ 33,902,675 | $ 680,642 Caricom v v v 2
6 |Beshaun Construction Service $ 32,446,838 | $ 648,936 Caricom v v v 2
7 |T.P Construction $ 27,327,125 | $ 680,642 Caricom v v v 2
3 Rahgman Construction & Transportation $ 20225700 | $ 584,514 Caricom Y v Y )
Services
9 Qé]rsiecrj:ud Construction & Transportation $ 31556125 % 680 641 Caricom v v v 5
10 |[Rans Contracting & Supplies $ 33250875 |% 800,000 Caricom v v v 1
11 |VS Engineering & Investment $ 29,022,000 | $ 653,541 Nafico v v v 2
12 |Momin & Son's Construction $ 28,821,450 | $ 576,429 Caricom v v v 2
13 [Matty General Construction $ 29,868,300 | $ 597,366 Nafico v v v 2
14 |Builders Hardware, General Supplies & $ 27126750 |$ 542,535 |  Assuria v | v | v 2
Construction
15 |Golden Key Construction & Supply $ 33918675 % 680,642 Caricom v v v 2
16 Technocon Investments Procurement & $ 35994000 | $ 800,000 Caricom v v v 1

General Contracting Solutions




17 |A.M.1.C. General Contracting Services $ 31,219,125 | $ 680,000 Nafico v v v 2
1g |N&A General Construction Maintenance, | ¢ g 575955 [ ¢ 571,518 | Assuria v iv| v 2
Supplies & Janitorial Services
19 |Orins Supreme Enteprise $ 29,638,875 (9% 680,000 Caricom v v v 2
20 |NP Contracting & Transportation Services $ 29,604,750 | $ 598,000 Premier v v v 2
21 |Sac & Sac Vision Construction $ 32,364,675 | $ 800,000 Caricom v v v 2
22 |lcan Engineering & Construction $ 32,996,250 | $ 659,925 Assuria v v v 2
23 |Vijay Persaud & Sons Contracting Services |$ 31,347,750 | $ 626,955 Assuria v v v 2
24 |Ceraturium $ 29,578,500 | $ 680,642 Caricom v v v 0
25 [Bhowan Trucking & Construction Services $ 29,157,500 | $ 573,248 Caricom v v v 2
26 | B.S Narine & Sons Investment $ 33801075 (% 676,022 Caricom v v v 2
27 |SixS General Construction $ 35843850 | $ 1,116,870 Caricom v v v 2
28 |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 33,090,750 | $ 750,000 Assuria v v v 2
Sovereignty Investments Construction :
29 Services (SICS Builders) $ 30,599,625 | $ 607,992 Assuria v v v 2
30 |4S Security & Building Enterprise $ 32,825,625 | % 680,642 Nafico v v v 2
31 [Lallchan's Construction & Graphics Service |$ 28,821,975 | $ 576,439 Assuria v v v 2
32 |Engineered Construction Company $ 38,721,900 | $ 774,438 Caricom v v v 2
33 |R79 Mining & Construction $ 30,095625 | $ 680,641 Caricom v v v 2
34 |Infinity Contracting & General Services $ 32,921,700 | $ 680,642 Assuria v v v 2
35 [Harry Chowtie Enterprise $ 30,296,595 | $ 2,000,000 Caricom v v v 2
36 [lcon Investment $ 38,335,762 | $ 744,405 Caricom v v v 1
37 |Wild Oats Civil & Mechanical Engineering $ 32241562 | $ 680,642 Caricom v v v 2
38 K&S Civil Engineering Contracting Services $ 16832550 | $ 400000 Caricom v v v 1

Inc




39

Visho's Hollow Blocks & Trucking Service

$

30,702,000

$

680,642

Caricom

Engineer's Estimate

$

34,032,075




Date of Tender Opening: September 03, 2024

File Number: Ministry Culture, Youth & Sports (136/2024/44) - Construction of Sight Screen and media Centre

. . Bid Security Form of
Bﬁder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender Hard FIQSh
0. Currency Currency signed Copy | drive
1 |Maxart $ 27,984,705| $ 559,694 Assuria v v v 2
2 |A Alli Construction $ 28,554,225| $ 571,085 Premier v v v 2
3 |Talish Hollow Blocks $ 33,197,850| $ 618,000 Assuria v v v 1
4 |Bhowan Trucking & Construction Services| $ 29,242 500 $ 457,048 Caricom v v v 2
5 |Zeebo & Sons Construction $ 28,971,800| $ 552,608 Premier v v v 1
6 |VG Group Guyana Inc $ 47,710,950 $ 054,219 Caricom v v v 2
7 |Wild Oats Civil & Mechanical Engineering| $ 33,324,375 | $ 670,000 Caricom v v v 2
8 [Ceraturium $ 28,570,000 | $ 619,438 Caricom v v v 0
Sovereignty Investments Construction :

9 Services (SICS Builders) $ 29,144325 | $ 582,887 Assuria v v v 2
10 ga;;l?;somers Construction & Hardware | o 55 67900 | ¢ 531,358 | Premier v | v | v 1
11 |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 30,181,200 | $ 750,000 Assuria v v v 2
12 |Beshaun Construction Service $ 29,540,805 | $ 592,034 Caricom v v v 2
13 [Paramlall Goberdhan Contracting $ 29,710,800 | $ 619,437 Caricom v v v 2
14 |D&S General Contracting Services $ 29,971,200 | $ 750,000 Assuria v v v 2
15 |F&A Mohamed Construction Firm $ 26,468,000 | $ 529,360 Caricom v v v 2
16 Builders Engineering & Architectural $ 30962085 | $ 619,242 Assuria v v v 5

Consultancy




17

Matty General Construction

$

28,129,500

$

562,590

Nafico

Engineer's Estimate

$

30,971,861




Date of Tender Opening: September 03, 2024

File Number: Ministry Culture, Youth & Sports (137/2024/44) - Land Clearing, Filling and Leveling of Cricket Academy Good Hope

Bid Security

Form of

Bidder . Bid Amount & . . Hard | Flash
No. Name of Bidder Currency A(\:rzsgenr;[ci Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS 'I;iegnncl%r Copy | drive
1 |AE&N General Contracting $ 84,686,910 |$ 1,999,951 Premier v v v 2
2 |VR Construction Inc $ 99,217,650 | $ 1,984,353 Caricom v v v 2
3 |F.M.C. Construction & Services Inc $ 99,862,350 | $ 1,999,951 Premier v v v 2
4 |Ceraturium $ 03,339,225 | $ 1,999,952 Caricom v v v 0
5 |Permaul Trading & Distribution $ 93,677,325 |$ 1,874,000 GTM v v v 2
6 |Excel Engineering $ 93,158,100 | $ 2,000,000 Premier v v v 2
7 |BM Property Investments Inc $ 120,926,925 | 3% 2,418,539 Caricom v v v 2
8 |S&S Construction & Aggregates $ 83,750,215 No Blglei(ra]curlty v v v 2
9 |J Persaud Infrastructure $ 82,193,270 No Blge?:]cu“ty v X v 2
10 |Engineered Construction Company $ 83,179,950 | $ 1,663,599 Caricom v v v 2
11 |Jardine Construction $ 84,219,345 No B'geiﬁcu”ty v | v | v 2
12 |Mohamed's Savannah Ranch Inc $ 86,591,400 | $ 1,700,000 Nafico X X v 2
13 |VK Excavator Rentals $ 81,562,614 | $ 1,631,252 Assuria v v v 2
14 |F&A Mohamed Construction Firm $ 79,485,105 | $ 1,589,702 Caricom v v v 2
15 |RH Global $ 97,516,000 | $ 1,840,000 Nafico v v v 2
16 |Jeetendra Enterprise $ 99,691,463 | $ 1,993,929 Premier v v v 2
17 |Powdat Ram Contruction & Engineering | ¢ g5 04350 | ¢ 1,099,040 |  Caricom viv ]| v 1

Enterprise




18 [JJ Construction & General Electrical $ 82,853,400 | $ 1,630,000 Nafico v v v 2
19 [Money Tree Trading $ 82,953,350 | $ 1,649,067 Premier v v v 2
20 |Buju Maintenance Service $ 108,939,915 | $ 1,999,951 Caricom v v v 2
21 |MSB Investment $ 90,902,700 | $ 1,818,054 Caricom v v v 2
22 |KNPS Contracting & Supplies $ 87,548,790 | $ 1,750,975 Caricom v v v 2
23 |Urban Road Builders $ 80,898,689 | $ 1,617,973 Caricom v v v 2
24 |A Alli Construction $ 88,150,440 | $ 1,763,009 Premier v v v 2
25 g;fgfges Construction & Maintenance $ 86,811,112 |$ 1,999,951 |  Premier viv] v 2
26 [Mobile Construction Company $ 88,238,375 | $ 1,764,767 Caricom v v v 2
27 |Applied Services $ 97,159,650 | $ 1,944,000 Premier v v v 2
98 Sove_reignty Invest_ments Construction $ 83715975 | $  1.674.320 Assuria v v v )
Services (SICS Builders)
29 |Orins Supreme Enterprise $ 95,372,825 [ $ 1,998,000 Caricom v v v 2
30 |Y¥hadram & Sons Construction $ 89,976,600 | $ 1,799,532 |  Caricom v | v | v 2
Establishment
31 |[Basheir & Son's Construction Inc $ 90,406,575 | $ 1,808,132 Nafico v v v 2
32 [B&N Construction Services Inc $ 92,448,668 | $ 1,999,951 Caricom v v v 2
33 |Matty General Construction $ 86,348,325 | $ 1,726,967 Nafico v v v 2
34 [Mohamed Rahim & Son $ 118,511,400 | $ 2,500,000 Assuria v v v 2
35 |Zeebo & Sons Construction $ 94,966,261 | $ 1,899,325 Premier v v v 1
36 (R Persid Construction $ 87,219,510 | $ 1,999,951 Nafico v v v 2
37 |SixS General Construction $ 87,697,050 | $ 1,753,941 Caricom v v v 2
gg |1echnocon Investments Procurement & | ¢ g a5 995 | ¢ 2,300,000 |  Caricom v | v | v 1
General Contracting Solutions
39 [K&A Contracting Services $ 75,654,525 | $ 1,999,951 Caricom v v v 2




40 |J.S Engineering Services & Supplies $ 80,208,450 | $ 1,999,951 Caricom v v v 2
41 |STP Investments Inc $ 99,699,561.68 | $ 1,994,000 Premier v v v 2
42 |VG Group Guyana Inc $ 98,870,625 | $ 1,977,413 Caricom v v v 2
43 |NK Engineering Services $ 89,272,575 | $ 1,800,000 Nafico v v v 1
44 |Wild Oats Civil & Mechanical Engineering| $ 96,141,150 | $ 1,999,951 Nafico v v v 2
45 |KV Contracting Services $ 88,296,600 | $ 1,765,932 Nafico v v v 2
46 |Dundas Construction Inc $ 98,351,768 | $ 1,999,952 Caricom v v v 2
47 |R Kissoon Contracting Service $ 102,909,450 | $ 2,060,000 Premier v v v 2
48 |First Change Builders Inc $ 99,063,825 | $ 1,981,276 Assuria v v v 2
49 |Harry Chowtie Enterprise $ 99,328,005 | $ 680,000 Caricom v v v 2
50 [NK Enterprise Inc $ 97,946,730 | $ 1,999,951 Caricom v v v 2
51 |[C Jagnarine & Son Construction $ 84,748,860 No Blglei(ra]curlty v v v 2
52 |ARK Trading $ 75,184,935 [ $ 1,900,000 Nafico v v v 2
53 |VNV Construction & Supply $ 95,390,400 | $ 1,907,808 Premier v v v 2
54 |D Bishoo Construction Services $ 87,376,170 | $ 1,750,000 Premier v v v 0
55 [NP Contracting & Transportation Services | $ 89,893,650 | $ 1,797,873 Premier v v v 2
56 |Navin & Sons Construction $ 89,683,440 | $ 1,793,669 Assuria v v v 2
57 |The Builders $ 108,519,915 |% 1,999,951 Caricom v v v 2
58 |4S Security & Building Enterprise $ 97,641,600 | $ 1,999,951 Nafico v v v 2
59 g::‘vﬁgz” Construction & Transportation | o g5 375375 | § 1,847,527 |  Caricom v | v | v 2
60 [A.K Premier Investments $ 76,974,870 | $ 1,539,497 Caricom v v v 1




C.Persaud & Son Construction & Supply

61 : $ 93,137,100 | $ 1,980,000 Caricom v v v 2
Services
6 Lallghan s Construction & Graphics $ 58974300 | $ 1179486 Assuria Y v v 5
Service
63 |AAD & Son Construction $ 85,682,940 No B'geiff“”ty viv] v 2
64 |Crown Road & Drainage Contractors $ 91,079,100 | $ 2,000,000 Caricom v v v 2
65 |Mohamed's Excavating Construction Inc | $ 80,332,350 | $ 1,900,000 Nafico v v v 2
66 |Faizal Ali Contracting $ 90,065,320 [ $ 1,900,000 Premier v v v 2
67 Four Brothers Construction & Hardware $ 80265726 | $ 1785314 Premier v v v 1
Supplies
Engineer's Estimate $ 99,997,569




Date of Tender Opening: September 03, 2024

File Number: Ministry Culture, Youth & Sports (138/2024/44) - Construction of Fence - Anna Regina

. . Bid Securit Form of
Bllglgl.er Name of Bidder Bliﬁrr?ggg & %T?:’Jenr:cicy Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS ;egnnciedr SOTO? ';L?\S/:
1 [MJ's Contracting & General Supplies $ 17,964,975 | $ 453,600 Caricom v v v 2
2 |D&S General Contracting Services $ 21,342825 | $ 453,600 Assuria v v v 2
3 |N&S Contracting & Supplies Service $ 19918575 | $ 453,600 Caricom v v v 2
4 |A.G Enterprise $ 20,731,200 | $ 414,624 Assuria v v v 2
5 |Zeebo & Sons Construction $ 21,472,372 |$ 429,447 Premier v v v 1
6 |Lallchan's Construction & Graphics Service |$ 21,269,850 | $ 425,397 Assuria v v v 2
7 |Maxart $ 19977825 |$ 399,557 Assuria v v v 2
8 |Paramlall Goberdhan Contracting $ 19,699,800 | $ 453,600 Caricom v v v 2
9 |Narine's Construction & General Supplies $ 22,043,438 | $ 440,869 Assuria v v v 2
10 [Wild Oats Civil & Mechanical Engineering $ 21,051,240 | $ 453,600 Caricom v v v 2
11 |Talish Hollow Blocks $ 21,151,725 | $ 450,192 Assuria v v v 1
12 |Golden Key Construction & Supply $ 20,129,025 | $ 453,600 Caricom v v v 2
13 |GY Contracting $ 2207499 | $ 441,498 Assuria v v v 2
14 |Beshaun Construction Service $ 19243770 | $ 408,733 Caricom v v v 2
15 |Satesh Naraine $ 19,839,750 | $ 396,795 Assuria v v v 1
16 [A.M.1.C General Contracting Service $ 20488125 | % 496,000 Nafico v v v 2
17 |Andrect Engineering & Construction $ 21,657,825 | 9% 453,600 Assuria v v v 2
18 [Harry Chowtie Enterprise $ 25870950 | $ 600,000 Caricom v v v 2
19 |Ceraturium $ 19,968,900 | $ 453,600 Caricom v v v 0
20 |VS Engineering & Investment $ 20572125 | $ 409,137 Nafico v v v 2
21 |M Ali Contracting & Engineering Services $ 21,808,185 | $ 436,164 Diamond v v v 2




22 |R Persaud Investment $ 19877025 | $ 453,600 Caricom v v v 2
23 |T.P Construction $ 18,822,008 | $ 453,600 Caricom v v v 2
24 |Proconstruct Solutions $ 18,795,735 | $ 375,914 Caricom v v v 2
25 [Visho's Hollow Blocks & Trucking Service $ 20,100,675 | $ 453,600 Caricom v v v 2
26 Technocon Inves’_[ments Pr_ocurement & $ 21999915 | $ 540,000 Caricom v v v 1
General Contracting Solutions
27 |Matty General Construction $ 18,942525 | $ 378,851 Nafico v v v 2
28 ?2:‘\/6:21” Construction & Transportation $ 20654550 | $ 413,091 |  Caricom v | v | v 2
29 |A.K Premier Investments $ 16,759,313 | $ 335,186 Premier v v v 1
30 |R79 Mining & Construction $ 20,307,525 | $ 453,600 Caricom v v v 2
31 [Infinity Contracting & General Services $ 20,720,805 | $ 453,600 Assuria v v v 2
32 |A Bacchus Contracting & Trucking Service $ 19,425,000 | $ 388,500 Caricom v v v 2
33 [Bhowan Trucking & Construction Services $ 18,585,850 | $ 348,303 Caricom v v v 2
34 gﬁ;;ﬁgther Construction & Hardware $ 21472372 |$ 429447 |  Premier v | v | v 1
35 |EJ&N General Construction & Maintenance | $ 18,716,250 | $ 374,325 Assuria v v v 2
36 |4S Security & Building Enterprise $ 21455700 | $ 453,600 Nafico v v v 2
37 é\grs;acr;,:ud Construction & Transportation $ 19215425 | $ 453,600 Caricom v v v 5
38 |Gavko Construction & Supplies Inc $ 19,866,525 | $ 453,600 Caricom v v v 2
39 |[lcan Engineering & Construction $ 22538250 | $ 271,480 Assuria v v v 2
40 |Rans Contracting & Supplies $ 21,677,460 | $ 800,000 Caricom v v v 1
41 Sove_relgnty Invest_ments Construction $ 18.364,500 | $ 367290 Assuria v v Y 5
Services (SICS Builders)
42 |Triple A General Contracting services $ 20,186,040 | $ 403,721 Premier v v v 2




43 |Saam General Contracting $ 19,945380 | $ 460,000 Premier v v v 1
44 |Vijay Persaud & Sons Contracting Services $ 20,281,800 | $ 405,636 Assuria v v v 2
45 |Momin & Sons Construction $ 19,100,025 | $ 382,000 Caricom v v v 2
46 Builders I—_Iardware, General Supplies & $ 21244650 | 424,893 Assuria v Y v 5
Construction
Engineer's Estimate $ 22,680,000




Date of Tender Opening: September 03, 2024

File Number: Ministry Culture, Youth & Sports (139/2024/44) -

Ancillary Works for Anna Regina Community Centre Ground Region 2

Bid Security

Form of

Bidder . Bid Amount & . . Hard | Flash
No. Name of Bidder Currency A(\:rS;):Jenr;tccjc Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS l’iegnndee;r Copy | drive
1 |Maxart L1 $ 11,940,600| $ 238,812 Assuria v v v 2

1 [Maxart L2 $ 11,940,600 $ 238,812
1 |[Maxart L3 $ 11,890,600| $ 237,812
1 [Maxart L4 $ 11,890,600 $ 237,812
o |Wild Oats Civil & Mechanical $ 23431500|$ 497,924 | Caricom viv]| v 2
Engineering L1
5 Wllc_i Oat_s Civil & Mechanical $ 23431500 (L1-2)
Engineering L2
5 Wllc_i Oat_s Civil & Mechanical $ 23256500 | $ 487 924
Engineering L3
5 Wllc_i Oat_s Civil & Mechanical $  23256.500 (L3-4)
Engineering L4
3 |lcon Investment L2 $ 24,628,145 | $ 492,562 Caricom v v v 1
3 |lcon Investment L4 $ 24,638,550 | $ 492,731
4 |D&S General Contracting Services L1 $ 23,941,400 | $ 497,294 Assuria v v v 2
4 |D&S General Contracting ServicesL2 | $ 23,941,400 | $ 497,294
4 |D&S General Contracting Services L3 $ 23,213,500 | $ 487,924




4 |D&S General Contracting ServicesL4 | $ 23,213,500 | $ 487,924
5 A Ba}cchus Contracting & Trucking $ 21600000 | $ 453 600 Caricom
Service L1
5 A Ba}cchus Contracting & Trucking $ 22680000 | $ 453 600
Service L2
5 A Ba}cchus Contracting & Trucking $ 22837500 | $ 456 750
Service L3
5 A Bgcchus Contracting & Trucking $ 21750000 | $ 456 750
Service L4
6 [Harry Chowtie Enterprise L1 $ 34,527,400 | $ 600,000 Caricom
6 [Harry Chowtie Enterprise L2 $ 34,527,400 | $ 600,000
6 |Harry Chowtie Enterprise L3 $ 34,527,400 | $ 600,000
6 [Harry Chowtie Enterprise L4 $ 34,527,400 | $ 600,000
5 :_nlflnlty Contracting & General Services $ 23000000 | $ 497 924 Assuria
5 :_n2f|n|ty Contracting & General Service $  23.090.000 (L1-2)
5 :_ngmlty Contracting & General Service $ 23000000 | 487 924
5 Infinity Contracting & General Service $  23.090.000 (L3-4)

L4




8 |R79 Mining & Construction L1 $ 20,776,800 | $ 497,924 Caricom
8 |R79 Mining & Construction L2 $ 20,776,800 | $ 497,924
8 |R79 Mining & Construction L3 $ 20,576,800 | $ 487,924
8 |R79 Mining & Construction L4 $ 20,576,800 | $ 487,924
9 |[Triple A General Contracting Service L1 | $ 21,896,200 | $ 437,924 Premier
9 |Triple A General Contracting Service L2 [ $ 21,896,200 | $ 437,924
9 |Triple A General Contracting Service L3 | $ 21,496,200 | $ 429,924
9 |[Triple A General Contracting Service L4 | $ 21,496,200 | $ 429,924
10 |Guycan Investment L1 $ 24,605,800 | $ 492,116 Caricom
10 [Guycan Investment L3 $ 24594500 | $ 491,890
11 |BS Narine & Sons Investment L1 $ 32,422,800 | $ 648,456 Caricom
11 |BS Narine & Sons Investment L4 $ 28,654,600 | $ 573,092
12 LaIIc_han s Construction & Graphics $ 34574400 | $ 691 488 Assuria
Service L1
12 Lallchan's Construction & Graphics $ 34574400 | $ 691 488

Service L2




Lallchan's Construction & Graphics

12 _ 33,074,400 | $ 661,488
Service L3
12 LaIIc_han s Construction & Graphics 33.074.400
Service L4
13 Narln(? s Construction & General 23545500 | $ 470,910 Assuria
Supplies L1
13 Narlng s Construction & General 23.245500 | $ 464.910
Supplies L2
13 Narlng s Construction & General 23.464.700 | $ 469,294
Supplies L3
13 Narlng s Construction & General 23.764.700 | $ 475,294
Supplies L4
14 IEfLN Contracting & Supplies Services 22 688.400 | $ 497,924 Caricom
14 IE;&N Contracting & Supplies Services 22 688.400 (L1-2)
14 IE;‘;QN Contracting & Supplies Services 22 268.400 | $ 487,924
14 IE;&N Contracting & Supplies Services 22.268.400 (L3-4)
15 Technocon Investments Procurement & 21,903,280 | $ 600,000 Assuria

General Contracting Solutions L1




Technocon Investments Procurement &

15 General Contracting Solutions L2 $ 21,903,280 3 600,000
Technocon Investments Procurement &
15 General Contracting Solutions L3 $ 21,903,280 3 600,000
Technocon Investments Procurement &
15 General Contracting Solutions L4 $ 21,903,280 3 600,000
16 Bhowan Trucking & Construction $ 22852400 No Bid Security
Service L1 Seen
16 Bhowan Trucking & Construction $ 22852400
Service L2
16 Bhowan Trucking & Construction $ 23652400
Service L3
16 Bhowan Trucking & Construction $ 23652400
Service L4
17 |Jay Apartment Rental L1 $ 23,113,000 | $ 462,260 Caricom
17 |Jay Apartment Rental L2 $ 23,137,600 | $ 462,752
17 |Jay Apartment Rental L3 $ 22,997,600 | $ 459,952
17 |Jay Apartment Rental L4 $ 22,897,600 | $ 457,952
18 [Beshaun Construction Service L1 $ 24,026,600 | $ 641,739 Caricom
18 [Beshaun Construction Service L2 $ 24,026,600 (L1-4)
18 |Beshaun Construction Service L3 $ 24,001,600
18 |Beshaun Construction Service L4 $ 24,001,600




Sovereignty Investments Construction

19 Services (SICS Builders) L1 22,021,080 | $ 440,421 Assuria
o [Soreony e S 5 zzgziom s asz

o [Soreny e S 5 animom|[s e

o [Soreony et S 5 avimom |8 azen

20 [Golden Key Construction & Supply L1 22,627,400 | $ 497,924 Caricom
20 [Golden Key Construction & Supply L2 22,627,900 (L1-2)

20 |Golden Key Construction & Supply L3 22,207,900 | $ 487,924

20 |Golden Key Construction & Supply L4 22,207,900 (L3-4)

21 |Andrect Engineering & Construction L1 23,841,400 | $ 497,294 Assuria
21 |Andrect Engineering & Construction L2 23,841,400 | $ 497,294

21 |Andrect Engineering & Construction L3 23,313,500 | $ 487,924




21 |Andrect Engineering & Construction L4 | $ 23,313,500 | $ 487,924
99 Builders Engineering & Architectural $ 24274300 | $ 485 486 Assuria
Consultancy L1
Builders Engineering & Architectural
22 Consultancy L2 $ 24,009,300 | $ 480,186
Builders Engineering & Architectural
22 Consultancy L3 $ 23,259,300 | $ 465,186
Builders Engineering & Architectural
22 Consultancy L4 $ 23,236,500 | $ 464,730
23 |GY Contracting L1 $ 24,771,000 | $ 495,420 Assuria
23 |GY Contracting L2 $ 24,771,000 | $ 495,420
23 |GY Contracting L3 $ 24,376,000 | $ 487,520
23 |GY Contracting L4 $ 24,376,000 | $ 486,520
Jaavier & Vidiana's General No Bid Security
24 Construction Desilting & Supplies L1 $ 22,437,800 Seen
Jaavier & Vidiana's General
24 Construction Desilting & Supplies L2 $ 21,437,800
Jaavier & Vidiana's General
24 Construction Desilting & Supplies L3 $ 21,287,800
24 Jaavier & Vidiana's General $  21.287.800

Construction Desilting & Supplies L4




25 |lcan Engineering & Construction L1 $ 24221400 | $ 484,428 Assuria
25 |lcan Engineering & Construction L2 $ 24221400 | $ 484,428
25 |lcan Engineering & Construction L3 $ 23,821,400 | $ 476,428
25 |lcan Engineering & Construction L4 $ 23,821,400 | $ 476,428
26 |A.K Premier Investments L1 $ 22,434,420 | $ 448,688 Caricom
26 |A.K Premier Investments L2 $ 22,434,420 | $ 448,688
26 |A.K Premier Investments L3 $ 21,179,420 | $ 423,588
26 |A.K Premier Investments L4 $ 21,179,420 | $ 423,588
27 |Sac & Sac Vision Construction L1 $ 28,172,900 |$ 1,200,000 Caricom
27 |[Sac & Sac Vision Construction L2 $ 28,172,900 (L1-4)
27 |Sac & Sac Vision Construction L3 3 27,897,900
27 |Sac & Sac Vision Construction L4 $ 27,897,900
28 |Talish Hollow Blocks L1 $ 24,639,400 | $ 478,016 Caricom
28 |Talish Hollow Blocks L2 $ 24,639,400 (L1-4)
28 |Talish Hollow Blocks L3 $ 24,039,400
28 |Talish Hollow Blocks L4 $ 24,039,400
N&A General Construction
29 |Maintenance, Supplies & Janitorial $ 22,819,960 | $ 456,399 Assuria

Services L1




N&A General Construction

29 |Maintenance, Supplies & Janitorial $ 22,819,960 456,399
Services L2
N&A General Construction
29 |Maintenance, Supplies & Janitorial $ 21,994,960 439,899
Services L3
N&A General Construction
29 |Maintenance, Supplies & Janitorial $ 21,994,960 439,899
Services L4
30 |R Persaud Investment L1 $ 22,949,300 497,924 Caricom
30 |R Persaud Investment L2 $ 22,949,300 (L1-2)
30 |R Persaud Investment L3 487,924
30 |R Persaud Investment L4 (L3-4)
31 ,E\.ll\/l.l.C. General Contracting Services $  20.777.400 486,000 Nafico
31 SI\/I.I.C. General Contracting Services $  20.777.400 (L1-4)
31 ﬁél\/l.l.c. General Contracting Services $ 23149500
31 ﬁA.rM.I.C. General Contracting Services $ 23149500
32 |SixS General Construcion L1 $ 32,084,200 641,684 Caricom




32 |SixS General Construcion L2 $ 28,926,400 | $ 578,528

32 |SixS General Construcion L3 $ 27,426,400 | $ 548,528

32 |SixS General Construcion L4 $ 27,426,400 | $ 548,528

33 |Matty General Construction L1 $ 20,818,800 | $ 394,176 Nafico

33 [Matty General Construction L2 $ 20,818,800 (L1-4)

33 |Matty General Construction L3 $ 19,918,800

33 [Matty General Construction L4 $ 19,918,800

34 |Engineered Construction Company L1 | $ 29,806,400 | $ 596,128 Caricom

34 |Engineered Construction Company L2 $ 29,806,400 | $ 596,128

34 |Engineered Construction Company L3 | $ 28,297,400 | $ 565,948

34 |Engineered Construction Company L4 [ $ 28,297,400 | $ 565,948

35 |Gavko Construction & SuppliesinclLl |$ 22,488,400 | $ 497,924 Caricom

35 |Gavko Construction & SuppliesincL2 [$ 22,488,400 (L1-2)

35 |Gavko Construction & SuppliesIincL3 | $ 22,088,400 | $ 487,924

35 |Gavko Construction & SuppliesinclL4 [$ 22,088,400 (L3-4)

36 M A!I Contracting & Engineering $ 23715200 Diamond
Services L3

36 M Ali Contracting & Engineering $ 23011200 | $ 460,224

Services L4




NP Contracting & Transportation

37 Services L1 $ 23,627,900 | % 1,885,232 Premier
37 NP Qontractlng & Transportation $ 23.627.900
Services L2
37 NP Qontractlng & Transportation $ 23 502.900
Services L3
37 NP (T‘ontractlng & Transportation $ 23 502.900
Services L4
38 RD (?onstructlon, Consultancy & Supply $ 22880200 | $ 457 604 Assuria
Services L1
38 RD (?onstructlon, Consultancy & Supply $ 22880200 | $ 457 604
Services L2
38 RD (_Zonstructlon, Consultancy & Supply $ 22079800 | $ 441 596
Services L3
38 RD (_Zonstructlon, Consultancy & Supply $ 22079800 | $ 441 596
Services L4
39 [Ceraturium L1 $ 22,571,000 | $ 497,924 Caricom
39 [Ceraturium L2 $ 22,571,000 | $ 497,924
39 |Ceraturium L3 $ 22471000 | $ 487,924
39 |Ceraturium L4 $ 22,471,000 | $ 487,924
40 |Orins Supreme Enterprise L1 $ 23,725500 | $ 992,000 Asurria

(L1-2)




41 |Momin & Sons Construction L1 $ 20,784,200 | $ 415,684 Caricom
41 |Momin & Sons Construction L2 $ 20,784,200 (L1-4)
41 |Momin & Sons Construction L3 $ 19,784,200
41 |Momin & Sons Construction L4 $ 19,784,200
49 Vua;_/ Persaud & Sons Contracting $ 22615200 AsurTia
Services L1
49 Vua;_/ Persaud & Sons Contracting $ 22615200 | $ 473,044
Services L2
49 Vua;_/ Persaud & Sons Contracting $  21.816.600 | $ 436,332
Services L3
49 Vua;_/ Persaud & Sons Contracting $  22.116.000 | $ 442,320
Services L4
Vijay Persaud & Sons Contracting
42 .
Services L5
43 |Paramlall Goberdhan Contracting L1 $ 23,678,000 Caricom
43 |Paramlall Goberdhan Contracting L2 $ 23,678,000
43 |Paramlall Goberdhan Contracting L3 $ 23,638,000 | $ 487,924
43 |Paramlall Goberdhan Contracting L4 $ 23,638,000 (L3-4)
Engineer's Estimate L1 $ 24,896,200
Engineer's Estimate L2 $ 24,896,200
Engineer's Estimate L3 $ 23,896,200
Engineer's Estimate L4 $ 23,896,200




Date of Tender Opening: September 03, 2024

File Number: Director of Public Prosecutions (18/2024/56) - Supply and Delivery of Photocopier Machines

. . Bid Security Form of
Bﬁder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender | 12rd FIQSh
0. Currency Currency signed Copy | drive
1 |Laparakan Trading Guyana Company Ltd | $ 9,800,000( $ 196,000 GTM v v v 2
) ﬁllglltal Technologies Group of Companies $  10758800| $ 215,176 Assuria Y v v 5
3 S&K Construc_tlon Consultancy Services & $ 8.740.000| $ 174.800 Caricom v v v 5
General Supplioes Inc
4  |Synetech Inc $ 7,800,000 $ 200,000 Premier v v v 1
5 |MAEC Enterprises $ 10,747,600( $ 214,952 Assuria v v v 2
6 |Atlas Business Solutions Inc $ 11,934,000{ $ 238,680 Assuria v v v 2
File Number: National Insurance Scheme (107/2024/03) - Reconstruction of Camp and Bent Streets - New Wing
: . Bid Security Form of
Bidder Name of Bidder Bid Amount & Amount & Bid Security Agency | GRA | NIS Tender | Hard Fle}Sh
No. Currency Currency signed Copy | drive
1 |ECS Construction & General Supplies $ 200,347,322| $ 3,005,209 Caricom v v v 2
2 |Great One Investment $ 168,277,316] $ 2,600,000 Premier v v v 2
3 |VG Group Guyana Inc $ 232,178,294| $ 3,750,000 Caricom v v v 2
4 |R Kissoon Contracting Service $ 389,247,306] $ 5,850,000 Premier v v v 2
Engineer's Estimate $ 222,381,307




